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■Winner in Local
Stock Show
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John DUUngham, ‘ sophomore, 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Jack UU1- 
ingham of ttia Shields conhiitt" 
nity and member of the local 
WFA Chapter, took the majority 
of first places in the annual 
Santo Anna Livestock Show 
Wednesday of last _ week. The 
show was held a t the' S ta ta  
Anna Show Lam, located near 
the high school.

Dillingham had the top fine- 
wool lightweight lamb, top trio 
of line wool wethers, top Corrie­
dale trio, top Suffolk and top 
“al1 other classes” in single en­
tries. He also showed the reserve 
grand champion finewool lamb. 

■-■ Dillingham, also was awarded 
; the Santa Anna National Bank

District 1 M  
Coaches Select 
ASS-District Team-

All the coaches and, Superin­
tendents of schools in District 
10-A met in Cross Plohis Wed­
nesday night of last week and 
selected the All-District football 
team and discussed oilier inter- 
scholastic league events coming 
up during the remainder of the 
school year. The district sched­
ule for the 1001 football season 
was set up. I t  will be the same.

only

Leifer fm m  
Maurice Smith 1

5V)Howh»B Is a letter received 
from Maurice Smith, a former 
pastor of the local First Baptist 
Chdrch, who'is now serving, ad a 
missionary tq Ghana, In-Africa.’ 
The letter wag received too late 
for publication last week.
Dem ' F r ien d s:

Christmas in Ghana will be
celebrated In many different 
ways. ■'■

On Christmas' Eve, the Chris­
tians will be 'found 'in their 
churches, singing and praying 
until past midnight. Then they 
will go caroling. On Christmas 
Day they will again, assemble in.............................. as , this - year, with the ___ __ „0„.„ _____

trophy for the. best, all-aroundjchange being in the sites where their churches for; a time of 
exhibitor of the 30-odd members I (jhe games will be played .In  1901' • ■ • ’ 1

’PIRSCMAK}

of the local FFA chapter and 4- 
H Club members who had en­
tries in the show.

This show is considered the 
kick-off show in the Central 
West ‘ Texas area. During the 
next two months local youths 
will enter most of the major 
shows throughout Texas. In the 
past many honors have been 
bestowed upon youths from San­
ta  Anna in their efforts in major 
shows. From appearances, they 
will furnish some tough coni pe­
tition at the shows they enter.

Stanley, Hartman, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. f.'dd Hartman, and Col­
lin Steward, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Bill Steward of Rockwood, show­
ed the two grand champion fat 
lambs of she show.

Hartman exhibited the grand 
char/ipion finewool mutton, a 
heavyweight lamb that led its 
class. This was the only first 
place going to a freshman stu­
dent.

Steward, who also had the re­
serve champion mutton breed 
wether exhibited Southdowns to 
both ' the grand and reserve 
champion places. This senior 
student also took championship 
honors In the show last year.

Darlene Jones, daughter of 
Rev. and Mrs. Raymond Jones 
and member of the 4-H Club, 
was the only- girl to take a first 
place. This was with her Suf­
folk pen of three.

First place winners in . the 
breeding sheep division went to 
Don1 C u p p s , C l u b ,  with his 
Rambouiliet; ewe lambs. Wade 
Rehm, FFA, Rambouiliet ewes; 
Les Guthrie, 4-H, Delaine ewe 
lambs; J. C. Bible, FFA, Suf­
folk ewe lambs and Suffolk ewes.

Frank Valdez, 4-H, took first 
place in the Hampshire gilt 
class of the swine .show. Billy 
Don Haynes, 4-H, won the fat 
barrow show. Terry. Mclver, . 4- 
H, showed the top peiTof ;fryers.

Judges for the show' were Har­
old Bragg, of Talpa in the sheep 
division and C. H. Sargent of 
Bangs, in the swine and poultry 
divisions. The show was under 
the direction of A D. Pettit, local 
Vocational Agriculture instruc­
tor. .-

Following is a complete list of 
the,places in the show;

all the games will be in the op 
posite location as they were in 
1900.'

They also re-elected the 
chairmen for the new year. 

Selected on the all-district 
teams and those receiving hon­
orable mention were as follows: 

Center: Kenneth Balter, Al­
bany, first team; Kenneth Lam- 
kin, Early, second team; and 
Eisner Graham. Cross Plains, 
honorable mention.

Guards: Bin Stapp of Albany
and Joe Howe of Clyde, first 
team; Bill Jones of Eastland and 
Raymond Taylor of Albany,-sec­
ond' teams.. Honorable mention 
went to Dayton Jackson of Santa 
Anna, Ervin Hutchins of Cross 
Plains, Biii Moyian of Eastland, 
Mertan Tewell of Clyde and 
Kenneth Holloman of Early.

Tackles: T. G. Wylie of Albany 
and Cheaney of Eastland, first 
team; Paul MacWoodfin of-Al­
bany and Mark Garoutte. of 
Clyde, ^second team.- Honorable 
mention went to Tommy Adams 
and Monte Need of Cross Plains, 
Clayton riunningham of Early 
and" Jim Niell of Santa Anna.

Ends: Hill of Albany and Bar­
ton Scott of Clyde, first team; 
McGleskey of Eastland and 
Ronnie Windham of Early, sec­
ond . team. . Honorable mention 
went to Tommy Stewardson of 
Santa Anna,' Tucker of Albany, 
Whitten of Cross Plains, Howell 
of Clyde, Cauble and Woodward 
of Albany.

Back's: Morrell of Albany, Poi­
son of Clyde, Lewis of Eastland 
and Milam of Early, first team; 
Hutchins of Cross Plains, Hogan
of Albany, Cook of Clyde and 
Smith of Early, second team. 
Honorable mention went to 
Watts of Clyde,; Wood and Agan 
of Albany, Baird of Gross Plains, 
Gamer of Eastland 'and Lea of 
Early.

singing, praying, and a short 
sermon. The children" look' for­
ward to the feasts' and the 
cookies, just as we looked for­
ward to the candy, nuts and 
fruits when we were children.

In contrast, the pagan people 
celebrate Christmas by remem­
bering their deceased relatives. 
They spend much time drinking 
Palm Wine (a home brew which 
is very intoxicating). This is a 
time of weeping and mourning 
for their dead.

In this ‘country of Ghana

All four of the 'daughters of 
Mr. and' Mrs. W. E. Vanderford
were hefts for a ‘Christinas visit 
with their parents:"Mr. and Mrs. 
Chick 'Watson, their daughter 
and husband, Mr, and Mrs. Har­
old Riley and son, Tommie, of 
I r v in g ; .  Mr,, .and - Mrs. Bill 
Pritchard, Robert. and Sue, of 
Post; Mr, and Mrs. Rip Mayo. 
Charles, Chris and Cynthia, of 
Coleman; Mr. and Mrs. Warren' 
Aldridge and Van of . Santa 
Anna. . Other visitors - were Mr. 
and Mrs.. W. D. Aldridge, Debra, 
Duane and Belinda of-. Hermit, 
Mr, and Mrs. Don Pritchard and 
Mike. Afternoon Callers were Mr, 
and Mrs. Audry Robbins, Walter 
and Glenda, of Midland.

Law Enforcement
Officers Busy 
During Weekend -

1959 Farm 
Census Figures 
Released

Mr. and Mrs. H. D. Speck spent 
Christmas in Dallas with their 
son, Mr. and Mrs. Adrian Speck.

Law, enforcement officers of 
this area were busy” during the 
holiday, weekend,.- filing 30 com­
plaints in the local Justice of the 
Peace court.
, Two persons were -filed on,-.for 
fighting, one for a loud muffler, 
one for no tail light, and 26 cases 
were filed against persons ex­
ceeding the speed limits.

So far as: we can find out. 
there were no traffic, accidents 
in this area and no: deaths were 
reported other than several 
natural deaths.

E. W. Marshall 
Died in Coleman
Wed., Dec. 21

where, the people are determined 
to be free and to preserve the 
“African Personality”, we are 
trying to help them see that the 
“African :■ Personality” can be 
Christian. At this season when 
the whole world is celebrating 
the birth of The Deliverer, many, 
many people here are still In 
slavery to sin.. Pray that these 
people will be set free from the 
bonds of sin, and pray for us as 
we serve the One whose birth we 
are celebrating.

We wish for you a spiritual 
blessing this Christmas season. 
May the New, Year bring much 
happiness to you.

Sincerely, •
Maurice and Evelyn Smith and 

sons

FAT LAMBS
Finewool heavyweight, {160 

pounds and up): 1. Stanley
Hartman; 2 and 3. John Dill­
ingham; 4. Randy Brown; and 
5. Dillingham. All are FFA mem­
bers, :

Finewool lightweight: 1./Dill-. 
Ingham: 3. Dayton Jackson: 3. 
Collins Steward; 4. Brown; and
5. Steward.

Pen of 3 finewool lambs: L 
Dillingham; 2. Steward; and 3. 
Brown.

Southdown lambs: 1. and 2. 
Steward; 3. Dillingham; 4. 
Brown; and 5. Steward,

Pen of 3 Southdowns: i. Stew- 
. ard; 2, Dillingham; and 3. 
Brown.

Corriedale and Corriedale 
• rcso lambs: 1. 2. 3. and 4. Dill­
ingham; and f>. Tommy Stew­
ardson.

Suffolk and. Suffolk cross 
class: i. Dillingham; 2. Stanley 
Hartman; 3. Eddie Jones, 4-H: 
4. Les Guthrie, 4-H; and 5. Bill 
Horne, FFA.

Pen of 3 Corriedale; 1. Dilling­
ham; and 2. stewardson.

Pen of 3 Suffolk: 1. Darlene 
Jones, 4-K; 2. Guthrie; and 3. 
Wade Jones, 4-H.

AW. other crosses: L Dilling­
ham,; 2. Brown; 3. Dillingham; 
i. Brown; and 5. Barton Goori-

Emory W. Marshall, 84, of 
Coleman, died in the Coleman 
Hospital a t 5:00 p. m. Wednes­
day, December 21. Burial was in 
the Coleman Cemetery Friday 
afternoon. Services were con­
ducted in the Stevens Memorial; 
Chapel with J. W. McKinney, 
minister of the First Christian 
Church oi Ooiemois officiating.

Nbphews were pallbearers.
Mr. -Marshall was born -in 

Eastland . County May 20, 1878 
and was married to 'Miss Lillie 
Crunie November 4, 1903, They 
lived in Santa Anna for many 
years, then moved to Dallas, 
where they lived for 17 years'be­
fore moving to Coleman, where 
they have lived for the past sev­
eral years,
-----He -was--a—-retired---blacksmith 
and machinist, a member of the 
Central Christian Church of 
Dallas and had been a member 
of the Woodmen of the World 
for 86 years.

Survivors includes his wife of 
Coleman; one son, F. -W. Mar­
shall of Dallas; one daughter, 
Mrs; Coe Cross-of Coleman;1 five 
brothers,- Ben Marshall of May, 
P. M. and Bill Marshall of 
Clarendon, Henry Marshall of 
Compton, Calif, and Lee Mar­
shall of Ciaireite; two sisters, 
Mrs. Frank McKee of San Angelo 
and Mrs. Lulu Smith of Cross 
Plains; three grandchildren and 
four great-grandchildren.

Stevens Funeral Home was In 
charge of arrangements.
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Father of Mrs.
Payne Henderson 
Buried Dec. 23

Funeral services for H. L. Old­
ham, 89, were held at 2:30 p; m. 
Friday, Dec. 23, at the First Bap­
tist Church in Breckenridge. Mr. 
Oldham had been in failing 
health for several years and 
suffered a heart attack on Wed­
nesday. He died about noon 
Thursday. .

He was born March 9, 1871 in 
Granbury. He had lived in a 
number of places during his life­
time, and had been living in 
Breckenridge since 1948, His 
wife -proceeded' him in death in 
1956. Two daughters, also pro­
ceeded him in death.

Survivors include ■ one son; five 
daughters, including Mrs. Payne 
Henderson of Coleman, former­
ly of Santa Anna, 16 grand­
children, 26 great-grandchildren 
and one great-great-grandchild.

Aliens Required 
To Report 
Addresses

J. W. Holland, District Director 
of the Immigration and Natural­
ization Service, stated that 
aliens in the United States will 
be -required : t o . report their 
addresses to the Attorney Gen­
eral within the near future.

All aliens, with few exceptions, 
who are in the , United States on 
January 1st each, year must re­
port-their-addresses-sby the-end 
of that month. Only the follow­
ing classes of aliens are excused 
from this requirement: (1) Ac­
credited Diplomats; (2) Persons 
accredited to certain interna-, 
tional : organizations; and' (3) 
Those admitted temporarily as 
agricultural laborers.. ,;

Forms with which to ‘make, the 
report can be obtained from any 
Post Office or Immigration 
Office during ' the ‘ month of 
January.

Mr.iiHollaad said that the law 
provides severe penalties for 
failure to comply with the re­
porting requirement.

Visiting in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. L. A. Welch Christmas 
Day were Roy Welch of Jqrrel, 
Texas; Mrs, Agnes Driskill, Mrs, 
Edna Mae White, Mr.: and Mrs: 
Jimmy Driskill and children, 
Mr. and Mrs. J. E. Driskell and 
Jeannie, Mr. and Mrs. J. T. 
Harmes and family and Mr, J. 
C. Welch and Connie, all of 
Coleman; and Mrs. Gertrude 
Davis of Santa Anna.

Miss Mary Griffin 
Buried Tuesday

Visitors in the A. E; McCarrell 
home over the Christmas holi­
days were Mr. and: Mrs. Edgar 
McCarrell and Melvin of Odessa, 
Mr. and Mrs, Vernon McCarrell 
of Fort Worth, Edmond McCar­
rell and children, Mr. and Mrs. 
Jerry Clark and L. J. Clark, all 
of Santa Anna.

The 1959 Census of Agricul­
ture, conducted in Coleman, 
County last fall, counted 1;105 
farms,: according to a prelimi­
nary . report just issued by the 
Bureau of the Census, U. S: De­
partment. of Commerce, Total 
land in farms was 745,409 acres. 
The average size of farm was - 
674.6 acres. The average value of 
farms --eland and buildings) in 
the county.was $40,539.

Of the county’s farm' opera­
tors, 458 owned their farms, 329 
owned part of the land and 
rented additional acreage, and 
314: were tenant fanners.;

. The average age of- farm 
operators in the county was 53.7 
years. There were 250 farm 
operators 65 or more years of 
age.

Of the 1,105 farms in, the 
commercial

Funeral services for Miss Mary ^
I. Griffin, 78, were held Tuesday, j countv "'774 were 
December 27, a t 2:00 p .  m. in the -fanTlS' '
Stevens Memorial Chapel in 
Coleman. Miss Griffin died at Detailed statistics on crops, 

livestock, equipment" etc., are
her .home in Santa Anna about |.presented. in.-the preliminary re-

. Those enjoying Christmas Day 
in the W. E. Irick Sr. home were 
Mrs. J. D. Whetstone, Sparks 
Whetstone, Mark Davis, Don and 
Patricia, Earl Irick Jr., and fam­
ily, all of Santa Anna; Charles 
Jetton and family of Coleman; 
the Rex Stark family of Abilene; 
Mrs. Winifred - Stark, Jean and 
Frances , Irick of Brownwood; 
.and Mr. and Mrs. Tom Bryan of 
‘Rockwood.

9:00 a. m. Monday. Rev. Paul 
Smith, pastor of the Concho 
Baptist Church in Coleman, 
officiated. Burial was in the 
Santa Anna Cemetery, under the 
direction of Stevens Funeral 
Home.

Miss Griffin, daughter of the 
late Mr. and Mrs. W. M. Griffin, 
was born in Kentucky October 

i 26, 1882. She came to Coleman 
County in 1905. She has been a 
farm and ranch manager and 
was a member of the. Baptist 
Church.

Survivors include two broth­
ers, J. D. Griffin of Santa Anna 
and Bill Griffin of Coleman: two 
sisters, Mrs- Laura Banning of 
Reed, Okla., and Mrs. Mae Car­
ver, of Santa Anna; and several 
nieces and nephews. ,

port, with comparable statistics 
for 1954. Copies of the county 
report may be obtained for 10 
cents each from the Bureau of 
the Census, Washington 25, D. C.

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Allen and 
Sammie of Odessa spent the 
Christmas holidays with her 
parents, - Mr. and Mrs. Sam 
Collier.

Marvin Williams 
Buried Wednesday

1960 Hunting 
Season End 
Is Nearing

Austin — It was a short hunt­
ing season, after all! Most of at- 
will be over in a lew days.
/The deer season will end for 

the entire state Dec. 31,
‘ The quail season will end m 

the trans-Pecos area, and in a 
number of individual counties, 
Dec. 31.

Duck season will end Dec. ’ 30. 
Goose season wall -.continue 
through' Jan. 8 : . ■ • ■-

Javelma season will be over 
Dec. 31 in most of the counties, 
covered uhder the penoral laws 
which have closed season on the 
javelinas.

Turkey season will end Dee:Funeral services for Robert,
It IT • TIT! 11?" — e r*D «!> 1. t U ll Oil t ■' till,Marvirr Williams. 63,- were heiri-s . T- __,.r ,+ u - ____
at the Liberty Baptist: Church 
a t ’'2:00 p. m. Wednesday, Dec.
28,'with' the pastor, Rev. Charles 
Gossett, ■■officiating. Burial -was!

Mr. and-Mrs, Bill McClellan of | jn the Bangs Cemetery under)
Greenville. S. C. and Mrs. Bar-1 the -direction of Hosch Funeral ) 
tow Boylston and girls of Aiken, i Home

In most ot the '"out.tics under 
1 general laws the quad season 
i will continue ihronuh Jan. 16. 
It will be best to check with your 
local game warden on open/ 
counties. :•

For the most m il.
S. C. are visiting their parents/ Mr williams had been a resi

and Mr. and .Mrs. George Stew­
ardson.

Harper Hunter of Amarillo is 
visiting his mother, Mrs. Ora 
Hunter; . .   ..

Mrs. M. A. Pritchard and 
Rhonda Pritchard of Temple 
came last week and took Mrs. 
Opal Little to San -Angelo, where 
the group spent Christmas in 
the home of Mr. and Mrs; Mar­
vin Evans and family.

, Miss Darlene Mercer, student 
nurse at Shannon Hospital in' 
San Angelo, is spending ., the 
holidays with her parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. John Gregg and family.

Visitors with Mrs. J; J. Gregg 
'during the Christmas holidays 
were her daughter, Mrs. Mary Jo 
Schulle and daughter, Willene 
and a friend, David Nealy, of 
Watonga; Okla.; a son, Mr. and 
MrsrrBurton: Gregg, -Helen and 
Joey of S an ; Antonio; and a 
nephew, Buddy Jones of‘ Bishop.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Mulroy
spent the Christmas- holidays 
with their daughter, Mr. and 
Mrs. Wayne Horton- and family, 
in Houston.

Mr. and; Mrs.. James Van. Buss 
and children of (El Paso were 
Christmas visitors, .with her 
mother, Mrs. Jewell Owen and 
her grandmother, Mrs. . K. O. 
Gore.

• Enjoying: supper Christmas- 
Eve in the G. M. Jackson home 
were Mr. and Mrs. J. D. Jackson
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Mr. and Mrs. S. F. Tucker of 
the Cross Roads Community, 
had all their children home for 
Christmas. They are: Mr. and 
Mrs. B. H. Norris and Mr. and 

c.-k ■, Boy. \."id.'. 
' miian,Creek;‘Mr: 

.■bicy.; Itutcherson, 
‘onnu 
; Curti 
le/b l.

1 ’ ti’s K: Ti
Ut 1iincl . * \nry  of

ny Tvrs. Ai
m j Jim.n y and J

Mr. s i. : \w ..

h e  h u n t -
! ing: season; in . Texas .this,, year;

accai'ding to :
for about 40 rears* He^died"about1 f  ’ , N ” '
I  imission^ Deer hunter, hate had

Mr. an d , Mrs,- J. W. McClellan, dent of the Buffalo Communitv' ^a'- ^een Mll'tt;" J 11

in failing health for several
ail-months, ■ suffering a heart 

ment. . ‘
He was born March 19, 1897 In 

Marion County, -Arkansas and- 
was married to Miss Aimer 
Moren December 2. 1917 at

| the best luck m years, p’a: Iv 
, quail shooting w as cxtremily 
| good in some areas, but is begin- 
S ning to taper oil. Many hunters 
i have been a b le  to  eet their 
! limits oi both ducks and geese

Bangs. A stock farmer, be was | 
a member of the Baptist Church.

Survivors . include his wife; 
one son, Robert David Williams 
of San Diego, Calif ; one daugh­
ter, Mrs. Beatrice Griffith of 
San Diego, Calif.; - his mother,' 
Mrs. Lena Williams of Brown- 
wood; four brothers, J. W. Will­
iams of Santa Anna, B, O. and 
Rex Williams of Brownwood and 
Guy Williams of Hobbs, N. M/ 
one sister, Mrs, Pearl Studdard 
of Brownwood; and three grand­
children. • '

Pallbearers were Billy Archer, 
William Brown, Garland .Powell,- 
Clifford Lowe, Drue Vinson and 
-Arnold - Ragsdale: - -  ----------
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Mrs. E. J. Hammonds 
Buried in Ft. Worth i:

'Funeral services for Mrs. El­
mer ...: Hammond^, 46, of Fort 
Worth,, were;., held - Thursday, 
Dec. 15, - in. the Bible Baptist 
Church at Kennedale, near Fort 
Worth.--Burial was -in the Emer­
ald Hills Cemetery.

Mrs. Hammonds died Dec. 13. 
in a F o r t  Worth hospital. She 
was a native of Santa Anna, the 
daughter, o f ; the. late Mr. and, 
Mrs. John Simmons. She lived in 
Coleman County about 30 years 
before moving to Fort Worth. ,
, ‘She is- survived by her hus­
band, Elmer J, Hammonds; one 
tsm Garv J  Ksmnvtnrts of Fort

v.:.
| Cullins of Santa Anna; one 
I brother, Elmer Simmons of San- 

■ A !io , e'id >'J;c b'qi-iivo'.c'jj, 
;!■. 1 . Dili: " u, ’ilii-iV.T).

P-TA to Meet 
Wednesday, Jan. 4

The regular meeting of the 
Santa Anna Parent-Teachers 
Association will be held in the 
Elementary School Cafetorium 
at- 2:30- p. m. Wednesday,, Jan­
uary 4, All members are . urged 
to b e : present and visitors are 
invitod. , .

Dr. A. O. Brink'~of Coleman; 
will,  he the guest speaker and 
will: show slides and discuss den­
tal care for children.

; Members of the J . C. Lovelady 
family -had---a  ̂-reunion*.-and 
Christmas dinner in the home of 
Miss Alta Lovelady on Monday, 
December 26. There were 31 pre­
sent.

Happy Birthday
“Happy Birthday” to all who 

have birthdays during the next 
week. Below are listed the birth­
days we have this week.
DECEMBER 3l

Janice Armstrong ‘ 
Burton (Butch) Makuta 
Mrs. Doug Moore*

: - Mrs. R. B. Archer
JANUARY 1

Minnie Collins Young
Mrs. R. P. Barnhart
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(On 28,000 milt; Trade Tour . They’ve had Socialism, ■ t 
■ > wi|h,.-Secretary..-'Benson) - * “H»® hM,i; ,r>. ua
•' Wellington, New Zealand

“ A-?

A;'1.?
.This- ^ ‘New.i-»!>ntteri’t 
his is also about as-far>|'awSy: 

' -'■T'-from rJohn^Kettnedy as ypu :;chn 
;■ - get,. ...Hie. 'day after Kennedy's

. . .  i.FUM lfURE
“ ■ NEW ANI3 USED 

NEW: AND. USED::

»yGOLI)vSEALT

- . 6 "-—9'- — 12' FOOT;
A .SEE CS BEFOBB 

.' ..YOU '-BIJY '■ :

West of Courthouse 
Telephone 9-2366 — Coleman;

SNevr Prontter,’!,.. -here k ta ..;.;^  
Zealand for around 25 years. I t
New .Zealand}' a s . In .other jgoelaL 
ist; nations,..’Aobody: goes, via 'bee 
'hungry, ;;As , cahdidate ,feep’ned|
• told'1 viiS - and.' .the ,, world,,:';''In 
.America 17 mililbh Pfiojile.go to 
ited:,4iHngr.y...iey.ery,- Hightt’iv-'Mps't;: 
‘of,-them A re ' .oh vMetrecal, Here, 
riobMy’s.i.'poor. !. And nobody's 
irich-' Tli'e ; only 7 possible' way to 
get rich in New Zealand, and in 
other Socialist - .states, is to; go 
into partnership with a crooked 
politician: -tinder, the - Socialists,; 
drtiyi'p61i£iciari,s .have "rank." . 
Every Pig The. 'Saine . . . ..

The'1'.average . wage hereV is 
around $25 - a week. Butter; arid 
other foods are government- 

'••subsidized-- — sold below cost 
! ’<the “Brannari plan ") ..  Medicine 
And -doctors - are'-“ free." Few 
-people have cars. .Government 
owns and rent-com-tols a big 

'portion of housing. There is.no 
Anemploynierit~ 'Etxcept-1 for the 
; Old, the sick and .the; ;gold- 
jbrtckers on - government relief, 
-everybody works '— but not very 
hard. I t’s bad taste here to get 
into the back seat of a taxicab. 
Indicates you think you’re bet­
ter than the driver. Everybody’s 
“equal,” by government regula­
tion — but they restrict u n ­
desirable immigrants. Although 
they need immigrants badly ...and- 
have a shortage of workers, im-, 
migrants are restricted:, almost, 
exclusively to Anglo’-fSaxons. 
They - are critical . of our;;treat­
ment to Negroes. —’ h u t 'they

litter — 12 pigs all get the same 
treatment.”

The Labor (Socialist) Party of 
New Zealand vats defeated a tew 
days ago by the less redlcdl Na­
tionalist Party.’ The mushroom-; 
hje costs of the Welfare SUitd- 
jolted the people into changing 
political horses - -  hnt- no gov- 
;emmejffc,,vWO;uid''f 
'-Welfare;State away, 'although it 
takes: All;-the-'-,,wool-' froiiA- Sew 
•Zealand's, -48 -milliph sheep 'W  
.hiaintain' the ‘(New’ -Frontier”,;for' 
the 2% -milion;peopleA '> ’;

. t* „ —- - speeial -.benefits'
air'1 Hhrfft : oltrtrJ’pnn

Has recently, been enlarged and improved. Those inter- ■ 

ested in Test care facilities are invited to .cail colleci to: 

Number 2T, Santa- Anna. \: t-A

hipre;-.:2,i'f..;:';,.they.:’t ihavq., tcKHdren.'
Orphahs - get- benefits.; The sick' 
get benefits'. Unemployed get 
benefits. iAvAiids get ! benefits-. 
.The - iblind- "'get; .benefits. Even 
widowers get benefits. Parents 
of children- under-16 get bene- 
fits .(paid; 'til 18 if child ; stays 
in ; school) . The- aged (60 and 
over) get benefits.; .People ; in 
“emergencies” get benefits — if 
the Social Security; commission 
thinks the, person; should; . have

What Have Vou Done For
Os Lately?.:'.:.

After traveling in ;23 nations 
(12 . of them ; with ; Secretary 
Benson)-, -1 am more than ever 
convinced that Uifcie' , Sam is 
Uncle .Sucker: On; Benson’s
Trade Development tours, I have 
been struck by the oneness of 
attitude of all foreign nations 
with us; We ask them, -"What 
can we do for you?” and they 
ask us, ."What- can you do for 
us?” They all have their hand 
out. They--want to take all and 
give nothing. They’re ail look­
ing out for Number One, while 
bur leaders sanctimoniously pro­
claim our belief in- world broth-
ni'Ncm/-) A ftrtw t im b m  i- ln m n n /l d’ lfn

government prevented one man 
from robbing another. Now gov­
ernment, robs one man for the

-sA'i-A" A.,'-'A -Vtf'v.
r :lt»-

.
Kennedy asks for unity. He,

won’t . gCMf:;beeadse.;fie’'.'doesn’t  
deserve- it —- any more than 
Norman Thomas, Walter Re oth­
er .or,'-'ariy.''otlier-',;SoclAlist;,'';Ken- 
ndcly - was'. “ elected.” .by,'a -/Well-, 
oiled, multi-milliQfledbHar; cam­
paign,: based (on. .destructive,. .se­
ductive, ’ (appeal’" ''to;:';;miiiu>rity-

l i i s | | s t e ; S # i i i 4 >
More than five million veter­

ans throughout the U, 8. holding; 
participating a i .  life insurance 
policies will share in. regular an­
nual policy dividends totaling, 
$298,500,000 during 1961, P. J.

in Wuco .said today.
■ These dividends are primar

a refund to pollcyhoMers of p 
of (heir premium payments, (j 
refunds arc my.de princl;-*
because the death rate a)

;giAApp‘Abd'oA/crobkeAAlg:'c|ty p'^poH ^ho^rs'Continues
machines. '(Alarmists., are worry 
Ing; iunriecA®Mlly;;'AbAAt';,fut.ure
and; worse vote . frauds! . tinder 
Kennedy, even if we .still'have 
elections, a,!.dollar .won’t,buy  a 
vote any more.) His? “victory” 
was not a mandate hut a-Aefault 
by an Opponent who tried to tip­
toe. in to , the White House. 
Dewey-like, with ,a  me-too, we~ 
can; - do, - it - better; - a'nd - 
,cheaper campaign?

Along; with millions of Ameri­
cans Who’ll refuse to “unite” be­
hind a collectivist with a police 
state mentality, I believe in 
neither “going along”, nor. going 
away. I intend to oppose; Ken­
nedy and ’his ;: Socialist ; brain 
trust; every-step of the: Way.
T h e  W ave  I s  W h a t  Y o u  M a k e  It

'Kennedy promises to plan, 
ban, lend, .spend us out. of. our 
freedoms. If the lamp of free­
dom! is blown o u t; in! America, 
the world will be thrown into 
darkness. With the: Kennedy 
dynasty ruling our lives,. I agree, 
for the first time,; that the main 
issue is religion: God tSave
America.

fyla.Tiy: materialists, cowards,

.ong
be

inch
shed

erhood. After we ve dumped $70 ostriches and switch hitters say,: 
billion m aid all: over the world, “i can’t  openly engage in politics 
our world brothers ask, “What -----7,
have you done for us lately?”

We always help our friends 
when they’re in trouble, -.and 
they never . forget us when 
they’re-in trouble again. But now 
we’re in trouble. We’ve “lost” 
niuch of . our gold. Our dollar is 

; in danger. Our debt is astfonq- 
:micai;: Britian, 'West Germany, 
.France and others we’ve helped 
Ao their highest level of pros- 
{ perity now refuse to join us not 
only in shouldering .part of the 
aid to the have-not nations, but 
also refuse to pay their fair
share for . their 
Uncle Sucker defends them, at 
his: own expense, from Commu­
nist invasion. Some call our 
foreign aid “enlightened! self- 
interest.” .1 call: it Moochual Se­
curity. : : ‘ -

Kennedy’s “New Frontier” is 
! Socialism. - Socialism is Commu-

because' .'.'of my business.” The 
politics we’re engaged in today 
is the politics of survival as a 
free people. We’re being spent, 
planned, maneuvered, cheated 
and“ neutralized:’ out of our 
freedoms.
. People who neither agree nor1 

disagree, who refuse to: fight for 
the right, ,who stay in the mfd- 

' die of the .road wftereever the 
middle is, who believe in peace 
at any price, who refuse to take 
a stand because it might lose 
business or alienate: friends, re- 

; mind me of pan,te’s classic in-

lower than the-;rate upon 
the premiums; were ' "  ’ 
by!ia)v.:.T'.;“ ,!':;!;',';'_r

Di'vldeuds totaling $240,000,000 
will be paid to approximately 4,- 
800,000. policyholders of National 
Service Life Insurance which 
originated in World War r.'f.

Some $18,500,000 in dividends 
will be paid to approximately 
200,000 policyholders of National 
Service Life Insurance which 
originated in World War I.

This . is approximately $5 
million more in overall dividend 
payments than the amount be­
ing paid during I960. This in­
crease is in large part- due to the 
expected higher interest earning 
resulting from a new investment 
formula developed last year.

Tito 1961. individual policy 
dividends will not be materially 
.different from the 1960. dividend. 
In some policies the extra in­
terest is offset by a decrease in 
some of the other dividend fac­
tors.

The dividends, will be paid as 
soon as possible after the 1961 
anniversary date each policy was 
issued, Mims said. Both term 
and permanent plan participat­
ing NSLI and USGLI policy­
holders; will receive dividends.

As the' payment of" dividends 
is automatic,; policyholder's. will 
receive their dividends sooner if 
they do not delay the processing 
by making advance individual 
inquiries, he added.

Attend . church regularly, .

„ grow ________
current' income; t

change the E's for taco)..  .....
ing Series H Bonds. You can de­
fer. paying income saxes on the 
B bond interest until you fiaolly 
cash the H’s. Ask you- banker „
for details,
(sZtaFm

“■'.'.Af;

;;Watches b'n'.the:

.Repair# iiiAa .Wink
Precision craftsmanship by 
our exports insures your 
co:>niik;to, satisfaction with 
a i i our watch repairs. 
Prompt service.

Coleman, Texas

V- ATA-A -A'-v a':?I

Open Thursday, ’ ;
-. Friday & Saturday;!

7 :00 to 9:00 p. m..
Sunday — 2 to 4 p. m.

For Private Parties 
' .'..Call- 9-1407- -

Free Skate on Your Birthday

Thompson. Roller Rink 
-"Old-Air Fort-Boad'

. . Coleman, Texas

A?;;

+̂ f ^ ns„e? dictmerit: “ The hottest fires ’of 
hell are reserved for those who, 
in a period of moral crisis, main­
tain neutrality.”

The cynics claim Socialism is 
the .“wave of the future.” I be­
lieve the wave of the future is 
what we make it.

“God grant us the serenity to 
accept the things we ’ caiinot 
change, courage to change the 
things we can, and, w'isdom to 
know the! difference.”

Reprinted from January 1961 
issue of Farm and Ranlh Maga­
zine, Nashvile, Tennessee. '
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. Live in your h’eaTt-as though 
every day were Christmas:

Nowadays men don’t talk 
about w'omen as much , as.: they 
used to. Most of today’s conver­
sation is’ devoted to overtime 
and time-and-a-half. ,

It’s the New Year again and a§ the Holiday Season 

_ _  ioretells the passing of another year, _ _

we think of those who 'have helped make that 

year a more enjoyable one,

,, If we could, we would grasf) your hand, as (

'"'""''■ good friends "do, and' thank : you’for your fine ■ 

and'loyal friendship. I t’-has been a pleasure  ̂ ■

for us to strive to’ serve you this past year.

; , May the New Year be ’one , • ■

o f  much happiness and success for you. •

© Clean and Safe 

# ,B est For Heating 

-#  Higher BTU Rating 

© Best For Cooking -

".•"'Approved By :
: Architects

•  No Mow

•  No Fuss

' PHONE 9-3551-,: 
Night Phone. 4599

Prompt Delivery

This thing coiled "busi-

ness" is founded largely :M; !3ii-

on friendship and the de- ‘B

\ - - A
j sire to be of service. We

ore grateful for having our B

Truthfully, and in all

sincerity, we appreciate

your acquaintance and

the .patronage - .resulting;

from it. May the New

Year be one of full hap-

m

mess and prosperity.
W

National Bank
Member FD  IC  And Fed Res. System'!
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About Your Health
Short on resolutions lor the 

new year beginning Sunday? 
Here’s a list designed' especially
tor you and your family by the
Texas State Department of 
Health.

Promise to-give your body at 
least as [̂6od care as you give 
your car. Periodic examinations 
are the- best way yet devised to 
detect bodily disorders ' while' 
they can still be treated success-: 
fully, so let your, doctor look you 
over • thoroughly ■ once a year 
whether you’re ailing or not. 
Make it twice yearly if you're 
middle-aged.

Dental troubles won’t kill you, 
but sometimes they can make 
you wish you were dei.u.1. So 
check in once yearly with your, 
dentist; too.

If you are putting on .weight,-
resolve to Start- passing up the: 
candled .yams, • boiled potatoes 
and. the cream-filled tidbits 
which almost Invariably spell 
extra; pounds and perhaps .an 
early,' grave, , ' 1 -

Too much weight-contributes 
to high blood pressure, and .may 
be associated with hardening of 
the arteries and various forms 
of heart' disease. Too, it means

OUT with the old

with the new!

vigor, greater aulrgical 
and greater - danger from 

otherwise minor -illnesses.
The statistics linking- smoking

to cancer and heart disease are 
piling up so fast it is getting 
tougher and tougher to ration­
alize the habit. Resolve to im­
press those statistics, on the 
mind's of the teenagers in your 
family;

When driving, consider that 
every other car’ is being driven 
by a madman, and when walk­
ing trust motorists only as far 
as you can see them. Motor 
vehicle deaths stand far above 
accidental, deaths .of all ‘other 
types.

1 Resolve to take full advantage 
of every advancement in medical 
science aimed at benefiltlng you 
and. the family, but always on. 
competent medical advice. Start, 
by getting the youngsters and 
yourself immunized against 
polio if you haven’t already, done, 
it: - " -
-.■Promise to obey local and 
state laws pertaining to health 
protection, por example, if your 
town has a dog leash law, adhere 
to it. It is a. public protective 
device and you are the. public. ;

Last but vitally important, 
give an occasional thought to 
such awesome problems as water 
conservation, pollution abate­
ment; juvenile delinquency, and 
the growing, number of elderly 
people in our society. Lend your 
support as a responsible citizen 
to community efforts to solve 
them. (A weekly feature of the 
Health Education Division, Tex­
as State Department of Health.

MEDITATIONt o
from

'file World's Mosi Widely Used 
Dovoliooal Guide

The old year passes and will soon be 

history. The ’’New Year approaches and 

we welcome it with genuine enthusiasm 

because of the possibilities it affords. 

Once again, as the old year is ushered 

out, we look to the coming year, assuring 

you of-our willingness to serve you 

any way possible.

in

Thanks for your friendships 

thanks for your patronage
fAPPY

NEW
YEAR

6

Coleman Butane § 
Gas Company f

Burkett Highway Coleman

- C l t l p p t r
O  THE UPPER ROOM, NA5HVIUI. TENNESSEE

Read Romans 12:4-14.
Ye are the light of the world 

A city that, is set on .an hill can­
not be hid. (Matthew. 5:14.)

When the Scottish author and 
poet Robert Louis Stevenson was 
a small boy, he enjoyed watching 
the lamplighter go up and down 
the city streets at dusk lighting 
the lamps. Finding him especial­
ly, quiet one evening, his nurse 
called out to ask what he was 
doing. His reply was, "I’m 
watching a man make ■ holes in 
the darkness.”

The world is waiting for 
Christian . men and women , to 
make holes in the spiritual dark­
nesses. Much needs to be done to 
relieve the world’s misery. There 
are the hungry to be . fed, the 
naked to be clothed,, the orphan­
ed children to be loved and cared 
for. There is the story of Christ 
and His saving power to be told 
to the nations.

We Christians must use our 
time and ouf&God-given talents 
in building a better world, thus 
helping to make the holes in the 
spiritual darkness that is all 
about us..
PRAYER: -

Our heavenly Father, show us 
what we can do to bring light to 
a darkened wdrid. .May - we- not 
rest until the farthest - corner 
shines with the light of Christ 
and all men reverence Thee and 
devoutly pray, as Jesus taught 
us,. “Our Father who. art in 
heaven . . . . Amen.” ' -
THOUGHT FOR THE DAY

There Is no darkness, that the 
love of God cannot- penetrate.

— A. E. Purviance

Fathers Can Give y 
Family Finest G i l t '., 
N ext Christmas .'

.BSeetrie trams,''-.dolls,.,- jewelry., 
clothing - and similar items oil 
make fine Christmas gifts,- but 
according to.T. O. Musick,. Gen­
eral Manager, Texas ‘Safety As­
sociation, the, finest?' Christmas 
gift a father can give Ids family 
if a cpotDss driving record.
‘ “Each . year /  the; ,j Christmas 

season is- saddened for manv 
Texas families by traffic acci­
dents Then- is http- cheer m Uni 
family group .when one.qr more, 
members are 1n a ^hospital or 
'awaiting burial. 1 

• "Most of these’ tragiy .scenes; 
can. be prevented, as tii.elr:. com­
ing is frequently indicated by a 
motorist’s driving record:

“When a driver receives • his. 
first traffic law yiolatlou cita­
tion-, he should become cautious. 
If and when he receives his ‘sec­
ond and third traffic ticket, he 
should realize the -odds are bet­
ter than 50-50 that he will soon 
be involved in a traffic acci­
dent,” Mustek stated. .

A study of the driving records 
of more than 40,000 Texas 
motorists demonstrates the rela­
tionship between highway acci­
dents and conviction's for mov­
ing traffic law violations. Ac­
cording to the study only 9 out 
of each 100 drivers, with no re­
cord conviction for a three year 
period, were involved in traffic 
accidents. Drivers with 1 convic­
tion in their records were in­
volved in accidents at the rate 
of 28 out of 100. This ratio in­
creased to 41 out of 100 for the 
class of drivers with 2 convic­
tions and jumped to 51 out of 
100 for drivers with 3 convic­
tions. Motorists with 4 o r. more 
convictions were involved in 
accidents a t the rate of 62 out 
of 100. : .

“A driver who runs up a1 re­
cord of convictions has a much 
greater chance of being involved 
in accidents than the motorist 
who drives his edr iiria lawful 
manner. Coming traffic trage­
dies frequently cast their*shad- 
ows before them. I hope all 
Texas fathers will take heed of. 
this fact and give their families 
the gift of a clean traffic record. 
This gift will help guarantee 

l that the breadwinner will be 
• around long enough to see his 
{children grow into' adults,” Mu- 
| sick concluded.

The -33,-4% Series E Savings 
Bonds the Treasury now sells 
for $75 are worth $100 in 7 years 
and 9 months, $144.75 in another 
10 years,, a 93% return on your 
savings. You can buy E’s in units 
of $25 up, on payroll savings 
where you work, or at any bank.

-»***# t

TEXAS POPIIMTIUN SHIFT’ 'F®’.T;.:{'-couhtfcs that irt fairly close - 
A, th ,-r ar '

end, population -trends in Texas nobulationY At fsrfriv -stable.

yennial- census',-have , now; .pejen 
given shine study and evalua­
tion. ‘

toy;^nrqasynpt „-fas. '.removed- rfrpm; 
'Wfitkydpph^

,,,, . n . .. , - - . j grow, .fairly, rapidly.”, However','
m ,1  H ? 1 ? I ? w ^ l ’unt P ' the anticipated populationadd up to-are that the thinly-1 expIosion actuaily arriVes, open- 

populated open-country areas J cpuntlx strictly rurai counties
of. the State axe becoming' even 
more thinly "'populated while 
more people are' flocking to 
counties which al'ready- are. 
thickly populated.,

Over-all, in round' numbers, 
the total 'Texas population in­
creased from 7,700,000 in 1950 to 
9,500,000 in i960, a rate -of 
growth amounting to 23 percent 
against the national increase of 
17: percent. Only two states out­
stripped the 1,800,000 gain in 
Texas: California, which had gn 
increase, .of about - 5,000,000, and j 
Florida which- grew by slightly j 
more than 2,000,000. I

But despite the over-all gain j 
in Texas, 144 out of .the State’s ; 
254 • - ‘counties showed- losses in i 
population. This was an ap-i 
proximate follow-up of trends j 
established in the decade from; 
1940 to 1950, with the losses in j 
total population confined,, large-1 
ly -to counties which have no j 
sizeable towns or cities and! 

i which offer-little in the way of j 
; industry. : |
I However, there were some ex-1 
i captions to the movement--away ■ 
from rural counties, Some1 of j 

; these counties, mainly in West] 
-Texas and in . the Panhandle,? 
: showed steady gains in popula­
tion, In general, these were)
; counties which have developed j 
i farming by irrigation, are' de-j 
! voted largely to cot-ton, and! 
grain cultivation, -and have re-1 
sources of oil and gas. : ]

Three of the older, compara-1 
; tively thickly-settled counties 
■showed the heaviest losses in 
population. These were Lamar;

- County in Northeast , Texas,' 
which lost 9,000 during the de-; 
cade, Hill and Fannin counties; 

, in the old Blackland Belt, which 
lost 8,000 and 7,600 respectively. I 
Then there were Rusk,’, Red ; 
River, Navarro, -Cherokee, Fails j 
and Limestone counties, all of j 

' which had losses of at least 5,000. t 
The trend, of the past two; de-1 

cades projects an outlook some-! 
-thing: along these-lines: Rural j

far ... removed-;,, from ‘industrial , 
areas may become even m ore' 
rural tjefore growth overflows- 
im their direction.- - / -

U.‘ ,8. Savings Bonds!- now ‘bn 
sale earn 3:!q% when held - until 
maturity. -Series E grdwsvin c&sh 
value for 7 years and 9 months; 
Series - ij - brings ; you interest 
cheeks twice yearly! for 10 years.

Weak McCulloch, Sec.-Treas. 
Settle McCulloch. Mgr.

Standard 
Abstract Co.

City & County Maps For Sale 
405 B.ank Bldg . Coleman

OPTOMETRIST
Dr. E. H. Henning, Jr.

117
Cpmmer- 

. . cial Ave. 
Cbleman, 
. Texas 

Phone 
8M4'

: OFFICE HOURS 
9:00 A. M. to 5:00 P. M. 

SATURDAYS, 9 to 12 .

B O B B Y ' S

1f)cnufif Q |u,,r
Phone 70

N E W  H I  
■ G R E E T  l

Last year was good to us, thanks 

to the many courtesies extended 

to us by our many friends and customers.

W e  are appreciative of 

alk the good things that have come 

■ . . our way and look forward to

We Have Been
B le s s e d . . .

Approaching the beginning- of a New Year,

' we are' reminded of thd countless blessings 

that have been ours 'to enjoy in the year just 

closing. .

It has been a pleasure to serve you in the past
,  ,  . '■ ■/

and we ask no greater privilege than the oppor­

tunity to continue to serve you in the future...

Happy New Year to each of you.

First Coleman National Hank
ALWAYS WILLING — ALWAYS PREPARED

Member FDIC andi Fed. Reserve Bask' a f D allas. 
w Coleman, Texas
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■ JOHN C. GREGG 
Editor,, wid. Publisher

pmusmo, E ta s  hbjday
AT SANTA ANNA, COtEM&N 

...: • COUNTY, TEXAS ■ ■'

. SUBSCRIPTION SATES 

..........DECEMBER 3% I960 '
,mcOp5IW.AM COUNTY ,

1 Y ea r ................................. $2.00
C Months' .$1.25,
OtfrSIBK COLEMAN COUNTY 
: l‘,Year In Texas $3.00
9 Months 'in Texas ____$1.75
1 Yean outside .Texas $4.00 
fl Months outside Toxins $2.25
1 Year outside U. 8. A____$5.00

Advertising Rates on Request1

1961 Poster Child for March of Dimes 
Ss Victim of Two Grave Birth Defects

T E X A S

7?t6miS£\ p ,  • -  • 1 196L

The Publisher Is not responsi­
ble for copy : omissions,- typo­
graphical errors, that may occur 
further than.to correct it in the 
next issue. All advertising orders 
are accepted on-this -basis only.

Second Class postage paid at i 
'Santa Anna, Texas.: \  i.

••o.i st,.-! ana :MV ifMSlKAHr SAM SEE-1’'
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g#ne ttje-'-'ias1
training business in. n big v:ry. 
In ternal.Revenue holds, a nun?- 
hoc M x-iu-L schools 1c help the 
Ptctrn.iion Dundee trail* their 
nduntj-,./.'agents and Horde IJe- 
njonsUatiun Agents. The comity 
;;glints and the Home Demon­
stration Agents in turn arc hold­
ing aim-arid-' of community 
mo«.th)g:: . -.viih farmers and 
himv'iMi'rM on irotp'ng records 
mid paying income taxes 
Thousan cl*h'rQl:::A^

Lv-V
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This likeness of • iinde. Br.eeso-.-'-appears-. qn- millions of posters and coin ..collectors.

©
Minimum

i

APS ©
Charge 40c Weakly

FOR SAM-’ : Hale Manuiacturing j 
, Co. Stock Trailers. AH tvpes j 

and sin Most reasonable | 
prim s in Wi st Texas Also ! 
erai usf u ti uiicrs James T. • 
Dockery, phone 137. Box 241. | 

: lOtfch
FOR SALE: Good used refriger-- 

a tors, automatic washers;. 
wringer washers, clothes dry-1
ers and gas cook stoves. Terms! 
to .suit YOU. Gfo. D. Rhone 
Co., .Coleman Texas. .. 48tfc.!.

FOR SALE: Several used TVs m 
good condition Geo. D. Rhone 
Co.,-'Coleman,1. Texas. 48tfc.:

FOR SALE: 200 acres of land,. EH)! 
in'cultivation. Well improved-,:
all convenience,., 5 room house i

, with bath, close in, immediate i 
pos,a ,'Mon M L (Rati Guth-j 

. !ne. 50c. |
THE ABILENE REPORTER-! 

NEDS can he delivered to your 
home or bunne.-.s address, 
mornines and Sundays, by1 
contacting John W Gregg 1 
,Phone 343 or 45 32Uc.i

Linda Gail Breese, a pic­
torial. - and1 : high-spirited 
young lady of four, who. 
lives in Columbus, Ohio, 
wp s ' no hied this week as the 
1961 Now,.March of Dimes 
National Poster Child.

Selection of the - vivacious 
child, a victim of the grave 
birth defects of-an open spine 
and -excess fluid on the brain, 
was announced by Basil O’Con­
nor, president of The National 
Foundation, parent body of the 
Now March of. Dimes. Study 
and patient aid m birth.de-. 
fects and arthritis, together 
with continued work m polio, 
embody the expanded program’ 
.of the health organization, 

yin January,- during ■-which 
the New March of Dimes will 
b e held -throughout th ©nation,

■ Linda will probably feel she-is-' 
facing mirrors everywhere she 
travel- That's because millions 
of poslers will-bear her like-'

- ness which, in drawings, and 
photographs, will also be pub­
lished ,ui thousands- of news­
papers and magazines. The 
blonde and blue-eyed chi.ld will 
also appear on network tele­
vision. . : .

Linda's parents are Mr. and 
M's. Dean E Bloc e Her father 
is an industrial engineer. Her 
mother, Dorothy Lohr Breese, 
m addition to Linda has an­
other daughter, Susan, 14, and 
two sons, Ronnie, 12, and Terry, 
six. Tragically, since there is

handicapped Linda among the 
Breese children, Ronnie is a 
victim of cerebral palsy but his 
general physical condition is 
described as good.
' Mrs. Breese has been a Moth­
ers’ Marcher for the annual 
March of Dimes.

"My husband and I are deep­
ly grateful that at last some­
thing constructive - is being 
done about birth defects,” she 
says, “We pray that The 
National Foundation which,

| through public contributions to 
the March of "Dimes, financed 
the -development of the Salk 
polio vaccine, will m time also 
solve the puzzle of birth de­
fects, which are the largest 
unmet childhood medical prob­
lem m our country today.”

Emphasizing the enormity of 
the problem, Mrs, Breese cit­
ed statistics showing that 250,- 
000 infants ’ m the United 
States are born annually -with 
significant birth defects. Also, 
because of thesfi congenital 
malformations, 34,000 babies a 
year in the nation are stillborn' 
or die m the first four weeks 
of life.

Linda underwent surgery to 
close her spine when she was 
less than a day old. The opera­
tion was performed at Chil­
dren’s Hospital, Columbus, 
where The National Foundation 
with March- of Dimes funds, 
established the nation’s first 
Birth Defects Study Center a 
few months ago. Nine months

You have- farm Ineofirfe, you 
should get a cqpy of the free, 
Farmer's Tax Guide, from your i 
county agent orffotn internal 
Revenue service. ■ ’

" le u  r-cu’3 more than money
with U, S. Savings-Bonds’' Is'-tile 1 
Treasury’s ,. _ bond ' ’ advertising 
theme tor ISiGO.-f'arl. m too ,-gtv ■
e gs of every elifeefi belongs fn

s conn Ivy >■ hood, now bplur
thun ever.

,- r r

AT HARVEY'S
FRESH PORK

LIVER Pound
FRESH HAM — Fine for Boiling

HOCKS Pound

Linda Breese

later, she again had surgery 
for excess fluid on the. brain, 
and the little girl today wears 
a “shunt” tube to drain off 
this liquid. -Linda also uses 
crutches but has been able to 
discard her leg braces. ,

Recently, while helping her 
mother wash dishes, she took 
three steps without her crutch­
es—a memorable and hopeful 
event.

m m

jJiStMzSOOiJ
; fetus

! details on this matter, address 
i.your inquiry-to John E. Winters,
Director, Texas State cDepart- 

-ment of Public Welfare, Austin, 
: Texas. His office is the only 
source of - official information 
as to how a governmental sub- 
unit may get'coverage for some 

: or all of its, employees.

persons hired after -that date 
are covered on a compulsory 
basis. ’

BUY or SALE: Good used furni- j 
- turn W M Morgan. 30tfr ,

W ANTED-TO BUY
WANTED; All kinds of sacks, 

burlap or.cotton feed bags. Top 
market nrieps. Coleman Bag- & 
Burlap ( -) plume 27, Santa 
Anna. : ■ 4tfc

QUESTIONS AND ANSWERS” '
Q.- My husband died "in 1939. 

lie w.t.s covered by social secur­
ity, but 1 was told that year and 
several limes later that I could 
not -collect on his..social security 
w hen I reached retirement age.

. ^11 Series E bonds of' any date 
are now guaranteed -a 10-year 
extension beyond the next m at­
urity date. Each $18.75 you put 
■in grows. to.$36.19 in.7 years and 
9 months,. . which ' is almost 
double your -savings,

SALT

JOWL Pound
BLACK-EYE

PEAS P o u n d .. 
2 Pounds

10®

$5®
RED 25 Lb. Bag

POTATOES
Q. I have read the questions 

m this series, but don’t  find the 
question I’d like answered. Howl Complete safety, interest and 
can I get - the information -I: principal guaranteed by the 
want? - • - [ Treasury, no risk of loss — plus

A. Write-to the Social Security j a -fine 3%% interest return — 
Administration. Box 5188, Abi-! are all wrapped up in one pack- 
lene, Texas, and you will get ai age for you: IT. S. Savings Bonds, 
prompt reply to your request. Or, i Ask your banker.

CARD OF THANKS
CARD OF THANKS . _

I wish So thank my ft lends 
and newhburs for the nict cords 
and pack.tees ] received during 
the holiday season' Your 
thought!uliu-.s i ginuiiielv ap­
preciated. , -
- Jack Lewis: - 53p.

Has  t h a t  been changed?
A Ycŝ  Survivors of workers | Phj,ek' t^e representative's travel 

who du-o after March. 31 1938 j schedule at your local post iffice i A pediatrician is a children's 
and before January 1 1M0 can | :ind mrH him whcn ^  is nexV doctor.

bo paid »n the saine mariiiei , jn your xommunity. No appoint- 
that has been ti u-' ,-fur oe,ath | ments are necessary, 
after 1939. A widow who has r ■ • ' ■'

The arteries carry blood a-#ay 
from the heart.

S I M
NOTICE OF FLECTION 

: FOR THE PURPOSE OF 
ELKCTINC, TWO DIRECTORS 
OF THE COLEMAN COUNTY 
WATER CONTROL AND-IM­
PROVEMENT DISTRICT NUM­
BER ONE.
The. State of Texas . . . .
County of Coleman - .’ •

TO THE RESIDENT QUALI­
FIED VOTERS OF COLEMAN 
COUNTY W A T.E R CONTROL 

-A-N I> - IMRROVO-ILNT DIST­
RICT NO.. -ONE.. .IN' COLEMAN 
COUNTY TEXAS:

TAKE NOTICK that ah' dec-| 
tion -will be held in The Coleman: 
County Water .Control and Im­
provement District No. - One ,on 
the tenth day of January: 1961.

, -at the Office Building and Com­
munity House in ' the ,• town of 

, Trickham . in said District in 
Coleman County, Texas, for the 

■ purpose of electing three direct-* 
.-tors;■■■■for the Coleman County 
- Whter Control and Improvement 
District No. One, said election 

. being called by order of the Di­
rectors of the Coleman County 

- -Water Control and Improvement 
District No. One, of Coleman 
County, Texas, by order dated 
the l&th day of December, 3960. 
Said pot's to open at 8:00 o’clock 
A. M. and close at 7:00 o’clock 
P. M. The three directors elected 
shall serve for two years. The 
Judge of election shall he Bond 

' Iteatherston.
3/E. U. CUFF'S

u Kfesfai«a3iVJ'̂ Board' 
of Directors of Coleman. District 
Water Control and Improvement

‘ ,8/J.H .M Aim N  
” ‘ J. H. Martin, Secretary, Board

, . Li. iv  - : ■
- --■> ■ '■! ■- ■: ; ■”

reached - age. 62. has not remar­
ried, and has not. built up -a 
higher payment - by her own 
work, can collect monthly wid­
ow's benefit,-, Alsu, adult child­
ren who have been 'disabled 
-nice before their 18th birthday, 
may now be paid monthly bene- 
uts based on the record of a 
parent who died after March 31, 
1938 The same is true for de­

pendent parents of su-'ii de­
ceased persons. Of course, the 
deceased'person must have had 
at least 1L years of social se­
curity credits. '

:Q. 1 work for a non-profit or­
ganization (or a church). How 
can I now get social security 

j coverage and credits?
A. The old requirement that 

two-thirds of the employees I shavetails, 
must agree to coverage has been 
repealed. Now, one employee 
may get such coverage if the 
governing body or board agrees 
to such coverage. Once the or­
ganization files a waiver to 
cover one or more employees, all

Rayon is a general term 
signaling artificial silk.

de-

GIANT

Box .69
GOLD MEDAL

FLOOR
Second lieutenants ■ are .called

Noah Webster ’ was the first 
great American lexicographer.

Guess they calhem. window 
envelopes because they contain 
bills that give us a pane-.

- O. My father works in my 
More (or on my farm). When do 
I start, reporting his wages for 
social security credits?

-A, Your first-report- wilL be_ 
filed . in April-1961, covering the 
first three months of. 1961,. and. 
then each following calendar 
quarter will be reported in  the 
first.month following such quar­
ter., However, for work on a 
farm, reports are made annual­
ly rather than .-quarterly,-, the 
first report to be made in Jan­
uary 1962 for the full year of 19- 
61.

!q,- When will payments be. 
possible directly- to the. funeral 
home?

A. For deaths after September 
13, 1960, immediately;' where 
death occurred before Septem­
ber 13, I960, this new provision 
cannot be used until December 
of 1960.

Q. How long must a wife be a 
wife in order t o  collect on ber' 
husband’s social security?

A. Before September I860,'-she 
must- have been, married to the 
beneficiary for at least three 
years; now she can qualify'after 
the marriage has been in effect 
for 1 year.

Q. VT&s any change made tha t 
affects city, county, or state 
employees?

A. Yes, Texas was added to fche:
group of states a^thortegd ' "

L v y A ir ; ; : - '  

M akes . ,

;/.L an«t A / - .  

:'Trucks j

Complete Motor Tune-up
... . Ignition .Service.. ... -

Brakes — Tires — Battery • , '

■Eveiything - inspected ' from: bumper .to 
..bumper and...all defective:-parts,replaced,'

- "AliOitr Work'-and'Parts Guaranteed "

Installed
r«BlU-0-HRIT

Motor l-o.

FOREST BRAND -

APRICOTSGal®

KIMBELL’S 3Lk Can

Shortening
BARBECUE

B e a t '-  Pork  - Chicken
COOKED D A ILY
Fresh Home Made Pies and Cakes 
Cooked Daily By Mrs. Jewell Ray

SfBttMWOHTllR

b A V ! N 0 
STA M P

Double FRONTIER STAMPS 
4 |§ |j! Oo Wednesday With $2.50 or

M o r e  P i r c l a s e *  " ■ -

HARVEY'S
p h o n e  30 . ■ • wfi bcaavi ■

No Delivery Between 11 a9m  & 1 % irt,
• 'l \  . .  ^ o . W l v e r f  A f t e r  1
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fiOR̂ 'i
Mr. ana Mrs. <kmhi Kemp vMl-

ed the wo-kcuri belurc Christ­
mas ■ with; Mr. and 1 Mrs. Roy 
s o  Lore -.t Z‘ l'-hyr and report 

, both are .improved.
Mr. and Mrs. T<raV Glass and 

' children of Austin spent SaWr-i 
day to - teonday - w ith . Mr.. and 
Mrs. Ji A, Hunter and Don, Mr. 
and Mrs. Tommy. Briscoe, and 

' children of Waldrip were with 
them! . Christinas1 Eve; also ' for 

, Sunday Christmas dinner. Mr. 
' and Mrk, J. Wi Hunter of .Cole­

man spent Monday with the 
(Hunters. Mr. and Mrs. James 
Hunter and Jimmy of Denver 
City were recent visitors.

, Mr. and Mrs. Charles Shef­
field and Mike of Midland spent 
Christmas, Saturday to Monday, 
with Mr. and Mrs. Jack Cooper

Mr: end Mrs. J. P, Hodges ted  i f  i James. Mr. and • Mw. H rfau jtj
sjsrci-rjr̂ ’ f I'ne riced RielKU'clcmis werei Anuta of smtomckif;....... ... -’■........ — ■■ ;...... •>.. {Cains Siuuro&y for a .Ohristins.-i i?

visit. . I f
Mr, ajid , Mrs. Leroy Casey,] ®

fei-fy Carl and Dana 6f San ita»
i.i ?, ■ . : ' >■ ■ i1
Mr. and Mrs; Curtis Bryan and 

Leann were a t shamrock for 
Christmas vUb Mr. and Mrs. <J. 
W. Hunter oh Friday and Satur­
day.

Mi. and Mm. Billy Mclnti-j 
and family spent Christmas 
weekend in Fort Worth With Mr. 
and .Mrs, James , Thoratqn.., Mri 
and Mfs. Ben Mclntire and fam­
ily. -of ,Atidrew(s spent Monday 
night" with, 'the Billy Meintires.

Mr. and Mp, Weldon Mc­
Creary, and family of .Slwllo- 
water came Monday to 'Spent the 
holidays- with Mr. and, Mrs! 
Frank McCreary; Mr. and Mrs, 
Fred Joerls' ttnd" family of Abi­
lene were Monday afternoon 
.guests..

Christmas Day guests with Mr, 
Aim!" Mrs. Frank Bryan were Mr,

and LaQumn. Sissy Steward w a s j j ^  Mrs. Wayne Bray and child

gelo spent Saturday to Monday, 
with 'Mr. and"MfS,- <?SrTBa#*Jr; 
Mr. and' Mrs. Dee McMillan were 
Saturday evening guerts.^Mrs.- 
Lillian Rehm aM 'M r, and .Mrs.

also a-Christmas diuper gueSt.
, Mr. and Mrs. Denver - MIMA of 
Junction visited Sunday after­
noon. .

Mr. and Mrs. John Hunter
were..hosts Saturday with 'a
Christmas 'dinner at the -Rocfe-i 
wood Community Center: At­
tending were M/Sgt. and Mrs. V.
E. Abernathy and Neil of Blythe-' 
ville, Ark., Mrs. Ruff .Hunter, Mr. 
and Mrs. R. c. Hunter and boys 
of Brownwood, Mr. and Mrs. 
Owen While, Sherrie and Mike, 
Mr.: and -Mrs. W. C. Patrick, 
Patsy, Steve and Brenda, Mr, 
and Mrs, Hubert Johnson, Joe, 
Lynn, .Gail, and Judy, all of 
Mercury,

George Chapapas and Kathy 
of McAllen came Saturday for 
Christmas with Mr< and Mrs. C.
F. Neyans. Mrs.. Chapapas ac­
companied them home on Sun­
day after visiting several weeks;

Mr. and Mrs. Tayor Boatright 
of Coleman visited Tuesday of 
last week with Mr. and Mrs. E. 
L. Estes and family.

Christmas dinner guests with 
the LeffeL Estes family were Mr, 
and Mrs., James Sluder of Rock­
wall, Mr, and Mrs. Cecil Day and 
children of Coleman, Mr.” and 
Mrs.’.Janies. Estes and. girls. Sun.-,

• day afternoon visitors’were Mr 
and Mrs. Bob Nixon of Valera 
and Mrs. Janie Conner of Breck- 
enridge.

Weekend and Sunday dinner 
guests with Mr. and Mrs. Johnny 

.Steward were Mr. and Mrs. J. E 
Porter of Utopia, Mr., and Mrs. 
o lio  Horton, and children of 
Midland, Mr. and Mrs. Chick 
Rehm -and Mary, Nell of Falfur- 
rias, Mr. and Mrs. Raymond 
Rehg^.M^s, Shirley Kalischa and 
Repe and Mrs.. Efewarjj, Rehm of 
uvalde, Mr. ,amd Mrs. Mack 

; Rehm' and Ginger, Mr: artd>Mrs.
Larry Ross and girls of -fBrown- 

' . wood, Mr. and Mrs. Gene Smith 
and Jeffrey of Tyler, G; T. Eng­
land of Houston, Mr. and Mrs.

: Tony Rehm. Afternoon callers 
were, Mr. and Mrs. Rolan Deal 
and family of Fort Stockton, 
Mrs. Lillian Rehm of Uvalde and 
.Mr. and Mrs. Denver Ellis.

Mr. and Mrs. James Steward 
and Jamie Kay were Christmas 

.Day guests with her parents, Mr.
, and Mrs. Elry Kelley in Coleman. 

Mr. and Mrs, Tom, Bryan spent 
. .Wednesday t0 Sunday with Mr, 
and Mrs. E. D. Black and. child­
ren  in San Angelo. Sunday 

-i'af|e?npo|i..:they visited with Mrs. 
John Whetstone in Santa Anna,.

M r.-am-M rs. Kenneth Bras-, 
en ip n  .spent Christmas Day 

..with Mr. and Mrs. Frank Burns 
and family a t Bronte. On Mon- 

Finest Brusenhan, of Cole­
man and Jimmy Brusenhan of 
Kingsville were visitors.

Mr. and Mrs. Ted McCarthey 
of Dallas spent Monday with 
Mfe-and-Mrs, Bob Steward 

Mr. and’ Mrs. Ray Caldwell 
went to  .Houston last Thursday 
to spend Christmas, with their 
children 

Mr. and Mrs. Byrl Hunter and j 
- children of Cortez, Colorado, Mr;i 

and Mrs. Raymond Crenshaw 
and. Mrs.,, Lorena, Houston of 
Coleman visiied Sunday after-’ 

.noon with the John Hunters.
Mr. and Mrs. Donnie Estes and 

family of Hermit, Vernon Estes* 
Jem a Marie and Linda of Bo­
vina visited Monday and Tues­
day with Mr. and Mrs. Matt 
Estes. Baroara and Linda Me- 
Intire were also Monday dinner 
guests. " -

, .. Christmas guests with Mr. and 
Mrs. Henry Smith were Mr. and 
Mrs. Jimmy Frank Smith and 
children of Iraan, Saturday to 
Monday; Mr. and Mrs. Don Gray 
and children of Odessa, Sunday 
to Monday, o ther Sunday dln- 

• nor guests were Ben Smith arid 
Elder and Mr. and Mrs. J. A. 
Martin of Santa Anna. Mr. and 
Mrs. K. J. Smith and Linda of 
Bsg Spring were Sunday after­
noon visitors.

. rY e Honry Smiths and other 
relatives were Saturday supper 
jiuesta in she Ben Smith home 
in Santa Anna.

......... MT; -and Mrs." Gr i r  P lieh ir and
Cynthia of Cwne visited Mr. and 
Mrs. 'M. A. Ricnardson V/ednes- 

• " day-and- Thursday • o r  a a ,

ren of Lohn,"Mr. and .Mrs. Mack 
IlarnbriglH and ehiidnm of Cole­
man and Mr. and Mrs. Curtis 
Bryan and Leann.

Mr. and Mrs. Pat Pattersbn 
and Paige of Irving came Friday 
to spend the holidays with Mr. 
and Mrs. Bill Steward and 
Sonsy.

Mr. and Mrs. Howard Pearson 
and boys of Calvert are spend­
ing the holidays with Mrs. J. W. 
Wise. P. L. Wise .of Brownwood 
was a Sunday visitor.

Mrs. Kate McIIvain, Mr. and 
Mrs. Aubrey McSwain and Gar­
land and Mrs. Gussie Wise were 
Christmas Day dinner guests 
with Mr. and Mrs. Jake" Mc­
Creary, Leslie and Sharon.

Mrs. A, L. Crutcher, and tu d y  
Jane visited Mrs. McIIvain Mon­
day- afternoon.

Spending the holidays with I 
Mr. and Mrs. Evan wise are Mr.! 
and Mrs. Bill Mueller, Stony, 
Lance and Pamela of Houston 
and Mr. and Mrs. Eddie Valicek, 
Mike and Terri of San Antonio. 
Others present for the tree and 
gifts Sunday evening were Mrs. 
Gussie Wise. Mrs. Jim Ruther­
ford, Billie " Gay and Jimmie 
Gail and Mr. and Mrs. Joe Wise 
and. boys. .
, Polly Wise of Brownwood was 

a Sunday dinner guest of Mr. 
and Mrs.’ Evan Wise and their 
house guests.

Mr. and Mrs. Oren Billings of 
Dallas and Mr. and Mrs. Jack 
McSwane and Stanley were 
Christmas Eve dinner guests 
with Mr. and Mrs. E. 'G. Billings.

The' McSwanes were in San 
Angeo Christmas- Day with Mrs. 
Mary Billings and other rela­
tives. . . .

Mr. ; an4-Mrs. .Lon Gray .were 
in Odessa Saturday to' Monday 
for Christmas. .with,.Mr. and Mrs, 
W. E, Routh and boys.

Christmas Day guests with 
Mrs.' Mena Shuford were her 
nephew, Amos Caldwell of Fort 
Worth and Mrs. Elpha Bowers 
of Coleman 

Mr. , and' Mrs.; Leon McMillan 
spent Saturday night with Mr 
and Mrs. J. H. McMillan a t Mel­
vin and visited Mr. and Mrs. J.
C. Long a t  Goldthwaite Sunday,

. Mr. ahiS  Mrss’, Clyde K ttard 
and’ family were Christmas Day 
dinner guests with Mr, and Mrs 
L. B. Griffin and family at Pisfe 
They .visited Sunday afternoon 
with E. E. Pittard at Mozelle.
: Mrs. A. L. Crutcher and Ludy 
Jane visited Friday morning 
with Mr. and Mrs. Uless Maness 
In 'Brady,, enroute to Rochelle to 
visit Mr. and Mrs. Sleepy Gar­
ner and family. .Saturday after- 
noon’Mr, and Mrs. R. C.-Arnold 
and Meri Jan visited in the 
Crutcher . home. Sunday - after­
noon .Mrs, Joe A. Hodges and 
children Of Coleman and Ronnie 
Haynes , of Fort Worth were 
guests. Mr, and Mrs. James-Bell, 
Shelia Kay and Jimmie R ay; of 
Lubbock were Monday- guests. 
Mrs, Hodges and children’ visit­
ed again on Monday,

Mr. and Mrs, ” Robert L. Estes 
and Phyllis of McGregor visited 
Mr. and Mrs. Elec - Cooper Sun 
day afternoon. Alfred Cooper of 
Snyder spent.Monday, night with 
the Coopers,

Bettie Straughan of McCamey 
spent Sunday night with Louise 
Cooper,

Holiday guests with Mr. and
Mrs. R. j.■.-■•Deal .wer.e Mr, and 
Mrs. C. R. Williams and family, 
of San Marcos, Mrs. G. E. Bible 
of Lockhart, Mr. ; and Mrs. J. O. 
Deal and Mr. and Mrs. E. E. Deal 
and family of Abilene, Mr. and 
Mrs. Rolan Deal, and family of 
Fort Stockton, Mr. and Mrs 
Johnny Deal of X\fovico, Mr. and 
Mrs: Robert Pern/ of Austin, and 
L. E. Deal of Brownwood. Mrs. 
Perry remained for a longer' vis-1 
it
. Visiting with- Mr. and Mrsv 

Rodney Dean and children for a 
Monday Christmas dinner, were 
Mr. and Mrs. S. M. Fellers off 
TMekhamv -Mr." and Mrs; Gmw  
Watts,, Donald and Byrl Fellers 
of Fort Worth, Mr. and Mrs. Jim 
Wells of Santa Anna and DeWitt 
Wells of Coleman.

Mr. and Mrs. George Cobb 'vis­
ited lost Thursday evening with

M r . s h i f t s . . Roger ;'.Bu®er.. of '.Mr,1 ..and,..Mrs,. Marcus . Johnson 
Owaia vjsited Friday to  Tuesday,! ahd“ boys. Mrs. Weldon White'
Mr. and Mrs. Ronald Cooper and 

■■•a.- „■ ".m . i-; . - ,
and children of Colonjan visited

afternoon, Mr. and Mrs. 
Straughan and Bettie
p-Betatee. Johasoa were

Rolan Deal a--'.I i;.vu;ly wem 
Sunday evaung vintoio 
- Chester-Brystrt" of Fort Worth

is home, for:the- holidays;*,; Jv-hli 
Mr. and Mrs. John Kemp were 

Christmas dinner guests
Mr.* 'and .Mrs.' Roy 'Gardner' antf- 
family and supper - guests with, 
Mr. ;and',Mrs. M. T. Traylor and
family, .. ........... . ......... ........
.■ Mr. and Mrs.;Ei M. Tisdale.ant} 
Miss Ida Mae .Day of Brownwood' 
were -Christmas Bay guests- with 
Mr. and Mrs. Joe, wise and-boys;

Mr,-and Mrs., J; R, Smith and 
children, Misses Colleen and Sue 
Wise and Wess Wise were home 
for the holidays. Sue and WesS 
will berhere through New Year's 
weekend.

-Miss Patricia Bryan of Dallas, 
is home for the ■ holidays. The 
Bill Bryan- family spent. Satur­
day and Sunday in Killeen with 
Mr. and Mrs. L. G. Tucker and 
other relatives. _ i

Mr. and Mrs. Lee McMillan1 
were Sunday dinner guests of 
Mr. and Mrs. .W. C. McMillan in 
Brady and spent Monday with 
Mr. and Mrs. Luther Crutcher in 
Bangs. The Harold Straughans. 
visited in the McMillan home 
Sunday evening.

Mrs. Bill Polk and Candy of 
Salt Gap came Saturday after­
noon and Mr. and Mrs. L. Brus­
enhan went home with her. Sire 
brought1 them: home Monday. 
The Junior Brusenhan family 
went over for Christmas dinner. 
Loretta and Judy stayed to-Mon- 
day. The Junior, Brusenhan fam­
ily were Sunday supper guests 
with Mr. and. Mrs., Ray Gleaton 
in Brownwood,

Mr. and Mrs. Brusenhan Sr., 
and Mrs. Bill Polk and Candy 
were Monday supper guests with 
the Junior Brusenhans.

Verna Marie- and Linda Estes 
visited Anita and Mary Broad­
way Monday afternoon.
. Mr, and Mrs. Morris' Straugh­

an .and Mary Ford visited Sun­
day afternoon with Mr. and Mrs. 
Fox Johnson.

Mrs. Johnson and Miss Bernice 
visited in the M. A. Richardson1' 
home Monday, afternoon.

Christmas guests , with Mrs. 
Rosa Belle: Heilman and Mrs. 
Hyatt Moore were Mr. and, Mrs. 
Hal Haines of Austin, Mr." and 
Mrs. Sam Estes and Raymond, 
of Sweetwater. Mrs. Bruce 
Snodgrass and -. Jerry j Bailee of 
Killeen, S. H. Estes and' Kelley 
of Sweetwater, Edwin Fowler 
and Mr. and Mrs. Charlie Moore 
of Coleman.

Mrs. Claud Box was a Sunday 
dinner guest, with Mrs. Teenie 
Campbell and family in. Santa 
Anna. ■

Mr. and Mrs. Marshall Camp- [ 
bell and Johnny- Pat of Eastland 
came, Sunday to visit Mr. andj 
Mrs. Claud Box. Mrs. Campbell i 
and Johnny Pat remained for 
the week. :

Mrs. Garnett Reeves, Bryan 
and Truett of Lubbock came 
Monday to visit Mr. and Mrs. 
Claud Box and Mr. and Mrs, Boss. 
Estes.

Mr, and Mrs. Gene Smith and 
Jeffrey of Tyler, m iss  Bobbie 
Rehm of Fort Worth and Miss 
Vita Rehm of Stephenville are 
home for the holidays. :

Mr, and Mrs. George Steward" 
of Mozelle visited Mr. and Mrs. 
John X. Steward Saturday. 
Christmas dinner guests with 
Mr. and, Mrs, Steward were Mr. 
and Mrs. Henry Barker, Mr. and 
Mrs. Bill Barker and family, Mr. 
and Mrs. Douglas Avants and 
children of Brady, Mr. and Mrs. 
Royce Yates -and . children of 
Abilene and Mr. and Mrs. Jackie 
Turner , and children o f Midland.

Mrs. Lee Miller spent-the holi-.. 
days in  Coleman with Mr. and 
Mrs. c. Nr -Davenport;

Mr, and Mrs, Harold Straugh­
an and Bettie of McCamey spent 
Saturday to .Monday with Mr. 
and Mrs. Fox Johnson, other' 
Christmas Day guests were Mr.' 
and Mrs. Marcus Johnson and 
hoys and Miss Bernice Johnson.

Visiting during Christmas 
with Mr. and Mrs. Drury Estes 
were. M r., and Mrs. Robert it, 
Estes and FhyilisToi McGregor' 
and,Mr. and. Mrs. Clinton Estes 
of Houston, Saturday to Monday. 
Christmas dinner guests were 
Mr.’ and Mrs. Dee Mankins and 
Gay Ion of Coleman, Mr. and Mrs;. 
Wayne Thompson and Mike of 
Dallas, Mi-, and Mrs. James Wat­
son, Cynthia and Pete of. Santa, 
Anna. OUier Sunday callers were 
Bruce Estes, the Rev. Douglas 
Estes. Mrs. Harold Straughan 
and Miss Bernice Johnson.

The-,. Rev,, .Pouglasfe-gstes., -and- 
Mike of Bridgeport, and Mr. and 
Mrs. Weldon Estes and Gordon 
of Big -spring-, were.:dlristmds 
guests With Mr. arid Mrs, Boss 
Estes. Mr. and Mrs. W. T. Bowers 
and Cora and Miss Belle Bowers 
of Coleman visited Monday 
morning with Mr. an d ; sirs.
Estes. .■ ... . .....' .. .........
..... .@»rift|aip.i«eate.»lth Mr... and 
Mrs. A. L. King were Mr. and

SPECIALS EOR FRIDAY AND SATURDAY

W M M  PEAS -  With Bacon, 300 Size Can, U  j
SHORTENING -  Our Value 3-lb. Can: M ®  i
HOMINY- Kimbell’s - - - 3  300 Size cans '25®
CHI L I-W o lf Brand 1 Large No. 2 Can 85®
POTATOES -  Instant la sh e d  (8 servings) 2 pkgs. 85®
HONEY-Uano Pure Strained Lge. 4-lb J a r  | | |
FAQ AL TISSUE -  Kim, 400 size pkg. - % for 4 9 #
BLUE CHEER-Giant Size Only S i©
SA LM O N -H oney Boy fa ll  Can § § g
BEANS-Green Limas, 300 size can % for
BARBECUE SAUCE-Kraft’s Large Bottle 39®
B E E F -  Arm Roast .Pound 49®
HAMBURGER -  Fresh and Lean Pound 39®

( F R A N K S -  Decker’s All Meat Pound - 49®

HOSCH GROCERY
B . PHONE ,56'.'' "' " ' ' . |

W. H. Burdens 
Observe Golden 
Wedding- Dee. 25
l, Mr. and ‘Mrs. Homer Burden 
.‘observed- their. Golden Wedding 
anniversary- in the home of her 
sister Christmas Day. Visiting 
hours were,from .3:00 to, 6:00, p;
m. The observance was held in 
the home, of Mrs. Frances 
Everett.

Sponsored by their four child­
ren, the open house was attend­
ed by a large number of friends, 
both young and; old and a large 
number of relatives. :

Myrtle Evans and Homer Bur­
den were married in Santa 
Anna on Christmas Day. in 1910. 
They have made their home in 
or near Santa Anna during their 
entire married life. .

Refreshments of punch, cof­
fee and cake' were served from 
a beautifully decorated table; 
which was arranged with twin 
candles as a center piece., The 
four-tier Golden Wedding Cake 
was cut by the bride and groom 
of fifty years.
- Daughters-in-law, Mrs. Alvin 

,Burden, Mrs. Evans Burden and 
Mrs. W. C. Burden, alternated 
in serving refreshments. Grand­
daughters, Grace Burden, Mary 
Burden, Georgia Burden. - Ann 
Burden, Jennie Burden and Lin­
da Burden, took turns serving at 
the register table.

Christmas' Gun
Lessons Must
For Youngsters , •

Austin — Christmas is ? a ■ time 
when- hundreds of youngsters 
are first introduced to firearms. 
Whether it be with Dad’s rifle 
on. that first deer hunt, or when- 
Santa" leaves \  one' under " the 
Christmas tree isn’t  important.

“The important thing to re­
member.” warns'- the director of 
law enforcement, Texas Game 
and Fish Commission, "is that 
lie’s a novice when it,comes to. 
handling firearms. .

“Take him out. w here he can 
fire the rifle and really get ac­
quainted with it. Make certain 
that he knows how each part of 
his^new instrument works. Point 
out some safety factors that he 
should never overlook. .

“Most youngsters are more

be controlled by spraying..or 
mowing. -
.“For further information on 

Premier, write the Agricultural 
Information Office., College Sta­
tion, Texas, and ask for a eopv 
of L-.504, '

Hints on -Protein ,■ 
Supplements ' Offered ‘'

College Statipn — Feeds which 
supply low cost protein and low 
cost- energy age matters of real - 
concern to beef producers. Grain 
is considered, the cheapest 
energy soujrce, and protein sup­
plements should be chosen on 
the basis of their- protein con­
tent and cost, IT. D. Thompson, 
extension animal husbandman, 
says that anyone ' considering 
the purchase of a supplemental 
protein- feed for beef cattle 
should note the price’ per 100

,, , , , . pounds, the percentage of crude
than- willing .-to, listen,and learn, jjrotein supplied by the oil seed

protein meals, percentage ofhow to become a safety-con 
scious hunter, But it’s up, to Dad 
to give him this information and 
help; him take those first, few 
steps in the right direction.

“There's nothing wrong with 
a boy.-or a girl, getting a rifle or 
shotgun all gilt wrapped on that 
joyous night Just make certain 
that he or she knows how-to use 
it safely- before going into the 
field,” suggests the .director..,:

"A little encouragement and 
j guidance at-the right time may

Relatives from out of town at-1 be the greatest gift you can ever 
tending, were:.. Mr. and Mrs. H. l'give that hunter of tomorrow.”
A. Burden and Mal-y of Wichita.,' -•---------------- ;----------------
Kte., Mr.-and Mrs. G., E. Burden.: ] \ J ^ y  Q j-ggg .-. '
Georgia .and "Tina of Elgin, M r.G 7 . , * TD  , " '
and Mrs. -w. c. Burden, Jennie Variety Released
and-• Linda - of- - Lubbock,,-Mrs. ;.— College-Station--^-. Fomidation 
David Hubble - and children, of j seed for Premier, a new variety 
Lawrence, Kan.,'- Mr. and Mrs. i of sideoates grama were released 
Everett Lee , of San Angelo, Mr, j to Texas certified seed growers 
and Mrs. Bill McClellan o f; in the spring of 1960 by the Tex- 
South Caroling,, Mr. and Mrs.,: as Agricultural Experiment Sta- 
Darwin Watson ‘.of - Fort Worth..j ti6n. Seed should be available 
Mrs.. R.. J., Boardman of Lamesa,1; through .commercial channels; 
Mrs. : - Mary Boardman and! for general planting in 1961.
daughter of Lamesa, . John,. L.j ,dPremier is .superior to avaii- 
Bardem of Coleman-and Mrs.: Al- i able commercial strains of side- 
feed Wiliams, of Coleman, ri » [ oats grama because of its ability'

—............... .—— r rto grp.w. and produce, seed .under
■Putting' part; of .your , savings | limited moisture conditions. In' a

equivalent protein .from., non­
protein nitrogen, and the' crude 
-fat and fiber content. The high­
er fiber content, feeds should be 
cheaper than others.- .

Other factors should also be. 
considered when choosing a 
supplement. Mixtures containing 
ingredients which limit con­
sumption have the advantage of 
saving , labor and distributing 
herd, consumption more evenly. 
Mixtures of-salt and cottonseed 
meal have had extensive use for 
this type of. feeding, but Thomp_- 
son warns that water must be 
readily available when excessive 
amounts of salt are consumed.

The amount and, quality- of 
roughages- fed -may also i n ­
fluence selection of a supple­
ment. More’feed is heeded where 
forage is limited, thus a feed 
supplement which includes both 
protein meal and grain may be 
more useful than a straight pro­
tein supplement. The possibility 
of vitamin -deficiency also , has 
a bearing on the choice of feed 
supplements; ,, , , v

No one has yet found a sup­
plement that- fills a i r  needs and 
is ecdripmical to alh beef pro-

into II. S. Savings Bonds will-! limited number of tests,’this new; ducers. .-Thompson says th a t 'in ­
help to defend our freedoms, i variety .. has produced . more seed j dividual feeders must decide 
protect the value, of our dollars than the commercial strains, - what supplement to feed in their 
and strengthen" our economy. I Coronado, UValde and Vaughn.- particular - operation. He con- 
Yqu save more than money with i A : desirable characteristic. . of | eludes -by ’ suggesting- a, confer- 
U. S.,Savings Bonds. , - (Premieris its tendency to-retain-!ence with the- county agent be-

, , j its*spikes after maturity, -which; fore deciding on any one feed 
Before ytni- criticize the* Old.1'permits all of the seed to -reach (supplement, 

folks, -remember ;‘-that ,e v e n t  full-, maturity before -harvest.
.though a  clock’Is ran down,- it’s) Another advantage of Premier

is- the .-forage it, produces. Theright twice a day.

City, ,OkIa./Mr. and Mrs. B. E. 
Harden and girls of Houston and 
Mr. and Mrs. Gerald Sltterle and 
girls of Alice. Other guests were 
Mr, and Mrs, Lige Lancaster and 
Robert Sari of Triekham, Jack 
Rutherford 'of Brownwood, Mr. 
and Mss. .Fete Rutherford and 
family of atouston., ,

Mr. andters. Robeft Russ and

stout, upright stems- produce an 
abundance of long, broad' leaves. 
Also, the seed of Premier germi­
nate readily, and the seedlings 
develop?, into mature .plants in 
approximately 120: days.

Premier is recommended for 
the ax*ea bounded by Lubbock, 
Sonora, Stephen ville- and Marfa.. 
I t should so planted in sandy 
loam, loam and clay iourn soils 
at the rate of 1 pound of pure 
liife .seed per acre. Seedling...of Gteudcroft,. N. M., .#• . ............ ........  ......... .

with Mfe&ishtelcl .be done is  early s«tog»

> In the cow country where 
ladies were scarce, the cowboys 
flecked to dances. Because there 
usually weren’t enough ladies to 
go around, some of the men 
were picked to play the part oi 
a  ’ female and .dance lady 
fashion. The man so designated 
wore a handkerchief tied to his 
arms. This was called a  “heifer 
brand”. His reward was being 
allowed to sit with the ladies 
between dances.

Isn’t  It odd th a t the easier -a 
gal Is to took at, the harder l i e
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Shields News
By Mrs. E. R. .(ones

Mr. and Mrs. W. T. Stewardson

Honored Mr. and Mrs. A. B. Car- 
roll' with''a “42’’. party Wednesday 
evening.. The Carrolls will be 
leaving soon for their new hpme 
at  ̂Tennesse Colony, Texas.

Visitors at the - Church of

New Year’s Eve
Santa Anna Armory

MUSIC BY

The Cruisers
8:30 to 12:30

; , . v
S ' '  ' 'u • I*.’,,OaSvw
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A spine-tingling chariot race 
between two powerful four-horse 
teams from the movie “Ben-. 
Hur” w'Hvbc one of the, out-; 
standing attractions during the 
1931 Southwestern Exposition, 
and Pat stock Show Hodep* 
President-Manager W. E, Watt 
has announced

The Fort Worth rodeo, Jan 27- 
Feb. 5, will feature more than 
300 top cowboys competing for. 
approximately $00,000 in prize- 
money. .Besides the spectacular, 
chariot race, .spotlighted enter­
tainment will include Jay Uls­
ter’s nimble dogs, five colorful, 
trick riders and two outstanding 
clowns.-. ■ . ■■■.■■'.■ ■ (-

Forty-one “ pretty ranch girl 
barrel racers will add a dash of 
color : and excitement. Cutting 
horses will pit their intelligence 
against determined calves, and 
a number of horse show events 
arc scheduled.

The chariot race will find the, 
hard-driving white icom origin­
ally driven by Charlton Heston
challenging the -movie’s four 
dappled greys. The race will be 
staged live in Will Roger Mem­
orial ̂ Goliseum-at all 20. perform­
ances of the Stock Show Rodeo,- 
beginning Friday-night, Jan-. 27.

Glenn Randall, owner and- 
trainer of the horses, spent al­
most a-year in Rome training 
the animals for the film version 
of Lew Wallace’s .great novel. He 
and Glenn Randall Jr. will be in 
the chariots as the race is run 
again in the Fort Worth arena.

Jay Sisler’s Australian Shep­
herd dogs and his educated 
greyhound, Blondie, have been 
a hit on the rodeo circuit for 12 
years—ever since Sisler broke his 
leg. The young rodeo contestant 
trained dogs while recuperating, 
and formed such a fresh and en­
tertaining act that he gave up 
bucking broncs for good.

Five veteran trick riders will 
furnish the thrills in that de­
partment, and two top clowns 
will be ready to fight horn-toss­
ing bulls for the rodeo fans’ 
amusement and the cowboys’ 
gratitude.

After the Friday night opener, 
Jan. -27, there will be a morning 
rodeo performance at 10 the first 
Saturday, then performances, at 
2 and 8 p. m, every day through 
the closing Sunday, Feb. 5. 
Rodeo tickets may be secured by 
mail from the Southwestern Ex­
position and Fat Stock Show, P. 
O. Box 150, Fort-Worth, Texas.
.. All, rpdeo tickets include ad­
mission to the Stock Show 
grounds. More than 9,000 ani­
mals will be on exhibition during 
the 10-day show, with a contest­
ant round of judging and auc-

and
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Christ Sunday were Edith 
Toombs of Laredo, Misses Norma 
Cutt and Garoi Cotter of Abilene,
Mrs. Jim McNeely of Doole and 
Mr. and Mrs, G. C. McDonald of 
Vick.; . ■ -

■'Mrs.'Aikins and son, J. C., of 
Melvin spent Sunday with her 
daughter,;. Mrs. Jack Dillingham 
and" family.

Mr. and Mrs. Noble Carpenter 
and family spent Christmas Day 
in Snyder with his mother, Mrs,
E. N. Carpenter and his brother,
Leroy and family.

Thursday evening visitors with 
Mrs. E .. S. Jones were Mr. and 
Mrs! Bill McClellan of Green­
ville. South Carolina, Mr. and 
Mrs. A. D,vEppler and children 
and Mr. and Mrs. Geo. Steward- 
son. -•

Mrs. Lillian Lewellen, and Mrs.
Bessie Stewardson, spent the 
weekend in Abilene with the
David Zirkle family. , ... , , .

Mrs. Doyle Isaacs and daugh- which the public is in­
ter, Margaret of Lubbock, are | In addition, the Texas
spending the holidays with her i ^ anch and Farm Show; offering

ii
FOE THE-NEW YEAH g
GREETINGS

. As’we prepare to welcome the 
" New-'Yearj we want to say just 

a - word of thanks to each of 
you. You have been loyal and 

• considerate and we are truly 
grateful. Best wishes for the 
New Year.
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parents, Mr. and Mrs. Roy Bled­
soe. Monday visitors,-with the 
Bledsoe family were Mr, and 
Mrs. Jess Upchurch and son, Mr. 
and Mrs, Sam Squyres,, Mrs, 
Doyle Wheeler, Mrs. B. S. Jones 
and the Noble Carpenter .family.

Mr.; and 'Mrs. Leonard Will­
iams and Miss Mabel Williams 
spent Saturday night and Sun­
day with their daughter, Mrs.
Joe Lindly and family at Arling­
ton.

Mr. and Mrs. Geo. Wheatley 
and Dhnny, Mrs, Ura Dilling-: 
ham, -Mr, Richard Dillingham 
and Mr- and Mrs. Dan Wheatley’ 
spent 'Christmas Day with Mr, 
and Mrs, Riley .McFarlin at 
-Baird, ,
■ Visitors with the Audrey 
Eppler family - on Sunday, were 
Mr. and Mrs. Sam Jones of Mc- 
Camey, the Cap Holder family 
of Kermit, their daughter, Betty, 
and Nom a Cutt and: Carol Cot- 
tor of Abilene, the Doyle Eppler 
family, Mr, and Mrs. Jesse Will­
iams. and boys and Mr. E, R. 
Eppler. '

Christmas Day visitors with 
the Bert Fowler family were Mr. 
and Mrs. G. G. McDonald of 
Vick and Leo McDaniel of Abi­
lene. - - :
- Visitors with Mrs, Ema -D, 
McClain- on Sunday were Mr> 
and Mrs. Kenneth McClain and 
children of San Angelo, .Mr, and 
Mrs. Varrell iMcClain and daugh­
ter of- Midland and Mr. and Mrs,
Jim McNeely of Doole.

Mr. and .-Mrs,' Jack Carroll of 
Midland visited Friday' and .Sat­
urday - with his parents, Mr, and 
Mrs. A. B. Carroll.

Mr. and Mrs. A. D. Eppler were 
in Fort Worth Wednesday. Thelri 
son, Glendon, who is attending 
a,business college there, return-; 
ed home with them for the holi­
days. - • V

Monday visitors with Mr. and 
Mrs. Douglas Milligan were their 
daughter, Ruth, Mr. and Mrs. 
Floyd Shelton and boys, Mike 
and Randy of Coleman, Mr. and:
Mrs. James Milligan and Julie of 
Tyler and Mr. and Mrs. Edgar 
Shelton.

Vance Cobb of Odessa and 
Stanley Cobb of Midland and 

xVjiheh t unihss are - i s , imp .‘ t - \  ,
'2$ j ii'Ki Mrs. Gcc. Cobb O; f'undav j 

' i.lu. i ■:r-',i: faniiie:, v'sitod 1 ’Uh '
Ur- C’f , .1 J-tot’ime’iTi :rr„hy 

TV [ .V,.SC:l' jCr-
71?! Mr and E C.-rrol! vl ■ 1
:jr ; | 1 h-d ouvi’i'v mil i'.oisda:-' v.itn!fTY 

] •ekiiives "leivuvs.- Oohn-y. j 
Mr.- and Mrs. W'. B. Watson o f ! 

jCr-lc-mi a Tpmi., Ch/islauv, D.-v! o,- 
■-•iih f.u:,. i-l

an opportunity to see the newest 
aids to better farming and 
ranching, will be free to visitors 
throughout the Stock Show run.

id rabbit raisers through Jan. 
15. A l'SiiJ premium list, will be 
mailed on roquivjt. ;

Railroads 1
$21,104 in Taxes '
In Coleman County

' Texas railroads paid $21’, 194’ in 
taxes in Coienian comity during 
1959, according, to the Texas 
Railroad Association, ,

That amorfnt was the county’s, 
share . of the .nearly, $lG,0t)0,C00 
the railroads paid tliroughont, 
the state: - - , .
■ In'addition,'of course, was the 

large .tutu) in taxes -the rail­
roads’ approximately ..40,0̂ )0 em- 
nioyee.s contributed on their own 
property. The vast. ,majority of 
railroad workers, many of whom 
live in cblhihan county, owrf 
their own homes. ,,

Tim largest railroad contribu­
tion in Coleman, county was ior

■: a- '  r., -■ i,-‘ (■'
ed }q M ,304, while f.h*> rhsre of 
ihe’ceunty govemniiraii’s'operat­
ing expenses paid i&y by the 
railroads totaled- ,i4,S82. The 
road and bridge fund gained $3.-' 
208 'from the' railroads in 15*5u.1 
AH other taxes brought; the total.1 
for the county to $21,194.
■ • “With the future of our coaa- 
try and' state depending to a, 
great extent upon the education - 
of-opr youth, I; am glad to s.eo 
f-Jnit. nearly half of the taxes 
paid by the railroad,s its !59. a 
total of $4,565,103, wont to sup­
port the , schools',” said W aiter: 
i.V.v'en, general counsel »f the 
Texas Railroad Association. “Re - 
cognizing this need for educa-r 
tion, many Of our railroads also 
make scholarships ■ available 
every .^eai'.'' v -- ' -

A taxpayer is one who does not. 
have' to pass a civil service 
exam in order to work for the 
government.

W-m.
B
B
B
BI
B
B
B-
I

\ah/)i 1o n .

«m
S
m m 
«  
«m m 
m 
«m 
m 
a  
mm

!h&

4A1- m J b

Gray Mercantile Co.

»»»
X
XBB
X.
X
X
X
X
B
XB
X
X
X
X

109 West Pecan Cole-man

m
m

Tots *st Teens
COLEMAN, TEXAS

Pre-Inventory Sale
GIANT REDUCTIONS, ON ITEMS THAT 

YOU WILL WANT FOR NOW!
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DRESSES-Sizes 64248 Months 
|  DRESSES-Toddler Sizes 1,2,3  

DRESSES -  One Group, sizes 3 to 14 Your Choice $5 J§ I
Just $3, $4 & $ | I

Sr3
X

§  DRESSES -  One Group, sizes 3 to 14 $3 and $ 4 1
I  DRESSES -  Subteen sizes Your Choice $6.00 ‘
mm
mmmm

CAR COATS & CO ATS
’ ' ENTIRE STOCK — INFANT SIZES THROUGH'SUBTEEN

Front

| Sweaters and Skirts
Girls anJ Liw-s

' i ' «

$1.00 TABLE
i,v>. <41(47 »ns items
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"cbpnti^s oi ihe EUArd." at lh~ 
slntuhopse.
j Actual number' of turnovers 

this your will bo' low, witti Gov£ 
price Daniel,' LI, Gov. Ben Pam-* 
say and Ally'. Grai! Will' Y/Usoii 

, continuing h\‘ their- ' present 
offices.

No. ■ t change will be in the 
3upvenie Comt. Chlei lusUrc

■■:.■>, ■ .■
ty i , ■j> i

John 15, Hickman, 70, la retiring
air ' - - ‘ ‘after.» 5Pryear legal pafeor, in­
cluding IH : year;; oi nppoliato 
court service. ■

Judge, Hickman will be ' $uc- 
jjeeded- by Robert' W. Calvert,

■- assoc!
Supreme Court.

Succeeding Calvert will be 
£ollie Steal-Icy, who has served 
ns Secretary of State since J957;

now an associate justice of the

DR. M. Q.-SO WELL ,
' ' 1 CHIROPRACTOR

Phone 2-521—615 Commercial 
Coleman, Texan

Electrical Motor 
■And Refrigeration 

S E R V I C E

We Repair and .Rewind- Elec­
trical Motors Of Alt'Kinds
And Give You Prompt, Expert 
Sendee On Refrigeration.

B O Z E M A N
ELECTRIC SHOP

. . Coleman, Texas
Service ..Calls.., >___\  6281
Night Calls . . . . . . . .  -7399
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■h House will-be hold hi the 
_ te Bar Building, 'The. public 
is invited- fov .both-- occasions.' y 

Ooun oi Criminal Appeals will 
get a-new judge,' also, W. T;, Mb- 
IJonald or Bryan will succeed 
Judge Lloyd Davidson.; defeated- 
at the polls .-last summer. • Mc­
Donald will be sworn in .Lmuory. 
2 in ’Bryan, in the district rourt- 
room whore be has yrer-ldod a;; 
judge' for the past fivo; years. 
His brother, Reed McDonald,,a 
'notkry; public, -’ will administer 
the oath.i 

Already sworn in and ready tu 
go when, his term as hind com­
missioner begins on January J is. 
Jerry Sadler. Mrs. Dorothy Hall­
man, chief clerk of the Hou.se of

great grandfather
uel- Maverick, ■ also. of

Antonio, mu;
the- Tetas "Declaration- of Inde­
pendence . - ' '

.Other announced candidates 
for the Senate■ seat are: Hep. 
Jim Wright of. Flirt Worth; For­
mer Senator,-William A'. Blakely 
Of Dallas; Slate Senator Henry 
Gonzaleis of San Antonio and 
John G. Tower of Wichita Falls. 
COLORADO DAM APPROVED _

Stale Board of Water Engine­
er'; approved plans t-o build a 
$7.1,0110,000 reservoir on Use Colo­
rado diver between l.a Grange 
and Columbus’,

Farmers, ranchers and, bust 
nessmen from Use affected area

..............  . had -vigorously protested the
Representatives, in which Sadler Hooding of what they described 
served : three terms, gave the ns a nrosperous agricultural
oath. Sadler was sworn in nearly 
two weeks ahead of time in order

prosperous agricultural 
area,5- /They estimated it would 
destroy an annual agricultural

to be- “ready.” He defeated the,-1 income of about $1,.500,000,

v.:U L.i,;.g :.iv„!.
prosperity to all. As 'for me ahd 
my family, nothing could have 
been more perfect. Our son, Mr. 
and Mrs. Thomas Rutherford, 
Steven and.Diane, arrived here 
.Thursday morning a t 2 a. ni., 
iron) Concord, New Hampshire. 
Christmas Eve night and Christ-* 
mas night, wo imd all our child -; 
r.en, Thomas and,, family (men­
tioned), Mr.‘ ‘-and 'Mrs.',"1 flrih 
Smlth of. Snider, Mrl and,Mrs. 
Hilary Ruthcrfoid and Rocky, of 
Brownwoocl, Loyd and Lynda Sue 
Rutherford. Christmas 'Day we 
all had turkey and allithe trim­
mings with Tom’s parents, -Mr. 
and Mrs. George Rutherford at 
Rockwood. Present were Mr: and 
.Mrs. I/O . Smith, Jerry and Billy 
of iraan, Mr. and Mrs, Joe Dang­
ler: and' George Wayne' of San 
Angelo and. Dumpy Rutherford.

■Mrs.. Bert Turney, was happily 
night,'surprised Christmas 'Eve night,

■ i
.ro .. :■■ ■ 
..'. ’a i ! 
'n . :„i

Lend
-;d ■.

f ,-]
-ill! IU

daughter and husband of Abi­
lene.

Mi and Mrs Fail Cow;rt aperd 
.Christ.thAs Day r with Earl's- sis-, 
tors.'Mr. and Mrs. T.-K. Carra- 
way and Mrs.'Otto Sipipsdn and 
son, in , Goldthwaitc. Another 
sister, ’ Mr; and -Mrs. Hdward 
Lovplaay- joined, them..th'ere; and 
came hdme %ith thejCozarts "and. 
spent -Sunday, might,'1 returning 
to GaleaviUe Monday afternoon. 
;• .- Mrs. ^Walter • Yapcy received 
‘the message that a little’ daugh­
ter. had arrived to make ;her 
honie with Mrs, Y&ttdy’s ' broth- 
er., Mr. and Mrs. Ray Switzer in 
Texarkana, She was born Dec­
ember 19 and has, been named 
Virginia Rena;- Ail are doing finp.

. Mr. and Mrs.: Greham Fitz­
patrick and. children are visiting 
Mr. FitzpAtriek’s brothers in 
California;: Greham’s ' mother,
Mr. and Mrs. Wright of Brady,

j.o-. . r, , ; ■. •' -i ; !
■ i .).■. '.v  ; i !.■•".
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a Happy New Year, and accept 
my. thanks ' for gettii.!g your 
news to me during the year of 
i960, and- ali prececdlng yeans. 
Without your help it would be. 
impossible for our little news 
items to be in our county papers. 
Thanks.

Then there was the guy who 
bought, a carbureator th^t saved ■ 
30 percent on the gas. a new dis­
tributor that saved 00 percent 
on tile gas and i>. new set of 
spark - plugs that, saved 40 per­
cent on the gas.- Last time we' 
heard from him, his gas tank 
overflowed after 15-.miles.-- : \

GO TO CHURCH SUNDAY.

yrticn her sister, Mr. and Mrs,; are with the Fitzpatrick’s things

incumbent, IJUI Allcorn.
HOME WORK: ‘ . . . . . . . .
• While they’re still home, mem­
bers of the next Legislature can 
take their minds off Christmas 
bills by studying Governor Dan­
iel’s proposed budget for state 
government.

I t  calls for spending $376,000,- 
000 from the general revenue 
fund for the 1962-63 biennium.

This is $54,000,000 more than 
was appropriated for the present 
two-year period, but is 40 per­
cent less than the agencies re­
quested. It .does not include any 
funds for public-school-teacher 
pay raises, a recommendation 
which the governor said he will 
present after the legislature con­
venes.

Governor 1 Daniel will propose 
a $600 a year increase per 
teacher, adding approximately 
$94,000,000 to the state’s two- 
vear costs.

This $94,000,000 plus the $54,- 
000.000 increase above, plus. the 
$76,000,000 general revenue fund 
deficit adds up Lo a $224,000,000 
problem which the new legisla­
ture will face.
MAVERICK TO RUN

Latest to announce for the U.

'but . . .
m

Proposed reservoir would be 22 
miles long, with.160,000. acre feet 
of initial water storage space 
and 75,000 acre feet of reserve. 
Lower Colorado River Authority 
estimated it will save for use 
some 100,000 acre feet of water 
that now flows into the Gulf.

U. S. Bureau of Reclamation is 
planning the project which is to 
be operated by LCRA after con­
struction,
YOUTH PROGRAM GOALS ’

Texas Youth Council will urge, 
the next Legislature to enact a 
six-point program to cut down 
on the number of Texas youngs­
ters who “turn out bad.”

Goals are: 1. Adequate funds 
to operate the state training 
schools and orphan homes; 2. A 
juvenile parole system to provide 
supervision for youngsters re­
leased from training schools; 3. 
A state home for dependent and 
neglected Negro children; 4. 
Local youth councils to work 
with delinquents and to help 
prevent development o f ; delin­
quency; 5. Testing and- guidance 
programs to spot problem child­
ren before they become delin­
quents; 6 ,More job opportunities 
for youngsters to keep them out 
of trouble.
NO HORSE-TRADING

Highway Department agents 
seeking to buy land for rights of 
way cannot “dicker” with land 
owners over prices.

Commissioner DeWitt C, Greer 
re-stated this policy in reviewing 
an instance in which ■ a land- 
owner eventually got in court 
nearly four times what the De­
partment originally offered for 
the land. ‘

Though dickering might have 
saved state money in this case, 
Highway officials feel that giv­
ing . more than a thousand 
different agents auhority to 
“barter" with state money would 
create many more inequities

Commission policy is to have 
an appraisal made and offer the 
amount indicated by the ap­
praisal. Landownnets who do 
not feel this price is fa ir .can 
seek a better one in court 
SHORT SNORTS -

Women seeking to -attend 
Texas A&M College have struck 
out again. U. S. Supreme Court 
refused to review state court 
decisions upholding A&M’s all­
male status. . Texas Employ­
ment Commission , reports . a 
creeping up of joblessness in 
Texas. Latest weekly figures 
show. 80,458 claiming unemploy­
ment benefits, an increase of 8,- 
241 over the previous week and: 
23,639 more than lor a year ago.

Floyd .Miller, called her from 
Rozcllc, Utah. She also talked 
with the Miller’s son, . Rolan 
Miller, and his family.

Mr. and Mrs. Aaron Avants 
entertained their children. Mon­
day, with a Christmas dinner and

here.
- Mr; and Mrs., Darwin Ldvelady 

andiRandelbhad Christmas din­
ner with her father, Mr; R. A. 
Baker of Winehell, .

Mr. and Mrs. Lee Abernathy 
and children, Linda and Ricky,

a Christmas tree. Present were spent Christmas with their par-
their children, . Mr. and Mrs. 
James Avants and children of 
Santa Anna and Mr. and Mrs. 
Douglas Avants and children of 
Brady.

Mr. and Mrs. Walter Yancy 
and children had Christmas din­
ner with- Walter’s father and 
family in the Shields commu­
nity.

Guests with Mr. and Mrs. Wal-

ents at Millersview.
Mr. Sammy Shields was in 

Brownwood for church Sunday 
morning, and was a dinner 
guest with my grandmother, 
Mrs, Annie Smith and! Jess.

Mr. and Mrs, Bert Turney’s 
daughter, Mrs.: Matassa of Dal­
las, called Christmas Eve, send­
ing Christmas Greetings.

SAVE' EMI

EXPERT SHOE 
REPAIR SERVICE

BOOTS
Made to Your Specification 

Guaranteed To Fit

BOOT & SHOE SHOP 
.Coleman,-Texas---.

ter Yancy and-children Sunday 
night and Monday were Mr. and 
Mrs. Junior Switzer and children 
of Odessa, Mr. and . Mrs.' John 
Huxall and children,: Mr. and 
Mrs. O. C. Yancy and children of 
Fort Worth and Mr. and Mrs. 
Thomas Switzer and children of 
Abilene;;

Those enjoying Christmas 
dinner with Mr. and Mrs. Babe 
Gardainer were her children, 
Mr. and Mrs. J. D. Hext and 
children of Fredericksburg, Mr. 
and Mrs. Guy Edwards of Mule- 
shoe, Mr. and Mrs.. Granvil Hext 
and Deanne of Alberquerque, 
New Mexico, also, Mr. and Mrs. 
George: Jenkins of Melvin and 
Mr. and Mrs. Jack Wagner- of 
Blackwell.

Mr. and Mrs. Tom Bradley of 
Fife visited with Mr. and Mrs. 
Earl Cozart one afternoon the.

SAVE 25 PERCENT
On Granite Memorials

FROM LLANO, TEXAS
S-toiie Eternal' 'Georgia Granite, select Winnsboro 
Blue Granite, “Silk of The Trade,” and other certi­
fied : granites at regular prices.

-.HORACE: SLATE, Sales-Manager

COLEMAN MONUMENT WORKS
W. A. FINLAY

Phone Day 8376 - Nite 4341 — 1301 E.isl 3th 
Near Cemetery Entrance

l̂ r ilje ■

At this time of the year, as on

no other occasion, we are privileged 

to give expression to our thoughts

■of those whosp friendship and 

good will we cherish. May we extend

our cordial greetings and good

wishes for happiness and prosperity
( t

in the New Year.

SH IRLEY
Upholstering 
, Company

415 W. Live Oak
Coleman, Texas.

Reupholstering
 ̂Seat Covers - 
.• Remodeling
_ ® Repairing
HASSOCKS

FOR STORAGE
CEDAR CHESTS

Furniture Re-Built, Re- 
Styled, Re-Covered' At An 
Economical .Low Prise.

New Repossessed Inner-
spring Mattresses 
And Old Mattress ■

$2450
Good Rebuilt Furniture 

■ Of All Kinds
OH

teed
W m m m m m m i ®

Let’s peer into the iuturc lor 

a moment. We see, for certain, 

a much more hopeful year -  a 

year of promise and of possi­

bilities. We believe you see 

this, too.

It is our hope that the New
• ■ • V ■ if.' • ... .

Year v/ill open for you a path*
1

way to your most cherished

desires, ■

\ :x n
i - J ,4:
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Church Attendance
ASSEMBLY OF GOD . ,

t 5 ju J l im « :u t  _ . , _ 51
Sumnoy Vhoo« (urOO) . . 48 
Mm-aing Worship (11:00) 35
Youth DroRnnn (8:30) . .. 
Evening- -7/orohip (7:00)

NORTHSIDE CHURCH' ' - .
o f  c h bist

•i'nrollmont,    84
ihble (Jl.i'iS (lO'Ou) . _. OS 
Morning Worship 110:;>0) 95
Young Pi-oph; (0:00) ...........

■ Evening Worship (7:0.0) 84
Sermon topics-, for Sunday, 

Jan. 1; Msming, “Prayer Life of 
Tito Christian”. Kvening, “Prac­
tical Lessons on Prayer.”

. SHIELDS CHURCH 
OF CHRIST - 
v A ttendance___

SHIELDS BAPTIST CHURCH 
1 Attendance . ' ______ _ 15

- Visiting in the Hoy.'West home 
Monda\ were Mrs. Jett it’ Wood. 
Mr,, and -AJrs. Mac; Montgomery, 

- Jimmy-,and, Johnny,--all of Sweet­
water; Mr. and Mrs. Mike Turner, 
of Lubbock; Ray Garner of Abi­
lene; . Mr a and Mrs. John West 
of Hamlin; Mrs; Leonard . Farr 
of San.Saba: Mrs. Robert Farr 
ot Marlin: Mrs. Sam -..McCrary, 
Mr, and Mrs, Luther McCrary, 
Billy and Alfred,; Mr, and Mrs. 
Vernon Campbell, • Sue and 
.Buddy. Afternoon visitors were 
Mr. and Mrs. Carl Flores of Vei- 
non; Maj; Joe B. Flores and Bob 
of Ft. Sill, Okla.

|  BIG 24 CASSS GOLD COAST

€ Peaches 4
g  BIG 2 |  CAN OUR VALUE

mMr. and Mrs. John West off gjp 
.Hamlin visited Mr. and Mrs, .Roy '*••••••
West; on Friday night. Saturday 
they all went to San Saba and 
spent Christmas Day with Mr.
.and'-Mrs. Leonard Farr and fam­
ily.

Plums 4  cans

R a n c h o

& 303 CAN
m 
m 
m 
m

APPLE

SAUCE 6 Cans $1
& CAMPBELL’S- TOMATO 

Down town: Theatre $
Coleman. Texas

New Year’s Eve
MIDNIGHT SHOW
‘Saturday, Dec. 31 
' 10:30 P. M.
/ AVA GARDNER in . "

■ ‘The Angel.Wor.e Red5

SOUP 8 Cans $1

300 CAN — SPANISH

RICE 8 Cans $1
303 CAN — KIMBELL’S

H I . ______ __ 5 Cans $1
e  GIANT SIZE
e  
&
m 
m 
e;

46 OZ. CAN — WHITE SWAN

m m u  j u ic e 4 Cans

C o le -A n n a
‘ Drive-In Theatre

FRIDAY '& SATURDAY 
DECEMBER 30-31
ANNE FRANCIS in

“Girl of the Night”
. - — PLUS---- -■■■
JOHN MERIVALE in

“CALT1KI The
lmmoilal Mouster”

SUNDAY - MONDAY 
TUESDAY' & WEDNESDAY

JANUARY 1-3-3-4 
ELVIS PRESLEY in

f  GIANT SIZE
m

46 OZ. CAN — WAPCO

MATO JU K E 4 Cans $]

JU K E
§  GIANT SIZE
■Su*

€  
m 
m
&m 
m

46 OZ. CAN

4 Cans
DEL MONTE —29 OZ. CAN

IEAPPLE-GRAPEFRUIT DRINK

I
X
X
X
X
X
Xx
X
X
X
X
X
Xw :
X
X
X
m
X
B
X
X
X
X
X

X-
Xx
X

0; GIANT SIZEi 46 OZ. CAN — KIMBELL’S

“G. I. Blues'n

O A K
Drive-In Theatre

v * ' FRIDAY & SATURDAY.
DECEMBER 30-31 

ALAN LADD in

“One, Foot in Hell”
----- PLUS-----

WALTER REED in

“Maeumba Love”

FAT HENS 3  t o  4  lb .
Average

m NICE MEATY

I PORK CHOPS 3 lbs. $1m

SALT JOWLS 5 lbs. $1
For Seasoning Your New

SUNDAY & MONDAY 
JANUARY J-2 

' • WALT DISNEY’S

“PQLLYANNA”

WEDNESDAY & THURSDAY
*.-5

Bargain Night
RCW* P.itV T ju rf

PUKE POKE

SAUSAGE

S L O P  Each
HORMEL — SLICED

■#* 11
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