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SA Defeated in Regional Playoff
Santa Anna’s hope for the 

highest Class B football title 
faded Friday night as Aca­
demy High School of Tem­
ple won the Region 5 champ­
ionship by a slim 7-0 score. 
The defensive battle was 
played at the. Lampasas High 
School stadium.

The lone Score came late in 
the third - quarter as AHS 
halfback Don Harmon made 
the TD. The kick for extra 
point was good.

The Mountaineers could get 
no closer to pay dirt than the 
Bumblebee 37, and only 
crossed the mid-stripe two 
other times during the game.

The loss Friday night came 
after six victories in a row 
for Santa Anna. Their sea­
son record ended 9-3 and4n- 
cluded the District 18-! 
championship and Bi-District 
championship.
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Although our fine football 
team lost the regional cham­
pionship game Friday night 
by a close 7-0, we’ve had the 
best season in years and are 
proud of their representa­
tion of the school and com­
munity. Again, congratula- 
tulations to the coaches and 
team.

A large banner across the 
main downtown . intersection 
proclaims "Home of the 
Mountaineers — Bi-District 
Champs—1971.” 

bk
Everyone is urged to be in 

town Friday for the holiday 
festivities which will indlivde 
a  2:00 p. m. parade. Most Ve 
us have hardly had tiip'e to ' 
‘think Christmas, and it’s 
none too soon to get into the 
act.
One of the biggest and best 

parades in several years is 
planned and there will be 
other activities during the 
day. i

Of course Santa Claus will) 
be on hand to visit with the 
children in the community 
following the parade, 

bk
Don’t forget to send us let­

ters to Santa Claus for the 
Christmas edition, Dec. 23. 
We will need the letters by 
next Wednesday, Dec. 15, so 
they can be printed and for­
warded on to Santa, 

bk
About 50 children were 

photographed Saturday for 
our coming "Citizens of To­
morrow” series. We appre­
ciate the cooperation of the 
local people with the project 
and are looking forward to 
the pictorial series of local 
children.

bk
The Santa Anna FFA-FHA 

annual barbecue will be held 
on Monday night, Dec. 20. 
Just like last year, Billy Riley 
and his FFA committee will 
barbecue anything (well, al- 
ngost anything!) that is con­
tributed for the meal.

, 'Last year a few armadillos 
wiere included ip the barbe­
cue and reported to be choice 
eating.

'■The FFAers have not had as 
i successful'" a season this year 
i as last, s0 donations of ven- 

sion, turkey, or other meat 
! for the barbecue will be ap­
preciated. The hoys will be 
happy to dress the game if 
any is available before Mon­
day morning, Dec. 20.

The Mountaineers had only 
99 yards on the ground and 
seven yards in the air Friday 
night. Fullback Rickey Beal, 
most consistant yard-gainer 
for the Mountaineers, was 
limited to 56 yards. Rocky 
Dean had 38 yards for the 
evening.

The first half showed an 
even four first downs per 
team with Academy making 
72 yards and Santa Anna 61. 
The two teams were very 
even in size and style.

The Mountaineers have 
showed improvement with 
each game this season, ac­
cording to head coach J. A. 
Smelley. Their season has 
been the best for the Moun- 
ties in many years and pro­
duced the first and only Bi- 
District championship for the 
school in its history.

The Academy High School 
tean came to the champion­
ship tilt with an 8-3 record.

The Mountaineer defense 
was excellent in the Friday 
night game but the. offensive 
crew could make only short 
gains through the big Bum­
blebee line,
STATISTICS:
Santa Anna:

First downs—9 
Yards rushing—99 
Yards passing—7

Passes completed—2 of 9 
Passes intercepted—3 
Punts, average—3 for 26.7 
Penalties—2 for 21 
Fumbles lost—l 

Academy:
First downs—12 
Yards rushing—188 
Yards passing—0 
Passes completed—0 for 7 
Punts, average—3 for 30.7 
Penalties—9 for 69 
Fumbles lost—3.
Coached by Smelley and 

Larry Steele, the team is 
composed of co-captains 
Rickey Beal, Mark Wise and 
Rocky Dean, also David Hor­
ner, Tony Beal, Randel Love- 
lady, Tommy Lewis, Ronnie 
Daniel, Danny Valdez, Ruben 
Valdez, Billy Diaz, Tommy 
Culpepper, Duane Aldridge, 
Roy Keeney, Randy Long, 
David Huggins, and W. Ts 
Young.

Others on the 1971 team are 
John Rendon, Lane Guthrie, 
Steve Beal, Robbie Drake, 
David Drake, Hank Wise. Sta­
tistician is Raul Guerrero, 
and Danny Walker and Neil 
Fitzpatrick are managers.

The Mountaineers will re­
turn to Class A n^xt season 
where they will be -in District 
10-A with Ranger, DeLeon, 
Cross Plains, Bangs and Ear­
ly.

igfiChristmas Opening Slated Friday
The annual Santa Anna 

community Christmas open­
ing will be held this week on 
Friday, Dec. 10. St. Nick took 
a back seat for football as the 
annual festivities were post­
poned a week from December

3.
Decorated windows will be 

unveiled Friday morning for 
judging and prizes.

The Lions Club pancake 
sale will be ' held during the 
day in conjunction with the

X'
SA Girls Win Championship 
At Cross Plains Tournament

LIONS CLUE PANCAKE SALE 
WILL BE HELD ON FRIDAY

The Santa Anna Lions 
Club will have their annual 
pancake day on Friday in 
conjunction with the annual 
Christmas opening in Santa 
Anna. Serving will begin at

SAHS TOURNEY 
SCHEDULED FOR 
NEXT WEEKEND

The second annual Santa 
Anna High School invitation­
al basketball tournament will 
be held at tbe-4ocal gymna­
sium on Thur^d&y^Jthrougb 
Saturday, Dec. 16̂ 18, Teams 
from eight schools are enter­
ed in the girls snd boys divi­
sions.

Games will get underway 
on Thursday afternoon of 
next week. Games will, also 
be played Friday afternoon 
and night and all day qn Sat­
urday. hHj. i 4 ■

The Santa Anna girtSi and 
the boys team from S’t'r, Jo­
seph’s Academy at Rotf.ena 
were championship winners 
last year.

A complete list of schools 
and the times of the first 
round games will be given 
next week.

Parents of high school ath­
letes will operate the con­
cession stand next weekend 
with all proceeds to go to the 
athletic fund.

10:00 a. m. and continue 
through 8:00 p. m. Friday 
evening. The event will be 
held at the Lions Club build­
ing.

Boy Scouts and Girl Scouts 
are assisting with the ad­
vance ticket sales and tick­
ets will also be available at 
the door. The cost is $1.00 
per person.

Door prizes will be given 
away Saturday night and 
turkeys will be given away in 
separate drawings during the 
day.

All Lions Club members are 
expected to assist with the 
pancake sale Friday.

JHS Cage Teams 
Host C-Plains 
Monday Night

The Santa Anna Junior 
High basketball team will 
have home games next Mon­
day night, Dec. 13, when they 
entertain the teams from 
Cross Plains. The games will 
begin at 6:30 p. m.

In recent games for the 
local juniors, the girls teams 
have won two and boys have 
lost two. <1

On Thursday night of last 
week the Santa Anna $irls 
defeated thb Blanket girls 
18-12. In ■ the boys game, 
Blanket won .over Santa An­
na by one point, 23-22. Lee 
Wristen was i high point boy 
with 12 points followed by 
Jody Day with 8.

At Early on Monday night 
of this week the girls defeat­
ed the Early girls 13-12 while 
the boys lost their game 25- 
1 1 .

New School Bus 
Arrives Tuesday 
For Rural Route

The first of two new buses 
for the Santa Anna Indepen­
dent School District was de­
livered Tuesday morning. 
The new bus is a 48-passenger 
Ford. The second bus is ex­
pected in a few days.

Both buses will be put on 
the routes immediately. .

The two new vehicles were 
ordered last Spring and ex­
pected soon after school 
started. However the deliv­
ery was postponed until this 
week.

The Santa Anna schools 
operate five rural routes. 
Mrs. Tom Rutherford Is the 
driver of the Whon-Trick- 
ham route; Mrs. Eurell Blair 
is driver of the Rockwood 
route; Mrs. Rodney Dean is 
driver of the Shields-Roek- 
wood route; Claude Lang­
ford is driver of the Mayo 
route, and Darrell Ashley is 
driver for the Liberty-Cleve- 
landr route.

The route assignment ofs 
the new buses was not given %

JERRY HORNER 
In N-Gnard Training

JERRY HORNER 
IN CALIFORNIA 
FOR NG BASIC

Jerry Horner, son of Mrs. 
Catherine Horner and hus­
band of the former Barbara 
Jones, is in California tak­
ing his basic training with 
the National Guard. Jerry 
is a member of the Coleman 
County National Guard unit, 
having joined the group in 
October.

A 1970 graduate of Santa 
Anna High School, Horner 
attended Tarleton State Col­
lege before going to Plano 
where he was employed and 
attended school.

The National Guard trainee 
will be given a two-weeks 
leave for Christmas:. then re­
turn to Fort Ord for the re­
mainder of the four-to six 
months training as a heavy 
truck driver.

While Jerry is in Califor­
nia his wife will stay with her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Billy 
Jones and family.

HERE FROM DALLAS

Suwanee Smith 
Is Chosen For 
All-Dist. Band

Suwanee Smith, daughter 
of Mr, and Mrs. Robert Smith, 
was chosen for the All-Dis­
trict Band last Saturday in 
tryouts at Stephenville. Su­
wanee was chosen for first 
chair baritone in the elite 
group.

The tryouts were held dur­
ing the morning, and the af­
ternoon was used for rehears­
al. A concert was presented 
by the All-District group on 
Saturday night.

Suwanee is a senior stu­
dent at SAHS and has been a 
a member of the band for six 
years. She was in competi­
tion with baritone players 
from schools of all classifica­
tions—B to AAA.

Accompanying Suwanee to 
Sffeptyenville Saturday were 
her mother and Aubrey Ed­
wards, SAHS band director.

Qualifying for the All-Dis­
trict Band makes Suwanee 
eligible for tryouts in the All- 
Region Band next week but 
she will not participate be­
cause of conflicting activities 
on that day.

Mi and| Mrs. Montie Les 
Guthrie ajncjl son of Dallas 

.were herej tor the weekend 
! with visiting his parents, Mr. 
i and Mrs. M. L: Guthrie and 
Lane, and jn Brownwood with 
her parents,: Mr. and Mrs. 
Fred Hicks. Les attended 
National Guard drill during 
the weekend.

School Board 
December Meet 
Slated Tuesday

The Sa.nta Anna Indepen- 
' dent School District Board of 
Trustees will have thej regular 
monthly meeting on Tuesday 
night, Dec. 14, at the high 
school business office! Rou­
tine business will be included 
on the agenda.

AH memebrs of the, board 
,(are requested to be ^present 
and visitors are welcome to 
attend.

Santa Anna High School 
girls basketball team brought 
home the championship tro­
phy and three all-tourna­
ment awards from the Cross 
Plains High School invita­
tional tournament last week­
end. The local cagers won 
all three games in the tour­
ney which was played Friday 
and Saturday.

The championship trophy 
was awarded Saturday night 
after the girls defeated Ris­
ing Star by a 33-26 score.

In the first round of play 
Friday the girls won over the 
Cross Plains B team. The 
final score, was 43-21. Pati 
Perkins scored 11 points fol­
lowed by Becky Allen with 9, 
Janice Martin with 8, and 
Sherrie Mclver with 7.

The Saturday morning 
game with Talpa-Centennial 
ended 42-30. Bobbie Strick­
land and Janice Martin tied 
for high point honors with 
12. Pati Perkins scored 7.

The last and most exciting 
game was the championship 
tilt with Rising Star. Pati 
scored 22 points for star hon­
ors.

Named to. the all-tourna­
ment team were Pati Perkins, 
forward and Linda Dean and 
Tony Allen, guards.

The Bangs boys team won 
the boys championship, de­
feating Putnam in overtime 
Saturday night.

The Santa Anna girls will 
be, at Abilene this weekend 
for the Hardin Simmons Uni­
versity invitational tourna­
ment. The first game will be 
at 6:15 p. m. Thursday even­
ing.

The SAHS boys team will

be in the Jim Ned tourna­
ment at Tuscola this week­
end. ;

Games next week will start 
! district play with home gam- | 
es with the Talpa-Centennial j 
teams beginning at 7:00 p. 
m. on Tuesday, Dec. 14.

Burton Elected 
C of C President 
For Coming Year

Bob Burton, manager of the 
local West Texas Utilities Co, 
office, was elected president 
of the Santa Anna Chamber 
of Commerce last week dur­
ing an executive board meet­
ing of the organization. Chos­
en as vice-president was Ver­
non Rowe of the Santa Anna 
Co-op Gin.

O. L. Cheaney of the San­
ta Anna National Bank was 
re-elected secretary-treasur­
er, and Billie Guthrie was re­
elected as executive secretary 
and manager.

Joe Riley is retiring presi­
dent of the group and Tom 
Kingsbery was vice-president 
during the past year.

During the meeting it was 
voted to continue affiliation 
with the West Texas Cham­
ber of Commerce.

Officers for the group are 
elected by the directors of the 
organization, who include C. 
N. Perry, Roy Horne, Thomas 
Wristen, Jake McCreary, Nor­

m a n  Walters, Kingsbery, 
Rowe, Cheaney and Burton.

other activities.
The big Santa Claus par­

ade is cheduled for 2:00 p. 
m. through the downtown 
area. Several floats have 
been entered in the competi­
tion and there will be bands, 
decorated bicycles, children 
in costume, and Santa Claus.

Plans call for the parade 
to assemble on Avr.’v.i'' D and 
go through the downtown 
main street.

Following the parade San-' 
ta Claus will be visiting with 
children in the downtown 
area. Band mebers who have 
marched in the parade will, 
be entertained with a Coke 
party at the Lions Club build­
ing.

In conjunction with the 
holiday activities there will 
be drawings for merchandise 
prizes on Saturday, Dec. 18, 
and Friday, Dec. 24. The 
time of the drawings will be 
announced next week.

Merchants in Santa Anna 
have cooperated to sponsor 
the Christmas activities and 
Jim Burchfield is serving as 
chairman of the committee. 
Bill Griffith and Bob Burton 
will be in charge of the Coke 
party and Cullen Perry is in 
charge of the parade.,

Everyone in the community 
is invited to attend the par­
ade and other activities on 
Friday.

School will be dismissed 
early Friday afternoon so 
that all local children can 
participate in or attend the 
parade.

Seminary Student New Pastor 
Of Rockwood Baptist Church

John Lindsey, a student at 
Southwestern -Baptist Theo- 
lop l Seminary :r. Ft. Worth, 
is the new pastor of Rock­
wood 'Baptist Church. He 
accepted the pastorate of the 
church two weeks ago.

SA Garden Club 
Holiday Bazaar 
Set Saturday

The annual Mountain City 
Garden Club Christmas ba­
zaar will be held on Satur­
day, Dec. 11, at the Lions Club 
building. The ladies in the 
organization will have for 
sale holiday decorations, gift 
items, hand made articles, 
and all kinds of baked goods.

The bazaar will open at 10 
a. m. and continue until 
everything is sold. Holiday 
shoppers are urged to visit 
the annual bazaar Saturday 
and visitors are invited to 
come in to see the many in­
teresting items on display.

The plans for the bazaar 
were made at the Friday 
meeting of the club which 
was held at the clubrqoms 
of the City Library building. 
Also planned at the meejting 
was the decoration of !the 
downtown window which |will; 
be done Tuesday afternoon 
at 1:00 p. m. All members of 
the Garden Club are asked to 
be present for both the win­
dow decoration and the Sat­
urday bazaar. ;

Special orders for baked 
goods may be placed with 
Mrs. Bert Turney before Sat­
urday.

- ' , fe ■

A native of Chattanooga, 
Tenn., Lindsey is 22 years old 
and a graduate of Ouachita 
Baptist University in Arka- 
delphia, Ark. He received his 
degree last spring and en­
rolled in the seminary for 
further study.

Mr. Lindsey is the son of 
Dr. and Mrs. Henry C. Lind­
sey of Brownwood. His par­
ents are both processors at 
Howard Payne College.

The Rockwood church has 
been without a postor for 
several months following the 
resignation of David Albin.

November Rain
Puts 71 Total____
To 23 Inches

Light rain fell in the Santa 
Anna area during the past 
week with 75 being the offi­
cial report for Santa Anna 
last Thursday, Dec. 2. Addi­
tional rain was reported on 
Sunday morning but the of­
ficial measurement was not 
given.

The surrounding communi­
ties have reported, from: one 
to two inches of rjain during 
the four-day period.

Ray Owen, official rainfall 
reporter for Santa Anna, sub­
mitted his report1 for the 
month of November showing 
a total of .79 inch during the 
past month. The rain fell on 
Nov. 22 with a .60 measure­
ment, and on Nov. 30 when 
.10 was received. The rain­
fall "was given fo r1 the offi­
cial gauge in the east edge of 
town.

[HELP NEEDED 
WITH PROJECT 
BY FIRE DEPT.

The Santa Anna Volunteer 
Fire Department has receiv­
ed very few toys for their 
annual Christmas pro|edt. 
The VFD, assisted by the 
Girl Scouts, is repairing and 
reconditioning used toys to 
be given to -local children a t 
Christmas.

Only two weeks remain be­
fore the toys are to be dis­
tributed and so far there are 
not enough of any kind. No 
large wheeled toys have been 
donated, such as wagons, tri­
cycles and bicycles. These 
are heeded in any condition 
as parts of wrecked bikes can. 
be used to repair others.

Also needed are books, gam­
es, puzzles and other items 
which can be used as gifts.

Over 20 families are to be 
included in the Christmas 
project this year so many 
toys and gifts are needed.

Anyone with items' to be 
donated may take them to 
the Allyn Early Garage or 
contact any member of the 
fire department. The toys 
are needed immediately so 
that necessary repairs may 
be made before Christmas.

Two From S-Anna 
Attend Workshop

SAHS Principal Floyd Mar­
shall and sophomore student 
Lane Guthrie were in San 
Angelo recently to attend a 

1 crime prevention and chug 
abuse workshop at Angelo 
State University. Lane, the 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Montie 
Guthrie, will assist local fa­
culty members in preparing 
and presenting the program 
in the jlocal school nexi year. 
The ferjme prevention portion 
of the ; program is new this 
year and will be added to the 

^drug abuse program next fall.
Students >om small schools 

throughout Region XV' at- 
I tended the meeting and work- 
j's^on. Several other work- 
! shops \yill be presented dur­
ing the coming months and 

[attended by the Santa Anna 
* representatives.

i
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Austin — House Speaker 
Gus Mutscher’s bribery trial 
site switched abruptly from 
Austin ,to Abilene, with Feb­
ruary or March now the ex­
pected date.

With both the defense and 
state filing rival motions for 
change" of venue, Austin Dist­
rict Judge Tom Blackwell con­
cluded extensive publicity in 
the capital city area made a 
transfer of the case advisable.

He sent it to the 104th dist-! 
rict court of Judge J. Neil

bought the antibiotics will 
share in the $4.6 million re­
covery against five large drug 
companies named in the anti­
trust suit. The U. S. Supreme 
Court denied the companies’ 
last appeal October 12.

Martin and his staff are 
■working on an allocation for­
mula. A New York federal 
court will hold a hearing after 
notice to all claimants, hope­
fully in January.

The drug case is the pioneer 
I “treble damage” anti-trust

Ik, O w i  O p in io n

Daniel in Taylor County along i case allowin:' individual con- 
with indictments of co-defen- j sumers to be represented by 
dants Rep. Thomas C. Shannon i the Attorney General and re- 
of Fort Worth and S. Rush j cover damages (or overcharges 
McGinty c-f Austin, a Mutscher | Pa*d as a result of price-fixing 
ajcje " j conspiracies.

Defense attorneys had con- j LEGAL OPINIONS — Candi- 
tended widespread news cover- i dates who moved into new
age made a fair trial of the

area impossible. The indict­
ment grew out of Mutscher’s

districts before Nov. 7 (a year
speaker in the Central Texas prior to the 1972 general elec­

tion) are eligible to run for 
House and Senate seats in 

and co-defedent’s 1969 profits those districts, Secretary of
on National Bankers Life In­
surance Company stock. State 
alleges he received the stock 
tips and loans for purchases

State Bob Bullock held in an 
opinion prepared as chief state 
election officer.

Atty. Gen. Martin released
in exchange for helping pass i a long list of opinions includ- 
bank deposit insurance legisla- ing the following:

By W. T. HAYS

IT MAKES ONE WONDER just what benefits this 
country is getting out of the United Nations when we 
review recent events in that body.

The Security Council can agree on the most minute 
things. When some big controversy come up, like the 
India-Pakistan war, and of the big four can stop action 
by their veto. The majority doesn’t mean a thing.

In the efforts to push for a cease-fire everyone except 
Russia, and Poland which is merely a shadow of their 
dominating country, voted for the cease-fire. But, be-j 
cause Rusia was one of the Big Four, their vote against 
it was an automatic veto.

It would seem that the United Nations is merely 
a sounding board for propaganda and a hiding place for 
those who would spy on the United States. We furnish 
the place, the majority of the money, and they come' 
over and take advantage of it.

This country has always been a sucker for that 
kind of situation, however, dating back to the League 
of Nations, which accomplished about as much as the 
United Nations. The only time there has been an agree­
ment is when it suits the purposes of the Communists 
and we go along.

One notable result in the voting brought out into the 
open the enmity of Communist China and Russia. They 
voted against each other and in the preliminary debate 
took advantage of the opportunity to blast one another. 
The fact that they are not the best of friends is a well 
known fact, but heretofore they have put up some kind 
of a front to make it look like things weren’t so bad 
between them.

The Chinese Reds sided with the Pakistanis and 
the Russians went along with India, so we wonder which 
one is wrong. Probably both.

However, there is no way of knowing the true facts 
about this war because we don’t know who to believe.; 
Each one would place the blame on the other and, frank­
ly, this writer wouldn’t believe either of them.

One thing, and I am sure my opinion is not alone, 
we had better keep our nose out of it except within 
the body of the United Nations and the Security Council. 
If we didn’t learn a lesson in Viet Nam, we will never 
learn one, Now that Russia and Red China are taking 
sides in the affair, let them supply their favorites and- 
we can stay clear of the whole thing.

It was notable that France and Great Britain abs­
tained in the voting in the Security Council. That should 
be a good example for us. Of course we can and should | 
champion peace, as we have done throughout the exist-1. 
ence of this country, but we certainly should not become, 
involved in any way in the dispute. |

It all goes back to the fact that you can’t buy friend-1 
ship. Look at the record of the nations we have helped 
with foreign aid, and we can. see for ourselves how pro­
fitable it was. Most of the countries we have helped 
wouldn’t spit on us if we were on fire. The recent vote 
in the United Nations on the admittance of Red China 
and the expulsion of the Formosa China is indication 
enough.

Politicians reacted angrily over this, but then claim­
ed that cutting foreign aid and UN funds were not reta­
liation. What if it was retaliation? That is something that 
those who opposed us know best. They are past masters 
at retaliating when they don’t get their way. -

It is our opinion that foreign aid should ,be cut to 
an absolute minimum and opr contribution to the United 
Nations should be limited' to varely our pro-r'ata 
beginning now! If that is retaliation — so be it.

ijou Want 
what -gou. 

w a n t
when gou
wmiT...

WBNTAPS
are for t j o u  !

................................  ’ ‘ ......... '

tion favored by Houston bank­
er Frank Sharp.

Travis County District At­
torney Robert O. Smith turned 
the, defense argument around.
He said Mutscher has so much 
power in Austin, where many 
citizens work for the state, 
that finding a jury free to give 
the state’s case open considera. | tion.
tion there may be difficult, j •  Potter County may not

Blackwell didn’t buy either j legally employ a flagman at 
argument entirely, but conced-1 a railroad crossing on a county 
ed Austin newspapers, radio 1 road, but services can be per- 
and television stations had formed by a traffic officer or 
covered the case rather enthu- a signal light and bell may be 
siastically since last January, provided under county cont-

•  The time natural gas is 
produced under “take or pay” 
purchase contracts actuates ac­
crual of production taxation on 
deficiency payments. The total 
price under contracts is the 
measure of the market value, 
based on the tax rate in effect 

i at the time of actual produc-

Further, he stated the coverage 
blanketed counties surrounding 
the capital city.

Mutscher said he was satis­
fied with Abilene as the trial 
site.

“The only thing that we have 
ever asked is that we be af­
forded a fair trial,’’ Mutscher 
commented after the brief 
court hearing. “I feel that the 
citizens of Taylor County will 
afford us an ample opportunity 
to establish my innocence.”

Along to Daniel went a stack 
of defense pre-trial motions, 
including one to quash the in­
dictment. Mutscher’s attorney, 
predicted a February or March 
trial date. January 10 had been 
set originally.
DRUG REFUNDS DUE —

ract. , -
•  Commissioners courts or 

boards of district judges need 
not give notice of an official 
meeting to appoint or employ 
a public officer or employee.

•  The Court of Criminal 
Appeals presiding is to receive 
a $33,500 a year annual salary,' 
just $500 more than other jud­
ges oft the court are paid.

•  The Department of Cor­
rections can buy and maintain 
an airplane.

•  Parker County Hospital 
District can be charged with 
a portion cf attorney’s fees for 
-defending two tax injunction 
suits to restrain collection of 
taxes.
APPOINTMENTS — Governor 
Preston Smith designated his

Texans who filed .valid claims j former aide, V. Larry Teaver 
under an anti-trust case may j of Lubbock, chairman, of the 
receive up to 6Q per cent re- State Board of insurance, 
funds on purchases of broad Smith emphasized Teaver’s 
spectrum antibiotic drugs pur- role as “consumer representa- 
chased during 1954-66. tive” on - the board and his

Atty, Gen. Crawford C. Mar. | concern for curbing rates.
tin said refunds will be made 
probably no later than March, 
1972.

Tax supported hospitals and

Smith appointed Kountze in­
surance agency owner John 
B'ltjr to succeed William P.„ 
Hobby Jr. o f, Houston; on the

other state agencies which 1 Texas Air Control Board.

Governor placed Charles W. 
Wooldridge of Dallas on the 
Trinity River Authority board 
of directors.

Smith picked as his acting 
press secretary 26-year-old 
Carlton Carl, a native of Hous­
ton.

Dr. Stanley Burnham of The 
University of Texas at Austin 
is chairman of the Governor’s 
Commission an Physical Fit­
ness. Albert A. Rooker, also 
of UT-Austin, is executive dir­
ector.

Donald Eastland of Hillsboro 
will serve as acting chairman 
of the State Judicial Qualifica­
tions Commission.

A 26-member State Advisory 
Council on Alcoholism has 
been named to advise on a 
state plan for combatting alco­
holism.
SPANISH TREASURE AP­
PRAISED — Appraisers have 
completed the preliminary pro­
cess of putting a value on trea­
sure recovered from four-cen- 
tu.ries-old shipwrecks off Padre 
Island.

Final reports will go to Fed­
eral District Judge Reynaldo 
Garza of Brownsville who dir­
ected the appraisal be made 
as the result of a lawsuit.

Platoro Inc., the Indiana firm 
which recovered the treasure 
in 1967, seeks title to at last 
half the artifacts. The state 
claims all of them, and has 
threatened to take its case 
for possession to the U. S. Sup­
reme Court.
P OLI TI CAL FIELD EX­
PANDS — Dallas attorney 
Barefoot Sanders stepped into 
the U. S. Senate race, slugging 
from the opening bell at Rep­
ublican Sen. John Tower.

Sanders, 46-year-old former 
district attoreny, LT. S. assistant 
attorney general and White 
House aide, is the first Demo­
crat to announce for the Sen­
ate.

W. L. (Bill) Jones Jr., Odessa 
businessman, entered the 
Democratic primary for lieu- 
tenate governor and set up 
campaign headquarters here. 
SAFETY TIPS OFFERED — 
Texas Safety Association warns 
holiday tipplers and 70 driving 
drunks may end up dead in 
traffic crashes.

Along with the verbal warn­
ing, TSA sent out charts show­
ing how much alcohol by 
weight a driver can consume 
before reaching the state legal 
“drunk” test level of .10 per 
cent blood alcohol concentra­
tion.

“The motorists of Texas, for 
their sake 'and the sake of their 
passengers, need to recognize 
the potential dangers during 
the upcoming holiday season. 
They need to be alert, ready 
to take evasion action,” said 
TSA.

SHORT SNORTS
Conservationists called for a 

minimum 100,000 acre Big

New Traffic Laws
VEHICLE INSPECTION

..If a motor vehicle, trailer, 
semi-trailer, pole trailer or 
mobile home registered in 
th is ‘state is damaged in a 
"rotor vehicle accident to the 
apparent extent that it would 
require repair before pass­
ing state inspection, the in­
vestigating officer shall re­
move the inspection certifi­
cate from the vehicle wind­
shield and shall give the 
operator of the vehicle a dat­
ed receipt. Within 30 days 
of the date indicated on the 
receipt, the vehicle shall be 
re-ihspected. The vehicle 
may be driven during this 30 
day period, with the receipt.
RIDING IN MOBILE HOME 
No person or persons shall

Thicket National Park in East 
Texas. ^

State Banking Board approv­
ed nine “phantom” bank char­
ters (multi-bank holding com­
panies) in Waco, Longview and 
Houston, despite protests.

Texas Highway Commission 
approved future revision of in­
terstate highway routes in the 
Dallas-Fort Worth areas.

Sen. W. E. Snelson of Mid­
land took over the governor’s 
job — for a day — December 4.

Russell International Mining 
Corporation was enjoined in 
a Beaumont district court frorh 
offering RIMCO securities for 
sale in Texas.

This year will be “an excep­
tionally good” one for const­
ruction, according to the Un­
iversity of Texas Bureau of 
Business Research.

The Texas Beard of Mental 
Health and Mental Retradation 
will meet December 18 to select 
a state school site to serve the 
Dallas-Fort Worth area.

occupy a house trailer while 
it Is being moved upon a pub­
lic highway.

TURNING ON CURVE
No vehicle shall be turn­

ed so as to proceed in the 
opposite direction upon any 
curve, or upon the approach 
to, or near the crest of a 
grade, where such vehicle 
cannot be seen by the driver 
of any other vehicle ap­
proaching from either direc- 

j tion within 500 feet.
USE OF MULTIPLE BEAM
Whenever the driver oij a 

vehicle approaches an on­
coming vehicle within 500 
feet, or whenever the driver 
of a vehicle approaches an­
other vehicle from the rear 
within 300 feet, such driver 
shall dim his head lights.

CLEAR WINDSHIELD
No person shall drive a 

motor vehicle with any sign, 
poster or other nontranspar­
ent material upon the front 
windshield of such vehicle 
which materially obstructs, 
obscures, or impairs the driv­
er’s clear view of the high­
way or any intersecting high­
way.
BLOOD ALCOHOL LIMITS
Evidence of the amount of 

alcohol in a person’s blood 
at the time of driving while 
under the influence of intoxi­
cating- liquor,-as shown by a 
chemical analysis of his blood, 
breath, urine or any other 
bodily substance shall be ad- 
mis?: able in court and if there 
was at that time 0.10 per cent 
or more by weight of alcohol 
in the person’s blood, it shall 
be presumed that the person 
was under the influence of 
intoxicating liquor.

Commercially speaking, the 
Douglas fir is more valuable 
than any other tree.

1 m m M M l

GIFTS!
SHOP FOR YOUR GIFT LIST

NEEDS AT OUR STORE „
e /

Belts - Billfolds - Boots - Western and 
Sport Shirts - Coats - Jackets - Gloves

Qift[lPrd^ping

Coleman, Texas

H om e*v ...  ̂
for Cfortstnms
Build, bity or remodelto 
electricGOld Medallion 
Holiday gift supreme. 
See your local baildjng 
Contractor or ask WTU.

West Texas Ut Compati,



C H A L K
D U S T

by

Carol
Kirigsbery

Sandra
Hosch

The 1971 Mountaineer Foot­
ball season came to close last 
Friday night. The team was 
defeated by the Academy 
boys 7-0. It was a defensive 
battle all the way, with the 
two teams both showing much 
strength. It was a game we 
all hated to lose, but the 
Mounties fought all the way 
and we’re certainly proud of 
all the boys.

. * * # .

Lane Guthrie, SAHS sopho­
more, won a free ticket to 
the Lions Club pancake sup­
per last week. He won the 
ticket from a SAHS co-ed on 
a bet on the A & M-Texas 
game. There’s just one catch 
he has to eat pancakes with 
her!

* * *

Basketball season is in full 
swing now that the first tro­
phy has been brought home! 
The high school girls won 
first place in the Cross Plains 
tournament.

The girls were defeated by 
Comanche Monday night but 
played a hard game. They

For
Finer Monuments 

COLEMAN 
^MONUMENT 

WORKS
1301 E. 9th Coleman 

See
Johnny Kirby 

or
W. A. Bill Finlay

defeated Richland Springs on 
Tuesday night.

This weekend the BB girls 
will travel to Abilene to the 
Hardin-Simniohs tournament. 
Its a real honor to be invit­
ed—so we plan to capture a 
few victories there.

Looks like the girls are off 
to a good start and we hope 
the boys will be as success­
ful in basketball as they were 
in football.

The SAHS basketball girls 
would like to thank everyone 
for their support at the gam­
es and we hope it will con­
tinue!

* *  * .
The pep rally Friday was 

spirit filled and moving. The 
cheerleaders presented a skit 
about all the teams the 
Mounties had defeated.

The newspaper staff had a 
skit with Lonnie Lowry being 
a viper. He was going to 
“vipe” out the Bumblebee.

be barbecued as long as it’s 
skinned and ready to be 
cooked.

- , r '

This weekend Leann Bryan 
goes to the State “Make It 
With Wool” contest. Good 
luck Leann.

V‘* '
Suwanee Smith has proved 

herself to have a lot of 
“wind.” This was discovered 
when after long hours of 
practice at the contest, she 
received First Chair Baritone 
in the District. Congratula­
tions!

The SAHS basbetball tour­
nament will be next Thurs­
day through Saturday, so 
make plans to attend all the 
games you can. A lot of good 
teams have been invited, so 
the games should be excit­
ing.

* * *
Mrs. Wagner threw up her 

hands in despair on Monday 
morning when all the drill 
team girls reported to her 
study hall. She must have 
been thinking, “more girls, 
more gossiping—more trou­
ble!”

FULL SPEED/
, 21 Y E A R S  BEFORE FUtTbf) LAUNCHED 1 
HIS "CLERMONT" J A M E S  RUMSEY IN 1786 f  
DESIGNED A MEC!' 'LNJW.LLY PROPELLED 
BOAT. IT W ORKED ON A  JET PRINCIPLE 
DRIVEN BY A PUMP AND REACHED A SPEED  
OF 4  MILES FcR  HOUR!
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NEWS FROM

RANGER PARK INN

IS THIS A SYSTEM ?
YOU BET IT tS  -  THE 
FREE ENTERPRISE 

. SYSTEM! WYÔ -YOU _
CAN'.SUPPORTIf BEST 
BVJbiN/NETtiE' ■ -
PAYROLL SAVINGS PLAN!\ .  _  

REMEMBER, U.S. 
SAVINGS BONOS 
SERVE YOU WHILE 
THEY SERVE YOUR. 

COUNTRY!

County Agent’s 
News. . .

DEEPEST CANYON IN .THE WORLD 
IS  HELL'S CANYON DIVIDING IDAHO 
AND OREGON. IT  REACHES A DEPTH 
OF -7,900 f e e t :

The Santa Anna FHA chap­
ter met Monday night, Dec. 
6. Mrs. McQueen spoke on 
“Preparedness, the Key to Op­
portunity.” She presented a 
really interesting talk. The 
program also consisted of a 
skit illustrating how your at­
titudes can affect the deci­
sion

Our 4-H Lamb Feeders chili 
supper last Saturday night 
was real nice. Belva Ruther­
ford was In charge of the 
food. She was assisted^ by 
Hilary Rutherford, James and 
Jody Barr, Helen Bragg, Ha­
zel Ryan, Doaky Bledsoe, and 
James and Sarah Tisdale. 
The decorations were real 
nice and the chili excellent.

Mark Wise gave a good 
showmanship demonstration 
and James Barr and I gave 
the 4-H some ideas on'fitting 
and feeding. Over 60 people

36 Years Ago 
In The News

New guests at ..the Inn are, nett of Abilene visited at the 
Julia Murphy, formerly of inn during the past week.

Mrs. Larry Petty and Mrs. 
Roscoe Petty df Bangs visit-- 
ed Mrs. Dollie Dodson.

Rev. Bill Weeks of the Pres-

Coleman, Mrs. Jim Lovelady, 
and also Donald Young is out 
of the hospital and is now 
a guest.

Saturday Mrs. Cliff Hern-j byterian Church led devo- 
don visited with Mrs. Retta tions during the week.
Bartlett, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Bunk Wagner.

Susie B. Julian and Miss 
Florence Harper are in the 
Ranger Park Inn Hospital.

Becky Buford and James 
Olan Buford visited ■ with 
Mrs. Maggie Blount last week.

Mr. and Mrs. Warnock Sim­
mons of Valera were visitors j 
of Mr. and Mrs. George Sim- ! 
mons. |

Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Een-

Downs, Calice Jane Overby, 
James England, Gene Blakely, 
Billy Mulroy, Eunice Chamb­
erlain, May Bell Brown, Mad­
ge Smith, Sybil Simpson, 
Bfcttyd Sue Hair, Jackie 
Pruitt, W. H. Blake.

Second' grade: Betty Lynn 
Williis, Leona McCain, Mary 
Ann Berry, Cynthia Rain- 
bolt, Winnie Holder, Betty 
Pritchard, Doris Henderson, j

Third grade: Louise Lane, 
Billy Ross, Cecil Grantham, 
Opal Mae Stoclcard, June 
Newman.

Fourth grade: Maudie K. 
Ashmore, Charles Edwards,

Reuben and Essie Loftis of 
Lubbock visited with Mrs. J. 
J. Horner.
. Emmett and Vada Smith of 
New Mexico visited with Mrs. 
Smith’s mother, Mrs. J. J. , 
Horner.

Mrs. Mollie Dodson’s dau­
ghter from Brownwood pre­
sented two Christmas ar­
rangements. One has been 
placed in the dining room 

j and the other in the living 
I room for all to enjoy. Thanks.

Curtis Collins visited at the 
Inn on Saturday.

George Stewf visited
with guests last week.

Mrs. Faye Mobley, Margaret 
Ann Mobley, Mrs. Linnie 
Bartlett and Mrs. Birdye Mil­
ler have visited Mr. and Mrs. 
Bunk Wagner recently.

VISIT IN ROTAN
Mr. and Mrs.- Floyd Mar­

shall were in Rotan last week­
end to visit their son and 
family, Dr. and Mrs. J,erry 
Marshall and daughter. They 
went by Cross Plains Satur-

PRESCRIPTIONS
O w l Drug Store

“Where Friends Meet”

Telephone 625-4514

512 Commercial A.ve.

attended and I thought it was 
people make about you. i a real fine event.

* * * All 4-H’ers are reminded to
The FFA boys will host a have their entries for the 

barbecue and get to-gether county show filled out and 
Monday night, Dec. 20. The mailed back to our office be- 
FHA girls will be their guests, j fore Dec. 10th. All 4-H’ers 
I t ’s going to be an interest- j wishing to enter major shows 
ing affair, as far as the food I need to come by our office 
is concerned; anything will, the week after Thanksgiving

and start filling out entries 
for the major shows.

4 H’ers are entering up for 
the -major and county stock 
shows now. Looks like we’ll 
have a lot of entries at all 
the major shows this year.

The show schedule, unless 
some have been changed, for 
the County shows look some­
thing like this: Dec 31—Santa 
Anna Show; Jan. 1—Talpa 
Show; Jan. 7— Mpzelle Show; 
Jan. 8—Coleman and Novice 
Shows; Jan. 9-12—County 
Show. '

Sandwiched between Talpa j 
and Mozelle is a trip to 
Odessa for their annual “Ice- 
pole International.” 
time of year again.

Coleman

The following stories are 
from the December, 1935, is­
sues of the NEWS:

LOST: Thanksgiving day,
33 model Chevrolet, front 
bumper. Reward. Jim Dan- 
iell.

—36—

The newly organized Moun­
tain City Garden Club met 
in the City Hall on Decem­
ber 6. There was good at­
tendance with several new 

i names being added to the 
i roll.

—36—
Each class in Santa Anna 

High School has -organized a 
boys basketball team. E. W.
Polk is captain of the senior 
team; Jack Price is captain 
of the junior team; Thomas | tion for the past two years. 
Wristen is captain of the so- j He succeeds Rev. Hal C. Win- i 
phomore team, and Bob | go, who resigned two months 
Wheeler is captain of thej I ago to accept the call to the 
freshman team. {First Baptist Church in Gon-

As each team plays, Mr. ( zales.
Adams and Mr. Prescott will 
watch the games and pick

works.
But Santa, be Darn Sure 

you DON’T give me a doll. If 
you do I will give it to True- 
boy (my dog) he likes some­
thing to drag around and 
chew on.

Your little friend,
Doris Marie McGahey.

- 3 6 -
Rev. and Mrs. Elmer E. 

Dunham and children, Dixie 
Lee, 6, and Harley, 2VZ, will 
move into the Baptist parson­
age next week, according to 
information received this 
week.

Rev. Durham has accept­
ed the pastorate of the 
church after being pastor of 
the Baptist Church in Junc-

day morning to see the SAHS 
Roy England, Allie Cille Gar- j girls basketball game.
rett, Virginia Hardy, Doris | -----------------------
Marie McGahey, Ruth Mor- NEx  MEXICO VSITORS 
ris.

Fifth grade: Allene Elliott, 
George Day, Dixie Ann West, 
Robert Joe Cheaney.

Sixth grade: Dorothy Jean 
Harllee, Lilly Pearl . Neill, 
Mary Field Mathews, Ruth 
Lovelady, Mary John Wade.

Seventh grade: Margaret
Mobley, Betty Sue Turner, 
Dorothy Ross, J. T. Garrett, 
Willyne Ragsdale, Vernon 
Oakes.

Mr. and Mrs, Tom Gilmore 
and children of Roswell and 
Albuquerque, N. M., were re­
cent visitors of his parents,. 
Mr. and Mrs. Basil Gilmore.

TIRES ARE ALWAYS 
A BARGAIN

RUDOLPH’S 
Coleman, Texas

m m m m m M M m m m m m

Step into Style 
for the.,

the best players from each

36—
E, M. Tisdale of Whon and 

Eph Day returned home on
team. The ones chosen will I Wednesday from Mason where 
be placed on the main team they both bagged their limit
for the year.

- 3 6 -
LETTER TO SANTA C’LAUS: 

How are you? I am just 
fine. Santa I have not made 
up my mind what I want for 

It’s that 1 Christmas, but be sure you 
give me about $5.00 for fire-

| of deer—two each. They will 
. have to confine their hunt- 
j ing for the rest of the season 
I to wild turkeys.

- 3 6 -
Ward School Honor Roll: 

First grade: Vernetta Ste- 
phensson, Web Golston, Viola

Nearing The End of QUIT BUSINESS SALE!
Moore's Dry Goods — 610 Wallis — Santa Anna — Hurry! 

ENTIRE REMAINING STOCK REMARKED FOR QUICK SELLING

ORDERED SOLD TO THE BARE WALLS!
Sale Starts 

Thurs. 8:30 a.m.

53 Ladies 

DRESSES 
Values 

to
$10.95 $1 I/2

Thousands 
of Yards
•  Ribbon
•  Lace
•  Trim

Price

Thousands of NOTIONS
•  Thread
•  Rick Rack

•  Zippers
•  Many Other

Items PRICE
lh

Simplicity 
Patterns -

3 1
Buy one Get 

2 FREE

XMAS 
DECORA. 

TIONS 
All 
Goes 
at Vi

MEN'S ■ WOMEN'S!
BOYS - GIRLS 

CANVASS ■ TENNIS 
S H O E S 

Values to $7.95 
Football 
P.F. Flyers 1.33 UP‘

It will pay you to come and save plentyl Never 
again will you buy so cheapl Buy for Christmas at 
Sensational pricesl A store full of Brand Name Goods 
for the entire family almost given away! Read below 
for a few of the hundreds of bargains taken at ran­
dom and hurry over.

3000 Yards Assorted 

PIECE GOODS
•  Perma Press 1
•  All Kinds JL
•  Hurry and 2

SAVE I

Men's ALL
SWEAT GIFT
SHIRTS ITEMS

$2.19 Value

1.57 i l l
Orig. Price

ENTIRE STOCK 
Ladies to $11.95

SHOES
Shoes for all 

Occasions 
Hurry for This

1.50

1000 Yards Value to $5.95 
100% Polyester

PIECE
GOODS 3.67Yard 

60 to 65 inches wide

240 Pair Mens
S H O E S

Dress and Work Styles 
Nunn Bush — Rand-

Values to $fj $] 
$27.95 0  to*6 .= 15
LADIES 
HOUSE 
SHOES 

VaL to $3.98
and
up1.33

Boys - Girls 
SHOES 

School and 
Press Styles 
Vat to $5.95

1.90-2.90

Sale Starts 
Thurs. 8:30 a.m.

Men's Genuine 
LEVIS 

and
WRANGLERS 

Broken Sues

4.50

Men's
RAIN­
COATS

2.77

48 Pair 
Men's Dress] 

PANTS 
Values 

to
$10.95 m

300 Boy's Branded 

JEyANS - PANTS
illy the Kid t% THf]
arafy - Mann L v / |

Values to $6.50 2 for $5]

Billy
Far,

300 Men's 
Dress - Sport

SHIRTS 
Values to $9

1.50 • $5

Men's £1.50 
Orion 
SOX

57c
2 for $1

FORMERLY Moore's Dep't Store 610
WALLIS Santa Anna

With This
Gas Hog, .
It Is Necessary

Why not try that good Mo­
bil detergent gasoline and see 
if you’re gas mileage doesn't 
improve. Get it at Burden’s, 
of course! it

B U R D E N ’ S
Mobil Station

We Give Scottle Stamps 
Delcio Battery Headquarters 
510 Wallis Pho. 348-3191

CLUBMAN 
LETS YOU BE.

Clubman lets you be a lion in this king 
of suits, tailored of elegant fabrics including 
born-free double-knits. Notable are waist 
sh|ping, deep center vent, pleated patch 
pockets, and 2-button front. In colors and 
patterns that don't pussyfoot around with 
fashion. Clubman lets you be at;

315 Cerfrer Srownwooa

>\i MhVi.tw.ftY hvv»v, v  w \
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Social Activities
Miss Patton, Mr. Williams 
Will Be Wed On January 14

50TH ANNIVERSARY OBSERVED 
BY MR. AND MRS. HAYES DIXON

Mr. and . Mrs. Hayes Dixon 
celebrated their 50th wedding 
annivesary on Sunday, Dec. 
5. with a reception at their 
home in Santa Anna, Chil­
dren of-the couple wei'e hosts 
for the affair.

Their daughter, Mrs. Dee 
Yancy, greeted guests at the 
door and presented them to 
the honored cquple.

In the dining room the re­
freshment table was laid 
with a floral cloth used at the 
golden wedding anniversary 
party of Mrs. Dixon’s late* 
parents. The table was cen­
tered with a large gold chry­
santhemum potted plant with 
“50” attached to the foliagO. 
The decorated cake was serv­
ed by the Dixons’ granddau­
ghter, Joy Barnett of Cole­
man. Mrs. Leroy Keeney, a 
niece of Mrs. Dixon, served 

: coffee and punch. Assisting 
with the - serving were her 
sister, Mrs. Pat Hosch, and 
Mrs. H. A. Burden. The cake, 
a gift from Mrs. Hosch, an­
other sister, Mrs. Adam Pal­
let of Brownwood, and his 
sister, Mrs. Roland Williams, 
was a three tiered confection 
iced in white and decorated 
with yellow roses. White 
sugar bells surrounded the 
lower layer.

A daughter-in-law, Mrs. 
Dewey Dixon, displayed gifts.

Arrangements of chrysan­
themums decorated the other 
party rooms.

Becky Turney 
To Be Feted 
With Gift Tea

Miss Becky Turney, bride^- 
elect of D. Carroll Holt of 
Brownwood, will be honored 
with a gift tea on Saturday 
afternoon, Dec. 11, at the 
community center of the 
Mountain City Apartments. 
The party will be from 2:00 
to 3:30 p. m. and all friends 
and, relatives are invited to 
attend.

Hostesses for the party are 
Mmes. Jake McCreary, Ver-* 
non Herring, Ken Bowker, 
Delbern Rice, Graham Fitz­
patrick, Janice Cozart, Rod­
ney Dean, Cleve Fox, M. L. 
Guthrie, Jr., Felton Martin, 
lone Caton, Thomas Wristen, 
Jr., and George Leonard.

Miss Turney, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Rex Turney, and 
Mr. Holt, son of Dr. and Mrs. 
Carroll .Holt of Brownwood, 
will be married on Sunday, 
Dec. 26.

Mr. and Mrs. Dixon were 
married in the Wallace homo 
in the Live Oak community 
south of Santa Anna on Dec. 
8. 1921. He is the son of the 
late Mr. and Mrs. J. H. Dixon 
and she is the former Monah 
Smith, daughter of the late 
Mr. and Mrs. John A. Smith.

Rev. J. M. Reynolds, pastor 
of the First Baptist Church, 
performed the ceremony.

Mr. and Mrs. Dixon have' 
resided in Santa Anna all ex­
cept four years when they liv­
ed in Rockwood. He is a re­
tired carpenter and stone 
mason.
“ For the wedding anniver­
sary celebration Mr. Dixon 
wore the maroon silk tie and 
gold monogrammed tie clasp 
which he wore at his wed­
ding 50 years ago.

Children of the couple who 
served as hosts for the cele­
bration are Bernice Yancy 
and D>ewey Dixon both of 
Santa Anna, James and Har­
ry "Dixon, both of Oklahoma, 
Audrey Seaman of Houston, 
Wanda Barnett of Coleman 
and Estel Wells of Ft. Worth. 
The couple also has twelve 
grandchildren and one great 
grandchild.

All the children and grand­
children of the couple were 
present Sunday except a 
granddaughter who is with 
her husband in the Army in 
Germany, and a step-grand­
son who is serving in the 
Jfavy,

Shirley
Upholstery

1504 N. Nueces 
Coleman, Texas

Daniell Circle 
Monthly Meet 
On December 1

The Nitia Daniell Circle of 
the United Methodist Church 
met on Wednesday, Dec. 1, at 
the church annex. Mrs. Nor- 
val Wylie and Mrs. Basil Gil­
more were program leaders.

Mrs. Gilmore read the 
Christmas story from Luke 
followed by group singing. 
Mrs. Wylie gave the Christ­
mas story by Peter Marshall.

Group singing and prayer 
concluded the program.

Mrs. Cliff Herndon led the 
business meeting. Mrs. N. O. 
Watson read the minutes and 
gave the treasurer’s report. 
Plans to remember members 
of the group who are ill were 
made. A gift was present­
ed for the grandbaby of Mrs. 

‘ J. T. Avants.
Mrs. Dick Baugh and Mrs. 

Buddy Benge were hostesses 
for the meeting and served 
refreshments of coffee, co­
coa, cake, and toasted nuts 
to the above mentioned and 
also Mmes. Louis Shambeck, 
Dwight Hudson, V. I. Dean, 
Chester Galloway, ■ Pauline 
Eubank and Walter Scar+ 
brough.

The next meeting of the 
! group will be Wednesday, 
Jan. 5.

# * * * * * * * $ $

* COMMUNITY *
* CALENDAR *
* OF EVENTS *
* * # * * * * * * * * *

Thursday, Dec. 9:
Girls basketball, H-SU tour­

nament, Abilene, 6:15 p. m.
Boys basketball, Jim Ned 

tournament, Tuscola 
PTO, school cafeteria at 

7:00 p. m.
Dorcas Sunday School class 

FBC annex, 7:Q(̂  p. m. 
Friday, Dec. 10: ,

Christmas parade, down­
town, 2:00 p. m.

Lions Club pancake sale, 
Lions Club building. 
Saturday, Dec. 11:

Garden Club- bazaar, Lions 
Club building - 
Sunday, Dec. 12:

Attend church 
SACY, United Presbyterian 

Church, 7:30 p. m.
Monday, Dec. 13:

JHS basketball, S. A. gym­
nasium, 6:30 p. m.
Tuesday, Dec. 14:

Lions Club, 12 noon 
XYZ Club luncheon, Moun­

tain City center, 12:30 p. m.
School board meeting, high 

school, 7:00 p. m.
High school basketball, S, 

A. gymnasium; 7:00 p. m. 
Wednesday, Dec. 15:

Evening church services.

Gift Tea Slated 
On December 10 
For Bride-Elect

Miss Beth Dean, bride-elect 
of Larry Steele, will be fet­
ed with a gift tea Friday, 
Dec. 10, at the community 
center of the Mountain City 
Apartments. The party will 
be from 6:30 to 8:00 p. m. All 
friends of the couple are in­
vited to attend.

Tire couple will be married 
on Monday, Dec. 27, at the 
First Baptist Church. Par­
ents of the couple are Mr. 
and Mrs. D. E. Steele of Sid­
ney and Mr. and Mrs. Rodney 
Dean.

Hostesses for the party will 
be Mmes. Vernon Herring, 
Delburn Rice, Jake McCreary, 
Ken. Bowker, Rex Turney, 
Graham Fitzpatrick, Jim 
Rutherford, M.' L. Guthrie, Jr., 
Glen Copeland, 1 Felton Mar­
tin, and Janice Cozart.

Dorcas SS Class 
Christmas Event 
Planned Tonight

The Dorcas Sunday School 
Class of the First Baptist 
Church will meet Thursday 
night (tonight) at the church 
annex for a salad supper, 
Christmas party and pro­
gram.

Gifts will. be exchanged 
and' secret pals revealed. A 
program emphasizing the an­
nual foreign missions Christ­
mas offering will be given.

All members and associate 
members of the class are 
urged to be present.

Christmas Qifts
Jkari
For Now  
and ”
Forever

New. especially for beautiful Christmas giving:
Supra Bath Oil in Decanter j 
Body Creme Soap in Cache ! j

. Fragrance Candle t I
I Parfum Rollette j . |r

■ I ' Creme Sachet. . . from $j2,50 to $5,00 . |i
W h ere  C h ris tm a s  is S im p ly  B e a u tifu l. ! 
A n d  S h o p p in g  is  B e a u tifu lly  S im p le :

Merle Norman Cosmetic Studio
Owner. Thelma DeBusk i j
207 Commercial Ave.

, P h o n e 1 625-5514 ' C o lem an , Texas,

M

McMURRY STUDENTS HERE
Jim See and a friend, Steve 

Chappel of Roswell, N. M., 
were weekend visitors in the 
home of Jim’s parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Dawson See. The 
two young men are students 
at McMurry College in Abi­
lene.

On Friday night the two 
boys attended the football 
game at Lampasas and on 
Saturday they drove to Ta- 
hoka to meet Steve’s father.

After a visit in Lubbock 
with Nolan Perry, a student 
at Texas Tech, they came 
back to Santa Anna. After 
attending (services at the 
First Baptist Church Sunday 
morning, they returned to 
Abilene.

Dr. Merle M. Ellis 
Optometrist

308 Citizens Nat'l Bank 
Building

Brownwood. Texas

Glasses - Contact Lenses
Call 646-8778 or write P.O. 
Box 149 for Appointment

Liffhs Officials 
Visit S. A. Club’s 
Tuesday Meeting

Homer Hodges of Winters, 
Governor of District 2 Lions 
Clubs, was special guest at 
the Tuesday noon meeting of 
the Santa Anna Lions Club. 
Mr. Hodges spoke to the group 
after being introduced by 
Russ Pace of Winters, Dis­
trict Deputy Governor.

Accompanying the two men 
to Santa Anna was Wesley 
Hays of Winters, a former 
Santa Anna resident.

Another guest at the meet­
ing was Evert Phillips of 
Brownwood. a former deputy 
district governor and a can­
didate for Lions Club District 
Governor.

ivfr. and Mrs. Cleo Brooks 
have announced the engage­
ment and approaching mar-

CHRISTMAS RECITAL
Jimmy Benton will present 

his piano pupils in recital on 
Sunday afternoon, Dec. 12, 
at the First Baptist Church. 
The recital will begin at 3:30 
p. m. and everyone is invited 
to attend,

Piano pupils to take part 
in the recital are Ann Abbey 
of Coleman, Judy Brusenhan, 
Serena Bryan, Mary Dens- 
man, Russell Holman and 
Lori Herring.

XYZ Will Meet 
For Luncheon, 
Party Tuesday

The XYZ Club for senior 
citizens will meet next Tues­
day, Dec. 14, for a Christmas 
luncheon and get-together. 
All members and guests are 
to meet at the community 
room of, the Mountain City 
Apartments at 12:30 p. m. 
for the Social;

Mrs. P. B. Snook, Mrs. Edna 
Henderson and Mrs. John 
Womack are on the commit­
tee to plan the luncheon and 
party.

The Christmas tree at the 
center will be decorated by 
the group and each one at­
tending is to take a card to 
add to the decorations.

ATTEND REUNION
Mr. and Mrs. W. V. Priddy 

were near Temple during the 
weekend for the annual fam­
ily gathering of her broth­
ers and sisters. The get-to­
gether was held at the home 
of Mr. and Mrs. Arthur C. 
Martin with 49 attending.

The Priddys returned home 
Sunday afternoon.

rlage of Kathy LaDon Patton 
to Johnny Lee Williams. Miss 
Patton is the daughter- of 
Mrs. Brooks • and: the late 
Johnny Patton. The groom- 
to-be is the son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Grady Williams of the 
Shields community.. • -

The bride-elect is a junior 
student in Santa Anna High 
School. Williams attended 
SAHS and is currently em­
ployed by the Santa Anna 
Tile Company.

The wedding is scheduled 
for Friday, Jan. 14, at 7:00 p. 
in., at the C'oncho Baptist 
Church in Coleman. The 
couple will reside in Cole­
man.

Program Planned 
By Fifth Grade 
At PTO Meeting

The fifth grade class of 
Mrs. J. A. Harris will present 
the program at the Thursday 
night meeting of the Santa 
Anna Parent Teacher Or­
ganization, The meeting to­
night will be at the school 
cafeteria at 7:00 p. m.

During the business ses­
sion the membership drive 
will be discussed.

Parents of all school chil­
dren are urged to attend the 
meeting.

HERE FOR WEEKEND
Mr. and Mrs. Milton Mose­

ley of Fredericksburg were 
weekend visitors in Santa 
Anna with his sister, Mrs. 
Ethel Bobo.

§
Bring the Family . . .

Enjoy the'Homecooked Good­
ness of Our Food, Prompt and 
Friendly Service. ,/

Reasonable Prices

STEAK HOUSE
Annie Mearl Morris, Mgr.

Coddle Baby with Cuddly Coats
Now there’s a cozy and warm fun-fur for both 
baby boys and girls from Dotty Dan. Boys get the 
hooded Car Coat of acrylic pile in blue, gold, red. 
Quilted lining. 11.00. Girls get the polyester pile' 
raglan sleeve Coat in honey cream, pink, red, 
white. 10.00. With a matching cap, 3.00. Both' satin 
lined. Sizes S-M-L-XL and Toddlers 1-4.

Girls Adore Colorful Fall Clothes

Girls always look adorable too, in carefree Dotty 
Dan fashions. Kodel/cotton Shirtdress has wine 
bodice and multi-color plaid collar, placket and 
low gathered skirt. 8.00. Striped nylon knit Turtle­
neck top with solid rib knit trim. Blue, brown, 
green, pink. 4.50. Stretch nylon knit pull-on Pant 
in amber, gold, navy, pink, purple, red, royal, 
rust. 5.00. Sizes 3 to 6x.

3-6x, 10.00 
7-14, 14.00

M & M  S H O P
Your Crib Through College Shop

Brownwood



A CHRISTMAS CAROL -1971
’Twas the night before, 

Christmas and there in his 
chair, lather was cursing and 
tearing his hair. The chil­
dren were upstairs asleep— 
far away, dreaming of gifts 
they would find Christmas 
day. They money was paid, 
the gifts had been bought. . .  
all was well with the world 
. . . s o  father had thought. 
Then out to the car, put the 
gifts in the seat, and back to 
the store for some good 
things to eat . . .  he returned

Santa Anna FFA 
Ag-News

by Jimmy Benton
Everyone remembers the 

■regular old stock shows. Well, 
this year’s is going to be dif­
ferent. I t will not only be a 
livestock show but a Youth 
Fair. The FFA, 4-H and FHA 
will be participating in it. 
Along with the animals will 
be clothing, foods, and other 
homemaking products.

F F A

The Fair will be on Friday, 
Dec. 31. Further details will 
be announced later. Mr. C. 
H. Sargent, Bangs high school 
ag. Instructor, and Mr. Bill 
Hightower, Coleman high ag. 
teacher, will be judges for the 
animal division.

Memberships in the Santa 
Anna Livestock Association 
are being sold by members 
and ag students. The $3.00 
merbership will go for cash 
awards and ribbons for both 
animals and clothing and 
food divisions.

FFA
We of the ag department 

of SAHS would like to thank 
the Santa Anna Livestock 
Association for the new scales. 
These scales are used for the 
weighing of hogs and sheep. 
It is not completely paid for 
and any contributions will be 
appreciated. A full list of 
contributors will be printed 
later.

FFA
Tire annual barbecue will 

probably be held December 
11, according to Bill Riley, vo. 
ag. teacher. 'Tills will include 
both FFA and FHA.

FFA
The entry for the District 

FFA talent contest will in­
clude Mark Wagner, David 
Horner, Ricky Jones, Randy 
Long and Jimmy Benton. 
They are doing a medley of 
country and folk songs. We 
wish them luck on December 
13 at Winters.

FFA
See ya-all next week with 

more Ag-News!

to the car and what did he 
find? Some lousy sneak thief 
had stolen him blind!

A sad tale, but too often 
true. The National Automo­
bile Theft. Bureau (NATB) 
poiints out ever^ year hun­
dreds of people are victimized 
by thieves who steal Christ­
mas packages from parked 
cars . . , often taking the car 
that the packages are in. 
Some shoppers in their haste 
even leave • the keys in th$ 
Ignition as an added Christ­
mas surprise for the thief.

NATB urges motorists to 
“Thief-Proof” their automo­
biles and offers these tips: 

Don’t leave packages or 
other possessions up for grabs 
by leaving them on the seats 
or the floor of your parked 
car. Put them in the trunk 

Roll your windows up tight, 
and lock your car doors.

Don’t forget to remove your 
ignition key when you re­
move yourself from your 
parked, auto . . . even for a 
moment. You may not only 
find your car gone when you 
return, but also get a .Christ­
mas present from, the police 
in the form of up to a $200 
fine for leaving your keys in 
the ignition. That is now 
against Texas state law.

Don’t park your car 'in  a 
remote or dimly lit 'spot. 
Thieves enjoy the opportu­
nity to do their foul deeds 
where they are not in thej 
limelight. i

Take these precautions. It 
will help you have what the 
NATB wishes for you: A Mer­
ry Christmas!

Jacqueline Sue Goreliam—Mrs. U.S. Savings Bonds of 1971-72—has a 
happy message: Give a  Bond for Christmas* As Mrs. Colorado in the AH  
American Family Search, Jacqueline won her. Bond crown at Lehigh 
Acres, Florida. The Gorchams live in Northglenn, a  Denver suburb.

New Subscribers
Nell Talley, Dallas 
Charles Benge 
Mrs. D. E. Amarine
Mrs. George Wells, Bangs 
J. B.- Joiner, S'-A Angelo : 
George Blount 
T. J. McCaughs”'.-Ft..Wo:th, 
Mrs. W.-'P. West - j
Harold Brown |
Barbara Avants, San j

Angelo.
L. J. Lovelady, Dickinson 
Mrs. Zell Powers, Midland 
Leslie Bryant, Coleman 
Dr. Max Woodward, 

Sherman
Lee Woodward, Mineral 
. Wells
Charles Zabel, Rockwood 
Roy Haynes/ Rangeley,

Colo
Venino Vasquez, Jr.
Maurice Kingsbery, 

Coleman
Mrs. C'. L. Hodges
Mrs. P. J. Ellis, Brownwood
George England.
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tarti Of Thanks
We want to say thank you 

for each gift we received for 
our wedding shower.

Mr. and Mrs. George 
C. Seifert. 49-ltp

Accent On Health

FAMILY GATHERING

Five of the six children of 
Mr. and Mrs. C. M. 'Barring­
ton and their families were 
together on Thanksgiving 
day for a family reunion.

Present were Mr. and Mrs. 
J. C. Young of Texas City, 
Mr. and Mrs. Marvin Conn of 

! Dallas, Claud and David Bar­
rington of Houston, Mr. and 
Mrs. C. J. Faught, Marcy and 
Shawn of Big Spring, Mr. and 
Mrs. Gene Day and children, 
Mr. and Mrs. M. M. Shella- 
barger and Mr. and Mrs. John 
Shellabarger all of Brown- 
wood. and Mr. and Mrs. Jim 
Young and children, Joy and 
Sandra of Arcadia.

Absent from the gathering 
was Ray Barrington who is 
stationed with the U. S. Army 
in Ethiopia.

One of man’s priceless pos­
session’s is his eyes, and help 
in conserving this treasure is 
on its way, reports the Texas 
State Department of Health.

This help is in the form of 
a federally-imposed require­
ment for impact-resistant len­
ses on eyeglasses. Thousands 
of Texans already wear them.

Effective December 31, all 
glasses and sunglasses sold in 
the United States must have 
lenses of laminated glass, heat- 
tempered glass or plastic. This 
seems like a simple solution 
to some of the eye injury pro­
blems. But it took years of ef­
fort by accident prevention ex­
perts to attain this ruling by 
the Food and Drug Adminis­
tration.

Last year, reports the Na­
tional Safety Council, there 
were 110,000 eye injuries in 
this country. It’s obvious that 
only a fraction of this number 
came from broken lenses. Al­
most 11 percent of the injuries

resulted in a permanent part­
ial-blindness, which means 
that one or both eyes were 
damaged permanently. More 
than seven out of 10 persons Newman, 
suffering eye injury went 
through a period of blindness 
— even if only temporary.

While the impact-resistant 
lenses won’t provide total pro­
tection from breaking, they 
will be a big step in the right 
direction. The FDA regulation 
will provide greater protection 
in tougher lenses. But they 
cannot be considered as pro­
viding an unbreakable shield 
against eye injury. The 
new regulation covers presc­
ription and

RECENT VSITORS
Recent visitors in Santa 

Anna included Mr. and Mrs. 
Kirk Newman of Denver, 
Colo., and their daughter, 
Cathy, a student at Texas 
Tech University. They were 
guests In the home of his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Henry

ANNUAL SHRIMP SUPPER
Men of the United Metho­

dist Church will entertain 
their wives and families with 
their annual shrimp supper 
on Thursday night (tonight) 
at the church\annex. Serv- 

at'-’k

Our sincere thanks to our 
friends for all the kindness 
and acts of sympathy shown 
us during our sorrow. We 
axe deeply grateful for each 
gesture and deed.

The family of 
Geraldine Collins Lewis.

49-ltc

For Sale or Trade
FOR SALE: New and used
Heaters; Metal Cabinets; New 
Mattresses and box springs, 
$69.95 set. Bargain House, 
715 Concho In Coleman.

40-tfc

Brownwood 
Cattle Auction

FOR SALE: Used TVs Refri­
gerators, Stoves, Washers and 
Freezers. Buy on terms to 
suit you. Geo. DJ Rhone Co., 
Coleman, Texas. 31-tfc
FOR SALE: Napko Paints, In­
side and outside latex and 
enamels to match. Will mix 
any colors desired. Win­
steads Paint & Paper Store, 
107 East Pecan, Coleman,
Texas. 51-tfc

FOR SALE: 2 bedroom house, 
paneled and siding, 2 car 
garage. Ave A. Ross Kelley 
Real Estate, Phone 348-3486.

48-tfc

DATE: 12-1-71
MARKET: Buyer attendance 
excellent Slaughter bulls 
steady to $1.00 higher. Slau- ■ FOR SALE: 2 Work Cars, 1949 
ghter cows fully steady. Mar- j Ford, 1963 Ford. Both run, 
ket very active and fully licensed. 408’ Bowie. Phone

ing will begin ^00 p. m.

MRS. TAYLOR’S GUESTS
Recent visitors in the home 

of Mrs. J. W. Taylor and John 
were her daughter, Mrs. Lo- 

non-prescription j nella Roesch of Henrietta,

LODGE MEETING
Mountain Lodge 

No. 661 AF & AM
will meet on Third 

liursday each month at 7:30 
. m. Visitors arc welcome, 
ames F. Marlin, Worshipful 
(aster and James D. Rice, 
ecretary.

WHAT A WIIOPPER-
A turnip of massive propor­

tions was brought to the News 
office last week by James 
Estes of Rockwood. The huge 
turnip was grown by Bernice 
Johnson in her flower gar­
den. It weighed eight and 
three-quarters pounds and 
measured 27Vi inches In cir­
cumference.

The turnip was grown at 
the Johnson home at Rock­
wood.

Both the highest and the 
lowest points above sea level 
in the United States are in 
California.

S I NGER
Trained

SALES & SERVICE
ALL BRANDS MACHINES 

Phones 348-3151

Bailey Lumber & Supply Co.

REGULAR PRICES 
Less 10%

BAILEY LMB. CO. Phone 348-3151

WE HAVE

Certified Ora and Nora 
)atSeed

WE STILL [HAVE PLENTY OF 
PLANTING SEED

CUSTOM AG SERVICE, INC.
(Formerly Cly^e Thomas ’Feed and Seed)

800 N. Neelies Coleman, Texas

TB Treatment 
Begun Earlier 
With New Drug

A new drug—rifampin—is 
now in use to treat tubercu­
losis. Treatment of the dis­
ease, it is expected, will be 
speeded up even more.

“The advantage of rifam­
pin over other drugs is that 
attacks the TB germ soon­
er,” says Dr. Robert J. Ander­
son, maging director of the 
National Tuberculosis and 
Respiratory Disease Associa­
tion. “It also looks as if it 
will have fewer side effects. 
The results should be short­
er hospitalization and a more 
rapid return to normal life.”

Rifampin was released for 
widespread use by the. Food 
and Drug- Administration 
only this May. Years of clini­
cal experience pretesting the 
drug, however .show that ri­
fampin .shortens by up to 25 
per cent the period of hospi­
talization for patients with 
active disease. The drug is 
used in combination with 
other anti-TB drugs such as 
isoniazid.

Many TB patients today re­
ceive most—and sometimes 
all—of their treatment as an 
outpatient, through a clinic, 
health center, or physician’s 
office. For patients with 
minimal TB .even hospitali­
zation for diagnosis and ini­
tiation of treatment seldom 
is necessary.

Although anyone can get 
TB, those who are not heal­
thy in the first place—the 
elderly and sick—have more 
TB than the rest of the popu­
lation. There is also more TB 
among the poor, whether they 
live in big cities or in rural 
areas. Too often, the poor 
do njat have access to medical 
care,| and TB can result In 
eventual death if it Is not 
treated. Anyone with un­
treated active disease can 
spread the germs by cough­
ing qr sneezing. .

Thjs year more than 30,000 
new cases of active TB are 
predicted in this country1 
alone . Drugs like rifampin j 
can help reduce the disloca-. 
tion in the lives of these peo­
ple . Treating TB sooner is 
a matter of life and breath.

glasses. If there is some rea­
son why these impact-resistant 
lenses won’t fulfill the visual 
requirements of a particular 
patient, regular lenses can be 
obtained.

The performance standard 
for impact-resistant lenses is 
based on American National 
Standards Institute specifica­
tions. Essentially, the standard 
requires that a given lens be 
capable of wihstanding an im­
pact test in \yhich a % -inch 
steel ball sweighing approxi­
mately .56 of an ounce is drop­
ped from a height of 50 inches.

Industry has long, used the 
“shatterproof” goggles or glas­
ses. It realized that tragedies 
resulting from lenses which 
have shattered into blinding 
slivers upon impact were need­
less and preventable.

One of he largest benefici­
aries of the new regulation 
will be the average wearer of 
glasses — the athletic young­
ster, the outdoorsman, the 
handyman and do-it-yourself­
er, the housewife and office 
worker. They run into situa­
tions every day which test the 
safety of their glasses and sun­
glasses. The new lenses will 
provide a better barrier against 
injuries to the eyes, says the 
Health Department.

Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy Belser 
of Oklahoma City, Miss Edith 
Brannon of Brownwood, and 
Mr. and Mrs. Mace Blanton, 
Jr., of Fort Worth.

HOME FOR THE WEEKEND
Mr. and Mrs. Buddy Benge 

were at home for the week­
end after being in Houston 
the past week. Mrs. Benge 
was in the M. D. Anderson 
Hospital for tests and return­
ed the first of the week to 
begin treatments there.

ATTEND FOOTALL GAME 
Mr. and Mrs. Wilbourn 

Weaver of Austin were among 
the Santa Anna football fans 
attending the Friday night 
football game at Lampasas. 
Wilburn is the son of Mrs. 
Burgess Weaver and a SAHS 
graduate.

steady-to $1.00 higher. Most 
rise onr light weight stocker 
calves and stocker steer year­
lings.

ESTIMATED RECEIPTS: 1227
Stocker Steer Calves

wts. 250-425 lb s .___39-56
Stocker Heifer Calves 

wts. 250-425 lbs. __ 34.50-49 
Steer Yearlings 

wts. 500-700 lbs., 35.50-42,50 
Bull Yearlings __ 35.50-38.90 
Heifer Yearlings __ 33.50-36.25 
Plain Feeder *

Steers ___ _ 33.50-39.25
Plain Feeder

Heifers ________  29.10-34
Cows and Calves - pr.

Good ______  270.00-345.00
Plain J_i___  232.50-317.50

Stocker Cows __ 170.00-252.50 
Slaughter Cattle

Fat calves _____  32.50-35
Fat cows _____ 20.50-23.10
Utility and cutter

cows ______  20.10-22.50
Canners _________ 19-20.50
Shells -------- :___ 15-18.60
Stocker bulls

348-3707. 48-2tp

FOR SALE: Console black and 
white TV, excellent condi­
tion. Also antenna. Ross 
Kelley, phone 348-3486. 49-2c
FOR SALE: l >/8 acre of land 
on Bowie Ave. one block off 
Brady highway. Write owner 
at Rt. 5, Box 277, Fort Worth, 
Texas 76126. 49-ltc

Miscellaneous
REDUCE safe & fast with 
GoBese Tablets & E-Vap 
“water pills”. Phillips Drug.

44-8tp

VISIT IN GARLAND
Mrs. Sally Snook accom- (

CUSTOM PLOWING: Tan-
deming and sowing. Norman 
and Edward Anderson. Phone 
348-3469 or 348-3347. 29rtfc
Coleman Automotive Supply, 
Walnut and Colorado Street, 
Coleman, Texas. Open Mon­
day through Saturday, 7:30 
a. m, to 6:00 p. m. We appre­
ciate your business. 46-7tc

POSTED: Hunting, .fishing ot 
27.90-30.75 trespassing are prohibited on

Slaughter bulls, 25.75-29.75 | a11 lands owned or controlled
I by me in Coleman and Erown 
Counties. James M. Cliett.

46-51p
Hogs (top) none

Ruth Sudderth, Rising 
Star, 1260 lb. wf. cow and 
calf, $315.00; Earl Parks of 
Richland Springs, 1210 lb. wf. 
bull, 30.75: Henry Cattle Co., 
Goldthwaite, 405 lb. wf. str., 
43.75, and 350 lb. wf. hef.,

WANTED: Junk auto motors, 
highest prices paidT^Alamo* 

■ Metals Recyclers, 500 E. La: 
Chappelle, San Antonio, Tex-

i as 78304, Phone

panied by her daughter and i40-50! Ben B°x> B’wd., 13201
224-0088.

48-ltp
son-in-law, Mr. and Mrs. C. 
R. Nichols of El Paso, to Gar­
land recently for a visit with 
a son and grandson, Mike 
Nichols and family.

The first oil well in the U. 
S. was drilled in Titusville, Pa., 
in 1859.
Adding Machine Tape at the 

Santa Anna News

i IN BRADY MONDAY
Mrs. Floyd Marshall, Mrs. 

Norman Walters and Mrs. P. 
B, Snook were in Brady on 
Monday to visit an art class 
and see some paintings on 
display. They also drove to 
Melvin before returning 

I home.

lb. hoi. cow, 23.80; Christy 
McDonald, Comanche, 600 lb. 
blk. wf. str., 37.7; H. M. Cox, 
Bangs, 6 char, strs., 550 lb.

We HAVE Calsul for spray­
ing fruit and pecan trees. I t’s 
time to treat trees with 
Borer-Sol . for .borers.. Qi-

wt., 39.00; C. H. Edington, Syston for honey dew on pe-

AVAILABLE N0W -THE1972-1973

TEXAS ALMANAC
WITH 1970 And More Than 700 Pages of In-
A F U ( * I I 0  n i l 1!  formatI<w about Texas History,C E N S U S  D A T A  Government, Agriculture, Busi­

ness, Economics, Sports, Tourism, 
Education, Weather,?Water, Poli­
tics, Recreation and Much, Much 
M ore .' ;

ON SALE NOW AT 
NEWSSTANDS, BOOK 

STORES, DRUG STORES 
iAND WHEREVER BOOKS 

ARE SOLD
ORDER FROM

i r i i g
T | |  A  HA /fcgLI? a ft ~ Ay

p O L ttm g

THE TEXAS A LM AN AC  D IV IS IO N  
THE DALLAS M O R N IN G  N EW S 
C O M M U N I CAT ION S CENTER 
DALLAS, TEXAS 7522(7

1 Please send lea

can trees also Green Light 
Rat Bait. Mett’s Garden Cen- 
man, Texas. j 49-tfc
WILL DO Babysitting in your 
home. Call Miss Kay Bur­
nett, 348-3426. 49-ltp

Burkett, 310 lb. wf. str., 52.00;
R. L. Smith, Rochelle, 1130 
lb. wf. cow, 23.00; Don Mc­
Laughlin, Baird, 335 lb. wf. 
str., 48.00, and 6 wf. strs.
514 lb. avg. wt., 41.25; Clyde 
Featherston of Goldthwaite,
400 lb. str., 45.00; Mac New- 
some, Brookesmith, 12 red 
hefrs., 406 lb. avg. wt., 35.90;
Eiie Robertson, Goldthwaite, jD n iro  Hl'S/'IflAtitflct 
10 wf. strs., 485 lb. avg, wt., Y  Clj&  1 /IV I llC liU o  
40.50; Burt Cole, Bangs, 245 
lb. wf. str., 55.00,

News Advertising

Advertise in the 
Santa Anna News

TIRES ARE ALWAYS 
A BARGAIN

RUDOLPH’S 
Coleman, Texas

NAM E

STREET NO.

I 
I 
(
j GTY, STATE, ZIP

I  Enclosed is remittance in the amount of $tS..

I  _ C o p i e s  Paperbound at $2.45 per copy
I  — — Copies Hardbound at $3.03 per copy

Moll prices Include tax, packaging and postage

coverings

OPTOMETRIST
Dr. E. H. Henning:, Jr.

117
Commercial 
Coleman

Ph. 625-2228 
OFFICE HOURS 

9:00 A. M. to 5:00 P. M. 
SATURDAYS, 9 to 12

Reed Memorial Co,
Inc. .

Monuments of Distinction

Fort Worth Highway 
Brownwood, Texas 

Box 265 — Phone 646-7625

Sylvia Herring, local 
representative

PE$T CONTROL

Call Cliff Morris
. . . .  A

nia! 348-34*8

FLOOR COVERINGS 
DRAPERIES 

MINNESOTA PAINTS 
ARTISTS SUPPLIES 
CUSTOM PICTURE*
, . FRAMING 
WALLCOVERINGS

McMinn’s House 
Of Color

' West of Post Office
Coleman

" , ' J - ‘‘„ ?*&*•!.. ,
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Trickham
News

By Mrs. Oscar Boenicke
Mr. and Mrs. Grady Mc- 

Iver attended the Sunday 
afternoorf Festival of Advent 
the Methodist Churches of 
the Brownwood District were 
having at the Coliseum at 
the Coliseum at Brownwood. 
They reported it to be very 
good. Terry and Orabeth

FOR HIS
CHRISTMAS

SKIFF "AM~
Water resistant, precision 
jeweled movement, shock- 
resistant, sweep second.

C a r a v e l l e *
by BULOVA

SEE and You Will 
Buy CARAVALLE

1 .0 0  A WEEK 
NEXT YEAR

AhLE SMITH'S (
COLEMAN, TEXAS

and Reece visited the Grady 
Melvers Saturday.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Vaughn 
visited Sunday afternoon at 
Bangs with her sister and 
family, Mr. and Mrs. Elmer 
Woods. Also their daughter 
and husband and baby, Jeana 
and Bill Smith and baby of. 
Suitland, Md., are there visit­
ing. He has a 30-day leave 
from-the service.

Rev. Travis Gipson, the 
Baptist minister, preached 
here Sunday morning. It was 
so bad not many were out 
to hear him and no night 
service was held.

The Oscar Boenickes at­
tended the dedication of the 
State School for GirLs at 
Brownwood Sunday after­
noon. A large crowd, attend­
ed, over a thousand people. 
The buildings are beautiful. 
We did not go though all of 
them as it would take some 
time to do that. We heard 
part of the speaking. We 
heard Lt. Gov. Barnes give 
his address as he said this 
school was one of the best 
in the United States and had 
the best staff of workers. He 
praised it all very much.

We also visited Mrs. Lacy 
and her mother. Her moth­
er was better . . . able to be 
up some. We came back by 
the Brownwood Hospital and 
visited Buck Mitchell and Ed 
Featherston. They were both 
doing very well, but Ed had 
eye surgery Monday. The 
report I had tonight was he 
was doing all right. Also 
Dollie Martin is there for 
treatment and may be there 
all this week. She is in room 
317, Buck in 232, and Ed in 

j 216. They all would enjoy 
’ cards. Mr. and Mrs. Oil Mar­
i' tin were married 64 years 
1 last Wednesday, Dec. 1. She 
! was unable to celebrate their 
| anniversary.
1 Mr. and Mrs. Walter Stacy 
j were married 54 years the 
’ same day.

E-P RANGE RECLAMATION, Inc.
Box 56

TREE DOZING
RAKING
SEEDING

Max Eubank
915 348-3413

Santa Anna, Texas 76878

TANKING
DIVERSIONS

WATERWAYS

* Don Pritchard
915 348-3769

Santa Anna, Texas — Call Collect

Visitors with the Fred 
Haynes Sunday evening were 
Robert and Juanita Haynes 
and Julia of Brownwood, and 
Byrdie Miller of Santa Anna. 
Their granddaughter, Me- 
che'lle Haynes, is visiting with 
them for awhile. *.

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Rice 
of Brookesmith visited the 
Wiley McClatchys on Friday 
night.

Frankie Wells and Dorthy 
Frazer of Brownwood mar­
ried last Friday. They will 
be living in the Trickham 
community in the Marion 
Ford house. He works for 
Rankin SMglver.

Russipf James spent Sat­
urday night with her daugh­
ter and family, the Pat Me- 
Shans, Cindy and Pat, Jr.

The last report from Gid 
Mathews he is not doing any 
good at all.

We looked for my nep­
hew and wife, Bill and Doris 
Shield of Bonham, until the 
weather got too bad. They 
were going to spend the week- 
en with us. Doris called on 
Friday morning and said they 
would not get to come now 
until after Christmas. They 
sold their place two miles out 
of Bonham but bought an­
other place 17 miles out of 
Bonham but will, have to 
build a house on it.„

Visitors with the Walter 
Stacys Saturday were O. T. 
and Sue Stacy of Abilene and 
Gordon and Alma Stearns 
were visiting them Monday 
night.

Mrs. Edna Laughlin’s visi­
tors over the weekend were 
Mr. and Mrs. Doyle Laughlin 
and children of Seymour, and 
Sunday Mr. and Mrs. Billy 
Roy Laughlin and Lee of 
Brownwood. Also Minnie 
Wilson had dinner with them 
and Mabel and Carl Sheffield 
visited in the afternoon.

Mr. and Mrs. Delbert Rice 
spent the weekend with their 
son and family, Lynn and 
Ann Rice and Melissa of Ar­
lington.

The rain was good on the 
grain which was sown and 
up. We received 1.2 inches 
of rain last week but the 
sunshine sure looks good.

The annual party for the 
Quilting Club will be next 
Tuesday, Dec. 14. Secret pals 
will have.a>.gift exchange and 
draw for new ones for another 
year.

...

Ifiri .
Whon
News

By Mrs. Tom Rutherford

The Safely Sheriff—Joe Higgins—is on pretty safe ground when he recom­
mends U.S. Savings Bonds as Christmas gifts. No one has ever been known 
to receive too many of them.

Rockwood
News

By Mrs. John Hunter

S E R IO U S L Y  ILL
Rev. Hal Wingo of San An­

tonio, a former pastor of the 
First Baptist Church, is 
seriously ill in Harris Hospi­
tal in Fort Worth following a 
severe heart attack. His 
condition was about the same 
early this week, according to 
family members here.

Among ourselves,
we call ’em 
"love” loans.

M

mi

We know hovy brightly the light glows in a wife's eyes 
when her husband announces that he’s going to buy that 

labor-saving applifcno6 she’s wanted. So we offer 
the fastest, easiest, most economical way to finance a 

dishwasher, dryer, refrigerator, range— any appliance.
A low-cost bank loan! Come in for details.

|We love to make “ilove” loans.
M l ' 1 ? y

W  ' 1 J ' 1 *

Santa Anna National Bank
f Member FDIC and Federal Reserve Bank of Dallas

Recent visitors with Mrs. 
Fox Johnson and Miss Ber­
nice were Mrs. Kate Mcllvain 
and her granddaughter, Caro­
lyn, of Houston.

Mr. and Mrs. J. H. Routh 
and Eo of Fort Worth spent 
the weekend with Mrs. Lon 
Gray.

Mrs. Junior Brusenhan and 
her mother* Mrs. R". W. Emer­
son, visited Tuesday and 
Wednesday with her father, 
Mr. Emerson, who has had 
recent surgery in Houston.

Mr. and Mrs. Brusenhan 
and Jody and uncle, Joe Mc­
Creary, visited Sunday after­
noon in Eden with Mrs. Mary 
Brusenhan.

Mr. and Mrs. George Os- 
burn and Rhanda of Brown- 
wood spent Wednesday to 
Friday with Mrs. Billy Mcln- 
tire and Tommy. All of them 
wei’e business visitors to 
Llano Thursday. Mr. and 
Mrs. Ricky Zabel of Bangs 
visited Friday to Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. R, J..Deal 
visited Mrs. W. F. Deal in 
Coleman Wednesday. Mr. 
and Mrs. Joe Deal and fam­
ily of Abilene were Friday 
supper guests. Mr. and Mrs. 
Deal spent Saturday in 
Brownwood with- Mr. and Mrs. 
Johnny Deal and family.

The Rev. John Lindsey, pas­
tor, preached at the Baptist 
Church at both Sunday ser­
vices. He was a guest of 
Mr. and Mrs. Claud B oxers . 
A. L. King was also a dinner 
guest.

Mr. and Mrs. Olin Horton 
and Denise of Andrews and 
Johnny Horton and Miss Su­
san Morgan, students in 
Texas U in Austin, were 
weekend guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. Johnnie Steward. Mr, 
and Mrs. James Steward and 
Jamie of Coleman and G. T. 
England of San Angelo were 
other Sunday guests.

Mrs. A. L. King was in 
Santa Anna last Wednesday 
accompanying Mrs. Lon Gray 
and with Mr. and Mrs. Claud 
Box shopping in Coleman 
and Santa Anna Saturday. 
They visited Mr. and Mrs. 
John X. Steward Monday 
morning.

Mr. and Mrs. Walter Patrick 
and Mr. and Mrs. Hubert 
Johnson of Richland Springs 
visited Tuesday evening with 
Mrs. John Hunter.

Mr. and Mrs. Iru Bray were 
in Brady Friday attending 
funeral services for Mike 
Looney.

Weekend guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. Hilton Wise were Mr, 
and Mrs. Bill Black, Forbes, 
Kelley and Corey of Fort 
Worth and Mrs. Kelley Smith, 
Nesa and Birch of Brown­
wood; Sunday visitors were 
Dr. and Mrs. Wes Wise and 
Geyer of Brownwood and Mr. 
and Mrs. Joe Riley of Santa 
Anna.

Mrs. Tom Stewardson visit­

ed Mrs. King Monday morn­
ing.

Lana Holman of San An­
gelo spent the. weekend with 
Mrs. Carl Buttry.

Elon Cheatham of Boerne 
spent the weekend at the 
deer lease where they were 
joined by Mr. and Mrs. Arlie 
Hughes of Corpus Christi. 
They report good luck.

Edmond MeCarrell of San­
ta Anna visited on Sunday 
morning with Mrs, C. N. Mc- 
Carrell, Harold and Mrs. 
Goldie Milberger.

Mrs. Matt Estes honored 
Mr. Estes with a turkey din­
ner and all the trimmings 
Saturday on his 84th birth­
day anniversary. Guests were 
Mrs. Lillie Horseman, Mrs. 
John Kemp and Mrs. John 
Hunter. Mr. and Mrs. Donnie 
Estes and family of Brown­
wood visited briefly with 
birthday greetings enroute to 
San Angelo for the ballgame. 
Donnie and Tammi were 
Sunday dinner guests. Mr. 
.and Mrs. Estes were in Cole­
man Monday afternoon and 
visited Mrs. Kemp.

A Sunday School teacher 
was talking with her class of 
small children. She was tell­
ing the children about Lots 
wife. She says, “Lots wife 
looked back and turned into 
a pillar or salt.” A small boy 
who had been listening so 
eagerly, said: “My mother 
was driving a car. She look­
ed back and turned into a 
telephone pole.”

We have received some nice 
rains during the past week­
end, measuring from 1>/2 to 2 
inches,

Mr. and Mrs. Elwayne JPer- 
kins and  son, Cecil Ray of 
Hurst, wer.e weekend guests 
of his aunt, Mr. and Mrs. 
Floyd Morris.

Mr. and Mrs. Aaron Avants 
accompanied Mr. and Mrs. 
Bean Radle, Santa Anna, Sat­
urday afternoon to Brown­
wood where they did some 
Christmas Shopping.

Mr. Hilton Sherrod and two 
sons, a friend of Hilton’s and 
his son, whose name we fail­
ed to get, all from Austin, 
spent the weekend on the 
Wimpy Watson farm here.

Please accept this as a big 
special thanks for the sub­
scriptions you have handed 
me for the Coleman County 
papers. Thanks.

We are glad to report both 
Mr. and Mrs. Floyd Morris, 
who have been ill, are feeling 
better. A son, Mr. and Mrs. 
Jamie Lee Morris and daugh­
ter, Judy were Monday din­
ner guests.

Todd and Tona Rutherford

cf Bangs, children of Mr. and 
Mrs. Loyd Rutherford, were 
Saturday and Sunday visitors 
with their grandparents, the 
Tom Rutherfords, while 
their parents attended a 
company banquet in Fort 
Worth Saturday night. Their 
mother, Mrs. Loyd Ruther­
ford, and Mrs. Hurby Hash of 
Bangs came for the children 
Sunday afternoon and visited 
awhile.

Mrs. Barbara Morgan and 
children of Rockwood visited 
her aunt and uncle, Mr. and 
Mrs. Floyd Morris, during the 
past week.

Mr. Hilary Rutherford of 
Coleman was with his par­
ents, the Tom Rutherfords, 
Saturday.

Mr. Don Fitzpatrick of 
Tarleton College was with his 
home folks here during,the 
weekend.
■ Mr. and Mrs. Tom Ruther­
ford visited the Aaron Avants 
late Sunday afternoon.

Only with the permission 
of Congress may an officer 
in the U. S. Government ac­
cept a title of nobility or 
order another country.

Weah McCulloch, Mgr.

Standard 
Abstract Co.

City & County Maps for Sale 
405 Bank Bldg. Coleman

BOB MANNING ELECTRIC
General Wiring and Controls 
Residential and Commercial

Phone
646-7785

1111 West Commerce 
Brownwood, Texas

Fine Quality 
Furniture ( 

Carpet - Linoleum! 
Custom-Made 

Drapes
1 Let Us {Show You 

In Your Home
Estimates , No Obligation 
Large Selection of Samples 
| Phone1' 625-2124

i J. E. Stevens Co.
Furniture Dept. 
Coleman, Texas

Financial Statement
1970-71

Santa Anna Independent 
School District

Opening Cash Balance on September 1, 1970 .......................
State and County Available . . . . . . . . . . $  2,184.52
Local Maintenance ..............................—  (1,622.12)
Interest and Sinking ................................ 22,025.41

$ 22,537.81

$ 22,537.81

RECEIPTS (9-1-70 through 8-31-71)
Local Sources ............   $129,067.80
County Sources ............................................  801.81
State Sources .......................................................  123,828.00
Sale of Property.....................................   1,177.37

$254,854.98
Revenue

Total Funds Available

254,854.98 

. $277,392.79

BUDGETARY DISBURSEMENTS 
(9-1-70 through 8-31-71)

100 Administration .......... i .
200 Instruction......................].
400 Health S erv ices.............\.
600 Operation of Plant . . . .  
700 Maintenance of Plant . .
800 Fixed Charges ...............
1000 Student Body Activities
1200 Capital O u tlay ...............
1300 Debt Service . .............
1400 Outgoing Transfers . . .

$ 23,590.00 
162,969.94 

.' 2,905.23

. 15,380.38 

. 4,643.48

. 2,646.46

. 4,223.64
778.74 

. 14,853.86 
329.00

$232,321.33
Disbursements 232,321.33

Cash Balance as of August 31, 1 9 7 1 ............................................  $45,071.46

Closing Cash Balances as of 8-31-71
gtate and Coiint^ Available .......... $ 2,053.18 1
Local Maintenance .................................... 12,466.59 ||

terest and S in k in g .................................. 30,551.69* 1

ded i ndebt-

. ■ i $ 45,071.46
* Interest and Sinking Funds are restricted for payment of bor 
edness. . ,

•• I ■ ;/ .
I certify that the above reflects the financial condition of the 

Anna Independent School District at the close of the 1970-71 iHsea 
on August 3,1, 1971. 1 , ■ J

Sandra J. Cariimack, Business Manager

Santa
Year

$



ASC News ...
by Joe K. Taylor

Coleman County residents 
can get official information 
on Phase II of President 
Nixon's Economic Stabiliza­
tion Program at the A>rrcul- 
tural Stabilization and Con­
servation Service office.

As the Nation enters Phase 
II, ASCS County offices along 
with the Internal Revenue 
Service will continue tp pro­
vide public information at 
the local level.

The County ASCS office 
will receive regular updated 
information from the Presi­
dent’s Cost of Living Coun­
cil, Price Commission,' and 
Pay Board.

Residents calling or visit­
ing the County office about 
a wage-price problem, will 
get answers on the spot if 
the questions fall within ex­
isting guidelines.

. More complex questions 
1 will be forwarded by County 
, Office personnel to the near­
e s t  IRS office for reply.- 
: Wo are not authorized to
j handle complaints, violations 
1 and requests for exemptions, 
but we will forward them to 
the IRS District Headquar- 

i tors office.
The name of anyone filing 

a complaint or violation will 
be kept confidential.

Any questions that cannot 
be answered by ASCS or in­
terpreted by the IRS Dis­
trict office wilLbe forwarded 
for higher level action. The 
person making the lnjuiry 
will be informed if this ac- 

1 tion is taken.
I Details on procedures for 
| appealing decisions also are 
! available upon request, 
j The County. ASCS office 
I located at 119 West Street is

gifts*f X-:.
THATSAY,

Why You’ll Call 
I ay mar’s 

Knit Slacks

TOE NO-QUIT- 
KNIT!

Because even after two days in a suit­
case, or a week-end in a boat locker,- 
these knit slacks just won’t stop 
looking new.
Simply shake 'em out, slip 'cm on, 
and jet going again. Wrinkcs just 
roll out!
Fashioned of 100% Dacron® (the 
Big Name polyester) in every 
solid fashion look, No-Quit- 
Knit Slacks come in colors 
you won’t believe and pat-  ̂
terns you can’t resist.
So -drop in today! Slim 
into a pair of Jaymar's 
Nn-C -Knits!

Beautiful

Wrapping 
Fr e e . . .  too!

AT

Tjhe 9/fcin ’s Shop
RAY DON JtfiitfSON CO.

• Coleman, Texas
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SPEND HOLIDAYS HERE FUNERAL HELD FRIDAY

Thanksgiving visitors in_.r __  _ Funeral services were hfeld
I'C'-t 3 r, ■ and ^  Hslton Frid&y for Mrs. Ad&
............  Tre'their chll- j

:c! Mrs. Will Till-1 *°n 1t est Hom Thursday,
' nil of Jackson-I Dec' '

Among survivors are sever­
al nieces including Mrs. W. L. 
Campbell, Mrs. Aubrey Par­
ker and Mrs, CarlAutrey, all 
of Santa Anna,

i; c v. vi Wy): 
r’ic:.. Mr. a 
m an  on 1 J .  
vllle. Ark;, i  -. and Nfrs. Budr 

vv/lti a; 1 Chris of Ai- 
Lvigfon, a n d  Mr. and Mrs. 
Pete Wylie and family of Abi­
lene.

From EARLE SMITH’S

"That consumer magazine rated it “Best Buy’ in washing machines!”

open from 8:00 a. m. to 5:00 
p. m. The telephone num­
ber is 625-2438.

The County convention to 
elect one county committee­
man to serve for a period of 
three years will be held on 
Wednesday, Dec. 15, at 10:00 
a. m. This meeting will be 
held at the ASCS office.

Delegates to this conven­
tion will be the elected com­
munity committeemen from 
the four communities in the 
county.

The County Committee will 
mail Notice of Allotment, 
Base Acreages, Yields and 
Rates to all operators in the 
county who have feed grain 
base and-or a wheat or cot­
ton allotment. These notices 
will be mailed Tuesday, Dec. 
21. The sign-up under these 
programs will begin Monday, 
Jan. 17, 1972, and end Friday, 
Feb. 25.

Care Procedure 
For “Preemies” 
Includes Love

Premature babies may 
crave more cuddling than 
full-term infants.

“Preemies” are secluded for 
days or weeks in sterile Iso- 
lettes. Slow learning and 
motor retardation is not un-‘ 
common among these infants, 
and many researchers believe 
that neurological defects 
cause the retardation. But a 
psychiatrist at the State Uni­
versity of New York at Buf­
falo believes' that early sen­
sory deprivation may contri­
bute to —even cause—the im­
pairments .

Dr. Norman Solkoff experi­
mented with two groups of 
premature infants. One group 
was picked up only to be fed 
or burped and for diaper 
changes. The second group 
was fondled for five minuttes 
every hour, day and night, 
for ten days. The results? 
The cuddled prematures cried 
less than the uncuddled ones; 
they were more active and re­
gained their birth weight fas­
ter. Eight months later, their 
performance was still far 
superior to uncuddled pre­
matures.

Because of these effects, Dr. 
Solkoff plans more projects 
with “preemies.” He will use 
colorful decals and mobiles

that the infants can touch 
and also play a wide variety 
of sounds—those of the ba- 

i bies’ own heartbeats, the 
voices of their mothers, and 
music from Beethoven to the 
Beeltes .

However rich their early en­
vironment, through, the prob­
lem of premature babies is 
still 'unsettling. And one of 
the suspected causes of pre­
mature births is smoking 
mothers. According to the 
U. S. Surgeon General’s lat­
est report, pregnant women 
who smoke have more still­
births and spontaneous abor­
tion as well as more prema­
ture babies than non-smok­
ers. Smoking can retard and 
damage fetal growth.

Your local tuberculosis and 
respiratory disease associa­
tion has very little informa­
tion about premature babies, 
but a great deal of material 
about the many hazards of 
smoking. Check with them 
for more facts.

THE PERFECT GIFT
ON YOUR CREDIT AT

Coleman, Texas

Santa Anna Cub Scouts Den 
1 and Den 2 met together last 
Wednesday, Dec. 1, to make 
plans for their float for the 
Christmas parade. The two 
groups will meet again this 
week to complete work on 
the project.

The two dens and the Boy 
Scouts will enter the float in I

the Friday parade.
Members of the group in 

charge of the float are Bob­
by Burton, J. T. Naron and 
Jerome Shield, Jr.

* * *
The Cub Scout Den 2 meets 

each Wednesday afternoon 
from 4 to 5 p. m. at .the 
Methodist Church.

m m m m w m m iS iM m w m m m m m m m m m s im :

THAT GIVE INSTANT PLEASURE

cssr

Vi OZ..B.50, Vi oz. 11.00, % OZ. 16.00, I oz. 30.00

:EVERY WOMAN ALIVE' 
LOVES CHANEL No 5

CHANEL

“Where Friends Mee^” 
Coleman, Texas

Jtjj



The Santa Anna News Thursday, December 9, 1971

County Records
Warranty Deeds:

Billy J. Rosser, to Joe D. 
Wilder, one loti in the town 
of- Coleman.

Flora Richey to Tommy V. 
Rush: Six lots in the town of 
Talpa.

Doyle L. Derryberry to Clif­
ton Harper: Property in the 
town of Coleman.

Truett Edwin Hipsher to 
Truett Hipsher: 12 acres in 
Coleman County^

Joseph Georjte Haynes to 
Franklin ScotteLane: One lot 
in the town, of Coleman.

L. B. Kennedy to Raymond 
J. Henderson: One lot in the 
town of Coleman.

O. J. Johnson to W. J. John­
son: 11.17 acres of land in 
Coleman County.

Bobby Gene McCullough to 
Jimmy Lee Webb: Property in 
the town of Coleman.

' Vera Elizabeth Marshall) 
Wester to Dolph V. Smith, Jr.: 
Property in the city of Cole­
man.

George C. Vincent to Tom­
mie J. Mills: Four tracts in 
Coleman County.

Janette Blatherwick to 
Donald Baird: Property in 
the town of Coleman.
Oil and Gas Leases:

H. W. Schulze' to McCul­
loch County Gas & Exp. Vo.: 
160 acres in Coleman Co.

W. F. Barnes . to Rhodes

J

Drilling Co.: 371 . acjres in 
Coleman County. . I \

James M. Gill to Rhodes 
Drilling Co.: 480 acres in 
Coleman County.

Tom A. Young to G. M. Mc- 
Garr & George M. C'lutts: 
79,14 acres in Coleman Coun­
ty.'

Andy Dale Young to G. M. 
McGarr & George M. Clutts: 
79.4 acres of land'in Coleman 
•County.

Herman Thate to TIPCO, 
Inc.: 258.5 acres of land in 
Coleman County.

O. C. Yang to Tom Berry: 
197 acres in Coleman Coun­
ty.

Adrian Price to Tom Berry: 
All of Section 98 in Cole­
man County.
Assignments:

Itjofgan Brothers to Tom­
my Littlepage: 120 acres in 
Coleman County.

McCulloch Co. & Exp. Co. 
to H. W. Schulze: 160 acres 
in Coleman County.

Tom C. Berry to Walter S. 
Yancy-: 164.5 acres in, Cole­
man County.

SAHS Students 
At ASU Seminar
On Wednesdayd

David Horner and Linda 
Dean represented the Santa 
Anna High School this week 
at the Region XV Talented 
Youth seminar at Angelo 
State University. The two 
students were chosen to re­
present the school by school 
administrators. The semi­
nar is sponsored by the re­
gional organization of the 
Texas Small Schools Associa­
tion of which Santa Anna is 
a member.

Linda, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Rodney Dean, is presi­
dent of the SAHS Student 
Council, head cheerleader, 
basketball captain and lead­
er in other school organiza­
tions. She was recently 
chosen as the Coleman Coun­
ty “Miss Spirit of Christmas.” 
She is a' sjfhior this year.

David, a junior student and 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Richard 
Horner, is vice-president of 
the Student Council, quarter­
back of the football team, 
member of the basketball 
team and golf team, and ac­
tive in other school activities.

The all-day meeting was 
held on Wednesday.

Fast Efficient Service 
Joe K. Cervenka 

Electric
i l l  Commercial - 625-4212 

Coleman, Texas

Mrs. McQueen 
Gives Program 
For FHA Group

The Santa Anna Future 
Homemakers of America 
Chapter met at, the high 
school Monday night, Dec. 6, i 
for the Christmas meeting. 
President Glenda Strickland, 
presided during the meeting.

Mrs. Winnie McQueen, FHA 
advisor, gave a talk on “Pre­
paredness, the yKe to Oppor­
tunity”. Sandra Hosch, the 
first vice-president, present­
ed a skit showing the differ­
ent attitudes a person can 
have, or the right and wrong 
ways for an interview. Those 
participating in the skit were 
Deborah Aldridge, Cynthia 
Rolfe, Serena Bryan, and 
Kelly C'ammack. The judging 
panel was composed of Lu­
cinda Smith, Jana Eubank 
and Suwanee Smith.

An announcement was 
made concerning the Decem­
ber project which is Christ­
mas cards for the Brown- 
wood State School for girls. 
The program was closed by 
group singing of Christmas 
carols.

Approximately 30 members 
of the FHA chapter were 
present for the meeting. Also 
attending were mothers of 
several of the girls.

Refreshments were served 
following the program. De­
cember hostess committee 
was Deborah Aldridge, chair­
man, Sandra Hosch, Lisa Her­
ring, Debbie Harris, Donna 
James, Janice Armstrong, 
Betty Lou Chaney and Judy 
Cupps.

The next meeting of the 
chapter will b e . on Monday, 
Jan. 3.

CONSERVATION
CONVERSATION

by Bob Pearson
Directors J. H. Martin, Ben 

Wilson, Leo Chrane and Lance 
Smith of the Central Colorado 
Soil and Water Conservation 
District acted on several mat­
ters Thursday that can help 
urban and rural residents 
alike.

Soil Conservation Service' 
was requested to make a 
study of a proposed flood 
control dam near Mozelle for 
water storage to supply a 
water system for south Cole­
man County. The flood con­
trol dam could be redesigned 
prior to construction to in­
clude an extra amount of per­
manent storage for domestic 
or municipal use. Your di­
rectors took the official ac­
tion needed for the study to 
be made. The South Cole­
man County group requested 
the study as they search for 
the most economical and 
feasible source of water to 
supply some 350 rural resi­
dents. The water system is 
to be financed through the 
Farmers Home Administra­
tion.

A report on the status o f; 
the Little Concho Creek and 
Old City Lake projects show 
that the detailed study is 
nearly finished. The project 
is being studied on flood con-, 
trol to the stream through 
the City of Coleman. A more 
complete analysis on the 
channel should be complete 
this month. To date the 
study shows that Old City 
Lake can be rebuilt into a 
flood control structure but 
would not give the total pro­
tection needed in Coleman 
without. adequate channel 
work. The study should soon 
show how much channel work 
is needed and its effect on 
the environment.'

Three conservation plans 
were reviewed and approv­
ed. These plans had been 
developed with assistance 
from Soil Conservation Ser­
vice.

Director Dale Herring miss­
ed the meeting to attend the 
directors meeting of the 
Texas Section of the Society 
for Range Management in 
San Antonio. Herring is a 
director for the society and 
several other organizations 
that are interested in con­
servation and resource de­
velopment.

Cleveland
News

By Mrs. Bruce Ilibbetts

We were saddened by the 
death of our sister-in-law 
last week. Mrs. May Baugh 
passed away Dec. 2, 1971, af­
ter having surgery. She fell 
and broke her hip. She had 
not been well for several 
years. Mary Cardelia Crow 
was born Oct. 2, 1887. She 
was married to Edgar A. 
Baugh, Aug. 29,1907. She had 
five children, one preceeded 
her in death. She was bur­
ied on Friday at Stanton. 
They have not lived here for 
a long time, but were one of 
our old-timers. Mrs. Tennie 
Campbell and Calvin, Mrs.

Evelyn Fisher 
Interred Here

Dixie Cupps, and L. V. and. 
Juanita, Mr. and Mrs. Dick 
Baugh, Rachel and Darrell 
Cupps, and Thelma Fleming 
were the ones to go to the 
services from here.

My news is going to be 
short this week. I don’t have 
the time nor do I feel up to 
it. Eva Nell is still going 
through.xray and tests. May­
be she will get' treatments 
started this week.

Nancy Baugh was home for 
the weekend.

Mrs. Evaline Herring and 
Mrs. Clara Cupps went to- 
Stephenville on Friday to 
bring Pamela Herring home 
over the weekend.

Eva Nell called Monday 
night and said they started 
her treatments Monday.

^ii December 5 4-H Food Units
Begin Preparing 
For 1972 Show

Funeral services were held 
in Coleman Sunday for a 
former Santa Anna resident, 
Mrs. Evelyn Wilson Fisher, 
aged 50, who died early Sat­
urday morning. Dec. 4, in the | 
Coleman hospital after a long 
illness. Burial was in the 
Santa Anna cemetery.

The daughter of the late 
Mr. and Mrs. Roy Wilson, 
Mrs. Fisher was born in the 
Shields community on July 
28, 1921. She married Har­
old Fisher in Brownwood in 
1945 and was a member of the 
Concho Baptist Church in 
Coleman. She had resided in 
Coleman County all her life 
except for nine years in ET 
Paso.

Survivors include her hus­
band; two daughters, Becky 
Fisher and Bennie Fisher; 
one son, Kenenth Fisher, all 
of Coleman; three sisters, 
Mrs. Clyde Seals and Mrs. 
Tode Hensley, both of Cole­
man, and Mrs. J. M. Robbins 
of Bangs.

SPECIALS
Prices Good Friday and Saturday Only

FRESH, LEAN, SEMI-BONELESS

PORK ROAST 
LB. 50*

FRESH
PORK STEAK : lb. 59c
FRESH
PORK CHOPS lb. 69c
BEEF CUTLETS lb. 69c
LARGE, FRESH FROZEN
CHICKEN HENS lb. 49c

Verner & Brown
Realtors

409 Coleman Bank Bldg. 
Coleman, .Texas 
Phone 625-5708

Tom Verner Steve Brown 
Res. 625-4663 Res. 625-2215

MATTRESSES
•  New and Renovate
•  Choice o>f ticking
•  Choice of firmness
•  New innnerspring unit 
•' New mattress guarantee
Western Mattress^

1507 Austin Ave„ 
BROWNWOOD, TEXAS 
Call Collect 646-8944

o  I N G S 1 
J E W E L R Y

tlome of
Fine! Diamonds 

and Watches
„ 1  • ■ i >

Jewelry |or All Occasions 
Santa Fe* Watch Inspector

407‘/a Center Tel. 646-0391 
Brownwpod, Texas

Coleman Voters 
Give Approval 
Of Bond Issue

I Coleman voters went to the 
i polls on Tuesday, Nov. 30, to 
approve the $75,000 sewer 
bond issue which will allow 
the city to receive a federal 
grant on the project. The 
unofficial talley was “612 for 
the approval and 14 against.

The approval of the bond; 
election is the first step to­
ward a new sewage disposal 

^system for the City of Cole- 
f rhah. Much publicity was re­

ceived in recent months . as 
the city'sought permission to 
release sewage affulent from 
the proposed system into 
Hords’s Creek. -

It is estimated that the 
hew sewage freatment plant 
will cost $230,000. The feder­
al grant will pay over half of 
that amount and the city will 

| finance thei.other jjortioh.

VISIT NEAR ABILENE
Mr. and Mrs. Veijnon Her­

ring and daughters were at 
Potosi Sunday to visit his 
sister and family, Mr. and 
Mrs. Danny Bryan.

The Santa Anna Girl Scouts 
met Saturday, Dec. 4, in the 
home of Mrs. Jerome Shield 
to work on the dolls they are 
making for Santa Claus. Girls 
working together to complete 
ten dolls were Beth Burton, 
Cindy, Michelle and Suzette 
Cozart, Nicki and Jackie Mar­
tin, Mary Rendon Dolly De­
Leon, Rhonda Roades and 
Debbie Shield.

The Scouts wish to thank 
Mmes. Ray Owen, Elton Mc­
Donald, Richard Horner, Tom 
Kingsbery, Bob Burton and 
Jake McCreary for the scraps 
of fabric and trimming they 
have taken time to gather for 
Santa’s workshop.

# * *

The junior troop organized 
patrols and elected patrol 
leaders at their last meeting. 
Each patrol must have spe­
cial duties at meetings and 
eampouts. ( ^

The three patrols are the 
Cowgirls with Mary Rendon 
as leader; the Wildcats with 
Alice DeLeon ai leader, and 

[ the Blue laws pith Rhonda 
| Roads as leader Each lead- 
! cr will serve for three months.

Services Held 
In Stanton For 
Mrs. E. Baugh

Mrs. Edgar Baugh, 84, died 
Thursday, Dec. 2, ■ in a Mid­
land hospital after a short 
illness. Funeral services for 
the former Santa Anna re­
sident were held in Stanton 
on Friday.

Mrs. Baugh was born in 
Kaufman County on Octo­
ber 2, 1887 and married Ed­
gar Baugh August 29. 1907 in 
Coleman County. She had 
lived in Stanton since 1924.

Survivors include her hus­
band; two. sons, J. L. Baugh 
of Big Spring and Eugene 
Baugh of Stanton; two dau­
ghters, . Mrs. Ona Hughes of 
Bronte and Mrs. Inez Gil­
more of Stanton; five grand­
children and 12 great-grand­
children. Also among the 
survivors are several rela­
tives in the Santa Anna area.

y 4-H Food and Nutrition 
groups have organized in 
Coleman County in prepara­
tion for the . County Food 
Show to be held January 22, 
1972. Theme for the 1972 
Food Show is “Foods for Spe­
cial Occasions.’’

4-H Food and Nutrition 
Projects are available to all 
ages. “Exploring Food the 
Picnic Way” for ages 9 to 10, 
“4-H Food and Fun” for ages 
10 to 11, “Outdoor-Indoor 
Meals” for ages 11 to l?„,a-nd 
“The Wonder. jof—Fbod” for 
age 12. Older 4-H’ers set 
their own objectives in self- 
determined projects.

Santa Anna girls partici­
pating in the program in­
clude: Becky Rendon; Cyn­
thia Rolfe, Mary Rendon, 
Minnie Frausto, Gracie Siller, 
Dollie DeLeon, Alice DeLeon 
and Dolma Salizar. Mrs. 
Murice Rendon is adult lead­
er.

Rockwood 4-H girls in the 
junior group are Kim Stew- 
ardson, Mary Densman, Tracy 
Duus, Denise Blair, Cindy 
Greenlee, Sherry Scarborough 
and D’Aun Long. Mrs. Bur­
gess Stewardson is the adult 
leader of the group assisted, 
by junior leaders LeAnn Bry­
an and Serena Bryan. Le­
Ann and Serena compose the 
senior group led by Mrs. Cur­
tis Bryan.

SWIFT’S DEEP BASTED BUYTERBALL

TURKEY HEKS
11-12 MMDS

Christmas Party 
Entertains 4-H 
Last Thursday

The Santa Anna Communi- 
ty 4-H Club met on Thursday [ 
night, Dec. 2, for the regular • 
monthly session. Jimmy 
Benton led the business 
meeting.

Members attending decor­
ated the Christmas tree at 
the Community Civic Center 
where the meeting was held. 
The decoration was the 
group’s community project.

David Horner and Sherrie 
Mclver led the' recreatipn. 
Sherrie also led the group in 
singing Christmas carols.

At the close of the meet­
ing Jana Eubank and Cyn­
thia Rolfe served refresh­
ments o f sandwiches, ’cook­
ies, ; chips, dips and} punch,;.

i French is the official dip- 
| lomatic language of the 
world.

OUT OF HOSPITAL
Mrs. Floyd Smith; was dis- 

mi^Sjfd Friday, from Brown- 
wood Community hospital 
after Loving surgery last 
week. She is back at her 
home and getting along well

About Your 
Patronage

We Give S & H Green 

Stamps

Russell Stover 

Candy
Exclusively at

II
iitiiii;

“Prescription Specialists 
Since 1886”

DECKERS QUALITY
BACON lb. 59c
3 POUND BOX
BACON Ends and Pieces 79c
CHOICE BLADE
CHUCK ROAST

■ .■

lb. 69c
LEAN
SALT PORK lb. 39c
ZEE

TOILET TIS!
2 ROLL PACK

SUE 19*
FOREMOST
BIG DIP f  gallon 59c
CANDY’S
BUTTERMILK i gallon 49c
OUR DARLING Cream Style or 
whole kernel 303 can
WHITE CORN 2 for 59c
HUNT’S
PEACHES-halves

No. 2\/‘i can
2 for 69c

GRIFFIN
GRAPE JELLY

18 oz. jar
39c

POTATOES pound 10r

YAMS lb. 15c
KRISPY SALTING
CRACKERS lib .b o x  35c
GRIFFIN
BLACK PEPPER 4oz. can 29c
SUPER
K0TEX - 24’s
---------------- 1.... - ..... 1-----

lb o x  79c
FREE JoELIVERY—MINIMUM $2.50

Jim Burchfield - Owner ami Manager


