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Christmas Edition 
To Be Mailed 
Tuesday, Dec. 23
: Plans for the annual Christ­
mas ■■■ Greeting . Edition of the 
Santa Anna. .News are In pro­
gress. Plans call for mailing the 
edition as early as possible on 
Tuesday, Dee. 23. We hope t o ' 
have it in the mail before noon.

. In order for us to get the an­
nual/ Greeting Edition out at 

- least two days earlier, it will toe 
necessary to have the coopera­
tion of all who turn in news 
items for publication and all ad­
vertisers.

We request all advertising 
copy to be in our hands not later 
than 5:00 p. m. Saturday, Dec­
ember 20. All news items must 
be received by not later than 
noon Monday, Dec. 22nd.

We have a large number of 
Christmas advertisements and if 
by chance you are not contacted 
And would like to have one of 
these Christmas ads in the 
paper, we would appreciate your 
telephoning 45.

Plano- Recital 
On Sunday

Mrs, Arthur Turner will pre­
sent her piano pupils in recital 
Sunday, Dee. 14, at 4:00 p. m. in 
the First Baptist Church. The 
public is cordially invited to at­
tend. \

Recitalists . are: Janice Lang­
ford, Roy Joe Harvey, Jodie 
Swindell, Jimmy and Norma Jo 
Eubank, Sonja, Vicki and Don­
nie Neff, Dickie and Linda Carol 
Horner, Reggie and Rickey Try- 
on, Beth Irick, Leanna Pollock, 
Susanna Hays, Margueritte and 
LaWanda Horner,'Nteta Ann Mc­
Clure Linda Abernathy, Carol 
Sue Campbell, Arlene Welch and 
Linda Kay Campbell.1

Wreck Sunday Near 
Ranger Park

Two cars heading east collided 
at the entrance to Ranger Park 
about 1:00 p. m. Sunday. No ser­
ious'injuries were reported.

Leon C. Hasserodt, 18. was dri- 
ving a 1954 Plymouth and was 
making a left turn into, the 
park. Vonceal D. Trammel of 
Coleman, driving . a 1952 Ply­
mouth station wagon, attempt­
ed to pass just as Hasserodt 
started to turn. The Hasserodt 
ear went off the right side of 
the road and stopped. .The 
Trammel car started a _ side- 
skid, turned over twice' and 
stopped on its wheels heading 
south on the" north side of the 
road,

Wilbur Anderson was a pas­
senger, with Hasserodt. They did 
not receive any apparent injur­
ies. Mr. and Mrs, Trammel and 
their five children were in the 
station, wagon; Trammel and 
two of the children were thrown 
out, but were apparently not in-, 
jured. AH were admitted to the 
Hospital and released Monday. 
: M:> R.Simmohs said no. char­
ges were filed in the accident, 
tout it was still under investiga­
tion.

Kile Dry Goods 
Received Good 
Opening Reception

Mr. and Mrs. Curtis Kile re­
port the reception to their open­
ing of a new dry goods store in 
Santa Anna was very good, and 
they are very happy with the 
response. The Kites opened the 
Store On Friday morning and 
held open house through Friday 
and Saturday., • .

They said a lot of people 
visited , the store and that sales i 
of merchandise were good. They 
invite your continued patron­
age. 1 ■■■- -

The store is located in the 
Stockard building across the 
street from the bank, and is the 
first door west of the Santa An­
na Beauty, Shop,

Although their stock is not 
complete yet; many new items 
are arriving daily, and will con­
tinue to do so until'they have 
a complete stock of merchan­
dise.

Murray Cooper 
Associated With 
Funeral Home

2 More Names On 
High School 
Honor Roll
- We unintentionally omitted
4wo names,from the high school 
honor roll Die past week. Char­
lie Sue Garrett should have 
been on the Freshman Honor 
Roil and Dixie Deal should have 
been on the Junior Honor Roll.

We are happy to make this 
correction.

20th'Century Club 
To Have Christmas 
Party Friday

Members of the 30th Century 
Club will meet with Mrs. Sam 
Rutherford Friday, December 
j% for an all day meeting and 
their annual Christmas Party. 
Each member is requested to 
bring & covered dish far lunch­
eon and a gift to be exchanged.

S. 8. Baker’s To 
.Observe Golden 
' Wedding Sunday

Mr. and Mrs. S. S. Baker an­
nounce they will observe their 
Golden Wedding Armlvousary 
Sunday, December 14, in their 
home here. All friends and rela­
tive.-' are invited, to call between 
theOhdurs p f 2;0tt,and 4:0ft j>.m. 
during'the open, house hours,.

_____ __

IMted 
and

School Christmas 
Program To Be On 
December 18th

The Santa Anna Bands and 
Choral Club of the Santa Anna 
Schools, will present a program 
i,n the high, school auditorium 
Thursday evening, Dec. 18: at 
7:30 p. m. This program, will 
take place of the annual Christ­
mas program that has been pre­
sented by members of the lower 
grades of the elementary school.

The program will .feature the 
band and choral club indivi­
dually, „ and as the program 
draws to a close, both groups 
will be featured. A large number 
of Christmas songs will be fea­
tured, but other music will also 
be used.

No Crossword
Puzzle This Week

For the past several months

' MURRAY COOPER f

Murray Cooper; • a licensed 
embalmer with 20 .years of ex­
perience, became associated 
with the Hosch Funeral Home 
recently. He and Mrs. Cooper 
are living in the Zachary house 
on Bowie Avenue, ,

Cooper came to Santa Anna 
from Brownwood, where he was 
associated with the London- 
Burton Funeral Horne for more 
than two years. He, will be .at 
the -Funeral Home here through 
the day each day during the 
week and at other times when 
needed. -

A. native of Honey Grove, Tex­
as, the Coopers are, members of 
the Baptist Church.;

Good Crowd Mere 
Saturday Despite 
Cold Weather

An extra' good crowd was in 
Santa Anna Saturday afternoon 
for the weekly drawing, despite 
the cold weather. Besides the 
regular merchandise, given a- 

The Santa Anna News has been way, several items were given as
bringing our readers a Cross­
word Puzzle. For the next three 
or four weeks we will not be able 
to bring a puzzle to our readers.

This has been brought about 
by a 25% increase in the cost of 
the puzzle and a mix-up with 
the company furnishing it.

We would like your comments 
on the puzzle. If enough of you 
enjoy the puzzle and want us to 
continue printing it each week,1, 
we will make an effort to get' 
the puzzle back.

More Members In 
Band Roosters Club

New--.members for the past 
two weeks in the Santa Anna 
Band Boosters Club include the 
folowing:

Mr, and Mrs. H. W. Gilbreath,
Mr. and Mrs. Elton McDonald, | i i  *■» n  •■-, •
Mr. and Mrs Barney Lewellen, j n m n  IS H s it l fK lO  
H. D. Speck, Reynold Buse, Mrs, TM-M. M  

i Bertie Hall, Mrs. Bill Griffin, E.
M, Nlell, Mrs. A. E. Campbell;
Mr. and Mrs. Carroll Kingsbery,
Mrs. B. IC. Riggs, Mr. and Mrs.
Charles Ing, Doug Moore, Mr, 
and Mrs. -M. R. Simmons, Rev, 
and Mrs. Ray Elliott.

Mr, and Mrs. Buddy Neff have 
been added to the list of tlmse 
who have volunteered to pur­
chase a complete uniform.

door" prizes at the Lions Club 
Pancake Sale, were also distrib.r 
uted.

Mrs, Do vie Wright was pre­
sent to receive the $25 in mer­
chandise coupons, and Earl Ellis 
was present to receive the tur­
key from, the Christmas pro­
gram.-Buddy Benge got the $10 
basket- of groceries from Piggly 
Wiggly.

Another program will be held 
this week at 3:00 p, m. Satur­
day. Another. $25 in merchan­
dise .coupons will be drawn for. 

i and two more turkeys -will be 
drawn fort,Also Piggly Wiggly 
will give away another $10 bas­
ket of groceries.

Everyone is invited to Santa 
Anna to participate in the Sat­
urday program.

Delta Omicron 
Has First Place 
Float in Parade

The Delta Omicron Sorority of 
Santa Anna had the first place 
float in the Santa Anna Christ­
mas Opening Parade Friday 
afternoon. Seven floats were en­
tered in the parade, along with j 
four ■ bands, Santa Claus and 
several children. The Sorority 
was presented $50 for their float.

The Santa Anna Band Boos-, 
ters: entered the second place 
float and received $25. The Pres­
byterian Church float was judg­
ed in third place and they were 
presented a prize of $15; Other, 
floats were entered by the 
Christian Youth Fellowship of 
the First Christian Church, Sev­
enth-Day Adventist Church, 
Santa . Anna Parent-Teachers 
Association and Emmett, Sim­
mons. > ,  -
,  The judges, from out of town, 
graded the floats by points and 
three details, the first being an 
expression of the Christinas spi­
rit, the. second being an Inte­
resting float, and the third 
being good details in: the float. 
Although none of the float? 
scored a possible 100 points, all 
were judged to be nice floats.

The Christmas windows, de­
corated by various groups, were 
judged by the same judges, ancT 
on the same basis. The first 
prize of $5.00 went to the Sev­
enth-day Adventist Church on 
the 'west window in the Kelley 
Building,:- Second prize of $3.00, 
went to the Delta Omicron So­
rority for the-west center win­
dow in the Kelley building; and 
third prize of $2.00 went to the 
Presbyterian- Church for, the 
east window in the Wash-O- 
Matic building.

A ll. other : windows . received 
$2.00 each, as follows: Santa An­
na Parent-Teachers, west win­
dow at Wash-O-Matic; Moun­
tain . City Garden Chib, east 
window of Kile Dry Goods; Cub 
Scouts', wes,t window of Hays 
building; Santa Anna Band 
Boosters, east window of the 
Hays building; Self Culture 
Club, west window of McKee 
Cleaners; Christian' Church, 
east middle window of Kelley 
building:: Santa Anna Hospital, 
east window of Kelley building; 
and 20th Century Club, window 
in old Parker Tailor Shop build? 
.ing.
■ After,, the parade, the four 
bands: Howard' Payne Collect’ , 
Coleman Biuecat and two Santa 
Anna bands, were entertained 
with- a soft drink- and candy 
party in the Hays building. San­
ta Claus treated all the child­
ren - with 1 candy on the south 
block of North' Second Street, 
while the band - played -on the 
North block, w

Several hundred persons, were 
present for the affair. Shop­
ping in most of the local stores 
was brisk most of the dav.

© a s  C o m p a n y  © e l s  
S a t e  S n e f e a s e

Officials of the Coleman Gas 
Company said today that the 
new domestic rates established 
last week by the Railroad Com­
mission of Texas for Coleman 
and Santa Anna will be applied 
on bills payable January 1. 1959. 
The Commission made its order 
effective November 15, 1958, and 
■set, the minimum monthly bill 
at $1.50 instead of-the minimum 
of $1.35:

The new rates-are $1.50 - for 
the first thousand cubic feet oi 
gas or less; 75c per thousand for 
the . next 2.000 cubic feet; 70c 
per thousand, for-the next 2,000 
cubic feet; 05c per thousand for 
the next 5,000 cubic feet;-and 
60c per thousand for,: all- over 
10,000 cubic feet. The. rate pre­
viously in effect lias been $1.25. 
for the'first thousand cubic feet 
and 57V2c -for .-'each--thousand 
cubic feet thereafter.

In it’s ruling the Commission 
stated,, in effect, that the new 
rates were expe’eted to produce 
a return of approximately, 6:5% 
on: the present-fair value of, 
$564,000 of the company’s gath­
ering, transmission, and distri-. 
bntion . systems, after making 
allowance for reasonable ope­
rating expenses, including 
■taxes. ■

The new rates, which are 
somewhat lower than those pla­
ced in effect im a number of 
cities in this -area in -recent

months,' will enable the com­
pany, under present operating 
costs and conditions, to keep 
pace with the growth of the 
Coleman and Santa Anna com­
munities. and continue to pro­
vide first-class natural gas - ser­
vice.

The average annual 'domestic 
bill in 1957 was $59.60. Under 
the new rates the average an­
nual bill based on -  1957- con­
sumption is estimated at $66.77, 
an increase of $9.87.-

2 Teenagers Picked
Up Here For 
Three Offenses.

Lion .Club Pancake 
Sale Successful

The annual. Santa Anna Lions 
Club'. Pancake Sale, held last 
Friday in connection with the-, 
annual Christmas Opening, was 
a very successful affair. About 
$420 -was- taken in- on -the-sale:, 
of admission tickets and turkey, 
raffles. Just what the profits 

-front the venture-will be has 
not been determined as yet, as 
ail the expenses ha-ve.not been 
reported. -

Tlie club wishes to express- 
their, appreciation to everyone 

ah 1 who participated in the affair.
I About-70 local merchants con- 
tribut ed door prize? that w-re 
awarded as the -sale closed t i n : 
the evening. Also 11 turkeys 
were given away., , . - a

The .el-ub would like to express: 
their: appreciation to the Qua­
ker Qat Company ni Sherman,, 
for fnrni. hinv the Aunt Jemima - 
Pancake Mix, Gandy's Cream­
ery. for furnishing . .the milk, 
Borden’s Milk Co, for -furnish-" 
ing the- coffee cream. Kinibell’s 
Brownwood Co. for furnishing' 
the syrup, and the Waples-Plat- 
ter Co. -of Abilene for furnisft- 
iftg the White Swan Coffee. Also- 
there ■ were .several men who 
helped do the work who are not 
members ol the Lions Club. The-

Sand Receives I

Letters To Santa 
Claus To Be 
Published
. The - Santa : Anna News will 

publish “Letters To Santa 
Claus” in the next two editions 
of The News. We urge parents 
to have your small children to 
write their letters to Santa and 
either bring them by The News 
office or mail them to Santa 
Claus, Santa Anna, 'Texas.
. Deadline for-receiving the let­
ters will be Saturday, Dec. 20th. 
The News for Christmas Week 
will be put in the mall as early 
as possible on Tuesday, Dee: 23.

HENRY CAIkfcPBEM. .
BREAKS HIP

Henry Campbell, 83, 3 former
■dent of Santa , Axmk, and 

iw Hying with, his son, to Me- 
Kime,-rT%wa«,'- fell' about turn 
weeM > ago’ -ah*, bjoke his

At Contest Sat.
The Mountaineer Band made 

a very good showing at the In- 
terschojtastic League band mar­
ching-contest Saturday, Dec. 6, 
at-Winters..The local"band- re­
ceived a No. I rating on “in­
spection’’ and. a No, H rating on 
marching. The extremely cold 
weather was hard on the 45 
bands present and certainly had 
its effect on the local band 
members, in the way of cold 
lips, stiff fingers and legs.

Only one band in Class A com­
petition, Medkel, received a top 
rating. Of the three judges,- one 
gave Santa Anna a-No. 1 /rat­
ing, the other two gave them 
a No. II rating, in marching. 
Bands are graded from I to V. 
Twirlers Frances Bryan and 
Mary Rehm received First Di­
vision rating in twirling. This 
part o£ the contest was held 
earlier in the day. Tney received 
nice bronze medals for their ef­
forts.

Now that the marching season 
is over, the band will concen­
trate more cn playing. Plans 
are also in the making for the 
spring activities.

Slaughtering and meat pack­
ing is t-he most importana indus­
try of '

•: ■ ■-
of fteci«te.

Ward School
Honor Rolf

Jame A. Harris, principal of 
1 he Santa Anna Ward School, 
announces the ' following stu­
dents as being on the honor roll 
lor the second six weeks period: 
FOURTH GRADE 

Loretta Broadway, Donnie 
Campbell,- Susanna Hays, Mar- 
garette Horner, Beth Irick,- Bar­
rett Marklan, Sonja Neff, Vikki 
Lynn Warren, Mary Kay Lee. 
Jean Robineit and Carlton 
Watson. ■
FIFTH GRADE 

Pam Garrett, Mary. Haynes, 
Sharon Mays, Linda Melntire. 
Anita Ellis, Linda Lee Aberna­
thy, Ronnie McCarre.ll and Gary 
Rider.
SIXTH GRADE 

iLinda RoMnett, Les Guthrie, 
Tommy Hays, Karen McCluskcy, 
Patricia White. LaWanda Hor­
ner, Nelson Perry, Barbara Bau- 
com, Dianne -Copeland, and Judy 
Moore.
seven th  g r a d e  

Sandra Davis, Karen Jones, 
Wanda James, Bobby Clifton, 
Glenn Gilbreath, Donnie Neff, 
and Jerry Ellis.
EIGHTH GRADE 

Arlene Welch, Jewel Elliott, 
Sherman Steams, and Clayton 
Jackson.

Two teen-age boys were pick­
ed up, here Monday for . what 
may turn out to- be a three- 
count charge filed against them.
The boys gave their names a s : . , . , , , ... ,
Carl D. Coffee. 17. of El Paso J f ub , ™ ll(i  al.° uke tu tXpress. 

| and Eddie Barke. 18, of San An- to,the sc.men... . .
j ton]-Q , ! Just about every member of

. . : - ,, - the club spent a good- part of
The boy* actniiies were-called, jpe dav makine. the sale a big 

to the attention of the Sheriff's | success ' ••• t:
Department . after they-: at- i ___y . ■ • ■

; tempted .10 sell a new tire to : ‘  j » f  *1
, Blossom Owen and Carl Autrey.'f 
Aidrey bought the fire amt kibe l '2 U 
and he made hi-= n port to M P.

-.Simmons- while -Simmon's-;v, 
getting a report on iim ooys 

i from Owen.. The .boys were-pick- 
j ed up in..- the J. A. Harrington 
j.service Station, \\ lie re they were With the expect;: 1 toil tiiat the 
|. buying gasoline on ..a stolen . Christina-; mail -load- will hit- its 
j coiittos) eatd. rhe ttie atm ittlje neak -■1.-h::: the —,. -,, r, ■. ,■ ■ - -,,
I luid been bought m Brownw/e-d Pelunastcr 1 ■ e P;iv‘h ox- 
1 cm tne .-aw..- aouneay eai\if nressCd his a-piirenatum■’ today 
j Driving a 1550 Pontiac, Cofi" for >c,iu* iv i; errhi. n "m - mr oil 
J wa-, filed on m tne local Jus- his antota! “Mol i-aii ' For 
tice ot the Peace court tor no Christmas" Camnaian. . :
driver's license and for mis-ase The PoMma-mg- said, 
of license tags. He hud one set Inn- to ‘ ah: .ibiot e.o-iy 
01 tags on the car. and the tui .uVhi tsl mm, gif Is and e 
regHtered to the car wile tm caiiec, lime mem,-, hy 
the insuic of the c o-. Jiuhm gar! now ■ i v o  a '!■■■• hit 
Irick fined Cuto-e St-’p Uti m th" in eeittni tour re., a.- ,

Espectd 
Recch Peakr At1

Second Sunday 
Singing To Meet 
Dec, 14th

The Second Sunday Singing 
group will meet at Fats North 
Side Isantirf Church Sunday,

two counts litre tin a 1 hi % ,une 
translerreo it, Col-man vhei. 
Simmons said they v.a'dd like!;, 
lutve a cha'gt of it'r""iy (ilvd 
against them. .■■.■■■

Both hoys are in. the roomy 
jail at this time

Library To Open 
December 31st

The Self Culture Club an­
nounces the Santa" Anna Public 
Library will be re-opened on 
Wednesday, December 31st. The

"It - loo 
mail.or 
.mh' h"- 
e:>!h.ing 
■ tii !,iv

: Us
; ,.unt- 

:,,i loved
mam-.i a ly m-.
:m-ut to your tnc.nsi: 
one., o> ('iiristmas I'ay

He suyO'-l.-- tho i-, : mnute
mailers n.o- Air Mail lor their 
Christmas cauls and vitts that 
are going .>tit of town. There's 
still time for 1 v: 1 deliveries but 
all Christmas., cards should be 
sent by First Class mail Be sure 
to .include your return address 
on all Christmas card envelopes 
and package labels

Happy Birthday
, ,  ,, . . . .. "Happv Birthday” to all. who
library has not been open since, have birthdays during the next
the death of Mrs. Lou Storey 
who was librarian.

Mrs. Dovie Chapman has been 
employed as librarian and plans 
to open the library each Wed­
nesday afternoon from 2:00 to 
5:00 p. m. for the public’s use.

There : are lots of good books 
in the library, but few people 
make use of it. Every one is in­
vited to become a member of the 
library , and to make use o f; the 
books there.

Shower To Honor 
Newly Weds A t . 
Trickham Sat,

A bridal shower will be held 
in the Trickham Community 
Center Saturday, December 13 
•at 7:00 p. in., honoring Mr. and 
Mrs. Grady Gene James, who 
were recently married in 
Brownwood.

WfwttoftRfVj for the i f  fair - will
Hi

,u ,  11
..! to -

week. Below are listed the birth­
days we have this week.
DECEMBER 12 

Barbara Craig
DECEMBER 13 

Johnny Bates
DECEMBER 14 

Mrs. B: S. Raney
DECEMBER 15

Nancy Eugenia Smith 
Cynthia Parker 
Mary Ann Wardlow

DECEMBER 17 
Mrs. James A. Mallow ,
Mrs. E. H. Cox, Royalty 
Ronald Fred Bates

DECEMBER 18 
Mrs. R. C. Arnold 
Jesse Wayne Upchurch
Would you like for your name 

to toe published on ypur birth­
day? If so. niease be sure to let 

■ ". ■. -..:f .to-:
. v i'1' 1 m . t . /. ■ ■
■ ■ ;»■ c ■ .',1 1 1 ■ a D r

m



— w n n i j

i

■

i

.»

1i?iS 1 ion.no ted : ,, ( ‘, , i. i

Straight Talk—
BY TOM ANDERSON

The Supreme Court of the TJ. .8, 
Washington, D. c . •
Dear Lifers:

Just because President Roose­
velt vilified the Supreme Court' 
Is no excuse for the common 
man to. After all, by rewriting 
the Constitution to suit modern 
life you are saving the: people 
all .the time, trouble and ex­
pense of having to amend the 
Constitution, ■■■■•. - '

The reactionaries who have to 
be pulled into the 20th century 
dragging their feet and clutch-

Just Arrived!

GOLD SEA!,
finyS Flii stir

in 9-Ft. and 12-Ft. 
Widths

It’s Scrub Free 
And Stain Free

in^ the Constitution to their 
breasts naturally can’t under­
stand you fellows.' They’re used 
to having judges on the Court. 
They don’t realize that human 
values are .what count today — 
not law —  and that you justices 
were appointed because: o f yhur 
social, economic and political'1 
backgrounds and ambitions. 
How could - you make America 
oyer, if you were tied down to 
the rulings of past Courts, the 
laws of Congress or .that ancient- 
Constitution? ■

You threw out the convictions 
of li. California Communists:. . 
you ruled against firing a gov­
ernment worker .suspected of 
being a security risk ..you 
turned loose a dope peddler be - 
cause the government agent: 
who sold the sluif to him had 
to remain anonymous so iv* 
could trap other citizens j like 
good -sports you decreed thaV 
FBI files must be opened: to 
criminal or ^Communist wheiv 
ihe contents of those files are 
being used to prosecute1.him ' v 
you luled that past -mcipher,ship.' 
m the Communist- partv Is no;
,t bar to the practice oi law . : 
you released thrie men wlV 
harbored a ■ convicted and fugi-.. 
tivi Comrinmul li.eai- i cenu-,-'' 
l lit FBI aeeiits i aided the hulls- 
dlhout a *’mrr,ii11 ,ne he’d 
the Jus’tict Departmcn. can't 
bar Communist activity IJ\ ah 
alien who ;s under ,j dppoyta- 

I non iirdu you destroyed tin 
n°ht of,.lutes to tty Commit 
lust.-, on sedition laws, saying nil 
seddi'-m c 's is  must he tried hv 
'he Federal Gm erunicllf only. 
Beieha you can ’ urn Commu­
nists ms, bv-ter'n j  Edear Hoo- 
\ er can lock "< m up 

Since 1932 the Court has de-

wJnUOao v.»Uv iiUw MW.11 k'J
such reversals in Use entire his­
tory’ of the court before 1032. So 
the recent law of the land is 
sorta .like a movie actress’ hair 
— whatever suits the mood- and 
the occasion. The Constitution 
is your- hula hoop: to be played 
with according to your fancy.

Can’!, you makewthe States 
Righters realize that schools 
and things n,wist be federalized 
if we are to -compete with Rus-

trom decisions previously

Prompt Ambulance Service
OXYGEN EQUIPPED

, W e  A r e  A t  Y o u r  S e r v ic e  
B a y  o r  M ight

SilTI'BS h l l T i l l  l i i >
Coleman, Texas Phone 2121

sian schools and things1? Like 
the Kremlin, you must make all 
state under your domination 
conform to whatever national 
educational and social stand­
ards in your gtfeat wisdom you 
deem best for the >vorid and us. 
Back when states and communi­
ties were free to run the schools 
any way they wanted to,, they 
had iittlet ope-room school-. 
Ilduses where-the only, thing red 
was tlh; .schoolhoijse it self ami 
whore about all they had worth 
havingwwas freedom — and, of 
course, that’smut-of date now.

Let’s not make the same mis­
take on integration and civil 
lights that we. made on Prohi­
bition Just because the people 
didn't warn Prohibition and n; 
couldn't be enforced, Congress 
■repeated ’ it. But, - everybody 
knows' people hist can’t  drink 
f qually, although''many (io sep'-- 
i'll1 dy Separate but equal' 
vou've-'.ruled. is not equality! 
And all men are created equal 
as anybody who'll^ just look 
around him can plainly see We 
must’ force ..togetherness - in' 
churches, parks-, theatres, swim­
ming pools, subdivisions, -danc­
ing classes, iarm organizations 
editorial stuffs, boards of direc- 
6rs, garden clubs, fraternities

,wg.f ityy-

GIVE HIM
"T H A T ..........

Read 1 Corinthians 13:8-13
’ When the perfect, comes, the 

imperfect will pass., away (1 
Corinthians 13:10. HSV.) ' 
y A saint loves, everyone, but' a 
witch hates everyone and loves 
only herself. This is the distinc- 
t ion made In John Van Dniten's 
play about, witchcraft entitled 
Bell, Book and Candle.

Gillian, the attractive young, 
witch, works her magic. Her sec­
ret potioijsi however, begin to 
lose their.control over Shep, the 
hero. Then she learns the truth 
oi an old saying: “A witch loses 
hir  ̂powers jf  she should ever 
fallvin. love.” ‘When the genuine

color. For amusement, we cart 
drive white-face musicals . and 
bonks like “Old Beige Joe” and 
“Grey ■ Beauty-.”- There w on ’t be 
anymore Sammy Davis, Juniors 
on TV. ’cause there w on ’t be 
anymore Sammy .Davis Juniors 
Ain’t that fabulous? -• -

Isn’t it unfair that citizens-in 
some areas of the nation, do no; 
have. an equal opportunity ui 
reallv mix with tlieir coloreo 
br'oihers? Would you please pas 
a law. requiring those little ex-

t i s s / l l p p c f R o c t M -
3 THE U B S  ROOM. IIASKVItU. TINNISSEE ,

love destroys her secret witch­
craft, the play closes with a 
happy ending. <

An eternal truth is presented 
here. Love and evil cannot c o - ) 
exist. When the; perfect comes, 
the imperfect'passes away.

This is the story: of Christ­
mas --  Love incarnate coming 
into the world of selfishness and 
hate. And when Love enters the 
human heart, transforming life 
itself, the imperfect passes row- 
and God’s plan for us is fulfilled; 
PRAYER: , '

Dear God, whose, jove for us 
comes into our world in the per­
son of Christ, we thank Thee for 
taking our lives as they are and 
transforming, them; into : -what 
Thou, wouldst, have them to be* 
May the spirit of love which 
came down at Christmas' cast 
that which, is selfish and evil 
in us. In love we pray. Amen, - 
THOUGHT FOR THE DAY 
. Evil goes out when Love conies 
in,

. Alan J. Davis 
. (Ohio)

society pages, living rfeoms and j elusive, commuter towns, arouno
byudoir.s ' Twenty-four states 
hfive laws against Intermarriage 
oi w h ite s -  and’ Negroes. Why 
don't you make that against the 
law of the land”
: This head-on battle for power 
between the federal and state
governments -goes back to- Noah 
He jiad to bring into the ark “of 
every living thing of -all flesh, 
two- of every sort. . .  ” Tf he had 
rust forced integration on. the 
boat, we -wouldn't have all. this 
trouble now. Just: ’ think of thc- 
possibilities: A woodpecker hou­
sed' with a carrier pigeon might 
have produced a pigeonpecker 
that- not only would, deliver a 
message across a continent- but 
would knock- on the door-when 
it got there. -

The racists should take a 
more tolerant view of 
amalgamation (they . call: it 
monerelizationo. When we’re 
like Brazil. Cuba

the big eastern cities to benpli 
by living with, going to school,, 
with, • working with and < social-’ | 
izing with their share of .Nee.- j 
roes?j -I am sure, you’ll agree;1 
that ■■ it's un--modern-American 
to let the- Negroes be discrimi­
nated against by being forced 
on-poor whites only. The:Burn­
ing Tree and - Augusta National 
golf ■ -clitbs, the DAR: and the 
Junior League, Brineeton and 
Groton must be Little Rocked: 

Aren’t you worried about the 
clear and present danger that 
the Southern die-hards-1 might 
really-make a: go of private -seg­
regated' schools? Suppose . Ark­
ansas decided, to refund-to each 
student his or her, per capital 
share of -school tax money to be 
used- .to go-:to the school of..his 

j.‘ac.iai i choice couldn’t; you make a
law of they land against that? 
Some pupils would -.choose, an in

Mrs A. E Campbell, Mrs it; r- 
t-ha Dean and Mr. and Mrs. -Billy, 
Campbell were' weekend visitors 
with Mrs: Gold a Mitchell in 
Grandfalls, Texas, While there, 
they did some; sightseeing ; over 
the country.

'Mr. and Mrs. Raymond Fis­
cher and -Mrs. Ida ..Gilmore of 
Abilene, spent last weekend with 
Mrs. Tone Caton.

Mr. and Mrs, Cullen Perry and 
family attended the Ice Capades 
in San Angelo, Saturday.

to little n.-■ b la week!

A  n  jewel, shock 
resistant watch 
with the executive 1 
look, lifetime un-
breakable main­
spring, with smart ;

,  f»ice tricliidtf T*tr .

>wy M e w .
Pay Next Year!

—AT-

Coleman, Texas

.DR.. PEBBLE -PURCELL .. | 
CHIROPRACTOR'-’ .

Phone S—1831 — 407 Liana St.i 
y COLEMAN, TEXAS
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, , ...................... and Puerto! g ra ted  school,: some a white
Rk.° everybody will be the same j a, Catholic, some a colored

—  , ..-.what a horrible-• uh-moderh-
S mess ' rrecdom
r-
Ĉ-
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Ifs easy . , .  just res’hic-’ yc-ur ore^enl t* list or
podtei wakh witli us. You don’t have to buy anything?!
The drawing will be Dee, 22 ..... and if your naive is 
drawn you will receive S50 in cash . , .  so stop in today

ft?£
- is*:

a nd register....... no obliffuiion ’ what ever
have to be present to win!

You do not
/V

r e f i © ! COLE hf AN 
TEXkS

• Some people who recognize 
that the,Supreme Court — not; 
the Constitution is the law of 
the land, say that integration is ' |! 
inevitable, we might as well a c -1 r 
cept it. Reactionaries say a peo­
ple integrated against their will 
is a people unintegrated still, j |f 
Abraham Lincoln said “To. s in 1' 
by silence when they. should 
protest, makes cowards of men.”

I But Abe lived -a long time go. be­
fore the Supreme Court Cham­
ber became a mixing mortar — 
which is a bowl in which the 
ingredients are broken, crushed, 
and ground together — with all jU 
deliberate speed; 1

,  —1Tom Anderson 
He in ini eii froi-i December 
1958 issue of Farm and Ranch 
aSaiur/ine. N:i',hvlilr-. Ti-na. :

....................................................

B:
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& §  C i B B S I i l A S
. .MEN.FAVOR (SIFTS LIKE THESE!

Here ore the gifts sure to win favor with your.favorite men! Shop 
our wide seleclioij of wearables that will score on Christmas.

It’s Our Business To Know What Men Like. So 
Wrhy Not Make It Your Business To Shop Here 
For His Gifts?

BEAUTIFUL GIFT WRAPPING FREE

t f k a | i J t o / T c a c e

tfc Clirfstmas—
Of course, you can’t just walk into a store and ask for a
package of peace, gift-wrapped. But you can buy Bonds, 
gift-wrapped, here at our bank. And they help pay for 
peace.- ■ - “• - - -7 ~ I . -T

Peace costs money- Money for industrial and miiitary- 
siri-ngth to kee)) ihe peace. Monev for science and edu­
cation to help make peace lasting. And money saved by 
individuals to help make- om economy strong.

Every U. S. Savin::.-.; Bond you give this Christmas will 
help strengthen America's Peace Power, Think it over. 
You couldn't give a boner gift!

» G I  F T  S «

★TOP COATS
■■̂ '★ SPORT' SHIRTS '-” ..... .

. ̂ ★ HQUSE.cSliQES: --
★ B O O T S  , ★ S H O E S

FLEECE LINED HOUSE SHOES

SWEATERS
LONG .SLEEVE...and ' ....

.... .'-....SHORT- .-SLEEVE-.. M M i
BUTTON-UP and

SLIP-OVER

M A M  S H O P
, - Cdleln̂ n, Texas

Gmt U / A  B o n 4

X
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wra-e in-:,1;; j.'c?' s-ho mmavaal 
dinner' of the ' Hoke-Ragsdale
wedding to the Fellowship Hall 

'of. the Presbyterian’ Church, on 
Tuesday, - Nevember 29, at 7.00 
p. rri>

The table was lovely with a 
centerpiece of orchid and yel­
low mums with smaller arrange­
ments on either end. The dinner
off chicken, salad, beans, sp’agh-. 
ettl, Tcakc and coffee was ser­
ved to thirty guests.

, Alaska' is out- largest outlying 
possession. It has an area of 
506,400 square miles.

4 -........ . " ■ • , ' • • • &

12-oz. Can f

$ L 0 9  I
( For Tour Dried | 
(Arrangements A udit 

Christmas Be- % ! 
-■corating,

SPARR-L/  
IRIDESCENT 

COLORS :• ■ . V  • ", ■ l ■ . r'

18-oz. Can ■

$ L 8 9

. The1 annual Christmas supper 
will .be-Saturday night, D ê. 13, 
at the Community Center;■■Every 
one come and bring someone 
with you. The time is, 7 o’clock,
; Betty Eppler and Anna Kay.
McClure are : members of the 
Mozeile High basketball (earn 
that won first place at the Ro­
chelle tournament and Charles 
Eppler is on the team that pla­
ced 2nd at Rochelle.,
- Mr. and Mrs. Raeford Evans 
and. children,, Jim, -jfpnot and 
Hal, of RlephenvilhY Mr. and 
Mrs. Floyd. Shelton' and* boys,
Mike and Randy, of 'Coleman 
and Mr. and Mrs. Khun, Jones 
and Kaiim spent Sunday with,
Mr. and Mrs Edgar Sheiton- 

Mr. and Mrs Jesse Wlllidm.s 
attended limeiai iKoH'-ibes in.
Coleman .Sunday for Mr. Knl 
lock. - ; r j

Chiystine and' Carolyn Car­
penter, Sandra Fowler, and 
Glemi Gilbreath, members of 
the Santa Anna 'iHigkj School 
Band, went to Winters Saturday 
lor a marching contest.'', The 
band placed ’ 1st on inspect ion''} lyhv ■arjcJ1--Mr;

i'dcovl»y i j.vix . ixciruutU isUU mlx-
gery for. hone--. tumor at Harris 
Memorial Hospital' , in ' .-Fort 
Worth - . T i  .■ ' 1 

Mr, fames- Laramore of Abi­
lene visitedywitli the Audrey Bp-
pler family Saturday night and’ 
Sunday . ■ . •••'*• .

Mrs. Uru Dillingham and Mrs. 
.Mattie Dalton spent .Wednesday 
with Mr. ancl Mrs. Dan Wheat? 
ley. -r * ~ ,
—Mrs, W. F, Maeheirspeut Mon­

day higlRi with' Ml'Sr-K.( H. .Tones, 
Mfs, Burgess Stewardson, and 

(daughter, Kim, returned" ibmie 
'Friday after a visit \if .several 
v eeks with her paient.s, Mr ami 
Mrs Kilts o f H.in'Haba. /  y ~ 

Visitors with Mr and'Mrs A; 
P ('arrolhdurini,,''tl)e weM;1 were 
Mr and Mrs I.mmie Carroll of 
Temfi-isee t ( 'Olony. -iVg. Roddy. 
Hobson of Ahili'be ancrtlubr .yi’uj 
and) wile; i lr v and Mrs Jack 
Carroll ol Fort Worth.., *

CflARUiS MeOUiLLAN 
M1AIE5KR OF ROTI1 SORORrj’ i; 

Charles L. McClellan,-*on of
' ' so Ue-Ater

THE
BEAUTY...
THE-
ROMANCE..
THE
VALUE,..
OF . 
OWWiNS

IS

fgBHM
■ ‘ ' MRS.” HAL-RAGSDALE;
In the First Presbyterian derson and 

Church, at 5:00 p. m., Wednes- hauser.
Mrs. David Kart-

Da. vid Karthauser. served as 
best man, groomsmen were Bob

GLITTER
. In-12 Colors

Glitter Glue
In'vThe Spray.Can

day, Nov. 26, Miss Sharon Hoke, 
daughter of Mrs. W. F, Hoke and

| the late Mr. Hoke, Santa Anna, j Henderson and Doyne Mclver.
| exchanged vows with Hal Rags-1 xhe bridei „lven ln marriage 
dale, son of Mrs. A. C. Ragsdale t by ner uncle, T. J. McCaughan, 

| and the late Mr. Ragsdale, of i wore a lovely1 gown of white taf- 
1 San Angelo. feta designed with jeweled Alen-

The Reverend Ben H, Moore,; con lace adorning the scooped 
pastor, read the double ring . neckline and -long sleeves taper-?

i MeCf’iure -1 
rj, Walter jJ 
nan, Mrs j 
trs. E S. j I

■ Coleman ■

ceremony before an altar flank- 
si ed on either side with -white 
I  mums and candelabra. Candles 
S were lighted by Barrett Mark- 
H land and Pamela Garrett; They 
g wore dresses . of taffeta with 

matching headdress that; were 
g identical in design and color to 
| the bride’s attendants. Ushers 
g were Bob Markland and Charles 
gj j Walker. - ■ -

Traditional wedding marches, 
were played by Mrs. Virgil Prid- 
dy, who accompanied: Mrs. -Billy 
Joe Robinett as she sang, “For 
You Alone” , “Entreat Me Not 
To Leave Thee” , and the (‘Wed-’ 
ding Prayer”.

Attending the bride as maid 
of honor was Miss Wanda Cook 
of Abilene. The bridesmaids 
were her cousins, Mrs. Bob Hen-

• f t .  .- -'iS

ed to points over the wrists. The 
voluminous -harem .skirt was 
caught to a wide band which ex­
tended into a small sweep train. 
Her veil ot French illusion was 
caught to a : pointed pill box 
trimmed with tulle, pearls and 
iridescent sequins. She carried- 
a white Bible topped with gar­
denias'. The Bible was a gift at 
her -birth. Her only jewelry was 
pearl ear-screws; a gift of the 
bridegroom. The traditional 
something old. something new, 
something borrowed and some­
thing blue was carried out. -

Elizabeth Henderson, flower 
girl and cousin of the bride, 
wore an identical dress, to the 
maid of honor. It was fashioned 
of aqua .taffeta- and had a 
matching headdress.

The bride’s attendants wore 
aqua and turquoise taffeta 
dresses, respectively, that were 
fashioned along ; princess - lines 
with full bubble skirts. Their 
headdresses were of matching 
tafieta, and they carried white 
button chrysanthemums that

%  Buy A Mew Gas Or Electric Range-  
And Get A Turkey For Christmasmmm

f tmmmm*mmmm
§
m

-F R E E ! n
'g&

WE HAVE ' f

ENTERPRISE -  .ESTATE, |
MAGIC CHEF and FRIGIDAIRE 8w

RANGES IN STOCK WWmm
m m »  m ■m m m m »  w  m

Wm 1 § w i  Payment
FIRST PAYMENT WILL BE 

DUE IN FEBRUARY

F u l l  S i z e  R a n g e
; PRICED AS LOW AS.

$ 1 2 4 . 5 0
Small Monthly Payments

jM .ja I . 
M *

•* -•» *

j « i  f i

i l l  111 1P ft 1 i

@ Clean and Safe 

© Best For Heating 

®  Higher BTU Rating 

@  Best For Cooking

©  Approved By .
- Architects - - -

-#■ No Muss . . . .

®  No Fuss -

Prompt Delivery 
PHONE 3371

m  i

and 2nd on marching 
Mrs. Tom Stewardson,/ is in- 

Houston -with her d,autrht.er anti 
family- of Odessa. Their little 
son is receiving .further treat- 1 Texias 
ment .at Childrens tliime. - I 

Mr. and. Mrs. Clinton MeX/lure '
and family,-Mr. and Mnr,.......
Newman. Lewis Newman,
Hollis Watson and\, Mrs.
Jones -attended tlie '50tlH wed­
ding anniversary uof Mr. knd 
Mrs; Wamon McClure a f Santa 
Anna Sunday afternoon. ,

Mrs. G. R. McClure. Torpipfiy 
of our community, is-; a., patient j 
in Santa Anna Hospital.-. ■■ I 

Tommy Stewardson, 'rLaiTV I 
Fowler and John / Dillingham ’
■were on the-Santa Anna! Junior.!- 
High . basketball team , .that 
participated in the Burkett 
tournament the past v.eeken’d 
Carolyn Carpenter is on /the 
girls Junior High.-team. The 
girls team won -the 'consolation 
trophy. Tommy Stewardson won 
a gold basketball as out,standing 
player, Leta Faye McClure is on 
the Mozeile High team and also 
went ter Burkett. - y -

Mr. and ■ Mrs. Tom ■ Newman

were shaped m the form of a 
basket. • •

The bride's mother wore a 
printed jersey dress with tur­
quoise accessories. Tije, groom’s 
mother wore a brown -jewel- 
trimmed suit with aqua acces­
sories. Both mothers-wore, white 
corsages. ’ . '

Immediately following the 
ceremony, a reception was held 
in the home of the bride’s 
grandparents, - Mr. and Mrs. J. 
L. McCaughan. Those in the 
house party were ■ Mrs. Lewis 
Guthrie - and Misses Patricia 
Davis and Carol McClellan.

When the couple leit for - a 
wedding trip ‘ o Ban Francisco 
California. Mrs Rae aialt v as 
wearing a suit ei Mango wo A 
with • small fu-r collar and 
matching feather hai. Her at- 
eessories were of brown suede.

The bride is a graduale <>i 
Santa Anna High School and 
attended MeMurry College, 
where she was a mu mber of the 
College Band, ■ ; •

Mr. Ragsdale is a graduate of 
San Angelo High School and the 
University of Texas: Ho is now 
employed in : the Engineering 
Department of 'Gbanee-Voueht. 
Aircraft, Inc;, of Dallas.

The couple will-reside at 411 
Yates Street, Arlington, Texas 

Out of town guests were Mr 
and Mrs. H. A. Smith. Renders. 
son, Texas; Mr W M Jwksun 
San Angelo. Mr.- Jell Mo me 
and children,' and Mrs W 11 
McCaughan of San Antonio 
Mrs. Bartow Boylston and child­
ren .of Aiken, South Carolina, 
Mrs. Allen Pierce of Austin; and 
Mrs. Billy Joe Robinett of Bra­
dy.

McClellan,
is one of 28 new,members of the 
Soabbar^ and blacky honorary 
iniUnuy organization doi; ROTC 
officers yai jiie U r iiv e rs ify o f

^ — -A------ - A

OPTOMETRIST
I>r. H. -‘Tltnn/hg,; Jrr

Cqir
tbial

V llT  y. 
m iner/ 

iaj- k v f .
Coleman. 
(. Texas ?. 

Phonei 
8944/

- \pFFTCE HOURS'; V  
8:00 A, Mi to 5:b0 M. I • 
*- SATURDAYS, A- to 2

m  .......................................■> •;
-*5' , s-n $

- > IS ONLY 11 ' -
•SHOPPING DAYS AWAY

~iziZtSJ,Z>+kz,C'-£*£t&ZtZK<l

Do Something’ About This 
Shoo Tomorrow At

A n d
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A.
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11(1 Commercial Coleman

ir ■
Soft untireakablc dolls 
at- onlv

ik
Soft unbrea 1> -ible dolls 
with rooted hair and 
sleeps eves at

83.9 •
■ _ ★

A new shipment of ador­
able Christmas dresses 
for the habe have been 
reeei) e-fi. See ilu-'-e in 
velveteen or cotton —  in 
red or pink. Priced from

$ 3 .9 8  ■
★

ik
If a white sweater has 
been mentioned —  be 
Santa s helper and see 
those of banlon or orlon, 
priced at

S5.98 up
Sizes 3 to. 14

★

/SC
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we lone o gift 
will speed your

For your eoir eoiesuT
sugestion tu.ble (hat

precious shbpping mi mites. 
Items Priced From W  I p
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Our Appreciation U B

We want to express our appreciation tef the large 
number of you who visited our new store during our 
opening last week. Your expressions and words of en­
couragement mean much to us.

We invite each of you to come to see its often. We 
promise to do our best to have the quality merchandise 
you want More iiew merchandise continues to arrive 
daily. ' (

-OPENING S P E C IA L S -
• We still have a few of our opening specials. We will 
continue the same prices for the next few days.

i frg an ra
, - a -A i

■p D r y  G o o d s
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Santa Anna Mews
ESTABLISHED 1888
JOHN C. OJtBOO'

. :,?jr and Business Manager
• - HUSHED EVERY FRIDAY 
ii- naNTA ANNA,' COLEMAN 

f C0UN1Y, TEXAS
Y eCEMBFR 12, 1958

's i iS re iw rr iO N  r a S s  
■ IN COLEMAN COUNT!

i Tear .. ........................... 31-SO
• '■> .Months ........................... fit.li!)
( OUTSIDE COLEMAN ' COUNTS
V  Year In Texas ................  32.00
1 Months In Texas...............$1.28
l Year outside Texas.........$2.60

. I Months outside Texas' ., $1.60 

. ! Year outside U. 6. A.\....• $9.00
- The Publisher Is not reaponal-
olp for copy omissions, typo­
graphical errors that may occur 
further than to correct it in the 
next Issue. All advertising orders
,u- accented on this basis only.
rSec’ond ('lass postage paid at 

Santa Anna, Texas. v v \

vveeWy

- 7  ^  / *
WANTED: A eood reliable man 

to supply , customers with 
Rawl.’igh Products in Calla­
han County. See J. E. Boulden. 
1713 Second, Brownwood. or 
write Ravieieh's. Dept. TXL- 
1252-127, Memphis, Term./

, 49-50p.

; f

FOR SALE (til RENT:' Two tea­
room - house in -San -Angelo.. 
Would consider some trade,

. -Contact John Gregg lor in­
formation. - -■ ■ 43-45e

......•v, Ci■: tf&.At. t - - • W'. • V •
.FOR vSALE: Farm Property to

veterans who have - received 
’ your approval from Veterans 
Land1 Board:. M. L. . (Rat) 
Guthrie — • : 45ttc

LEGAL NOTICES
.-Citation iBy Publication-' •- 

THE STATE OF TEXAS ■
TO: Wilmer Bays, .Raymond 

Bays, Illene -Waggoner, and hus­
band Wayne Waggoner,. Defen-: 
dants, Greeting: .

YOU ARE HEREBY- COM-

&ncome. T i X  FAX
Questions.ahd Answers About -Your.'Individual-' 
Income Tax Report for. 1958, as Presented 

.--By The Texas-Press'Association. -■

MAWDED to appear before the another,:

Medical expenses present
great opportunities for switch­
ing .expense from one year to

Honorable 35t,h District Court of
Coleman County , at the Court­
house thereof, In Coleman, Tex­
as, by filing a written answer/ 
at or bgfore 10 o'clock A M. of 
the first. Monday next after the 
expiration of forty-two days 
from the date of the issuance of 
this citation, same being the 
12th day of January A. ,1). 1959 
to plaintiff’s Petition Tiled in 
said court, .on the ,1 1 th day ol 
Sept, A I). 1958, in this cause, 
numbered 82T3-A on .the docket 
ot said court and styled Lednani 
S. Johnson and-John M. John­
son, Plaintiffs, vs. Clyde V. Bays 
Wilmer Bays, Raymond Bay,1. 
Rodney L. Byars, Illene .-Waggo­
ner and husband Waynis Waggo­
ner. Defendants,

A'Tfrief statement o{ (he u.at 
lire ui this syi! is as follows, to 
vMt: Piaintii'is' sue.; for parti­
tion,-:,.if 45[2 .lereo o; land more-e- 
less a park- of Jam.>.--(,(■». Bulk- 
Mur. 2D An,-: ■ 31, 1 situato/l r 
Colt man Cou.ity Tix./s, and 
being same ’ -rifi desy libed by 
mules amd bounds in ’deed to J 
V,. John-on <;T recoiai nr Vol 205 
pace 129 dt\d r- cords of Cole-, 
man Coilifty, P  si;:,, 'Plamtifi., 
ullepe i ha i Plaint if is' and defen­
dant ? heron', allow* named own 
all oi ,-airi land,: and prays for 
partition of said laud invmh, r 
with p.-r.v.nal pn 'pc 'fy  owned by 
-mai pailn*- i m>no lullv 
shown by PlamtifiV Pe'ilion on 
file in Uns suit b

• If this eiiatioV. h  noi served 
within m n .iy  days alter the 
date of its issuance, u shall be 
returned unserved.

The officer executing this writ 
shall promptly serve the same 
according to mpiiremt nla of 
law, and-tiie- mandates hereof, 
and make due return, as the law 
directs. -

Issued and Vivens.under my 
hand and the seal of said court 
at Coleman. Texas;,'this 24th day 
of Nov. A. If. 1958

Attest: G: A.
District • Court
Coleman County, Texas. 

(SEAL) : 48-5'lc

Medical expenses are deducti­
ble to the extent,they exced 3% 
of your adjusted' gross 'income. 
But you are- allowed : not more 
than $2,500 per personat ex­
emption and not more than 
$5,000 oh a separate return, on 
more than $10,000 on ajoint, or 
head of household return, , 

Exemptions for old age.,and

Suppose ypu . have paid medi­
cal ■ expense; of over 3% of your 
adjusted gross income: and will 
have a deduction and yon still 
owe medical bills which you 
plan to pay in 1959. If you pay. 
Uhi.sc bills before the end of the 
year They will' be ta deduction 
this year. You won't have, to rise 
them to make up 3% of your ad­
justed gross Income for 1959 be­
fore you can start; deducting 
again. If you do not have funds 
readily available it -might be

blindness do not count... If you , wise to borrow the money, 
or your spouse are over 05 years Let’s sec l)ow that would 
old the 3*7 provision does nof work. Suppose you borrow $1,009 
apply to you. . from a bank and repay in twelve

Now suppose, that you have . monthly installment’s. Your cosjt 
large unpaid medical expenses; for such a loan would be about 
this year and will have even I $70. Now suppose 'you take this 
more .in 1959. -Do not pay aiiy o f $1,000 and pay deductible bills 
these this year. Wait until 1959 with it. If-,you are paying taxes 
and pay them all in that year. 1 at the lowfest rate, you will save 
this way you will .have the ad~;i $200.. . ’Your net profit on the 
vantage Of the full deduction in- > transaction .will- .be ''about. $130,
tead of losing 3C of your in- 

1'iuiii' this year as well as 3fT of , 
ndr income for 1959.

'■ This works the other way tpo

JL-

NIWOT NEWS
AY THE NlWOfT KIDfjJ-

Remeaiber too, that any in- will become u deduction neat 
terest paid on borrowed money year. '

m,m-
&
€as •

1  * - A: '  SEE US FOE
|| C. L. Green & Gerald Fortified Feeds || 

For Livestock and Poultry |f‘
g  PLENTY OF GOOD RANGE CUBESf'S

f  C am m ack G ra in  S to re  §
§?5 ■ Telephone 18 '* -

QUESTIONS AND’ ANSWERS 
Q. I,, have had multiple scle

■ Mr. and. Mrs, Wells;5and 
. Wanda were -dinner- guests of.
Mr.) -and - Mrs., Cecil - Ellis - arid j

-.children - Sunday/ ...... - -a
Mr.; and Mrs. Buddy Benge!

, npd son--were dinner guests of i £%. 
Mb and Mrs. -Bruce Hibbetts ,on j 
Sunday. .,; - :■ ■ i j.’jw
■ Mr. anti MrSi.Gecil Ellis and f ggv 

family-visited Mr.-andfMrs. Eh 
Ellis Saturday night.

...........................I
andj-iS;

monthly ! children visited 'Friday night;

M-
Miss Dixie Jo ’’Baughr was,. in-f C f

Wjnters'Saturday with the band, 
rosis for- the past five years and 1 Mrs. Dorothy.: Wallace
have been*, receiving monthly! children visited 
social security checks since- July1'! with Mr.-and- Mrs. Buddy Benge

Fm  C o l o r
C l t r i s t m f f l s  T r e e s  1

Can Be Used On Old Toys And Many, M
Many Other Items Too Numerous To *ggi 
Mention. • ■ W

I t  J u s t  S p m y s  O n  1
REMEMBER: Our Building Materials, g  
And Supplies — And Glass Cut To Any (If 
Size. ■
THANK YOU AGAIN FOR YOUR 1  

BUSINESS' ‘ |

B a i l e y  L n n i i3e r C o . |
R. L. (Bob) Garrett, Mgr, . ||

Hon-ley Clerk,

The / famous ' liberty' ,bell was | 
cracked W hile' tolling t for.’ • the-' 

. , 1n.„  T„_ i death of John Marshall.‘Chief
i-i Y  A 1 Justice of the United States, whoSlicker. I, A. Welch Garage. (|ied ifi m 5

DON'T WAIT! Don't Delay Get

39-41-43-450
FOE SALIi: -5 room-house. Billy.
■ Joe Scott, . . 49e50p;
BARGAINS G A L O R E : TV'1 tor 

sale i , ; :.:. 519 95 and up. 9'J- 
day t.ai lanty: Sink ensem­
bles, $39.95; Wall and Water 
heaters: Apartment: stoves.
Bathroom fixtures, - Quality 
-and low priced Government 
specification outside white j

o paint, motors,- plastic pipe;! 
Best - prices anywhere. You 
heed it — We got it! Reg’s j 

.Trading Post, 108 East- Live i 
Oak, Coleman. ' 45tfc |

WANTED: Pasturing for sheep.
- Would take field or grass. Gall 

L. L. Gwothmey, Brownwood, 
Texas. Phone Milton 30883.

. . ■•.•■■■: 49- 50p.

FOR SALE: 1948 Ford If 7-Ton 
truck:: one tandem stock

■' trailer; and a 1948 Ford Trac­
tor. See at Ray Owen Gulf 
Station. 48-.49c.

FOR KALl'h: 4 room house with
bath, to be moved. Newly re­
decorated with inlaid linole­
um. See Raynoid P.use 39tfe

FOR SALE: 1.009 1959 Motor Tn- 
spi’Ction stickers. You may act 
yours now, L. A. Welch Garage 

39-41-43- 45c
EASY -Ti;i£3IS cm , Goodyear 

Passejrger, Truck and Farm 
■Tires, Goodyear Batteries, G. 
K. Appliances. Goodyear Ser­
vice Store; Coleman, Texas. 
Wayne Gage, Manager. 20tfc

NOW WRECKING: Several large 
buildings — excellent building 
materials including dimension 
lumber, sheathing, decking, 
flooring, window:,. and door 
units, pipe and plumbing fix­
tures. Also 28 foot trusses and 
overhead doors. Real Bargain 
Opportunity. C. W. Barbee & 
Son, P.p.W. Camp, Brady, Tex.

12tfc

10.000 SQ. .T .  FLOOR SPACE
FILLED WITH

DR. A. 7?. FISCHER 
CHIROPRACTOR

Phone 2421—815 : Commercial I 
Coleman,. Texas' '

ra re rm%:-4
FOUND*. One friend of the

Lonely Hearts Club, P. G. Box 
397, Santa Anna, Texas. You 
all come. Fraternally yours, F. 
B. McPeak, 309 N. Navy Bivd., 
Warrington, Fla. 49c.

a  /. - ■' TO REUEVE ' . -'

S o r e  t h r o a t
Duo io a cold, iry DURHAM’ S 
ANATHESIA-MOP and see how pteasant 
and efTeciiy© a mop can be. Generous 
bott!a iwlfh applicators only 75c at .y.ouf-. 
Druggist..

PHILLIPS DRUG CO.

AYeah McCulloch, See.-'Press/ 
Settle McCulloch,- Mgr;

Standard 
' Absi.-.Tlt’n.

Pity & -Cbanty Naps for  -Sale 
405 Bank"Bldg.. - Gdlemaa

B O B I R S

Telephone - Red 59

1957... Does the new law .provide i : Mr. and -Mrs. John /  Haynes: 
any benefits for my iwife. and 12 band* Mr. and Mrs. W. .0, McGor- | ^  
year old son? * ■ , j mick visited with. Mr. and. Mrs-.

‘ A. .Yes. Monthly payments i Earl Ellis Friday night. . - rv5-
beginning, with September 1958 : Mrs.-John Perry visited Sat-; ^
can .go to a disabled .worker’s.1 urday afternoon w ith ’Mr. and! 
child, who is under 18 as well as i Mrs. Robert Perry.
to the disabled worker’s wife if j Mr.- and Mrs. Silas Wagner, ... ___________ -.k. ..-. ■.v.
s,he has the child in her-care. . I returned to Dallas Friday after. i
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Electrical Motor 
And Refrigeration 

S E R V I C E

R f •1 C-fCR m s  a ' f :
w - 7-?r-v;rsrj nnA Rewind Fic" 
* ;-..t h :i.vr "'i "j

Fine Furniture - Appliances 
Floor Coverings -  Gifts

A lew Specials im  Char&stmas Buying

a
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LANE

Cedar Chests
Regular Value

ONLY $49.50 ■ftft

PLATFORM

Kefj:iSlar $^6.50 Value

■ ONLY-$13J$

Hoover Sweeper
WITH 'TOOLS
Regular $8ft.50 Value

ONLY $ 4 |  J |

I  1
B ' "

* i . .i:. . - . j ; , : x . ,-a. A s.r.y-,'
:-s««t.stc*g«g«tgsswts«sw>es«K

m
m

«
m
m
«
«

I

Thinking About Giving Her A Bedroom Suite? 
HERE" IS A “SHORT TIME SPECIAL!’ - -

Purchase Any Bedroom Suite From Our Complete 
Selection. For Only $1.00 Additional We Will Give You 
A $50.00 9x12 Rug Cushioned With Foam Rubber.

* » » » » » » » » »

! AUTOMATIC POP-UP <

T o a s t e r s "
Regular $19.95. Value. • *:

mu HiJi
I  WE M M  HAVING 100 VISIT WITH U i C0IE I  A D  LOOK A- g  
* ROUND. YOU MIGHT F fD  JUST'WHAT YOU ARE LOOKING FOR. '•*

«m
m
mmm

Terms If Needed - Liberal Discount For Cash!
. WE GIFT, W R A P — AND. DELIVER . ■

■ • • from  $im  - ' '
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Mrs. Jack Cooper, Mrs, Heury
Smith and Mrs. Aubrey Mc­
Swane were hostesses lor the H.
n. Club jiH rt oulU-Urg Club 
OhilsLxmi? pasty at the Rock- 
wooci Community Center Wed­
nesday .afternoon, nee. 3. Mrs. 
Bill Btyeu diitciou rccrcaUott.

Chririm.'m mollf v;?.; used and 
gilts were exchanged from a 
Christmas tree supplied and de~ 

/ corated by.Mrs. Jim Rutherford.
Refreshment,-, of chicken sal- 

.ad, crackers, cookies, mints, cof­
fee and cocoa were served to 
Mrs, Drury Fates, Mrs. J. T. Â  
van tv, Mrs. S. T. Heilman, Mrs. 
Tom ’Bryan, Mrs. Roy Blackwell, 
Mrs. F. E, McCreary, Mrs. Jack 
Cooper, Mrs. Henry Smith, Mrs. 
Aubrey McSwane, Mrs. John 
Hunter; Mrs. Ray Caldwell, Mrs. 

’ Kate McUvain, Mrs; Hilton Wise, 
'■■■■••Mrs. Bill Bryan,. Mrs, - Jake- Mc­

Creary and girls, Mrs. Claud 
Box and Mrs. Sam Bates of 
Sweetwater.'

CRUTCHERS HOST 
CHRISTMAS PARTY

: Mrs. A.- L, Crutcher and Ludy
Jane were hostesses for the 
WSCS party at. the Roclcwood

ARTISTIC

Authorized Manufacturer Of 
Harm Guild Granite 

Georgia Granite 
Winnsboro Granite 

.. And Marble Memorials' -

-. SEE

L. M. Robertson
Plume 8373 — Coleman 

•; REPRESENTATIVE f o r

Coleman Monument 
Works

■ W-. A . Finlay. Owner . 
ioOi East 9th St. 
Coleman, Texas

, 1 C • -r m y
:-j.v.’"-r 0 - -  . -.I’d.- ■ n i)
cuurge ui «>dmj . gurnet, iiie 
group sang Christmas hymns 
and Mrs'. Jade Bostick offered a
prayer.

Gifts were exchanged from 
the 'decorated Christmas tree, 
that - was used at the other 
community parties.

Refreshments of cake squares, 
mints, coffee, cocoa and punch 
were served to- Mines. E. C. 
Simon, J. C. Ferguson, !>ury 
Estes, Lee Miller, Jack Bostick, 
jLeffel Estes, John Hunter, J. T. 
Avdnts, J. A. Hunter, Toni Bry­
an, Sherman tollman, Fox 
Johnson, Lee* McMillan, - Kate 
Mcllvain, Goldie Milberger, F. E. 
McCreary, Aubrey McSwane, 
Evan Wide, ’M, D. Bryan, Jake 
McCreary and Sharon, J. W. 
Tickner, The Rev. J. W. Tlckner, 
and. the: ■hostesses.'-

Wamon McClure's 
Observe Golden • 
Wedding- Sunday
; Mr. and Mrs. .Wamon McClure 
Observed their .Golden Wedding 
anniversary in their home Sun­
day with art open house. In the 
receiving line with .Mr. and Mrs. 
McClure, were their .daughters. 
Mrs. J esse Upchurch, Mrs. Noble 
Carpenter and Mrs., Marvin 
Rouse. -
. The home was decorated with

>1 :\v < i 1 ■. ■■ ■ . ■ 1
n,_ ■.»!..■ •• ■ ■ ■ >■ "|.-

ria Owen,
..d . ■■ ;V "■’-.■i-i r  ■ ;,J

took a  Thanksgiving basket to 
a needy family.

Anothf.’ meeting was held ri  
the Church on Dec. 3. After tin 
opening and business meeting, 
a program, “.And Yet Abidteh.. - 
Hope” wsis presented. The same 
program was presented a second 
time at the Rrayer Meeting that 
night, ' ’ ’ ■

The v  \y. A. monthly meet­
ing was held in the home of 
Kota lug on Monday, Dec. i, 
with ftonja Dium presiding. The 
Christman Party, to be held Pec.
17, was discussed. The party 
will be held in the home of Mrs. 
James Mallow at 8:00 p. m. A 
discussion was also held con­
cerning a white Bible ceremony 
for Mary Ann Wardlow on Doc. 
loth. ,.■■■:■

Plans were made to make 
tray cards for the Coleman Hos­
pital, and to go caroling in San­
ta Anna. Refreshments were 
served. ■

Following the meeting, the 
group went to see Rev. Smith 
about the fellowship following 
Friday night basketball games. - gj 
The fellowship named “Funspi- - § 
ration” . The first one will be; 
held in..the annex of the First <S 
Baptist Church: immediately: 
following the Friday night I? 
games. Entertainment will be - || 
furnished, by students of How- y

SPECIALS FOB,FRIDAY AND SATURDAY

SUGAR Imperial u n d o n e * 10 lbs. ~~ 
COFFEE Falgers laslanl 6 - o z . Jar § 9 C 
CAKE MIXES /ill Mr M«rs 8  for ;

MRS,
VVINSTC N SApple Butter 

Orange Juice Tn,s(iP'A ft-8": 
KLEENEX M W K t

1. ff-M. Jar 2 9 c

] yellow mums. The refreshment . ^ X b e  U S S t
| table was laid in lace with an mems WU1 be SL1%ed~________
, underlay of gold. ■ n  , A,
! Mrs. Vernon Bartlett greeted ; W . A .  W aiH pu G ll S 
■guests at the-door. Granddaugh--OhsPFVP f in lfJ p n  ■ ■'
ters, Chrystene Carpenter served ’ 7 i • -.t “
the beautiful three-tiered cake;-: W £?utllH.lv -JNOV, bO til 

i Mrs, Wamon Upchurch laddled; Mr, and Mrs. W: A. Campbell 
t punch; and -Carolyn Uarpenter : of Floydada were honored Sun-j | 
;and Anna Kay.McClure presided ; day afternoon, Nov. 30 with an| If 
. at; the register. Mrs.. H. C. Me- ; -open house celebration of their j S 
| Clure and Mrs,-Glenn McClure : Golden Wedding Anniversary, - is  
; werealso in the- house party. .. :  The couple’s three children, |
j Eighty-six guests from Sweet- i Mrs. ^Turner Hunter, McCoy Sf 
i-water-; Crane, San. Angelo, Gra-- community, David, who operates If 
ham,-;.. Rochelle, ■ Stephenville, | the Floydada farm, and Maurice ■'¥ 
Coleman and Santa Anna at- i of Dimmitt, were with their j || 
tended, ' /parents in the receiving line, s-If
, _ _ _ —,— ------ ——— ! Miss Barbara - Hunter/- at-tf

■YWA of First Baptist | granddaughter, presided at the 
M  t '  ' R  *t ' ! guest’s book, where 132 friends

APPLES
3 LB. CAN
SNOWDRIFT

DELICIOUS'
LARfe’E 5f£E Hi

L
. , . M JEWKL
7l¥ I I^FR^tAKI-)'

. OUR VALUE ■--. 303 CANS
I.GREEN BEANS
&
K
i?

2 Tor 27c
SUN SPUN ' , a
ENGtJfSH PEA'S

■
7] I N l J 9 b

2  lf> r /?7 c ,
SUPREME ‘
CRACKERS ' l b .  2 7 c

AI’STEX”  , "• ’
CHILI- \V 2 lb .  C m i  {A c

KRAFT
CARAMELS • ' ■ lb .  35c i

■ BURKETT ' . -
PECANS C i ! ) . U e

BEEF
ARM ROAST

!
l b .  5 3 c i

BEEF •- .
’SE '̂EN STEAK lb . - :3 c

F R Y E R S  lleail-l-Twas ■ llradc " i "  lb .

On -Nov. 26, the Y. W. A. met 
a t, the First Baptist Church 
with the president, Edna Lewis, 
presiding. After the regular 
opening, the business meeting 
was held. A discussion was held 
on the goal of $25 to be contrib­
uted t o . the Lottie Moon offer­
ing. „ i

Ruth Radle introduced the 
program, “Tributes of Praise on 
Stewardship.” . - After singing 
“Praise Him, Praise Him”, other/

H O S C H  G R O C E R Yand, relatives- registered-between 
2 and 5 o’clock.

The serving table, laid with 
lace over gold held a center, ar­
rangement of bronze chrysan­
themums, and a three-tiered 
cake bearing the letters “50” in. 
gold. Gold punch was served! , '. ...
from crystal appointments. i merly made their home m Mot- nmghoonng communities The, 

Mrs. Tom Poyter, Mrs.. R: O. - ley county, having lived in t h e  ere mariied No\. ?8,. 1908.
Rainey of Lubbock, and Mrs, ; Darden Canyon community, and j ' bon.; y '0'-

later in the Roaring Springs . J89:1. is the formei Lam a Scott. 
' Both -were-born in Cole-1 Mr...Campbell was born on June

| PHONE 56
gmM&M

Star,Melvin /Thacker of Lone 
presided at. the service,

Mr. and Mrs. Campbell for-

Ji;

area.
man County and grew’ up in i21 in 1890.

Former Coleman 
Resident Dies .

Funeral services for Mrs Mil­
lie Mae Hornsby, 71, of 320 N. 
Riverside Dr.. Fort Worth, Tex.,

Natural Gas
The Modern Fuel For

® COOKING
• REFRIGERATION 
® WATER HEATING
• HOUSE HEATING

©AIR CONDITIONING
• CLOTHES DRYING 
® INCINERATION'
• INDUSTRY

In 1945 the Campbells bouaht-.-wtre held in Lucas Chanel, Sat- 
i a farm five miles northwest: o! urday. at 2:00 p. rn . with burial 
| Floydada and have made their ;m Mount Olivet . 
residence there since that time J Survivors include tier hus- 

[Besides ■ their three children, band. E. L. Hornsby; six dauah- 
j Mr..-and'Mrs. Campbell have one : ters. Mines. Hollie Slane of Fort 
I granddaughter.. Miss Barbara - Worth; Lewis- Bryan of Rock-
■ Hunter, and -five grandsons,! wood: Herbert Taylor of Nash-
■ Larry Hunter. Gary. Gregg and ville. Term..; Eula Hardy of Bay- 
Gale Campbell, children of Dev- town. Melvin .Snider of Cole-

Yes, It's True
O N L Y  G A S

DOES SO MUCH MORE... 
FOR SO MUCH LESS!

Ga,s service is both reliable and automatic. Always responds silently, ef­
ficiently, accurately to all thermostatic settings on any modern GAS 
appliance. And GAS is economical! Gives you more for less than any other
MODERN, automatic appliance you can buy and operate today!

A  trained service representative is available at all times for burner tip
adjustments at no cost to you.

id, and Ken Campbell, son of 
Maurice.

Mrs. Campbi - brother and 
his wife, Mr a: d Mr.-. Steve W 
'Scott of San A mrlo. Mr Camp­
bell’s sister anti husband; Mr 
and Mrs. W i Wallace of 
Grants..- N. Hex., and. Mrs... 
CampbellV only uncle and his 
wife, Mr. and Mrs George Scot: 
of - Sayre, Okla., were among 
the guests; -

man. and Om el Puckett of 
Inin, five sons. Puitl and Leon­
ard of Fort .Worth. Mark o f 
Many. La . Ed Houston: and 
John-with, the Air Force in Cal- 
uornia; two ..sisters and two

Parent-Teacher Assn. 
Retralar Meeting

:Th P. T, A. met December 3rd- 
at 2:30 p. m in.the Ward School 
eafetonnm. Visitors and mem­
bers were served eoftee and te.-. 
as they entered.

Rev. Maurice Smith of the- 
First Baptist Church opened the 
meeting with a prayer. Mrs.: 
Martin’s choral group sane 
Christmas Carols. Mrs B A 

j Parker introduced the speaker, 
Rev. Maurice Smith, who gave 
a very interesting talk on 
“Spiritual. Culture and Social 
Values of Today.:’’
’ ’During ’ the~business meeting 

1 a letter was read from Mrs.
1 John Hensley resigning as pres- 
j ident. It was with deep regret 
i her-resignation -was accepted.
I Mrs. Odem’s room won the 
' room count. ' Mm Harris an­
nounced the 'school would be: 
dismissed Dec. 19th for the! 
Christmas Holiday’s. . ■ i

W A T C H !

W \

R E P A I R '
| Prompt Hurt ice,
| Fensihle

What o'. 11' ait- >o>ir watch 
we'II repair i: with expert 
]nveir.ien : have yeiir watch 
ready whim promised.
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Serving Coleman and Santa Anna
With Dependable Gas Service For Homes-. Businesses and Industrial Plants

, ★  ★  ★

You are invited to visit your gras appliance dealer and 
see the modern, economical gas ranges, and hot water 
heaters. You are especially invited to .see the new com- 
,Mnation. automatic washer-dryer. Your dealer or a 
representative of the gas company, will be glad to ;show 
' 'gu the various models and help you to decide on one 

home. - ~ • - ' -- - 7 V r «  . .  f  AC
' V. . ★  ' * '  it* tjtJ y k s

J. T. Oakes spent the weekend 
in Robert Lee with his daugh­
ter. Mrs. Otto Wojtek and Mr. 
Wojtek. . :

('OLFUA'DS BEST 
WATCH REPAIR  

SERVICE

Coleman Texas

§EE US FOR EXPERT W ELDING OF ALL KINDSt

■ - E. A. BEMSMAM ■
BLASKSMITIUNG & WELDING
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Cities To See

Helena-̂ Queen of the Mountains
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Cleveland News
Of.MBS, MANI.ET f  BLANTOW

Miss Patsy Cupps spent Wed­
nesday night in Santa Anna 
with Janice Scarbrough,
, Mrs. Sid Blanton and Mrs. M. 

P. Blanton spent Tuesday in
Brownwbod shopping, a 

Carolyn Carpenter of Santa 
Mina visited Tuesday ■evening- 
’'it'll Margie Fleming/
;• Mr. and. Mrs. C.: T. Moore 
visited m Coleman" Saturday 
with Mr and Mrs. Tommy Jami­
son. , ' W . ... : ■■’ . 7

Mr and Mrs. Toni Howard and 
iluldren <if hom'd a visited last 
■n rjtcnd with Mr. and Mr.|. 
John Howard,

Mrs J 'E Williams and Mr

W a c o  R e g io n  V e ts  
S e t R e c o rd  I n
Paying Home Debts

Veterans in the Waco’ region
wvith .GI home loans . have set 
and continue to set a remark­
able record of paying off home 
mortgage .'debts,- Dr. George 
McMahan* Manager of the Vet- 
rans. - Administration : Center, 
said today.
, Dr. McMahan disclosed that 
out of a total of 107,000 Wbrld 
War II and Korean Conflict vet­
erans 4n the, Waco region, GI 
home loans had been niade by 
'22,999 since the program was 
launched in December, 1944.
,1 Of the total number of home 
mortage loans guaranteed, 4, 
108 have been paid in full by the' 
veteran borrowers, he said.

Mrs. Barbara Roach and Miss 
Mery Alice Roach of Abilene 
were weekend visitors in tire 
Milton House and B. K. Riggs 
homes.

The army post at Fort Bragg, 
N- O., is the largest in-this coun­
try, from, the standpoint of area. 
It occupies '120(477.39.-.-acres...

Mrs. E. B. Archer, a patient
in the local hospital, has had all ■ 
of her children visit her this 
week.

The military word taps cornea 
from the Dutch word iaptoc or 
time to dose up all the taps and 
taverns in the garrisoned towns. ,

!• H i e  Last.-i.lianccr—.IIclcnaAMont.- ...-,■' "■ IV- ... ,, '. ■
The city cHf lk*h n.i, \\ith’ »i jmpulalwn of. 2r>,4GH» i.s Mn'Urma'^ \iHh 

lnii*«'St tfjl.v and th< sfaft‘ capital U ttaivs its hi-toty bach Pi 13(11 \v)j<*n 
a "f  paid fpii 'csj i atm- -.ot iip a base of opeiation,^ ff,t what dbi y
ealh-d "L a 't  Chance Gulch ”  ^  \

:./Bv early fall, -1864, the i/hch con- ! £olrf discovery of 1-81)4; an old huf- 
trurjerl niore than1 3U0-cad.ans and.it Halo trail; .theSlalo Capilol and ijic 
was •dee-Kl'cd that '"Last -Chance” | Veterans* -and Pjoneer#'' Memorial 
• was .not- a .suitable- name ’.lor the ;-Bthldimp which lion sets one of-lhe 
i,n,UU ipMv.m-’ c io.p and the finest historical musuitnr in the 
name whs aceordinelv. char,tied’ to. ; West-■ ineludmt the famous \hnlf- 
Hrlma . - - 1'milhon dollar-eolleclmn'of Charles

Tne city is mv. at-traotum t o : the ./ Russell paintings.-t - •

He- -added that the- VA paid 
and Mrs Finin'  ̂Cupps  ̂ spent | rtutns on only 83 out of all 
Up MiayHn Puri Worth \yit.li. Mr.-1 {j10tSG 'loans- 'Rimranleod in -the 
and Mis Knpnet Terry and! W;i(lo tPfrion. '
■rluldt.eii... ■ -. ' V . : j  ■ These- figures are' based on a

■ Mr. .and Mrs. lliesh :Turner ,of.t study by-Â A-. meludinu all loans 
Houston.. .visited 'with Mr, Rbcl.i..mu'chv through August, 1958.
Mm H,John Howard last week • ,
Mrs/ -Turner • is -Mr. Howard’s-.slowly.' -■ • • • •
Mstei 1 Mr mid Kirs, J, D Howard and
■/-.Mrs. -.M/ ■ F. -/Blanton • visited dauehter of- -Midriff-.spent ..-the 
v.jch Mrs Mare Blanton Satur- vteekend witlk Mr and , Mrs/ 
day/Mrs. Blanton -is.--Improving/ John Howard.*/ ■- _  ,

t im e  to  g e t  / ■ •

';Your CFrckii Heady
FOR PLANTING < ;

We Have'A Complete line of Equipment 
For 'Working Garden Spots and Small. 
Tracts of Land. We Would Appreciate- 
The Opportunity I1# Work Your Garden 
For You. ll Should Be Broke Now.

; FO R  HAtILINf/CALL 857
- l r .  and Mrs. Lee Wade Wallace “

, travMei. Tint only l>» c.iUm* it Hi"
) -R-laty c.p’pUali but as well - because 

it hna a hiickrCmnd of srnumuo 
■'and ioiik iin* that ilan  ̂bach to the 
Kujd isi'h da\'- ih is the bold out­
law and '■■yi'vf j.anhM' \ ôun̂ h* f\ 

- and tiijC ViL’ ilarit'*’ , -m 'M l io «  b- 
fid ii -^ani./Pion, hif i T p ’ a 1 
ordci out <>i chao- b> 3;</h, .ft
ju tw*t till till* H lira 

The La-t t ' ,m._i 
ino-t u n /"w  U m; 
i. *. l . f a  n u l - 
d > ■ n U  f M i l ( 
c i i e l  T II. ■ - , 
'cai'i'inpe.s |/ 
cn urn* tom i ’ if 
Mui.u-h aichit 
1*a , Hi* i■
\> ralvli .s to<_ G . s. n

Fj-
if the

h\ ,i i J..

Cf n

. Fifteen; miles north :-of Helena is 
the Gales of the Mountain-, so 
named by Lewis and Clark m  Johf?. 
When the explorers. rowed' up .'the 
iiuchty Mi^souu thi'ouph the t<>’ - 
l u i k  CviiiVan, the uvm.i t'» r- < ni- 

1 my nj tlw v/itei's ed *-■ p^ * ni 
an /'iitical ihti'iun of m  

h ,TfS up'ep/'q \>* furotnn t 
, al tei they had pm cl d '
, G he city that< star 
( ’la nee Gulch is tiaf a : 
i itv T he chunoui of p. a- « 
nil lu.n • <>\ii tlii c.t\

, / a  W ' t hl< ow *■ a,,\ t • 
ter ol dm state *• ih a'H ,al 
r.d, i i\ je and ‘■w ai ti. /

1 Hi'-tiijes h, i n;/i . h •
-t ntUW a. ’ QU( en ,,i thc 
iams.-” ./

Whi:.s t-HY-
*ra: .H*e;- ' in '!  imi-TIIKW-o v I'

■Mr and Mrs, Warren Gill and 
Mr * Ear] Gil]' of Brcuvnwood 
spenr - - last Thursday on the 
ranrh hf.f I'j.'kiiv; uver ranch 
activH!".- a

Mrs Dick' D al sperJ tlm 
'■weekend with her sister, Mr. 
and Mrs Wm-ton and mother, 
Mrs. rani:!'  KIL. M Ku\ice We 

.are clad to hear Mrs.-, .Ellis, is 
feeling .fine...

Mr and Mra It ‘X Turney and 
children of Santa Anna visit.ed 
Sunday with his parents, Kir. 
and M:s Bert Turnej

Mr.-, Hillman and Belva oi 
Rockwooci visited m .the -Tom 
RtuLcrhud home Wtdr.'e'-cUty 
nicht and a !n  with'Mrs. Ann 
Brian and Frances Frances 
spi’-nt Wednesday night with 
Belva

Mi a id  Mr- _ Degal were 
shiil,]),,!!'., m Brady Satutday.

M. Flo'.'1’ M* in -  Vid’ sd ” -i‘ h 
Mm Aim Brian Monday aiier- 

, noon,- . ■'■'■ .. ■■■■■■,.
, .Mr ana Mi- Babe Card,liner 

were in B>ady Kiluiday.
Sammie Shields • was in 

Brownv/ood Kunilay tor church 
services and Was dinner guest 
with Mr. and Mrs. John Avant.

Mr Pt skins of Coleman spent 
several days- last week with fhis 
daughter. Mr and Mi.- Floyd 
Morns and boys '

Mrs Dave Shields and bovs j
j

Thinking of hearing glasses? !

' .. i

■ | nt Sunday ni'k ' 
lives in Cross Flat

Mrs Greham Fit.-patnck \\fi 
:n Broivnwood Saturday shop­
ping, She accompam 
parents.-Mr. and Mrs. t 
to Broivnwood. ■-..■-.
- Mrs. Walter-Xanev 
ran are staying a i n  < i 
Mrs. O C Y.nu- a 
while the nun Jo]!;, a 
hunting: ' I - -■«. ■

Mr and Mr.- D.n m J 
and Ftnndtll veto he-e i 
ivei kejul Tire Lmelaiy - . 
living m Sweetwater ill 
lob has transferred him

Mr "and Mr Ceo;*'- 
son and Jean and, Mr- 
Everett sinv imin ; :
and Merkel Sund.n a

Mrs Bertha Li V :  v  . 
spent Sunday nr In w. ! 
nephew. Mr and :.irr 
Blanton and iaimly

Miss Bet tie Blue 
home Monday after 
in-.it m S'nydu’ r w m  
Henderson family

21,1 > Cpniinercial
See your nearest Santa Fe agent

Wlicit Mofe^^Jjou/Tfe WoMl Bait Sloppe/i?

4«a
INSIST ON QUALIFIED 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICE

If a hearing aid is the 
answer to your hearing a a 
problem, consider
P r e s c r ip t io n  H ea r in g  
Glasses.
These glasses are available 
exclusively through 
ophthalmicchannels — not ■ 

- through hearing aid dealers.- 
Don’t sacrifice your vision or 
comfort with heavy, poorly- 
fitting glasses that slip or 
slide. Benefit by the • 
professional experience and : 

a Op
/p /s / /

i

IT’S THOSE CLIPPINGS IN YOUR HAND!

It's a iact that American women are the most qualified 
shoppers in the world. Because of the intensity of news­

paper advertising, American women have more infor­
mation about more products, and so can compare value 

and price to get the most for their money. The -largest 
single advertising voice in our country is the local news­

paper. And what's more, take it with you when you 
shop. Or you can dip the ads out, as reminders to you 

to take advantage of the bargain you read about.

STORES THAT ADVERTISE 
H O M E T O W N  NEWSPAPER! i f f

:>k. i — ■»
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About tort time Im  ̂year, '"ex-- 
■. as and most of the United States 
w«.5 swamped with tlse iio-eallcd
Asiatic flu.

In fat’i; the inroads of the As­
lan strain of influenza '.vrro so 
widespread that its pfiw.ts were 
feltci) over the work! with vary-

■ tag intensity.
There is no doubt that influ­

enza y?as a contributing factor 
. in1 the light rise of death rates 
during the win ter. months. In­
fluenza may weaken an indivi­
dual’s resistance so ' that he is 
subject to more serious illness 
such as pneumonia which may 
result in death.

The two most , studied out­

breaks were the highly fatal 
epidemics of 1389 and 1.913 
when hundreds of thousand;}- 
-were killed as a result of the di­
sease. Since then attention lias 
been directed 1o the epidemic 
of mild disease that have yearly 
occurences with varying inten­
sity. - ' •
' Fortunately, although there

was a large number of cases, the, 
severity, of the Asian influenza 
was noj; great. The epidemic as 
measured by ..excess influenza 
pneumonia mortality was only 
slightly- more severe than the 
influenza '“A prime” epidemic of 
1953.. .

Although there are no iuciica-

>

N OTRAFFIC WORRIES TO m a r  y o u r

HOLIDAYS

TO;

Strain of influenza, there un­
doubtedly will he some Influen­
za.

For this reason the U. S, Pub­
lic Health Service and the Texas 
Slate Department of Health re­
commend consideration of vac­
cination against influenza for 
certain groups and individuals.

'Influenza vaccine is indicated 
for groups wishing to guard 
against absenteeism in their 
professions or occupations, and 
among those to whom the di­
sease might be an added health 
rlsik,: .:.

There are now ample supplies 
of influenza vaccine of the poly­
valent type, -containing immu­
nizing material against the im­
portant strains of influenza, in­
cluding the Asian strains.

Groups which should be con­
sidered for vaccination include 
hospital staffs whose services 
are necessary to the care of the: 
sickr  groups subject fo exposure 
and quick spread such as in in­
stitutions; and individual pat­
ients who have a special risk 
because of chronic- illness, preg­
nancy and age, .

Practicing physicians, should 
be the judge of whether or not 
to vaccinate individuals. (A 
weekly feature of the Public 
Health Education Division of the 
Texas State Department of 
Health.) - , ■

4lAf€li’%'» OOu •
dy MRS. JOHN CtoSUNTEIt

• We extend- our -sympathy- to 
.Mrs,-Lewis Bryan, on- the death 
of: her mother, Mrs.- Millie Mae 
■Hornsby,-71, of Fort W°rth, who 
passed away last Thurday. Mr. 
and Mrs. Bryan and -Kenneth 
were-in Fort Worth during the 
weekend. , \ y

The Rev. J. W. Whitefield of 
Brown wood filled the pulpit at 
the Methodist, Church: t.Sundav 
morning. He ami Mnto While?f , , , '• ,, , »•; ’ -iviih. onm  ruMf's JiiKi jkuvh

l WT J mnf j Û  0f thc- of -Swoelwnfer,- visited f rclu Kev. and Mrs: .T, W Tfr>W.n»ir . ■ -,..i W..,.- -^5,-.,. • . . : ■  „ 4 -

Mrs. Rex Golston has return­
ed home after a few weeks visit 
in Houston with her daughter, 
Mrs, Paul. James and family.

NOW !
all thc way \- > ,Y j \ <-- 
with .  ̂ „
T RAILWAYS*

San Angelo 
Fort Worth 
Dallas
Houston

Texarkana 
-Little. Rock. 
Memphis
Atlanta

Mrs. Jess Jackson ■ of Bangs 
and Sarah Beth Dale of Abilene, 
visited Suridgy ywith Mrs. Char-- 
lie McCarrell," Harold arid Mrs
poldie ^ilbergex. Sa'rah Beth 
was a dinner guest •> of Minnie 
■leap Jackson.) . N

■Mr. .and,MrS. C. to Davenport 
and LaNelM of Coleman spent 
Sunday vyi-tli Mrs. Lee Miller X 
, Mike Sheffield df Gatesvillc is 
spending the week with his 
grandparents, Mrs ,Ja<'k Cooper, 
arid- aunt,pLaCjuinn. . a v /
-Mrs. Sam Kales ahd jiuvnuind

during the weAend- > -
Mrs. J. E. Porter of tltopia 

spent the weekend witjhher par­
ents, Mis and Mrsj. Johnny Stew- r 
ard. , -

' * W-* ~< .
'-.Mrs,. Bob Johnson-..-ieeently ! 

Visited her daughter,'Mrs. W'. H. 
Schultz and laniily,' m Cleve-' 
land, Tenn. .’ / .

$3am Kites -of Sweetwater 
was ..Saturday dinner guest of 
Mrs. Aubrey McSwuimO ^
—“ rtfi:......................

SAVEEfS!

»■ gif ^ '<
% Vf;1

* «§ m  a  m  wm

1007
Wallis Ave.

It's SAFEU! 
5 7

CONTINENTAL TRA9LWAYS
SHIP SHAPE . . .  Ann Jacksop, 
prettiest member of the National 
Society of Professional Engi­
neers, holds a model missile.

Rev. and Mrs. J. W. Tickner.
Thc Tickner;; 'spent Monday 

night and . Tuesday with hie 
mother, Mrs. J. W. Tickner, 90, 
of Cisco who is still ill.- ,

Mrs. M, A. Rii’liaulson' is o:. 
the sick list, this wdrk, v 

Jack McvSwane-iK still m the 
VtX Hospital at, Big-Spring .ami 
expects - to have kurgery soon 
Mrs. MeSwanc is at his. bedside 

Ulcss Mancss was dismissed 
from Nix Hospital in' SaiV-An­
tonio last Wednesday ;He and, 
Mrs. Maness want. Ho'. 1 hank ev­
eryone for all of the ■ wbjitlerful, 
thoughttul things done for 'them 
during the long ’ illness. Mr, 

.Maness is doing 'fine. ' - -s \ 
Mr. and Mrs, - j'akp. McCreary 

and girls and Mrs.,, Gussie LWise 
spent the- weekt/nd in Fort- 
Worth with Mr and Mrs Billv- 
Eckles.

Mr and Mrs L C Harrison 
Jr. and Marilyn tot Fort Worth 
spent Saturday night and Sun-J 
day with Mr ftndr k-frs John1 
Hunter. . ■ :: - i

Mr. and Mrs. Cecil' Day And, 
children of Coiemafl- wei-'e -sA n-; 
day guests of Mrv an# Mrs-'Let-; 
fel-Estes and family - * I
.Mr., and Mrs, ^Tpm “̂BryanT 

spent the weekend in San -An-i 
gelo with Mr. ahdr MrsLE. D | 
Black: Gary and Elaine. -' I 

Mr. and Mrs.- Bherman Heil- [ 
man and Belva spent1' Suiidav j 
in -Coleman -with Mr, - a,nd Mrs: ] 
-John Fulbright, -and rchildren. i 
Belva remained to Mohday-. : 1

Mr. and Mrs. Tommy Briscoe' 
and children of Waldrip were i 
Sunday guests with Mr.'and Mrs.! 
J. A.-Hunter and Don: ,, I

Mrs. E.van Wise joined Mr and ■ 
Mrs. Miller Box at their hunt- i 
ing lease Wednesday to Friday. , 
Mrs. Box ■ spent the weekend i 
.with her mother. Mrs. J. W. Box i 
-and other relatives. ... <

last weiife Raymond went to Ah-, 
jlene Thuisday for his- assign-' 
rpent to the Armed Hn-ccs Mr. 
'Kstcs ca m e 'fo r  Mrs Ktuy; Him -
d!5y ; A  ( “

'Mr., and,Mrs i'luuMc 'Mii.orc ol 
Goi'emun Visilcd Hniillay afier- 
nooh with' Mr and, Mid Hyatt- 
Moopc, t . - - -~ -
rMr(jm d Mrs Tifiss Itsl;-/, yeni 

tfe Paradise last Friday'tdv visit' 
withdhe, R<t>\ -Douglas Rstrs and- 
Mike. -- - . -A e>

Mrs Bilj fkijk and Candr of 
Salt GApTi.-ai! dpn tin rtrHnc-ji 
epll.OT Sr home.on F on d ly  1 
/■ -Bill Steward ami 'Jniiior 
Brushmihaii. ,v,h i ai-e cmploj'ed 
art Colorado, (in y,. honie

E X P E R T  SH O E-,, o 
R E P  ASH dsERVR H

Made to Your^Spenificat ion 
. Euaranteetl Tfi1 Fit

' W LIW I
l^O O T 'A , SIIGlv .SHOP '

Coleman. Texas) --
t o

iiE ,SU M > W Oi; GLT

E e g t 'k 1 M @ a > 2  ’ g o .

;t ENDER s
T O P  G R A D E -: M A-

Ât Tour favorite ^feat Coimier In TV* 
j v  ̂ San|4 Anna .Markets

. If Ami Hayf- F-af (klves|To Sell Sim.
0, MORGAN. JR. AT

m
m

WITH A 1S58

W I T H ' H E W

LECTRICALLY

0 P ? r g . © t l e ; s l i #-. € h @ @ s ©
^  . .MU**.

Either For -Your Own 
Personal Pse Or For 
A Remembrance Gift
To A Tot m One.

E L E C T R I C
R f i N Q E

Cooking
Without Slaving!

N o more down-on-knees 
oven scrubbin'! No more 
door dodging, stretching, 

- bending!. The Frigidaire 
oven actually pulls: out —- 
full length —  so you can 
wipe it clean standing up! 
As easy as cleaning the top 
of your range.

WONDERFUL "EXTRAS”
* Porcelain, enamel Roaster Fan—* 

easy to dean!
Automatic Cook-Master—Mels you 
cook oven meals without watching. 
Full-width fluorescent worklight,
4 Radiahtube Surface Units with 
removable drip bowls for 
at-sink cleaning*
Plug-in automatic appliance outlet, - 
Roomy storage drawer pulls all the , 
way out for under-range cleaning, fell

f-Ni
only $ i g 2 3

P i t  W E E K  :

after small down payment :
BEUfXE MOBS. RD-20-59 , :

lalfus pa lilt ’s f l i t i !  

S u ts  ffttii 5 i « t i l k g  t | fii | i - I s l f  %

Fer toss than

&

;r -?v. 
&

-

>1
. .

ks

© A-
® Omirs 
® Cedrt * .  f-ests 
© Desks 
© Lamps 
© Mirrors 
@ Dinettes

A n d  M a n y  O th e r  

U se fu l G ifts

b  y  A w y  T o r  Owlsih i s v  &>
ft ( «j  ̂ l ?PA  ̂ torms

m w m @ m  bsiow f
This is a super buy in a bedroom group. Y our bedroom 
goes modern and looks beautiful. A complete group, in 
choice of a+iraAlve finishes; includes Bed, Headboard, 
Dresser, Night Stand And Mirror — ONLY”.

&

l it  cjd lgx ft
i f i  N A  «,.v ^ c o m p l e t e

fn 's  av«roae WTU fwnlly ««* «  wmpftte m«of A®
j . - - . . -  fils .-j tM v c i i ‘  .J ^..r.

m T 1 * (v: t- •*:'> /He !•*.>/' Ci-csp;,- c:* v.ct.'J: -

ALSO LARGE SELECTION OF LIVING ROOM, 
DINING ROOM AND DINETTE, SUITES — SEE

i W
«*“.r j .v  ■ -1' ■

1‘ f y. / .1

■t

- . ■ ■ |. 
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BASKETBALL 
RESULTS

In  the Talpn-Centmnlal vs. 
Santa Anna games'played in the
local i gym Thursday • night, the 
*18” boys lost by a 69-32 score; 
the girls Won 42-40 in an over­
tim e; and the ’‘A" boys lost by 
s  50-44 score.

In the "B" game Arlen Allen 
was high point boy for Kant a 
Anna with H points Spark:, wan 
high point boy for the Tnlpu- 
Cenleiuiiul team.

In the 'p.h Is paint' Monroe was 
high point girl for Talpa-Cen- 
Utnnlu! team with 32 pomt o 
Sandra Pricer was Inch point 
girl for Rama Anita with 20 
points. >

in iiW 1.fjy:. ‘A" game, the
Santa Anna high pomt hoy was \ 
Buddy Wylie witii lit points Tal- 
pa'.-. high point boys -were Lane 
and McEweii with 14 points 

. each. . ,
in  the Comanche tournament 

«>ri Friday and Saturday, the' 
g tr], lost one 'game, won one, 
then lost Uwir last game. The 
hoys lost tlieir iir.si game, then!.'®? 
won their next two iRsmey 
place third, in lh» .lourm-v '  l.j^"

Although the girl,-, did not ! $tv 
.plait: in tin tourney. ■ two ol i 
them were placid on the nh-.Jjy 
tonrnameni bum  'Sandra Pn- 1 '?£ 

.vas pli" mi , a 1 ; \.. rd, 1 $£•■ ■ "m m, \mmm.

SANTA
A N N A h L T  f

4' - 1

PURE LA RD
3 P o u n d

C a r t o n .49
&QiLfamOLA

3 Cans 2 § ^
FmOZBM

WBERMB 10-Oz.
Pkg.

■■ c o r ,
and Roberta Morgan ns a guard.
The boys placed one member,- 
Lowell Pembroke, on the all- 

- "tournament- team. "
In the girls division Santa An­

na lost to DeLeon by a 02-4̂ 4 
score Anne George: was high' 
point girl for DeLeon .with -19 
points, _ and Sandra Pncer was j 
h igh ’point girl for Santa Anna t a ? 
•with 23 points: ■ ? - ' ‘ Tiv

In th*dr o-.-rml1 -whip the-w - 
.girl' won ovt r Guldihwaite by a 
42-39 scon-, P'icer wo.-, ago in' 
high noinf ai'-l to- die Mour.- 1 "

FR O X E M

FLOUNDER Pound 59'

F R O Z E N

c a t fis h Pound - 59$

O n ;.'v:
t C o s f s . , : .

, ‘ p i G G i . y
( W I G G L Y

Black Pepper 
2 -oz . Gan | 0$

taimr-ns v ith 13 ponds d- & K im b e iB 9s
high, point eirl,

F oB gers
n m ^ w  m

-die Corvad-i
for Goldthwaib with 32 points.

In the last game for the girls: 
tiny lost to ( ’-imanche by a 
score ol 27 to 24 Pricer was high 
again for Rama Aim. with 10 
points, and Ani‘ a Broadway was 
second wiih Z owr . y,,,-. G ,ri? 
was hjch f u1 C ana . !,< v ■ '• "

- points, '
-In the first same forTne boys; 

they lost to I mw.’eviJle 3] to :!a.
Lowell Pe:nh!'>ki was hieh point 
bow fo- S-iiia Ar.r.xi with 12 
points'. Procter. and, Hicks, were 
high,, for .LineJeviUe with 13 

. points each. -
In the " '"or.d sanw the B  ^

Maun ainr> •'.< won w.-er Garni an CsrirS <Ss •&
by a. 44-12 score. Pembroke was , 
high for S..iv.a Anna with 17! jjP 
poirts Simp; a, high for ; %ji

•Gorman with 3 points.
Santa Anna won over Gold ________________

tlnvaite in their final , game bv 1
a 47 to 21, swore. Pembroke was <§| O  ̂  CJ15 C* 
high again with 17 points and i VM 
Audrey Hillman was high lor 
Goldthwaile with 5 points

Dinner uutMs m the Clifford 
Stephenson home fw.day were 
Mr- Eva Conic. htr son and 
fan>i’,v, Mr . nd Mr.- Vf.nwon , ^  jf*

„ . . . . . . . . . . . . . Y l f  B U L K  D A T

3-P ound can

ClOhk*’-
lifroM

Flvn y ■ onie

n, , - > n
by , ;>e.i.. a 
dueti r v, jth i 
he ..’wki o a .-; 
usme a c
his Mi" It
no! vet hei-u 
ray 7 h- y w  
dm • 3.;i,n ’ t 
ol hi-, d! i • 
MRlglV

u ,  -i. In j baying , •
• . ,i i: - i u’mins i fW-
rrl! n M they were ] ^  
th'-onometer into 1 
i -..;ct lo'u'Kin has 
d- t( I l.h'k J by x-- 

as.'Mi?" further 
t(", salK ,s no 

' u'lvr than the I “kw : -.■•■■■•■■■ i ©c

GIVE HER

B that ~~
ULOVA

difference

Best t¥taid
SALAD DRESSING Qt

C h r i s t s n a s
f r e e s

Special Price

II SMOP II
I PICCLT II
i wî vi

SAVINGS

| SUNSHINE ISM OZ. FKG, |  SUPREME
m  Q r a h a m  C r u m b s  2 0 c  1  F r e n c h  C r e m e s

10 OZ. PKG. |  NABISCO
49c I Vanilla W a f e r s

12 OZ. BOX
3 4 c
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