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Board to  review bids tonite d« no*
The Santa Anna School District 

Board of trustees will meet tonight 
at 7:00 PM to review bids for con­
struction of the new multi-purpose 
building to be added to the school 
campus. Plans are for the building 
to be ready for occupancy for the fall 
school term.

ILCOR Corp. of Austin a-e  
designers of the building and also 
drew up the bid specifications. The 
building will house four classrooms,

the offices of the superintendent and 
school business manager, and a con­
ference room.

According to school officials, more 
space is needed due to the continued 
growth in student population and ad­
ditional educational requirements. 
During the past several years, most 
elementary classes have required 
two sections.

Space made available in the high 
school building when the new

building is occupied, will be used for 
additional classroom and office 
space. The superintendent and 
business manager currently have of­
fices in the high school building.

The multi-purpose building will be 
constructed from available loca 
funds and construction is expected 
to begin within a few weeks.

The building will be of brick con­
struction to blend with other struc- 
tures on the campus._______________

Local ladies a t 
Heart of Texts  
art Art sHow

The Heart Of Texas Porcelain Art 
Show was held in Brownwood Sun­
day April 14 at the Addams Street 
Community Center, with several 
local ladies participating.

Charlotte Moseley of Santa Anna 
is the President of the Heart of 
Texas Porcelain Arts Club of 
Brownwood. Others attending from 
the Santa Anna club were Mrs. 
Richard Horner, Mrs. Rex Turney, 
Mrs. Vernon Herring, and Mrs. 
Charlie Moseley.

Charlotte Moseley won the door 
prize of a framed plate painted by 
Alma Graves.

Appreciation
dinner for locals

A dinner honoring ex-Mayor Ed 
Hartman and Mrs. Hartman; pre­
sent Mayor Joe Guerrero and Mrs. 
Guererro; all city council members 
and spouses; and all city employees 
and spouses was held Saturday 
night at the Lions Club building on 
Wallis Avenue.

The impromtu dinner was hosted 
by a group of friends and supporters 
of the city officials and staff. Mex­

ican food was served to a group of 
sixty to seventy in attendance at the 
affair.

The persons hosting the dinner 
wished their names to withheld but 
stated that it was given in apprecia­
tion of ex-mayor Ed Hartman and to 
wish the present city adminsitration 
and staff well in the coming years.

Burn Victim Remembered Here
Mary Brown of Poleman, who was 

injured in a mobile home fire on 
Monday, April 15, is reported in 
serious condition in the bum unit at 
Parkland Memorial Hospital.

She was transfered to the Dallas 
hospital after being treated at 
Overall-Morris Memorial Hospital 
in Coleman.

The fire was extinguished in 35 
minutes and extensively damaged 
the kitchen and dining areas. Fire­
fighters found the Woman in the 
bedroom of the home.

According to Dr. Fennela Schaef­
fer of Coleman, Mary Brown will

need 100 units of blood.
A bloodmobile will be in Coleman 

for this purpose on Monday, May 6, 
from 9 to 4 at the Teen Center. Pro­
spective donors are asked go by Dr. 
Schaeffer’s office to sign up or 
report to the teen center.

Mrs. Brown will be remembered 
here as the daughter of the S.R. 
Squires. Her daughters, Lorri and 
ferri Stevens .were students in the 
Santa Anna schools several years 
ago.

Mailing address is: Mary Brown, 
Parkland Bum Center, 5201 Harry 
Hines Blvd.,Dallas, Texas 75235.

Rep. o f Small 
Business Admn. 
in B'wd
On Friday, April 26, 1985 Grady 

Box, representative of the Small 
Business Administration will visit 
the Brownwood area. Mr. Box will 
headquarter at the Chamber of Com­
merce building in Brownwood and 
will be available to discuss pro­
grams of the Small Business Ad­
ministration. Meetings will be by ap­
pointment only. Appointments may 
be made by calling (915) 646-9535.

Additional information may be ob­
tained by contacting the Chamber of 
Commerce office.

Aux. 'did' Brave team
By i .  Strickland

' The Ladies Fire Aux. “ did”  have 
teams in the Fire Convention at 
Sonora. This reporter was just late 
getting “ around to it" as reporting it 
to the paper.

The ladies Water Polo team con­
sisting of Debbie Dean and Nikki 
Donham won second place, bringing 
home a large trophy for the trophy 
case in the Fire Hall and small ones 
for each individual person.

Last not but least, the Ladies 
Pumper team consisting of Nikki 
Donham, Syble Huggins, Donna 
Bradley Debbie Dean, Edith Dodson 
and Janette Strickland won second 
place with a time of 19.15 seconds, 
also bringing home a large trophy 
and small individual one for each 
member of the team.

Siller signs le tte r of intent
Danny Siller, the son of Mr. and 

Mrs. Daniel Siller and a student at 
Santa Anna High School, has recent­
ly signed a letter of intent to play 
football at Cisco Jr. College.

Danny recently completed his 
senior football season at SAHS 
where he was an outstanding offen­
sive and defensive .ackle. Danny 
was voted First team All-District 
tackle both offensivly and defensive­
ly by the district 8A coaches. Danny 
was also named to the All West

Texas class A Defensive First Team 
as a tackle. Danny averaged 8 
tackles per game at defensive tackle 
this past season.

Coach Chuck Lawrence, Defen­
sive Coordinator at CJC has in­

dicated that Danny will be used on 
the defensive line. He indicated that 
the team was hurt in this area by

graduation and that they were mosv 
excited to be able to sign a player of 
Danny’s caliber to help them rebuild

defensive line. Lawrence has also in­
dicated that they anticipate Danny 
being able to help immediately.

Coach Galen Privitt says ‘ we in 
Santa Anna are extremely proud of 
Danny and his accomplishments and

honors. He and his family are to be 
congratulated. We wish for Danny 
only the best and all the sucess in the

world. Danny is an exceptional 
young man and worthy of all the 
praise he has received. ’

Youth Rady
A group of twenty three local 

young people and their sponsors 
were in Cisco Sunday evening for a 
Methodist Youth Fellowship Rally.
The Santa Anna MYF was the 
largest group in attendance at the 
rally which was composed of MYF 
groups from Early, Comanche,
Gorman, Winters, Bangs, Cross 
Plains, Cisco, Eastland and Santa 
Anna. Darla Beal and Dale Freeman 
are directors of the Santa Anna 
MYF. Steve Ramsdell and Lois 
Harper accompanied the group.
The program for the rally consisted 
of a business meeting, an evening 
meal, games, and closed with a time 
of worship. Rex Harper of the Santa 
Anna group was elected as a high 
school representative on a district 
level.

Members of the local Methodist 
Youth Fellowship attending the af­
fair were; Laura Oakes, Lana 
Pyburn, Reece Mclver, Rex Harper,
Laura, Eva, and Alex Frausto,
Raymon, Mary, Sylvia, and Nora 
Castillo, Rose Garza, Becky and 
Shaera Lewis, Armando, Cecilia, 
and Matilda Banda, Kim and Stacie 
Gunter, Holley Hoffman, LeeAnn 
Estes, Doug Warnock, and Jamie 
McClure.

Beauty Contest
Entry forms for the F untier Day 

Beauty Contest may be picked up at 
G&E Hardware. Time is drawing 
short. Those who plan to enter 
need to enter as soon as 
possible.

Jam fo r St. Jude

The News will publish a complete 
schedue of events for Fun tier Day in 
next week’s edition.

Make your plans now to par­
ticipate in the events.

It will be a big day for the com­
munity of Santa Anna.

fe fe m  Star 
Meets
'The Santa Anna Chapter No. 247 of 

the Eastern Star met for their stated 
meeting at 7:30 PM on Monday, 
April 8, 1985. Eleven officers filled 
their stations with Ethel Williams, 
Worthy Matron and Montie L. 
Guthrie, J r ., W orthy Patron 
presiding over the business session.

Officers elected for the ensuing 
year include the following: Worthy 
Matron, Carmen Donham; Worthy 
Patron, M ontie Guthrie, Jr.; 
Associate Matron, Viona West; 
Associate Patron, Raymond W. 
Balke; Conductress, Lois Avents; 
Associate Conductress, Eula Mc- 
Cary; Secretary, Billie Guthrie; 
Treasurer, Rose Bass.

Raymond W. Balke and Montie L. 
Guthrie, Jr. served refreshments of 
cheese, crackers, cake, punch and 
coffee during the fellowship hour! 
The annual Memorial Program will 
be presented at the next meeting, 
May 13,1985.

tierit care in this hospital and 
because their whole body, including 
their nervous system, suffers due to 
their malignant disease and inten­
sive treatment. Some children are 
hesitant to return to school due to 
their worries about their changed 
appearances e.g., amputation, loss 
of hair. Because of this they fre­
quently show academic problems 
with resulting feelings of inferiority, 
vocational uncertainty, depressions, 
and decrease of motivation for 
achievement in school and work.

Parents exhausted by their strug­
gle for the child’s survival are faced 
with an additional burden to help 
their child to readjust to satisfactory 
functioning among their peers who 
are living healthy and normal lives.

Let’s help support these people by 
giving to the Traffic Jam to be held 
on May 4 by the Delta Omicron 
Sorority.

PROBLEM: Quality of Life of 
children and their parents during 
their treatment for malignant 
disease. This hospital’s policy of 
helping the total human being rather 
than aiming treatment in the diseas­
ed organ only.

SYNOPSIS: Recent studies at St. 
Jude Hospital by the department of 
psychiatric services (psychologists, 
psychiatrists, social workers) have 
begun investigating the neurop­
sychological effects of cancer treat­
ment on a cross-section of long-term 
survivors.

Many children and their parents 
suffer from intense anxieties and 
depressions in addition to physical 
pain and discomfort during their 
ca ta strop h ic  illn e ss  and its 
treatment.

The children’s school attendance 
suffers because of their hospitaliza­
tion and repeated visits for outpa-

Pork board plans dinner
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The Santa Anna Parks and 
Recreation Board met in special 
meeting April 16, at Coleman County 
Telephone Coop conference room. 
Board members attending were 
chairperson Glenda Cook, Earlene 
Scott, Pearl Wilson and councilman 
Gary Fleeman. Betty Sue Brown 
also attended.

Final plans were formulated 
regarding “ An Old Fashioned Sun­
day Dinner”  to be held Sunday, 
April 28, 1985 at Santa Anna school 
cafeteria from 11:00 a.m. to 2:00 
p.m. The menu will include roast 
beef, mashed potatoes, brown 
gravy, red beans, com, homemade 
yeast rolls, homemade pies and cob­
blers, iced tea and coffee. Adult 
tickets will be $4.50 and children’s 
$2.50. Charlie Jordan, KTAB-TV

IGndergarden
Registration

Registration for Kindergarten will 
be held on Monday, May 6 at 2:45 
PM. Parents will need to bring im- 

, munization records and birth cer­
tificates. Hie registration will take 
place, at the elementary building 
and is for jthose children who will be 
5 years old on or before September 1.

plans to be present. Everyone is en­
couraged no come and enjoy a good 
old fashioned Sunday dinner. Pro­
ceeds will be used for improvements 
on Gary James Memorial Park.

The board would like to request all 
interested persons who have roses 
and shrubs to call Mrs. Cook 
(348-3582) or  E a r le n e  S cott 
(348-3856) if they have these items to 
donate. Arrangements will be made 
to plant them as soon as possible. 
Park water lines and sprinkles have 
been repaired and watering has 
begun.

Remember Sunday, April 23, 
1985-come for dinner.

M in i m *  ( n l n i MaoBwIlHjWv sPJRSSmu HwBu

Monique to  s ta te  
Bterary m eet

Monique Spillman, senior student 
at Santa Anna High School, has ad­
vanced to the state UIL Literary 
competition to be held April 26th at 
the University of Texas at Austin.

At the regional meet at McMurry 
last week, Monique placed third in 
ready-writing, qualifying for state 
participation. Additionally, she was 
chosen first alternate in calculator 
and second alternate in spelling.

Monique is the daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. James Spillman.

Roy tribute * 

to  your moot
On Mother’s Day all Moms are 

special. However we would like to 
give extra special attention to your 
mother. We are looking for stories of 
special remembrances you may 
have concerning your mother. This 
will be a chance for you to take the 
time and pay tribute to your mother 
for ail the things she means to you. 
Entries should be no more than 200 
words and should be in the News Of­
fice by May 2. Entries will be printed 
as space permits, so plan to get 
yours in early. .

WTU offers 

microwave 

cooking school

West Texas Utilities will host a 
M icrowave Cooking School on 
Thursday, May 2,1985 at 7:00 p.m. in 
the WTU local office, Santa Anna, 
Texas. The Electric Living Con­

su lta n ts  from  A b ile n e  w ill 
demonstrate exciting new recipes of 
meats, vegetables, and desserts us­
ing the Amana Radarange and 
F r ig id a ir e  M icro w a v e . Save 
yourself time and energy when cook­
ing and cleaning by learning new 
techniques using the most conve­
nient k itchen  a p p lia n ce , the 
microwave oven. Microwaves not 
only save electrical energy, but help

you have a cooler kitchen during 
those air-conditioning months. Come 
join us for free instruction and 
tasting of the foods. Call the WTU 
Local office at (&15) 348-3101 to 
make your reservations.

School solicits parent input
Due to state reductions in funding, 

the Santa Anna Independent School 
Distrist is considering two proposals 
for the 1985416 Kindergarten pro­
gram. The first proposal is to split 
the kindergarten students by age. 
The older students would attend 
school all day during the first 
semester. The younger students 
would then attend all day during the 
second semester.

Proposal number two is an alter­
nate day schedule. During the first 
semester, the older students would 
attend school all day on Mondays.

Wednesdays, and Fridays. The 
younger students would attend on 
Tuesdays and Thursdays. During 
the second semester, the older 
students would attend on Tuesdays 
and Thursdays, while the younger 
students would attend on Mondays, 
Wednesdays, and Fridays.

Interested parents are invited to call 
and give an opinion as to which pro­
posal they would prefer. Please call 
Superintendent Gerald Brister at 
3483136 between the hours of 8:60 
AM and 4:00 PM before May 14,1985.

mailto:S@rv.es
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Deaths
Hoyd C. Young

M r . F l o y d  C . Y o u n g  o f  
Bnrwnwoed, age 70, died at 11:20 
ta d a y , April 2 1 ,1 ®  in a local nurs­
ing home. He was bom March 9,1915 
in Dallas, Texas, and was a member 
of the First Christian Church of 
Odessa.

Mr. Young was a former longtime 
resident of Odessa, and had resided 
in Brownwcod for two years.

Mr. Young married Vermeil 
Newman at Santa Anna June 15, 
1970. Services were held at 2:00 p.m. 
on Wednesday, April 24,1985 in the 
Davis-Morris Funerla Chapel. Inter­
m ent w as in the G reen lea f 
Cemetery.

Survivors include his w ife, 
Vermeil; 1 daughter, Nancy Young 
of Dallas; 1 son, Gary Young of 
Austin; 2 step-sons, Taylor Hetzel of 
Brownwcod and Walter Hetzel of U. 
S. Marines, Camp Lajune, N.C.; 1 
step-daughter, Carolyn Daily of Cof- 
feyville, Kansas; 1 sister, Beatrice 
Vossler of Junction; 1 brother, Earl 
Young of Atlanta, GA and 5 step- 
grandchildren.

Mrs. Lets Bede Fomby
Mrs. Lela Belle Fomby, age 99, of 

Santa Anna passed away Monday, 
April 22 at 5:03 a.m. at Holiday*Hill 
Nursing Home of Coleman following 
a lengthy illness. Services were held

SANTA ANNA NhWS

Wednesday, April 24 at 2 p.m. at 
Henderson Funeral Home Chapel 
with, Rev. Anthony Thibadeaux, 
pastor of First Christian CHurch of­
ficiating. Burial will be in Coleman 
City Cemetery.

Lela Belle Fomby was born March 
14, 1886 in Coleman County to the 
late Joe H. and Callie C. Haley 
Green. She was a life time resident 
of Coleman County where she at­
tended the Bee Branch and Santa 
Anna Schools. She married W. M. 
Belle in Santa Anna in 1916, and he 
proceeded her in death in 1949. She 
later married O. B. Fomby in Bangs, 
who also nreceeded her in death.

Mrs. Fomby was a member of 
First Christian Church and a 
housewife.

Survivors include: 2 step-sons, 
Garrett Somby of Cross Plains and 
Howard Somby of Riverside, CA; 
four nieces, Mrs. Sidney (Geneva) 
Hughes of Marian, Mrs. Lois O’Neal 
of Ft. Worth, Mrs. Walter Dowden of 
N ederland, Tx and K athleen 
McDaniels of Abilene; 3 nephews, 
Dr. Joe Green and Col. George O. 
Green both formerly of Coleman, 
and J. T. Green of Dallas.
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Audrey Martin
Audrey Martin Robbins, 54, of 

Blanket, a rancher, died Sunday, 
April 21, at his home. Services were 
held at 10 AM Tuesday at Harrell 
Funeral Home in Dublin.

G erald F reem an O fficiated . 
Burial was at New Dublin Live Oak 
Cemetery.

Bom July 13,1930, near Santa An­
na, he married Jean Whitfield 
November 4, 1976, in Odessa. He 
served in the Air Force during the 
K orea n  c o n f l i c t .  He w as a 
Methodist.

A daughter, Glenda Reid, Pro­
ceeded him in death.

Survivors include his wife; two 
sons, Walter of Odessa and Martin of 
Coleman; two daughters, Donna 
Saylor of Midland and Joey Barlow

of Levelland; a son-in-law, Glen 
Reid of Odessa; a brother, Billy Ray 
of Midland; and nine grandchildren.

Local survivors include two aunts;

M ildred Cam m ack and Jewel 
Anderson; and an uncle, Lee Ray 
Huggins.
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The engagement and approaching 
marriage of Miss Brenda White and 
Chad B. Malm has been announced 
by the couple. Their parents are 
Mrs. Dorothy J. Beal of Abilene and 
Lee G. White of Salado, Leon B. 
Malm of Texas City and Mrs. Gwen 
Malm of Webster.

The couple will be married Satur­
day, May 11, at Peace Lutheran 
Church in Texas Citv.

The bride-elect is a 1982 graduate 
of Santa Anna High School and is 
currently employed with the Univer­
sity of Texas Medical Branch in 
Galveston. Her fiance is a 1979 
graduate of Texas City High School 
and is a chemical operator with 
Reagent Chemical & Research in 
Texas City. Following a wedding 
trip to San Antonio, the couple will 
make their home in Texas City.

Anniversary For 
M r. and M rs. C.D. Bruce

Mr. and Mrs. C. D. Bruce were 
honored last weekend on their 62nd 
wedding anniversary with a get- 
together in the home of a grand­
daughter in Junction.

Hosts for the occasion were Jim­
my and Carol Kingsbery Ottiners.

Mr. and Mrs. Bruce were married 
in Junction on Sunday, April 22,1923 
at the First Baptist Church. The late 
Rev. S. F. Marsh, pastor of the 
church, officiated at the ceremony.

The Bruces and their family at­
tended services at Junction First 
Baptist Church on Sunday morning.

Family members gathered at the 
Ottmers home on Cedar Creek on 
Saturday, with a picnic lunch served 
on the patio. During the afternoon, 
Junction friends joined the group for 
an informal reception.

Helping host the occasion were the 
h o n o re e s ’ s th ree  d a u g h ters , 
Margaret Robin of Houston, Evelyn 
Kingsbery of Crystal City and Bar­
bara Kingsbery of Santa Anna. 
Other family members present were 
grandchildren, John and Sue

(Kingsbery) Porter, Diana and 
Mollie of Austin; Bob and Kerri 
Kingsbery, Amber and Clay of San 
Antonio; and Walter Robin of 
Houston. Also two sons-in-law, Jack 
Kingsbery of Crystal City,and Tom 
Kingsbery of Santa Anna;'

At the afternoon party, an an­
niversary cake baked and decorated 
by Margaret Robin was served with 
lemonade and coffee. The table was 
covered with a blue cloth overlaid 
with white lace and centered with an 
arrangement of spring flowers in a 
brass urn.

Saturday evening the group en­
joyed a barbecue supper and 
visiting. Joining the family group 
were Dr. and Mrs. Ronald Graham 
and Mrs. Wilburn Nethery.

Mrs. Bruce, the former Leona 
Banister, was teaching school in 
Kimble county at the time of their 
marriage. They have lived in Col­
eman County for over 50 years 
where they are still actively engag­
ed in ranching.

Granbury
opera

G R A N B U R Y ,TE X A S-’ Blazing 
Beds’ a mad-cap bedroom farce 
comedy by Jo Ann Miller will be 
playing at the Granbury Opera 
House April 26 through Mav 26.

The resident Company of Glen and 
Claudia Veteto, Sid Williams, Dren- 
da Lewis, Laddie Howard, and 
Sydney McBeth are joined by Opera 
House veteran favorite, David Cof­
fee, in the romp.

Performances Friday and Satur­
day at 8 PM with matinees Saturday 
and Sunday at 2 PM. Please call th 
Box Office for ticket information 
and reservations. (Closed Monday). 
(817 ) 573-9191.

Heed Memories Co. 
Uni f®d

Monuments of Distinction 
Fort Worth Highway 
Rrawawood. Texas 

Bex 265 - Ph. 646-7625
Sylvia Herring 

Local Representative

Mrs. Ruby Box is pleased to an­
nounce the arrival of a great grand­
daughter. Destre was bom on April 
14 in Odessa. Proud parents are Pam 
and Walter Robbins, of Odessa and 
paternal grandmother is Gene 
Turner of Coleman.

Don's Diary
Thursday, April 25,1985

%  t o  flu tfm rM

Have you ever been lonely? Silly 
question isn’t it? Of course we have 
all been alone and have been lonely! 
Have you ever been in the midst of a 
crowd and still been lonely?

Loneliness is a universal ex­
perience. We have all experienced 
loneliness to one degree or another.

There is that physical loneliness. 
When separation because of miles or 
tim e puts loneliness into our 
vocabulary. This kind of loneliness 
is best pictured by a solitary owl per­
ched on some bare branch in the 
darkness of night in some dreary 
place of desolation.

There is that personal loneliness 
when we put up barriers between 
ourselves and those around us. 
These barriers lead to the worse 
kind of loneliness. Being lonely in 
the midst of people; now that is lone­
ly. A feeling of being cut off from 
people around us is the worse kind of 
being alone.

B a rr ie r s  o ften  lead  us to  
loneliness. The barrier of self. When 
we think we are better than others 
we can be so lonely.

The barrier of love. When we love 
those who will love us back to the ex­
tent that we do not venture out to 
those unlovely people who may not 
love us back we can be lonely in the 
midst of people who may need love.

The barrier of religion. Did that 
surpries you? Some religious folks 
put up barriers. Some people have 
just enough religion to keep them 
miserable. They have enough to 
keep them from reading “ Playboy”  
but not enough to keep them reading 
the Bible. They have enough to trust 
Jesus but not enough to trust God in 
all the “ personal”  elements of life.

There are ways we can break 
down these barriers. We have been 
offered the abundant life through the 
lifestyle of Jesus.

One way is to cultivate empathy. 
Em pathy m eans standing in 
anothers shoes and looking at life 
through their eys. As the Indian say­
ing goes "Do not critize until you 
have walked in his shoes.”

Learning to give ourselves in love 
to others helps us to overcome 
loneliness. A man of the New Testa­
ment named Zacchaeus was a lonely 
man. He was short of stature and 
was the brunt of cruel jokes as he 
was growing up. To compensate for 
this he became a rich and powerful 
man. He was going to show them! 
He used every trick in the trade to 
become rich and powerful. Then it 
happened, Jesus showed him a new 
lifestyle. Jesus showed him how to 
love rather that impress and exploit. 
And in this love Zaccheaus was 
released from his self imposed 
prison. When we rise to the occasion 
of giving ourselves in love we are 
released from  defen sive  and 
“ mesism" and to a great degree are 
released from loneliness in a crowd.

Knowing God’s companionship 
helps us to overcome. In John’s 
gospel, chapters seven and eight we 
read of a lonely time in the life of 
Jesus. He had lost the popular 
following. Jesus was not bringing a 
sugar stick but a lifestyle and this 
caused many of the easy followers to 
abandon him.

The attackers of those in authority 
were become worse and worse.

Even his close followers began to 
slip away. John records that even 
his brothers did not believe in him.

In this m idst o f terrify ing  
loneliness a great truth came over 
Jesus. “ He who sent m e is with me, 
he has not left me alone. ’ ’

The constant love of God can help 
us through the loneliness.

THINK ABOUT IT: John 14:18; 
Isaiah 54:10; I Peter 5:7; Psalm 
46iL_________________

Boss - Wiliams wed

Pamela Jean Bass and Jeffery 
Todd Williams, both of Albany, ex­
changed wedding vows Wednesday 
evening in a double-ring ceremony 
at the Immaculate Conception 
Church.

Father David Lyke of Tyler 
officiated.

The bride, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. James B. Bass of Tyler, and 
granddaughter of Rose Bass of San­
ta Anna, is a graduate of Randolph 
High School in San Antonio and at­
tended Angelo State University. She 
is a jockey.

'The bridegroom, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Robert Williams of Mount 
Pleasant, Mich, is also a jockey.

Matron of honor was Carmen

Reno of Comfort. Maid of honor was 
Tarrii Purcell of Manor.

Best man was Tim Williams of 
Poolville, brother of the bridegroom. 
Groomsman was Mark Mills of 
Mount Pleasant, Mich.

Others in the wedding party were 
Jaime Linn Lyons of Fairfield, Ohio, 
niece of the bride, flower girl; 
Travis Reno of Comfort, ring 
bearer; and Diedre Sweet of Tyler, 
musician.

Serving as ushers were Phillip 
Gentry of D allas and Arthur 
LaBonte of Albany.

The reception was held at the 
Tyler Petroleum Club Marina.

The couple will reside in Ruidoso, 
N.M.

T:O W N
ALK

Carol Kingsbery Ottmers was in 
the news office this week and related 
that she has opened her law office in 
Junction. Her husband is on the 
coaching staff in the Junction

Thursday Modora Gilmore, Mr. 
and Mrs. Campbell, Lucille Wylie, 
Vera Walters, Ciaudine Brown, 
Louise McCaughan and Sally 
Stewardson went to Llano to see the 
Bluebonnets, stopping tin Brady fro 
Bessie Bell Caylor who accom­
panied the group. The group had 
lunch at the Badu House in Llano.

Friday night , April 19, the 
backyard of the R.C. Smith home 
was the scene for a barbeque dinner 
for the members of the First 
Presbyterian Church. The guests en­
joyed barbeque chicken, sausages, 
ribs, red beans, corn, salad and cob­
bler. Thirty eight were present for 
the meal and an evening of visiting.

Dick and Karen Smith and Dana, 
visited over the weekend with their 
parents, the R.C. Smiths and the 
C h arles W e tse ls . M ary  Cay 
Hohensee of Miles was also a guest 
of the Smiths. Mary Cay is a 
member of the tennis team from 
Miles, where Dick Smith is doing his 
practice teaching and coaching ten­
nis. Mary Cay was competing in ten­
nis matches in Coleman on Saturday 
and attended the Santa Anna Junior 
-Senior Prom as a guest of Doug 
Wamock.

Jeff Lee of Abilene was a weekend 
guest of Shawn Harper and attended 
the Junior- Senior Prom with Missey 
Moore.

Elissa Dungan was a weekend 
house guest of Missey Moore and at­
tended the prom  with Shawn 
Harper.

Mrs. Joe C. Barnes should have 
been included as a hostess for the 
Self Culture Club meeting reported 
in last weeks paper.

Mr. and Mrs. William Rutherford 
just returned early last week from a 
vacation and sight-seeing trip . They 
went to Liberty, Texas for a visit 
with his brother, Mr. and Mrs. R. B. 
Rutherford and then on to Galveston 
and on Friday and Saturday they 
visited their son, Mr. and Mrs. Larry 
Rutherford, Stacy and Jackie of 
Anson.

Visitors with Modora Gilmore this 
week were Mr. and Mrs. Thomas 
Campbell from Harrison, Arkansas. 
Also on Wednesday night Modora’s 
grandson and wife, Mr. and Mrs. 
Doug Gilmore from Dallas, Texas 
were overnight visitors.

RE Homer ReoJ Estate 
625-5625 or 348-3715

662 Acres South o f Santa Anna, Man> 
Improvements

51.83 40 ae.citlt., NE of Santa Anna $800 
•per acre

33.57 acres, all or part,$900 per acre 
303.8 ac. NF. of A Santa Anna, good hunting,

several tanks,!OO ae. eplt. $530 per acre 
353 ac. South of Santa Anna,$550 per acre 

If we don‘t have what >ou‘re .looking for, 
wetll find it!

I

Santa Anna funeral Home Offers;
Emergenc> Medical File with important 

medical information to hove available in an 
emergency, f 'I.EASE come h> and fill out 
an emergenc> medical form.

Hf# boner o l hoiks, ife insurance , or pso-e ■■ ■ * sd 
bsnm te....M  meffor from w hm

Santa Anna Funeral Home 
348-3153
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MON
hj Mrs. lorn Rutherford

Our little community was blessed 
with showers of rain during the night 
Saturday for which we our thankful. 
Myself and several others stated 
their rain gauge had sis tenths Sun­
day a.in. We deeply feel the need of 
more moisture.

Mr. Douglas Avant and grandson, 
Jeramie Avants of Brady were din­
ner guests with his mother, Mrs. 
Pearl Avant in Santa Anna on Satur­
day, during that time they made 
plans to come to the family farm at 
Whon Monday. So today Mrs. Avant 
and son, Douglas came to the farm 
for the week, planning to enjoy the 
quitness of the country for a time.

Mrs. Betty Bearden of Brownwood 
visited with Mrs. Darwin Lovelady 
and her sister, Jaunita Minica in 
Santo Anna Wednesday night. On 
Thrusday, Juanita Minica went to 
Scott and White Hospital in Temple 
for her check. She was a patient 
there a few weeks back. We are glad 
to repost Mrs. Minnica received a 
good report.

Mr. Dusty Vinson of Waco and Mr. 
Dale Vinson of Fort Worth were 
weekend guests with their grand­
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Tom Vinson.

Mrs. Floyd Morris returned home 
Thursday afatemoon following a 
week stay with her son, Mr. and 
Mrs. Jamie Lee Morris and baby 
girl at Smithville. Mrs. Morris was 
assisting with care for the mother 
and baby. Both are doing well. Mrs. 
Jacky M orris of Santa Anna 
prepared supper Thursday night and 
came down with her children Jeffery 
and Jennifer and all enjoyed supper 
together.

Lucille Sorrells of Coleman visited 
with Mrs. Darwin Lovelady in Santa 
Anna Sunday afternoon. We are 
sorry to report Mrs. Lovelady not 
feeling so well.

Mr. and Mrs. Walter Lee of San 
Angelo was with her uncle, Mr. and 
Mrs. Tom Vinson the first of the past 
week. They enjoyed staying on the 
river quiet a lot, and seemingly had 
a good luck fishing.

Mr. and Mrs. Floyd Morris visited 
in the Owens community on Sunday 
afternoon with Mr. and Mrs. El- 
Wayne Perkins of Grand Prairie 
who were on their farm there. Our 
deepest sympathy to Mrs. Elwayne 
Perkins over the death of her father 
recently.

Mr. and Mrs. Tom Vinson receiv­
ed word their great granddaughter, 
K. K, Valdez of Prescott, Arizona

had major surgery at 11:00p.m. on 
Friday for ruptured appendix in a 
hospital there. Saturday moniing 
they were notified she stood surgery 
fine. The appendix was bursted. 
Then on Monday Mr. and Mrs Tom 
Vinson talked with K. K. by 
telephone. She told them she was 
feeling much brighter. She felt she 
would be going home soon. K. K.’s 
mother, Susan is a registered nurse 
in the hospital there.

Jeffery and Jennifer Morris of 
Santa Anna spent the weekend with 
their grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Floyd Morris. We are / sorry to 
report, Jeffery recently fell and 
broke both wrists. He reports felling 
very well, but awfully handicapped 
with each wrist in a cast.

My daughter, Mrs. Bob (Patsy) 
Smith of Abilene is with me tonight 
(Monday). She plans to return home 
Tuesday aftemon.

Mr. Hilary Rutherford of Coleman 
was out with me on Saturday andjny 
grandson, Todd Rutherford of Bangs 
was with me Saturday night and 
Sunday.

While Mr. and Mrs. Floyd Morris 
were away from their home Sunday 
afternoon, Mr. and Mrs. David 
Perkins of Coleman visited with Mr. 
John David Morris in the home. Also 
Mr. Leon Carter was a brief visitor 
following visiting his sister, Lorene 
Black in Brownwood on Sunday.

Mr. Darwin Lovelady of Santa An­
na visited during the past week with 
his son, Mr. and Mrs. Randel 
Lovelady and girls in Brownwood.

Mr. and Mrs. Graham Fitzpatrick 
spent the weekend with their son, 
Mr. and Mrs. Neil Fitzpatrick and 
girls in Odessa. We are sorry to 
report Mr. Graham Fitzpatrick was 
admitted to the Brownwood Hospital 
this MOnday afternoon. Reports are 
he is rather ill. But we do wish for 
him a speedy recovery.

Mr. Amon Ott was in Abilene from 
Thursday to Sunday participating in 
a Registered Heifer Sale.

Rm ger Park
By Annie Rim Brimer

LIVING CENTER 
Thelma Whitehead visitors have 
been Helen Jo Beaver, Arris and Pat 
Whitehead.

Cody Mathews spent Wednesday 
through Sunday visiting her sister, 
Rita Ing in Brownwood.

0 . C. Barker visitors have been In­
ez Lowe, Juanita and Lou Griffin 
and Wayne Barker.

Edna Wells is pampering a sprain­
ed ankle.

NURSING HOME
The residents spent a very en­

joyable afternoon Tuesday listening 
to the Melody Makers sing beautiful 
gospel songs. Helping with the pro­
gram were Jim Boyle at the piano 
and Doris Aderholt, Wanda Wallace, 
Lorene Winn and Kate Cagle sing­
ing. We are so happy they came our 
way.

There was a birthday party Thurs­
day afternoon. Pat DeWltt played 
piano selections. Fannie Gilbert 
gave some readings for the pro­
gram. Happy Birthday was sung to 
Nola Hopper. Bud Evans, Sybil 
LaBafrow. Also to 0 . C. Barker and 
Thelma Whitehead from the living 
center. Helen Jo Beaver and Stena 
Mitchell baked the cakes. The serv­
ing table was covered with a lace 
table cloth and an Easter basket was 
the centerpiece. Jeannette Brock, 
Jean and Charles Caldwell, Helen Jo 
Beaver, Herman Estes, Carmen 
Ddnham, and Doris Harvey served 
cake and punch to the honorees and 
a large number of residents and 
guests.

Preachers visiting the nursing 
home were Bro. Rudy Juarez, Bro. 
Dan M offett, and Bro. Steve 
Ramsdell. We look forward to their 
visit each week.

Bernice Johnson brought some 
nice clothes for the residents to 
wear. It’s good to have friends like 
you to share with us.

We are happy to meet the new 
Pastor of the Northside Baptist 
Church, and have him bring the 
devotion each Wednesday morning. 
Bro. Dan Moffett was here Wednes­
day morning. Others attending the 
service were Peggy Moffett, Fannie 
Gilbert, Ruby Howard, Amanda 
Perry, Imo Herring and Etheleen 
Stewart.

Jay McCoy popped the com  Fri­
day afternoon for the movie “ Camp­
ing in the Smokies” .

The Northside Baptist Church was 
in charge of the service Sunday 
afternoon. A large number of 
residents enjoyed the singing of 
Robert and Maggie Robinett, Bro. 
Dan, Peggy, Regie and Robert Mof­
fett, Fannie and Clarence Gilbert, 
Wanda D ietzel, Im o H erring, 
Etheleen Stewart, Amanda Perry, 
Linda Moore and Francis Weems.

m  RUMP 
& SUPPLY CO.
femsf €$Sslf &ppSii

Santa Anna, Texas 
Bos 580-Ph. 348-3179 
Box 21, Ira, Texas 
Bus. 91S-S73-6403
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It’s such a blessing to have you visit 
us each third Sunday.

We are so happy to have Lou Lyn 
Dunn make her home with us. We 
are glad to have David Nichols live 
with us for a while too.

Pearl White visitors were Jr. and 
Wilma White, Lena Howard, and 
Wanda Steffey.

Effie Priddy visitors have been 
Elmer L. Hughes, Ophelia Watson, 
Richard and Maudie Kelley.

Jack and Ila Todd visited Lillie 
Knotts.

Ora Caldwell was visited by Edith 
Reichenou, Charles and dean 
Caldwell.

Mary Hoffman visitors have been 
Kevin and Dedra Rasberry, Regina 
and Shelly, Floyd, Rosie, Sally and 
Arthur Slavinsky.

Jane Hawkins was visited by 
Walter and Barbara Moore.

Opal Maples visitors were Jeannie 
and Shayron Thompson, Carl, C.J. 
and Cynthia Squyres and Nieva 
Guerrero.

Kenneth Brusenahn visitors were 
Doris Harvey, Garland Morgan, 
David Coffman, Herman Estes, 
Dick Longbrake, Amanda Perry, 
Jeanette Brock, Nora Bursenhan, 
Doyle Evans, Ernest Brusenhan, 
Carmen Donham, Gladys Hunter 
and Vera Wise.

Nora JOnes was visited by Maudie 
Henderson, Eula Phillips, Wanda 
Hood, Bob and Carole Weaver, 
Floretta and Jean Jones.

nancy Menges was visited by Nan­
cy Bodine, Ann Spencer and 
granddaughter.

Sarah Bomar and Linda Childress 
visitors were Bonnie Weigan, Walter 
Bedell, Tom Duggins, Bob and 
Louise Gordon.

Mary May was visited by Ann 
Fuller, C. J. and Isla Thompson,

Woody and Tom Worthington, Mr. 
and Mrs. Perry Bourland.

Jim Daniel visitors were Dick 
Longbrake, Rev. Steve Ramsdell, 
Garland Morgan, Virgil Priddy and 
Eddie Jonas.

Jay McCoy was visited by Doris 
Harvey, Carmen Donham, Vera 
Wise, R. W. Balke, Clarence Hipp, 
Rose Pearce.

Nyla Sim m ons and Ursulla 
SHelley were visited by Vera Wise, 
Doris Harvey, Amanda Perry, 
D o r o th y , J im m y  an d  B eth  
Isenhower, Terest Gunner, Julian 
Kelley, Edmond McCarrell, Erin 
Day.

Annie Barrington visitors were 
LaVada Hubburd, Anna Maria and 
Lonzo Bahena and Johnny Harris.

Maude McCarrell visitors have 
been Grace Keinp, Edmond McCar­
rell, Stephanie Morgan, Gus Morgan 
and Edgar McCArrell.

Dona Estes was visited by Louise 
McClellan, Betty Day, James Estes, 
Grace Kemp, Bruce and Linda 
Estes.

Dave Shields visitors were Mary 
Shields, Kenneth and Betty Shields.

Debbie Strength visited Cecil 
Drake.

Thursday, April 25, 985

Emmie and Salon Seale visitors 
were Viola and William Hammett, 
Sharen Sartin and Ray Lile.

Bessie Thomas visitors were 
Laverne Simmons and Vera Wise.

Major Mulanax and Bud Evans 
visitors were Floyd Gilbreath, Doyle 
Evans, Daoris Aderholt and Ken­
neth Mulanax.

Mable Barrage visitors were l/)u 
Harvey, Bessie Parish, R. W. Balke, 
Imo Herring, Etheleen Stewart, 
Dorothy and Elgean Harris.

Beulah Hyden and Neil Mulanax 
were visited by Karen Shearer, Kate 
Cagle, Doris Aderholt, Kenneth 
Muianax, Mr. and Mrs. S. D. 
Conner.

Clarinda Menges spent the day 
Wednesday with Dorothy Alsobrook 
and Ivy Taylor.

continued on page 4
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Many o f us will be Working Outdoors, Around our 
Homes, with Electric Weed Trimmers,1 Edgers, Mowers and 
Other Electric Yard Equipment this Summer.

West Texas Utilities wants you to have a Safe and Enjoy­
able Summer while Working in your Yard. Please follow the 
few  Simple Safety Tips Outlined Below:

• K eep  electric c o rd s  clear o f  your 
w ork in g  area.

• D on ’t use electric toois ou td o o rs  if it 
is rainy o r  dam p.

• Protect y ou r  o u td o o r  outlets and 
wiring from  moisture.

• M ake sure your o u td o o r  electrical 
equ ipm ent is properly grounded , 
and the wiring is in g o o d  condition.

» K eep ladders or long-handled toois 
well away from  overh ead  wires.

■ D on't d ig  near buried electric wires.

PHONE NUMBER
Remember REDDY Supplies the energy 

but only YOU can use it safely!
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Vela Plante was visited by Perry 
and Ileta Bourland, Jack and Lillian 
Bourland and Bryan Bourland.

Lou Lyn Dunn was visited by 
Grace Kemp, Lynda and John Gord- 
ner, Norma Sutherland and family, 
Chester and Ora Belle McDaniel.

Ollie Estes visitors have been Her­
man and Edna Estes, Kenneth 
Estes, Lena Howard, and Grace 
Kemp.

We are sorry Ruby Blanton and 
Jimmy Watson are in the hospital. 
We hope they are well soon.

We are happy more are playing 42. 
We had four tables playing Monday 
afternoon. We appreciate Herman 
and Edna Estes helping with the 
games. REmember the time is from 
1:30 to 3:00 p.m. each Monday.

Benefit team  
roping fo r 
Boy's Ranch

The Coleman Rodeo Association is 
sponsoring a team steer roping, Sun­
day, April 28, to benefit West Texas 
Boys Ranch. The roping, limited to 
“ B”  class ropers, will begin at 1 
p.m. at the Coleman County Arena 
in Coleman, Texas.

The books for the event open at 
noon. Teams may enter for $30 for 
three steers, progressive after one.

Aside from sharing in the event’s 
proceeds, West Texas Boys Ranch 
will also operate the concession 
stand on the grounds.

For more information contact 
Charles Coats at (S15) 625-2056.

P loy Boll i Lady Mountaineers

The Santa Anna Orioles Senior 
League team kicks off the 1885 
baseball season this Friday night In 
Coleman at 7 PM against the Col­
eman Cubs.

The Orioles have T players back 
from last years team. They are Bob­
by Pritchard, James Hartman, Rob- 
by Pritchard ,Lynn Kellar, Kollin 
Gunter, Ceasar Padilla, and Doug 
Taylor.

Newcomers to the team are 
Hubert Jackson, Alonzo Hernandez,

Bryon Dowdy, Dennis Absher, Toby 
Absher, Jody Patterson, James 
Perry, Chuck Brown, and Rusty 
Bryce.

Eddie Hartman is managing the 
Orioles an coaches are Danny Kellar 
and Galen Prlvitt.

Everyone is encouraged to come 
out and watch these young men play 
ball. Games played in Santa Anna 
this year will be played under the 
lights for the first time in many 
years.

Henderson Funeral Homes
Catenas ' People V§m Care' Irate Amu 
625-212? 348-3131

Offering At Your Request
Pm-Amit§@f£ FwwMs

funeral Insurance and Counseling
Ambukmce Sm w (

School menu
Monday, April 29 
Burritos 
Buttered com 
Tossed salad 
Brownies
Milk >

Tuesday, April 30
Chicken Fried steak with gravey
Cream potatoes
Lima beans 
Hot roUs 
Oranges 
Milk

Wednesday, May 1 
Western Burgers 
Pinto beans 
Salad
Puddin Pops 
Milk

Thursday, May 2 
Bar B Que on a bun 
Pickle relish 
French Fries 
Salad
G raham  cra ck e rs  w ith  m a r­
shmallow creme 
milk

The Santa Anna High School girls 
track team traveled to Iron County 
for the 15-A district track meet. The 
Girls track team which consists of 
Irma Castillo, Diana Castillo, mary 
Castillo, Carmen Banda, Tammy 
Radicke, Melissa Buse, bccky 
Lewis, and Shanna Hensley had an 
outstanding meet with 37 points.

Irma Castillo started the scoring 
with a 15:22.00 in the 3200 meter run 
that was good enough for fifth place.

Melissa Buse had her best jump of 
the year in the triple jump. She 
jumped 31’9% "  which enabled her 
to capture the 3rd place medal.

The 400 meter relay team (Becky 
Lewis, Melissa Buse, Diana Castillo, 
Shanna Hensley) cut 2 seconds off 
their best time of the year to capture 
third with a time of 53:33.

Diana Castillo then picked up the 
scoring for the Lady Mountaineers 
with a time of 2:52.85 in the 800 
meter which was good enough for 
5th place.

Rosa Castillo threw the discus 82’ 
8”  to capture the 6th place ribbon.

Becky Lewis, who had been work­

ing out extra hours with hurdle 
coach Dale Freeman, turned in her 
best time of the year in the 100m 
hurdles. She ran 16.43 sec. to capture 
4th.

Shanna Hensley, who had been 
plagued with many injuries this year 
and was involved in a car wreck just 
two weeks prior to the meet, ran her 
best race of the year. She was just 
nosed out of 2nd place and finished in 
third with a time of 65.79 sec.

Irma Castillo then came back to 
pick up more points in the 1600 m. 
She ran 7:13.20 to take 4th place.

Coach Joe Young said that he 
would like to thank all of the people 
who came to Irion County to support 
the team. He would especially like to 
thank Dale Freeman for his help this 
year in coaching the girls.He stated 
that he really appreciated the girls 
for their fine effort and for their 
dedication during this track season.

The followinf people earned letters 
by scoring at the district meet: 
Diana Castillo, Rosa Castillo, Shan­
na Hensley, Irma Castillo, Melissa 
Buse, and Becky Lewis.

You con bunk any time 

when you bank by m ail.

AH Types of Snving| Accounts

First Coleman Sferfissaf Bank
Member F.D.I.C.

“ Always Wining • 
Always Prepared’ '

Yew
Good Neighbor 1

We Sponsor T W  Nows'EacSi Day 
At 12.30 Over KSTA

Shower for

Brenda White
Miss Brenda White, bride-elect of 

Chad Malm of Texas City, will be 
honored with a bridal shower on 
Saturday, April 27, at the Christian 
Life Center of First Baptist Church. 
The party will be from 7 - 9 p.m. and 
al friends and relatives are invited 
to attend.

Miss White and her fiance will be 
married in Texas City on Saturday, 
May 11.

Hostesses for the party Saturday 
will be Kim Head, Lori Smith, Elvia 
Salazar, Karen Langley and Rober­
ta Tomlinson.

School
calendar

Upcoming events on the school 
calender a r e ;
Friday, April 26- Jr.High and 
elementary District Literary Meet 
in Santa Anna.

Fannie's
Funnies

By Fannie Gilbert

Adult- A person who has stopped 
growing at both ends and has started 
growing in the middle.

Saturday,April 27- State UIL 
Literary Meet in Austin, with Moni­
que Spillman competing.

Also on Saturday the Band will 
make their annual trip to Six Flags.

Birthday- Observed only by men and 
children.
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Santa Anna
Merchants....

Are You Ready For 
The Fuutier Day 
Sidewalk SqJe ?

The Santa Anna News

WjJJ Punish The Flintier Day 
TaijJoid 9 Thur.9May 2nd

Let6s Make Flintier Day 1985 
A Success!

For Advertising Information Cq|] 
Santa Anna News

May 2 and 3 - Regional Tennis in 
Abilene, with Chris DeLeon' and 
Doug Wamock competing.

R'Wdod Baptist 

Women meet
Tlie women of the Rockwood Bap­

tist Church met in the home Mrs. 
Mary Emerson, Monday morning in 
a study of ‘Missions and Organiza­
tions’ , dwelling espicially on early 
history of the organizations.

Sadie Bryan led the discussion 
assisted by La Nella Brushenham, 
Lillie Box, Coleta Pearson, Ella 
Gray, and the hostess, Mary Emer­
son.

A social meeting will be held Mon­
day, May 6.

Advice- The one thing which is more' 
blessed to give than to receive’ .

Alimony- When two people make a 
mistake and one continues to pay for 
it.

Dachsund- Half a dog high and a dog 
and a half long.

Echo- The only thing that can cheat 
a woman out of the last word.

Neighbor- One who knows more 
about your affairs than you do.

Self made man- A horrible example 
of unskilled labor.

if 348-3545

Tips- Wages we pay other people’s 
hired help.

Yawn- The only time some married 
men get to open their mouths.

Bachelor- A man who never makes 
the same mistake once.

B aseball
F riday
The Orioles and Cubs play at 7:00 

PM Friday evening at the Coleman 
Little league fields.

The Mets and Dodgers will play 
the same evening at 8:00, also at 
Coleman.

Deal Ad-District 
Band
Junction was the site for the Jr. 

High All-District Band tryouts on 
April 19.

Belinda Deal of the Santa Anna Jr. 
High band qualified for the all­
district band. According to Eric 
Wharton, Santa Anna school band 
director, the district band was 
reduced in size from previous years 
to improve the quality of the Group’s 
concert performance.

The concert was held on Saturday 
, April 20 in Junction.

Honor Roll
Santa Anna High School honor roll 
for the fifth six weeks period.

Seniors 
Rosa Castillo 
John Morris 
Monique Spillman 
Doug Wamock 
Toni Yanci

Juniors

FATTEN PROFITS mwm
IQUAIITY
FEED!!!

K ee p in g  Them  Fit 
Is S e rio u s . Business 

Your Dealer....
ALDERMAN CAVE FEED 
, PURINA PET CHOW

i
j White Feed 3- Wa> dross Grazer

, 13.50 P«*r hundredtntroducing-
Gqldeii Victory 100,lbs. $44 

. Hazer IOO,lbs. $17

WE FEATURE A FULL LINE 
OF GARDEN SEEDS

M  ff§m  Of teg® Q m m  AvuMle

Santa A nna Seed C i
Your Browning Seed Denier'

24 Hrs. 3483143 
'■■■■ SMft:

Jeanene Jones 
Michelle Malone 
Alys Pelton

Sophomores

Melissa Buse 
Irma Castillo 
Sonny Guthrie 
Jeannie Langford 
Freshmen 

'■Jeremy Hartman

Santa Anna Elementary School 
Honor Roll

Eigth GSt3F!~
Rhonda Fleeman 
James Hartman 
Holly Hoffman 
Reece Mclver 
Rachel Phillips 
Laurie Powers 

Seventh Grade 
Scotty Anderson 
Chad Davis 
Robert Duus

Sixth Grade 
Jeffrey Hartman 
Chris Simmons 
Fifth Grade 
Troy Abernathy 
Lori Castillo 

- Jason Dean 
Lori Diaz 
Sam McCrary 
Grady Mclver 
Carrie Myers 
Chares Makuta 
Netza Siller 
Tommy Williford 
Fourth Grade

Nathan Barnett 
Julie Dean 
A dd DeLeon 

* Rusty Fleeman 
Mika Gore 
Benny Guerrero 
ChereeHalmon 
Brandi Homer 
Alissa McGee 
Betsy M dver 
Michelle Osbum 
Jeannie Patterson 
Laurie Yasquez 
Stephanie Williams
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CLEVELAND

This coming Sat. night will be the 
Cleveland community get together. 
Hostess will be Mrs. Doris Kelly, 
Mrs. Bea Cupps. Start around 7 Pm. 
Bring tables and d< ninoes. All are 
invited.

The C.E. Wise visitors were the 
Adolph Kellys, Mrs. Ruby Stephen­
son,Mr. and Mrs. Travis Smith, 
Laura and Nancy Hendry of San 
Angelo, and Vera Wise.

Thursday, The Richard Smiths of 
Fort Worth, Gail and Tery Flemm­
ing and children, Phillis Dillard, Fri­
day Morn., Charlie Flemming 
visited. Sunday Eddie and Phillis 
and Max and Donna zmopson & 
Jason all visited Mrs. Buelah Flem­
ing and Margie.

Sunday Visitors in the home of the 
Ed Hartmans for a fish fry were 
R.D. and Doris Penny of Robert Lee 
, Odell and Re Box of Brady, Pete 
and Iona Moore, The Buck Mills and 
Lousie Moore.

Those visiting Iona Moore Thurs­
day were Louise Moore, Velda Mills 
and Ruby Hartman. Iona visited 
Dalton Sikes of Bangs Friday.

Amber Huggins spent Friday 
night with her grandparents, The 
Lee Ray Huggins.

Gladys Haynes visited with the 
E m il W illiam s M onday. Inez 
Guthrie and Author Tucker visited 
Wednesday.

Ovella Williams visited Thursday, 
and Mrs. Eppie Lowry dropped by 
Wednesday..

George and Gredie Haynes annd 
Mourine Blair of Coleman visited 
the B en jy  A llisons Tuesday. 
Maurine and Willie Blair of Coleman 
visited agian Wednesday and again 
Friday.

Jennifer and Juanita Naron went 
up to Merkel to visit the J. T. Narons 
Saturday.

Chrystal spent Thursday night 
with her grandparents, The A. C. 
Pierces. Lou visited a couple of 
times last week with Cindy Pelton 
and Girls.

Kayla Lowry spent Wednesday 
with her grandparents, The Dick 
Baughs Carmilla took her home and 
visited with her mother, Mrs. Mae 
Flores. Saturday the Dick Baughs 
went to Teague, Texas and came 
back Sunday. They visited the Jim­
my Reids.

Thursday night, The Cecil Ellis 
visited the Jerry Ellis and family. 
They also had supper with them. 
Grace Ellis visited the Cecil Ellis 
Saturday night.

Sunday, Ruby Howard visited 
Lora Russell also R. D. and Doris 
Penney of Robert Lee visited awhile 
Sunday evening. John and Ronnie 
Russell and family of Brady spent 
Saturday evening with his mother, 
Mrs. Lora Russell.

Mrs. Ruby Howard and Bessie 
Parish went to Zephyr and visited
the Tom Howards.

Kasha Donn Cupps of Coleman
spent the weekend with her daddy, 
Billy Cupps. She also visited the R. 
W. Cupps.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Lowry spent 
Tuesday with Kayla Lowry at 
Bangs.

Mrs. Florence Starnes visited 
Mrs. Winnie Haynes Tuesday even­
ing. Winnie visited Florence Sunday 
evening. Grace also visited Winnie 
Sunday evening.

Royce Cupps of Stephonville 
visited his dad, Virgil Cupps over the 
weekend. Uncle Emil and Aunt 
Helen William visited Virgil Sunday 
night.I visited him a while Monday 
morning. Louise and Judy called on 
him Sunday.

Uncle Emil and Helen Williams 
visited Friday evening with the 
Charlie Flemings. Virgil Cupps 
dropped by Thursday evening. Mrs. 
Beaulah Fleming and Margie visited 
Monday morning to look at Thelma’s 
roses. Charlie and Thelma visited in 
Bangs Saturday with the Kenneth 
Sikes and Roger.

Recent visitors in home of The C. 
E. Wise were Jerry Lovelace, Mike 
Richards, Sharon, Shannon, Tallion 
Taylor of Abilene, Jimmy and Toni 
Lovelace of Pecos, Emmit and 
Margaret Simmons and children, 
Ruby Stephenson, Adolph and Doris 
Kelley, Coy Cavitt and Gladys 
Haynes.

Annie Laura York, Buraice Bat­
tles, Gladys Haynes, Joey Cupps, 
are the ones visiting in the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. L. V. Cupps last week.

Mary Jackson and Wesley of San 
Angelo visited her mother, Mrs. 
Tavy Ford Saturday morning. They 
went to Brownwood to visit Peggy 
Lancaster and family Saturday 
evening.

Mr. and Mrs. Clyde Davenport 
went to Brownwood Monday morn­
ing to visit Mrs. Mary Boenicke, Mr. 
Albert cole. Visitors with the Clyde 
Davenports Sunday aftemon were 
Albert and Alma Davenport of 
Coleman.

We have committed the Golden 
Rule to memory let us now mommit 
it to life.

Funtier
f e y

Olympics
Activities and events for children 

during Santa Anna's May 4 Funtier 
Day will include track and field 
events. Young people of United 
Methodist Church are sponsoring 
the Funtier Olympics for all area 
children aged four to twelve.

Children in third and fourth 
grades will compete in one category, 
and the top division will be for those 
from fifth and sixth grades. These 
events are softball throw, chinning, 
long jump, wheelbarrow race, horse 
and rider, 50-yard and 75-yard relay 
and dash.

Coleman County children have 
traditionally taken part in a county­
wide track meet in Coleman, but 
that was discontinued due to conflict 
with UIL regulations. The Santa An­
na event has no connection with the 
school and is open to everyone.

For more information, contact the 
directors or call United Methodist 
Church in Santa Anna.

E v e n ts  fo r  c h ild re n  fro m  
kindergarten through second grade 
are tow sack race, 25-yard dash, and 
25-yard relay.

The contests will be held at the 
school campus starting at 4:30. Com­
petition will be in three age divisions 
in addition to a 25-yard dash for pre­
school children. Ribbons will be 
awarded winners in each event.

Daria Beal and Orabeth Mclver 
are directing the meet, assisted by 
members of the church group. Entry 
blanks are being distributed at the 
Santa Anna school and will also be 
available prior to the events and 
during the day at the Funtier Day 
site in downtown Santa Anna. There 
will be a fee of fifty cents for each 
entry and no limit to the number of 
events a child may enter.

Microwave Oven 
Cooking School

iO<
«  l, 

@ 1 f  9

Learn to cook meats, vegetables 
and desserts in the microwave oven.

presented by your 
WTO Electric 

Living Consultant

Please com e for FREE instruction, 
tasting and questions.

lim e : 7:00 pm
Dote: Thursday,May 2,1985
Place: WTO Local Office, Santa Anna, Texas

Pteite w ! ym r  locci' WTO-efffliw .for reienrittefis ' "
• (915) 348-3101

, Please cafl your fees! WTO mMee far rmegvsMmtm*

Opportunities
Federal, State, & Civil Jobs 
now available in your area. 
Call 1-819-5!)9-8304 for info. 
24 hrs.
T-26038-I5-17

WANTED: Dog Catcher, 
male or female apply at Ci­
ty Hail in Santa Anna for 
more information. 
025972-05-tf

Real Estate

HOUSES FOR SALE: Low 
down payments and low 
monthly payments. Owner 
financed. Call 348-3122. 
C-25951-03-tf

14 x 70 ft. Trailer Home. 
$2,000 down and take up 
payments of $189.00 a 
month. Charles Benge 
348-3418.
B-26055-17-18

FOR SALE BY OWNER: 3 
bedroom, 2 bath, built-ins, 
central heat and air. 2 
years old on two fenced 
acres at edge of Santa An­
na. Has city water. 348-3349 
H-26054-17-21

Automotive

C a d illa cs , M e rc e d e s , 
Porsche, etc direct form 
Government. Seized in 
drug raids. Available your 
area. Save $thousands$. 
216-453-3000, ext. 1193. 
U-26045-16-17

Automotive
FOR SALE: 1976 Mercury 
Marquis-good condition. 
$1795.00. Call 643-3339 after 
5:00.
H-25983-07-tf \

A.
Miscellaneous

S L I G II T / P  A I N T 
DAMAGE. New flashing 
arrow sign. $ll49 complete, 
free bulbs, tubes! Four left. 
C a l l  i m m e d i a t e l y ,  
l-(800)423-0163 anytime. 
(Not repossessed). 
H-26053-17-17

Booths available for Fun­
tier Days, May 4. Arts and 
Crafts-Food-etc. Call Susie 
Voss 348-3373 
C-26050-16-tf

Funtier Days Pet Show, Ice 
Cream Freeze-Off, Beauty 
Pageant, and Break Dance 
entry forms available at G 
& E Hardware, Glenda’s 
Beauty Shop and West 
Texas Utilities.
C-26051-16-tf

Reduce excess body fluids 
and lose weight fast, take 
E-V ap “ W ater P il ls ’ ’ 
Phillips Drug.
G-26056-17-18

MARTIN MEMORIALS 
2500 South Commercial, 
Coleman, Texas 76834. 
Quality monuments at 
reasonable prices. 625-4927 
or 625-3313. N ig h t s :  
625-2438.
M-27378-27-tf

Miscellaneous

Channel Catfish fingerlings 
and Fathead minnows rais­
ed in Coleman County. 
Caught after you place 
your order. 625-5746. 
J-28035-15-17

NEW AND USED Fur­
niture, antiques, at Travis 
Trading Post, 402 N. Col­
orado, Coleman. We’re a U- 
haul dealer, too. 
T-27279-35-tf

Garage Sale
GIANT 3-FAMILY YARD 
SALE-Saturday, 27. Tools; 
b o o k s ;  f u r n i t u r e ;  
aquariums; toys; stuffed 
animals; infant, toddler, 
teen, and adult clothing; 
and lots of misc. Priced 
cheap. No sales before 9 
a.m. 10(® Ave. B. 
T-26059-17-17

GARAGE SALE: Satur­
day, April 27-8 a.m. 906 
Wallis Ave. Small camper, 
77 Luv pick-up, clothes, 
stereo, and lots of misc. 
L-26058-17-17

For Rent
HOUSES FOR RENT:
306 4th St.—$125.00 
308 2nd St-$95.00 
Santa Fe St at 7th—$75.00 
Deposit required.
348-3122 or 348-3226. 
C-25952-03-tf
FOR RENT on Ave. C-IVi 
b ed room  $100. Smal l  
deposit. Call 348-9140 or 
mornings call Tradewinds 
625-5859 and ask for Kay. 
T-28052-17-17

Services
I w i l l  l i a u  I 
(915)348-3831.  
Morgan.
M m im m ,

h a y  
G. E .

PAUL'S CARPENTRY 
AND W O O D C R A F T - -  
Additions, remodeling,  
c a b i n e t s ,  e t c .  F r e e  
e s t i m a t e s .  C a l l  
915-348-3260.
P-:
O v e r a l l - M o m s  Home 
Health Department offers 
skilled nursing services 
and aide services for the 
Medicare-Medicaid patient 
under the direct supervi­
sion of your physician. For 
more information, contact 
either your doctor or our of­
fice at 625-2135.
H-25962-04-tf
Roofing and hay hauling. 
Richard Brannon, 348-9164 
after 6 pm.
B-26043-15-19

M & P Custom Hay Baling 
Contact Billy McCrary 
348-3327 or Jerry Phillips 
348-3834 before 8:00 a.m. 
and after 6:00 p.m. No job 
is too small.
M jm i-m L .......... ..........

Card of Thanks
I would like to thank all my 
friends that called, visited, 
sent cards and flowers 
while in the hospital and at 
home. May God Bless You. 
Dorothy Harris 
H-26061-17-17
Tomyalranymous friend"..
Thank you so much for the 
beautiful flowers. You’ll 
never know just how much 
they meant to me.
Love ya,
Paula B-26060-17-17
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ROCKWOOO
B y M ®

Troy Fowler of Arlington and Kiky 
Bickley of Mansfield spent Saturday 
and Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. Bert 
Fowler, visiting and doing some 
limiting.

Mrs. W. B. McCutcheon spent last 
week in San Antonio with a grand­
son, while his parents had to he 
away. Sunday afternoon visitors 
with Mrs. McCutcheon were Calvin 
Feagle of Houston, Thurman McCut­
cheon of Fife, a niece, Billie Ruth 
Isaacs of E ldorado, and her 
daughter, Linda Crouch of Marble 
Falls and Mrs. W. L. McCutcheon 
enroute to San Antonio from 
Abilene.

Garland McSwain of Dallas spent 
Sunday to Thursday with his 
parents, Dorothy and Aubrey McS­
wain; Monday Dorothy and Garland 
were shopping in Brownwood and 
visited B. A. McSwain. Visitors with 
the McSwains were Mrs. Sammie 
McCreary of Santa Anna Thursday 
morning, Saturday afternoon Mar­
cus Johnson and his guest, his sister, 
Marguerite Carter of Abilene were 
visitors.

Mr. and Mrs. Greeg Mobley of 
Pflugerville spent the weekend with 
his mother, Oleta Mobley.

Mr. and Mrs. Jody Brusenhan and 
Jennifer of Converse, David Cornett 
of Rising Star visited Mrs. Mary 
Emerson Sunday afternoon; other 
callers were Mr. and Mrs. Junior 
Brusenhan, Ella Gray and Lillie 
Box.

Mrs. Emerson spent Sunday with 
the Brusenhan family; Mr. and Mrs. 
Jody Brusenhan and David Cornett 
visited in afternoon.

Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Esslinger 
and children, Ryndal, Burt and Tony 
of Kerrville spent the weekend with 
Tony and Wade Rehm.

Marion Aldridge of Cameron 
visited Wednesday to Friday with 
M r. and Mrs.  Jack  Cooper .  
Elizabeth Allen and roommate, 
Sarah, of Tarleton State University 
were  Fr iday  guests .  Marion 
Aldridge, Alma Wright of Chilton, 
Mr. and Mrs. Denver Ellis, Mr. and 
Mrs. Johnnie Steward and Mr. and 
Mrs. Elec Cooper were Friday sup­
per guests.

Saturday afternoon visitors were 
Mr. and Mrs. Arlen Allen and Wes of 
Temple, Mr. and Mrs. Elec Cooper 
and Mr. and Mrs. Ronnie Cooper and 
family.

Mrs. Sadie Bryan spent Wednes­
day in Brady visiting Mr. and Mrs. 
P. L,. Ulstad and Mrs. Arlue Davis. 
Saturday supper guests were Mr. 
and Mrs. Charles Greenlee and 
Jason and Mr. and Mrs. Homer 
Greenlee of Coleman and three 
friends of Wichita Falls. The P. L. 
Ulstads of Brady visited Sunday.

Callers with Lillie Box were Jane 
Wise, Wilma Williams, Angie Her­
nandez, and Nell Brusenhan; phone 
visits were with Carl Harkey in 
California, Mavis Campbell and 
Johnny Pat Campbell of Ft. Worth.

Among those attending the Spring 
Fling at Lake Brownwood last week 
were Oleta Mobley , Pebble Ellis, 
Alma Wright and Wilma Williams.

Visiting Sunday afternoon with 
Jane Wise were Dr. and Mrs. Wes 
Wise,  G e y e r  and Hil ton of  
Brownwood; Jaiie had a phone visit 
with Kelly.

Billy and Emily Maness of 
Brownwood visited Linnie Box Sun­
day afternoon.

Joe Ed Wise had Saturday 
breakfast with his parents, Joe and 
Faye Wise. They were Sunday sup­
per guests of the Joe Ed Wise family 
in Santa Anna.

Marguerite Carter of Abilene 
visited her brother, Marcus Johnson 
Saturday.

B e t t y  D u u s , R o c k  w o o d  
Postmaster was in Waco last 
w eekend attending a Postal  
meeting. ,

Ethel and Olin Horton of Andrews 
spent Saturday night with her 
parents, Johnnie and Geneva 
Steward; Billy and Emily Maness of 
B r o w n w o o d  v i s i t e d  S u n da y  
afternoon.

Lois Haines was Sunday luncheon 
guest of Jewil Lee.

Mr. and Mrs. Ronnie Cooper and 
family spent Saturday night with his 
parents, The Elec Coopers, Mr. and 
Mrs. Denny Densman of Brady join­
ed them for a Sunday fish fry.

Herman and Edna Estes visited 
Sam and Myrtle Estes Wednesday 
afternoon; Herman and Kenneth 
Estes visited again Saturday 
afternoon.

Lillie Box was Wednesday dinner 
guest of Mr. and Mrs. R. J. Deal; 
Thursday visitor was Mrs. Terry 
Thomason of Brownwood; Mr. and 
Mrs. Deal visited at Holiday Hill in 
Coleman Friday with her sister, 
Norine Winstead.

Mrs. Jim Rutherford was in 
Brownwood Wednesday, visiting 
Mr. and Mrs. Dan Slate and 
children. Troy, Tim and Tony Aber­
nathy spent Friday with the Ruther­
fords. Jennifer Rutherford and Cin­
dy Cozart of San Angelo spent the 
weekend with the Rutherfords.

The Rockwod Quilting Club meets 
each Thursday; last week as they 
were working Sadie Bryan and Lin­
nie Box walked in, while the 
members were all offering a thimble 
to Linnie Box, Lillie Box went to the 
piano and the group sang Happy Bir­
thday, Dear Jane, and Sadie invited 
the group to birthday cake and 
homemade ice cream, a very big 
surprise to Jane.

Present were Lillie Box, Sadie 
Bryan, Skeeta Coooper, Anita 
Milligan, whose quilt they were com­
pleting, Fredna Scarborough, Berna 
Fowler, Linnie Box, Ella Gray, Vi­
vian Steward and the honoree, Jane 
Wise.

WICKMM
By Mix  0. ft.

Written by Mrs. J.E. York for 
Mrs. O.R. Boenicke.

I’m sorry to report that Mrs. 
Boenicke is ill and has been in the 
Brownwood Regional Hospital for 
several days. I understand that she 
will go to a rest home in Bangs for a 
few weeks. I hope she will be up and 
around soon.

Our community was blessed with 
a good rain Saturday night. Our 
guage measured one and four tenths 
inches here. Others received more 
or less.

The 84 party was held at Mr. and 
Mrs. Rankin Mclver’s the past 
Thursday night with twenty present.

Mrs. Irene Mclver Durham of Col­
eman visited Tuesday afternoon 
with Mrs. Carrie Stacy and on Satur­
day Mrs. Alice Wells, Mrs. Barbara 
Kirkpatrick, and two girls along 
with Mrs. Florence Stearns visited 
her.

Mr. Pat Steams and Mr. Grady 
James of Fort Worth visited Mr. and 
Mrs. G.K. Steams on Saturday.

Mrs. Irene Haynes and six other 
ladies from Hermleigh spent the 
weekend here on the Haynes farm. 
They were out looking at the 
bluebonnets, as they don’t have 
them out there. All reported a ball, 
seeing new country and camping 
out,

Mrs. Alice Wells and two gran- 
daughters Amber and Jennifer 
Kirkpatrick of Coleman spent Fri­
day night with her mother, Mrs. 
Florence Steams. Mrs. Barbara 
Kirkpatrick and Mrs. Greg Wells 
and baby joined the group on Satur­
day. The ladies were doing some

H a rtm a n
would like to 

thank-you for your
leadership and support 

during your 
administration.

The Employees Of 
The Oty Of Santa Anna

work around the house.
Twenty people met at the com­

munity center Friday Night for sup­
per and 84.

Mr .and Mrs. Rodney Guthrie and 
baby, Michael, of Rockwood, spent 
the weekend with his parents and 
brother, Mrs. and Mrs. John 
Dockery and Wesley.

Mr. and Mrs. Ray McSwain of 
Hico spent Saturday afternoon and 
night with her parents, Mrs. and 
Mrs. J.H. Martin. On Saturday, 
Mr.and Mrs. Martin and Mrs. 
Russie James and Mrs. Lyndell 
Moore all had lunch with Mrs. 
Yvette Cole in Brownwood.

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Cole of Bangs, 
Eugenia Mclver,and Mrs. John 
Dochery and Wesley visited on Fri­
day with Mr. amd Mrs. J. E. York. 
Mr. York returned home on Tuesday 
from a four week stay in the V.A. 
hospital at Kerville with a bout of 
pneumonia. I’m proud to report that 
he is feeling better and says to thank 
you for the prayers, cards and con­
cern shown him at this time.

Mr. and Mrs. Virgil Dockery and 
Mrs. Maria P r ia  of Port Worth, the 
Elmer Woods of Bangs, Mrs. John 
Dockery and wesley and the Rodney 
Guthries and baby had lunch Satur­
day with Mrs. Lou Vaughn. Ilene 
Haynes and friends ate lunch with 
her Sunday and afternoon visitors 
were Mrs. Byrdie miller, Russie 
James, Toberta McShan and Erica, 
and Mrs. Moore. ,■

D aniel Circle 
Meets

The Nitia Daniell Circle of the 
First United Methodist Church met 
at 7 PM on Monday evening at the 
annex of the church.

Coyita Bowker presided during 
the business session. Main item on 
the agenda was the discussing of 
plans for the Sealy Hospital Nurses 
Reunion to be catered in May. Com­
mittees were appointed.

Carmilla Baugh was at the piano 
for the group singing. Thelma Up­
church directed the program, ‘Must

Stevens Funeral Home
Since 1889

Member By Invitation Of National 
Selected Morticians'

400 Vtest Pecan 625-2175

we have enemies?’, opening with 
prayer, scripture reading, and clos­
ing with prayer.

Hostesses Carmilla Baugh and 
Lucille Dean served refreshments to 
Coyita Bowker, Margaret Crews, 
Thelma Upchurch, Hettie Scar­
borough, Glayds Hunter, Pauline 
Eubank, Martha Thompson, and 
Lois Avants._________ _______________

Dallas attorney uuitli Williams, 
elected to the Texas House of 
Representatives in 1922, was the first 
woman to serve in that capacity. 
Although she served only one term, 
she was also the first woman to 
preside as Speaker of the House. In 
1924. and 1926 she ran unsuccessfully 
for governor.

mm

Carmen

honored
Twenty-eight friends and relatives 

surprised Mrs. Carmen Donham on 
her birthday last Thursday, com­
plete with personalized birthday 
cake with candles depicting 60?. All 
of her children , grandchildren, and 
great grandchildren were present 
with the exception of her son Larry 
and Mary Donham of Andrews. A 
special guest was Mrs. Faye Caudell 
of Elk City, Oklahoma, maternal 
aunt of Mrs. Donham

Happy

Birthday
Glenn

( April 29 th )

With Love,
From Laura, Zackary,Johnie, 

Mom ,Dad, Undo, 8<Po

REPORT OF CONDITION
Consolidating domestic and foreign subsidiaries of the

SANTA ANNA NATIONAL BANK SANTA ANNA

In the state o f.

Namsol Bwih 
TEXAS , at the close of business o n .

C4tv
MARCH 31 , 1985

published in response to call made by Comptroller of the Currency, under title 12, United States Code, Section 161. 
Charter Number 1 3 8 j'!> Comptroller of the Currency________________ .._____________________District

Statement of Resources and Liabilities

Cash and balances due from depository institutions

E
S

Thousands o f dollars

8
E

i
□

Noninterest-bearing balances and currency and coin............................................... 584
Interest-bearing balances.............................................................................. .............. 850

Securities.............................................................. ......................  . . 4,778.
Federal funds sold and securities purchased under agreements to resell in domestic offices
of the bank and of its Edge and Agreement subsidiaries, and in IBFs ...........
Loans and lease financing receivables:

450 J
Loans and leases, net of unearned income...................................................... 9,241
LESS: Allowance for loan and lease losses.................................................... 100
LESS: Allocated transfer risk reserve............................................................... 0
Loans and leases, net of unearned income,
allowance, and reserve...................................................................... 9,141

Assets held in tradinq accounts...........  ............................................. 0
Premises and fixed assets (including capitalized leases).............................................................. 43
Other real estate owned................................................................... --------------n —

Investments in unconsolidated subsidiaries and associated com panies............... ---------------- 0--
Customers* liability to this bank on acceptances outstanding.................. ..............................................

----------------JJ— ■

Intangible assets ............... .......; .............. ............................... . . . 0
Other assets .................. ...........................................................; . . . ...................... , 504
Total asse ts ........................................................................................ 16,371

Deposits:
In domestic offices........................ ..................................................................... 1 1

Noninterest-bearing.......................................................................... ................ J 3,040
Interest-bearing............................................................................................... j .12,134

In foreign offices, Edge and Agreement subsidiaries, and IBFs
............s 0 |

Noninterest-bearing................................... ........................................................ 0
interest-bearing.................................................................................................. 0

Federal funds purchased and securities sold under agreements to repurchasie in domestic
offices of the bank and of its Edge and Agreement subsidiaries, and in IBFs 
Demand notes issued to the U S . Treasury............................................. ...........

0
0

Other borrowed m oney............................................................................
Mortgage indebtedness and obligations under capitalized leases .
Bank's liability on acceptances executed and outstanding.............
Notes and debentures subordinated to deposits...............................
Other liabilities . ......................................................................................
Total liabilities..........................................................................................
Umited-lile preferred stock....................................................................

0
0
0

“nnr
15,330

0

I

3
h

§

Perpetual preferred stock.................................................................
Common s to ck ...................................................................... .............
Surplus.............................................................................................. .
Undivided profits and capital reserves..........................................
Cumulative foreign currency translation adjustments.................
Total equity capital........................ ........................................ ..........
Total liabilities, limited-life preferred stock, and equity cap ital.

50
200
791

U N I16,371

We, the undersigned directors, attest to the correctness of 
this statement of resources end liabilities. We declare that It 
has been examined by us, and to the best of our hnowtedga 
end belief has bean prepared in conformance with the 
Instructions and ia true and correct.

C. Stephen Cullins

Cashier
w *

i-V - V .

of me above-named bank do hereby declare that this Report 
of Condition is  true end correct to the beat of my knowledge 
end M M .

Dtreetora

t . .)v ,


