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Postal rates are increasing 
November 1, with first class 
postage getting the second 
increase this year. Postage for the 
first ounce will be 20 cents 
starting Sunday. In March the 
rate was increased from IS to 18 
cents.
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Saturday is Halloween, and 

little spooks and goblins will be 
out to 'trick or treat' in town.

Everyone is advised to drive 
with caution as the children are 
on the streets, and parents are 
encouraged to dress their little 
goblins so that they may be seen 
after dark.

The Junior Class is having a 
special event that evening, and it 
would be a fine place to entertain 
children, rather than out and 
about town!

More Rainfall

In Community

Santa Anna has received more 
rainfall during the past week. 
R. W. Balke, rain reporter, 
recorded 1.60 inches Wednesday 
and Thursday.

The rainfall last week brought 
to 6.5 inches the official measure­
ment in Santa Anna.

Garbage Pick-up '
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CHEERING FOR THE MOUNTAINEERS— Wetsel, Holly Smith, Julie Jones, Jill Watts
Santa Anna High School Cheerleaders are shown (mascot) and Janis Weathers.
at a recent game. They are, from left, Karen (Photo by John Russell)

Proposed Amendments On BallotTuesday

SDA Children 
Plan Collection

Thursday evening, between 
5:30 and 6:30 p.m ., students from 
the Seventh-day Adventist School 
will be gathering canned goods 
donations so they can make food 
baskets to be distributed at 
Thanksgiving and Christmas to 
families in need.

This is an annual tradition 
which Adventist children all 
through the United States part­
icipate in every year instead of 
(trick or treating.) In this way 
they provide a more bountiful 
Thanksgiving or Christmas for 
someone, and every donation will 
be appreciated.

Band Boosters 
Slate Meeting

The B^nd Booster Club will 
meet Tuesday, November 3, at 
the Band Hajl at 7 p.m. A report 
will be given on the Homecoming 
luncheon, and it is important that 
all band parents be present.

Local people are reminded that 
the toboggans and scarf sets are 
still on sale as a fund-raising 
project of the group.

City Sales Tax 

Shows Increase
The City o f Santa Anna has 

received a payment of $872.08 in 
City Sales Tax for the month 
ending October 9. The tax 
receipts for Santa Anna total 
$16,913.33 for the ten-month 
period of 1981, a substantial 33 
percent increase over the pre­
vious year.

The City Sales Tax is collected 
by local merchants with the State 
Sales Tax, then computed and 
returned to the city each month. 
The ten-month total in 1980 was 
$12,684.12.

Texas voters will go the. polls 
Tuesday, November 3, to vote on 
seven proposed constitutional 
amendments. The three most 
important proposals are those 
dealing with residential home­
stead exemptions, the creation of 
a water trust fund and state fiscal 
management.

Santa Anna voters will cast 
their ballots at the Coleman 
County Telephone Cooperative 
building from 7 a.m. to 7 p.m. 
Glen Copeland is election judge, 
with clerks to be Della Wristen, 
Udell Copeland, Montie Les 
Guthrie III, and Oma Dean 
Horner.

The proposed amendments, in 
order of appearance, are as 
follows:
1. Authorizing cities, towns and 
other taxing units to encourage 
the improvement, development, 
or redevelopment of certain areas 
through property tax relief and 
the issuance of bonds and notes.
2. Authorizing the Commissioner 
of the General Land Office to 
issue patents for certain public 
free school land held in good faith 
under color of title for at least 50 
years.
3. Allowing the legislature to 
grant to a state finance manage­
ment committee the power to

manage the expenditure o f 
certain appropriated funds.
4. Authorizing the use of a
portion of the excess revenues of 
the state for water development, 
waterjoaggfervation. water quality 
enhancement, and flood control 
purposes; authorizing the use of 
the state's credit, not to exceed 
$500 million, to guarantee the 
bonds of local governments in the 
financing of projects for such 
purposes; increasing the interest 
rate that may be paid on 
previously approved but unissued 
state bonds; and authorizing a 
program to retire state bonds . 
(See AMENDMENTS, Page 2)

Halloween Coronation, Carnival Saturday
Has Requirements

City Sanitation workers will 
be passing some local homes 
without picking up their garbage 
if certain regulations are not met.

Although the City now has a 
garbage truck in operation, all 
garbage and trash must be placed 
in cans, and if possible in plastic 
bags. No trash will be picked up 
from paper sacks or boxes.

City officials have also stated 
that the sanitation workers 
cannot go onto private property, 
so garbage cans must be placed at 
the edge of the street or alley 
before they can be emptied.

Junior Class To Sponsor Events 

At School Auditorium, Gymnasium

The Junior Class of Santa 
Anna High School is sponsoring 
the annual Halloween Coronation 
and Carnival Saturday , October 
31.

The coronation will be held at 
the school auditorium at 6:30 
p .m ., followed by the carnival at 
the old gymnasium.

The Halloween Queen will be 
announced during the coronation, 
with representatives from each 
class and organization at school. 
Nominees and their escorts are 
the following: Freshmen - -Janis

Weathers and Doug Wamock; 
Sophomores - Gayle McCrary and 
RodneV Guthrie; Juniors - Joan 
Collins and Tommy DeLeon; 
Seniors - Tessa Clauson and Brad 
Wardlow.

Others are Student Council • 
Cheryl M itchell and Junior 
Salazar; FHA • Casey Anderson 
and James Bass; FFA - Tana 
Watts and David Strickland; 
Librarians Club • Gay Hosch and 
Tony Culpepper; .Band - Julie 
Jones and Raymond Castillo; 
Annual Staff - Beth Rhoades and

Bodie Stark.
Elementary representatives are 

the following: First Grade •
Brandi Horner and Lanham Stark; 
Julie Dean and Fernando Jim- 
inez; Second Grade - Traci 
Dockery and Jason Dean; Carrie 
Myers and Troy Abernathy; Third 
Grade - Christi Morrow and Zane 
Keeney; Fourth Grade • Shannon 
Brown and Toby Goodwin; Selina 
Cook and Junior Garza; Fifth 
Grade - Holly Hoffman and Dan 
Dockery; Sixth Grade - Cynthia 
Garrett and Paul Anderson; 
Seventh Grade - Bertha Garza 
and David Garza; and Eighth 
Grade - Jeannine Jones and 
Wade Miller.

Crown bearers from the kinder­
garten class include Ingia Stark, 
Mitchell Guthrie, Kyra Neff, 
Brandon Crisp, Christi Zabel and 
Glen Donham.

During the carnival, there will 
be a concession stand and a 
spaghetti supper will be served.

Booths and activities will 
include a spook house, fortune 
telling, ring toss, fishing, bottle 
throw, putt-putt, frisbee throw, 
disco house, hay ride, bingo, 
basketball shoot, football throw, 
darts, bucking bull, a cake walk, 
and others.

Everyone in the community is 
invited to attend the event 
Saturday night.
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Retires From N-Guard
Charles Wristen, a Santa 

Anna native, was one o f three 
National Guard officers honored 
recently on their retirement in 
Brownwood. Wristen ended his 
long career with the National 
Guard this month, serving most 
recently as Command Sergeant 
Major of the 3rd Battalion, 112th 
Armor Division in Brownwood.

The son o f the late Mr. and 
Mrs. T. J. Wristen Sr., he is a 
graduate o f Santa Anna High 
School and entered the Santa 
Anna National Guard unit in 
1938. He served until 1940, and in 
April 1941 he entered the U. S. 
Air Force for active duty during 
World War n.

He participated in eight mili­
tary campaigns including Algeria, 
Tunisia, Sicily, Naples, Rome, 
North Appenines, Po Valley and 
Southern France. His decorations 
included Bronze Star, Army 
Commendation, American De­
fense Service medal, American 
Campaign medal, European, Af­
rican, Middle Eastern Campaign 
Medal, World War 0  Victory 
Medal, Armed Forces Reserve 
Medal, Presidential Unit Citation, 
12 service stripes, and others.

In 1951 W risten resumed

For Lord's Acre Success

George Seifert 

Buried Tuesday 

In S.A. Cemetery
Graveside funeral rites were 

held at Santa Anna Cemetery 
Tuesday, October 27, for George 
C. Seifert, 53, who died Monday 
in Overall-Morris Memorial Hos­
pital in Coleman. The Rev. John 
Hix, pastor of Northside Baptist 
Church, officiated at the service 
that was directed by Stevens 
Funeral Home in Coleman.

Mr. Seifert was born May 28, 
1928 in San Angelo and married 
Wanda Duggins of Santa Anna 
November 5,1971 in San Angelo. 
He had been a resident o f Santa 
Anna since 1973, and had 
previously lived in Mason 
County. He was a Baptist.

Survivors are his wife; three 
brothers, Raymond Seifert, R. B. 
Seifert and Charlie (Dude) Men- 
ges, all of Santa Anna; and 
several nieces and nephews.

CHARLES WRISTEN 
Honored on Retirement

service with National Guard, and 
he and his family have made their 
home in Brownwood for many 
years, moving from Santa Anna.

Others honored at the recent 
dinner in Brownwood were Chief 
Warrant Officer Arvid J. Benner 
and Sergeant First Class Billy J. 
Crownover, who with Wristen 
had a combined service in the 
military of 110 years.

The Methodist annual Lord's 
Acre project was very successful 
this year. Appreciation was 
expressed to people of the 
community for their support.

Among those giving assistance 
was West Texas UtilitiegCo. who 
hung the banners j£ P ls  the 
street, to the City o f Santa Anna 
for use of the Civic Center, and to 
the Lions Club and School for use 
o f the tables and chairs.

Special thanks was also given 
G&E Hardware, Western Auto, 
Phillips Drug, W ylie's Flowers, 
Benge Fina and Mike's Mobil 
Station for donations for the 
auction.

During the day those attending 
were entertained by several 
groups, including the Mountain 
City Stars twirling group under 
the direction o f Suzan Daniel, the 
Coleman County Twirling Stars, 
also directed by Mrs. Daniel, the 
puppet People of First Baptist 
Church, and during the supper, 
music by the Sonshine Quartet of 
First Baptist Church and the New 
Creation gospel singers.

The beautiful handmade quilt 
that had been on display at 
Western Auto was won by 
Donnie Neff. Conducting the 
successful auction was Jim 
Gravel, auctioneer.

Proceeds from the annual event 
will be used for renovation of the 
parsonage.

Extension Office 

Has Job Opening
The secretary's position in 

the County Extension Office will 
be open to employment Novem­
ber 9, according to Roger 
Blackmon, County Extension 
Agent. Anyone interested in the 
position may pick up an appli­
cation form from the County 
Extension O ffice by Friday, 
October 30.

Interviews will be conducted 
between 9 a.m. and 12 noon 
November 2 in the Extension 
office, located on the second floor 
of the County Courthouse in 
Coleman. The phone number is 
625-4519.

Applicants must possess typing 
and filing skills and other 
secretarial abilities.

The County Extension Office is 
an Equal Opportunity Employer, 
and this position is open to all 
ages regardless of socio-economic 
level, race, color, sex, religion or 
nationality.

(Continued from Page 1)
5. Providing for the tnclmdnn of 
livestock and poultry with form 
products as exempt from  tax­
ation.
6. Authorizing a • political 
subdivision to provide property 
tax relief for owners of residence 
homesteads and changing certain 
property tax administrative pro­
cedures.
7. Authorizing the issuance of 
additional bonds to finance the 
veterans' aid program and to 
increase the maximum interest 
rate allowable on veterans land 
fond bonds.
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Whirly Birds 

Have Meeting 

At Baptist Church
The Whirly Bird group met 

Wednesday, October 21, at First 
Baptist Church for the weekly 
meeting. The children were taken 
by the church bus to the meeting 
and back to school.

The lesson was presented by 
Rev. John Stanislaw, pastor, and 
Gail Homer was hostess.

The First Grade group proudly 
flew their flag for good behavior.

COW POKES By Ace Reid

JHS Game Tonight
The Junior High football 

une was cancelled last Thursday 
le to the rain and wet field.
The last game of the season will 

be held today at Blanket starting 
at 6 p .m .

The football sweetheart will be 
presented at the afternoon pep 
rally today.

Rowena Anderson 

To Start Work 

At Sharon's Salon
Rowena Anderson is dosing 

her beauty shop on South First 
Street this week and will be 
assodated with Sharon Guthrie at 
Sharon's Beauty Salon as of 
November 3.

Mrs. Anderson has had her 
own shop for the past four years* 
and prior to that time worked 
with Glenda's Beauty Shop and in 
Coleman.
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Henderson Funeral Homes
.“People Caring For People”

OFFERING AT YOUR REQUEST 
Pre-Arranged Funerals

Funeral Insurance And Counseling 
Ambulance Service

“I ain’t votin’ ferthis commissioner agin’, since he’s been in office 
I’ve lost all my hub caps, torn off three mufflers and knocked two

holes in my gas tank!”
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PASS BOOK SAVINGS

Up la SIM,M0 
6 MONTH
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Mountaineers Win 14-0 
For First Zone Victory

The Santa Anna Mount­
aineers changed their luck last 
week when they won their game 
over the Irion Cdunty team Friday 
night at Mertzon. It was Santa 
Anna's second victory of the 
season and their first conference 
win.

The Mountaineers scored once 
in each of the first two quarters,' 
holding the Irion County team 
scoreless for the 14-0 victory.

Santa Anna turned in . a solid 
defensive perform ance, with 
Charlie Lewis named as out­
standing on defense.

Albert Collins scored the first 
touchdown on a 52-yard drive, 
adding the extra point with his

kick.
The team scored in the second 

quarter when Ernest DeLeon 
went over from the five. Collins 
added the extra point.

Collins led the team with 
128 yards on 19 carries, while 
DeLeon had 92 yards on 23 
carries. Santa Anna led 17 - 4 in 
first downs, and held the Mertzon 
team to only 32 yards rushing. 
The Mountaineers had only one 
penalty for five yards, and lost 
one fumble.

The Mountaineers will host the 
strong Cross Plains team Friday 
night at Mountaineer Stadium at 
7:30 p.m. for the last home game 
of the season.

WTU Seeks Rate Increase 
For Rural Electric Co-ops

West Texas Utilities Company 
has filed  for a change in 
wholesale rates for electric 
service it supplies to 14 rural 
electric cooperatives, one munici­
pality and one investor-owned

Memorial Gifts 

Are Given To 

Meals on Wheels
The Meals on Wheels program 

has received a number of 
donations as memorials to the late 
Norman Walters. The gifts are 
from the following people:
Mrs. T. J. McCaughan, Fort 
Worth
Mr. and Mrs. Ford Holt, Bangs 
Mr. and Mrs. Chester Austin, 
Fort Worth
Dr. and Mrs. Carroll Holt, 
Brownwood
Mr. and Mrs. Sam Swafford, 
Abilene
Beth Marshall, Melvin
Mr. and Mrs. G . A. Morgan Jr.
The J. S. Jones family
Mr. and Mrs. Allen Pierce and
family, Austin
Mr. and Mrs. Tommy Oakes and
family, Pasadena
Mr. and Mrs. Bud Weygandt,
Houston
Mrs. Gladys Davis, Houston 
Miss Sharon Oakes, Deer Park 
Mrs. Doris Barnes, Deer Park 
Mr. and Mrs. James Oakes, 
Pasadena
Mrs. Rose Holt, Dallas
Mrs. Ray D. Williams, Dallas
Fred B. Oakes, Dallas
Mr. and Mrs. George Richardson,
Abilene
Mrs. Vera Shield
M rs. James Clark, Larsen,
Wisconsin
Mrs. Will McGaughey, Bangs 
Mrs. Mae Blue 
Mr. and Mrs. Ford Barnes 
Mr. and Mrs. Joe C. Barnes

distribution company.
In its filing Friday, October 16, 

with the Federal Energy Regul­
atory Commission in Washington, 
WTU estimated the new rates 
will produce about $4.3 million in 
additional revenue for the com­
pany during the 1982 calendar 
year. This amounts to an increase 
of approximately 10 percent from 
these wholesale customers.

WTU requested that the new 
rates become effective on Decern-. 
ber 15. The present rates have 
been in effect since June 1980. 
WTU also proposes to change to a 
fuel adjustment clause similar to 
the one applied to its retail 
customers. No other major 
changes were proposed.

WTU officials said the rate 
change is necessary to bring the 
Company's earnings on sales to 
wholesale customers to a level 
that will help WTU maintain a 
sound financial condition and 
attract new capital for growth 
required to meet future needs of 
electric customers. The previous 
wholesale rate increase proved 
insufficient because of inflation, 
higher than anticipated interest 
rates, and the delay in making the 
rates effective.

Wholesale customers to be 
affected by the filing include 
Coleman County Electric Cooper­
ative, Inc. that serves Coleman 
County and parts of several 
surrounding counties. Others are 
Concho Valley Electric Cooper - 
ative, Inc. to the west, McCulloch 
Electric Cooperative, Inc. to the 
south, and others in the farther 
reaches o f the WTU service area.
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School Board 

Has Meeting

October 13
The Santa Anna School 

Board of Trustees had a long 
agenda for the Tuesday, October 
13 , meeting. Jay Weathers, 
president, led the session at the 
school business office.

The monthly financial report 
was presented, and bills and 
accounts for the month were 
reviewed and approved for 
payment.

Three teachers, Joan Jones, 
Gail Loyd and Becky Martin, met 
with the board to present 
recom m endations for a new 
curriculum plan to be used in 
Texas Schools starting next year. 
The program for continuity of 
curriculum was the topic o f a 
recent workshop attended the the 
local teachers.

Supt. R. C. Smith distributed 
copies of Senate Bill 314 
concerning term contract renew­
als for teachers that has been 
approved.

The Board voted to have the 
roof of the elementary school 
repaired, and to select a new 
contractor for the paving project 
at the gymnasium and new tennis 
courts.

Also approved were repairs for
the air conditioning - heating 
units in the high school building 
and purchase and installation of a 
new door for the storage area at 
the show barn.

The 1981 tax roll was approved 
by the Board.

The next meeting of the group 
will be Tuesday, November 10.
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SUPPLY CO.
General

Oilfield Supplies
Santa Anna, Texas 

Box 580 - Ph. 348-3179 
Box 21, Ira, Texas 
Bus. 915-573-6403

IN BROWNWOOD HOSPITAL 
Mrs. Calvin Campbell was 

admitted to Brownwood Regional 
Hospital Saturday and is in the 
cardiac care unit after suffering a 
heart attack. She has been very 
ill, but her condition was stable 
Wednesday morning.

24 Hour Service On Locution Welding

Serving Oil Field, 

Ranchers & Farmers

Service
Owner

Jerry

Rt. 1 Box 26 
Santa Anna, Tex.

915-348-3834
or 348-3333
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El Paso Elementary School 
Named tor S-Anna Native

A Santa Anna native who 
started a career in education in 
1940, was honored October 15 in 
El Paso when an elementary 
school was named in in his honor.

Hibbard G. Polk , who retired 
this year as associate super­
intendent o f the El Paso 
Independent School District, was 
honored by trustees o f the district 
at the recent program. He was 
cited for his 41 years of service to 
the district as one of the most 
loved and respected educators.

Mr. Polk, the son of the late E. 
E. and Mayme Baxter Polk, was 
born in Santa Anna and lived here 
with the family who were in 
business. The late E. E. Polk was 
a former Mayor of Santa Anna.

A graduate of Hardin Simmons 
University, Polk began his 
teaching career in El Paso in 
1940. A fter returning from  
service in World War II, Polk 
resumed teaching and became a

Honored By El Paso ISD

counselor. He was named prin­
cipal of an elementary school in 
1948, and was named personnel 
director for the entire school 
district, holding that position 
until 1964.

He also served as the director 
of secondary education, assistant 
superintendent for instruction, 
and associate superintendent, 
administration. He had held the 
deputy superintendent post since 
1978. He was honored as 
administrator of the year in 1975. 

Mr. Polk was sitting in the 
Cotton ginning has been in full audience with his family during 

swing at the Santa Anna Co-op the presentation, and received a 
Gin , with 168 bales processed standing ovation. He was also

Cotton Ginning 

Continuing Here

there since the season opened.
The cotton harvest was delayed 

last week due to the rain, but 
farmers are getting back into 
their fields this week to continue 
the stripping process.

presented a portable typewriter 
as a retirement present from the 
district.

His son, Barnard, spoke for his 
father, who cannot speak 
because of throat cancer.

Booster Club 
Has Meeting 
Tuesday Night

Coach Roger Goodwin review­
ed the Friday night football game 
and showed the film at the 
Tuesday night meeting of the 
Booster Club.

Coach Dean Bass announced 
that the final game of the season 
for the Junior High team will be 
Thursday (today). Last week's 
game was cancelled due to rain.

A deer rifle will be given away 
Friday night at halftime at the 
game, a fund raising project of 
the club. Those wishing to donate 
to the Club may contact any club 
member.

D. D. (Tex) Wright was named 
'Booster of the Week' for the 
Friday night game. He is the 
father of James Pelton, a senior 
team member.

Sharing Booster of the Week 
honors bn Friday, November 6, 
will be Randy Brown and Jim 
Spillman.

Everyone is invited to attend 
:he meeting of the club,Tuesday, 
November 3, at 7:30 p.m. at the 
Vocational Agriculture building.

c o m m u n i t y !
C A L E N D A R

THURSDAY— OCTOBER 29:?
JHS Football, at Blanket, 6 p.m.

FRIDAY— OCTOBER 30:
Pep Rally, Perry Gymnasium, 3:15 p.m.
Football game, SAHS Stadium, 7:30 p.m. 

SATURDAY— OCTOBER 31:
Halloween Coronation , school auditorium, 6:30 p.m. 
Halloween Carnival, Old Gymnasium, 7:30 p.m. 

SUNDAY- NOVEMBER 1:
Attend Church 

MONDAY— NOVEMBER 2:
Campfire Girls, Civic Center 
Boy Scouts, Civic Center, 7 p.m.
VFD and Auxiliary, Fire Hall, 7 p.m.

TUESDAY- NOVEMBER 3:
Amendment Election, CCTC building, 7 a.m. - 7 p.m. 
Lions Club, Lions Club building, 12 noon 
Booster Club, Vo-Ag building, 7:30 p.m.

Rental Notice
The Santo Anno Housing Authority

is accepting applications for rental of 

24 new apartments located at Jefferson and Clark 

(just east of the school). Apply at 702 Wallis Ave, 

bringing documentary evidence of income, 

such as W-2 Form. There will be no discrimination 

because of race, color or national origin.

Jesse L. Sparkman
a  ’ ■ v- c - ’ 1 ( j

Executive Director

V  t *  J  tt * .  A •
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Texas Farms Increasing Class of 1951 Reunion

A s Nation's Total Drops
COLLEGE STATION- While 

the total number of farms in the 
United States continues to de­
cline, Texas is bucking the trend.

The most significant reason for 
the increasing number of farms in 
Texas is the division of medium­
sized farms in East Texas, 

gig* according to Dr. William E. 
u r  Black, economist with the Texas 
•“& Agricultural Extension Service.

A relatively small portion of the 
total number o f farms are now 
producing an increasingly larger 
;hare of agricultural products, 
iccording to Black.

According to the 1978 Census 
of Agriculture, about 2.8 -percent 
of the Texas farms produced 60 
percent of the value of farm cash 
receipts. This compares with 
about 2.8 percent of the U. S. 
farms producing about 36 percent 
)f the nation's cash receipts from 
agriculture.

The U. S. Census Bureau 
defines a farm as 'any place from 
which $1,000 or more worth of 
agricultural products were sold or 
normally would have been sold in 
the previous year.'

This general definition of a 
farm, which has been changed 
since the 1974 Census of 
Agriculture, is part of the reason 
for an increasing number of farms 
in Texas, adds Black. Along with 
this is the disappearance of 
medium-sized farms.

In West Texas, medium farms 
are being consolidated to form 
bigger, more profitable farms, 
Black said. But in East Texas, 
medium farms are being sub­

divided into smaller farms to be 
used as weekend retreats for folks 
who have to live and work in the 
city during the week.

In 1974 there were about 
174,000 farms in Texas, and in 
1978 the number had increased to 
194,253, according to Census 
Bureau figures. During the same 
period, the number o f U . S. 
farms declined.

Technical advances since the 
50s, market pressures and growth 
in nonfarm employment in rural 
communities are three reasons for 
the overall decline of the nation' s 
farms.

Bright This Year

Hosch Furniture 

Donates Chair

To S.A. Library
Hosch Furniture Company has 

donated a nice chair to Santa 
Anna Public Library. The gift has 
been acknowledged by Letha 
Martin, librarian, who extended 
appreciation for the addition.

The local library is open for 
everyone in the community, with 
no charge for the use of the 
hundreds o f books that are 
available there.

Many other services are also 
available at the local library.

AUSTIN— Prospects are ex­
cellent across most o f Texas for 
the upcoming hunting seasons, 
according to Texas Parks and 
Wildlife Department biologists.

Favorable weather conditions 
with plenty of rain during the first 
half o f 1981 boosted populations 
of deer, turkey and quail. 
Biologists said turkey and quail 
made the most immediate pro­
gress, with reproduction and 
survival rates good enough to 
prompt rosy predictions for the 
hunting seasons. Deer also are in 
excellent shape, but herds in 
some areas still are down 
somewhat in population after last 
year's severe drought, particular­
ly in western portions of South 
Texas. The deer and turkey 
season in most Texas counties 
opens November 14.

Throughout most of the tradit­
ional deer range, hunters may see 
slightly fewer bucks than in 
recent years, but there should be 
higher percentage of trophy-qual­
ity racks than normal in the 
herds.

One of the most outstanding 
production years for wild turkey 
occurred in 1981, and the 1982 
season should also be a great one.

In the Rolling Plains area 
centered around Abilene, San 
Angelo and Big Spring, the deer 
counts are up this year. Range 
conditions were dry during 
August but are now very good. 
Turkey and quail hunters should 
also do well .
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The easy way to pay is

with a personal deck.

ook Savings 5% —  Compounded D aily

'Always Willing
M
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Held at Homecoming

Hunting Prospects

Members of the Class of 1951 
met for their 30th reunion 
Saturday, October i7 , during 
Homecoming. The group met at 
the Homemaking Cottage on the 
school campus following the noon 
luncheon, enjoying visiting and 
renewing old friendships.

Those attending the get-toget­
her were Mr. and Mrs. Harold 
Horton of Pflugerville; Geraldine 
Lewellen Graves , Gary; Reba 
Hardy Loggins, Midlothian; Mr. 
and Mrs. Thomas Ray Ruther­
ford, Concord, N. H.; C.W. and 
Billie (Wallace) Stephenson, Abi­
lene; Billy Joe Parish, Tucumcari, 
N. M .; Mr. and Mrs. Joe Vernon 
Buse, Gordon; Mary Frances 
(Williams) Newman, Raywood; 
Linda (Stewardson) Slusher, of 
Brown wood; Mr. and Mrs. Max 
Eubank and Jeanette (Lovelady)

Turner of Santa Anna.
Others visiting with the group 

during the afternoon were former 
teachers, Dow McBride of Brown- 
wood and Winnie McQueen of 
Coleman, Mrs. Bessie Lewellen 
and Billie Faye (Lewellen) Mc­
Donnell o f Plains, Carolyn (Love- 
lady) Haynes of St. Louis, Mo., 
and Suzanne (Renegar) Smith of 
Santa Anna.

” ” " ^ 1  fwawaum
admitted to Ranger Park Hospital
October 19 r 26:
Ike Garza, city 
Louise Davis, Coleman 
Fred Jackson, Coleman

Mrs. I. J. Bailey, Ranger Park 
Inn ...

These patients were dkmfafefl 
from the hospital October 19 - 26:

COMMUNITY CHOIR TO MEET 
All local people interested in 

taking part in the Community 
Choir Christmas cantata are 
asked to meet at 4:30 p.m. 
Sunday, November 1, at the 
Seventh-day Adventist Church,

Herman Howard, Coleman 
Alma Webb, city 
E. J. McCoy, city 
Norma Steffey, city 
Clarence Clay, city 
Ike Garza, city

I '

Other patients still in 
hospital October 26:

the

The cantata is set for Sunday, 
December 13, and singers from 
the community are being sought.

Cleo Moon, city 
Charlie Menges, city 
Aurora Aguirre, Bangs 
Ruby Horton, Ranger Park Inn

Save Energy,
Save Money * . .

With These Floor Model, UNVENTED

Dearborn Heaters
the best unvented heater! Its heat flows forward and 

is deflected down to the floor where it forms a carpet of 
warmth to keep rooms comfortable, corner to comer. Does it 
q u ic k ly -a n d  economically, too. Has the famous Cool Safety 
Cabinet that can t burn fingers, plus cheery Glc-Brite 
Radiants and a lifetime Hi-Crown burner. Smartly styled in 
coppertone. built for durability by Dearborn.
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With LP or Natural Gas, Safety Pilot* We also have 
Thermostats available. (We will install dll heaters 
to your present gas valve at no charge) Many 
other models and makes.
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MR. AND MRS. GEORGE HAYNES 
To Be Honored November 7

and meeting and sat in a group at 
lunch.

At 2 p.m. the group gathered in 
the home o f Mr. and Mrs. (Alice 
Guthrie) James Spillman for a 
get-together.

Bonnie Balke Kuykendall had 
created several collages of class 
pictures, and Artie Jean King 
Sitterle brought pictures that her 
husband had made at the reunion 
five years ago. Autograph books, 
scrapbooks and pictures from as 
far back as the third grade were 
shared.

'Spirit' candy sticks of black 
and gold were given to the 
following, Wayne Horton and 
Jean Sitterle, who traveled the 
most miles to attend; Ray Dean, 
who has the most children; Marie
Heilman Fulbright, married the regret the loss o f a classmate, 
longest and with the most Vemetta Stephenson Pruitt.
grandchildren.

Gass members and guests 
enjoyed snacks, dips, sweets and 
punch. The table was covered

Members hope to publish a 
newsletter of 'happenings' until 
their next meeting.

Class of 1926 Enjoys Reunion
The Fellowship Hall of United 

Presbyterian Church was the 
meeting place for the Gass of 
1926 when they met Friday, 
October 16, for a reunion.

Dinner was served by the 
Eastern Star, with tables decorat­
ed in a Western theme, with 
orange pyracantha and pump­
kins.

an arrangement of a camel with 
cacti was on the piano, and 
bandana napkins completed the 
motif.

Out-of-town members present 
were Fay Hill o f Comanche, 
Lorena Burris MOnty of San 
Antonio, and from Santa Anna 
were Leta Parker, Jim Lovelady, 
Grace Short, Lucille Balke, and 
their sponsor, Mae Blue.

Guests present were Betty

Henderson, Erin Day, R. W. 
Balke, Bonnie Gene Kuykendall 
and daughter Karla, Mark James 
and Minnie Bell Richardson.

The Class o f 1926 has met 
annually at Homecoming since 
their 50th reunion.

A  new method of treat­
ing cotton that makes it 
wrinkle-resistant'is expected 
to increase the amount of 
cotton  used fo r woven 
sh irts f rom  66,600 to  
133,000 b a le s  a year.

Class of 1946 Has Reunion
Members of the Class o f 1946 with black and gold, centered 

met for the 35th anniversary with fall flowers and leaves and a 
during H om ecom ing. Several football, 
were present for the Friday night Those present were Mr. and 
football game, and on Saturday Mrs. John Fullbright and two of 
morning they met for the program their grandchildren, Mr. and

Mrs. Thomas Newman, Mr. and 
Mrs. G. W. Sitterle, Mr. and 
Mrs. Ray Dean, Mr. and Mrs. 
Ben Gene Tatum, Mr. and Mrs. 
Wayne Horton, Mrs. Wayne 
(Minnie Jean Bryan) Bray, Mrs. 
Jack (Evelyn Bruce) Kingsbery, 
Mrs. E. G. (Eunice Cupps) Terry, 
Mrs. W. A. Kuykendall, Fred 
Oakes, Hal Souder, Mr. and Mrs. 
Charles (Alene Talley) Allen, also 
Karla Kuykendall and friend 
Mark.

A telephone call came from 
Mrs. Thomas (Wanda Hender­
son) Johnson who was busy 
welcoming a new granddaughter, 
Crystal Rose. A note from Mr. 
and Mrs. Ray (Minola Martin) 
McSwain told of her recent 
surgery. The group recalled with

Anniversary Reception 

For Former S-Annans
Mr. and Mrs. George Haynes 

o f Brownwood will celebrate their 
Golden W edding Anniversary 
Saturday, November 7, with a 
reception at their home near 
Brownwood. The party will be 
from 2 - 4 p.m. at Route One, Box 
388 G.

Children of the couple will host 
the party. They are Wanda 
Titchen of Lovington, N. M. , 
Connie Seals of Houston, Rev. 
James Haynes of Gonzales, 
Gerald Haynes of Houston, 
Jeanelle Spears of Levelland, 
Carol Faychak of Las Vegas, Nev. 
and Janice Kindel of Encinitas , 
California.

George Haynes and Goldie 
Welch were married November 7, 
1931 at Rockwood by Rev. A. C. 
Jones, the Methodist minister. 
Mr. Haynes was an employee of 
Amerada Petroleum Corporation 
for 34 years, retiring in 1970. He 
then went into business, retiring 
in 1980.

The couple lived at Mukewater, 
Longview, Houston, Tomball and 
Lovington, N. M. They moved to 
Brownwood in July of this year.

Relatives and friends of the 
family are invited to attend the 
reception November 7.

Kin of Area Folks 

Buried Last Friday
M asonic funeral services 

were held in Houston on Friday, 
October 23, for Carl Williams, a 
former resident of the area who 
died Tuesday, October 20, in 
Pasadena.

Mr, Williams, a brother of 
Blake Williams of Rockwood, is 
also survived by his wife , two 
other brothers, B. R. Williams 
and W. D. Williams, both of 
Brownwood; and two sisters, 
Mrs. Doris Richardson of Cole­
man and Mrs. Ruth McGill of 
Pasadena. .

Collections G ood  

ForCityToxes
Property owners in Santa Anna 

are responding well to the 1981 
taxes, according to City Secretary 
Pat Rutherford. Payment is 
coming in well during the first 
weeks since notices were mailed.

City property owners are 
encouraged to pay property taxes 
before December 31 to avoid 
penalty for late payment.

v isit  in  McCr e a r y  h o m e
Recent visitors in the home 

o f Mr. and Mrs. Jake McCreary 
have included Tom, David and 
Chris Timmins o f New Orleans, 
La., John Martin of Shreveport, 
Leslie and Trent Arnold of San 
Angelo, Carl Howard and Ray­
mond Thomas o f Houston,

Other visitors during the 
Homecoming weekend were Mr. 
and Mrs. Allyn Gill of San 
Marcos, Mr. and Mrs. Bill 

& Shamblin o f Granbury, Jim 
Everett of Houston and Joe Bell 
of Euless.

Fossi ls  o f  flowering  
plants 165 million years 
old have been found.

Sye Burdens Have 

Great-grandchild

Amanda Kathryn Craft was 
born October 11 weighing eight 
pounds, five ounces. She is the 
daughter of Larry and Regina 
Craft of Academy.

Grandparents are Lyndale and 
Mary Rea of Troy, Roy and 
Shirley Craft of Academy. Great- 
grandparents of the new baby are 
Alice Wilkins of Midland, Arnold 
Wilkins of Temple, Estle and 
Wence Craft of Big Stone, Va., 
Mrs. Sam Rea of Temple and Mr. 
and Mrs. Sye Burden of Santa 
Anna.

UN1R0YAL
Home of 

the Tiger Paw

W illiam s  
T ire  Store

2003 C om m ercia l 
Colem an, Texas  
Phone 625*5152

Tl
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Robert Fulton, of steam­
boat fame, was also an 
a c c o m p l i s h e d  artist)

u n r e m n  u f i c r n c

■VlHj

Commercial
In a U S ifK II 

C e fin g  Fans
414 Commercial 

Coleman, Texas 625-3085

★  Announcing ★
CTTOcme n o v e n iw r 4

Row&ra Anderson
WIN be ossocioteii with

Sharon's Beauty Salon
Call 348-3433 

O r Call 348-3571 Before 8 a .m . o r A fte r  5:00

Clft£l* FLAY
For Clean Family Entertainment

Game Room
Pool & Snooker Video Games

Video Pinball

^  Skating Rink
Saturday Mornings 9:00 -12:00 

13 year old & Under
Your Young Skaters Will be WELL Supervised

No Alcoholic Beverages or
Obussive Language Allowed

HOURS 12-12 7 DAYS A WEEK
WEST SIDE OF THE CIRCLE ■

BROWNWOOD 643-2251
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ROCKWOOD HIGH SCHOOL STUDENTS in 
1926-27 are pictured here, seated from left, Bert 
Fowler, Carl Williams, Dean Ashmore, Jim Allen 
Hart, and Roy Richardson; second row, Vernon
Johnson, Alfred Steward......... Hall, and Pollock
Wise; and third row, Ruby Johnson, Fannie M.

Estes, Jewel Smith, Goldie McCarrell, Jessie L. 
Ashmore, Mary A. Lankford, unidentified, 
Geneva Rehm, Mildred McSwane, Edna L. 
Estes, Lois Moore and M. B. Blake Williams, 
Principal. Rockwood school had classes through
(Photos courtesy Bernice Johnson of Coleman)
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ROCKWOOD STUDENTS in 1925-26 .......Front
row, from left, Erin Ashmore, J. P. Hodges, 
Wilma Mcllvain, J. L. Trotter, Tyna Black, Bill 
Steward, Gladys Moore, Ross Dixon , Fay Bryan 
and Ezra Trotter; and back row, Leslie Hays,

Superintendent, Sanford Ellis, Bill Bryan, John 
Mcllvain, Jessie L. Ashmore, Bernice Johnson, 
Mildred McSwane, Jasper Mcllvain, Geneva 
Rehm, Rosa L. Mcllvain, Ralph Bentley, 
and Elizabeth (Polly) Johnson.

Sheep Program 

Set in Coleman 

On November 3

steep specialist from San Angelo, tratatag of sheep dogs.
I f .  “ 1  !  ̂ ‘Z  I  Anyone interested is invited to 
feature the ASPC video tepe on attend the program nest Tuesday
bhbv lamb survival developed m njKht * y
Idaho, and also a tape on the

Tuesday night, November 3, 
there will be a meeting for sheep 
producers at the Gub Room of 
Coleman Bank at 7 p.m.

Dr. George Ahlschwede, area

Repairs or 
Remodeling

lee's
H ■Hii

Col 348-3417
Santa A n n a , Taxaa

f r a a b r t g o f M

Santa Anna
school
JHENU

After 80 Years
The Rockwood Schools were of 

importance to the community for 
over 80 years, but as many other 
community schools, they have 
ceased operation.

N ew
Subscribers

Frances Nugent, Roseville, Cal. 
Jim Stearns, Fort Worth 
Mrs. 0 . A. Etheridge, San 
Angelo
Charles Peacock, Everman 
George Pearce, Dallas 
Darwin Watson, San Antonio 
Wayne Walters, Fort Worth 
Lenora James, Houston 
Geem Mfg. & Service Co., 
Abilene
Selma Russell, Baltimore, Md. 
Gene McSwane 
Regional Cooper, Fort Worth 
Robert Perry , Dallas 
Fleda Asta, Bristol, Pa.
Glenna Essary, El Cajon, Cal. 
Roscoe Hosch, Bangs 
Howard L. Lovelady, Fort Madi­
son, Iowa
Lewis Carter, Abilene 
Ethel Matthews 
Mrs. Robert Slusher, Odessa 
J. W. Stewardson, Dallas 
Harry Crews 
Lynn Wright
Mountain Reading Service, Provo 

Utah
Dorothy Maltese, Pueblo, Colo. 
Mio-New-Land Ranch, San Angelo 
Robert Stewardson

Students from the Rockwood 
area now arrive by bus at the 
Santa Anna Schools, the 
arrangement since 1955.

The Rockwood School District 
consolidated with Santa Anna in 
1957.

The Rockwood Schools were 
started in the 1880s, according to 
Gladys Hunter in her book, 
(Discord, Texas on Camp Creek.) 
At their peak, there were 225 
students in the school i  a 
faculty of eight.

For some time students attend­
ed through the tenth grade at 
Rockwood, then attended their 
final year in Santa Anna. Later 
the entire high school education 
was available at Rockwood, with 
classes graduating through the 
early 1940s. At that time high 
school students transferred to 
Santa Anna. For 13 years only the 
elementary school was in operat­
ion there.

RECENT VISITORS
Visiting recently in the home 

of Mrs. E. E. McClintock was a 
daughter and her husband, Mr. 
and Mrs. Lyndon Haynes of 
Kermit, and a granddaughter , 
Glenna Essary and Nicci and Nick 
Nickerson , all of El Cajon, Calif.

D r. E. H. Henning, J r .

OPTOMETRIST

Francine Merritt, Baton Rouge, 
La.
Mrs. E. J. Browning, Lampasas 
June Wray
Glenda Pricer, Abilene 
Louis Fittard, Gouldbusk 
Nancy Avants, San Angelo 
W . V. Priddy

-> $ y ?
117 C o m m erc ia l 

Colem an

Ph. 625-2228

OFFICE rtOWRS 
9:00 a .m . to 5:00 p .m .

November

Ihurs. 5th - 6:30-9:30
Pen &  Ink " In  The Round" Class fee $10.00!

Teacher fee and all supplies included 
Deposit: $3.00

Set. 7th.

knjj^ Bobbie FryarTeacher 9:00 a.m. 
Teacher fee $ 15 plus supplies - Deposit $ 15 ]

Ihurs. 19th 6:30-9:30
_ChrislmasWreorti With Stt Rowers

Monday - Friday, November 2 - 6:

MONDAY-— Beef enchiladas, pinto beans, macaroni salad, 
combread, peanut butter brownies and milk 
TUESDAY—  Steak patties and gravy, creamed potatoes, 
buttered carrots, hot rolls, chocolate clusters and milk 
WEDNESDAY—  Burritoes with chili and cheese, buttered corn, 
shredded lettuce, apple cobbler and milk 
THURSDAY—  Barbecue chicken, potato salad, baked beans, 
jello, homemade bread and milk 
FRIDAY—  Cheeseburgers, salad, French fries, oranges and 
milk

Tis the season for pretty things!!!
Fee? (to be announced) Deposit: $3.00,

i i i f « § 8 i
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r w iV n VW e are so happy to have Mr. 

Herman Howard of Coleman and 
Mrs. Pearl Abernathy of Santa 
Anna to come live with us for 
awhile. We hope they enjoy their 
stay with us.

The residents were so happy to 
see Bro. Scott and Marge Bell 
from Plano . They enjoyed the 
singing and devotion time Mon­
day afternoon with the Bells.

The residents enjoyed the 
singing of the Pentecostal Church 
group Tuesday evening. We 
appreciate them coming each 
week.

The Songbirds did a beautiful 
song service for the residents 
Wednesday afternoon. The sing­
ing was enjoyed by a large 
number o f residents. Thank you 
for coming each week.

We appreciated the devotion 
Bro Catalino 0 . Bautesta from the 
Phillipine Islands brought Mon­
day morning. Thank you for the 
wonderful service.

Visitors with Susie Snider have 
been Herman and Edna Estes, 
Dr. John and Dr. Remy 
Cabansag and Marie Britton.

The movie, .Ganges: Sacred 
River' was enjoyed by a large 
number o f residents Friday 
afternoon. Thank you, Blanche 
Grantham, for the pop corn we 
ate while watching the movie.

Visitors with Mary Hoffman 
have been a niece and nephew, 
Allene and Houston Humble of 
Phoenix, Ariz. and Hough Wil­
liams of Ballinger.

Mrs. Roy Casey had as visitors 
M rs. Jonnie Rae and Lea 
Luschen.

Mr. and Mrs. Jim McAfee and 
Ronda of Bangs, Kevin and Jonie 
Morgan and baby, Laverne 
Simmons and Doris Bell of 
Brownwood visited with Bessie 
Thomas.

Visiting with Maury Cathey 
have been a daughter, Bertha and 
Glenn McQueen, a nephew and 
niece, Wesley and Katie Kile, 
and W. L. Campbell, all of 
Coleman, and Winnie McQueen, 
also of Coleman.

Also visiting with Mr. Cathey 
have been Edgar and Ora Nealy 
of Valera.

Easy opening for clams and 
oysters. . .wash in cold wa­
ter and store in a plastic bag 
in the freezer for an hour.

For Your

Insurance
Needs

Come See

Archie Phillips
Representing 

Germania Farm Mutual 
Aid Insurance 
andG.I.C.
Located at

216Va COMMERICAL

Dessa Patterson visited at the 
Inn with Mrs. D. R. Hill.

Erin Day was a visitor with her 
sister, Mrs. Myrtie Ward.

Marie Lancaster visited her 
mother, Ethel Matthews, one day 
last week.

Rose Moxley and Lissa and 
Kimmie were visitors of their 
father and grandfather, Julius 
Masoud.

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Hughes 
visited with her mother, Margaret 
Beckham.

Visiting frequently with Addie 
West is 
Herring.

THE SANTA ANNA NEWS
■ *r -'ft-Pt ■

The Santa Anna-Bangs Chapter 
o f the American Association o f 
Retired Persons met at the

Walter
A business meeting was held 

with the minutes of the last 
m eeting read by Secretary,

Community Center in Bangs Eunice Kowierschke. Opal Little 
October 19 for a luncheon and gave the frnanicial report. The 
business meeting. 34 members chapter voted to send $100 flood
and one visitor were present.

Mrs. Lucile W ylie, president of 
the chapter, called the meeting to 
order. Thomas Williams gave the 
invocation preceding the noon 
meal. He also led the group in the 
Pledge of Allegiance to our flag.

Mrs. Essie Wagner introduced 
the speaker, Mr, Swagerty from 
Brownwood, who spoke on fire

heVTaughter, SyUva Prevention with a slide presenta­
tion. A very informative talk.

relief to Breckenridge, Texas.
Mrs. Dennis Carter, Nominat­

ing Chairman, gave the names of 
those nominated for office in the 
coming year. They include: Mrs. 
Lucile Wylie, President; Mr. 
Thomas Williams, Vice Presi­
dent; Mrs. Faye Whitley, Secre­
tary; and Mrs. Madora Gilmore, 
Treasurer. The meeting was 
adjourned.

The next meeting will be held 
in Santa Anna November 16.

To Be Honored 

On Saturday
Mr. and Mrs. Walter Newman 

will be honored Saturday, Octo­
ber 31, with a reception on their 
50th wedding anniversary. Host­
ing the party will be their 
daughter, Mrs. Vermeil Young of 
Odessa, and family.

The party will be at the 
Mountain City Center from 1 - 6 
p.m. , and friends and relatives 
are invited to attend and share 
the happy occasion. The couple 
requests no gifts, please.

In Coleman
Has Moved Their Entire. . .

Fabric Department
To a New Location.

Pecan Street Warehouse
(Across from Coleman Bank Building)

FABRIC * THREAD 
★  BATTING ,

YARN * NOTIONS 
PATTERNS *

60 b. Wide

“Wool-look” 
Double Knit
stable Sofid&P

Reg. 5.99 Side $3.88

1 -5Yd.tenghts
Corduroy

*$1.66 yd
New FoH Colors

Reg. 1.97

60 n. wide
Blazer Velvets T-Shirt Knit

Side $6.88 yd  40 inch ■ M---IVgjLl fnlnrt-
D iiy n i

Full Fal Colors Reg. 1.99yd.
■ 3 Yds. for $.400 *

NoOntielnvawavPtan

mm



1W1SAHS Vasily Footbdl Schedule 1981
Oct, 2 
Oct. 9 
Oct. 16 
Oct. 23 
Oct. 30 
Nov. 6 
Nov. 13

Mile# [Homecoming] 
Mon Comity 
Ctom Plain*

Here
':'Tliece:. 

Here
Bronte There

Zone Play-Off 
Coaches

Roger Goodwin, Barry Mfle* & Dean Bass

8i00
8t00
7*30
7(30
7(30
7(30
7(30
7(30

« ; * !
V A

'*■>:

m
& * 1

Sir
I

Walker Funeral Home
401 Commercial A v e . Coleman 625-4103

*

Huggins Exxon Station
3484515 Santa Anna Slill

Taylor Motor Co.
Coleman, Texas

Herrings Flowers & Gifts
i j l i l i iptlii

1981 Mountaineei

348-3461 Santa Anna

Foster Miller Insurance Co.
C ol— i , Texas

Phillips Drug
J. E. Stevens Co. Fi

Where You Shop With Confidence

Downtown Santa Anna 
348-3151

Bradley
Lumber & Building Supply

Watson Dozer Service
1005 W . Cedar C olem an, 625-4419

3 4 0 - 3 1 8 5  Santa A n n a

T & T Farm Services
625-2015 ColeaM n, Texas

G l i l f ) G & E Hardware
Santa A n i348 43 73

Rockwell Brothers Lumber
Kenneth New m an, Ow ner Coleman 625-2435

Ken's Dairy Queen
348-3123 Santa Anna Benge Fina Sit

348-3331

First Coleman National Bank
Colem an, Texas

Hosch Furniture Co.
.. n ' Son td  &̂h rr  . ■ Derriel & Polhji

Ira Pump & Supply
348 -3 179  Santa An na

Stevens Funeral Home
Since 1889 *

C o ie ntan, Texas 6 2 5 -2 1 7 5

H&HFoodMart
D ow ntow n Santa An na 

3 4 8 4 14 8

Wylie's Rowers Watson-Cope land Constniction Co.
€ 0 178 5 4 4 5 1

1005 W . Coleman 6 25 4419

Clark's 10
625-2168

Santa Anna National Bank
Yoar HooMtown Bank 348-3108

Lewis Barker Seed
625-2161

Texas Ranger J!
9 1 5 4 4 8 4 1 5 0 For Resero
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neer Football Team

Furniture & Hardware

Longhorn Feed & Seed
Dow ntow n Santa Anna 

Pipeline A U fiK ty C o n t.

Edd Hartman Construction Co.
915-348-3481 or 348-3662 Santa Anna

Coleman Co. Rural Electric Coop.
Colem an, Texas 625-2128

nee Colem an, Texas

s . 's  Cafe
Geo. D. Rhone Co. Hardware ârousê

R C A  - Frigidaire - Litto n  
Phone 625-4141 C olem an,. Texas

201 Commercial 
Coleman, Texas

1 10 4  Wallis A v e . Santa Anna

Serving Coleman County

21 lC o m m e n M  Coleman 6 2 5 4 1 2 6 . 6 2 5 -3 117

Anna

Mahan Ford
llO S r e ta  Anna A v e . 

Colem an.Texas

Coleman Bank
Coleman, Texas

Western Auto
Owned

348-3771 Santa A n n a , Texas

348 -3 412

Henderson Funeral Home
. , F fR jA A a i lA d R l f ca B 1-nmutMaLm̂ ^■■■ \uonnpnn mmwnin tor :.r w ^ e , ■.

II 625-5152 M a h tt625-4656 
■ Colem an, Texas

348-9146

,e .

lervations 348-3191 Santa Anna Colem an, Texas

I

m
.

Ill

i a

'-V/

I



SfF’f'V i ■■ v.* ■’ i’ - ""fit !m lit \ * - ■ sM

'■¥fM$f£0.- J u-'-t'f ' '(V  * *'''* r

r >

10

Class of 1956 Reunion 

Attended By Large Group
Members of the Gass of 1956 

rod spouses met with friends 
xom the classes of 1955,1957 - 59 
:o celebrate their 25th reunion 
luring the recent Homecoming 
weekend.

Janice Donham Cozart, Lois 
inn Shields H arper, Belva 
ieilman Rutherford, Carie Blair 
Vhitfield and Pat Taylor Mc­
Cullough did a fine job o f having 
neetings arranged so former 
lassmates could take pictures, 
isit and enjoy lots of good food. 

The group met for coffee and 
ake at the Vocational Agriculture 
uilding following the Home* 
oming football game, with school 
nnuals opened so the identifl- 
ation process could begin, for 
vith the exception of Martha Ray 
’ritchard, everyone's appearance 
ad changed a little. Donald Ray 
)wen recognized no one, as he 
ore his glasses in his pocket. 
Saturday arrivals had an 

pportunity to get acquainted 
vith everyone at an afternoon 
offee at Mountain City Center. 
The crowd numbered about 45. A 
;alad supper was served at 6 p.m. 

Centerpiece for the supper was 
large cake baked by Billie Joyce 

Voodard Perry displaying the 
lass motto, Over the hilltop lie 
ew horizons. An arrangement of 

. old mums was used for the 
:hool colors.
A special guest was Mrs.

Carmen Donham who provided a 
list o f the members of the 1956 
graduating class who started in 
die first grade together, Carol 
McClellan, Beth Stiles, Janice 
Donham, Duane Bivens, Ottis 
Taylor, Diane Williams, Patsy 
Scott, Jerry Scarbrough, Betty 
Vinson, Pauline Voss and Donald 
Owen .

Breakfast was served at the 
Center after the Homecoming 
dance. The group enjoyed eggs 
and sausage casseroles, biscuits, 
jam, coffee and more stories of 
yesteryear.

Members of the Class o f 1956 
attending the weekend activities 
were Jerry Clark, San Marcos, 
Donald Hosch, Janice Donham 
Cozart, John David M orris, 
Donald Owen of Kemp, James 
Perry, Martha Ray Pritchard, 
Hilary Rutherford of Coleman, Liz 
Smith Paprowicz, Altus, Okla., 
and Carolyn Woods Stone of 
De Soto.

Letters were read from several 
who could not attend, Christine 
Barnes Jones of Glenwood 
Springs, Colo.; Wally Foster 
Conneway o f Diamond Bar, 
Calif.; Barbara House Roach of 
Aurora , Colo.; Carol McClellan 
Simmons of Abilene; Ruth Milli­
gan Meredith of El Paso; Patsy 
Scott Granad of Carlsbad, N. M. 
and Beth Stiles Meador ofBishop.

THE SANTA ANNA NEWS

Trickham
News

By Mrs. Oscar Boenicke

Hass of 1976 Has Fifth Reunion
Members of the Class of 1976 

met for their fifth reunion Friday, 
October 16, during the annual 
.Tomecoming.

The group met at the Fire Hall 
ollowing the football game, with 
J1 present except six, Sandra 
larris, Larry Benton, Sarah

Estes, Tammy Ellis, R. B. Dillard 
and Dana Pelton.

The group enjoyed visiting and 
refreshments of sandwiches, 
dips, chips and cake.

Hosting the party were Denise 
Blair McElrath, Michelle Cozart 
Morgan* Vicki Benge Aldridge, 
and Sharon Keeney Guthrie.

Last Sunday there was only 
Sunday School here, but next 
Sunday R ev. Swanner, the 
Baptist minister, will preach at 11 
a.m.

Tuesday afternoon the Quilting 
Club will meet at the Community 
Center in the afternoon. We will 
try to finish a quilt for Mildred 
Buggies and one for Lyndall 
Moore.

Visitors with Bene Haynes last 
week were Oma Lee Dockery, Sug 
Steams, Russie James, Winnie 
Haynes and Mattie and Jim 
Lineberry.

Sunday visitors who had dinner 
with her were Lou Vaughn, Mary 
Ola and Elmer Woods, H. B. and 
Ernestine Dockery, Rodney Guth­
rie, Byrdie Miller, and Elinor 
Sikes.

Natalie Mclver went to Abilene 
Wednesday and spent the night 
with her mother, Mrs. 1. N. 
Anderson and also visited her 
daughter, Janet and fam ily. 
Rankin went to San Angelo to 
visit Sherrie and Jim Blake 
Wednesday. Roy and Inez Miller 
and Irene Durham of Coleman 
visited the Rankin M clvers 
Thursday night.

Sunday after church I had 
dinner in Santa Anna with my 
cousin, Vera Shield, and her 
daughter, Annelle Clark. On the 
way home I stopped by Homer 
Goodgion's home and visited 
Homer and his daughter, Doris 
and her husband. Homer seems 
to be doing good for a 92-year-old 
man.

Sunday Mr. and Mrs. Charles 
Brewster and son Brad and his 
girl friend from Abilene Christian 
University all had dinner after 
church with Mr. and Mrs. Jim 
Roach in Zephyr, and in the 
afternoon they came back to the 
funeral of Mrs. Univa Smith held 
at Davis Morris Funeral Home in 
Brownwood. She was the mother- 
in-law of their minister.

Russie James and Oma Lee 
Dockery were hostesses for the 
Porcelain Arts Gub meeting at 
Adams Street Community Center 
in Brownwood Saturday. Satur­
day night Pat and Roberta 
McShan, Pat Jr. and Shannon 
McShan and Cindy and Kelly 
Huffman and Russie James 
attended a dove cook-out at Mr. 
and Mrs. Eddie Watsons in 
Brownwood. $unday they all had 
dinner with Russie at her home 
here.

Russie attended the Retired 
Teachers meeting Monday.

Saturday Virgil Dockery of Fort 
Worth and his daughter and son, 
Debra Hopkins and son Danny of 
Kansas City, Mo. and Oma Lee 
Dockery, Mary Ola and Elmer 
Woods of Bangs visited Lou 
Vaughn.

Sherman and Dortha Stearns 
and children came last week to 
visit his parents, the G. K. 
Steanrs. Leona Henderson visited, 
one evening last week, and Pat 
Stearns and grandson, Travis 
Shelton, and Mr. Fitters of Fort 
Worth visited them Saturday.

Del Ray Stacy visited his 
parents, the W alter Stacys, 
Thursday.

Visitors with Mary Lea Mitchell 
were Rick and Angela and Damon 
J. Miller of Austin who were 
weekend visitors, and Sunday 
night Lou Vaughn, Oma Lee 
Dockery and Russie James visited 
her.

Visitors with the Grady Mc­
lvers Sunday evening and night 
were Betty Henderson and 
Orabeth Mclver, Betsy and Sally, 
also Rankin and Natalie Mclver.

Lorene and Delburn Rice 
visited the Bond\Featherstons 
Sunday evening. V

Florence Stearns visited at 
Coleman with Alice Wells and 
daughter, Barbara Kirkpatrick 
and girls last Wednesday.

Lois Sheehan of Burleson came
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S-Anno Man 

Now Serving 

In Panama
Spec. 4 Ricky L. Purnell, son of 

Mr. and Mrs. Roy Purnell of 
Santa Anna, has arrived for duty 
at Fort Gayton, Panama.

Pannell, a rifleman with the 
193rd Infantry Brigade, was 
previously assigned at Fort Hood, 
Texas.

His wife, Diane, is the 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. G. 
Baskin of Bangs.

and brought Joan Hipes to visit 
her parents, the Bernice Mclvers, 
last week. Lois went back the next 
day and Joan stayed a few days. 
Mary Lou Storm took Joan to 
Dallas to take a plane back to 
California.

Sunday Betty Martin went to 
see her motiier, Mrs. John 
Crawford at Goldthwaite. Her 
mother has been sick but is doing 
well now.

We had some more rain -  two 
inches or more -- in our 
community. I had here at my 
place six and one-half inches 
since it started about two weeks 
ago. We are thenkful for it all, but 
the Sunday sunshine looks good 
now.

drive

Coleman
JlilO R sim e irf Works 

1309 i a t t  9th 
C o te m M . T e x w

D A V ID  H U FF
PIm m  625-5352 
N ig h t 6 25 -2719  

30 Years in C o ie n a n

Second Grade Sweepsi PTO Awards Dale &  Donna 348-3185
The Second Grade Classes of 

anet Neff and Sharon Cheaney 
lave received several awards 
iven by the Santa Anna Parent 
eacher Organization.
The class members received 

he cash award for largest 
articipation in the recent bake 
ale, and also have enlisted the 
irgest percentage o f parents in 
le membership drive.
At the Tuesday, October 20, 

leeting, the Second Grade 
resented the program, a Hallow- 
an play. The room count award 
âs given to the group at the

close of the meeting.
During the business meeting, 

led by Mrs. Terry Mclver, a 
report was given on the bake sale, 
with $345 added to the treasury.

The m em bership drive has 
enlisted 132 members for the 
1981-82 year.

VISIT IN JONES HOME
Visiting with Mrs. Ed Jones 

this week nave been a nephew, 
Robert Jones of Dallas, and on 
Sunday Mr. and Mrs. Fred 
Williams and Mrs. Lester Jones 
were dinner guests.

P R ES C R IP TIO N S
Dally Deliveries to Santa Anna

Where Friends Meet" 
Telephone625-4514

Colem an, Texas

it*

Bradley
LUMBER & BUILDING SUPPLY

Why Go Out of Town To Remodel Your House

We Cut What You ‘Need —  FREE 
*  We Are Cheaper 

*  We Deliver FREE
★  Ne Restocking Charges

on Vthat You Don't Use

Try To Beat Our Qurtty and Prices

&

lip



r, October 29,1*11
SEES u-f

THE SANTA ANNA NEWS
. i

r w \ .' I s * L

News
By Mrs. Tom  Rutherford

Our community received rain 
zain during the week. Possbily 
Wednesday night and Thursday 
lorning, we received two and 
ie-tenth inches. Seems a pretty 

1 idea to be happy with the 
even if we do not feel the 

teed so much. For Coleman 
founty is usually in need of rain. 
7e wish for sunshine awhile, 
une fanners still have grain to 

and then the cotton crop 
jieeds harvesting, although our 
ittle community has no cotton.

We enjoyed a nice telephone 
sit with our daughter, Mrs. Rick 

Lynda) Wheeler of La Grange on 
Saturday. All were well.

Mr. and Mrs. Floyd Morris and 
the granddaughter, Jennifer 

[orris visited in Brownwood last 
londay night with Mr. and Mrs. 
torman Floyd l orris. Mrs. 
[orris attended the LVN meeting 

the class room at Brownwood 
Regional Hospital and reported a 
jrofitable meeting.

Mr. and Mrs. Hilary Ruther­
ford of Coleman were hosts for a 

[Mexican supper Tuesday night 
for Mr. and Mrs. Tom Ruther- 

Eford, Mr. and Mrs. Thomas Ray 
[Rutherford and Loyd Rutherford. 
After going out to. eat and 
enjoying the good Mexican food, 

[we visited awhile in the Hilary 
[Rutherford home and with Mr. 
and Mrs. Bobby Boatright in 
Coleman.

Mr. and Mrs. Tom Vinson were 
in Abilene last Wednesday and 
were guests with their daughter, 
Mr. and M rs. Tom Berry. 
Thursday they went to Fort 
Stockton and spent the night with 

I their grandchildren, Mr. and 
Mrs. Adrian Hadley. The Tom 
Berrys of Abilene came for them 
Friday and they flew to Scotts­
dale, Arizona and attended the 
horse races and visited with a 
granddaughter, Susan Valdez and 
daughter K. K. while in Arizona. 
They returned to Fort Stockton 
and home Sunday, reporting a 
wonderful journey.

Joe Floyd Morris is with his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Floyd 
Morris, following a two-week visit 
in Oklahoma. The children, 
Jennifer and Jeffery Morris o f 
Santa Anna were also guests in 
the Morris home last week.

On Monday night Mr. and Mrs. 
Morris visited with Mr. and Mrs. 
Norman Floyd M orris and 
daughter, Rena and her son, 
Rusty of Utah, who are visiting 
her parents in Brownwood.

M r. and M rs. Don Fitz­
patrick and Brandon of Santa 
Anna visited during the weekend 
with his parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Graham Fitzpatrick.

30 Plus 1 Reunion

Leon Carter visited several 
times during the past week with 
his sister, Lorene Black o f 
Brownwood.

Our son, Mr. and Mrs. Thomas 
Ray Rutherford, left our home 
Friday morning for Dallas where 
they flew to Boston on Saturday. 
They had a nice flight and a safe 
one. Thomas called Sunday and 
reported they did tour the Ewing 
Ranch in the Dallas vicinity where 
portions of the show 'Dallas' we 
see on television are taped and 
filmed. They reported a nice day 
of touring places around and in 
Dallas since it was his wife's first 
time to be in Texas and out of the 
New England states.

Another son, Loyd Rutherford, 
was with us most of last week, 
assisting with farm work. Mr. and 
Mrs. Hilary Rutherford of Cole­
man were supper guests with us 
Monday night.

Mr. and Mrs. Tom Vinson had 
two grandsons, Dale and David 
Vinson of Hurst, and a nephew, 
Mr. and Mrs. Walter Lee o f San 
Angelo, in their home Sunday. 
The Vinsons were away from 
home.

Mrs. Maxey Morris of Coleman 
was a guest of Mr. and Mrs. 
Floyd Morris on Sunday, October

Leon Carter visited in the Floyd 
Morris home during the past 
week.

Our Whon Post Office has a 
new up-lift over the weekend. 
When the Post Office received a 
new paint job, which really looks 
nice. Mrs. Fitzpatrick, our Post­
mistress, plans other improve­
ments to our Post Office here. 
Our Whon Post Office does have a 
new sign, which has been 
installed for quite awhile. But the 
first of April someone took it upon 
themselves to take the Post Office 
sign down. They a very neat job, 
and took the sign all in one piece. 
It was awhile before M rs. 
Fitzpatrick could have the sign 
replaced, and hoping no one will 
take the sign away.

John David Morris of Eldorado 
was at home with his parents, the 
Floyd Morrises, at the weekend.

The Santa Anna High School 
Class o f 1950 met during the 
Homecoming weekend for their 
30 plus 1 reunion. The group 
gathered at the Derriel Warnock 
home following the football game 
Friday night for coffee, cake and 
visiting. They also sat in a group 
at the Saturday morning meeting

and had lunch at the school 
cafeteria.

The Presbyterian Church was 
the site of the meeting held 
Saturday afternoon. Old annuals, 
newspaper clippings, pictures 
and other mementoes were on 
display for the group to enjoy and 
remember. A card was signed by 
all present to be sent to Billy Joe 
Scott o f Three Rivers, who had 
planned to be present but became 
ill and was hospitalized at the

time.
Cass members present at one 

or both meetings were Julia 
Bailey Hartman o f Odessa, Lois 
Haynes W allace o f Palm er, 
Shirley Matthews Leach o f Azle, 
Eddie Edmondson Leonard o f 
Zephyr, Martha Priddy Floyd of 
Snyder, Richard Shield of Austin, 
Alwyn Brandon Jacobs o f Early, 
Helen Day Slusher of Odessa, 
Albrus Little of Midland, Patsey 
Baucom Jones of Fort Worth, and 
Patricia Davis Gardner of Gar­
land.

Others were Joe Sealy Price of 
Crosby, Charles Benge of Lub­
bock, Verna Stearns Bolton of 
Dallas, M argaret McCaughan 
Karthauser of Arlington, Lea 
Mitchell Mock of Post, Polly Little 
Warnock and Glen Scarborough

of Sai
greatest d ista i.
Morndock of Englcwoodk<#to. ;=

Also visiting with tirngrbup 
were former coach and class 
sponsor, Dow W. McBride and 
Mrs. McBride o f Brownwood, and 
former teacher Winnie McQueen 
of Coleman.

Other guests included Derriel 
Warnock, Marion Gardner and 
sons, Bob Slusher, Elizabeth 
Price and Robert, Duane Leach, 
Edd Floyd, Betty Scarborough 
and Amy, Bonnie Little, Leon 
Jones, David Karthauser, Sam- 
mie Jacobs, June Little Malaer, 
Linda Stewardson Slusher and 
Reba Hardy Loggins.

MISSISSIPPI VISITORS
Mr. and Mrs. C. E. Sigler of 

Waynesboro, Miss, spent the 
past week in Santa Anna with her 
sister and brother-in-law, Mr. 
and Mrs. Joe C. Barnes.

VISITS PARENTS
Mrs. John Porter and Diana 

returned to Round Rock today 
after spending the past week with 
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. Tom 
KIngsbery, while Mr. Porter was 
on a hunting trip to Colorado. 
Joining them here at the weekend 
was Carol Kingsbery of Austin, 
and Mr. and Mrs. C. D. Bruce 
were Saturday dinner guests.

*

LOOK!!! 
*3.89 *3.89*3.89

1/2 IB. T-BONE STUK
Includes baked potato or fries & salad bar

*3.89For Only
SIRLOIN FOR TWO - >17.50

SPECIAL ALL DAT LONG!
FREE SOFT DRINK FOR THE KIDS I

THE SECTION HAND STEAK HOUSE
ON THE BRADY HIWAY 

643-1581
I
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LET'S K EB 1 
THE INKIER

M TEXAS!
In cities and towns all across Texas, local water problems are threatening to 

erupt into one enormous statewide crisis. Countless communities are facing grow­
ing water supply, water treatment, sewage treatment and flood control problems 
estimated to cost a staggering $50 billion over the next 25 years. To make matters 
worse, federal funds for water projects have recently been slashed.

But on November 3, Texans have the opportunity to adopt a plan, already passed 
by two-thirds of the Legislature, which would harness a portion of our state’s 
budget surplus to help shoulder that heavy local burden.

The plan is proposed Constitutional Amendment No. 4.

Passage of Amendment No. 4 would:
• Make possible the sale of more than $200 million in authorized and urgently 

needed state bonds to address a backlog of needed projects.
• Create a loan guaranty program to enable local communities to save millions of 

dollars in issuing future bonds.
• Begin to build a "nest egg" for the future from a part of the state's budget 

surplus to assist local governments in financing hiture water and sewage 
projects.

Texas’ water needs must be met, either now 
or in the future. We can act now, and save 
money. . .  or pay the higher price later for our 
neglect, with possible increased taxes. Sensible 
action now makes much more sense for Texas.

Water^TForTexas
VOTE FOR CONSTITUTIONAL AMENDMENT NO. 4 
ON NOVEMBER 3!
Pol. Ad. paid by Water for Texas. 1011 Congress' Avenue. Suite 400. Austin, Texas 78701, Phone 512-472-7B72.



UMW, Nitia Daniel I Officers 

Are Installed at Meeting
Rockw ood News

By MBS. JOHN C. HUNTER

The United Methodist Worn* 
en met for a joint meeting 
Monday, October 26, at the 
Church Annex. Mrs. Gladys 
Hunter, president, led the meet­
ing and welcomed members. The 
invocation was led by Rev. Mike 
Alexander.

Mrs. Doris Griffin and Mrs. N. 
C. Watson were program leaders 
using the topic Tw o Copper 
Pennies - A  Gift of Love.' Mrs. 
Harry Crews was pianist for 
group singing.

Mrs. Lillian Herndon presented 
the nominating committee report, 
and the following officers were 
elected: Mrs. Hunter, president; 
Mrs. Lucile Smith, vice president; 
Mrs. Griffin, treasurer; Mrs. J. T. 
Avants, secretary; and Nitia

Officers for the Nitia Daniell 
group include Mrs. Herndon, 
chairman; M rs. Crews, vice 
chairman; Mrs. Watson, treas­
urer; Mrs. Dick Baugh, secretary.

Mrs. Xuma Jones is secretary of 
the Martha Group.

The new officers were installed 
by Rev. Alexander.

Mrs. Chester Galloway and 
Mrs. J. T. Avants were hostesses 
for the social hour, serving 
refreshments of cake, coffee and 
tea to the ones mentioned and 
also Mmes. Thelma Upchurch, 
Opal Little, Modora Gilmore, 
Lucile Wylie, Walter Scarbrough, 
Doris Kelley, Fred Williams, 
Mike Alexander and David, 
Nancy Cheaney, Ora Hunter, 
Lucille Dean, Hardy Blue, and 
Misses Pauline Eubank, Ruby 
and E. Lee Harper.

The Halloween motif was used 
in decorations on the refreshment 
table/.', ■'

Mrs. Hardy Blue gave the 
closing prayer.

The next meeting will be 
November 23.

SOCK
Mr. and Mrs. Bill Gustavas 

and Mika visited Friday evening 
with Mr. and Mrs. Jim Ruther­
ford . M r. and M rs. David 
Huggins and Amber were Sunday 
visitors.

Odis and Steve Fowler of Fort 
Worth spent Friday to Sunday 
with Mr. and Mrs. Bert Fowler.

Mrs. Carl Buttry had a call 
Sunday from her son-in-law, 
Clyde Wright o f San Angelo, for 
"Mother-in-Law' Day.

Joe C . Deal went to Abilene

injured badly.
Mr. and Mrs. Jack Cooper and 

Mr. and Mrs. Elec Cooper were in 
Brownwood for Sunday dinner 
out. The occasion was Mrs. Jack 
Cooper's birthday anniversary.

Mr. and Mrs. Elec Cooper 
visited in Brownwood Saturday 
morning with the Ronnie Cooper 
family who are moving into a new 
home.

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Cooper were 
in Temple Wednesday to Friday 
for Mr. Cooper's medical check- 

Thursday to meet his daughter, up with a good report, and also

More Drilling Sites 

Listed In Community

Mrs. Joel Gains, the former 
JoAnn Deal, of Manhattan Beach, 
Calif., who visited to Sunday with 
relatives. The Joe C. Deals were 
all Friday supper guests of Mr. 
and Mrs. R. J. Deal. Mr. and 
Mrs. R. J. Deal and Rolan were 
Saturday supper guests of the Joe 
C. Deals, and Abilene relatives 
visited with Mrs. Games at the 
Abilene A irport before her 
departure.

Mr. and Mrs. R. J. Deal visited 
at Holiday H ill W ednesday 
afternoon with her sister, Mrs. 
Lorene Winstead.

visited with Mr. and Ms. Arlen 
Allen and family and Mr. and 
M rs. Charles Sheffield and 
Monte.

Jan Daehnert of Irving, a 
former Rockwood pastor, visited 
Tuesday afternoon with tile R. J.
Deais#

Mr. and Mrs. Billy Deed of 
Mercury visited Monday after* 
noon with Linnie Box.

Mr. and Mrs. Carl Harkey of 
California spent several weeks 
this sumiper with Mrs. Gaud 
Box. As they were enroute home,

Bob Kihgsbery 

To Be Included 

In Honor Edition
Bob Kingsbery of Arlington, 

the grandson of Mr. and Mrs. C. 
D. Bruce, has recently been 
named for "Outstanding Young 
Men of America.' He will be 
included in the 1981 edition o f the 
publication.

kingsbery, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Jack Kingsbery of Crystal 
City, is a graduate of Carrizo 
Springs High School and Texas 
A&M University. He has recently 
been promoted to president of 
The Outfit, Inc., an agri­
marketing firm that includes 
marketing and consulting ser­
vices and a publishing subsidiary. 
The company specializes in 
marketing o f purebred beef 
cattle.

Mr. and Mrs. Olin Horton of 
Andrews spent the weekend with > couple of weeks with a sister and

afternoon. A brother, Willard 
Harkey of Austin, came Monday 
to visit a few days.

Donations to the Rockwood 
Mrs: Box accompanied them to Cemetery fund were from Elmer 
Lubbock where they visited a Watson Estate, and memorials to

Marianas Operating Co. Inc. of 
Abilene has filed application to 
drill No. 1 Jenny Birdwell as a 
Coleman County wildcat six miles 
south of Coleman.

The planned 3,500 foot test is 
located on a 155-acre lease in the 
Wade H. Bynum Survey 282.

Doyne Mclver of San Angelo 
has filed application to drill No. 2 
Cecil Ellis, a planned 1,990-foot 
regular field project 10 miles 
south of Santa Anna.

Drillsite is in the S. S.
Thompson Survey 3281.

*•*
Another regular field project 

will be drilled seven miles south 
of Santa Anna as W&K Oil and 
Gas Inc. o f Coleman, No. 1-A 0 . 
H. Watson.

The proposed 1,800-foot ven­
ture is located on a 50-acre lease
in Pleasant Young Survey 494. 

**•

Royalon Petroleum Inc. o f 
Dallas has staked No. 1 Hilburn 
Henderson as a Coleman County 
wildcat three miles north o f 
Trickham.

The proposed depth is 1,400 
feet on a 126-acre lease in Bonds 
& Sanders Survey A-56.

***
The community has gained a 

Jennings Sand gas discovery well 
with completion of Mclver Inc. o f 
San Angelo, No. 3 Grady Mclver.

Location is five miles northwest 
of Trickham, in the Pleasant 
Young Survey A-727.

Absolute open flow was 1,250,- 
000 cubic feet o f gas daily with a 
gas-liquid , hydrocarbon ratio of 
770,000 - 1 of 62 gravity.

The well is producing from 
perforations at 1,192-98 feet. 
Operator set the 4‘/ j-inch casing 
at 1,214 feet and the hole is 
bottomed at 1,224 feet.

her parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Johnnie Steward.

Joe F. Estes of Abilene spent 
Thursday night with Mr. and 
Mrs. Sam Estes.

Keith Thomas and three 
friends of Arlington spent Satur­
day and Sunday with Mr. and 
Mrs. J. P. Hodges, doing some 
bird hunting.

Tom Boy Johnson and wife of 
Odessa visites Saturday afternoon 
with Mr, and Mrs. Aubrey 
McSwain. Mrs. Jack McSwane 
and Mrs. Bob Mobley of Santa 
Anna visited Sunday morning 
after attending services at the 
Rockwood Methodist Church.

Mrs, Ada Hughes of Corpus 
Christi visited Tuesday to Friday 
With Mr. and Mrs. Howard 
Pearson and Mrs. Evan Wise. 
Mike Valicek of San Antonio 
visited Friday to Saturday with 
his grandmother, Mrs. Evan 
Wise, after a business trip to 
Midland.

Mrs. Goldie Milberger reports 
a one-car accident near her house 
at the intersection north of 
Rockwood. The car was totaled, 
but the family traveling were not

family, Mrs. Garnet Reeves. Mrs. 
Box returned home Wednesday. 
Mr. and Mrs. Junior Brusenhan 
and Mrs. R. W . Emerson visited 
Mrs. Box Saturday afternoon, and 
Mrs. Lon Gray visited Sunday

Carl Williams were from Mrs. 
Lon Gray, Mrs. Gaud Box, Mr. 
and Mrs. Howard Pearson, Tony 
Rehm, Mrs. Ray Caldwell, Jack 
Cooper, M r. and Mrs. Sam Estes, 
Lois Haines and Mr. and Mrs. Bill 
Steward.

COMPLIMENTARY FACIAL
Let me explain the secret 

of Mary Kay beauty to you through 

a complimentary facial. I also have many j 
deautiful gift ideas for Christmas

and other occassions.
Sandra Fitzpatrick 348-3670

PRE-HOLIDAY

The first equals sign de­
noted by = was used by 
Robert Record in his al­
gebra text The Whetstone 
of Witte, London, 1557. 
He chose the symbol be­
cause "no two things can 
be more equal" than two 
parallel straight lines.

The first full Technicolor 
film was Vanity Fair in 
193EhThe future Pat Nixon 
was in  it as an extra.

i t i

I -M u ffle rs?!
*  Custom  Duals *  I

I  Sou Jim m y A t  J
D  it R A u to m o tive  I  

lo w  Prices j j

Somethin' Fishy

"We Bring the World 
to Your Door Step

Betas from Tialand 

Rainbow'sfrom Australia 

Swordtails from South America 

Leaf fish from Africa

401 forty Btvd. 

Across from Mali

Hours 9-6 Mon-Sat.

Fateh for our

30%  OFF
A N D  M O R E

Lingerie
Jr. Sportswear

Sportswear

310Comat«rcia|3T address Cotemon.Te*.
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Ex-students and Former Teachers Are Listed 

At 1981 Santa Anna Homecoming
The following ex-students were 

registered at the Saturday, 
October 17, Homecoming:
Sandra Davis Guthrie 
Sherlyn Keeney Stevens 
Gail Robinett Horner * 
Debra Horton Dean 
Bettie Ruth Blue Henderson 
Hays Hefner, Lubbock 
Belva Heilman Rutherford, 

Coleman
Hilary Rutherford, Coleman 
Montie Guthrie III 
Patrick Hosch 
Donnie Neff
June Little Malaer, Abilene 
Albrus Little, Midland 
Opal Pritchard Little 
Bessie Smith Pallett 
Allyn Gill, San Marcos 
Ray Dean, Duncanville 
Sylva Ruth Byrd, Arlington 
M. L. Guthrie Jr.
Max Eubank
Bemidine Culpepper Watson
Julia Bailey Hartman, Odessa
Jim Everett, Houston
Joe Bell, Euless
Oma Dean McDonald Homer
Richard Homer
Jane Switzer Lovelady, Spice- 

wood
L* J. Lovelady, Spicewood 
Dickie Homer
Alice Anna Lovelady Smith, 

Stafford, Va.
LaQuinn Cooper Allen, Temple 
Arlen Allen, Temple 
Curran Pieratt, ^an Clemente, 

Calif.
Homer Alvin Burden 
Roberta Morgan Tomlinson 
Geneva Atkinson McDermitte, 

Balmorhea
Wendell Sparkman, Houston 
Julian Kelley
Carrie Blair Whitfield, Coleman 
Dean Bass
Mattie McCreary Gray,

Rockwood
Marjorie Pope Brewer, Brown- 

wood
Lorena Burris Monty, SanAntonio 
Jasper McClellan 
Veva Oakes McClellan 
Juanita A lexander Stephens, 

Lometa
Suzanne Renegar Smith 
Velma Alexander Price, Evant 
Aurelia Tweedle Brown 
William Brown

LaFonda Blount Buford, Odessa 
Lucille Lowe Balke 
Bonnie Balke Kuykendall , San 

Antonio
Patsy Baucom Jones, Hurst 
Glen Pope
Carolyn Lovelady Haynes, St. 

Charles, Mo.
Wanda Hodges Mclver, Katy 
Tom Vinson, Whon 
Nettie Yancy Vinson , Whon 
Leanna Pollock Hartman 
Ray Switzer 
Lois Shields Hamer 
Janice Donham Cozart 
Modora Kirkpatrick Gilmore 
Joyce Smith Burton, Midland 
Edna Smith Shipman, Midland 
Mary Simpson Lucksinger,

Austin
Myrton McDonald, Dallas 
Garrett Slaughter, Dallas 
Joe Sealy Price, Crosby 
Glynnda Gober Pricer, Abilene 
Lolette Gober Curry , Coleman 
Thelma Lowe Lowry 
Sybil Post Faubion, Coleman 
Lea Mitchell Mock, Post 
Betty Mitchell Miller, Austin 
Verna Steams Bolton, Rockwall 
Bessie Watkins Standley, Odessa 
Lucile Kirkpatrick Wylie 
Christine M arshall Watkins, 

Nashville, Tenn.
Eugene Watkins, Nashville,Tenn. 
Sallye Kirkpatrick Stewardson, 

Georgetown
Faye Turner Home, Waco 
Gaye Turner, Waco 
Helen Turner Goodloe 
Kathleen Turner Mitchell 
Charles Turner, Roswell, N. M. 
Audas Smith, Odessa 
Iris Dixon Williams 
Lorene Fiveash Wynn, Coleman 
Reba Hardy Loggins, Midlothian 
Jo Ann Morris Stevens, Pampa 
Alice Jane Lovelady Mayfield, 

Abilene
A. L. McGahey, Houston 
Sharon Wise Taylor, Abilene 
Linda Pittard, Abilene 
Hattie Fay Todd George, Brady 
Faye Routh Mobley 
Margaret Ann Mobley 
Shirley Matthews Leach, Azle 
Jack Watkins, Kingsville 
Helen Day Slusher, Odessa 
Ben Gene Tatum, Euless 
Aline Harper Reinback, Kerrville 
Geneva Caldwell, Midland

Maty John Wade Bums, Cook- 
viBe, Tenn.

CullenPmy,

Oderra Gillen Hunter, Blooming 
Grove (teacher)

Sue Milligan Newman 
Tom Newman 
Mildred Boardman Tinkle,. 

Abilene
Mark Sheffield, Brownwood 
Fay Atkinson Hill, Comanche 
Martha Harvey Thompson 
Leland Thompson 
Ruth Conley Current, Amarillo 
Lois Haynes Wallace, Palmer 
Joe Buse, Gordon 
Dolphus Ashmore, Levelland 
Leroy Pollock, Leander 
Ruby Moore Hartman 
Ruth Marie Moore Box, Brady 
Billie Lewellen McDonnell, Plains 
Geraldine Lewellen Graves, Gary 
Bessie Alford Lewellen, Plains 
Neal Oakes
Helen Upton Oakes, Coleman 
Fred Faulkner, Midland 
Mattie Haynes Lineberry, Bangs 
Fred Oakes, Dallas 
Marie Heilman Fullbright, Cole­

man
Dixie Baugh Bible, Sonora 
J. C. Bible, Sonora 
Bobby Joe Densman, Abilene 
Thomas Ray Rutherford, Con­

cord, N. H.
Leon Ward, Lake Kiowa 
Minnie Belle McMinn Richard­

son, Abilene 
Grace McMinn Short 
James Curtis, Houston 
Goldie Welch Haynes, Brown- 

wood
Kathryn Williamson Lee, San 
Angelo
George Haynes, Brownwood 
Carmella Flores Baugh 
Elizabeth Smith Paprowicz, Okla. 
Louise Boyd McCaughan, Fort 

Worth
Margaret McCaughan Karthaus- 

er , Arlington
Evangeline Mulroy Horton, 

Houston
Wayne Horton, Houston 
Pauline Little Wamock 
Artie Jean King Sitterle, Houston 
Lillie Stewardson King 
Melvin Pollock, Hurst 
Duane Moredock, Englewood, 

Colo.
Joe C. Barnes
June Bond Binion, Abilene
James Binion (teacher)

Abilene

.Pope
Terry Mclver

Evelyn Bruce Klngsbery, Crystal
City *

Margaret Jones Reid, Austin 
Annelle Shield Clark, Larsen, 

Wis
Charles Walker, Colorado City 
Glen ”

A.*g ! Weaver, Dallas'
Winnie McQueen , Coleman 

(teacher)
Janette Lovelady Turner 
Bemie Vinson Davis, Fort Worth 
Helen Vinson Ingram, Corpus 

Christi
Manon Ingram Keeter, Fort 

Worth
Mae Allen Blue (teacher)
Fern McCaughan Hoke
LaNita Benge Bozeman, New
Caney
Arthur Hill, Alpine 
Delmer Crye, Coleman 
LaVelle McClintock Haynes, 

Kermit
Lyndon Haynes, Kermit 
Gayla Mclver Sellers, Cleburne 
Donald Ray Owen, Kemp 
Patricia Davis Gardner, Garland 
J. G. Williamson, Corpus Christi 
Helen Hall Kirkpatrick, Amarillo 
Everett Kirkpatrick, Amarillo 
Bessie Caylor, Brady 
Gene Ricek, Duncanville

'Jewie L  SpfldaQMi 
John Sidney West, Crown City, 

Ohio
Willie C: Gilbreath, Coleman 
Voncille Taylor Estes, Weather­

ford
Frances Stafford Shamblin, Gran­

bury
Bill Shamblin, Granbuty 
Billy Joe Parish, Tucumcari, 

N. M.
Virginia Lewellen Zirkle, Austin 
Ethel Jones Williams 
Dick Jones, Houston 
Arlene Welch Haynes, Arlington 
Weldon Haynes, Arlington 
Doyne Mclver, San Angelo 
Sue Holmes King, Brownwood 
Alice Anna Guthrie Spillman 
R. C. Smith (teacher)
D. W. McBride, Brownwood 
Don McCullough, San Antonio 
Genie Haynes Mclver 
Grady Mclver
Carolyn Woods Stone, DeSoto 
Evanell Arrant Hefner, Lubbock

drive

Pet Emporium
Ask About our Puppy Layaway

AKC Puppies

Birds

Feeds
Reptiles

Hamsters

Mice

Fish 
Gerbils 

Guinea Pigs
Hermit Tree Crabs

643-3951
(Heartland Mall Brownwood

B a n g ’s D ru g  M art

Effective October 3 1
We will be dosing 

at 1:00 Saturday only

M o n d a y — Frid a y Open 9 -  6

Coleman Automotive
Supply

Shop and Compare Our Prices

Custom Made Hydraulic Hoses

Freddie Gardner — Owner
Phone: 625-2512 Coleman Nights & Holidays 625-3029

Frame Master
Custom homing & Matting Mirrors

Ready Made Frames

limited EdHkm Prints To Order

Have Your Class Pictures Framed & Matted

10% Off

H o w s 9 :0 0 -6 :0 0  Charles Vonpett - O w h w  

M o a .-S a t. 41SW.Unoak Colem an

Phone 625-3269 
W g h t*625-3357
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By CLABA CUPPS Held For ESA Chapter
Mrs. Kathleen Av&nts and 

Sabrina, Lynn Stephenson and 
Holly visited her parents, the

the Lonnie Lowrys at Bangs on 
Sunday.

Hardon Phillips visited Bruce 
Alsobrook Saturday. He alsoBruce Hibbetts, Sunday.

C. E. W ise visited the Adolph visited Mrs. Ivy Taylor 
K elleys W ednesday m orning. Mildred Cammack visited Mrs. 
The Kelleys visited Pete Curry Amanda Perry Sunday evening.

Mrs. Gladys Haynes visited

The Delta Omicron chapter, 
Epsilon Sigma Alpha held the 
annual jew el pen cerem ony 
Saturday night, October 24, for 
the installation o f a new member. 
Jo Whitworth was named to

membership in the local chapter 
at the close of the fall rush 
season.

Bernidine Culpepper, chapter

Local Serviceman 

Completes Course
Pvt. Eddie R. Dawson, son of

Nancy Bodine o f Santa Anna, has 
com pleted a tracked-vehicle 
mechanic course at the U.S. Army 
Armor School at Fort Knox, Ky. 

During the course, students

Thursday night at Brownwood 
Lake. Mr. and Mrs. Gordon 
Kelley of Abilene spent the 
weekend with the Kelleys, and 
the Travis Smiths, Nancy and 
Laura Hendry of San Angelo 
joined the family group Sunday 
afternoon.

Those visiting the R. W. Cupps 
home over the weekend were 
Mrs. Lucille Blanton and little 
Leslie Genz of Fort Worth, Mrs. 
Winnie Haynes, Linda White and 
her husband, Billy Don and 
‘Casha of Brownwood.

W ednesday afternoon Ruth 
Campbell visited M rs. Leta 
Parker. Mrs. William Ragsdale 
ind Mrs. Carl Autry of San 
Angelo visited that afternoon, 
inoMargaret Campbell and Mrs. 
1. K. Jones were also visitors in 
he Campbell home during the 

. veek. ■ ■ 1 .
Mrs. Carmilla Baugh went to 

langs several times to visit her 
nother, Mrs. Mae Flores, who is 
nproving a lot.
Mrs. Lucille Cupps went to 

oleman Saturday to visit Richard 
Veils and Maggie Leonard. She 
iso visited Bob and Sydney 
urleson and family, and Justin 
>.me home with her.
Donna and Max Mapson and 

ison of Brownwood will be 
sending a few days with Mrs. 
eaulah Fleming and girls.
Ovella Williams and Eveline 
erring attended the funeral of 
rs. Mary Stevens in Bangs 
ednesday.
V. H. Russell is in the 
ownwood Regional Hospital, 
ilmoth took him Saturday 
ternoon. Mrs. Pearl Etheridge 
Banes and Mrs. Ruth Walling 
Dallas ate dinner with the 

issells Saturday, and Mr. and 
rs. John Howard and the 
eldon Priests visited the group 
turday. Oleta is feeling well 

>w. ■ '
Syble Huggins and Amber 
tended a birthday party for 
na Huggins Friday at Cole- 
in. She is the daughter of the 
il Huggins.
Mr. and Mrs. R. V. Boyd of 
ano visited Saturday with the A. 
Pierces. Troy Pierce spent the 

?ekend, and Cindy Pierce and 
mes Pelton spent the day 
inday and had dinner. Mrs. 
;rkins of Coleman visited late 
inday.
Those visiting Mrs. Betty Joyce 
ipps Sunday were Michael, 

and Shane Cupps, Janice 
is Fellers. Betty Joyce 

tried Aunt Byrdie Miller to 
rownwood Friday shopping.
Mr. and Mrs. Bill Lowry visited

terry anc 
id Curtis

1  ■■■■1 * “ 1 back the
|A • family insurance
i */ i  1 sell with
i f  ' : 2 good neighbor
m  - 1 service.”

Mrs. Bernice Battles Thursday. Fleming and Peggy Sikes went to 
Mrs. Vera Wise visited Friday. Alice to visit their son, Charlie 

Sammie LaDoucer and Mrs. and Frances Fleming, Leslie and 
Tavy Ford went to Coleman to Chris. They returned home late 
visit their sister, Mrs. Lula Sunday night. Roger Sikes 
Hancock at Holiday Hill rest visited his grandparents Wed- 
home. Peggy Lancaster of Brown- nesday night, 
wood came up Sunday afternoon Marsha and Shannon Brown 
to visit with her mother. had a pre-Halloween party at the

president, was in charge of the were trained to repair engines, 
meeting held at the Methodist transm issions and the fuel, 
Church annex. electrical and air hydraulic

Members and their husbands systems of the Army's tracked- 
enjoyed a barbecue supper and vehicles. They also learned to 
visiting during the evening, with perform recovery operations for

Brownie Brooke and Jeffery of 
Comanche came up Saturday to 
cut wood at the Coy Brooke place. 
Jeffery spent Saturday night and 
Sunday Shala and Glen McDonald 
came after him, returning home 
late Sunday afternoon. Tne Coy 
Brookes visited the E. A. 
Densmans in Coleman Friday 
evening.

Tommy and Sherry Watson and 
Mitzi and Wynndi of Coleman 
spent the day Sunday with the 0 . 
H. Watsons.

Friday Mr. and Mrs. Charlie

Randy Brown home Saturday 
night. Those attending were 
Missy Cook. LeAnn Musick, Rosa 
and Mary Castillo.

Monday afternoon I got to visit 
with two dear friends at the Santa 
Anna Bank, Mrs. Laura Carpen­
ter and Mrs. E. K. Jones. I 
always see Mends there: It is a 
nice place to visit.

We have had lots of rain lately 
and the tanks are running full. 
That is most of them are.

Hope all of you have a good 
week.

Pam Morgan and Lois Ann 
Harper as hostesses.

Those present were the ones 
mentioned and also Romona and 
Jerry Myers, JoAn and Clint Day, 
Cathy and John Pearce, Patti 
Musick, Susie Voss, Betty Martin 
and David Morgan.

BACK AT HOME
Ford Barnes is back at home 

and getting along well after 
spending the past month in an 
Abilene convalescent center . He 
was in Ranger Park Hospital 
three months for treatment of a 
broken hip before going to 
Abilene for further treatment.

abandoned, damaged, disabled or 
mired vehicles.

Dawson is a former student at 
Santa Anna High School, entering 
the Army early last summer.

Reed Memorial Co.

MMHUMnte of Diettnctfea

Fort Worth Highway 
Brownwood, Texas 

Box 265 Phone 6467625

Sylvia Herring 
Local Representative

Why gas is so efficient:
j vm

-rriTOH

c fV

Ihf-

l

Gas is a  natural fuel, not a manufac­
tured energy. By using gas directly in 
your appliances, you get natural 
economy and natural efficiency to help.

you hold down utility bills. And Lone Star 
can deliver all the gas you need for your 
home. It’s another reason to pe glad 
you’re served by the Lone Star system.

■ i

ME. Gas. It’s plentiful, efficient and right for the times.
l l p i P

JMMeANAULY impany
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Miscellaneous For Sale

ORDER YOUR CHRISTMAS 
PRESENTS NOW! Will make 
personalized rag dolls or have 
Raggedy Ann and Andy. Call 
348-3525. 44-ltc

FfOCUTV FEATURES I
FARMERS and ranch­

ers Find OUR POLICY, A 
CAREFULLY PLANNED 
MEASURE Of Their 
NEEDS, Never Making An 
Inch of COVERAGE OVER­
LAP, SAVING UP TO 
30%!

B & B  BUILDERS 
All phases of building construct­
ion, new and remodeling. Elect­
rical, carpentry, plumbing, paint­
ing, roofing, concrete work. Call 
Coleman (collect) 625-4867. After 
6 p.m. 348-3635. 26-tfc

II
HOSCH @

Insurance Agency
348-3 1 1 5

709 W a l l i s  A**. Santa Anna

I

SHOP BEAL'S GARDEN CEN­
TER for Christmas. Layaways 
accepted. Windmills, Bird Baths, 
Wicker, Martin Houses, Plant 
Stands, etc. 40tfc

FOR SALE— Historic two-bed­
room home in lovely neighbor­
hood. Unusual all-masonry 
Construction. Also have 
buyer for 3-bedroom home in 
Santa Anna. Max Eubank Real 
Estate. 348-3636. 41-tfc

FOR SALE— Three bedroom, 
one bath frame house. Carpeted, 
well insulated. Double carport, 
extra-modern kitchen, on large 
lot next to mountain. Very nice. 
Modora K. Gilmore, broker, 
348-3161. 40-tfc

Garage Sale

- \  •

Card o f Thanks

NOW IS THE TIME to apply 
LAWN FOOD containing iron on 
your lawn. BeaPs Garden Center 
In Coleman. 37-ltc

TWO-FAMILY GARAGE SALE— 
Saturday, Oct. 31. James Bryan 
home, 2 miles east o f Santa Anna. 
Watch for signs. 9 a.m. - 5 p.m.

44-ltp

We want to express our 
heartfelt thanks for the many 
kindnesses shown during the 
illness and death o f our loved one. 
Especially your calls, cards, 
flowers and prayers were most 
helpful, and we are truly grateful. 
Norman would be truly pleased at 
the many memorials to file worthy 
causes in which he was interest­
ed. God bless each one of you. 
Mrs. A. Norman Walters 
Mr. and Mrs. George Vaughn

BUY, SELLOR TRADE-New and 
used furniture. Travis Trading 
Pst, 402 N. Colorado, Coleman, 
Texas 25-tfc

X
Santa An na 
Electric C o . 

348-3505

©

CHAIN SAW S - HAND SAW S - CIRCULAR SAW S 

PLANER - JOINER KN IVES - SC ISSO R S - CH ISELS

we.

H e lp W anted
SHARP-ALL SHOP

102 N. 8th
SANTA ANNA. TX 76878

NEEDED - Active or retired RN to 
work two days a week. Light work 
load. Ranger Park Inn, 348-3158.

40-tfc
JIM KEENEY Phone: 348-3593

Taking applications
fo r nurses aides 

a t
Ranger Parickin

SHOP AT HOME

Blair Products
Gift Items, Christmas - 

cosmetics,e ■
J decorations, Jewelry and 
t many other items.
S Shown at Your Home 
• 
e.

1 348-3772
* Before8a.m.-After5p.m.

ABERNATHY
Dirt & Conservation W ork

| Specializing In Tanks And Land Clearingl

After 6 :00  PM Call
Lee 785-4401 Rickey 785-4235]

Call K ay Cooper

>»«

Y O U  C A N  FIN D  

H e a te r Radiants 
Rubber Rain Suits 

Foot Lockers &  Trunks
A T

The

Mips

WESTERN Al/TO

Layaway How for Christmas 

While Selections are Good
Low Down Payment 

hoMs your Purchase until Dec. 2Wi

Western Auto
Santa

.......Hun'n ‘ •, 1 M , i ...........  All New

Hom es Fo r R ent l  * * , „ , * *
------------ ---------------------------------  k  Chair................ $198.00

FOR RENT— Three bedroom 5-piece dinette..........$89.00
unfurnished house, 306 S. Hous- y g unjc g ecjs
ton, $135 per month, p l u s ?  (Complete)........ $190.00
deposit. Make application at the Twin size mattress 
office of Dr. Cabansag, 348-3122. a  an(j t,ox..................$89.00
FOR RENT— Three bedroom \  Full Size mattress
unfurnished house, 306 S. Hous- f  an ° x.......V/” ‘
ton, $135 per month; 3-bedroom ® Queen Sue mattress
unfurnished house, 1007 Ave. D „ C  and tra ... . .. . . . . . .S169.00
$150 per month; 2-bedroom |  King Size mattress
house, stove and refrigerator }  “ d bo1..................S219'001
furnished, 308 S. Second St., $95 ~ i o  i c  •*
per month; 2-bedroom house, 306 V J «  L rU  m  ITUr©
S. Second St., $85 per month. All ft .
plus deposit. Make application at f  ****
the office of Dr. Cabansag, J  
348-3122. 3 8 - t f c jJ ^  915/ 643-4949

Beal's Garden Center
“ We’re More Than Just a Garden Center”  

FERTILOAM DEALER
For WEED ANDJF^jED FERTILIZER FOR GRASSES

SELECT FROM LARGE VARIETY
TROPICAL PLANTS A lARGE llN E  0F CONCRETE

,,m M r A B e i I 1 , BIRD BATHS, FOUNTAINS,
FALL BULBS FOR SALE STATUARY, NOVELITY ITEMS

WE BUY PECANS AND PLANTERS
We Wrap Plants For All Occalons.

1410 Commerical Coleman We alsoJVlake Deliveries.

Brazos Pipeline Corp.
□  PULLING UNIT a

*OUfMd Generators for Lease 
• Test Tanks * Roustabout Crew 
^  Im ^R^^Up With Casfaig Crew

Paul Martin, Mgr. 
Day [915] 348-3046

Trickham, Tex. 76878 
Night [915] 348-3066

u e o c ii
REAL ESTATE

625-4181
V. J. Kemper 625-5794 
James Hunter 625-2232

115 W. Liveoak Street 
Coleman, Texas 
Office 625-4181

REALTOR'

ki the Santa Asm Area

455 Acres o f improved grasses, oak trees, 4 
good stock tanks, excellent fences, county roads 
on 2 sides, deer, turkey, quail and dove.

36 Acres, housing for a large family, work 
shop, garages, out buildings, city water, stock 
tank, ‘/i  minerals.

mm
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BISCUITS.
SHOOFOESH KM RIERS

Margarine

Thursday, October 29,1981
y  _ • . - , . .  '■ • s  '  ■ ■ ■■ - ■ ■■— * | -

^BO’z f
CANS

* i  • i  i  i

1 LB. 
PNG.

’

PRICES EFFECTIVE OCTOBER 26 THRO NOVEMBER 1.1981 - WHILE SUPPLIES LAST

c o f f e e .

BORDET S CHOCOLATE

MILK QT.

0  SHURF1NE CHUNK STYLE DRY

v DOG FOOD 2.VI
SHURFIME FROSTED 60/79/100 WATT

ALLSUPS ASSTB.

ICE CREAM
SHURFREShAMERICAN C 4  A Q  SHORFIREFROSTED00/7

CHEESE a r l *  LmotBoios 2CT.
PKG.

$149

SHURFRESH

Honey Duns
SHURFINE ASSORTED

Cake Mikes
SHORFIRE ASSTD. FLAVORS

COLA
SHURFINE ALUMINUM

FOIL

9 0 Z.
PKG.

IBVe O Z J 
BOX

2 LITER 
, BTL.

v2 GAL/ 
HD.CTK.

SHURFRESH COLBYLOH6HORH

ICE
cream

JLfiEENBEANS

V

12X25 FT. 
ROLLS 17 OZ. 

CANS i
i SWEET COR#

SHURFIME

CATSUP

CHEESE
RATH ALL MEAT

FRANKS
SHURFINE STRAWBERRY

PRESERVES
SHURFINE FANCY TOMATO

JUICE
SHURFINE FRESH SHELLED

PEAS 8U“EYE

10 OZ. 
PKG.

12 OZ. 
PKG.

1R 0Z .
JAR

46 OZ.i 
. SAN

15 OZ.i 
CANS

32 OZ. 
BTL.

SHURFINE

* SPINACH X 1csA°.zs S U G
Q AAMULATED

SUGAR

SHURFINE GRANULATED

SUGAR

UVU U R *

t u n a

SHURFINE WAFFLE

SYRUP
SHURFINE WHOLE PEELED

Tomatoes
SHURFINE SALT1NE

32 OZ. 
. BTL

$ 1 ® ®  ^ ( g y

10 02.
CM S

” ™  7 QC CRACKERSPEPPER vt 1 9 B̂SS1
1 LB. 
BOX

m  s i b .
w  S A G

SHURFINE

FLOUR
79 , PL^U| *

y .

SHUP ALLSUP'S FOR TRICK OR TREATS 
WE HAVE A LARGE SELECTION OF CARRY!

CONVENIENCE STORES

i
I

in p

SHURFINE PINK

SALMON
SMOOFIK STHAIIED CRAHBEIBY

SAUCE
QIIIIBCIINEanUlirilC

Pork H Beans

15 02. 
CAN

•  •  •  ■ •

1002.
CANS

TSOZ.
CANS

BATH BREAKFAST

SAUSAGE
SNOBFIII FAULT HMVEST

■ •■111

B i f y . & /
» ■ -

T LB .

1 7  OZ.
I CMS —

■H sSifiSaWSBlsfyilg'; iS&iwSfBifti
••‘•s- • v ‘ .* ' r ' • * */•'*£ ’ ’’ .
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