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Gardens and orchards are 
producing well this year with all 
the good mositure. Among the 
good gardners is Weldon Priest, 
who came by the office Monday 
with a fig the size of a small 
orange! The fruit is from a young 
fig bush that has few figs, but of 
exceptionally large size. A few 
that size will go a long way, too.

bk
Not all of us are having 

such good luck, however. Grass­
hoppers are still thick in many 
parts of the rural area, eating 
their way through gardens and 
yards.

Among interesting facts about 
grasshoppers, they consume 
green forage rortghly eight times 
as fast in proportion to their 
weight as beef animals, eating 
their own weight in green food in 
about 16 hours.

The Extension Service has 
estimated that seven grass* 
hoppers per square yard over ten 
acres of rangeland can eat the 
equivalent amount of one cow.

Mail Del ivery 

Delayed By 

Rural Accident
Mail service on Santa Anna’s 

Route One was delayed Monday 
when carrier Leland Thompson 
was in a collision.

Thompson, driving a 1977 
Dodge pickup, was in the collision 
with a foreign-made pickup truck 
driven by Malcom Laing of Fort 
Worth, an employee of an oil 
company. The mishap occurred 
on a county road at a "blind 
curve.”

According to Butch Wampler of 
the Department of Public Safety, 
both vehicles were severely 
damaged and had to be towed 
from the scene. No one was 
injured in the accident.

Thompson was taken to Santa 
Anna following the mishap and 
got his auto to continue the mail 
route.

In another auto mishap Mon­
day, a 1981 Mercury rental car 
driven by Jimmy Hendrix of 
Denver, Colo, hit a deer on Farm 
Road 1176 north of town at 4:30 
a.m. Although damaged, the auto 
was driven on to Dallas where 
Hendrix caught a plane for his 
home. He had spent the weekend 
in Santa Anna with his step­
father, Virgil Cupps, and was 
enroute home at the time of the 
accident. A passenger in the auto 
was his nephew, Dewey Ham­
monds of Irving, who had been 
here for the weekend.
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Buffalo School and Gymnasium

B u f f a l o  R e u n i o n  T h is  W e e k e n d
Activities Planned Saturday and Sunday 

For Former Residents and Students
Former residents of the 

Buffalo community and former 
students at the Buffalo School will 
be meeting this weekend in Santa 
Anna for the second annual 
homecoming and reunion. About 
500 people are expected this year,

McCrary Station 

Sold Recently
A Santa Anna business has 

changed ownership recently. Mc­
Crary Fina Station , owned and 
operated by Luther McCrary the 
past 25 years, has been sold to 
Alton (Buddy) Benge and Timmy 
Benge. The change in operation 
was effective Wednesday, June 
17.. ■ ,

Timmy Benge, an employee at 
the station for several years, will 
be managing the business. His 
father will be associated with the 
station operation in addition to be 
employed with 3-M Corporation 
in Brownwood.

McCrary , who has farming and 
livestock interests north of Santa 
Anna, will continue working at 
the station on a part time basis for 
awhile. The station is located in 
the east part of town, adjacent to 
the McCrary home at the corner 
of Wallis and North Houston 
Street.

Driver Education Class 
Ending Session Friday

an increase over the first event in 
June 1980.

Pete Curry of Lake Brownwood, 
president of the group, and others 
on the committees have listed the 
schedule of events that will start 
with registration at the Civic 
Center (Armory) at 9 a.m.

Sunday activities will start with 
a memorial service at 9:30 a.m., 
visiting during the morning and a 
barbecue dinner at noon.

Other committee chairmen are 
Leland Thompson, arrangements; 
Odie Griffith, food; Adolph 
Kelley, entertainment; Lucille 
Baker Smith, historian; and 
Lucile Wylie, registration.

Marion Smith of Coleman is 
vice president of the group, and

Saturday morning, and activities j ^ i l  Gilliam Nichols of Casper,

Thirteen Santa Anna students 
are completing their Driver 
Education class this week, taught 
by Gerald Brister. The course 
consists of 32 hours of classroom 
instruction, 12 hours of simulator 
driving, and three hours of actual 
driving and three hours of 
observation.

The simulator training is 
available in the mobile classroom 
furnished by the Education

Service Center in San Angelo, 
located at the school campus 
while the class is in session.

will continue through the day.
A program and visiting is 

planned during the afternoon, 
and a banquet Saturday at 6 p.m.

A dance will be held at 9 p.m. 
that evening.

Wyo. is secretary - treasurer.
All area residents are invited to 

attend any or all of the reunion 
,and visit with friends and former 
residents who will be on hand for 
the homecoming this weekend.

Students taking the course this 
year include Robbie Clifton,
Jeannie Radicke, Cindy Pierce,
Randy Casey, Bodie Stark, Mike 
Hartman, LaNita Switzer, Robin
Hartman, Connie Culpepper, A +  A n n o l n
Paul Vasquez, James Bass, ™  r U i y t f l U  Q lU l t ?

S-Anna Student 
On Honor List

Richard Malaer and Amy Day.

Camp Meeting Through Sunday
The annual Cowboy Camp 

Meeting will continue through 
Sunday, June 28, at Flying H 
Acres between Santa Anna and 
Coleman. Services are held each 
evening at 8 p.m., with a

night) will be Bob Monsey of 
Daisy , Oklahoma. Special music 
will be presented at each service.

Lester Roloff, a Corpus Christi 
evangelist, was speaker for the 
opening service, attracting a 

chuckwagon supper planned Sat- large crowd and much publicity.
urday evening at 6 p.m.

Evangelist George Havens, 
founder and director of the 
annual event, will be speaker for 
the services Friday through 
Sunday. Speaker Thursday (to-

Roloff is widely-known for his 
fight to separate church and 
state, having been taken to court 
for operating homes for de­
linquent children without a state 
license.

Debra Ann Brister, the 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Gerald 
Brister, has been listed on the 
Dean’s Honor Roll at Angelo 
State University for the spring 
semester. She maintained a grade 
average to qualify for the 3.00 to 
3.49 honor list.

Miss Brister, a senior health 
and physical education major at 
ASU, will graduate from the 
university in August. She has

Subscription 

Rates to Increase
Subscription rates for The 

Santa Anna News are Increasing, 
effective July 1. The rate Increase 
Is the first since 1979, and Is 
necessary due to Increases In 
postal rates and all other 
materials and expenses.

Subscriptions for Santa Anna 
and Coleman County will be $8.95 
per year; rates for subscribers In 
Texas, outside Coleman County, 
will be $9.95. Outside of Texas 
will have a yearly rate of $10.95 
Price on the news stands win

already accepted the position as increase to 20 cents per copy, 
head track coach and assistant Subscribers have until Tues- 
basketball coach at Fredricksburg day, June 30, to take advantage of 
High ' School. She is a 1978 the current rate, 
graduate of Lometa High School. n M M W M W H V W M b /
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Bangs High School Student 
Gives AARP Program

Mrs. Lucile Wyle, president of 
the Santa Anna-Bangs Chapter of 
the American Association of 
Retired Persons presided over the 
June meeting held at the Bangs 
Community Center. A covered 
dish luncheon was served to 27 
members and 4 visitors.

The invocation was given by 
Mr. Thomas Williams.

The tables were laden in white 
tablecloths centered with white 
baskets filled with pastel colored 
silk flowers.

After lunch, Mrs. Lora Allison, 
program chairman, introduced 
the speaker, Miss Shigeko Kan- 
da, an exchange student from

Campfire Girls 

To Assist With 

Buffalo Reunion
The Adventure Group of 

Campfire Girls will be helping 
with the Buffalo Homecoming 
and Reunion this weekend. Their 
project will also help raise funds 
for the group.

At noon Saturday the girls will 
serve sandwiches, chips, cup­
cakes, cold drinks and coffee, 
and that evening will be serving 
cold drinks to visitors attending.

A decorated cake, made and 
donated by Billie Perry, will be 
given away during the weekend 
by the girls group.

Japan, who spoke on customs and 
ways of living in Japan.

The business meeting was 
held. Minutes were read by Mrs. 
Eunice Kowierschke and the 
treasurers report was given by 
Mrs. Opal Little.

The July meeting will be in 
Santa Anna and all members are 
urged to attend. Visitors are 
welcome.

Former S-Annan 

Buried Monday
Funeral services were held in 

Colorado City Monday, June 22, 
for Lora Fletcher Albert, 60, who 
died Saturday in Colorado City 
after a long illness. Burial was in 
Colorado City.

Mrs. Albert was reared in the 
Santa Anna area, the daughter of 
the late Mr. and Mrs. Will 
Fletcher. She attended the Leedy 
School and was married to Gene 
Albert.

Survivors are her husband, two 
sons and several grandchildren. 
Also surviving are two brothers, 
Clay Fletcher of Artesia, N. M. 
and Jesse Fletcher of Graham.

Local people attending the 
funeral Monday were Mr. and
Mrs. Marshall Wallace of Cole­
man, Mrs. Bessie Parish and 
Martin Wallace of Santa Anna.

IN ABILENE HOSPITAL
Mrs. Don Clifton was in 

Abilene last week with her father, 
J. D. Clay of Aspermont, who is 
convalescing from a,.heart attack. 
He is getting along well at 
Hendrick Hospital and expected 
;o be dismissed next week.

Everyone 

sleeps better

with bedside 
security

isn’t it comforting to know you have a

BACK AT HOME
Mrs. Lillian Herndon is back 

at home after a 10-day vacation 
trip with Mr. and Mrs. Paul 
Wilburn and Mr. and Mrs. 
Dewral Wilburn of Big Lake. 
They went to Oklahoma City to 
visit Mrs. Herndon’s nephew and 
family, Mr. and Mrs. Alfred 
Wilburn and Todd, and back by 
Dallas to visit Mr. and Mrs. 
Robert Alton Wilburn and Brett.

I
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New Hours For 

Local Laundry
"7" Mary Shields has been 
employed at Modern Way 
Laundry and will be on duty 
Tuesday and Friday and until 
noon each Wednesday. Edith 
Dodson, who with her husband 
formerly owned and operated the 
business, will be working Monday 
and Thursday of each week.

Donnie Neff, a co-owner of the 
business, also announced the 
laundry will be open each Sunday 
from 1 - 8 p.m . Other hours are 8 
a.m.- 9 p.m. with no attendant on 
duty Wednesday afternoon, Sat­
urday or Sunday.

Neff and Terry Mclver pur­
chased the business two weeks 
ago from Freddie Dodson who 
had owned the coin-operated 
laundry the past 25 years.

Thursday, June 25,1981

NOW  O P EN
Our Popular

"Summer Salad B a r"
Plenty of Air Conditioning 
and Cool, Crisp Salads

4 -8 p .m .d a ily
Served alone or with your favorite entree

Seating Capacity of 1,000 
( 32 at a time)

CHILDREN VISIT
Mr. and Mrs. Robbie Drake 

of Clute were weekend visitors 
with her parents, Mr. and Mrs. R. 
C. Smith. On Saturday night the 
Smiths, Vicki andRobbie Drake, 
Dick and Lori Smith went to 
Brownwood for dinner to cele­
brate the Smiths’ wedding 
anniversary.

The Drakes were here to attend 
the Drake family reunion at Lake 
Coleman Sunday.

COW POKES

The Best Little Cafe in Texas

telephone at your side? You don’t have to v  

get up to answer the phone or to make a call.

— !
Coleman County !
Telephone Co-Op J

(W in d y  B's)
Coffee Simp 

& Cafe

By Ace Reid

“ It’s worth a trip to toiler this guy 
jest to see what he does when he 

gits where he’s goin’!”

Santa Anna National Bank
PASS BOOk SAVINGS

by m e  Up to SIM,MO

MONEY MAKER 0 MONTH GEKTOICAXES OF DEPOSIT 
ABvwud by Unr 

to n wkwd tor
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Whon
News

3y Mrs. Tom Rutherford
Seems 1 will begin this weeksgm

on a report on myself. On Friday 
of last week we were in Abilene to 
see the doctor and we had a good 
report. The doctor told me the 
bone was completely healed, but 
the muscles are sore from being 
so disturbed. I am slowly getting 
off the walker, but still have lots 
of soreness in my leg. 1 am 
looking forward to a complete 
recovery. Thanks for all the 
encouragement that has come my 
way from everyone.

Weekend guests in the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Riley McFarlin in 
Santa Anna were Mr. and Mrs. 
Carl Smith of Cayuga, Texas, 
Mrs. Lena Gunn of Brownwood, 
Mrs. Carrie Bible of Bangs, Mr. 
Allen Wells and Mr. and Mrs. 
George Daniel Wheatley and son 
Danny of Santa Anna. The group 
all attended the annual Wells 
reunion at Coleman Park.

Mr. and Mrs. Glen Grote and 
daughters made a journey to his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Fred 
Grote, in the Fredericksburg 
vicinity on Saturday. Mr. Grate’s 
little nephew, Roby Hunt, re­
turned home for a few days visit 
with the Grates.

Mr. and Mrs. Billy Radle and 
boys, Mike, Chris and Phil of 
Moore* Okla., were guests of his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Bean 
Radle, in Santa Anna from Friday 
to Monday.

Mr. and Mrs. Nicky Poldrack o f' 
Brownwood were also guests 
during the weekend in the Radle 
home.

Mr. and Mrs. Ray Traweek of 
Bangs visited with Mr. and Mrs. 
Tom Rutherford Thursday after­
noon. Mr. Traweek stopped by 
again Sunday afternoon.

Mr. and Mrs. Glen Grote enter­
tained friends out of Brownwood 
in their home Sunday following 
church services there.

We have just talked to Mrs. 
Tom Vinson. She has received 
word of the death of her brother, 
Mr. Jay Yancy in California; also 
the death of a cousin, John Brown 
from Stacy or Leaday. Our 
sympathy to those in sorrow.

Mr. and Mrs. Tom Rutherford 
were dinner guests with our 
daughter, Mr. and Mrs. Bob 
Smith of Abilene, on Friday, the
day I was back to see the doctor.

Mr. and Mrs. Graham Fitz­
patrick had all their children 
home over the weekend and for 
Father’s Day, Mr. and Mrs. Jacky 
Bullion and Michelle of O ’Don-

Read Memorial Co.

nell, Mr. and Mrs. Don Fitz­
patrick and Brandon of Santa 
Anna and Mr. and Mrs. Neil Fitz­
patrick and Josylyn of Odessa. All 
returned home Sunday afternoon 
except Michelle who remained for 
a longer visit with her grand­
parents.

Mrs. Doris Thurber and two 
grandsons, Kevin and Ronnie 
Peek of St. Petersburg, Fla. are 
visiting with Mrs. Jacky Morris 
and children in Santa Anna. They 
were all guests with Mrs. Floyd 
Morris Monday. Mrs. Thurber is 
Mrs. Jacky Morris’ mother.

Mr. and Mrs. Hilary Ruther - 
ford of Coleman visited his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Tom 
Rutherford, Sunday afternoon, 
bringing ice and making ice 
cream.

Mrs. Graham Fitzpatrick re­
ports she heard of the death of 
Mrs. Gene (Lora) Alberts who 
was buried in Colorado City 
Monday afternoon. Mrs. Alberts 
was the daughter of the late Mr. 
and Mrs. Will Fletcher who came 
to the Whon church for several 
years. Mr. and Mrs. Alberts and 
two sons, Eddie and Jerry, lived 
and worked on the Gill Ranch 
when they were residents of our 
community. Our sympathy to the 
bereaved.

Mrs. Cecil Delvige of Austin 
and Mrs. Opal Clair of Lexington 
visited with Mr. and Mrs. Riley 
McFarlin in Santa Anna Monday 
morning.

Mrs. Maxey Morris of Coleman 
was a weekend guest with Mr. 
and Mrs. Floyd Morris.

Floyd Morris attended the 
Cowan reunion at the Brady Park 
Saturday.

Leon Carter visited different 
times during the week with Mr. 
and Mrs. Tom Rutherford.

Mrs. Catherine Wynn of Fort 
Worth visited Sunday afternoon 
with Mr. and Mrs. Bean Radle 
and their guests in Santa Anna. 
Mrs. Wynn and her mother are 
visiting relatives in Coleman and 
Santa Anna hospital.

Jamie Lee Morris, who is now 
working in Oklahoma, was home 
with his parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Floyd Morris, during the past 
week.
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Roy Wests Feted 

On Anniversary
The Mountain City Center 

was the scene of a Golden 
Wedding reception honoring Roy 
and Viona McCrary West on 
Sunday, June 14. Hosting the 
party were nieces of the couple.

The tea table was spread with a 
white ninon cloth over gold, 
centered with a golden silk rose 
flower ring encircling an Eternal 
Love lighted taper. Golden punch 
and anniversary cake were served 
from crystal appointments.

Serving at the tea table and 
guest register were nieces of the 
couple, Mmes. Carole Voss of 
Pleasanton; Barbara Allie of 
Norwalk, Calif.; Shirley McCrary 
of Odessa; Margie McCrary, 
Jeanette McCrary and Miss Gale 
McCrary of Santa Anna. Assist­
ing were Mmes. Camilla Baugh 
of Santa Anna and Earlene Scott 
of Wichtia Falls.

More than 100 guests reg­
istered during the afternoon with 
special guests being the only two 
living anuts of the couple, Mrs. 
Mae Flores of Bangs and Mrs. 
Lena McClintock of Santa Anna.

Other close relatives attending 
were Messrs, and Mmes. D. R. 
West of Gustine, Walt Sorenson 
of Rialto, Calif., Ray Beard of 
Coleman, Lusher McCrary of 
Santa Anna, Bill McCrary of 
Austin and Mrs. Jettie Wood of 
Sweetwater.

Îtew Si^scribers
Casey Herring
Claude Bible
Tom Simpson, Weslaco
J. K. McClain, San Angelo
Bob Floyd , Dallas
Mary Jo Schulle, Watonga, Ok.
J. B. Jones, Bishop
Raymond Eubank, Corpus Christi
Vemell Young, Odessa
Donnie Neff
Luther McCrary
Elgean Harris

THANK YOU

Fort Worth Highway 
Brownwood, Texas 

Box 26S Phone 646-7625

Sylvia Herring 
Local Representative

■ Mufflers
*  Custom Duals *  I  

.  See Jimmy A t •
|  D & R Automotive I

■ Low Prices _
200 E. Pecan £

During Our 25 Years In Business.

McCrary 
Fina Station

Luther & Hazel McCrary

David Robinett 

On Dean's List 

At Texas Tech
David Robinett, son of Mr. 

and Mrs. Robert Robinett, was 
among the more than 5,200 
students at Texas Tech University 
who qualified for the Dean’s 
Honor Roll in the six colleges for 
the 1981 spring semester.

David, a 1976 graduate of Santa 
Anna High School, acheived a 
grade average of 3.0 or above for 
at least 12 semester hours of 
work. He is a senior Geology 
major at Texas Tech, transferring 
there from Angelo State Univer­
sity.

The Romans are not known 
to have used soap. They 
used sand and skin scrap­
ers to cleanse themselves.
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ATTENDING MEETING
Judy Hartman, School Secre­

tary, and Jean Brister, also a 
member of the school staff, have 
been in Austin this week 
attending a meeting of school 
secretaries. _____

Santa Anna News
(USPS 481540)

P. O. Box 399 348-3545
Santa Anna, Texas 76878 

Published every Thursday at 
Santa Anna, Texas 76878 and 
entered as second class mail 
under the Act of Congress March 
2, 1879.

Subscription price: In Cole­
man and surrounding counties, 
$7.95 per year; other areas of 
Texas, $8.95 per year; outside 
Texas, $9.95 per year.

BARBARA KINGSBERY 
Editor
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• Listen To §

| The Hour 
| O f Prophecy

6:15 to 6:30 a.m.

K S T A fM
Focus On Faith

from 11:55 to 12:00

Monday • Friday
Over

K S T A  « * « '

Tax.
CaD 625-5140

*  ANNOUNCING *
Change o f Ownership

Benge Fina Station
Formerly McCrary Fina Station

Now Owned and Operated 

by Timmy & Buddy Benge

We welcome former patrons, and invite 

new customers to come trade with us.

Phone 348-3331
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Rockwood News
By MBS. JOHN C. HUNTER

Cap Johnson of near Temple 
visited Sunday morning with Mr. 
and Mrs. Blake Williams. 
Marcos Johnson and Kenneth 
Brushenhan.

Mrs. Mena Shuford was 
admitted to the Brady Hospital 
Saturday.

Mr. and Mrs. Carl Buttry 
visited Sunday in San Angelo with 
Mr. and Mrs. Danny Sturgill and 
Christy and Mr. and Mrs. Jerry 
Halmon.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Bryan spent 
Saturday and Sunday at Lake 
Buchanan attending the Hall 
family reunion, where some fifty 
family members were present, 
enjoying visiting and fishing.

Mr. and Mrs. R.J. Deal 
accompanied by Mrs. Norine 
Winstead spent Friday at 
Woodson with Mrs. Guy Ellis and 
visited Mrs. Winstead’s home. 

Mr. and Mrs. Joe C. Deal and 
Belinda of Santa Anna were 
Sunday dinner guests of the 
Deals.

Robert Duus is spending this 
week with Mr. and Mrs. Gary 
Maedgen at Glen Rose.

Mr. and Mrs. James Hodges of 
Clyde spent Sunday with his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. J.P. 
Hodges.

Mr. and Mrs. Aubrey McSwain 
and Mrs. Gene McSwane spent 
Saturday and Sunday at Lake 
Whitney with Garland and 
Stanley McSwane.

Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Esslinger
Kirk and Kyndall of Midland 

spent the weekend with her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Tony 
Rehm and Wade.

Mrs. John Hunter spent 
Wednesday to Sunday in Fort 
Worth with Mr. and Mrs. L.C. 
Harrison Jr. and daughter, 
Marilyn.

Mrs. Claud Box and Mrs. 
Luther Abernathy had lunch in 
Coleman Friday and visited at 
Holiday Hill with Mrs. Paul 
Riddle, Mrs. Bert Turney and 
Cora Bowers; returning to Santa 
Anna, Mrs. Box visited Mrs. Lois 
Haines, who accompanied her to 
Rockwood,spending Friday night 
and Saturday with Mr. and Mrs. 
Sam Estes; Mrs. Box joined the 
group for Saturday lunch.

Elon Cheatham of San Antonio 
and his daughter, Mrs. Betty Sue 
Barbour of Denver, Colorado 
visited Mrs. Box Sunday and 
Monday, Sunday afternoon they 
visited at Holiday Hill with Mrs. 
Paul Riddle and on to Brownwood 
to visit with Mrs. Doris Starnes, 
all going out to eat.

Mrs. Vivian Chapman Phillips

Home of 
the Tiger Paw

Williams 
Tire Store

2003 Commercial 
Coleman, Texas 
Phone 625-5152

has made a cash donation to the 
Rockwood cemetery Permanent 
Fund in memory of her parents, 
John and Dovie Chapman. Other 
donation have been from Mrs. 
Freddie Polk, and mrs. Junior 
Brusenhan and Mrs. R.W. 
Emerson.

Mr. and Mrs. Olin Horton of 
Andrews and Mr. and Mrs. 
Jimmy Rose and Jennie spent the 
weekend with Mr. and Mrs. 
Johnnie Steward; G. T. England 
of San Angelo, Mr. and Mrs. 
James Steward and Mr. and Mrs. 
James Steward and Mr. and Mrs. 
Mike Ray and Casey of Coleman 
were Saturday guests.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Mueller of 
San Antonio spent the weekend 
with her mother, Mrs. Evan 
Wise; Mr. and Mrs. Joe M. Box 
of Freeport visited Saturday with 
Mrs. Wise and Linnie Box. Mrs. 
Bill Steward and Mrs. Sam Estes 
were frequent callers.

Randy, Todd, and Mark 
Rutherford of San Angelo spent 
the weekend with grandparents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Jim Rutherford and 
Jennifer; Troy Abernathy joined 
the group for Saturday and 
Sunday. Randy is spending this 
week with other grandparents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Lee Abernathy. 
Other Sunday visitors were 
Rhonda Brown and Jody 
Brusenhan and Mr. and Mrs. 
David Huggins and Amber.

Friday guests with the 
Rutherfords were Mrs. Bob 
Rutherford and Mrs. Bobby Lee 
and J.J. and Mrs. Leslie Arnold.

Mr. and Mrs. James 
Stephenson of Leaday visited Mr. 
and Mrs. Joe Wise Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs.Elec Cooper were 
in Brady Saturday evening for the 
Miss Heart of Texas Pageant, 
where granddaughter, Dorinda 
Densman was a contestant.

Mr. and Mrs. Collins Steward 
and girls of Katy spent the 
weekend with his parents, Nr. 
and Mrs. Bill Steward; Friday 
afternoon visitors were Jimmy 
Brown of Brownwood, Mr. and 
Mrs. Richard Snider of New 
Mexico, who were attending 
funeral services at Marion 
Cemetery for Carol Ryan, a 
former Rockwood resident. 
Betty Sue Cheatham Barbour 
visited the Stewards Monday 
morning.
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Blanton Family 

Has Reunion At 

Lake Buchanan
The 19th annual Blanton 

family reunion was held June 12 - 
14 at Chism Lodge on Lake 
Buchanan . There were SO of the 
73 family descendants of the late 
Manley and Nora Blanton pre­
sent.

Those present for the occasion 
were Mrs. Lucille Blanton, Mr. 
and Mrs. William Anderson and 
Jody Anderson of Bangs; Mr. and 
Mrs. Terry Blanton and Brandi of 
Grand Prairie; Mr. and Mrs. 
Tommy Blanton , Kevin and 
Alishia, Mr. and Mrs. Jerry 
Phillips and Rachel of Santa 
Anna; Mr. Tammy Elmo Blanton 
of Houston; Mr. and Mrs. Joe 
Phillips, Mr. and Mrs. Tony 
Kondrat, Kathy and Anthony, 
Mr. and Mrs. Paul Snowden, 
Mrs. Loyce Myers, Mr. and Mrs. 
Ronnie Myers and Kelly, Mr. 
and Mrs. Ted Lawson, all of 
Austin; Mr. and Mrs. Bob Reese, 
Mr. and Mrs. Dennis Hickman 
and Doyle of Angleton; Mrs. 
Shirley Jones, Mike and Shaylene 
of Odessa; Bill Singleton, Natalie 
and Kimberly of Lake Dallas; 
Mrs. JoAnn Meyer and Lee 
Headrick of Hotchkiss, Colo.

Others were Tom Blanton of 
Lampasas; Mr. and Mrs. Roy 
Blanton, Manley and Sara of 
Stephenville; Sgt, and Mrs. 
Randy Moon and Rickey of San 
Clemente, Calif.

Games of cards, volleyball, 
swimming, fishing, visiting and 
good food were enjoyed by 
everyone. Appreciation was ex­
pressed to Jerry Phillips, pres­
ident, and Jody Anderson, 
secretary, for a job well done.

At the business meeting held 
Saturday night, officers for the 
coming year elected were Ted 
Lawson, president, and Loyce 
Myers, secretary. A donation of 
$60 was made by family members 
to the Cleveland Cemetery 
Association in memory, of the late 
Sid E. Blanton who passed away 
this past year.

Debbie Tibbs of Brownwood 
visited Linnie Box Monday 
afternoon; Jimmy Brown of 
Brownwood stopped by Friday 
afternoon.

ATTEND RECEPTION
Mrs. 0 . L. Cheaney, Mr. and 

Mrs. Rob Cheaney were among 
special guests at a reception 
Saturday, June 20, in Stephen­
ville honoring their grand­
daughter and sister, Barbara 
Cheaney of San Angelo, and her 
fiance, Bruce Martin. Hosts for

the party were his parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Bill Martin. Other 
relatives of the bride-elect attend­
ing the party were her mother, 
Mrs. O. L. Cheaney Jr., and 
sister and brother-in-

law, Mr. and Mrs. Larry Jackson, 
all of Houston. Mrs. Cheaney Jr. 
returned to Santa Anna for the
weekend with the family.

Thursday, June 25, 1981* .

VISIT IN JONES HOME
Recent visitors with Mrs. E. 

K. Jones were Mrs. Bill Price of 
Evant, Mrs. Otha Stephens of 
Lometa, Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy 
Meeks and daughters of Denver, 
Colo.

Dr. E. H. Henning, Jr.

OPTOMETRIST
117 Commercial 

Coleman

Ph. 625-2228

O FF ICE  HOOfHS 
9:00 a m. to 5:00 p.m.

Beal's Garden Center
“ We’re More Than Just a Garden Center” 

FERTILOAM DEALER
For WEED AN^FTEEE^ERTTLIZERFO^GRASSES

SELECT FROM LARGE VARIETY 
TROPICAL PLANTS A LARGE LINE OF CONCRETE

_ BIRD BATHS, FOUNTAINS,
HANGING BASKETS STATUARY, NQVELITY ITEMS

AND PLANTERS 
We Wrap Plants For All Occaions.

410 Commerical Coleman We also Make Deliveries.

R . M ark M artin M . D .
• \ . . .

Announces Hie opening of his office

July 1,1981 
For

GENERAL PRACTICE
A t

101 - A  South Park Drive 

Brownwood, Texas 76801
Office Hours By Appointment

Mob. ■ Hum. 8t00 a.m. To 12t00 Noon 
And 1*15 To 5i00 p.m.

Sat. 8i00 a.m. To 12:00 Noon 
Telephone 

[915] 643-3656

‘ IN T R O D U C IN G - 
Santa Anna Electric Co.

Locally owned and operated 24 Hour Service -  Phone 348-3505

We are now ready to serve Santa Anna and surrounding communities wHh 
all your electrical needs, whether Residential, Commerical, or Industrial.

H  : j;- Car,RiP|ey i ' I
Over 25 Years Experience in Electrical &

Electronic Service Electronic Service
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Trickham
News

By Airs. Oscar Boenicke 
Rev. Swanner.preached Sunday 

morning at 11:00 a.m. and he and 
his wife were dinner guests with 
the Hilburn Hendersons Sunday.

Leona and Hilburn visited her 
parents, the C.T. McClatchys Sr., 
Sunday evening

The Quilting Club meets this 
Tuesday afternoon at the Com­
munity Center.

Visitors with Russie James 
Sunday were Pat and Roberta 
McShan of Brownwood, Cindy 
and Kelly Huffman of Lubbock,
Pat Jr. and Shannon McShan of 
Andrews and her mother and 
daddy, Mr. and Mrs. Eddie 
Watson of Brownwood, all spent 
Father’s Day with Russie.

Marjorie Knox of San Antonio 
came Saturday to visit her parents 
the Walter Stacys. She stayed 
until afternoon Sunday, Father’s 
Day. Other visitors with them 
were Lou Vaughn, Mary Boenicke 
and her niece, Erica Hendery.

Joe and Ora Stacy and Oma Lee 
Dockery went to Coleman to visit 
their father, O.J. Martin, in the 
Holiday Hill Nursing Home 
Sunday evening and came back 
by the First Methodist Church at 
Santa Anna to the meeting there.

Albert Miller brought his 
brother and wife, Mr. and Mrs. 
Raymond Lee Miller of Houston 
to visit me Tuesday morning.

I received a telephone call from 
my brother, Bryan Shield of 
Albuquerque, N.M., Saturday 
night that Ann Shield had died 
that morning after a long illness 
with cancer. Their three 
daughters were there with her 
when she died.

Mr. and Mrs. Howell Martin 
went Saturday to Vernon to a 
family reunion of her grand­
father’s family, Alec 
McCullough. They came home 
Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Charles 
Brewster and son came home 
‘Friday and they all visited their 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Cleve 
Brewster of Blanket, Mr. and 
Mrs. Jim Roach of Zephyr, on 
Father’s Day.
G.K. Stearns Saturday night, and 
Sunday Doris Laughlin and 
mother, Elva McDaniels, visited 
them, and Florence Stearns 
visited Sunday afternoon.

Donnie and Sherry York spent 
the weekend with his parents, the 
J.E. Yorks.

Mr. and Mrs. Felton Martin 
and Ann Martin went to 
Woodstock, Vermont to the 
American Jersey Cattle Club 
Convention. They went Sunday 
and came home Thursday. Janice 

and Delbert Snow and Tiffany of 
Brownwwod visited them Sunday 
evening and had supper with 
them.

H.B. and Earnestene Dockery 
of Brownwood ate dinner with 
Lou Vaughn Sunday, and Mary 
Ola Woods and grandson, Bruce

Leather bound books need 
special care, starting when 
new. Once a year, ap­
ply white petroleum jelly, 
la n o lin  or saddle soap.

Coleman
Monument Works

1309 E u t  9th 
Coleman. Texas 

W .A .R N U Y
DAWID HUfF 

§25-5352 
Night 625-2719

3§ Tsars m CeSeansn

Smith, visited Lou Sunday eve­
ning. Russie James and Oma Lee 
Dockery visited Saturday night.

Betty and Damon Miller - of 
Austin spent the weekend with 
her mother, Mary Lea Mitchell. 
Also James Mock and Damon J. 
Miller are spending the summer 
with her.

Visitors with Ilene Haynes over 
the weekend were Jerry Haynes 
and Britt of Odessa and Billy and 
Carole Haynes of Hermleigh.

Lynn and Ann Rice and 
children of Arlington spent the 
weekend with his parents, the 
Delburn Rice’s, and grandparents 
the Bond Featherstons and the 
Wendell Rice family.

We are happy Rankin Mclver is 
able to be back home after a stay 
in the Brownwood Hospital and 
Scott and White Hospital at 
Temple. He seems to be doing 
better. Visitors since he got home 
Saturday evening were Ethel 
Johnson and Roy and Inez Miller, 
Genia and Grady Mclver and 
Bernice Mclver, and Sunday 
afternoon Frankie Wells and 
Mary Boenicke and Erica Hendry 
and Bernice Mclver.

Visitors who went to the 
Brownwood Hospital were La 
Verne and Pete McClatchy, 
Russie James, Lou Vaughn, 
Genia and Grady Mclver, Inez 
and Roy Miller, Irene Durham, 
Ethel Johnson, Horace Thompson 
and Harold Byler of Austin, 
Sherrie and Jim Blake, May and 
Bernice Mclver, Terry Mclver, 
Betty Henderson, May Lou 
Storm, Marvin and Ruth Smith 
and Mary Boenicke.

I received word this Monday

THE SANTA ANNA-NEWS ‘ '

Donald Sheedy 

Buried Tuesday
Donald W. Sheedy, 60, of 

Santa Anna died Sunday, June 
21, at his home . Burial was in 
Santa Anna Tuesday after rites at 
Sacred Heart Catholic Church in 
Coleman at 10:30 a.m. Father 
Lawrence Cyr, priest of the 
church, officiated at the services, 
with Henderson Funeral Home in 
charge of arrangements.

Mr. Sheedy was born in Pine 
Bluff, Wyoming December 1, 
1920, the son of Michael and 
Margaret Erickson Sheedy. He 
was a veteran of World War II 
and a Catholic. He was retired 
and had lived in Santa Anna since 
1973.

Survivors are a sister, Mrs. 
Wilburn (Mary Ellen) Bible, and 
an aunt, Mrs. Robert (Loretta) 
Gifford, both of Santa Anna, and 
a nephew, Gene Hash of Haltom 
City.

Pallbearers for the services 
were Donald Ray Bible, Lonie 
Leonard, A. F. Bird, Jack 
Henson, Billy Joe Harvey and 
Bobby Dean Bible. Alternate 
pallbearers were Dan Dial and 
Gary Pollock.

that my Sister-in-law, 
Bertha Deere of Brownwood 
fell in her home and broke her 
hip. She is in the Brownwood 
Hospital in a weak condition.

This is my anniversary month, 
writing the Trickham News 14 
years June 17 to the Santa Anna 
News and Coleman paper.

We are having some pretty 
weather this week after all the 
good rains, but we all have lots of 
grasshoppers.

P»*eS:

Cowboy Camp Meeting
Continues Thru Sunday Night
With Little George Havens & Friends

Gospel Preaching, Singing, 

Fellowship,

Flying H Acres
West of Santa Anna - Highway 84

Services 8 p.m. Nightly 
Prayer Services -7 :1 5  p.m. 

Chuckwagon Supper 
Sat. June 27 6:00 p.m.

THURSDAY; JUNE 25 
FRIDAY, JUNE 26: 
SATURDAY, JUNE 27: 
SUNDAY, JUNE 28:

Bob Monsey 
George Havens 
George Havens 
Georg?

When you're aiming high, 

need advice or funds, we can be 

helpful with one or both.

Pass Book Savings 5% — Compounded D aily

First Coleman 
National Bank

Member F.D.I.C.

"Always Willing — 
Always Prepared"

"Your Good 
Neighbor Bank"

We Sponsor The News Each Day 
Ai 12:30 Over KSTA

Mind Increases 
Strenght By Continual Effo rt

:; : r

A Wise man 
knowledge

Is sbrongjyea, a man 
strength. Prov. 24j5.

of

Put your highest power into your effort. Call to 
your aid the most powerful motives. You are 
learning. Endeavor to go ”to the bottom of 
everything you set your hand to. Never aim 
lower than to occupy you. Do not allow yourself 
to fall into the habit of being superficial and 
neglectful in your duties and studies; for your 
habits will strengthen and you will become 
incapable of anything better. The mind naturally 
learns to be satisfied with that which requires 
little care and effort, and to be content with 
something cheap and inferior. There are, young 
men and women, depths of knowledge which you 
have never fathomed, and you are satisfied and 
proud of your superficial attainments. If you 
knew much more than you do now, you would be 
convinced that you know very little.

God demands of you vigorous and earnest 
intellectual efforts, and with every determined 
effort, your powers will strengthen. Your work 
will then always be agreeable, because you will 
know that you are progressing. You can either 
become accustomed to slow, uncertain, irresolute 
movements, so much so that the work of your will 
not be one-half what it could be; or, your eyes 
fixed upon God, and your soul strengthened by 
prayer, you can overcome a disgraceful slowness 
and a dislike for work, and train your mind to 
think rapidly and to put forth strong efforts at the 
proper time.

God has given the human mind great power, 
power to show that the Creator has endowed man 
with ability to do a great work against the enemy 
of all righteousness, power to show what victories 
may be gained in the conflict against evil. To 
those who fulfill God’s purpose for them will be 
spoken the words,“ Well done, good and faithful 
servant; thou hast been faithful over a few 
j$|j||gfcAJHULnULke thee ruler over many things.’ ’

Sponsored By

Seventh-day Adventist 

Church
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Cleveland News
By CLARA CUPPS

Those visiting the R. W. 
upps Sunday were the Brown 

Brookes, Jeffery and Shala, Jean 
and Kasha Cupps of Brownwood, 
and Josephine and Lucille Blant­
on dropped by several times the 
past week.

Mr. and Mrs. Dick Baugh went
to Bangs Saturday to visit hei 
mother, Mrs. Mae Flores. They 
also dropped by Lonnie and 
Nancy Lowrys for a visit.

Those visiting in the L. V. 
Cupps home during the week 
were Doris Kelly ana Henry, Bill 
Williams, Adolph Kelly, Eddie 
Vaughn, Gladys Haynes, Doris 
Cupps, Jerry and Joey.

Mrs. Gladys Haynes and Bro. 
Hall and Mrs. A. G. Brewer were 
dinner guests of Mrs. Virgie 
Loudermilk Sunday. Ethel Casey 
spent the weekend at home from 
the Rest Home. Leroy Casey 
visited them over the weekend.

Mr and Mrs. W. L. Campbell 
visited Mr. and Mrs. O. L. 
McGahey of Brownwood and 
Mrs. Eva Stovall Monday. The 
Campbells and Sue Moredock and 
Effie Copeland visited with Mrs. 
Martha Taylor, Mrs. Mae Flores, 
Mr. and Mrs. Roscoe Hosch and 
Mrs. Eva Stovall of Bangs Rest 
Home, and with Alma Burnett at 

Cross Country Care Center in 
Brownwood Friday. The C. E . 
Wises visited them Sunday 
evening. Jimmy Lee Brown and 
Aline Conley of Brownwood were 
bedtime visitors with the W. L. 
Campbells Friday night.

Mary McDaniel and Johnny of 
Carbon visited Mrs. J. F. Fleming 
and girls Sunday afternoon.

Bill and Gladys Hibbetts of 
Briggs visited Mr. and Mrs, 
Bruce Hibbetts Sunday. They also 
visited with Dorothy and Joe 
Wallace and Warren Bruce.

Tom and Bobbie Howard of 
Zephyr visited his parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. John Howard, Sunday 
afternoon. Mrs. Bessie Parish 
also dropped by, and the V. H. 
Russells were bedtime visitors of 
the Howards Saturday night.

Cindy Pierce and David Strick­
land spent Sunday afternoon with 
the A. C. Pierces. Sue McCarrell 
spent several days the past week 
helping Lou can. Mr. and Mrs. F. 
A. Sanders visited Saturday.

Friday Syble Huggins dropped 
by Hardon Phillips .

Lucille Cupps visited Richard 
Wells and Sydney Saturday. 
Sunday the Darrel Cupps went to 
Coleman to the Wells reunion, 
taking Richard Wells out with 
them.

Winnie Haynes and Dana and 
Mr. Bud Evans all were dinner

guests of the Doyle Evans 
Sunday. Lavanda went to Abilene 
to have dinner with her mother.

Saturday J. B. Brooke and two 
friends of Abilene came down to 
visit the Coy Brookes. On Monday 
they went to Comanche and took 
Brown Brooke a lot of vegetables. 
The Brown Brookes were supper 
guests of his parents Sunday 
night.

Ted and Diana Ford of 
Lingleville came Friday after their 
boys who had spent the week at 
Jacksonville at a church camp. 
Mrs. Mildred Ford and Mrs. Jot 
Deal went after the children 
Friday. Ted and Diana spent the 
night with his parents.

Mr. and Mrs. Casey Herring 
visited Sis and Imo Herring 
Saturday. Sunday they visited 
with Mr. and Mrs. C. E. Wise.

Visitors in the home of Mrs. 
Tavy Ford last week were Walter 
Stacy of Trickham who brought 
her a lot of vegetables. Mrs. 
Bessie Parish, Mrs. Joe Harvey, 
Mrs. Ruby Hartman, and Mrs. 
Jackson also visited her. Mrs. 
Ford and Mrs. Sammie LaDoucer 
of Brownwood went to Holiday 
Hill at Coleman to visit their 
sister, Mrs. Lula Hancock Sunday 
afternoon. Friday Peggy Lan­
caster of Brownwood came up 
Friday and took Mrs. Ford to San 
Angelo to see her eye doctor. She 
said she was doing fine. Mr. and 
Mrs. James Ford dropped by 
Sunday afternoon for a visit.

Mr. and Mrs. Edd Hartman 
visitecf’Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Todd 
at Glen Cove Sunday night. Robin 
Hartman spent Monday with 
Ruby Hartman.

Jerry and Cathy Ellis and 
children of Shreveport, La. came 
Friday and spent until Saturday 

with his parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Cecil Ellis. Tammy Ellis of 
Bellville came in for the weekend 
also. Grace Ellis visited Friday 
with the group, and Cecil and 
Nona Bell visited Grace Sunday 
evening.

Pete Curry visited the Adolph 
Kelleys Thursday evening. C. E. 
Wise and Gifford Stephenson 
dropped by the same day. 
Orabeth Mclver dropped by also, 
and Toni Watson visited with 
Doris awhile Monday morning.

Dena and Lance Rasch are 
spending some time with their 
grandparents, the Calvin Camp­
bells, this summer.

Amanda Perry visited at the 
rest home Sunday afternoon. 
Their church was in charge of the 
singing Sunday afternoon.

P^ggy Sikes of Bangs was at 
church Sunday morning. She was
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Jack Boyds 

Have Baby Girl
Mr. and Mrs. Jack Boyd of 

Comanche announce the birth of a 
daughter, born in Brownwood 
hospital Monday, June 22, at 
10:22 a.m.;the baby weighed five 
pounds, eight ounces and was 
named Bonnie Bea.
Grandparents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Curly Boyd of Comanche and Mr. 
and Mrs. Curtis Bryan of 
Rockwood;Mr. and Mrs. C.W. 
Hunter of Anson are great-grand­
parents.

INJURED IN FALL
Ford Barnes is at Ranger 

Park Hospital being treated for a 
broken hip he received in a fall 
Saturday. He is in traction and 
getting along well.

Mr. Barnes was injured when 
he slipped and fell at the curb of 
the Billy Barnes home Saturday 
morning. A daughter, Mrs. Terry 
Sanders of Dallas, was here with 
her parents at the time of the 
mishap.

a dinner guest of her parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Charlie Fleming. Randy 
Sikes and Daniel Vasquez of 
Bangs came Tuesday evening for 
a visit.

Lonnie and Nancy Lowry 
visited the Bill Lowrys Sunday 
afternoon . Others visiting during 
the week were Sue Moredock, 
Mrs. Mae McFarlin, Mildred 
Cammack and Susie Smith. Those 
. visiting the Dick Baughs 
on Monday were Mr. and Mrs. 
Richard Jennings of Porterville, 
Calif., Eveline Herring, Doris 
Kelley and Nancy Lee Lowry of 
Bangs.

Mr. and Mrs. Buck Mills were 
dinner guests of Susie Daniel and 
Candi and Josh on Sunday. Mr. 
and Mrs. Doug McHam of Odessa 
visited briefly with her grand­
parents.

Ruth Hibbetts had a letter from 
Shirley Phillips of Austin, and she 
sent a donation to the Cleveland 
Cemetery Fund.

Several of the Blanton family 
were included in the donation, 
made as a memorial for Sid 
Blanton.

Mr. and Mrs. Doug McHam of 
Odessa visited briefly with the 
Buck Mills Monday.

Mr. and Mrs. J. B. Boyd of 
Brownwood and Tonya Boyd of 
Kilgore spent Thursday with Mr. 
and Mrs. V. H. Russell. Thursday 
evening Mr. and Mrs. Clarence 
Proctor of Winters also visited 
them.

Thursday, June 25,1981

NOTICE
Effective July 1 ,1 9 8 1

The G t y  of Santa Anna Utility Office Will No Longer Receive 
Payments fo r Lone Star Gas Co. gas bills.

You may mail your bill and paym ent, using the envelope that is enclosed 
with your monthly bill, or you may pay in person at our Coleman Office, 
located at 116 South Concho.

For Service, Please Call Collect

625-2114

Lone Star Gas Co.

ENGAGEMENT ANNOUNCED— Mrs. 0 . L. Cheaney Jr. of 
Houston has announced the engagement of her daughter, 
Barbara Ann, to Bruce Mackenzie Martin, son of Dr. and Mrs. 
William B. Martin of Stephenville. The bride-elect, 
granddaughter of Mrs. 0 . L. Cheaney Sr. of Santa Anna, is a 
1980 graduate of the University of Texas at Austin and presently 
anchorwoman and reporter for KCTV-TV, the CBS affiliate in 
San Angelo., Martin graduated from the University of Texas at 
Austin in 1979 and is an assistant buyer at Joske’s of San 
Antonio. The couple plans an October wedding and will make 
their home in San Antonio.

Mrs. Betty Joyce Cupps spent 
the weekend with Regina and 
Danny Walker in Abilene. Curtis 
and Janice Fellers also visited 
Saturday evening and they all 
went shopping Saturday night. 
Betty visited awhile with Sherry 
Friday when she returned home 
from church camp. They went 
with Michael over the weekend.

Mrs. Byrdie Miller visited with 
Mr. and Mrs. Morris Williams at 
Early Sunday afternoon. She 
visited with the Bunk Wagners at 
the nursing home that afternoon, 
and also with Hillard Thornton.

Mr. and Mrs. Lee Ray Huggins 
and Phil went to San Angelo to 
attend the air show.

Mr. and Mrs. Fields visited 
Mr. and Mrs. Ercell Ellis 
Saturday evening.

Jean Cupps and Kasha of 
Brownwood visited her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Robert Robinett,

Sunday and also dropped by the 
R. W. Cupps late in the 
afternoon. Jeffery and Kasha are 
spending a few days with us.

The Coveys called Father’s Day 
and we had a nice chat. We had a 
nice day.

It is getting summer time now. 
Real nice and cool at night,

IRA PU M P & 
SUPPLY C O .

General
Oilfield Supplies

Santa Anna, Texas 
Box 580 - Ph. 348-3179 

Box 21, Ira, Texas 
Bus. 915-573-6403

Listen To

The Voice 
O f Prophecy

Every Sunday
9:30-10:00 a.m.

Over KSTA
AM-FM
Coleman
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O D D  C  H A  U K  I N S

HOME OWNERS Keep 
Their Feet “ Above 
Ground,” SAVING UP TO 
35 % on POLICIES PRO­
TECTING HABITATIONS 
To The HIGHEST RE­
PLACEMENT COST!

t
HOSCH ©

InsuranceAgency
348-3115

| 709 Wallis fl»e. Santa_Ajina

p'
a
r  =

Farms
<M*«llltllCliH|lll<IIMMI«IMItlllMI«|7J |>

■Ranches
WANTED— Your listings of city 
lots or small or large acreages. 
Many buyers seeking property in 
this area. Eubank Real Estate, 
348-3636. 16-tfc

B&B Builders

Electrical &  Plumbing
New
Repair

Remodel
Additions

Coleman (Collect) 
6254867 

Emergency Phone 
348-3635
After 6 pan.

J Central Texas 0

i INSULATION i
Service

Free Estimates
Contact

Buddy Mays
Daytime Ph. 625-2332 

NitePh. 625-5414 !

Miscellaneous

BE SURE TO CHECK BEAL’S 
GARDEN CENTER ad in this 
paper for super selections on bird 
baths and accessories 23-ltc

Services

Notices
NOTICE

MODERN WAY LAUNDRY - 
open 8 .m. - 9 p.m. daily; 1 - 8 
p.m. Sunday. Attendant on duty 
Monday - Friday; Pickup and 
delivery. 26-4tc

BID NOTICE
The City of Santa Anna will 

accept sealed bids for one 10 
cubic yard sanitation truck until 
5:00 p.m. July 2,1981. Specificat­
ions may be picked up at City Hall 
or from City Administrator. The 
City reserves the right to reject 
any or all bids or to accept that 
deemed most advantageous. 
Johnny Williams 
City Administrator 
City of Santa Anna 25-2tc

FINISH COLLEGE THREE 
YEARS SOONER.... 

by concentrating on your
nafppr

CENTRAL TEXAS 
COMMERCIAL 

COLLEGE 
Building Business 

Careers for 15 Years 
Financial Aid Available 

315 N. Center Brownwood 
CALL COLLECT: 

(915)646-0521
16-27c

ABERNATHY
Dirt &  Conservation Work

|Specializing In Tanks And Land Clearingj 

After 6:00  PM Call
Lee 785-4401 Riekev 7 8 5 -4 2 3 5 1

For Sole

MOBILE HOME TRANSPORT­
ING. For quality work and 
affordable prices, call 643-4014 in 
Brownwood. 19-tfc

B&B BUILDERS 
All phases of building construct­
ion, new and remodeling. Elect­
rical, carpentry, plumbing, paint­
ing, roofing, concrete work. Call 
Coleman (collect) 625-4867. After 
6 p.m. 348-3635. 26-tfc

PROFESSIONAL CARPET 
CLEANING by Brownwood Ser­
vice Co. For free estimate call 
our local representative, 
Phillips Drug, 348-3151. 49-tfc

BUY, SELL OR TRADE— New 
and used furniture. Travis 
Trading Post, 402 N. Colorado, 
Coleman, Texas 25-tfc

FOR SALE— 1978 Chevette. 
Clean, low mileage. Call Roy Joe 
Harvey, 348-3685. 25-tfc

FOR SALE— Mobile home with 
lot in Santa Anna. Also have 
several farm amd ranch listings. 
R. E. HORNER REAL ESTATE 
348-3715 After 5:00 p.m.

Help Wanted

TAKING APPLICATIONS for 
R.N.’s, L.V.N.’s and Nurse 
Aides. Apply at Ranger Park 
Hospital or Ranger Park Inn. 
348-3158. 26-2tp

Lost and Found

FOUND— Wristwatch. Call 348- 
3484 to identify and pay for this 
ad. 26-ltp

NEED A GIFT? Give a sub­
scription to the Santa Anna 
News.

Ranger Park Inn News

Cord of Thanks

Fishing Gear
New Line O f
Metal Detectors 
Plastic & Canvas Tarps

T he

TradingPost
114 E. Pecan 
Coleman, Texaa

It is a joy to have Mrs. Nora 
Goen and Mrs. Doris Kelley come 
to make their home at Ranger 
Park Inn. Both ladies are from 
Santa Anna and well known here.

We had a wonderful time at the 
birthday party Thursday after­
noon. About 30 residents helped 
Mattie Hicks, Allie Woodard, 
Lillie Knotts and Ruby Horton 
celebrate their birthdays, eating 
ice cream, cake and drinking 
punch. We appreciate Eunice 
Longbrake having the party for us 
each month. Mrs. Billie Joyce 
Perry baked the birthday cake. 
Thank you, Billie, it was 
delicious.

We enjoyed the singing of the 
Pentecostal Church group Tues­
day evening. Thank you so much 
for coming.

It was a joy to have Mr. and 
Mrs. Neal Smith sing with the 
Songbirds Wednesday afternoon. 
We appreciate Wanda Wallace, 
J. C. Boyle, Doris Aderholt, Kate 
Cagle, Mr. and Mrs. H. O. Trent,

Allene Needham and Virgie 
Wood for sharing their time and 
talent with us. Thanks so much.

We watched the movie “ Count­
ry Coyote Goes to Hollywood,” 
Friday afternoon while eating 
popped corn. Thank you, Lillian 
Herndon, for the corn.

We are eniovine the beautiful 
flower arrangements Veva Mc­
Clellan and the children of Ethel 
Matthews brought to the Inn 
Sunday. Thank you so much for 
sharing with us.

We appreciate the members of 
Northside Baptist Church coming 
out Sunday afternoon for a 
beautiful song service. Thanks to 
Mr. and Mrs. C. C. Gilbert, Bro. 
and Mrs. Hix, Amanda Perry, 
Adell Vinson, Robert Robinett 
and Mrs. Etheline Stewart for 
coming .

Ethel Casey had as visitors Lea 
Lerscher and Jonnie L. Rae.

Lora Rollins and Keetie Haynes 
visited one day with their friends, 
Nora Goen and Lily King.

Ranger Park Hospital

Johnnie and Jesse Goen 
want to thank all the people who 
were so helpful in the recent 
accident of Nora Goen, especially 
the unknown telephone operator, 
Miss Clara Brown for her 
helpfulness, and so many who 
helped in any way. She is now in 
Ranger Park Inn, Room 106, and 
would love to see all her friends.

26-2tc

God bless all you dear people 
who remembered me in any way 
while I was in the hospital. 
Aurelia Brown 26-ltc

Miscellaneous

AMBER COVE RESTAURANT- 
Now open 11 a.m. to 12 midnight. 
AMBER COVE INN- west of old 
Truck Harbor - We have rentals, 
so come check with us. 26-tfc

Garage Sale

PORCH SALE— Friday, June 26, 
104 South 6th. Men’s and1 
children’s clothing, misc. Starts 8 
a.m. 26-ltp

The following patients were 
admitted to Ranger Park Inn June 
15 - 22:
Mrs. D. R. Hill, city 
Betty Witt, San Angelo 
Houston Rutledge, Brownwood 
Homer Boyd, Ranger Park Inn 
Arrie Brinson, Bangs 
Ada Smith, Coleman 
Clifford Stephenson, city
Ford Barnes, city 
Kathleen Mitchell, city 

These patients were dismissed 
June 15 - 22:
Sylvester Ramon, Coleman

Ollie Yarbrough, city 
Delbert Teague, city 
Zola Kuykendall, city 
Pete Diaz, city 
E. J. McCoy, city 
Mrs. M. J. Walters and baby, 

Coleman
Rena Rider, Coleman 
Homer Boyd, Ranger Park Inn 

Other patients still in the 
hospital June 22:
Ollie Estes, Ranger Park Inn 
Teresa Huntsucker, Ranger Park 
Inn
I. K. Holmes, Bangs

PRESCRIPTIONS
Owl Drug Store

"Where Friends Meet"
Telephone 625-4514

312 Commercial Coleman, Texas

24 Hour Service On Location Welding

Phillips Welding 

S e ,v k e
Serving Oil Field, 

Ranchers & Farmers

Owner
JeiTy Phillips

Rt. 1 Box 26 
Santa Anna, Tex.

915-348-3834
or 348-3333
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Local People Attend Family Reunion Bill McClellan On Dean's List
The annual reunion of the and Mr. and Mrs.Floyd DeForest 

descendants of the late Canady and Cory, all of Katy.
T'  ” Mr. and Mrs. James Taylor,Snider and Della Bolton was 

held June 20, 21,1981 at the lake 
front cabin of Lee and Avis 
Barnett Vaughan on Lake 
Brownwood.

Bar-B-Que prepared by the 
planning Committee was served. 
The planning committee consist­
ed of Thomas Wristen, Montie 
Guthrie, Jr., Lee Vaughn, Pete 
Maddox and Sam Bolton. Pete 
and Sammie Maddox prepared 
their usual cook-out breakfast on 
Sunday morning.

During the two-day event 
skiing, boating, swimming, 
dominos and conversation was 
enjoyed by the 68 descendants 
and 9 guests attending.

The 1982 reunion will be held 
the third weekend in June. 
Elected to the planning commit­
tee were Thurman Maddox, Lex 
Vaughn, Greg Myers, Lane 
Guthrie, Lance Vaughn and 
Montie Guthrie, III.

Those attending were Mrs. Eva 
Barnett and Sam Bolton of 
Coleman; Andy Bolton of 
Oklahoma City, Okla.; Mr. and 
Mrs. S. L. Bolton of McKinney; 
Mr. and Mrs. N. Vefnon Bolton of 
Odessa; and Mr and Mrs. S. R. 
Snider of Jal, N.M.
Thurman Maddox; Mr. and Mrs. 
Glen Williams, Hilary, Jay and 
Gay;Ronnie and Jerry Williams, 
Ronald Case' and Mr. and Mrs. 
Pete Maddox all of Post. Mr. and 
Mrs. Billy Griffin of Odessa; Mr. 
and Mrs. Lee Vaughn, Ladd and 
LeAnna; Mr. and Mrs. Lance 
Vaughn of Early. Mr. and Mrs. 
Lex Vaughn, Lynette and Leslie of 
George West; Mr. and Mrs. Greg 
Myers of Coleman; Mr. and Mrs. 
Kent Taylor, Tammy and Kristie,

VISIT RELATIVES
Mrs. John Porter and Diana 

of Round Rock came Thursday 
and accompanied her parents, the 
Tom Kingsberys, to Mineral 
Wells Friday to visit Mrs. W. L. 
Woodward. From there they went 
to Dallas to visit Dr. and Mrs. 
John Woodward. On Saturday 
they all went to Sherman to be 
with Dr. and Mrs. Max Wood­
ward and their daughter, Betsy 
Johnson and children of Denver , 
Colorado.

Mrs. Porter and Diana returned 
home Sunday t

Lori and Randy of San Antonio; 
Faye Hunt Akers of Dallas; Mr. 
ana Mrs. Revi Pexa, Revi, John 
and Van of Albequreque,N.M.; 
Glen V. Bolton of Garland. Mr. 
and Mrs. Thomas Wristen, Mr. 
and Mrs. Lin Wristen and Melisa, 
Mr. and Mrs. Montie Guthrie, 
Jr.; Mr. and Mrs. Montie 
Guthrie, III, Sonny, Rhett, and 
Mitchell, and Mr. and Mrs. Lane 
Guthrie, Tom and Aaron all of 
Santa Anna.

Friends visiting were Danny 
McClure of Early; Mr. and Mrs. 
Hubbard Reynolds of Bam 
Shelby Mast of Lancaster; Debt 
Weinberg of San Antonio; Mr. 
and Mrs. Mack Hambright of 
Coleman; Mrs. Lily Davis and 
Mrs. Mack Davis of Brownwood.

Jasper W. (BUI) McClellan, a 
native of Abilene, has been 
named to the Dean's list at 
Hardin-Simmons University at 
AbUene for the spring semester.

McClellan, the son of Mr. and 
Mrs. J. W. McClellan of Santa 
Anna, is a spring graduate of the

university. He was recognized for 
a grade point average of 3.75 for 
12 hours or more.

Hardin-Simmons is a multi­
purpose university and is Affil­
iated with the Baptist' General 
Convention of Texas.

Thursday( June 25, 1981

VISIT FRIENDS
Mr. and Mrs. Vernon Her­

ring returned home Saturday 
from Mesquite where they spent 
two days with friends, Mr. and 
Mrs. Micky ChUton.

" M a n 's  fr e e d o m  is his in n e r 
w o r t h ."  M ic h a e l B e e r

Repairs or 
Remodeling
Plumbing &  Supplies

Lee's Plum bing
CoH 348-3417

S a n ta  A n n a , T e x a s
Free Estimates

Henderson Funeral Homes
“People Caring For People”

OFFERING AT YOUR REQUEST 
Pre-Arranged Funerals

Funeral Insurance And Counseling 
Ambulance Service

jlCoieman 625-2121  Santa Anna 348-3131^

“ I t r e a t  m y  
p o l i c y h o l d e r s  lik e  

i n d i v i d u a l s , 
n o t  n u m b e r s . . .  

e a c h  o n e  h a s  
d i f f e r e n t

i n s u r a n c e  n e e d s .”

Call me today.

Jim McAnoly
117 West Street, Coleman 

[West of Court House] 
Phone 625-4343

Like a good neighbor, 
State Farm is there.

SIAM l » l »  S T A T E  F A R M  
J f i h  Insurance Companies

q 3 T a h  Home Offices:
Bloomington, Illinois

PRICES EFFECTIVE 
JUNE 25-27,1981

WHILE SUPPIIES LAST 
WE RESERVE THE RIGHT TO LIMIT

j g i S p F

1 2  O z . Reg. 35 Cento

Fountain Drinks 

Steak Sandwich 9 9 *
Reg. $1.49

I mm*® “« « «  *  DIET PEPSI.
PEPSI LIGHT. 

MOUNTAIN DEW OR

PEPS I C O LA

6 PACK 
12 OZ.CANS

SINGLE
CNN

Shurfine

Green Beans Reg ^ nU
BORDENS

Shurfine

Tomato Sauce rJ . » c.Ou4/10()
bUHUtN 5 i V f i p  SUNSHINE COOKIES

FRUIT DRINK ,„99c Chip-A-Rm s
BORDEN’S ASSORTED FLAVORS

SHERBETSTORE SPECIAL

12 OZ. 
PKG.

, / 2 GAL. 
CTN.

GLAOIOLA

FLOUR $129
5 LB. m
BAG ■

MEATLOAF TURKEY/SALISBURY STEAK WESTERN

M o r t o n  D in n e r s EACH

v

G o ld e n

POTATO, 
CHIPS

REGULAR DIP REG. $1.49

CLOVER CLUB 
POTATO CHIPS

1 9
1 0 oz
PKG.

Shurfine

Biscuits MCeB** 8/ l ° °

Shurfreeh Soft

Margarine 2/ 8 9 *
Reg. 96 Cento

\ RENT RINSE VAC
the professions,, do-it-yourself 
carpet cleaning system M l

OPEN 24 HOURS 
365 DAYS A YEAR

SJJjsi*30FF
| R1NSENVAC 
1 RENTAL RATE
1  t r,is coupon 'may tie applied iric or any model

' HlNSfc'NVAt. -Steam Cdioei C eam;,y- System' Nor 
N app cab-e ’c WNSL.NVAC purtna&es One
_ , couponpt*<- tep-KH cir'H -• .1. 1 \,e -duced •
N- assorted w tw w i'e c  . f •*’ mi,- • r-av. a,' appiicacie 
_  la.e* ( af.n .a-..,, or i .jo o' one w i 
N Hedcfi-ir.'1*' .1’ ,, ,1! . <,'l ; al ’u A'ISi)|> s Slors*..
|  C O U P O N  EXPIRES J ULY 3i i ‘W !

F -

STORE COUPON ..............J

CONVENIENCE STORES

'THERE’S ONE NEAR YOU”


