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U.S. financing British 
mercenaries in Angola 
By The Associated Press 

A British diplomatic correspondent 
reported Sunday that more than $20 
million, mainly from the CIA, is to be 
spent on mercenaries in Angola. The 
Kremlin, meanwhile, lauched a rare 
personal attack on Secretary of State 
Henry A. Kissinger, accusing him of 
falsifying Moscow's position in the 
embattled southwest African nation. 

Norman Kirkham, diplomatic 
correspondent of the Sunday 
Telegraph, quoted diplomatic sources 
in Zaire as saying that $200,000 of 
American money given to the Western-
backed National Front FNLA in Angola 
has already been sent to London to 
recruit mercenaries. 

Over 100 tough-looking Britishmen 

flew out of London's Heathrow Airport 
last Wednesday and some told repor-
ters they were an advance guard of 
mercenaries bound for the Angolan 
civil war. A Hamburg newspaper said 
West Germans are also being recruited 
as mercenaries. 

THE BRITONS left by Sabena 
Airlines for Brussels and press reports 
said from there they would fly to 
Kinshasa, Zaire. The Zaire govern-
ment backs the FNLA, which with its 
National Union UNITA allies aided by 
South African troops, has been losing to 
Soviet backed forces of the Popular 
Movement MPLA and the MPLA's 
Cuban allies in Angola. 

Kirkham said at least 300 Britons 

were joining Western-backed forces in 
Angola. 

He added that the CIA had allocated 
about $49.2 million in arms, other 
supplies and cash so far to the FNLA 
and UNITA forces and that more 
authorized money was still in the 
pipeline. 

ANOTHER British Sunday 
newspaper, the Observer, quoted a 
spokesman for an organization called 
Security Advisory Services SAS as 
saying the recruiting of British mer-
cenaries was being financed with 
American money. 

The Observer quoted the SAS 
spokesman as saying the organization 
had received $564,000 in the past three 
weeks. 

Today deadline to file for offices 
By BEKI SHUMAN 
UD Reporter 

Texas A&M's School of Medicine 
recently received a letter of assurance 
from the Liaison Committee on Medical 
Education ( LC1VIE ), but Tech's Medical 
School may not receive such an in-
dication until next fall, according to Dr. 
Richard A. Lockwood, vice-president 
for the Health Sciences Center. 

of the cult, explained how to enter the "higher level" to a 
small group of students at their meeting. (Photo by Larry 
Jayroe) 

After several months of hidden existence, followers of a UFO 
cult which promises followers will be taken to a higher level 
of existence aboard a spacecraft reappeared in Lubbock 
Saturday. Chris Robins (left) and Sage Williams, members 

The delay of assurance should not 
affect Tech's chances for funding of 
Medical School programs, Lockwood 
said. 

"I'm hoping it won't," Lockwood 
said, "and as of now, we have no 
specific plans for funding requests 
because we haven't received the 
necessary instructions from the 
legislature yet." 

Assurance delay should not 
affect Med School funding 
By BETSY HUMPHREY 
UD Reporter 

They may have to draw a bigger ring 
if candidates keeping tossing hats. 

Filing for county and state offices 
ends officially at 6 p.m. today, however, 
and Lubbock's voters will have a 
chance to catch their breaths and size 
up all of the candidates. 

Candidates must file with either the 
Republican or Democratic party 
chairman to be placed on the ballot for 
the May primaries. 

ROY WARD, a 28-year-old in-
vestment adviser filed Friday as a 
Democratic candidate for state 
representative, District 75-A, which 
covers western Lubbock. 

Ward, a former associate pastor of 
First Methodist Church, said an issue of 
extreme importance to him is the in-
creasing need on the part of all elected 
officials for integrity and forth-
rightness. 

"The challenge which stands before 
the next session of the legislature lies 
not with the limits of how much money 
can be spent before we reach the limits 
of expected income," Ward said, "but 
rather the challenge is to pass quality 
legislation that will be beneficial, 
positive and progressive for the entire 
State." 

Ward noted Texas Tech, permanent 
school financing, spending and taxes as 

UFO cult members promise 
`higher level of existence' 

major concerns of the district. 
CANIDATES who have already filed 

for the office are Democrats Tom 
Purdom, Xen Harris Oden and John 
Sims. 

Republican David Sullivan indicated 
he would officially file today. 

In the state representative, District 
75-B, race, Republican Lee Page has 
filed for the position. Democrats Jim 
Teaver, Froy Salinas and Delwin Jones 
are also seeking the post. 

Democrat Mike Pyron said he would 
officially file for the race today. 

The county commissioner, Precinct 
One, race has six Domocrats filing for 
the seat. They are W. Eugene Smith, 
Pete Choban, Joe Brice, G.A. Edwards 
Jr., Woodrow "Woody" Orr and Edgar 
Chance. 

REPUBLICAN GARY Riley and 
Democrat Bettye Lee Fortner have 
indicated they will join the Precinct 
One race officially today. 

Seeking the county commission, 
Precinct Three, position are Democrats 
W.R. "Bill" Skirlock, James M. Lan-
caster and Charles "Doug" Moore. 

Democrat Dolphus Cleveland has 
indicated he will enter the race today. 

Four Democrats have announced 
their candidacy for sheriff. They are 
incumbent C.H. "Choc" Blanchard, Bill 
Webb, Wayne Kirkpatrick and Jack 
Sullivan. 

coming back because the truth was so 
distorted." 

The leaflet claims, "There are two 
individuals here now who have also 
come from that next kingdom, in-' 
carnate as humans, awakened, and will 
soon demonstrate the same proof of 
overcoming death ( as Christ). They are 
sent from that kingdom by the 'Father' 
to bear the same truth that was Jesus." 

WILLIAMS SAID "The Two" were 
the fulfillment of a Biblical prophesy 
given in Revelation II. 

The chapter gives an account of two 
witnesses who will be sent by God, 
killed, and resurrected, and who will 
ascend to Heaven on a cloud. 

Williams said, "The Two" will give a 
demonstration within months where 
they will be killed, resurrect them-
selves, and ascend to the next level in a 
spacecraft ( UFO) in public view." 

At least a couple of hundred people 
have since followed "The Two", 
Williams said, adding that he could not 
give an accurate view because mem-
bers were scattered across the country. 

When the instructions regarding 
money requests for programs are 
received, Lockwood said, specific 
request intentions will be made public. 
Funds requested this year will be 
granted next year if approved by the 
legislature. 

"THE LIAISON committee will 
return in July to determine whether the 
Medical School will remain on 
probation or not," he said. "I then 
expect some indication about ac-
creditation in the fall." 

The LCME, chief accrediting body 
for the nation's medical schools, placed 
the Tech School of Medicine on 
probation last July. Since that time, the 
school's administration has been 
working to improve 14 problem areas 
cited in the committee's 60-page report. 

The Medical School will receive 
priority attention during Thursday's 
Board of Regents meeting and Medical 
School progress will be discussed in 
open session, according to Clint Form-
by, chairman of the Board of Regents. 

Dr. George S. Tyner, dean of the 
Medical School, has said repeatedly 
since last July that Tech's probationary 
status will not affect the accreditation 
of the school, and according to Lock-
wood, the delay of accreditation 
assurance should not affect funding 
hopes. 

BILL PARSLEY, vice-president for 
Tech student affairs, agreed with Lock-
wood. 

"That A&M has received a letter of 
assurance should have no effect on 
western fundings," he said. "As far as I 
know, A&M is tied in with Baylor 
Medical School in Houston and the VA 
Hospital in Waco." Funding of those 
medical schools is :separate and should 
not affect Texas Tech School of 
Medicine is fundings, Parsley said. 

Asked about financial need in the 
areas of nursing and pharmacy, 
Parsley said, "We've already proved 
our case for appropriations in those 
areas. It's up to the legislature to 
determine whether we receive the 
funds or not. If granted, we'll receive 
the money next year." 

Gunmen steal 
Picasso paintings 

Committee makes library suggestions 
AVIGNON, France (AP) — Three 

hooded gunmen beat and bound three 
guards and made off with 119 unsigned 
Picasso paintings from an exhibit in the 
14th century papal palace here, police 
reported Sunday. The thieves ap-
parently had inside information and 
acted with split-second timing. 

Art experts said the untested market 
for unsigned Picassos made it im-
possible to estimate the full value of the 
paintings, which were loaded into a van 
in the palace courtyard Saturday night. 
They were part of an exhibition of 201 
Picassos insured for $2.47 million, but 
police said the paintings were worth 
more than that. 

"In the end they are probably worth 
nothing to the thieves because they are 
catalogued, photographed, inventoried 
and indexed, and the information has 
long been distributed worldwide," said 
Paul Puaux, director of the Avignon Art 
Festival who set up the show. 

"WHAT CAN the thieves do with 
them? In my opinion the paintings 
cannot be sold," he said. 

According to Melvin Gibson, an 
Oregon State Police investigator who 
got into the search for the pair after the 
Sept. 14 meeting, all of the people who 
disappeared did so of their own will. 

SINCE THAT time, the world at large 
has lost track of the mysterious pair 
and their followers, now estimated at 
about 200 by the two young men in 
Lubbock Saturday. 

The two "recruiters" said they did 
not know where "The Two" are now, 
but guessed they were in "South Texas 
or Colorado." They said they had been 
about their present mission of con-
ducting meetings for about two months. 

At the meeting, Williams said, "The 
message we speak is the same as that of 
the man 2,000 years ago. This is all tied 
in and spoken of in the Bible, but the 
people had and now have a half-truth. 
They wrote it down as they thought it 
should be. They left out books that 
should be there, like the book of St. 
Thomas which gives the Biblical basis 
for reincarnation, and they have 
changed what should have been said. 
That is why "The Two" must come — to 
bring back the truth." 

WILLIAMS SAID to follow "The 
Two" and enter the next level, men 
must go through a series of experiences 
designed by beings in the next level to 
rid a person of the human conditions of 
anger, anxiety, or other conditions that 
tie humans to the Earth. 

A leaflet given to the audience 
described the process as similar to the 
metamorphosis a caterpillar goes 
through to become a butterfly. 

"We have to be trained," Robins said, 
"They have to teach us so that when we 
reach the next level we don't destroy a 
party of the universe by moving our 
hand or something. We have to be 
taught what the powers of the next level 
can do." 

WILLIAMS DIVERTED questions 
concerning whether this "evolution" 
meant giving up all material or earthly 
possessions or relationships by saying 
this matter would be discussed later 
because it was to complex for the non-
believer to understand. 

Williams and Robins took names and 
addresses from three persons who said 
they were interested and said they 
would contact them in the near future. 

This recruiting effort, they said, was 
a part of their transitional process and 
was directed by "The Two." 

Explaining why they follow the 
directions of "The Two," Robins said 
"The Two" are considered gods by 
Williams and Robins, along with Moses, 
Enoch, and Christ. 

"ALL OF these brought the message 
of ours to this world to raise the level of 
the people," Williams said, "They tried 
to get the people to go then, but no one 
was ready. They had to continue 

INSIDE 

By IRA PERRY 
UD Reporter 

Copyright February, 1976, by the 
University Daily. 

Dozens of people, according to 
reports, gave up all they had, often 
even their children, and mysteriously 
vanished without a trace following 
meetings with "The Two," a man and 
woman who promised followers a 
higher level of existence through 
contact with "the next level" by 
spacecraft (UFO's). 

That was four months ago, and since 
then, "The Two" and their followers 
vanished as mysteriously as they had 
surfaced, with only scattered reports of 
their activities or whereabouts sur-
facing. 

SATURDAY in a Lubbock park, news 
of the obscure clan surfaced again, 
borne by two young men who told of 
their "hidden existence" while 
following the would-be prophets. 

Speaking to only seven people at the 
park, Chris Robins and Sage Williams 
told of their new leaders and their 
activities while following "The Two." 

"Months ago we were approached in 
California," Williams said, "We 
decided what they ("The Two") said 
spoke to us. We lost our past lives, and 
devoted our energies to the changing 
process." 

WILLIAMS SAID as part of the 
"changing process" he and Robins had 
become members of a nationwide effort 
"to reach others and spread the truth." 

Robins and Williams, as part of this 
effort, organized the meeting by 
distributing a small number of hand-
bills on the Tech campus. 

The mimeo-graphed handbills read, 
"Two individuals say they are about to 
leave the human level and literally 
(physically) enter the next level in a 
space craft ( UFO) within months! 
Followers of 'The Two' will discuss how 
the transition from the human level to 
the next level is accomplished, and 
when this may be done. 

"THIS IS not a religious or 
philosophical organization recruiting 
membership. However, the information 
has already prompted many in-
dividuals to devote their total energy to 
the transitional process. If you have 
ever entertained the idea that there 
may be a real, physical level beyond 
the earth's confines, you will want to 
attend this meeting." 

Just what kind of an organization 
"The Two" are setting up has been a 
matter of conjecture since ap-
proximately 20 people dropped out of 
sight to follow "The Two" after a Sept. 
14, 1975, meeting in Waldport, Ore. 

The Two have been identified by 
Oregon police as Marshall Herff Ap-
plewhite, 44, a native of Spur, Tex., and 
Bonnie Lu Trusdale Nettles, 48. 

By GEORGE JOHNSTON 
UD Reporter 

The lack of adequate study space in 
many sections of the library is 
currently the major problem facing the 
library, according to Doyle Patton and 
Gayla Beleele, members of the Student 
Association Committee to study library 
services. 

Patton said the committee is working 
with library officials to try to open 
unused study carrels to undergraduate 
students. 

The carrels, located in the new 
section of the library, are currently 
reserved for graduate student use only, 
Patton said. 

HOWEVER, Beleele said, not all of 
the carrels are being used while un-
dergraduate students have inadequate 
or noisy places to study. 

The committee is also working to get 
a combination typing-room and copy 
center which would be located in a 
section of the basement, the committee 
members said. 

Patton said the copy center is now 
located in the reference section of the 
library, and the lines caused by the 
center make noise. 

"By placing the typing room and 
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THE LIBRARY committee would 
work with the Residence Halls 
Association (RHA) to provide coffee 
during finals week, Patton said. 

The library committee is also 
working with Janeway for a survey to 
determine what students want from the 
library, the committee members said. 

Patton said the survey will be con-
ducted in the University Center, outside 
the library and, with approval from the 
RHA, in the dorms. 

"The results of the survey will help us 
determine the feasibility of the 
proposed changes and may help 
determine new ones," Patton said. 

RESPONDING TO many criticisms 
that non-students cannot use the new 
section, Beleele said a Lubbock citizen 
can get permission from library of-
ficials if he would like to use the stacks. 

"The purpose of restricting the en-
trance to the new section is supposedly 
because there have been some rape 
attempts," Beleele said. 

Patton said library officials, 
especially Janeway, have been helpful 
in studying the library situation. 

"Janeway doesn't beat around the 
bush," Patton said, "If he can do it he 
will, but if he can't he'll give you a 
straight 'no.' " 

copy center in the basement, we can 
centralize all excess noise away from 
major study areas," Patton said. 

BELEELE said the library would 
also rent typewriters for 50 cents or $1 
an hour for student use. 

"Hopefully they would be electric 
typewriters," Beleele said. 

The committee is also working on the 
feasibility of placing a book drop at one 
of the entry stations on campus, the 
committee members said. 

Patton said a commercially 
manufactured container for the books 
would cost $900, however, he suggested 
a Tech agriculture shop could make the 
containers cheaper. 

THE COMMITTEE is also working 
on a policy change which would in-
crease library operating hours during 
finals week, Patton said. 

However, Patton quoted Ray C. 
Janeway, dean of library services, as 
saying unless a need is shown for the 
increased hours, it can't be done. 

According to Patton, Janeway said 
currently the library is usually empty 
by 11:30 each night. 

But Patton said if students knew the 
library is open later they would 
probably stay later. 

• 



Wayne Roper  

Waking up Tech's student vote 
THE DOOR OPENED a crack to reveal 

a half - awake student peering out through 
pin-hole pupils. 

"Good afternoon, sir," said an en-
thusiastic visitor standing in the hall. "I'm 
a volunteer working to get more Tech 
students to vote." 

"Afternoon?" the resident asked. 
"Geeze, I must have really tied one on last 
night." 

"Uh ... yes .. well like I was saying," the 
volunteer said. "We're trying to register 
students to..." 

"OH, WELL I'M already registered. 
My head's killing me. You wouldn't happen 
to have any aspirin?" the student asked. 

"I'm sorry I don't," answered the 
visitor. "If you are registered, we en-
courage you to become active in Tech and 

tlidrsident interrupted. "I realize I haven't 
been to as many classes as I should have, 
but I'll try to become more interested and 
active. By the way, what dorm am I in?" 

"No, you don't understand. We're 
trying to get students to register to vote. By 
registering, you can vote for the interests of 
Tech and its students," the volunteer ex-
plained. 

"SOUNDS GREAT. Put me down as 
`Yes'," the student said. 

"Yes?" the volunteer asks. 
"Yes, anything in the interests of Tech 

and its students, I'm all for it. So I vote, 
`Yes'. What time is it?" 

"It's 2: 30. You don't quite get the point, 
sir. You see, Tech students have a notorious 
reputation for poor voter turn-out and 
general apathy concerning local elections."  
We, members of the Student Association 
Voter Campaign, are trying to get students 
registered, so they may vote in local 
elections. We're trying to dispell the nasty, 
unfair, stereotype that Tech students don't 
give a damn about the university, the town 
where they live, or anything that doesn't 
have to do with parties and drinking," the 
volunteer explained. 

"THAT'S TERRIBLE," the resident 
commented. 

"It is an unfair reputation and..." 
"Not the stereotype, the time. It's 2:30 

and I was supposed to meet some friends of 
mine at 1," the student said, digging some 
lint from his navel. 

"Don't you see," the volunteer pleaded 
in desperation, "Tech's rights will continue 
to be usurped unless we maintain a never 
ending vigilance at the polls; asserting our 

right to be heard, becoming active in local 
elections, demanding that consideration to 
be given to our cause through the 
democratic process and the American 
way." 

The resident yawned. 
"Imagine," the volunteer said, his eyes 

widening, "our voice, 22,000 strong, 
speaking for their rights." 

"Say, that is impressive. Twenty-two 
thousand, did you say?" 

"Twenty-two thousand," the volunteer 
eagerly answered. "We shouldn't let out-
selves be ignored." 

"I should say not," said the resident. 
"Why 22,000 people is enough to put Rick 
Bullock in first place in the Pizza Hut 
Basketball classic." 

"YOU'RE GETTING the idea. Now if 
you just think about what we could ac-
complish in local elections. We could get 
permanent representation on the city 
council. We could further the cause of Tech 
with legislators in Austin. We could..." 

"Well that's all fine and dandy, but I 
really don't know much about politics," the 
student said. "I really don't think we 
could..." 

"WE COULD lower the price of beer..." 
"Where do I sign?" 

Ford 'completely approves' of Moynihan's acts 
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Presidential screening group needs interview time 
THE PRESIDENTIAL Screening Com-

mittee represents various facets of the 
university. Minorities, students, the various 
colleges and schools of the university, and the 
School of Medicine are insured some voice in the 
debate over the qualifications of Tech's next 
president. 

Various sources have commended not only 
the representaive nature of the committee but 
also the individual committee members as being 
wise choices for seats on the committee. The 
committee has settled down to its work, having 
processed approximately 90 names so far. 

THE QUALITY OF the committee and its 
representativeness will be of no avail, however, 
unless a crippling fault in the screening 
procedure is repaired. Under the procedures 
now in force, the committee is relegated to 
paper-shuffling. 

When the committee and several members 
of the Board of Regents met in December, it was  

decided that only the regents, and not the 
committee, would interview candidates for the 
job. The only information by which the com-
mittee can rank candidates is on paper — letters 
of nomination, resumes, and letters of reference. 
The committee is not allowed the important, 
personal contact of an interview. 

UNDER SUCH A setup, it appears the 
naming of a committee composed of faculty and 
students was a deceptive move, intended to give 
the appearance of faculty-student participation. 
In reality, the regents will be the only ones in 
control of the essential information needed to 
make the choice. 

Anyone given serious consideration for the 
position will look good on paper. That person will 
have a doctorate and hold a position high in 
university's hierarchy. 

THAT INFORMATION, for example, will 
not tell how much emphasis the candidate thinks 
recreation facilities deserve. Or whether  

students should retain control over Student 
Service Fee allocations. 

The information, although it might give 
hints, will not definitely tell whether the person 
wants to emphasize the development of 
engineering or agriculture or medicine. Or 
whether he wants Tech to develop more in the 
area of liberal arts. 

SUCH INFORMATION can only come from 
a personal interview, which the committee 
should conduct. Without being able to conduct 
those interviews, the students and faculty are 
going to be left without a voice in the selection 
process. They will not have anything truly 
substantial to say about the person who will be 
leading and directing this university. 

It should be noted that Board Chairman. 	Clint 
Formby has hedged on this point. The board may 
ask for committee members to be a part of the 
interview process, he has said. "I wouldn't say it  

could not happen," he said. 
It also should be noted the board has, and 

deserves to have, the final say in the selection of 
the next president. No one is proposing the 
screening committee function as a selection 
committee, and take away the board's 
responsibility. But for the committee to function 
as an effective screening committee, it must 
take part in the interviews. 

THE BOARD WILL, at its meeting this 
week, review the criteria and procedures in-
volved in the screening process. The board 
should take this opportunity to announce its 
intention to allow the committee members in on 
the interviews. The regents should demonstrate 
a real desire to involve students and faculty in 
the screening process. 

All the students and faculty have now is 
token representation. 

—Bob Hannan, Editor 

Letters 

Freshman Center 

commended 
To the editor: 

This is to thank the Freshman Center for the 
nice personal help that they gave me the other 
day. I did not know the procedures for add-drop, 
and not only did they tell me, but a worker also 
went with me through the entire process. We 
finished in 10 minutes with no hassles. I had been 
getting the run-around on several other 
problems and they also helped me clear these up. 
I later got a call from the Freshman Center 
checking to make sure that I had gotten answers 
for all my questions. 

I heartily recommend the Freshman Center 
to any other student as a way to beat the Tech 
Shuffle. 

Ricky Sales 
151 Carpenter 

Writer discards 

thief classification: 
To the editor: 

I would like to make a reply to the person 
that alleges that I stole five generations from the 
black people. This allegation is absurd. It is 
absurd because I was not even alive 110 years 
ago, when slavery abounded in the United States. 
I believe that it is absolutely ridiculous to hold 
the people of this generation responsible. 

Slavery of any type is wrong and everyone is 
entitled to equal rights, regardless of race, sex or 
personal beliefs. However, it is not right to grant 
special privileges to the so called "oppressed 
minorities" simply because they are a minority. 
This would be the same as discriminating 
against the majority, and as we all know 
discrimination is unconstitutional. 

Many propagandist would lead one to believe 
that slavery was an invention of the white man. 
This is not true. For example it is a fact that 
slavery existed in Africa even before the 
colonization of the New World. Also the type of 
slavery that existed in the South was not the only 
type of slavery that existed in America. In the 
North, immigrant labor was just as much a form 
of slavery, and it lasted well into the 1900s. So the 
plight of the black people is certainly not unique. 
Everyone deserves equal rights and an equal 
chance in life, but special privileges are simply 
not fair. And it is foolish to call me a thief. 

Dale May 
133 Sneed 

WASHINGTON (AP) — President Ford says 
he "completely approves" of the way United 
Nations Ambassador Daniel P. Moynihan is 
conducting his office, the second presidential 
vote of confidence given the fiery diplomat in as 
many months. 

FORD ISSUED a statement Wednesday 
endorsing Moynihan, who last week sent a 
classified cable to Secretary of State Henry A. 
Kissinger complaining that elements in the State 
Department were under mining his work at the 
United Nations. 

Kissinger also expressed on Wednesday his 
feeling that Moynihan is "doing an outstanding 
job" and said Moynihan has "the full support" of 
the department. 

AT THE U.N., Moynihan issued a 
statement that said Ford had telephoned him at 
midday to give him the go ahead to continue 
"committed but candid" U.S. participation in 
the U.N. 

Moynihan's cable described as successful 
his controversial confrontation methods in the 
U.N. aimed, he said, at "breaking up the 
massive blocs of nations, which for so long have 
been arrayed against us in international forums 
and in diplomatic encounters generally." 

FORD'S PRESS secretary, Ron Nessen, said 
of the complaint against State, "It's a routine 
exercise in Washington bureaucracy that not 
everybody always agrees with what some one 
else might be doing." 

A State Department spokesman read a 
statement, approved by Kissinger, to reporters, 
saying, "Newspapers must ask themselves what 
their responsibility is when they consider 
publication of such documents." 

A TEXT OF the cable was carried by The 
New York Times Wednesday. 
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Daily, Texas Tech University, P.O. Box 
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SamThoss 
A UWANTS 

In a Hurry For 

t. LUNCH? Call Us - 
lite I 

table 
 l ll ave it on 

when you 
Arrive! 

OPEN 24 HRS. A DAY 
CALL IN FOR FAST 

CARRY OUT SERVICE 
Across from Jones Statium 

763-0609 

THE 

ATTENTION: SORORITIES & FRATERNITIES 
Gifts for all occasions, custom made, 

hand painted, made to order 

3809 34th Valentines too. 797-5901 

PLAINS PIZZA 

CORNER 34th & 

-UNIVERSITY 

SPLIT SHIFTS 

.SOME WEEKENDS 

.FLEXIBLE SCHEDULES 

.NOON & EVENINGS 

KTXT 
UB HOC K 

92 
FM 
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STD literary contest 
reruns for Harbinger' 

in The Harbinger box in the Sigma Tau Delta, English 
honorary society, is running 
the annual fiction, poetry and 
photography contest for its 
magazine, The Harbinger. 

Submissions may be placed 

English Building, room 216, by 
Feb. 20. Contestants must be 
undergraduates. 

First place winners will 
receive a $10 prize. 

Answer to Thursday's 
Puzzle Crossword Puzzler 

ACROSS 

1 Shallow 
vessels 

5 Den 
9 Occupant 

11 Raged 
13 Bone 
14 Rustic 
16 Proceed 
17 Pigpen 
19 Encomium 
20 Yellow 

ocher 
21 Winter vehi-

cle 
23 Female 

sheep 
24 Footwear 
25 Mans name 
27 Faint 
29 Stroke 
30 Transgress 
31 Boundaries 
33 Vegetable 

11)1 ) 
35 Girls name 
36 Edible seed 
38 Clan 
40 Urge on 
41 Brag 
43 Conjunction 
44 Symbol for 

nickel 
45 Fall back 
47 Note of 

scale 
48 Tall struc-

tures 
50 European 

ermines 
52 Bird s home 
53 Oceans 

5 Path 
6 Emmet 
7 Pronoun 
8 Area 

11 Rants 
10 Stories 
9 Hurl 

12 Apportion 
15 Seed 
18 Barking 
20 Make 

briefer 
22 Girls name 
24 Painful 

spots 
26 Devoured 2 
3281  \I 

st  
Tiny 37 

32 Blemishes 
a horde 

33 Foundations 39 
34 Games 
35 Period of 	41 

fasting 
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'Chinatown' stars 'Catch 22' scene 

Organ of 
hearing 
Spanish for 
"three.  
Mans 
nickname 

42 Makes lace 
45 Things, in 

law 
46 Pedal digit 
49 Pronoun 
51 Cooled lava 
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MAILED ANYWHERE 
IN THE WORLD FOR $3 

LA 
VENTANA Lone Star Festival returns 

'Zardoz' 

Freebies come from increased fees 

DOWN 
1 Pounding 

instrument 
2 Article 
3 Short sleep 
4 Snick and 

ORDER NOW 

"Including the three 
movies, we are offering 
students about $2,200 woth of 
free activities," McQueen 
said. 

By CLIFFORD CAIN 
UD Reporter 

Regularly scheduled big 
name free movies will be one 
of the benefits derived from 
the $5 fee increase passed on 
an Oct. 29 and 30, 1975 student 
referendum, according to 
Nelson Longley, director of 
the University Center. 

The University Center 
Programs Council met last 
week and decided which 
services and activities would 
be upgraded this semester. 

THE FIRST THREE free 
movies will be: 

-"Catch 22", Friday and 
Sunday with the showings at 7 
and 9:30 p.m. plus a late night 
showing on Friday and two 
showings (times yet to be 
announced) Sunday. 

-"Zardoz" March 5 and 7. 
-"Chinatown" April 2 and 

will be repeated on a six-week 
cycle and be advertised along 
with the movie ads. 

Other benefits will include a 
free dance sometime in 
February and a "May Day 
Celetration" (May 1) with free 
ice cream and other goodies. 

BIG NEWS for Tech 
students will be the return of 
the Lone Star Music Festival 
as a free event. 

According to McQueen, the 
programs council had con-
sidered dropping the festival 
or charging students because 
of increasing costs and losses, 
but will continue the festival 
with the fee increase. 

The headlining band will be 
the Wright Brothers and the 
Overland Stage Company, 
coming back for an encore 
performance. 

SOCIAL SECURITY NO • 	  

CROSSWORD PUZZLE COURTESY OF . . LUBBOCK ADDRESS • 	  

Enclose a check for $8.40 payable to LA VENTANA andmaft 
to LA VENTANA, Box 4080, Tema Tech 79400, or bring by 
Room 102, Journalism Building. rANCAKE HOUSE 

OPEN LATE 	 6th & Ave. 0 

WHISKEY SMITH'S 
SPECIAL 

FROZEN DRINKS 
DAIQUIRIS & 

MARGARITAS 69° 

NO. 1 SINCE '61 

Classified Ads 

Dial 742-4274 CLASSIFIED 
DEADLINE - 12 NOON • ONE DAY PRIOR TO PUBLICATION 
15 WORD MINIMUM - CASH IN ADVANCE - NO REFUNDS 

1 day $1.50 	2 days $2.50 	3 days $3.50 	4 days $4.50 	5 days $5.00 

CLASSIFIED HOURS 8:00 - 11:45 a.m. & 1:00 to 4:45 p.m. Monday thru Friday. 

Closed on week-ends and holidays. 

VENTURA String Bass and Amp. Ex-
cellent Condition. Call 795 3311 after S 
p.m. 

BOX OFFICE OPENS 7:15 TYPING WINCHESTER 
3417 50th 795.2808 

Adults 
2.50 

Child 
51.00 

Peter Fonda, Warren Oates 
in 

HASTINGS ANTIQUES invites you 
seven miles east to Idalou 12.000 ft 
floorspace Come shop 892 2779 ( 

TYPI NG Thenies; theses. Disser-
tations. I BM ..Selectric. Work Guaran-
teed. Approved Graduate School List. 
Marge Talbott, 792 3829 

4. STAMPS-CASH 
57 50 Hollywood bed frame. linoleum. 
515.00 carpet, 	bassinet. 	air tank, 
typewriter, dog house, weights. 520• 
Power saw. bicycle. wardrobe. $25. 
bookshelves, chest. S40-desk, sewing 
machine, wringer washer. S50 Electric 
dryer, automatic washer. S65 Radio, 
tape player, TV. 590-6-chair-dinette. 1106 
23rd-744.9672. 762 2589 

"92 IN THE SHADE" 
TYPING and-or Editing. IBM Correc.  

ting Selectric II. Themes, Theses, etc. 

Experienced educator (English). Mrs. 
Larson 795 9740 

Rated R 
7:30 and 9.10 "Students will be able to get 

in free by going by the ticket 
booth and picking up an ad-
vance tickets," said Sid 
McQueen, assistant director 
of UC activities. 

n PROFESSIONAL typing 10 years ex-
perience. IBM Selectric II. Themes, 
theses. dissertations. Work guaranteed. 
Mrs. Davis 2622 33rd. 792 2229 7477853. 

Matinees-Open 2:00 

Adults 
52.50 
Child 
$1.00 

CINEMA WEST 
19th & Quaker 799.5216 FOX 1-2-3-4 QUILTS, all kinds, lovely patchwork. 

Reading light. Manual Olympia long 
carriage typewriter. Mist hairdryer. 762. 
3598 

PROFESSIONAL typing service for 
dissertations. theses. term papers. IBM 
Selectric II Satisfaction guaranteed. 
Cheryl. 792-0645. 

4215 19th St A LOVE STORY 
Olivia Hussey, Leonard Whiting 

"ROMEO AND JULIET" 
Rated PG 

5:15.8:00 

NEED Extra money? Keep 3 children in 
my home. 2:45.600 p m weekdoys only.  
Call 795 1591 BESIDES THE movie 

freebies, the snack bar and 
cafeteria will offer lunch 
specials on Tuesdays and 
Thursdays with a repeat 
special on Saturdays in the 
snack bar. 

HELD OVER 

CAMELOT 
8:00 ONLY 

JULES and 'BM STEREO Closeout - From Marantz 
Superscope receiver. List price $219.95 
Now $138.00 Layaway and financing. 
Martin's Sound Center, 4902 34th. 792-
2156- 

TERM papers. theses. dissertations. 
Experienced. Work guaranteed IBM 
Selectric II. Mrs. Gladys Workman. 2505 
24th 744 6167 

WANTED Part time bus drivers. Af 
ternoons. Monday Friday. 	Some 
weekend work Must have good driving 
record. Apply 1809 Avenue C. 52.75 hr 

1 EN years experience. Theses. term 
papers. etc. Mrs. Arnold. 792 1641. 2810 
53rd. Fast. Guaranteed. Spelling 
Corrected. HELP WANTED 

Position open for male or 
female organist - To work 
part time in our new MALL 
STORE to demonstrate 
organs. Must be able to 
play good organ music. 
Contact C. A. Rodgers at 

LUBBOCK 
MUSIC CENTER 

1722 Broadway 
Phone 762-0567 

OFFICE open 6:15 REFRIGERATOR, 1 year old, 2 Cubic 
foot Call 797-9172 after 6 p.m 

BOX 

ARNETT BENSON 
Io t a Univ. 762-4537 

Adults 
$2.00 
Child 
$1.00 

CAMERAS Brand new cameras in box 
with warranty's at wholesale prices' 
Most brands available. Call 7422420. 

TYPING . themes, theses, reports. etc. 
Reasonable rates. Fast Service. Call 
Terry, 797-3934. 

Tuesdays and Thursdays 
will be the special days until 
the new food lines are opened, 
McQueen said. The specials 

Dean Jones in 
Walt Disneys 

"BLACKBEARD'S 
GHOST" 

71C.,rtoon-A-Roonies" '  

-6:30-8:05 

USED Speakers. 3-way advance. Great 
Shape $35 00 each. Layaway available. 
Martin's Sound Center, 4902 34th, 792-
2156. FOR RENT 
DISCONTINUED Carpet samples for 
sale. Also carpet remnants. 5226 9th 

HALF Block Tech. 2 Dorm. Furnished 
house. 24099th. 7997419. No Pets. 2 boys. 
590 each. Bills paid. 

Inas 
Matinees-opens 2:00 LEFT in layaway. Kenwood Amp Model 

KA 1400G. 14 watts. RMS per channel. 
List price $159 95. Balance due $120.00.  
S10 monthly. Martin's Sound Center. 4902 
34th, 792 2156. 

Wednesday 8:00 p.m. Coronado Rm. 

$100  W/ID or Season Ticket 

ONE Bedroom furnished. Fireplace. 
Indoor pool 5185 For Appointment call, 
747.6373. 2001 9th 

Adults 
$1.75 
Child 

75c 

LINDSEY 
Moin & Ave. .1 765.5394 

Booze. Banks 8 Broads EFFICIENCIES Furnished, $130. For 
appointment call 747.6373. 2102 10th. TWO Black bean bags. New. $15.00 each.  

Call 7u-3367. AUTOMOBILE "SUN DANCE CASSIDY 
& BUTCH THE KID" 

Rated PG 
2:15-0:00-5:45-7:30-9:15 

AK U New' New' One bedroom, S155 plus 
electricity. 1 bedroom efficiency, $135, 
plus electricity. Panelled, dishwasher, 
disposal and shag 2217 10th. Jacon 
Enterprises, 2205 10th, 744.9922 

'68 Dodge Charger. 303. good cOndlhOn. 
must sell. Call 742-4945 Introducing the 

UC FOOD SPECIALS 

FOR SALE 1964 Mercury Comet. Good 
Condition. S400 Call 742.5537 

Quilts all kinds, excellent quality junior-
miss slacks. dresses. Typewriter. 
reading lights. pillows, scraps. 762 3598. 

IM 
1966 Chevrolet Impala. Runs like a top 
795 2435 WINDJAMMER. New! New! 1 

bedroom. $155 plus electricity. 1 
bedroom efficiency. S135 plus electricity. 
Available February 1. Panelled, dish-
washer 8. Shag. 2207 7th. Jacon En-
terprises, 2205 10th. 7449922. 

J BAR J 	Efficiency Apt. S135 plus 
electricity. 1 & 2 bedroom. 5165 & S215, 
plus electricity. Dishwasher. disposal. 
carpeted, panelled 2410 8th Jacon 
Enterprises. 744.9922  

WANTED Male roommate to split rent 
on 3 bedroom house. Plus bills. Call 747. 

4995 evenings. 

An Allred Artists Release at) 
vX-#) NO ONE UNDER 14 ADMITTED 

BOX OFFICE opens 7:30 

LOTUS Eurota. twin Cam. 35 m.p.g. 
New tires. battery and paint. Call 793-
0048 after 6.  

VILLAGE 
2329 34th 765.6560 

HELD OVER 

Adults 
52.00 

Child 
51.00 

Tuesday 
Snack Bar: Cheeseburger with Samll Coke 	69c MISCELLANEOUS 3rd Week 6:50- 9:00 

I.D. Re t uired STEREO Speakers Closeout Sonic 	u 
with 3 inch, 5 inch, 15 inch. Removeable 
cover. List price $169.95 each. Now 
$125.00 pair. Martin's Sound Center, 4902 
34th, 792.2156. 

"THE LIFE AND 
TIMES OF 

GRIZZLY ADAMS" 
AireatantOne showing 7:45 Rated G 

Lonely. Confused, need help, or to rap' 
Call INTERCHANGE from 6 p.m. to 1 
a.m daily. 747-1311. 

Cafe: Meatloaf with tomato cause 	 72c 

Watch for Thursday & Saturday Specials ACADEMIC Rescue Squad A mini 
course in academic skills. Call 742-4297 LEFT in layaway Toshiba receiver. SA 

300 In Box. Balance 5125 00 or S10 00 per 
month Martin's Sound Center. 4902 34th, 
792 2156 PRESCHOOL. M F. 7.30 a.m - 5 30 p.m. 

Ages 3-5 Degreed teacher. Early 
childhood specialization, Licensed Near 
Tech 792 0853. 

UNIVERSITY ARMS APARTMENTS 

Across from Tech and Jones Stadium 

Furnished 

WEDDING invitations All styles, 
colors. traditional. modern Lowest 
prices, fast, personal service. Mrs 
Bailey, 797-215.4 

ionns• 	 SIR  
hrr MP/ C "JO* 	COISAINCADX 

r(
JOHNNY BUSH 

Iet-44 Coto Pada 
AT THE 

Friday, Feb. 6th! 	RESERVATIONS 799-1326 

_/''''...11.111111.2"7-t1111/00,a1 

FREE puppies. 762-3732. Efficiencies. 1 and 2 bedrooms HOW LONG HAS IT BEEN 
SINCE YOU HAVE HAD A 6th Week 

7:05 - 9:30 

1 Rent you can afford 
2 All utilities paid 
3 Heated pool 
4 volleyball Court 
5 New Gas Bar B Oue Grills 
6 Patio 
7 Laundry 
8 Private Parking 

HELP WANTED  
NEEDED 1 part time cook. approx 3 
hrs. at noon Mon.-Fri. Apply at The 
Brittany Restaurant, 2424 14th. in per 

son. 

GREAT DATE 
1776-1976? 

call or visit 
GREAT DATES 

795-5729 	3108 50th 
In 	the 	Monterey 
Professional Building 

LOOKING for future? Begin working 
part-time while in college and earn $300. 
$500 per month After graduation op 
portunity to earn 120.00040.000 per yer 
Call 747 /625 between 4.30.8 00 p.m.  

409 University 767.6113 

HANDSOME, 2 story, 2 bcIrm furnished 
apt Central air & heat. The Shadows, 
2413 9th Street ' 7 block from Tech. 5198 
monthly. Bills paid. 744.0867 TEMPORARY Office workers Register 

Williams Worker Company. 2302 Avenue 
Q. No Fee 747 5141.  BURT REYNOLDS 

CATHERINE DENEUVE 

"HUSTL,E4 ," FOR SALE LOST & FOUND  SOPHOMORES - VETS! HAVE WE 
GOT A DEAL FOR YOU' $100 a month. 
Academic credit. Social activities. $500 
for six weeks advanced camp- Contact 
AROTC. Social Science Building. Rm. 
10. 742-2141 2142 Ask about the 2 year 
Army ROTC Program 

Ex 
$300 

SUPER Olds. Cornet. Dead bell 
cellent Condition. Includes Case 
Call 792 5011 

Cui.o 

A Vit.inknol PKItite 
SR 51 Calculator lost in vicinity of band 
practice field. Morning 76th. 8:30 
Reward given. Call 792 5342. 6th Week 

7:00 - 9:20 
SYLVANIA AM FM Stereo. BSR turn 
table, air Suspension speakers. 

Tapedeck. four channel Matrix Adapter. 

$100 742 4448. 

CALL Linda 	Lost black male 
Doberman. 6 mo. old 2600 block of 33rd. 
793 0093 

FULL time bartender wanted Apply in 
person. J Patrick O'Malley's 

Jo. 	  -.•••-•••1•••-.mi 



tir A II . 
ONE 

BEDROOM 
APARTMENTS 
FURNISHED 
'139—'149 
Bills Paid 

Adults 90* 

CORTE VISTA APTS. 
119 Avenue X 	762-8433 

Sentry Property Mgmt. 

ALPHA KAPPA PSI 
"Social fraternity for B.A. majors" 
(A new concept in fraternities) 

Invite all B.A. majors to 

SMOKERS ON FEB 3rd & 
FEB 5th - 7:30 p.m. 
Blue Room 	Coat & Tie 

NEWCOMER SPECIAL 

Clip This Ad For $200 Discount 
With Dorothy-haron-Pat-Carol 

/144.4.X 	a/iltioot 

Terrace Shopping Center 
Mt 346 

792.2292 

000 
SPECIALS! 

There's a whole new way to beat the inflation at 
the INTERNATIONAL HOUSE OF PANCAKES. Just 
look at our 991 Specials, served 11 AM to 9 PM. 

MON. 
Spaghettini & 
Meat Sauce, 
served with 
Soup, Garlic 
Bread .  

TUES. 
Mighty 
Burger 

WED. 
Cheese 
Omelette & 3 
Buttermilk 
Pancakes 

THUR. 
Soup & 
Sandwich of 
the Oay 

FRI. 
Fish & Chips 
Banquet served 
with Dinner Roll, 
Salad, choice 
of Dressing 

International House of Pancake? 

1627 University Ave. 
LIAM-  ...for many good reasons 

CRUZ'S 
BICYCLE-REPAIR SHOP 
DISCOUNT on New Ross & 
Vista Bicycles With Tech 
I.D. Free Check up. 
Sales and Service For All 
Makes Since 1945. 

• NUM 
42041/2  19th Across From 

795-4331  Fox Theater 

S MONEY S 
Early Tax Return 

prepared by Law Students 

SHORT 
T
...

t 	LONG 
FORM 	'00 

 FORM $10.00 
CLEMENT 325 	

8. up 
 

4-8 p.M. 	 742-1531 
or by Appt. 	792.1307 

Favorite Mexican Food 

ek. 
RESTAURANT 

(Closed Mon) 
762-5854 	 1608 19th St 

The University Daily, February 2, 1976 Page 3 

Colleges support Houston as solar research site NEWS BRIEFS 
Moslem leader predicts fighting 

MOKHTARA, Lebanon (AP) — Kamal Junblatt, the 
most prominent leader of Lebanon's Moslem left, said 
Sunday both sides in the civil war are bringing in new arms 
and predicted more savage fighting soon. 

In an interview with the Associated Press, Junblatt 
qualified Syria's efforts to end the 10 month conflict as 
"mythology" unlikely to resolve the root problems that have 
thrown Lebanon into chaos. 

"An organization like the Phalange party has to be 
completely crushed before we have any peace," he said. "It 
is impossible to reconcile yourself with people who look down 
on you. Myself, I don't think it will happen." 

The Phalange party fields the largest right wing 
Christian militia fighting Moslem leftists and their 
Palestinian allies. Junblatt, leader of the Progressive 
Socialist party, is the titular head of Moslem forces and their 
most influential political chieftain. 

Moslem and Palestinian forces control roughly two-
thirds of Lebanon. 

Gandhi protestors arrested 
MADRAS, India ( AP) —The Indian government arrested 

on Sunday hundreds of members of a regional political party 
opposed to Prime Minister Indira Gandhi following federal 
takeover of the administration of Tamil Nadu state. 

The arrests were part of tough and apparently effective 
security measures clamped on the state following the central 
government's decision Saturday to dissolve the Tamil Nadu 
legislature and bring the state administration under what is 
known as president's federal rule. 

The outgoing government controlled by the Dravida 
Munnetra Kazhagam ( DMK) party turned over the state 
machinery without incident to representatives of the central 
government and urged its followers to remain nonviolent. 
There were no reports of fighting. 

Guerrillas attack police academy 
BUENOS AIRES, Argentina (AP) — Fifty guerrillas 

attacked a police academy Sunday, apparently to steal 
helicopter gunships stored there, but were repulsed in a 
bloody gunbattle that left at least three guerrillas dead and a 
policeman seriously wounded, police said. 

"The number of casualties could be higher," a police 
spokesman said after the raid on the Juan Vucetich Police 
Academy in a suburb of LaPlata, 30 miles south of Buenos 
Aires. He said a number of guerrillas were captured. 

However, an army report tried to minimize the attack, 
making no mention of any deaths or arrests and saying the 
guerrillas managed to escape. 

Despite the difference in the army and police versions, 
observers said it was the worst guerrilla attack on a 
government installation since a raid last Dec. 23 on an army 
arsenal in the Buenos Aires suburb of Monte Chingolo in 
which at least 156 civilians, soldiers and guerrillas were 
killed. That attack was the bloodiest in nine years of 
Argentine political violence. 

King named assistant 

to engineering dean 

By DEBBI WHITNEY 
UD Reporter 

Tech, the University of 
Texas, Rice and the 
University of Houston are 
working together to bring an 
estimated $50 million Solar 
Energy Research Institute to 
Houston, according to Dr. 
George F. Meenaghan, dean 
for research and - director of 
Research Services. 

The institute will be con-
cerned with developing solar 

returning 
By MIKE ROYE 

UD Staff 
A new program at Texas 

Tech, The Woman's Con-
tinuum, offers "A Look at the 
Library and How to Use It", a 
Graduate Records Exam 
(GRE) preparation seminar, 
and a Women's Continuum 
Informational Symposium for 
women returning to Tech this 
semester. 

The trend across the United 
States, as in Lubbock, is for 
women, age 25 to 30, to return 
to college continuing or 
completing their education. 
Most of the women are 
returning to complete their 
undergraduate degrees, and 
others are enrolled for career 
purposes, according to 
Ridgley Denning of the 
Student life office. 	Some 
women are taking history 
courses because it's the 
bicentennial year, she said. 

Women leave college to 
marry, to travel, to put their 
husbands through college, to 
have families and many other  

energy as a heating and 
cooling source to supplement 
oil and gas. 

The Energy Research and 
Development Adminstration 
(ERDA), which will fund the 
institute, commissioned the 
National Academy of Science 
to determine what should be 
the criteria for location and 
management of the institute, 
Meenaghan said. 

THE KEY QUESTION now, 

to Tech 
reasons. By age 25, many of 
these reasons are not as 
primary as before and the 
women return for more 
education, Denning said. 

THE programs deal with 
using resources already at 
Tech because there is no 
funding for The Women's 
Continuum. Programs are 
developed on a demand basis 
according to what the women 
think will be interesting and 
helpful. 

As many graduate students 
as freshmen attended a study 
skills seminar in January 
prior to the first day of classes 
this semester. Because of the 
response for this program, the 
study skills seminar will be 
offered again in February, 
Denning said. 

A schedule of programs 
designed to aid about 1,000 
women returning to Tech was 
started in September. The 
new program, The Women's 
Continuum, was a follow-up of 
a successful earlier program, 
The Women's Symposium.  

according to Meenaghan, is 
whether the location should 
have solar insolation (high 
exposure to radiation from the 
sun). 

If solar insolation is 
required, only the states along 
the sun belt, including 
California, Arizona, New 
Mexico, Nevada and Texas, 
will be in competition for the 
institute, Meenaghan said, but 
if solar energy is not required, 
competition will come from all 
over the United States. 

The solar insolation 
requirement will be made 
known in a request for 
proposal containing ERDA 
specifications and desires for 
the institute, Meenaghan said. 

The request for proposal 
should be received next week, 
he said. 

The four universities' 
ultimate goal, according to 
Meenaghan, is to get the 
proposal for the institute for 
Texas. The San Antonio, El 
Paso and Houston areas will 
be in competition if Texas gets 
the proposal. 

THE universities decided 
Houston would be the most 
desirable area, Meenaghan 
said, because it meets most of 
the specified requirements for 
the institute. Included in the 
requirements are proximity to 
a large international au-port, a 
strong academic department 
from which the institute lab 
could find help and a large 
technology 	base 	for 
manufacturing parts for the 
institute. 

"The four universities are  

not asking for management of 
the institute, but merely for a 
location," Meenaghan said. 

The Houston area does not 
have solar insolation, 
Meenaghan said, so if the 
request for proposal lists an 
insolation requirement, 
Houston will be eliminated. 
Meenaghan 	said 	the 
universities will support one of 
the other two areas in this 
case. 

IF TEXAS receives the 
proposal for the institute, 
Meenaghan said Tech officials 
feel the school has an ideal 
location for a field station 
which would conduct research 
programs for solar collectors  

and their sub-systems because 
of Lubbock's adequate supply 
of solar energy from wind. 

Meenaghan feels solar 
energy will not take over the 
job of oil and gas, but will be 
an energy supplement. He 
said coal as an energy source 
will be used for at least the 
first two decades of the next 
century. In the meantime, he 
feels more work will be done 
to utilize nuclear energy as a 
source. 

Solar energy is especially 
important 	to 	Texas, 
Meenaghan said, because 
natural gas is now being used 
as an energy source for 
irrigation. 

Program aids women 

Let Your Eyes 
Be Fashion Wise 

A GENUINE 
EMILIO PUCCI 

CREATION 

Mrs. Jo King 
in her home town of Abilene 
and worked in the cotton and 
oil industries before coming to 
Tech. 

The division she heads 
supervises the college's 
Flying Professor's Program 
and the off-campus program 
leading to a master of 
engineering degree. 

Mrs. Jo King has been 
named director of the Division 
of Continuing Engineering 
Education and assistant to the 
dean of Tech's College of 
Engineering. 

The announcement was 
made by engineering Dean 
John R. Bradford. 

King succeeds Dr. Lee J. 
Phillips, who joined Texas 
A&M University Jan. 1 as 
assistant 	director 	for 
engineering studies in the 
Texas Engineering Extension 
Service. Phillips was 
assistant dean and a member 
of the industrial engineering 
faculty. 

King has been an employe of 
Tech 14 years, and in 1975, she 
was a recipient of the Top 
Techsan staff award 
recognizing outstanding 
service. She formerly served 
as secretary to Tech President 
Robert C. Goodwin and later 
as administrative assistant to 
Tech President Robert C. 
Goodwin and later as ad-
ministrative assistant to 
President Grover E. Murray. 
She has served three years in 
the Division of Continuing 
Engineering Education. 

She studied business at 
Hardin-Simmons University 

NORWAYSWEDEN 
DENMARKGERMA 
NYHOLLANDBELG 
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The longest country in Europe. 
Two months for $195. 

Student-Railpass covers 100,000 miles of track in thirteen European countries, all 
the way from the Arctic to the Mediterranean. And $195 buys you unlimited 
Second Class rail travel for two whole months. 
On a student's budget that's some deal. In fact, the only thing cheaper is thumbing it 
or wearing down your heels. Besides that, the trains are fast (some zip along at 100 mph), 
clean, comfortable and fun. You can go and come whenever you like. And 

Trains are dynamite. But how about ferries, lake cruisers, 
you'll meet more Europeans than you would on the road. 

• 
* ***** • • • • • • • • • • • • • • 

river boats and hydrofoils? Student-Railpass covers them, • 
• 

too. And it'll even get you discounts on motorcoach trips. 
If you want to do it big and mingle with the First Class 
types, think about Eurailpass. Same places, same trains 
(First Class, though), in two-week, three-week, one-month, 
two-month and three-month passes. 	 • Name 
To get a Student-Railpass, you have to be a full-time 	• 	 • 
student, under 26. And both Student-Railpass and 

	
• • Address 	  

• • Eurailpass are sold here through a Travel Agent. 	
City 	 State 	Zip 	

 • •• 
You won't be able to buy them in Europe. So plan ahead. 	 • 

• 
• My Travel Agent is 	   
• We've got a big country waiting. 	 • 
• • 

SITUDENTRAILPASS 

Sounds like an incredible bargain. Please send me •• 
free information on Student-Railpassand Eurailpass. • 

• 

Eurailpass, Box 0, 
Staten Island, N.Y. 10305 

192-1135 • 
• 
• 
• 
• 
• 
• 
• 
• 
• 
• 
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million people are amassing in cities. Many major cities are 
growing two, three and four times as fast as the country in 
which they are located, doubling up in 8 to 12 years." 

Bergstrom told the group that too much of the world's 
food is going to the affluent countries. Bergstrom illustrated 
the fact by informing the group that in the period 1950-72, 
four-fifths of the oceans harvests were given to the affluent 
world. 

"THE U.S. WOULD NEVER have heard about the 1972 
crisis if the grain exporting countries led by U.S. and Canada 
had not restricted their wheat acreages in the period of 1969- 
70. If 

There are four critical areas that must be given con-
sideration in the near future, Borgstrom says. 

"We must formulate a food strategy plan to include 
better food utilization, nutrition, diseases and resources." 
Borgstrom added that the problem of food and population is 
not a twin issue. 

HOW NEAR WE ARE to the limit is measured in the fact 
that there are no more than 470 million people who eat as well 
as an average American, according to Borgstrom. 

"If all available food were equally distributed and each 
one received a U.S. diet, some 560 million would be provided 
for," Borgstrom said. 

Dr. Borgstrom 
Dr. Georg Borgstrom of Michigan State University told a 
Friday "Population, Food, Water" seminar audience that 
U.S. agriculture surpluses created a false sense of security in 
the world food scene. (Photo by Darrel Thomas) 
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LIQUOR STORES 

By LINDA THOMAS 
UD Staff 

Everything from a study on 
infant mouse brains to 
biostimulation will be covered 
in the interdisciplinary 
neuroscience research 
seminar scheduled this 
semester. 

The 	lecture 	series, 
developed 	by 	the 
Neuroscience Advisory 
Committee on campus, will be 
every Tuesday throughout the 
spring semester. 

THE SEMINAR consists of 
13 topic sessions dealing with 
different 	aspects 	of 
neuroscientific research and 
advances. Members of the 
Tech faculty will conduct the 
weekly sessions until April 13. 
The dates April 20 and 27 have 
been left open for the 
possibility 	of 	outside 
speakers, according to Dr. H. 
Bernard Hartman. 

Hartman, who helped 
coordinate the seminar, said 

I 

the idea of a neuroscience 
seminar was developed 
because of wide campus in-
terest in the subject. The 
Neuroscience Advisory 
Committee members 
discovered 60 faculty mem-
bers from 16 different 
departments who expressed 
an interest in the field, he said. 

The seminar series was 
started to provide a common 
forum for discussion of the 
different aspects of reaseach, 
Hartman said. 

I 
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(With this coupon) 
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Every Tuesday b Ta
e have everything 

anybody else has got 
6 large closets 	I 

1 Br. Furnished 
Utilities Paid 

2 Swimming Pools 
3 Laundries 

All Electric Kitchens 
Plenty of Parking 
Reasonable Rents-5141 to 5151 
Sorry-No Pets 

UNIVERSITY VILLAGE VARSITY VILLAGE 	TECH VILLAGE 
763-8822 	3102 4th St. 	761-1156 	30014th St.  7622233 2902 3rd PI 

at A&W 
Genuine Coney Hot Dogs Smothered 
in Rich Coney Sauce Topped Off with 

Tongy Bits of Juicy Onion 

Tuesday Special 20¢ 
Regular Price 50¢ 

3607 50th PHI ALPHA THETA 
Phi Alpha Theta, history honorary, 

is now accepting applications for 
membership Application blanks and a 
list of membership requirements are 
available in the Social Science Building. 
room 119 Deadline for application is 
Feb 13 

PHI ALPHA THETA 
Applications are now available for the 

Phi Alpha Theta Ernest Wallace 
Scholarship. which offers a minimum of 
S100 Application blanks are avilable in 
the Social Science Building. room 119 

Physics professor 

to lecture this week 

Professor Marcos 
Moshinsky of the University of 
Mexico theoretical physics 
department will lecture at 
Tech at 3 p.m. Tuesday and 
Thursday and 3:30 p.m. today, 
Wednesday and Friday, all in 
room 60 of the Science 
Building. 

IROBINSON 
CLEANERS 

.EXPERT CLEANING 
ALTERATIONS 
.REPAIRS 

1615 University 
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CORPSDETTE RUSH 
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Surplus obscured food crisis, nutritionist says 

a 

House Speaker Bill Clayton introduces featured speaker Dr. 
Georg Borgstrom at Friday's food-water seminar at South-
park Inn. (Photo by Darrel Thomas) 

By JAY ROSSER 
UD Reporter 

The United States did not forsee any world food crisis 
developing until 1972, because of a "persistent obsession with 
grain surpluses," Dr. Georg Borgstrom told a seminar on 
"Population, Food, Water—West Texas Faces the 
Challenge" at the Southpark Inn Friday. 

Bergstrom, a professor of food sciences and human 
nutrition at Michigan State University since 1956, told a 
group of about 150 at the seminar that U.S. agriculture had 
created a feeling that there was no end to agricultural 
development. 

"WE PERSIST IN OUR MYOPIA and talk almost 
boastingly about our agripower with seeminly little 
awareness of the true nature, magnitude and complexity of 
the world food calamity," the past head of the Swedish In-
stitute of Food Preservation Research said. 

In the speech entitled "Food Population Crisis — How 
Near the Limit?" Borgstrom told the group there are three 
forces now having a major effect on the world scene. 

"All of these forces deeply affect the food situation," 
Borgstrom said. "These include population growth, 
escalating affluence and growing numbers of destutute, 
landless and unemployed." 

ALL OF THE PROBLEMS ARE compounded by 
allowing urbanization to run rampant, according to 
Borgstrom. 

"Within one short decade we are completely remaking 
the basic fabric of our world. We are in the midst of the 
biggest migration ever in human history. More than 600 

At food-water seminar  

Water-use efficiency urged 
By DEBBI WHITNEY 
UD Reporter 

stands and thus using less 
water. 

evaporation and transpiration 
through pores Viets said, but 
experiments with closing 
plant pores to save water have 
interrupted photosynthesis. 

Viets included control of 
irrigation 	run-off, 	less 
frequent irrigation and 
evaporation control as keys to 
water-use efficiency. 

chemicals and mulches have 
yet to be made. 

One of the greatest aids to 
water-use efficiency on 
irrigated lands, Viet said, is 
the use of fertilizers to 
produce optimal yield from 
the crop by creating thicker 

'All the high plains needs is water' 
By PAT GRAVES 
UD Reporter 

The agricultural produc-
tivity of West Texas could be 
doubled or tripled by bringing 
enough water to the high 
plains area, in the opinion of 

"Without green plants, 
there wouldn't be any people, 
but without water, there won't 
be any green plants," said Dr. 
Frank G. Viets Jr., in a speech 
Friday afternoon at the 
"Population, Food and 
Water" seminar. 

Viets is an independent 
agriculture consultant and 
retired consultant of the U.S. 
Department of Agriculture 
Cooperative Research Ser-
vice, National Science 
Foundation. 

THE EMPHASIS for saving 
water snould be on water-use 
efficiency, Viets said. Sixty to 
80 per cent of the water lost 
from plants is through 

an expert on water transfer. 

George W. McCleskey, 
president of Water Inc. and 
director of the Canadian River 
Municipal Water Authority, 
emphasized the potential of 

West Texas and Eastern New 
Mexico to help alleviate the 
world food shortage in a 
speech delivered Friday at 
Lubbock's South Park Inn. 

McCleskey spoke to a 
luncheon audience of more 
than 150 persons attending a 
day-long 	seminar 	on 
population, food and water. 
His topic was "Water Tran- 
sfer to Arid Lands: 	A 
Realistic Appraisal." 

In order to expand 
agricultural production, 
McCleskey said four con- 
ditions 	are 	required-- 
moderate temperatures, 
proper soils, level land for 
mechanization and adequate 
supplemental water. 

"All the high plains needs is 
water," he said. "If there's 
another area better suited 
than the high plains (for in-
creasing agricultural 
productivity through water 
transfer), let's go there. The 
demand for food is coming 
down the pike." 

McCleskey quoted statistics 
to support his case for water 
importation. He said there 
are approximately 460 million 
undernourished people 
(mostly children) in the world 
today and that 10 million of 
them die annually. Since 1961, 
the United States has moved 

Neuroscience schedules 

research seminar series 

Gravel mulches have 
proved effective in retaining 
water in soil, Viet said, but 
some areas do not have suf-
ficient gravel even for con-
crete, and the gravel must be 
stored somewhere until 
planting time. 

CHEMICALS to reduce 
water evaporation in soil have 
not worked very well, Viets 
said, but he added that 
technological advances on the 

CHARCOAL n OVEN 
4409 19r1 ii. 	PH. 792-7535 

from a time of surplus to 
reserves to scarcity in terms 
of food production, he said. 

McCleskey said the 
economic feasibility of water 
importation is directly 
dependent on the degree of 
need for the water. Although 
the cost may seem high, he 
said the alternative to 
rejecting water transfer, and 
the accompanying increase in 
agricultural productivity, is 
unacceptable. 

"If we began serious 
planning to import water to 
west Texas right now," Mc-
Cleskey said, "we couldn't 
begin pumping until the year 
2000. We could easily turn our 
backs on water importation 
since it won't affect our lives, 
but it will be a serious problem 
for our kids." 

McCleskey quoted U.S. 
Secretary of Agriculture Earl 
Butz who said America's 
agricultural production must 
double in the next 25 years. 
McCleskey added that a 
problem not faced becomes a 
crisis. 

"The author of Proverbs 
wrote, 'Where there is no 
vision, the people perish,' " he 
said. "I hope we'll have the 
vision to deal with the two 
greatest problems man has 
faced: water and food. 
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NEUROSCIENCE, ac-
cording to Dr. Kent Rylander, 
chairman of the Neuroscience 
Advisory Committee, seems 
to be one of the more exciting 
areas of the future. Studies 
range from molecular level to 
understanding human 
behavior, he said. 

Similar programs have been 
in operation for several years 
at Massachusetts Institute of 
Technology, the University of 
Iowa and the University of 
California at San Diego. Few 
programs have the breadth of 
interest of this Tech seminar, 
Rylander said. 

CURRENTLY 25 graduate 
students have declared 
neuroscience as a minor. No 
courses in neuroscience are 
now being offered to un-
dergraduates, but Hartman 
said a course concerning the 
principles of neurophysiology 
may be available in the near 
future. 

The first lecture, conducted 
Tuesday by Dr. William R. 
Jarzembski of the biomedical 
engineering department, was 
on 	biostimulation, 	or 
stimulation of the brain. 
Jarzembski discussed the 
history of biostimulation and 
the research going on now in 
the field. A question and an-
swer session followed the talk. 

Hartman will speak on 
analysis of movement and 
tension receptors Tuesday at 8 
p.m. in biology room 101. 
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TOWN DRAW 
MOMNPS NO110E KOEN'S STUDIOS 

Entry deadline is Feb 10 
STUDENT HONOR RECITAL 

The music department will present 
"Program IV. Student Honor Recital" 
of the Symposium of Contemporary 
Music at 8 15 p.m today in room 1 of the 
Music Building 

ALPHA THETA 
Alpha Theta executive committee will 

meet at 7 p m. today in the conference 
room of the Animal Science Building 
Those interested in running for office 
will be interviewed. 

1311 University 2222 Broadway 180119th. 
clip this coupon 

for 1/2  price 
pitcher 

ONE PER CUSTOMER-EXPIRES FEB 8 HOME EC BANQUET 
Those interested in helping with the 

Home Economics Spring Banquet will 
meet at 6 30 p.m. Tuesday in El Centro 
Room of the Home Economics Building 

BEST DRESSED COED 
Entry blanks for the Best Dressed 

Coed Contest. sponsored by Women in 
Communications. are available from 
a.M. to 5 p.m in Journalism 103 through 
Monday. 

ALPHA KAPPA PSI 
BRINGS TO TECH A 
NEW CONCEPT IN 

SOCIAL FRATERNITIES 
(business majors only) 

SMOKERS: 
February 3rd and 5th 

7:30 P.M. 
in the 

UNIVERSITY CENTER 
BLUE ROOM 

Coat and Tie 
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Fern swimmers win meet 
By ANGELA SHEPHERD 
UD Sports Writer 

Tech surprised top com-
petitors from Midland College 
here Saturday, amassing 427 
points to easily win the Tech 
Women's Swimming In-
vitational. Midland tallied 283 
points, followed by New 
Mexico State with 264, 
Oklahoma with 200, West 
Texas State with 179 and 
Texas Woman's University 
with 90. 

Tech took first in the 200-
yard Freestyle Relay with 
Janet Calhoun, Cathy Hem-
phill, Leslie Simpson and Pat 
Reeve. Reeve's:30.03 effort in 
the 50-yard Backstroke gave 
Tech its only two first places. 

Midland College, predicted 

by Tech Coach Millie Roberts 
to be toughest competition for 
her undefeated team was 
disqualified for the first event 
of the day. In the 200-yard 
Freestyle Relay, Midland had 
a discrepancy between the 
entry and the person actually 
swimming a leg of the event. 

After that first event, Tech 
held third place behind both 
Oklahoma and New Mexico 
State. In the 200-yard 
Freestyle, the second event, 
Mary Frimpter took third, 
Debbie Main had fourth, and 
Ann Ditch managed fifth for a 
total of 33 points, putting the 
Raiders ahead. 

Next competition for the 
swimmers is Saturday at the 
University of Arizona in 
Tucson. 
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FARMER'S EXCHANGE INC. 
SPORTING GOODS 

1914 AVE. G 	 747-2964 

Punch in 
for a free meal 

at Burger King. 
Come in for your double punch card. 

Every double beef sandwich you buy gets two punches. 
Every other sandwich you buy gets one punch. 

10 punches get you a free meal. 
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Buy one double beef hamburger or cheeseburger, I  
• get another one like it. Free with coupon. 

Have it 
ME 

C'mon. Start punching in 
for your free meal—a double 
beef cheeseburger, regular 

• order of fries, and a regular 
• soft drink. Do it in double time 

1 	555; with our double beef 
	 sandwiches. Buy any sand-
wich and you get one punch. But 
when you buy any double 
beef sandwich, you'll get a 

double punch. 
So, hurry in to Burger King. Don't miss this 

/ bargain. Just 10 punches and we'll serve you 
a free meal. On the double. Bring in 
this coupon for a double beef bargain. 
Plus a double punch. 

Please present this coupon before ordering. Limit one 
, per customer Void where prohibited by law. 

:-.:',.'•.:-..--':,1  This offer expires 
E xpires 2-5-76 

Good At 313 UNIV 
5112 SLIDE RD. 
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GIRLS BASKETBALL 	 • 
Alpha Ph, 30, ZTA 13 	 • 

Bullock's steal 
good enough 
to skin a Coug 
By JEFF KLOTZMAN 
UD Sports Editor 

Someone forgot to tell Rick Bullock that 6-foot-9 post men 
aren't suppose to make steals. That's a guard's play. 

Luckily for Tech, Bullock must have thought he was a 
guard the way he put pressure defense on Houston forward Al 
Winder, tipped away a pass, and drove the length of the court 
with Cougar George Walker hot on his heels. Bullock went 
up for the layin and Walker went after Bullock's head. "The 
Bull" missed but Walker didn't. And that little gem of a steal 
sealed the Cougars doom while Tech walked off with a 
pressure - packed 57-54 victory in Hofheinz Pavilion. 

The game was close from the opening tip, with both 
teams jockeying for position and taking brief leads. Houston 
got the biggest lead of the night, 24-16, in the middle of the 
first half, but the Raiders came storming back behind Mike 
Russell and took a 32-30 halftime lead. The second half was 
more of the same; both teams traded buckets and leads. 
Tech's biggest advantage was four, 52-48, but the Cougars' 
bomber, Otis Lee Birdsong, tied it up with a little less than six 
minutes left on the clock. Then the game slowed down to a 
crawl with the "Guy Lewis stall ball" attack. 

HOUSTON TOOK command and put on a ball control act 
which ate up three minutes on the clock and brought eventual 
doom. The ploy was to bring Tech out of it's zone defense, as 
Arkansas had done with glittering success Wednesday. But 
Tech remained steadfast in the zone, cutting off the passing 
lanes and the streaking Otis Lee. 

Bullock put the pressure on Winder at a high post as the 
clock approached the two-minute mark. Winder was puzzled 
and panicked trying to pass off to Walker. The little drop pass 
was easily within Bullock's reach and he was off to the races. 

Bullock was given plenty of chances to think about the 
two-shot foul with both teams calling time. And the mental 
stress almost payed off from the Cougars point of view. 
Bullock missed the first then got the second down for a one-
point lead. Houston was behind and had to have a bucket to 
win. But instead of going to the attack, it was back to the 
stall. The Cougs worked it down to 15 seconds then aimed for 
Birdsong. But the sharp shooter couldn't work any magic and 
Winder got a piece of Bullock on the rebound. "The Bull" 
canned both sides of the one-and-one, watched Otis Lee miss 
again, then came down with the final rebound as the clock 
finished the Cougars off. 

The game was even more thrilling because Tech won 
without the bench direction of Gerald Myers who was 
sidelined in bed back in Lubbock with the flu. Coach George 
Davidson filled in admirably, coaching a superb defensive 
game. 

WHILE TECH WAS clipping the Cougars toenails, 
another nailbiter was taking place 200 miles up the road in 
Fort Worth where TCU was laying the wood to Texas A&M. 
As luck would have it, the Frogs couldn't hold on to a five-
point lead and the Aggies won it at the buzzer on Karl 
Godine's jumper 66-64. 

A&M kept a tight reign on first place with the Raiders a 
half-step behind. Also making a break for the championship 
is hot shooting SMU, another half-step behind the Raiders. 

Baylor, TCU, Arkansas, and Houston are next on list 
while Texas doesn't have to worry about setting up shop in 
the cellar. That distinction belongs to winless Rice. 

Wrestlers take tourney 
By MOLLIE GROOTERS 
UD Sportswriter 

Tech grapplers placed in 
eight of nine events entered to 
win their own invitational 
tourney this weckend. Tech 
accumulated 65 points while 
secondplace New Mexico 
State had 55'2 points. South-
west Texas and North Texas 
State University tied for third 
with 43'2 points each. 

Mark Faris and Scott Rice 
contributed 10 points each to 
Tech's overall totals by taking 
first place in their weight 
divisions. David Hadden got 
seven for Tech with his second 
place finish. Allen Atnip, 
Melvin Robinson, and Dee 
Monroe all finished third in 
their divisions for four points 
each. Phil Albrecht and Joe 
Chappell received two points 
each for their fourth-place 

SPORTS 

High scorers 
Rudy Liggins (34) and Rick Bullock (54) were the only two 
Tech players scoring in double figures Saturday night in the 
Raiders 57-54 victory over Houston. Liggins peppered the net 
for 12 points while "The Bull" put in 17, three of which came 
in the last two minutes of play to give Tech the victory. 
Liggins, shown shooting against SMU, has scored in double 
figures in the last five games while Bullock, shown in a 
rebounding struggle with SMU's Ira Terrell, is third in the 
league in scoring, averaging better than 20 points per outing. 
(Photos by Norm Tindell) 
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(NO LIMIT) 

WITH THIS AD or TECH I.D.'s 	1  
• • •• 	Feb. 4th & 5th 	••• 
I 	Special hours these days only 	• 
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70th & Indiana 	 Phone 799-9223 • 
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Downhill Racer wants you to keep in 
shape for the warm weather ahead with 

our brand New Line of Skate Boards. 
Come by The Chalet for a Test 

Ride on Top Brands such as: 

BONZAI 	
HOBIE 	

ULTRA FLEX 

BAHNE 
	

WEBER 

Introducing 
Schlitz Light 

Beer. 
One third 
fewer calories than 
our regular beer, 
but all the taste 
you'd expect from 
Schlitz. 

0197570S SCHUTZ BREWINGCO 
MitmAuKEE,IMS ANOOTHEROTIES 

finishes. Each wrestler also 
received points for ad-
vancement and pins to make 
Tech's final score 65. 

"I was glad to see them win, 
Anders said. We are still 
hoping to reach our peak at 
the upcoming state cham-
pionships Feb. 27 in San 
Marcos." 

The Wrestlers' next action 
will be this Saturday when 
they take on Texas Christain 
University at Fort Worth after 
the Tech-TCU basketball 
game. 

IM scores 

Alpha Delta Pi 27, Sigma Kappa "B" 3 	50 OFF 	DRY CLEANING 
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