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ARMS AND LEGS AKIMBO . . . Spearman's Tim W oolley [14, white] 
draws more than one foul as Gruver's Ron Green [50, dark] stretches 
out for a block In Tuesday's district game in Spearman.

In games played Tuesday . . .

Spearman boys9 girls beat Gruver
The Spearman Lynx and Lynx­

ettes kept their sights (irmly train­
ed on a post-season playoff berth 
as they swept a pair of games from 
district 1-AA cross-county basket­
ball rivals from Graver Tuesday 
evening in the Spearman varsity 
gym at Spearman junior high.

The lynxettes downed their 
Lady Greyhound counterparts, 50- 
29, while the Lynx took an impres­
sive 70-48 win over the Greyhounds 

The Spearman girls are still 
undefeated in district competition 
with a perfect 9-0 mark while the 
Lynx improved their situation to 
6-3, just one game behind league 
leader Highland Park who is 7-2.

For the season, the Spearman 
boys hold a 17-8 mark overall. The 
Lynxettes are 23-2 for the year,

their only losses to perennial state 
contender Nazareth and the Way- 
land Baptist College jv Queen 
Bees.

Tuesday’ s contest saw the two 
girls' teams feeling out their 
opponents in the first frame as the 
score went to 7-6 in favor of home 
team Spearman.

By halftime, the Lynxettes had 
established both their offensive 
and defensive stance to take a 
6-point lead into the lockers with a 
20-14 count.

Spearman continued their domi­
nation of the court and the boards 
in the third quarter, going out to a 
15-point lead, 38-23.

The Lynxettes defense continued 
strong throughout the remainder of 
the game, limiting the Lady Grey­

hounds to only six fourth-quarter 
points.

The Spearman girls tallied 
another 12 in the final frame to put 
the game on ice with a 50-29 win.

High point for Spearman was 
Krista Kirkland with 20 points, 
followed by Londee Bradley with 
16.

Boys action taw the Lynx and 
Greyhounds hitting almost point 
for point in the opening stanza with 
Spearman taking a slight advant­
age. 12-11, going into the second 
quarter.

Once there, the Lynx began 
exercising control from both the 
floor and the grace line where they 

" proved devastating that evening, 
hitting on 18 of 20 attempts for a 90 
percent effort.

When halftime rolled around, 
Spearman was in control o f the 
tempo of the game with a 12-point 
lead, 32 20.

The Greyhounds came back in 
the opening minutes of the third 
quarter to pull within eight points 
of their Spearman counterparts 
before the Lynx began pulling 
away again with a series of steals 
and unanswered points.

Going into the final quarter, 
Spearman had regained its advan­
tage to control the scoreboard, 
48-35.

They didn't slack up in the final 
period of play as they tacked on 
another 22 points to Gruver's 13 to 
place the final at 70-48.

That win left the Lynx with a firm 
See "BASKETBALL” , p-2
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Delayed one week by Austin agencies . . .

Bid opening date reset by PDRA
Feeling like a fool is nothing new 

to me. I’ ve been married now for 
going on 18 years and, if that isn't 
enough, I have a teenage son. That 
alone qualifies me for almost 
anything.

However, when Gruver's I.W. 
Ayres visited our office the other 
morning with his Hooey Stick, 1 
had cause to re-evaluate that 
assessment. There’ s a difference 
between feeling foolish and feeling 
ignorant.

Neither situation is all that 
enjoyable, and it's a fine line, but 
there is a distinction.

Now, I’ ll have to admit that I had 
never seen a Hooey Stick, and 
there may be other folks around 
who have the same problem.

A Hooey Stick is nothing more 
than a 3 /8  inch dowel rod cut off 
short with a smaller piece nailed 
into the end, much like a propeller.

Near the propeller end are 
several grooved notches. In addi­
tion to this piece is a smaller dowel 
rod -- about 1/4 inch thick -- which 
is used to set up a vibration which, 
in turn, causes the propeller to 
spin.

At least, I.W. made it spin. I 
rubbed and rubbed, then rubbed 
some more. It made a few feeble 
attempts at a 360 degree revolu­
tion, but it never actually got into a 
free wheeling spin.

I.W. took it back and got it 
spinning, something on the order 
of several revolutions per minute.

He handed it back. I failed 
again. Miserably.

I.W. took it back. This time he 
got it to spinning, said the word 
“ Hooey" and it reversed its spin. 
He said “ Hooey" again and it went 
back to the direction of its usual 
spin. Every time he said, “ Hoo­
ey " , it reversed its spin.

He handed it back. I looked at it 
forlornly. I could think of several 
words to say. Those words might 
have turned some heads, but I 
doubted sincerely whether it would 
cause the propeller to reverse its

Registration

deadline nears 
for primary

Texans who wish to cast ballots 
in the March 8 Super Tuesday 
Republican or Democratic pri­
maries have until Monday after­
noon to appear in the Hansford 
county tax assessor-co llector 's  
office to register, reports Helen 
Dry.

The law requires a 30-day min­
imum period between registration 
and acutal voting.

Those who register by mail must 
have their letters postmarked no 
later than Feb. 7, however registra­
tions in person may be taken 
through close of business Monday 
due to the final legal day falling 
on a Sunday.

spin - assuming, of course, that I 
could get it to spin in the first 
place.

I.W. finally relented and shared 
the secret of its operation with 
me. Now I can “ Hooey”  with the 
best of them.

* * * *

The move made necessary by the 
change in UIL enrollment figures 
was greeted hpartily In Gruver, as 
well it should be.

Now, instead of being on the 
bottom end of class AA schools, the 
Gruver sports teams will find 
themselves on the top end of class 
A.

But, talk about mixed blessings .
. . the age-old example being your 
mother-in-law driving off the edge 
of a cliff in your brand new car . . . 
well, Gruver coaches are eyeing 
that now.

After all, district 1-A is not 
exactly a m ilquetoast affair. 
There’ s defending state class A 
gridiron champions, Wheeler in it, 
for one.

Nor is Booker a slouch and, of 
course, White Deer made the move 
with Gruver and the Bucks are 
always strong opponents.

Still, the nice thing about it -- as 
far as football goes, anyway -- is 
that size will be up against size.

I know if my son were playing 
football for Gruver, I would wince 
every time his 135-pound frame 
went up against a 200-pounder. 
And class AA has a lot of those. At 
least district 1-AA did in 1987 and, 
it would appear, will have again in 
1988.

With only three regular season 
games left on the 1987-88 district 
basketball schedule, the Spearman 
Lynxettes and Lynx are in the 
driver's seat for post-season play­
off berths.

The Lynxettes stand in line to 
take the district 1-AA girls crown 
outright as they own an unblem­
ished conference record of 9-0.

The Lynx, meanwhile, are 6-3 
and one game behind 1-AA leader 
Highland Park at 7-2. They are 
being chased hard by the Stratford 
Elks who boast a 6-4 district mark.

Neither of the district crowns 
have been clinched in either boys 
or girls standings although it 
appears unlikely that either leader 
will be dethroned before the sea­
son's end a week from Friday.

The Spearman boys will have to 
face the Bucks in White Deer, their 
only district loss other than to 
league leader Highland Park. A 
loss here could spell trouble for any 
hopes of post season play.

Meanwhile, the future is begin-

A delay by the two state boards 
which oversee construction of wat­
er plans in Texas has forced the 
Palo Duro River Authority to set 
back a proposed March 9 bid

H onor society 
to induct 19  
new members

A total of 19 new members will 
be inducted into the Enda Hart­
man chapter of the National Honor 
Society at Spearman high school, it 
was announced this week.

The new inductees include nine 
sophomores, three juniors and 
seven seniors. The induction 
ceremony will be held March 15 at 
10 a.m. in the high school audi­
torium.

New senior members include 
Sara Blackburn, Tina Breeden, 
Lisa Cazarez, Matt Jones, David 
McGuire, Carol Poole and Kath­
leen Sangalang.

Junior inductees will be Krista 
Kirkland -- a transfer student from 
Sudan -- James Tindell and Olivia 
Mendoza.

The sophomore pledges are 
Michelle Cook, Laura Dyess, Nora 
Garcia, Darryl Hawkins, Bonnie 
Jarvis, Laci Lasater, Cacy McGill, 
Mitzi Pearson and Chris Volden.

President o f the Spearman 
chapter is senior Kevin Nelson, 
vice-president is senior Norman 
Scroggs and secretary-treasurer is 
junior Jan Crawford.

ning to appear dim for other 
district opponents as the season 
quickly comes to its conclusion.

A few teams still have hopes of a 
district playoff berth but find 
themselves in a position where 
they will have to wait for another 
team to knock off the front runners 
for them.

The league standings through 
Tuesday's contests follow.

GIRLS
Spearman 9-0
Panhandle 9-1
Stratford 7-3
Gruver 4-5
Highland Park 3-7
West Texas 1-8
White Deer 0 9

BOYS
Highland Park 8-2
Spearman 6-3
Stratford 6 4
Gruver 5
Gruver 5 4
White Deer 4-5
West Texas 3 6
Panhandle 1-9

opening date by one week, reports 
PDRA general manager Johnnie 
Lee.

The Texas Water Development 
Board and the Texas Water Com­
mission finally reviewed and ap­
proved the PDRA plans and speci­
fications in meetings held late last 
week in Austin.

Lee attended the meetings and 
was on hand to answer questions 
for the two state agencies.

The dam project in Hansford 
County is the first water plan 
submitted to the two Texas agen­
cies since voters approved the 
issuance of bonds for water plans 
in constitutional balloting in 1985.

As such, the PDRA project has 
become a test case of sorts for the 
two agencies, notes Lee.

“ I have been very encouraged 
from the conversations we've had 
in Austin," he says. “ They have 
been complimentary of the pro­
gress we’ re making here."

The Palo Duro River Authority 
was created by the Texas Legisla­
ture in 1973 with the board 
organized in Hansford County in 
March, 1974.

In 1976, the federal government 
-- through the Corps of Engineers 
-- began a feasibility study on the 
project, a study which was com­
pleted in 1982.

The Diamond Shamrock plant in 
M oore County was the first 
entity to become a part of the

PDRA outside of Hansford County 
when three voters within that one- 
square mile block came to Spear­
man to request inclusion in 1977.

Then, in early 1985, all of Moore 
County and the city of Stinnett held 
elections for the PDRA. The vote 
in Moore County carried by a 5 to 1 
margin, while in Stinnett, voters 
approved the issue by a 17 to 1 
margin.

The only negative aspect to date 
came in the fall of 1985 when 
Ochiltree County voters turned 
down the issue there.

Elementary 
TEAMS exam 
scheduled

Spearman third, fifth and sev­
enth grade students will take the 
Texas Assessment of Minimum 
Skills tests in February -- testing 
now required by state law.

The tests consist of mathematics 
reading and writing skills with 
students' performance regarded in 
terms of mastery or non-mastery.

Third grade students will take 
the TEAMS exam Feb. 9-10-11 
while grades five and seven will 
take the test Feb. 15-16-17.

“ The lake project has been 
talked about for a good while," 
observes the PDRA manager. "In  
an Aug. 5, 1935 report in The 
Spearman Reporter, a group from 
the Spearman Lions Club met with 
county commissioners to discuss a 
similar project."

That project never materialized, 
however. But it did help begin 
conversations which led to the 
eventual establishment of the Palo 
Duro River Authority, he notes.

The PDRA board will meet next 
week to finalize their plans on the 
construction start of the dam itself. 
That meeting will be held next 
Tuesday in the PDRA board room.

One tract of land has already 
been purchased -- that for the 
spillway area. A decision on the 
remaining land for the dam itself 
will be announced at next Tues­
day's meeting.

January is 
month of 
contrasts
January was a month of con­

trasts -  at least in the weather 
where temperatures went from 
below zero at the first of the month 
to balmy, spring-like 60's and 70's 
near month’ s end.

Winter’ s grasp held Hansford 
County firmly from Jan. 4 through 
Jan. 9 when the days' highs never 
got above the freezing mark.

A -6 degrees Jan. 7 was the 
lowest recorded for the month and 
the high that day reached only 14 
degrees.

A total of 8-'/i inches of snow fell 
during the month to account for .72 
inch of moisture so far in 1988.

Then, as if to atone for those 
colder days, near month’ s end a 
week of spring-like temperatures 
set in with highs in the 60’ s and 
70's while lows ranged from 25 on 
up to 42 degrees.

The highest temperature came 
last Friday when Hansford County 
reached 74 degrees according to 
information supplied by KRDF-FM 
in Spearman, the county’ s official 
weather reporting station.

The low of 42 recorded Saturday 
morning was the warmest night 
time temperature for January.

Monday’ s artic cold front saw 
temperatures plummet once again 
as winter came back to the county.

The low Monday at 5:30 a.m. 
was 24 degrees. As the cold front 
came through, however, tempera­
tures dipped and the high that day 
at noon was 20 degrees.

Mist and fog froze on city streets 
and county highways, leaving an 
icy glaze. No accidents were 
reported by either the police de­
partment or the sheriffs office, 
however.

THOSE OUT-OF-FOCUS BLURS in this picture are new telephone 
fiber-optics which can carry some 8,000 calls concurrently. The object 
which appears to be. a nail is actually a straight pin and both a n  set up 
against the edge of a common ruler.

Lynx, Lynxettes strong 
fo r  post season berths

i
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1 9 8 8 -8 9  kindergarten  
registration up to 71

continued from p-1

BASKETBALL

Pro registration ranks of child­
ren who will start kindergarten this 
fall has grown to 71, up from 48 
just a few weeks ago.

Children who will be 5-years old 
by Sept. 1 can pre-register for 
kindergarten and thus be eligible 
to participate in a special spring 
round up held annually at the 
Spearman elementary school.

The round up is used to help 
new kindergarten students famil­
iarize themselves with the school 
campus and teachers.

A list of new students who have 
already pre registered follows. If a

You Are Invited 
to a

Baby Shower 
honoring

Teagan Leslie Ross 
daughter of 

jerry & Lori Ross
Mon. Feb. 8 

from 1:30 - 3 p.m.
at 71 5 Cotter Dr. 

Come and go shower 
Given by hostesses

child who is eligible is not included 
in this list, parents may pick up a 
special pre-registration form at the 
elementary school business office.

New kindergarten students for 
the 1988-89 school year include 
Amaand Adams, Christina Alvara­
do, Jackie Baker, Ashleii Barrera, 
Kelcee Beezley, Julie Bravo;

Jordon Brockman, Joseph Burch 
Travis Burgess, Timothy Bynum, 
Cary Cates, Brandon Clyburn, 
Andrew Cummings;

Micah Edwards, Maranda Fight, 
Bethanie Flores, Jared Freeman, 
Heather Garcia, Sarah Goodson, 
Jessica Guzman;

Jamie Hansen, Jacob Harbour, 
Ashley Healey, Adam Holmes, 
Clinton Jones, Dibrell Kirk, Angela 
Laird, Michelle Laughlin;

Erin Lozano, Jared Lozano, 
Danica Mahanay, Robyn McClure, 
Wayne McCubbin;

Kyle M cLaughlin, Delfina 
Medellin, Heath Mireles, Lindsay 
Mitchell, Robert Morris, Homero 
Munoz, Brandi Nava;

Chelsea Nollner, David Oakley, 
Raquel Perea, Kara Pipkin, Sally 
Pittman, David Rodriguez;

Richardo Salazar, Jennifer 
Schnell, Tashiana Schumann, 
David Sharp. Elizabeth Sharp, 
Ricky Sharp, Alexis Smith;

Dedra Stevens, Amanda

grasp on the second place position 
in district 1-AA, just one game off 
Highland Park who stands at 8-2.

Kevin Nelson turned in a strong 
performance with 22 points to lead 
the Lynx in the Gruver game.

Also in double figures for Spear­
man was Carl Urban with 14 and 
Brett Davis with 13.

In non-conference action last 
Friday evening, the Spearman boys 
downed Miami in a 70-49 game 
while the Lynxettes bowed out to 
Wayland Baptist C o lleg e 's  jv 
Queen Bees, 48-40.

High point for the Lynxettes in 
that game was Kirkland with 18. 
Pacing the Lynx was Tim Woolley 
with 17 points and Shawn Cook 
with 14.

Thompson, Clayton Vanderburg, 
Sergio Vargas, Richard Varnon, 
Eduardo Vasquez, Tony

Chelsey Villines, Dusty Vinson, 
Sheri Wagner, Desiree Wattier, 
Adriane Watts;

Ty West, Jennifer Whitefield, 
Devin Wolfe, Brady Woolley.

THE SPEARMAN REPORTER
Junior varsity action Tuesday 

evening saw both the Spearman 
boys and girls take slim wins over 
their Graver rivals.

The Lynx jv took a 33-28 win 
while the Lynxettes eked out a 
32-28 win in the Spearman gym.

Gerald Blan led the Lynx jv with 
10 points and Kyla Nelson paced 
the Lynxette jv squad with 12 
points.

The two Spearman varsity and 
junior varsity teams will be in 
White Deer this Friday for another 
series of district 1-AA contests.

VARSITY GIRLS
Gruver:
Spearman:

6 14 23 29
7 20 38 50

G - Cindy Barkley, 0-0-2 2; Krista 
Stedje, 6-0-0-12; Cissy Smith, 2-0- 
8-12; Raquel Mathews. 1-0-1-3; 
Team, 9-1-11-29.
S -- Vonda Benson, 0-0-2-2; Krista 
Kirkland, 8-0 4-20; Heather 
Murrell, 0-0-2-2; Lisa Cazarez, 
2-0-0-4; Ginger Pearson, 0-0-1 -1; 
Londee Bradley, 8-0-0-16; Jennifer 
Turner, 2-0-15; Team, 20-0-10-50.

Wayland:
Spearman:

14 22 34 48 
8 1831 40

A clothing store in Georgia has 
run an ad in the same place in its 
local newspaper since 1889

W -- Jill Rees, 0-0-1 -1; Kendra
Reeves, 3 0-2-2; Gwen Wilson. 
5-0-5-15; Marion Sanchez, 2-0-0-4; 
Steph Morris, 1-0-0-2; Ann Potts, 
4-0-0-8; DD Stegnic, 4-0-0-8; Team 
19-0 10 48.

S -- Benson, 10-0-2; Kirkland, 
4-2-4-18; Laci Lasater, 1-0-0-2 
Murrell, 10-0-2; Cazarez, 1-0 0-2 
Pearson, 3 0-0 6; Bradley 3-0-2-8 
Team, 14-2-6 40.

Fuller’s Jewelers
221 Sanders

lOpt. $108. $64.  j
2 7  p t $200. $ 1 2 0  [

33pt. $245. $147 .  [

37 pt $445. $2 67 .  |
45pt. $645. $387 .

51 pi. $799. $4 79 .  [
60pt. $1 ,025. $615 .  t

I 86pt, $890. $534 .  j
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VARSITY BOYS
Gruver: 11 20 35 48
Spearman; 12 32 48 70
G -- Tim Fletcher, 0-2-2-8; Troy 
Seagler, 3-0-2-8; Brian Hoel, 10-0- 
2-22; Gannon Harris, 1 -0-2-4; 
Theron Park, 1-0-2-4; Ron Green. 
1-0 0-2; Team, 16-2-10 48.

S -  Brett Davis, 4-0-5-13; Carl 
Urban, 5-0-4-14; Kevin Nelson, 
8-0-6-22; Keith Benson, 1-0-0-2; 
Tim Woolley, 3-0-1 -7; Pat Shields, 
3 0-6-22; Matt Tucker, 1-0-0-2; 
Shawn Cook, 1 0 -0 -2 ; Carson 
Wonble, 0 0 2 2; Team, 26 0-18-70

Miami: 7 26 43 49
Spearman: 9 28 46 70
S - Davis, 3 0-2-8; Urban, 3-0-0-6 
Nelson, 4-0-0-8; Benson 1-0-0-2 
Woolley, 8-0-1-17; Tucker, 1-0-4 6 
Cook, 6 0-2-14; Womble, 2 0-2-6; J

Garnett, 0-0-1-1; Team, 28 0-12-70.
JUNIOR VARSITY GIRLS 

Gruver: 3 7 18 28
Spearman: 0 2 16 32
G -  Kelli McCloy, 9; Brooke 
Roberts, 7; Winger, 7; Jennifer 
Terry, 1; Hiller, 4.
S -  Michelle Cook, 1; Bonnie 
Thompson, 4; Brandi Schneider, 2; 
Kyla Nelson, 12; Marci Womble, 3; 
Cindy Melton, 4; Cam Butts, 6.

JUNIOR VARSITY BOYS 
Gruver: 4 8 14 28
Spearman: 6 16 22 33
G -- Slavin Sparks, 2; Justin 
Armes, 15; Irwin, 2; Shapley, 2; 
Stefan Dorman, 2; Henry Zapata, 
4.
S -  Heskell Garrett, 8; Mark 
Garcia, 6; Slaid Jones, 4; Billy
Clubb, 3; Kile Coombs, 2; Gerald 
Blan, 10.

We're Loaded With 
CA$H!!

We'll Give You High Cash Prices 

for Scrap Metals.

SCopper Scrap (Red Brass
(Radiators (Aluminum

ALSO WE BUY
(Insulated Wire (Yellow Brass

(Junk Batteries 
(Sheet Copper (Stainless Steel

ALL PAYING HIGH PRICES 
ALUMINUM SCRAP . . .

(Limited Time on Price)

DAN'S BODY SHOP
1100 W. 7th 659-2531

ALUMINUM
CANS

30c lb.

___659 -5005
earman

Weatherproofing 
for your checkbook

lnsuia,e your checkbook from the ups 
and downs of seasonal electric bills with Texas- 
New Mexico Power Company's Budget Billing

-  regardless of the weather. h ^

Visit our office today to see 
If you re one of the preferred customer* 
who qualifies for the Budget Billing Plan.

NewMexico
unmnnt c w

iaffi
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Channel Station
m ESPN
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f4|4 KAMR
HI TMC
Pl» KVII
HI CBN
HH WON
|t0) 10 KFOA
|11]17 TBS
l« l CNN
IU] TBN

SHOW

THURSDAY  
February 4

EVENING
6 00 [2] College Basketball Oklahoma Stata 

at Nebraska (LI

i : .........  .....................■
Cheer* Save the Last Dance for

at h

i
[i2 :

Nightly Business Report 
I [7)7 [10110 News 

nmgton Steel

Nightly
„  7r  ■ a Remington Steele Stng of Steele

Moneyline 
13] Jerry Barnard

[8] 700 Club 
[1011

9:00

EVENING

6:00

6:30
Lou Phlft
2 Speedweek
3 Oklahoma News
4 4 M*A*S*H
7 7 Wheel ol Fortune p  
9 9 Barney Miller Woio s Girl, Part 2 
10110 Love Connection 
12] Croasllre

K*

T h a t ' s  E n t e r t a I n m e n t RMMRMMMWMMMWWMMVWWMMI

A  Fu ll WEEk o f PRoqRAiviiviiNq
[7] 7 The Thorn* Callers hear Mrs Thorn 
went to funeral for Mr Thorn, not with him.

S i 700 Club
MO] 10 Dallas Vowing revenge on J R . 
Bobby plots his own quest to regain 
Ewing Oil □
[12] Larry King Live!
[11] Fred Price

6:30 [7] 7 Sledge Hammer! Sledge and Don
get the champagne giggles while posing 
as newlyweds p

6:45 [SHOW] Comedy Club Network (1987) A 
unique, short form showcase spotlighting 
new comedians NR 015 

9 00 [3] MOVIE: C itiien Kane (1941) A brilliant 
look at the rise and (all ol a greedy 
newspaper publisher Orson Welles. 
Joseph Cotten NR 1 59 
[4] 4 Unsolved Mysteries Cases o l Kurt 
McFall, Charles Scheel. Mike Martin, 
Melissa Munday
[7] 7 20/20 □
[8] Straight Talk
[10] 10 Falcon Crest Maggie and Richard 
try again; Curtis goes alter dirt on Richardtry t 

M2; Evening New*
thi

6 05 [11] 17 Andy Griffith The Rumor 
6:30 [31 Oklahoma News

[4] 4 M*A*S*H
[5] MOVIE: Rumplestiltskin (1987) A 
simple miller s daughter dreams of 
marrying a prince Amy Irving G 1 24
71 7 Wheel of Fortune □
91 9 Barney Miller WojO s Girl, Part 1 
10] 10 Love Connection 
12] Crossfire

6:35 M l] 17 Sanford and Son The Copper 
Caper

7:00 [3] This Old House Tiling begins in the 
master bathroom; living room is sponge

ftainted □
4) 4 The Cosby Show Vanessa prepares 

an impressive audition for the band major 
position □
[7] 7 MOVIE: ABC Thursday Night Movie 
FirefOM (1982) A retired pilot is hired to 
hijack a top secret Soviet warplane Clint 
Eastwood, John Dvkstra □

[8] Hell Town My Girlfriend Anne 
9] 9 MOVIE: The Bride (1976) A girl 
comes back to haunt her unfaithful 
newlywed husband Robin Strasser. John 

Beal PG 1 25
[10] 10 Lyndon Larouche Political 
broadcast □

112] PrimeNews 
13] TBN Today

SHOW] MOVIE: Friday the 13th, Part IV: 
he Final Chapter (1984) Jason, the 

murdering menace of Crystal Lake, is 
back Kimberly Beck, Crispin Glover R 
1:31

7:05 [11] 17 MOVIE Bataan (1943) Story of 
American evacuation of troops on Bataan 
and their heroism Robert Taylor, George 
Murphy NR. 1 54

7:30 [3] Wild America (1987) Sibling rivalries in 
the animal kingdom are frequent and may 
be fatal Q
[4] 4 A Different World Denise campaigns 
to get street-smart, genius study partner 
enrolled.
[10] 10 Bugs Bunny's Valentine (1979) 
Bugs pits his skills as a matchmaker with 
Cupid s p  
[13] Oale Evans

[3] Mystery!
[4 ] 4 Cheers Evan Drake s 
becomes the setting for j 
quadrangle
m  MOVIE: Psycho III (1986) Norman 

Bates is fine, until mother begins to 
reassert herself Anthony Perkins. Diana 

Scarwid R. 1:36 p

[13] Praise the Lord Live 
[SHOW] It's Garry Shandling'* Show
Crazy comic deals with life's daily 
problems. Garry Shandling NR. 0:30 p  

9:05 [11] 17 Black History Special Black 
Achievers

9:30 [81 Last Frontier Of Artificial Reefs 
[9] 9 News
[SHOW] Brothers Two macho types 
attempt to deal with their brother $ 
homosexuality. Robert Walden, Brandon 
Maggart NR 0 30 p

SATURDAY 
February 6

A F T E R N O O N

12:00 [31 Oklahoma Gardening
[4] 4 Wild Kingdom
[5] MOVIE: The Last of Sheila (1973) Man 
invites friends on his yacht to find who 
caused his wife s death. Richard Ben­
jamin, James Coburn. PG. 2.00

l§] i
Kerr

[81 Iron Horse Six Hours to Sky High
[9] 9 MOVIE: The Muppet Movie (1979) 
Kermit the Frog leaves his home for 
dream city, Hollywood Kermit the Frog, 
Miss Piggy G 1 34
[10] 10 Lifestyles of the Rich and 
Famous
[12] Newsday
[13] Inside Track 

12:30 [31 Kovels on Collecting
[4] 4 Crook and Chase (1986) Daily 
magazine with informative interviews and 
entertainment. 0 30 
71 7 Wheel of Fortune p
12] Newsmaker Saturday
13] Maker's Match

1:00 [2] College Basketball N Carolina State 
“ iuke (LI 
1 Living \

[4 j 4 College Basketball Arkansas at 
Texas
[71 7 Road to the Superbowl 
[8] Alias Smith and Jones Fifth Victim
[10] 10 College Basketball Regional 
Broadcast (L)
[11] 17 NBA All-Star Saturday Live from 
Chicago (L)
12] Ne*

at Duke (L)
[3] Living With Animals

I
121 News Update 
13] Dale Evans
SHOW] Stevie Nicks: Rock a Little
loger Daltrey agc[ £leetwood Mac join 

. Stevie in a high energy special NR 
1:00

yacht
love

] 10 Simon and Simon Self-appointed 
death squads have been murdering 
Salvadoran refugees 
[121 Larry King Live!
[13] Dwight Thompson 

8:30 f4] 4 Late Night with David Letterman: 
oth Anniversary Look at the past six 
years
[SHOW] MOVIE: Friday the 13th, Pari VI: 
Jason Lives (1986) Ominously, the body 
count around the old Crystal Lake begins 
again Thom Matthews Jennifer Cooke 
R 1:27 p

I Lou Grant 
Straight Talk 
9 News

] 10 Knots Landing Abby confronts 
thanes wife; Rourke s escapade leads 

to murder p  
[12] Evening News 
[ 13] Praise the Lord Live 

9:05 [11] 17 MOVIE: Flyina Leathernecks 
(1951) A strict officer and his men become 
friends in the crucible of war. John Wayne, 
Robert Ryan. NR. 1:42 

9:30 [8] Great American Outdoors 0:30

FRIDAY  
February 5

1:10 [12] Healthweek
1:30 [31 Newton s Apple Examine the deadly 

effects of hypothermia; why boys voices 
change 0:30 p  
[121 Style with Elsa Kiensch 
[ 13j Don Spradling

2:00 [3] Wonderworks English family strug­
gles to make a living in Australian mining 
town □
[5] MOVIE: Thunder Run A retired trucker
and his grandson drive plutonium across 
the desert Forrest Tucker. Chris She­
pherd PG13 1 24
[7] 7 Pro Bowlers Tour From Venice, FL
(L)
[8] Big Valley Midas Man
[9] 9 MOVIE: The Enemy Below (1957) 
Men and machines duel in a submarine 
battle during WWII Robert Mitchum, Curt 
Jurgens. Nh 1:38
[12] Your Money
[13] Deaf World
[SHOW] MOVIE: Kojak: The Belarus File
(1985) Kojak investigates Nazi spies in 
New York Telly Savalas, Suzanne Ple- 
shette NR

2:30 [12] Foreign Correspondents 
[13] Ray Bn

3:00
ubaker

'88 Truck & Tractor Pull
hampionships From Anaheim, CA (T) 

[3] Nova Scientists try to find why 
members of Franklin expedition were lost.

£

atDePaul
irgia Tecfi (L)

81 Laredo A Medal for Reese
10] 10 National Pebble Beach Pro Am

<L)

SportaCenter (L)
Nightly Business Report 
4 T7J 7 [10] 10 News 
MOVIE: Howard the Duck (1986) An 

alien duck finds himself tossed across the 
universe to Cleveland Lea Thompson. 
Jeffrey Jones PG 1:51 P  
[8] Remington Steele Steele in 
Circulation
[91 9 Cheers Fear is My Co Pilot 
[12] Moneyline

6:05 [11] 17 Andy Griffith Barney and Thelma 
lo

[4] 4 College Basketball
Georgia Tech (L

E
(121 News Update 
[13] Trumpets in the Morning 

3:10(12] Sports Closeup 
3:30(5] MOVIE: Ths Gambler (1974) A hip 

young college professor has an insatiable 
desire to gamble. James Caan, Paul 
Sorvino R 1:51
71 7 ABC Wide World of Sports
12] Big Story
13] TBN Today

4:00 [2] Racing Across America '67 Eclipse 
, (wards
3] Nature (1986) Examine how unusual 
South American animals live m Pantanal

1 Wagon Train Kilty Pryor Story 
] 9 Puttin' on the Hits

11] 17 Fit
12] News13] ^hy 1

6:35 (11] 17 Sanford and Son A Matter of Life 
and Breath

7:00(2] All-American Pulling Series From 
Louisville. KY (T)
3] D C. Week Rvw. Q
4] 4 Main Event Special Hulk Hogan vs 
ndre the Giant (L)

When Joey *  comedy act

4:30

r aAnc
(7] 7 Full House V
bombs, he seeks a more serious 
occupation p
8] Paper Chase Birthday Party 
f ]  9 MOVIE: Bronco Billy (1980) A shoe

salesman becomes the owner of a run 
down wild west show Clint Eastwood. 
Sondra Locks PG 1:59 
(10) 10 Beauty end the Beast Catherine 
and Vincent mark the anniversary of their 
firal meetingrflllHInSWI
13 TBN Today
SHOW] MOVIE: Clue (1985) Characters 
rom the popular board game Imd murder 
and mischief Tim Curry. Madeline Kahn 
PG. 1:37 Q

7:05 [11] 17 MOVIE: The Mummy (1959) Three 
archaeologists search lor a tomb of an 
Egyptian princess Peter Cuehlng. Chris­
topher Lee. NR. 1:28

7:90 [2^ NFL's Greatest Performances of

3] Well Street Weak 0 30
are George plans t  

surprise 20th anniversary holiday trip for

Fishing with Roland Martin 
Newswatch 

Wait?
SHOW] MOVIE: The Longshot (1986) 
:our unlucky guys borrow money from the 
mob to invest in a racehorse Tim 
Conway. Harvey Korman. PG13 1:29 
9] 9 T and T
11117 Fishln' with Orlando Wilaon
12] Nswamaker Saturday
13] Christian Lifestyle Magazine

5:00 (2] U S. Skiing Nationals 70M and 90M
Jumping (T)
(3) Wild America 11987) Sibling rivalries in 
the animal kingdom are Irequenl and may 
be fatal Q  
4] 4 News
7] 7 ABC World Newt Saturday p  
9] 9 Buttin' Loose 

Barney Miller
World Cleat Championship 

restling
[12] Nswswatch
[13] 100 Huntley Street 

SporteCenter (L)5:30 [2 
(3 
(4 
[8

Capitol Press Report 
4 NBC INews
Short Film Showcase Hollywood s 

egendary actors and actresses ara 
showcased NR 0:30 
717 News
8] Monroes Ride with Terror 
t ]  9 Charlee in Charge 
10] 10 CBS Newt 
12] Pinnacle
SHOW] MOVIE: Detective School 
Iropoute Two bumbting sleuths get 

involved with the Main in Rome David 
Landsberg. Lorln Dreytuss PG 1 30 Q

Marsha. p  
[13] Diane b itn 

8:00 J2J Top Rank Boning From Atlantic Chy.

[31 World at War Stalingrad 
[4] 4 Miami Vica A cowboy reports the 
lhatl of nrtptacaabte butt semen 
[6] MOVIE: Mack Widow (1986) Federal 
agant hunts a woman she suspects of 
hurrying and murdering. Debra Winger. 
------------------- 8. R. 1:43

6:00 [2] Cottage Basketball Auburn at Florida

[3] Oegrasti Junior High Themes: Dis­
abilities shyness, jealousy and peer
relationships Q
[4^4 Star fr*k :T h *  Nest Generation

[8] MOVIE: Crimes of the Heart (1988) 
The McGrath sitters deal with life’s

7] 7 He
9] 9 It's
10]  10 I

problems in a peculiar way Diane Keaton. 
Jessica Lange PG13. t 45
----- Has Hew

a a Living 
Star Search 1 00

12] Crossfire
13] Benny Hinn 

6:30 3] Outdoor Oklahoma
8] Campbells Peter Was a Saint 
919 Mama's Family 
12] Sports Saturday

7:00 [3] Lawrence Walk A Salute to George 
Sershwin

[4] 4 Facta of Lite Natalie and Snake take 
a big step (Parental supervision advised.)

(?) 7 Dolly Q
[8] MOVIE: Whoopeejl 930) This classic 
film is I, based on the Broadway musical. 
Eddie Cantor. Eleanor Hunt. NR 1 33
[9] 9 MOVIE: The Beastmaater (1982) A 
young man in feudal times uses super­
natural powers lor revenge Marc Singer. 
Tanya Roberts PG. 1 58
[10] 10 High Mountain Rangers Jesse 
and an in|ured runner are marooned in a 
wilderness snowstorm
[12] PrimeNewa 
113] Phil Arms
[SHOW] MOVIE: Crocodile Dundee
(1986)G day. America1 A bloke from down 
under takes New York by storm. Paul 
Hogan. Linda Kozlowski. PG13 1 38 O 

7:05111] 17 MOVIE: The Rare Breed |1966) 
Cattlewoman introduces new breed of 
cattle to the West James Stewart. 
Maureen O Hara NR 148 

7:30 [4] 4 227 Sandra transforms a shy 
student into a junior version of herself.
[13] Zola Levitt

8: T [2] College Basketball BYU at U.
\L/Birmingnam (L)

[3] An Evening oi Championship Skating
1987 (1988) Top amateur figure skaters 
lake to the ice with dazzling 
performances
[4] 4 Golden Girls Dorothy and Stan 
pretend they are still married when her 
uncle visits Q
[5] MOVIE: The Bedroom Window (1987) 
A man can t prove his innocence without 
revealing his secret affair Steve Gutten- 
berg. Elizabeth McGovern R. 1:53 
[7)7 Ohara Federal officials impede 
Ohara and Shaver *  pursuit of smugglers.

M0] 10 Houston Knights Q 
(12 ShowBiz Week 
[13] Robert Schuller g  

8:30 [4] 4 Amen Rev Gregory is confused 
when a wealthy widow sets her sights on
him g
[12] This Week in Japan 

8:35 [SHOW] Showtime Coast to Coast (19S7) 
Herbie Hancock hosts this series which 
will scour the nation NR. 1:15 

9:00 [3] Austin City Limit* (1988) Reba 
McEntire sings Last One to Know and 
Whoever* in New England 
[4] 4 Super Bloopers and Practical Jokes 
Catch new bloopers from programs such 
as Cheers and The Golden Girls
(7) 7 Spenser: For Hire Spenser, forced 
back into the ring at gunpoint, tights lor his
life g
[8 ] Paper Chase Birthday Party
[10] 10 West 57th CBS News primetime 
magazine John Ferrugia, Meredith 
Vieira.

with his straight life, becomes a thief 
Ryan O Neal, Jacqueline Bisset. PG. 
1:45

1:30 [31 Firing Line NR 
[13] John Hinkle

2:00 [2] Superbcuts All vs Frazier II (R)
[11] 17 MOVIE: National Velvet (1944) A 
little girl trains a horse lor the Grand 
National Elizabeth Taylor. Mickey Roon­
ey NR 2 05
[12] Larry King Weekend (R)
[13] Fred Jordan

2:30 [3] Candidates 88 with Marvin Kalb Kalb
interviews Republican and Democratic 
presidential candidates g 
[5] MOVIE: Clue (1985) Characters from 
the popular board game find murder and 
mischief. Tim Curry. Madeline Kahn PG. 
1 37 □
[13] TBN Today

3:00 [2] NFL's Grestest Moments
llanda Miracle 70 Season (R)
4] 4 Collage Basketball Notre Dame at
Juke (LKJIP)
7] 7 College Basketball Purdue at 
Michigan (L)
8] Gunsmoke The Bad One
9] 9 MOVIE: The Adventures o l Robin 
tood (1938) Robin Hood robs from the 

rich and gives to the poor Errol Flynn, 
Olivia Oe Havilland NR 1 45
[10110 National Pebble Beach Pro Am 
Golf (L)
[12] News Update
[13] In Touch
[SHOW] MOVIE: Except tor Thee and Me
(1975) A righteous Quaker couple help a 
pair ol runaway slaves lind freedom. 
Richard Kiley. Shirley Knight. NR. 1.40 

3:10(12] Science Technology Week 
3:30(2] NFL's Greatest Momenta O J. Simp­

sons Year of 2003 (R)

romp through an Eastern temple Ringo 
Starr. John Lennon G 1 ;32 

7:30 [4] 4 My Two Deda Joey a rock star friend 
accuses him ot being a slutted shirt.
[9] 9 At the Movies 
[13] Charlie Osborn

8:00 [3] Upstairs. Downstairs (1988) Virginias
son goes to boarding school: hergoes
daughter gets a puppy
[4] 4 MOVIE: NBC Sunday Night at the
Movie* Rombo: First Blood. Pori III 1985)
Vietnam vet is released from prison to 
conduct a search for MIA* Sylvester 
Stallone Richard Crenna. R. 1 35 g  

]  MOVIE: Crocodile Dundee (1986) 
day. America' A bloke from down under 

takes New York by storm Paul Hogan. 
Linda Kozlowski PG13. 1 38 g 
7] 7 An ABC Mini-Series CMs end Me. 
'art 1 (1988) Priscilla Beaulieu Presley *  

best-selling book is dramatized Oale 
Midkitl. Susan Walters g  
[6] In Touch
[9] 9 Star Search 1 00
[10] 10 CBS Sunday Movie Windmills ol 
the Gods. Part 1 (1988) A Midwestern 
college professor is appointed Ambas­
sador to Romania Jaclyn Smith, Robert 
Wagner g

17 National Geographic Explorer 
Week in Review 

V. Hill

George
El

8:30

iduur iu 
Vagner 
11117 I
12] We
13] E.V
13] Lloyd Ogilvie
SHOW] MOVIE A Hard Day's Night

our Liverpool boys go to London

13  ̂French Che*
2] Evans and Novak 

4:00121 Ski World (T)
[3] This Old House Marble countertops 
are installed in the new kitchen, wall­
paper s hung g  
81 Empire walk Like a King
12] Newswatch
13] Jerry Savelte

4:30 2] Steve Garvey Celebrity Ski Classic 
■rom Deer Valley. UT (T)
3] Oklahoma Gardening
4] 4 Meet the Press g
5] MOVIE: Still ot the Night (1982) A 
isychiatrist is drawn into a murder 
nvolving one of his patients Roy 
Scheider, Meryl Streep PG. 1 31 
[11] 17 World Class Championship 
Wrestling

.  _Wj 
[1964) Fo
for an engagement Paul McCartney. 
John Lennon G 1 25

9:00 [3] Masterpiece Theatre Harriet and Guy 
are reunited in Athens by Prince Yakimov. 
Kenneth Branagh, Emma Thompson g  
8] Changed Live*
919 News
12] Evening News
13] Kenneth Copeland 

9:30 [8] Rock Alive

MONDAY 
February 8

EVENING

8:00

5:00

12] Newsmaker Sunday
1 3 ]  'Jimmy Swaggart 
3 Tony Brown's Journal 

4 News 
7 ABC World News Sundaly g
Big Valley The Murdered Party 
9 MOVIE: Ei ~  ........ ~: Excalibur (1981) The legen­

dary sword empowers Arthur to assume 
the throne of England Nicol Williamson. 
Nigel Terry PG 2:20 
[10] 10 CBS News 
[12] Newswatch
[SHOW] MOVIE: Enemy Mine (1985) An 
earthling and an alien are stranded 
together on a deadly planet Dennis 
* —■ ' ------------Jr PG13 1 4 8 g

sCenter (L)
ghtly Business Report
[7] 7 [10] 10 News 
JVIE: The Fringe Owellers (1986) 

Young aboriginal woman breaks away 
from Hie in a shantytown. Kristina Nehm. 
NR 1.38
[8] Remington Steel* Steele Waters Run
beep
tl2]Tvfbneynne

6:05 [11] 17 Andy Griffith Back to Nature 
6:3012] College Basketball ConnecticuH vt 

Providence (L)
Oklahoma News 
4 M*A*S*H

6:35

10]
12]

7 Wheel ot Fortune g  
9 Barney Miller Middle Age

Ciuaid, Louis Gossett.
5:30

[12] Evening News
[ 13] r .w . r. Schambach 

9:05 [ I t ]  17 NBA Alt-Star Highlight* 
9:30 [9] 9 News

SUNDAY 
February 7

SportsCenter (L) 
Candid Campus 
4 NBC Newt 
7 News 

1&] 10 Barney Miller 
11117 Leave It To 

blearer
12] Inside Business
13] Fulton Buntsin

Beaver Ensign

12:00

A F T E R N O O N

3 D.C. Week Rvw. g  
4 New Gidget 
7 Newt
Butterfly Island What are Friends

6:00 [2] 19 
(3 La 
[4]4<

[ I t ]  17 MOVIE: Bataan (1943) Story of 
American evacuation ol troops on Bataan 
and their heroism Robert Taylor, George 
Murphy NR 1:54 
[12] Newaday 
|13| John Bertolucci

12:30(3] Well Street Week 0:30 
[4] 4 It'sI! Your Business 
5] MOVIE: Crocodile Dundee (1986) 

day, America! A bloke from down under 
lakes New York by storm Paul Hogan. 
Linda Kozlowski PG13 1:38 g  
717 Texas Country Reporter
8] Campbells Peter Was a Saint
9] 1 Lone Ranger Two for Juan Ringolonger 
111 Money week
13] rI Kenny Foreman

1:00 [2] Billiard* 3rd Annual 9 Ball Champion-
snip (R)
[3] Adam Smith’s Money World 0:30
[4] 4 College Basketball Texas Tech at
Rice
[7] 7 Olympic Preview (L)
[8] MOVIE: The Gatling Gun (1972) 
Indians use the Galling Gun to battle U S. 
troops after the Civil War Guy Stockwell, 
Woody Strode PG 1:33
[919 MOVIE: An Affair to Remember 
(1957) A playboy and a girl fall in love on 
board ship Cary Grant, Deborah Kerr 
1:54
121 Week in Review 
13] Chuck Smith
SHOW] MOVIE: The Thief Who Cam* to 
tinner (19731 A comDuter analyst, bored

EVENING
1987 NFL Films All-Pro Team (T)
Lawrence Welk A Tribute to Bing 

Our House David and J R . *  friend­
ship is threatened by romantic 
competition
[5] MOVIE: Big Trouble in Little China
(19861 A truck driver is swept into the 
mysterious world under Chinatown. Kurt 
Russell. Kim Cattrall PG13. 1 39 g
[7] 7 MOVIE: Disney Sunday Movie Rock 
end Roll Mom, Pert 1 A music-loving 
mother becomes a hot rock sensation 
overnight. Dyan Cannon. Talma 
Hopkins.
[8] Crossbow Re-Birth 
[10] 10 60 Minutes

MOVIE: The Roaring Twenties
Buddies dash in bootlegging 

racket James Cagney, Humphrey 
Bogan NR 1 46 
(121 One on One 
[13] Billy Joe Daugherty 

6:3018] Animals ot Africa Pelicans and 
Paradise Fly Catchers
[12] Sports Sunday
[13] Jack Hayford

7:00 [2] NFL Football AFC/NFC Pro Bowl Irom 
Hawaii (L)
[3] Nature (1986) Follow the experiences 
ol an elusive female leopard lor two days.

{? ]4  Family Tie* With her parents 
support, Jennifer defies the school 
pnncipal
(81 Paper Chase Birthday Party 
[10] 10 Murder, She Wrote Ancient Indian 
curse casts a murderous shadow for 
Jessica g 
[12] PrimeNewa
ISHOW1 MOVIE: Helpl (1965) Beatles

10] 10 Love Connection 
Crossfire

I f ]  17 Sanford and Son We Were
lobbed

7:00 [3] The Brain (1984) Examine the role ol 
instincts and internal rhythms in humans
1:00 g
[4] 4 ALF ALF confronts a burglar in the 
Ochmonek *  house g
[7] 7 An ABC Mini Series Elvis end Me, 
Part 2 (1988) Priscilla Beaulieu Presley s 
best selling book is dramatized Dale 
Midkitt. Susan Walters g
[8] Father Murphy By the Bear that Bit

[»] 9 MOVIE: Sixteen Candles (1984)
Samantha s sixteenth birthday is the
worst day ol her life Molly Ringwald.
Anthony Michael Hall PG 1:33
[10] 10 Kate 8 Allie Allie and Kate are
terrorized by what they think* a ret in the
house g
[12] PrimeNew*
M3] TBN Today
[SHOW] MOVIE: Six Weeks (1982) Two 
strangers come together at a time of

Kirsonal crisis Dudley Moore. Mary Tyler 
oore PG 1:47

7:05 [111 17 MOVIE: The Sugarland Express
(1974) Police official becomes involved in 
the pursuit ol a fugitive couple. Goldie 
Hawn, Ben Johnson PG. 1:49 

7:30 [4] 4 MOVIE: NBC Monday Night at the 
Movie* Moving Torgot 11986) Teen finds 
his home empty, family gone, himself a 

............... n Bateman. Richardtarget of killers Jtson I 
Dysart. g
[10] 10 Frank* Place
[13] I| Marilyn Hickey 

8:00 [3] Horses The Undefeated
[51 MOVIE: The Man Who Cem* to Dinner
(1941) A lecturer is forced to stay in a 
house because of an accident Monty 
Woollev, Bette Davis NR 1:52 
18] 700 Club
[ 10]  10 Newhart Dick is skeptical about a 

l-luck legend, at least lor a while

[12] Larry King Live!
[13] LaVem* Tripp Family

rj r /i r jr j  rj l d  t v  rj u
h

8
5

M i m / 9JL \ \

8:3012] College Basketball Wisconsin at 
Minnesota (L)
[10] 10 Designing Women Suzanne
resorts lo a high flying gamble to settle her
IRS debts
[13] Hal Lindsay

9:00 [3] Talavision The race to invent televi­
sion created intense international

rivalries g
? The *8  Vote: The low* Caucus (L)q 7

[8] SStraight Talk 
9] 9 News110] 10 Wiseguy When Vinnie is shot, 
JcPike and Lococco set out to lind his 

assailant.
[12] Evening Newt 
113] Praia* the Lord Live

s

36.5 NKe

(jANSnSik QOUKiy

Top 40 P0P/R0CK Weekly TOP 10
5
§

[SHOW) Super Dev* (1987) Super Dave 
Osborn* goes off on his own hilarious 
quest. NR 0:30 g

9:20 [11] 17 MOVIE: Bonnie and Clyde (1987) 
The adventures ot two famous outlaws. 
Clyde Barrow and Bonnie Parker Warren 
Beatty. Faye Dunaway PG. 1:51 

9:30 [8] World Bass Show
[SHOW] MOVIE: Tai-Pan (1986) James 
Clavell* best selling saga o l colonial 
Hon^Kong. Bryan Brown. John Stanton

TUESDAY  
February 9

EVENING

J}COUNTDOWN Dedication Hour..,and more^k k

us Fridays following ly n x & 2
w .

Business Report

lynxetta basketball and Saturdays 7  p.m. to midnight - j j

at and Mike (1952) Promoter 
turns an ex phys ed. instructor into the

aueen of sthletics. Spencer Tracy.
atharine Hepburn NR 1 3 5 g  

[81 Remington Steel* Steele Eligi 
(919 Cheers Relief Bartender 
M2] Moneylln*
[13] Or. D. James Kennedy

gible

5
6:05 [11] 17 Andy

Blc “
6:30

THENz CRANK IT UP!!! ^
AND REMEMBER ^

★  B e  S m a rt-D o n ’t  S t a r t !  *  v j& 
★  J u s t  S a y  N o V 

to  D ru g s &  A lc o h o l ^
rj rjti

Griffith Elarney*
Bloodhound
2 NHL All-Star Salute (T)

Oklahoma News 
4 M*A‘ S*H
7 Wheel of Fortune g  

- 9 Barney Miller Counterfeiter 
10110 Love Connection 
12] Croesflr*

6:35 11] 17 Sentord and Son A Pad lor 
.amont

7:00(2] NHL Hockey 40th Annual All-Star 
Game (L)
13] Nova Look at efforts to mak* plan* 
fires less likely and more aurvlvabt*. g  
(4) 4 Matlock Mattock trios to prevent a
mob war Irom breaking out
[7] 7 Who's the Boss? Tony applies to 
college, and Angela tutors him lor me 
entrance exam □
[8] Crossbow Re-Birth
[919 MOVIE: Mask (1965) A severely

disfigured boy overcomes his physx:al 
shortcomings Cher. Sam EHiotl PG13. 
2:00
10] 10 46 Hour*
12] Prime News
13] TBN Today

Showtime Coast to Coast (1987)W] S
•  HaHerbie Hancock hosts this series which 

will scour the nation NR 1:15 
7:08[ I f ]  17 NBA Basketball Jazz at Maver­

icks (L)
7:30 (7) 7 Growing Pains Whan M ika* 

Hawaiian girlfriend will be m L A . he plans

A Destiny Which Made Us
to join her g  
[8] Branded , 
Brothers
(13] Betty Jean Robinson 

8:00(3] Nature of Things Whales us* the
precious store of spermaceti oil to locus 
sound waves
[4] 4 Hunter Hunter trails a hit man to 
Mexico and finds why the CIA is 
interested
[5] MOVIE: Water (1985) War begins lor 
control ot an island after mineral water is 
discovered Michael Cain*. Brenda 
Vaccaro PG13. 1:31
[7] 7 Moonlighting g  
8] 700 Club

[10110 CBS Special Movie Windmills ol 
the Gods. Port 2 (1988) A Midwestern 
college professor is appointed Ambas­
sador to Romania Jaciyn Smith Rntu»* 
Wagner, g  
[121 Larry King Live!
[ l  3] Dan Sheafler 

1:30 [SHOW] MOVIE: Psycho III (1986) 
Norman Bates is tine, until mother begins 
to reassert herselt Anthony Perkins. 
Diana Scarwid. R 1 36 g  

9:0013] Frontline Look inside the mind of Mark 
David Chapman, who shot John Lennon

S ] 4 Crime Story Luca is determined to 
keep Manny alive, even it it means a 
transplant g
17] 7 thirtysomething Michael looks 
forward to dad* visit, until he finds reason 
lot it g
8] Straight Talk
12] Evening Newt
13] Praise the Lord Live

9:20 [ f tr11] 17 MOVIE: They Were Espendable
1945) Story of the PT boats used in

lighting the Japanese m W W.ll. Robert 
Montgomery. John Wayne NR 2:15 

9:30(8] Celebrity Chefs 
[9 ] 9 Newt

WEDNESDAY  
February 10

EVENING

IS

man pinscher 
accused ol murder is finally resolved 
James Garner. Katharine Ross PG
1:37
I] Remington Steele High Flying 
teele

[9] 9 Cheers Proposal 
[ 12] Moneylln*

6:05 [ f  1] 17 Andy Griffith Family Visit 
6:30 [2 Scholastic Sports America 

[3 Oklahoma Newt 
[4 4M*A'S*H 
[7 7 Wheel of Fortune g  
19 9 Barney Miller Open House 
HO] 10 Love Connection 
[ 12] Crossfire

6:35(11] 17 Sanford and Son The Great 
Sanford Seige

7:00(2] College Basketball Syracuse at 
Pittsburgh (L)
[3] People's Business
[4] 4 Highway to Heaven After Jonathan 
loses his wings, he finds mortal love g  
[7] 7 Perfect Strangers When Larry plays, 
he winds up flooding the apartment □
[5] Second I '
* ]»  Hogan's Heroes Hogan and the

Lady Doctor
10] 10 The Law and Harry McGraw
12] PrimeNews
13] TBN Today
SHOW] Brothers Two macho types 

attempl to deal with their brother* 
homosexuality Robert Walden. Brandon 
Maggart NR. 0:30 g  

7:05 [11] 17 MOVIE: Walking TaN. Part 2 
(1975) Upright sheriff continues to fight 
the heads ol organized crime Bo Sven- 
son. Richard Jaackel. PG. 1:49 

7:30 [7] 7 Head ol the Class Darien* pretends 
to like Alan to soothe his bruised, fragile

[?] Animals of Africa
[9] 9 College Basketball DePaul vs
Bradley (L)

EJino Show
W] It'S Garry Shandling* Show 
y comic deals with life *  daily 

problems. Garry Shandling. NR 0:30 g  
8:00 [3] MOVIE: Lust lor Ufa (1958) Biogra­

phical drama based on artist Vincent Van 
Gogh* tormented life Kirk Douglas. 
Anthony Quinn. NR 2:02 
[4] 4 A Year in the Life JoeS exhausted 
and disoriented, but he won't reveal the 
cause.
[S] MOVIE: Thunder Run A retired trucker 
and his grandson drive plutonium across 
Ihe desert Forrest Tucker, Chris She­
pherd PGt3. 1:24
[7] 7 Hooperman Hooperman rekindles 
an old llama, then busts her lor 
prostitution, g  
(61 700 Club
[to ] 10 Magnum. R.l. Magnum searches 
lor a priceless ancient scroti at Higgins 
request.
[12] Larry King Ltvel 
[131 Kenneth Hagin
[SHOW] MOVIE: Aliens (1986) After 57 
years asleep. Ripley again encounters 
extraterrestrials Sigourney Weaver. Mi­
chael Biehn R. 2:17 g  

6:30 [7] 7 Slap Maxwell Story Slap struggles 
with the prospect of visiting his ailing 
lather g  
[13] Doug Clark

9:00 [2] College Basketball Tennessee at
Vanderbilt (L)
[4] 4 St. Eleevrtiere Elderly man brings in 
his childhood sleeping beauty to be 
awakened p
[7] 7 Dynasty Jesse asks Karen lor a
second chance: she gives birth to Adam s 
son g
[8] Straight Talk
[10] to  Tit* Equalizer A foreign diplomat 
is accused ol kidnapping his son from hit 
ex-wile
[12] Evening Ni
[13] Praise the Lord Live

9:30 [8] MOVIE: Clue (1985) Characters from 
the popular board game find murder and 
mischief. Tim Curry. Madeline Kahn. PG. 
1:37 g
fSl American Snapshots

Hospital Report
Patients in Hansford Hospital 

are Olga Gafford, Irene Brown, 
Amy Black, Kaye McFarlin, Tony 
Pacheco, Jr., Alvin Harbour and 
Buth Garner.

Dismissed from the hospital 
were Fran Maupin, Zachary Bree- 
land, Willie Taylor, Lson Schroe- 
der, Mary Mayfield, Haset Jack- 
son and Nora.Haya.

I

m

.
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To be honored Saturday . . .

Sororities name Queens
The four Spearman chapters of 

Beta Sigma Phi will honor their 
respective Valentine Queens at the 
sorority's annual Valentine Ball 
Saturday evening in Spearman.

Marsha M urphy will serve as the 
Rho Rho sorority Queen while 
Karen Schnell has been named 
Valentine Queen fo the Xi Zeta 
Sorority.

The Preceptor Epsilon Zeta Val 
entine Queen will be Carolyn 
Gressett and Barbara Schnell will 
be honored at the Valentine Ball by 
laureate Gamma Gamma.

The Rho Rho Queen is the wile of 
latrry Murphy and the couple has

4 * 9
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MARSHA MURPHY 
. . . Rho Rho Queen

one daughter, Kathryn, who is 
6-years old.

Marsha was pledged as a mem­
ber of Beta Sigma Phi in 1977 and 
was a member at-large from 1978 
through 1986 while teaching at 
Waka.

A graduate of Childress High 
School, Mrs. Murphy received her 
bachelor's degree from West Texas 
State University. She received her 
Master’ s of Education degree from 
Trinity University, San Antonio.

She attends the First Christian 
Church in Spearman and is involv­
ed in numerous service projects. 

'She has worked with the senior 
citizen's program since 1976.

In addition, Mrs. Murphy is the 
current president of Golden Spread 
Center and has held that position 
for five years. She has served on 
the library board since 1976, 
including a 4 year stint as presi­
dent.

She helped initiate the Meals on- 
Wheels program in Spearman and 
currently serves on the board of the 
Panhandle Crisis Center.

In 1984, she was honored by the 
Spearman Chamber of Commerce 
as Citizen of the Year.

Xi Zeta's Karen Schnell is the 
wife of James Schnell of Spearman. 
They have two children; Clint,

W

KAREN SCHNELL 
. . . Xi Zeta Queen

11-years old, and Jennifer, who is

five.
Active both in her sorority and 

the community, she is a member of 
the First United Methodist Church 
of Spearman.

She is a former president of the 
Spearman PTA and served two 
terms as District 8 Youth Protec­
tion Chairman for the Texas PTA 
group which consists of the top 22 
counties of the Texas Panhandle.

In sorority, she has been voted 
Pledge of the Year, second vice- 
president of Rho Rho, president of 
Rho Rho, twice as city council 
president;

Treasurer of Xi Zeta, president 
of Xi Zeta, a member advisor, twice 
as Program of the Year, twice as 
Girl of the Year. This is her first 
Valentine Queen honor.

Carolyn Gressett will serve as 
Preceptor Epsilon Zeta’ s 1988 Val­
entine Queen. She is the wife of 
Ray Gressett. The couple have

Questions about 
the sweeping 
tax changes?
H&.R Block has the answers. •

fcvcrylxxly’s nskirtg questions about the most sweeping tax changes 
in history. Our experienced preparers know the answers. We know 
the new laws and the new forms. We'll sas e you every dollar possible. 
And, you'll grf the biggest refund you have coming! If there's ever a 
time for H&.R Block, it's now.

D i  n r i r  d o n t f a c e  t h e
NEW TAX LAWS ALONE. 

to/fs Spearman 659-2310 ^
{. Frf. 9A.M. -5 PR. Appointment* Availablt

Phi in 1961 and has held various 
offices as well as committee chair­
manships since that time.

CAROLYN GRESSETT 
. . . Preceptor Epsilon Zeta Queen

three children; KhrisU Phelps of 
M uleshoe, Cindy Sinclair ol Pine 
Bluff, Ark., and Jeff, a student at 
Southwest Texas State University 
in San Marcos. They have three 
grandchildren.

Active in Beta Sigma Phi for 
several years, Mrs. Gressett has 
held almost every office and com­
mittee.

A member of the First United 
Methodist Church, she recenUy 
served on the Mission Committee 
and, currently, serves as co-chair­
man of the Hospitality Committee.

An avid golfer, she has served as 
the Ladies' Golf Club president and 
as tournament chairman for two 
different terms.

An equally avid high school 
sports booster, Mrs. Gressett has 
also helped decorate dressing 
rooms and busses in addition to 
attending games. She has also 
served as a girls basketball coach 
at the Hansford Y.

Mrs. Gressett has also worked 
with the Music Boosters of Spear­
man -  a group which supports 
band and choir in the Spearman 
schools.

The 1988 Queen also manages to 
work bridge, tole painting and 
sewing into her busy schedule.

Barbara Schnell has been chosen 
as the Laureate Gamma Gamma's 
1988 Valentine Queen, The wile of

Louis Schnell, they have two 
children, James of Spearman and 
Patricia Nash of Hampton, Ve., 
along with lour grandchildren.

The owner-operator of her own 
drapery shop, she is a member of 
the First United Methodist Church 
where she is an active worker.

Mrs. Schnell joined Beta Sigma

BARBARA SCHNELL 
. , laureate Gamma Gamma Queen

History book  

by M ary Ayres 

now available
A family history book -- started 

by the late Mary Barns Ayres -  
has been completed by her hus­
band, I.W. Ayres, and the 60-page 
loose-leaf publication is available 
to the general public.

The late Mrs. Ayres died in 
April, 1986, before completing the 
history of her parents, V.E. and 
Mollie Barns, and her grand­
parents. Absolem  snd Mary 
Isabelle Garrison.

The work she put into the book 
was completed after her death by 
her husband and is available for 
$11, he reports.

Farmers m ay  
enroll land  
in CRP plan

Texas farmers have another 
opportunity to enroll highly erod- 
ible land in the Conservation 
Reserve Program.

The next signup period is Feb. 1 
to Feb. 19. Farmers may enroll 
land at Agricultural Stabilization 
and Conservation Service county 
offices where previously accepted 
bids do not exceed 25 percent of 
the cropland in the county.

"The Febuary signup is the 
sixth since the program got under­
way two years ago," points out Dr. 
B.L Harris, soil specialist with 
the Texas Agricultural Extension 
Service, The Texas A&M Univer­
sity System.

Farmers who participate in the 
10-year commitment receive an­
nual rental payments. In addition, 
the U.S. Department of Agriculture 
picks up half the cost of establish­
ing a permanent conservation 
cover.

Gruver grads 
on W ayland  
honor listing

The fall 1987 Dean’ s Honor Roll 
at Wayland Baptist University 
includes three students from 
Gruver.

Named to the list were Julie 
Deakin, junior, 4.00 grade point 
average (GPA); Pamela Kay Doty, 
sophomore, 3.50 GPA; and Anne 
Potts, freshman, 4.00 GPA.

The Dean's Honor Roll is an­
nounced at the end of each 
semester by Dr. Bill Hardage, 
academic vice president and dean 
of the university, and lists the 
names of students who earned at 
least a 3.50 PGA on a 4.00 scale 
while completing at least 12 sem­
ester hours during the term.

People believe to  cure a sore throat,
wrap a piece of bacon around your
neck.

PASSING IN THE NIGHT. . . Spearman's Lisa Cazarez [33, white] hits 
hte backboards as Graver's Raquel Mathews [32, dark] attempts a 
block.

Valentine's Special
C I ean  J  S w e a t e r s ,

G e t  o n e  c I ean eeJ FREE 
S p e c ia I  o FFe r  q o o d  T liRouqh Fsb. 14 O N ly.

Call collect 435-4211 For pickup & 
delivery each Monday & Thursday

* -* * •
- X

You are invited
to

Coronado Hospital 

Pam pa, Texas

February 13
You MUST pre-register 

Call 665-3721
S c h e d u l e  o f  A c t i v i t i e s

7:00 a.m. to 9:00 a.m. — FREE cholesterol screening ... (see note about preparations).
—visit exhibits, tour hospital ... HEARTy snacks served 

9:00 a.m. to 9:30 a.m. — How to cook HEARTy ... dietary department of Cqronado Hospital 
9:30 a.m. to 10:00 a.m. — Risk factors for heart disease — Dr. Albert Sy

10:00 a.m. to 10:30 a.m. — Common medications used In treating heart disease — Dr. Laxman Bhatia 
10:30 a.m. to 11:00 a!m. — Panel discussion featuring four heart patients and Pampa physicians 
11:00 a.m to 11:30 a.m. — Exercise after a heart attack — Dr. Kamnani 
11:30 a.m. to? — Results of cholesterol screening
NOTE: If you want to have a fr**oholeetero» screening, you muet not eat or drink after B p.m. Friday evening. You 
may drink water, and take your heart medications. Diabetics should wait until they have a snack before taking 
medications.
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"Lincoln’ s birthday is this 
month,”  I told a friend.

“Big deal," he said. " I  drive a 
Mercury."

"N o, I’ m talking about Abra­
ham," I replied.

"W hat kind of a car would have 
a name like Abraham?" he ques­
tioned. "G ive me a macho name 
like ‘ Cougar’ ."

"Listen, dummy, Tm talking 
about the Abraham Lincoln of 
history . . .  the man who freed the 
slaves."

"T h ou g h t that was Henry 
Ford."

"N o ,”  countered his wife. "It 
was the Big Three who freed the
slaves."

The Big Three?" I asked in 
amazement. You mean Roose­
velt, Churchill and Stalin?”

"N o, I mean Betty Friedan,

Gloria Steinham. and Jane Fon­
da,”  she cackled.

Well, however you perceive his­
tory, you have to admit Lincoln's 
birthday, February 12th, was a 
significant event. When Abe was 
bom, Ronald Reagan was just a 
boy.

Lincoln has things named for 
him -  Lincoln Center, Lincoln 
Tunnel, NFL wide receivers.

Reagan will have things named 
for him, too — Reaganomics, 
Reagan Star Wars, even a presi­
dential bush named George.

Both Lincoln and Reagan were 
shot but it looks like they’ ll both 
live forever. One of them lives on 
in history books, the other on the 
late, late show.

If Abraham could talk to us 
today, I suspect he would have 
some very interesting things to say 
about the country. Probably things 
like:

" I  preserved the Union so all the 
Yankees could go south for the 
winter. So why is Miami full of 
Cubans?"

"Four score and seven years ago 
. . . Wasn't that the last time the 
Houston Oilers won a wild card?”

"The west is finally settled . . . 
with the possible exception of

%SXX3SXaXXXXXKKXXX3

SPEARMAN SKI GROUP 

Taking Reservations NOW

for Spring Break Ski Trip 

will stay at Gold Creek in Angel Fire

Call Pat at Wheatheart Travel 
and get your name on the list!

659-2476

THE SPEARMAN REPORTER
California.”

We don't have politicians like 
Lincoln around any more and that’ s 
too bad. Lawyer Lincoln was 
arguing a case once and the judge 
thought he got out of line. Fined 
him $10 for contempt of court.
Honest Abe wanted to pay on the 
spot with a $20 piece. The judge 
said the court had no change for 
the twenty. "That’ s alright,
Judge," said Honest Abe. "I 'll 
just take the other ten out in 
contempt.”

Services held for 
Milford Langston

Funeral services for Milford 
Leon Langston, 63, son of Lera 
Langston and brother of Viola 
George and Oleta Denham all of 
Spearman, were held Tuesday 
morning in White Deer.

Mr. Langston died Saturday in 
Amarillo. The Rev. David Keller, 
pastor of the First Christian Church 
of Dimmitt, officated at the ser­
vices which were held at the 
Carmichael-Whatley Colonial 
Chapel in White Deer.

Mr. Langston moved to White 
Deer in 1954 from Fritch. He was 
married to Bettie Wolfe at Clovis,
N.M. He was a Baptist. He worked 
for Natural Gas Pipeline for 32 
years and retired in 1978. He 
served in the U.S. Army during 
World War II.

Survivors include his wife; two 
sons, Stephen Langston of Wichita 
Falls. Melvin Langston of Roanoke; 
three daughters, Calene Long of 
Dimmitt, Bonnie Cox of Pampa and 
Dela Warminski of White Deer:

His mother, Lera Langston of 
Gilliland, Frank Langston of Sey­
mour, Alvin Langston of Victoria 
and Curtis Langston of Skellytown;

Four sisters. Viola George and 
Oleta Denham, both of Spearman,
Catherine King of San Antonia and 
Della Patchett of Las Vegas, Nev; 
and 9 grandchildren.
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Final Reduction 
O N E  W E E K  O N L Y

Beginning Wed. Feb. 3

M A I N

506 Main Gruver 733-5040

Your Home Is Full 
O f Hidden Dollars

Advertising Pays B-I-G! Call 659-3434

^  Turn idle items
Into cash fast 

Call 659-3434 wjth a Want fid
1 * *

OSGOOD
MONUMENT CO.

Amarillo, Texas
Dealers of Rock of Ages 
Granite, as well as all 
colored granites, marble 
and bronze memorials.

represented by
BOXWELL BROS. 
FUNERAL HOME

519 S. Evans
659-3802

}od y

m i i m m  n nwwn-nw*

&  M  
Worki

1501 Hwy. 15 
659-2775

Tailpipes - $29.95 
Mufflers • $39.95 

Most Duals - $160.00 
complete

VISA! MASTERCARD! GUARAN 
TEED! W ithout investigation. 
Bankrupt? Bad credit? Divorced? 
Widowed? On Welfare? No prob­
lem. All eligible. Free details. 
Send #10 self addressed stamped 
envelope. Success, Drawer 389, 
Clanton, Alabama 35045.
S08-rtn

Help Wanted

Real

STEAM RINSE A VAC- Rinse and 
Vac Shampooer for rent at Gordons 
Drug. $10.95 up to 24 hours.

NOTICE
Wallace Monument Co.
Monuments, Curbing, 

Grave Covers 
Local Representative 

LEONARD JAMESON 
Spearman, Texas

WANTED: Any J.H. Gruver 7 
& Sons Advertising Gifts a 
that you do not wish to keep, 4 
please contact Helen Shap- 4 
ley at 733-2671 or 733-2641. 1
Especially bond books, coin ' 
purses, calenders, knives 
and pen and pencils.
SU 4

OWN YOUR OWN APPAREL OR 
SHOE STORE. CHOOSE FROM: 
JEAN/SPORTSWEAR, LADIES
APPAREL, MEN’ S. CHILDREN/ 
MATERNITY, LARGE SIZES, PE 
TITE, DANCEWEAR/AEROBIC 
BRIDAL, LINGERIE OR ACCES 
SORIES STORE. ADD COLOF 
ANALYSIS. BRANDS: LIZ CLA1 
BORNE, LUCIA, HEALTHTEX. 
LEE. CAMP BEVERLY HELLS, 
ST MICHELE, CHAUS, AND 
BUGLE BOY, FORENZA, OR­
GANIC AIXY GROWN ovar 2000 
other*. Or $18.99 one priee design­
er, multi-tier pricing discount or 
FAMILY SHOE STORE. RETAIL 
PRICES UNBELIEVABLE FOR 
QUALITY SHOES NORMALLY 
PRICED FROM $19. TO $80. 
OVER 250 BRANDS 2600 STYLES. 
$17,900 TO $27,900: INVENTORY. 
TRAINING, FIXTURES. GRAND 
OPENING. AIRFARE. ETC. CAN 
OPEN 15 DAYS. MR. LOUGHUN 
(612)888-6555.
S14-ltp

' l l Z I l I  
GOLDEN SPREAD REALTY 
Janye Helton Pointer, Broker 

Owner, 435-5444 
SALES ASSOCIATES 
T.O. Lesly - 659-2028 

1112 S. Bernice • 3-13/« loca­
tion! Location!
322 Hazelwood • 2/1 owner 
will finance.
607, 609, 611, 615, Haney 
Small house/2 apartments.
615 E. Kenneth • 3/2. Corner 
lot with extra acreage!
102 Wanda - 3/1 Immaculate! 
118 Townsend - 4/2. Apart­
ment included!
711 Collier - 3/1 Why rent? 
322 S. Barkley • 3/1 Good 
location at affordable price! 
811 Townsend-2/1 afforuable!

COMMERCIAL 
15 N. Hazelwood 
201 Bernice • Former M&M 
grocery store. Can be sold 
with or without fixtures. 

FARM
640 acres of grass in Sherman 
Co., over 500 acres in the 
C.P.R. Program 
640 acres of wheat and milo 
land in Hansford Co.
3 RANCHES in Brown wood 
area. Call today!
—-----— t - r

©  II jnmlEnUfCtvp— 4i «r

Allen Alford-Broker-659-3034 
Hester Sue Crawford-Snles 

659-3060 or 659-2074 
Dennis Nelson-Sales-659-3608 
Larry Trosper-Sales-659-3491

316 S. Bernice • 2366 sq. ft. 
101 W. 12th - 1344 sq. ft.
426 Haney - 1479 sq. ft.
619 Evans - 1350 sq. ft.
1014 Linn Dr. - 2,000 sq. ft. 
734 Wilbanks • 1192 sq. ft.
32 N. Snider - 1850 sq. ft.
729 Cotter - 1519 sq. ft.
506 Endicott - 1100 sq. ft.
907 Dressen - Nice starter 
505 Haney • 1600 sq. ft.

W « want to bo Tour 
REALTOR

TEXAS REFINERY CORP. needs 
mature person now in Spearman 
area. Regardless of experience, 
write A.D. Hopkins, Box 711, Fort 
Worth. TX 76101.
S14 ltp

WANTED BOOKKEEPER
with very strong accounting 
background. Must be able to 
type, prepare financial reports. 
Responsible for all bookkeep­
ing. Must be able to handle 
stress and work well with 
people. Computer background 
helpful. Only those qualified 
need apply. Fulltime position 
with benefits available. Equal 
Opportunity Employer. Contact 
Tina at Hansford Hospital, 707 
S. Roland Spearman, Tx. 79081 
S14-2tc

V M M V M M aM W W U W M M M M  i
I Offered by

EMMETT R. SANDERS
REALTOR

| 3 bedroom home, attached garage. 
*•**

EM METTR. SANDERS
REALTOR

659-2516. nights 659-2601

BOB HARD)’ RtALTi 
803 V\ ilmeth Dr.

659-3440
NEW LISTINGS:

820 Linn Drive ^
bd - 2 bath - fire.'V^^ double 

; car garage. 2?00 sq. ft.
living area. Lustom drapes. 
Lawn Sprinkler System. Satel­
lite dish and receiver. Fenced. 
Excellent location.Call for quote 
1001 Haney - 3 bd, 2 bath. Den 
with fireplace. Cornerlot 
fenced. Carpeted. Nice, price- 
reduced. Approx. 1450 sq. ft.

Robert Hardy - broker

lmro'f\5^ve i>
rln n K lo

Sales Reoresentative
High Caliber Person

Sales career position with man­
agement opportunities in grow­
ing organization. Intensive 
training program. Starting 
income to $3,200 per month. 
No experience necessary, Out­
standing group insurance and 
retirement benefits. Reloca­
tion not necessary.

For confidential personal in­
terview, call (806)435-9448 or 
write Manager, P.O. Box 602, 

J£rTjtonJJ 2 (J 9 0 7 0 ^ S 1 4 ii4 ^

FOR SALE
FOR SALE: 1978 Lincoln town car, 
lots of miles, Show room condition. 
Call 365-4637.
S14-ltc

FOR SALE: 8”  metal lathe, on 
stand 24”  centers, 36”  bed with 
lots of extras. Also 500 gallon 
butene tank. Call (806)733-5235, 
Gruver, during the day.
S14-ltc

FOR SALE: 1983 Redman 14 x 70
Mobile Home, furnished or un­
furnished, with or without Iota, 2 
full baths, 2 bedrooms, just like t 
new home. Call 365-4637.
SU -lte

l tail Estate ♦ n tF H
FOR SALE: Nice house in good 
neighborhood. 3 bedrooms, l'/« 
baths, office, lots of cabinet stor­
age, garage, on 2 lots. 727 Wil­
banks. Price reduced. Call Sheila 
Watley 659-3970
S13 rtn ____

FOR SALE Newly remodeled house 
2 bedroom, central heat and air, by 
appointment only. Call after 5 p.m.
659-2697.
SI IS 8tp

HOUSE FOR SALE: 1850 sq. ft.. 4 
bedroom/2baths. living room with 
fireplace. Reasonably priced. Loca­
ted at 721 Wilbanks. Contact 
Frances Pipkin at 659-3938.
S10-8tp

ABANDONED HOMES Take over 
payments on 2 and 3 bedroom 
homes. Qualify by phone. (806) 
381-1352. Call collect.
S46-rtn

FOR SALE: nice 3 bedroom brick 
home, approx. 1300 sq. ft.; single 
garage. Priced in 30 's. Good 
neighborhood! Call 659-2263 after
5:00.

FOR SALE: 1983 Bonnevtlla Mo­
bile Home, 16x80. 3 bedroom, 2 
full baths, fireplace, spacious bi­
level kitchen. Set up on Corner lot. 
Must see to appreciate. Call 659- 
2354 after 5:30 p.m.
S09-rtn

For Rant

FOR RENT: 1 bedroom furnished 
apartment with new paint. Call 
659-3491 afterS p.m. 
SUT's-only-rtn

FOR RENT: Small 2 bedroom 
apartment, partially furnished. 
Call 659-3491 after 5 p.m. 
SU-T’ a-only-rtn

PSU BULL SALE 
Sat. Feb. 20, 1988 

1:00 p.m. CST Activity Bldg. 
Univ. Farm, Goodwell, Ok 

Selling 80 Hd.
For Catalog call (405)349-2611 

Ext. 262 or 221 (Office) 
or 349 25U  (Home)

SFeb.4,U,18-c

Miscellaneous \
Will do babysitting in my home. 
Day or Night. Call Julie at 659-230C 
Drop-ins welcome.
S13S-2tp

BASSETT/ COW DOG puppies to 
give away must see to believe how 
cute and adoralbe they are. 6 wke 
old call 733 2118 
S13 2tp

MISCELLANEOUS
ADDRESS ENVELOPE for firm$, 
nationwide! $en$ational earning$! 
No experience. We show you. 
Begin immediately! Stamped en­
velope: Publications-1, 804 Old 
Thomsby Road, Clanton, Alabama 
35045.
S08-rtn

CARDOFTHANKS

I would like to express my 
appreciation for the many kind­
nesses shown me during my recent 
illness. I would like to thank Dr. 
Sangalang and Dr. Viola for ‘ heir 
efforts in my behalf. I would like to 
thank the nurses at the hospital 
who were auperb. I appreciate the 
flowers, gifts, prayers, cards and 
visits, all of which have made me 
feel very humble. I am very 
grateful to the staff at the Manor 
for their many kindnesses. I also 
appreciate my precious family who 
have been a pillar of strength.

Bertha Forester
SU -ltc

NOTICE TO BIDDERS
Sealed bida for the following 

item will be received by the City of 
Spearman, Texna, at the office of 
the city manager up until 2:00 
p.m., March 16, 1983, and then 
publicly opened and read.

24 month contract for service of 
new uniforms and service of walk- 
off mats.

The city reserve* the right to 
reject any or all bida, to waive 
informalities, and to accept tbs bid 
deemed to be the most advantage­
ous to the city. All bids received 
after the closing hour will be 
returned unopened.

All bids shall be sealed and 
marked on the outer envelope of 
the type of bid being submitted.

Specifications and bidding 
document* may bo secured from 
the office of the eity manager, P.O. 
Box 37, Spearman, Texaa 79061. 
814 2te Tonly
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\Arnong the Neighbors
Gloria Knox is at home after a 

two weeks stay with her sister, 
Joyce, in Casper, Wyoming. Dr. 
Tom Kinser, husband of Joyce, 
passed away while she was there. 
He had been ill for six months, and 
interment was in Hope, Ark.

Other family members were 
unable to reach Casper for the 
services due to the extremely 
heavy snows in the area.

He was chairman of the Fine

by Helen Fisher
Arts Department of Casper College 
and the Kinsers had visited in 
Spearman several times.

Ora Lee Blackburn returned 
Thursday from several days visit 
with former Spearman residents. 
Gertrude Jones and Bob and Hall 
Parris, her grandson. They live at 
Crowell and Hall works in Vernon.

One day Ora Lee and Gertrude 
drove to Wichita Falls to visit Mary

Catherine Parris who is in a skilled 
nursing home there. Her condition 
has not changed in several years.

Nicole Parris is employed in 
Dallas. Gertrude sends greetings 
to her old friends in Spearman. 

•***•*•
Suiting the deed to the word, 

nine Spearman people have been in 
Matamoros, Old Mexico, working 
at an orphanage sponsored by the 
First Baptist Church. °  H

The home provided quarters for 
the volunteer group in the dormi­
tories. 38 orphans make their 
home there.

Interior construction work and 
roof repair occupied the full time of 
the group for a week.

Those making the long drive and 
donating their time and effort 
were: Russell Gibbs, James Cun­
ningham, Wirt Davis, R .L  Upter- 
grove. Joe Garcia, F.W. Thomas, 
Cleo Denman, Altha Groves and 
Mrs. H.L. Boyd.

To see the work through to 
completion R.L. Uptergrove, F.W. 
Thomas and Joe Garcia remained 
down there for several more days.

During Mr. Cunningham's ab­
sence, Mrs. Cunningham put in 
her time enjoyably, though probab­
ly not as rewardingly. She visited 
with friends at their home on Green 
Belt Lake, Clarendon.

*•**•*•
Andy and Ann Etter of Olathe,

FEBRUARY CLEARANCE 
TO CLEAR OUR INVENTORY

C O M E  I N  N O W  A N D  S A V E ! !  wb* toebTnj* muabv,
. » * WE ARE EXTENDING

THIS SALE ENDS FEBRUARY 16,1988

STAINMASTERAND ANSOV PRODUCTS
ANSOV WORRY 
FREE CARPET

• 100% Nylon Pile
• Velvet Plush Construction 
•Anso V Nylon
• Anso V Worry Free1' Carpet 
•PremierAnso’ VCollection 
•Anso1 V5-Year Soil, Stain

and Wear Warranty
• Backing — ActionBac

$
Compare .it $19.951 4 95

YD.
IM STALLED  ON Q U A LI TV C USHIO N

DUPONT CERTIFIED STAIN RELEASE
STAINMASTER* • 100% Continuous Filament Nylon Pile

CARPET • Cut and Loop Construction
• 100% Nylon Pile • Advanced Stain Protection, Resists
• Velvet Plush Construction Soiling and Reduces Static
• DuPont Certified Stainmaster"  Carpet • Uni-Set Continuous Heat Set Yarn
• Full 5-Year Wear and • Soil, Stain and Static Resistant Yarn

Slain Resistance Warranty • Scotchgard Stain Release
• Lifetime Anti-Static Warranty • Backing — ActionBac"
• Resists Soiling and Staining Compare at $15.95

$1 C 9 5 $-1 H 95
Compare at $20.95 I  YD. 1 1 YD.

INSTALLED ON QUALITY CUSHION INSTALLED ON QUALITY CUSHION

PROFESSIONAL INSTALLATION ON ANY PRODUCT GUAR ANTEED 5 YEARS
FREE ESTIMATE ON ANY JOB

BIG SAVINGS ON CERAMIC AND HARDWOOD FLOORING

ceramic flooring
8"X8” tiles

89‘
per lile

CASH & 
CARRY

$ 4 9 9
per loot

INSTALLED

Install yourself
Remodel with Bruce glue-down 

Oak Parquet.
G enuine oak flooring  you glue in adhesive righ t over 
your o ld  floo r — wood, tile  or concrete. Easy-care p a r­
que t w ith  in-the-w ood prefin ish ing  fo r lastinq  good 
looks. Has the look of expensive in la id  floo ring , but at a 
frac tion  o f the cost. Great rem odeling idea fo r any room.

$ 1 19
per fool 

CASH & CARRY

$ 0 9 9
per foo t

INSTALLED

ARMSTRONG VINYL FLOORING

WE SERVICE WHAT WE SELL BECAUSE IT’S SERVICE AFTER THE SALE 
_____________THAT KEEPS OUR CUSTOMERS COMING BACK!!!

OVER 600 YDS. OF THIS SPECIAL 
PROMOTION ITEM ONLY J8 95 YD.

INST ALLED WITH CUSHION

ROLL END SPECIALS 
INSTALLED PRICES

A 32 yds stain m a s te r b e r b e r g n ly  $559.00
B 44 YDS. RED LEVEL LOOP........................$379.00

‘ C. 21 YDS. BROWN CUT* LOOP ...............$239.00 ^
D 25 YDS. LIGHT BEIGE CUT * LOOP ..  $299.00

•  E.29 YDS CUT PILE KITCHEN CARPET $359.00
F.25 YDS GOLD 65 OZ PLUSH ................ $359.00

i  G 38 YDS.-15FT. WIDE 65 OZ PLUSHGRAY

STAINMASTER.....J $659.00
H. 52 YDS FOOTPRINT FREE INDIAN SAND .$859.00 

fak. 126 YDS BEIGE SAXONY TIGHT TWIST $299.00

S T E A M  W A Y
‘  CARPET CARE _

/ t l lDIO M i t t
• s  <e

MAll  /»AI0DCTCu t i K I  Y v U r r
1026 M E G E R T  S H O P P I N G  C E N T E R

MAN OAIKr fc l o
273 2114

Kan., spent last weekend with his 
uncle. Tom and Helen Etter. The 
Etters have visited here on several
occasions.

•••••••
Mr. and Mrs. Bichard Gaines 

spent last week visiting relatives in 
Eureka and Madison, Kan.

A delayed Christmas gift for 
Stephanie Brock from Kim was an 
enjoyable cruise from which they 
have just returned. They flew to 
Ft. Lauderdale, FI. and embarked 
on the Italian cruise ship “ Costa 
Riveria".

For 7 warm, pleasant days they 
cruised the Caribbean. Interesting 
stops were made at the isles of St. 
Thomas, St. Croix and Nassau.

During their absence, their four 
children had an equally fine time. 
They spent the time being spoiled 
by their grandmother, Mrs. War-

THUR8DAY, FEBRUARY 4, 1988

Services held for 
E.L. (Roy) Collins

Funeral services for E.L. "R o y "  
Collins, 71, were held Wednesday 
afternoon in the First United 
Methodist Church in Spearman.

Mr. Collins died Monday. Burial 
was in Hansford Cemetery by 
Boxwell Brothers Funeral Directors

Mr. Collins, born in Burrton, 
Kan., moved to the Spearman area 
in 1957 from Satanta, Kan. He was 
a shift operator for Panhandle 
Eastern Pipeline Company for 39 
years retiring in 1978. He was 
married to Emma Lou Kline in 1942 
at Cottonwood Falls, Kan.

Survivors include his wife; two 
sons, David Collins of Spearman 
and Dan Collins of Groesbeck; a 
daughter, Becky Pittman of Ama­
rillo; and six grandchildren.

them. Memorials may by to 
charity.

a favorite

Carly Shieldknight is at home Markets
after spending several days in St. WHEAT 12.72
Anthony's Hospital in Amarillo last MILO $2.95
week.

She underwent oral surgery in an 
unusual operation that required

CORN $2.00

denhall, Liberal; Mr. and Mrs.
bone graft. Jimmie Blair, Balko;

She is recovering and expects to 
return to her junior class as school 
by the middle of the week; how­
ever, apples and celery will be 
curtailed in her diet for some 
time, more than likely.

Gary Thomas, son of Penny and 
Jim Thomas, is back at home with 
them and expects to be here six to 
eight weeks before he will be able 
to resume his work at American 
Trailers in Amarillo.

A week ago Saturday, Gary and a 
group of friends were horse back 
riding in Palo Duro Canyon, when 
the saddle slipped and he fell from 
the horse. Not realizing that he 
was injured he did not seek medical 
attention.

Four hours later, after he lost 
consciousness, it was discovered 
that he had a ruptured spleen and 
was bleeding internally. He suf­
fered almost fatal blood loss before 
emergency surgery could be per­
formed.

Gary had finally fully recovered 
from a prior accident which was 
work related.

Sally Desimone is back home and 
family members report that she is 
recovering satisfactorily. She un­
derwent surgery last Monday at 
High Plains Baptist Hospital.

An interesting article concerning 
Donald H. Smith and his under­
water detecting service was is the 
Amarillo Sunday News-Globe. 

»•••••*
As sure as the season rolls 

around, the annual reunion rolls 
around for the six girls who were 
college roommates at Panhandle 
State University.

The first was held in 1933 and 
ha« continued since. This year 
they came to the home of Olive and 
Owen Pendergraft on Thursday for 
the reunion.

The ladies and their husbands 
were Mr. and Mrs. Clyde Kile, 
Beaver; Mr. and Mrs. Paul Men-

Mrs. Lura Adams, Hooker and 
Mrs. Vera Gray, Ulysses, Kan.

A guest was Mrs. Lillian Otta- 
way of Tyrone, Ok., the mother of 
Mrs. Gray. Mrs. Gray and Mrs. 
Ottaway remained until Saturday.

The Pendergrafts have had other 
callers during the week. Reverend 
Don Wirsdorfer of Lockhart, Tx. 
came on Friday, and on Saturday 
afternoon Mrs. Glenda Purcell and 
son, Justin, of Stinnett and Mrs. 
Maggie Painter and daughter, 
Molly, of Borger visited.

Mr. and Mrs. Nolan Holt and 
Mr. and Mrs. Roger Odegaard 
attended the 59th annual meeting 
of the National Council of Farmers 
Cooperatives held in Washington 
D.C. last week.

The meeting was held from the 
24 through the 28, but the Spear­
man group flew in a day early in 
order to do some sight seeing.

While the men were in the 
meetings, the ladies enjoyed the 
entertainment provided for them, 
though the weather was very 
unpleasant.

There were scheduled tours of 
the Capitol Hill area md the 
Washington Cathedral and Embas­
sies, also some luncheons and 
breakfasts.

•••••*•
Happy anniversary to a couple of 

Spearman kids! Dorothy and Jesse 
Davis observed their 58th on 
Feb.2.

Free Attic 
Insulation

With Siding or 
Overhang Trim-Out Job

Reid Construction  
435-2772

February Only

Steve Cross Cares 
About

Hansford County
★  ★  ★  ★

Be sure to 
register to vote!

Feb. 7 • Last Day of Registration
Feb. 17 - March 4 - Absentee Balloting
March 8 - Super Tuesday Primary Election
VOTE FOrR  Stephen F. "Steve" Cross

-----  Republican Primary - 84th District Attorney
Pol. Advt. Pd for By Stephen F,Cross, Borger Tx.

VAN’S
PRIME SEAFOOD

Fresh shrimp and seafood 
. . .  by air!

Spearman Super Service Hwy. 207 S. 
Thursday, Feb. 4 12 noon to 2 p.m.

Over 100 fresh 
and frozen items!

Clean, inspected 
mobile unit.

7200 S.W. 45th at Coulter phone 355-6066

l t


