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Sheets 
on WTSU 
honor roll

National beef checkoff 
seen positive by group

National beef checkoff refer­
endum results, announced May 27 
by the U.S. Department of Agri­
culture, were seen as extremely 
positive by industry, education and 
research groups involved in the 
effort.

Nationally, 78.97 percent of the 
eligible cattle producers, dairy 
farmers and importers voted to 
continue funding the U.S. beef 
research and promotion. Of the 
256,508 total ballots cast, 202,408 
were affirmative votes, while the 
remaining 54,097 voters registered 
negative votes, or 21.03 percent 
rejected the referendum.

In Texas, 37,945 people voted in 
the referendum. Affirmative votes 
were cast by 32,269 persons, or 88 
percent. Voting “ no" were 5,676 
persons, or 12 percent.

Dr. Ernest E. Davis, economist 
in livestock marketing with the 
Texas A&M University Agri­
cultural Extension Service, said it 
is very critical that this funding be 
available to cattlemen not only for 
advertising and promotion but 
"also for future research and 
continuing development of gene­
tically-designed cattle to meet con­
sumer and packer carcass and meat 
demands."

Davis said approval of the refer­
endum will allow funds spent on 
that research to come from cattle­
men rather than private funding.

"This means that cattlemen may 
own the genetics, instead of a 
private company," Davis said.

Passage of the referendum will 
permit long-range information 
planning that will benefit all seg­
ments of the beef industry, said Dr. 
John R. Beverly, beef cattle project

group supervisor for the Texas 
A&M University Agricultural Ex­
tension Service.

"Broader promotion and infor­
mation projects can now be plan­
ned in this post-referendum  
period. Besides product develop­
ment research and promotion, 
more comprehensive marketing re­
search and educational efforts can 
be generated that should have a 
positive impact on all phases of the 
beef industry," Beverly said.

.According to Anne Anderson, 
executive director of the Texas 
Beef Industry Council, Austin, 
strategies to be used to influence 
consumers will include reaching 
them through education of physi­
cians, dietitians, nutritionists and 
children -- the consumers of the 
future.

"The Beef Industry Council will 
strive to reposition beef as a food 
that is fashionable, light, healthy, 
wholesome, versatile, nutritious 
and good tasting by working with 
food editors of magazines as well 
as the broadcast media," Ander­
son said.

The referendum provides the 
accountability needed so producers 
are aware that funding decisions 
have been made by producers, 
Anderson said.

The beef checkoff program, 
which began Oct. 1 of 1986 as a 
result of the 1985 Farm Bill's Beef 
Promotion and Research Act, re­
quired that $1 from every head of 
cattle sold or imported in the U.S. 
be put aside for beef promotion and 
marketing efforts. The program is 
controlled by a 113-member board 
of 108 producers and five im­
porters.
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Hansford County Activity Center

Activity Center has membership drive

Baker on PSU honor roll
Beckee Baker, Spearman, was 

inadvertently left off the list of 
students named to the President's 
Honor Roll for the spring semester 
at Panhandle State University. She 
was among the 69 PSU students 
named to the list by Dr. Larry 
Boyd, PSU president.

The President's Honor Roll con­
tains the names of those students 
who have earned a perfect 4.0 
grade point average. To qualify for 
listing, a student must carry at 
least 12 hours of university 
courses, receive a straight A 
average and have no I's.

The Hansford County Activities 
Center is in the process of holding 
their 1988 Membership Drive. This 
years Membership Drive goal is 
$40 thousand.

Everyone working on the Sus­
taining Membership Drive needs to 
make all their contacts by June 13 
and be ready to turn in all 
donations. The time and place of 
this meeting will be announced 
later.

The drive will be continued for 
an additional week if need be. The 
past two weeks have been un-

Latta inducted 
to freshman 
honor society

Julie Latta, a Tarleton State 
University sophomore from Spear­
man, was one of 66 students 
inducted this spring into the Phi 
Eta Sigma national freshman honor 
society.

Students inducted into the soci­
ety must have been enrolled full 
time at the university and have 
earned at least a 3.5 grade point 
ratio as freshmen. Only eight 
percent of college freshmen 
throughout the nation achieve this 
distinction.

Julie is an Elementary Education 
major at the university and the 
daughter of Tom and Linda Latta of 
Spearman.

Following induction ceremonies, 
the elction of officers for the 
1988-89 year was conducted. Julie 
Latta was elected treasurer of the 
group.

The winner of the float division at the Hansford 
Round Up Parade, last Saturday, was "Old Drive In 
Theatre". The float was entered by XI Zeta The 
second place float was "Those were the Days-Past-

usually busy and the additional 
time will be given in order to let 
•voryona make all their contacts 
and pick up the donations. Later in 
the year a Harvest Ball fund raiser 
will be organized.

The Hansford County Activity 
Center formerly the Hansford 
County YMCA was started in 1979. 
The kids programs it offers are 
soccer, football, basketball, swim 
team, baseball, T-ball, and coach 
pitch. Possibly next fall wrestling 
could be added to the programs. 
Exercise classes for both men and 
women along with a weight train­
ing program are offered for adults.

The cost for a family member­
ship $125, an adult membership 
is $60 and a student membership is 
$30. An additional fee is needed for 
aerobics of $10 per month for 
members and $25 per month for 
non-members.

The current board of directors 
for the Hansford County Activity 
Center are Norlan Winegarner, 
president; Kelly Fuller, Vice presi­
dent; Lynn Archer, Secretary and 
David Boyd, treasurer.

Other board members include

Last Tuesday night several baseball games were played. The games 
were programs for Spearman youth sponsored by the Hansford County
Activity Center.

Don Hawkins, Joe Archer, Cindy 
Blackman, Barbara Townsen, 
Mary Schumann, Craig Schumann, 
Buddy Witherspoon, and Don 
Ledge wood, program director.

Additional board members are 
Carolyn Collier, Fred Shieldknight, 
Allen Varnon, Paul Lopez, Stephen
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appraisal review board

Taxpayers given protest June 28

Present-Future" entered by the 4-H Club. The third 
place float was Rho Rho's "Those Were the Days of 
the Wild Wild West. The prizes in the float division 
were $100, $75, and $50 respectively.

Taxpayers in the Hansford 
County Appraisal District will have 
an opportunity June 28 to protest 
values proposed for their property 
for local taxes. The district’ s 
appraisal review board (ARB) will 
begin hearing taxpayer protests on 
June 28.

After the ARB concludes its 
hearings and approves final pro­
perty values, local governments 
will use these values to assess 
property taxes to property owners 
for 1988.

The ARB is a group of citizens 
who live in the appraisal district 
and are appointed by the district's 
directors. Their responsibilities are 
outlined by the Texas Constitution, 
which requires that property be 
appraised equally and uniformly 
and that exemptions and pro­
ductive valuation are properly 
granted.

Property owners appear before 
the ARB and may protest any of 
these seven specific actions of the 
appraisal office:
-the appraised or agricultural 
value of the property;
-unequal appraisal of the tax­
payer’ s property compared to other 
property in the district;
--inclusion of the property on the

appraisal records;
- denial of a partial exemption, 
such as a homestead exemption; 
--denial of agricultural-use, open- 
space or timber productivity 
valuation;
--identification of the taxing unit or 
units in which property is located;
- determination that the taxpayer is 
the owner of the property; and 
-any other action of the appraisal 
office that adversely affects them.

Alice Peddy, chief appraiser for 
the district, outlined the steps for a 
property owner to file a protest. 
First, the property owner must file 
a written "notice of protest" with 
the ARB. This must be filed by 
June 30 or within 30 days after the 
taxpayer receives a notice of ap­
praised value from the chief ap­
praiser, whichever is later.

However, if the ARB sends a 
property owner a notice of any 
other kind of change in the 
appraisal records, the property 
owner has only 10 days to file a 
protest.

Official forms for a notice of 
protest are available at the ap­
praisal district office. “ A letter 
from the taxpayer ia also accept­
able," Peddy said, "as long as it 
identifies the property owner and 
the property which is the subject of

the protest and indicates dissatis­
faction with some decision or action 
of the appraisal office."

Each protesting taxpayer may 
offer evidence or argument either 
in person or by filing an affidavit 
with the ARB. Taxpayers should be 
aware that the ARB has no 
authority over tax rates or taxing 
unit spending and will not hear 
protests of those matters.

The ARB will schedule hearings 
as property owners file protests 
and will inform them of the time, 
date and place of their individual 
hearings at least 15 days before the 
schedule appearance date. Peddy 
said that protest hearings will be 
held for one day and that the ARB 
expects to approve the final ap­
praisal roll on July 8. State law 
requires the ARB to review and 
approve the appraisal records by 
July 20.

The State Property Tax Board 
has issued a pamphlet called 
"Taxpayers’ Rights, Remedies, 
Responsibilities," available at the 
Hansford Qounty Appraisal District 
office, which explains how to 
prepare and present an appeal to 
the ARB. For a copy, contact the 
appraisal district staff at 709 West 
Seventh, Spearman, Texas. 
659-6576 or 788-5139.

Students and future students in 
need of supplemental funding for 
college were urged today to write 
to The Scholarship Bank for a free 
financial aid planning calendar and 
information on private scholarship 
sources.

According to the director of this 
national, non-profit foundation, an 
estimated half-billion dollars is 
available to high school and college 
students, many of whom may not 
know that they are eligible. Funds

are contributed by corporations, 
trade, civic and non-profit groups 
and are normally awarded on such 
basis' as academic standing, 
college major, geographic pre­
ferences, areas of special interest 
and even on the student's willing­
ness to consider a special research 
project. Parental factors such as 
union, employer or past military 
experience are also considered by 
some donors.

The Scholarship Bank works with

ANN SHEETS

Ann Sheets, daughter of Claude 
and Jonell Sheets of Spearman, 
made the President's Honor Roll at 
West Texas State University both 
in the fall and spring semesters. 
She has a 4.0 grade point average. 
She was recognized for her aca­
demic excellence as Cross Resi­
dence Hall's academic student for 
1988. Sheets is a sophomore at 
WTSU majoring in b io ­
engineering.

financial aid counseling offices 
throughout the U.S. to assist in 
distribution of the information on 
the approximately 3,500 scholar­
ship sources. Each scholarship has 
a value of a least $1,000 and many 
are renewable yearly. Graduate 
level grants with values of up to 
$25,000 are also available. All 
students receive from 20 to 65 
different aid sources for which they 
are potentially eligible. For the 
1988-89 school year, a number of 
new aid sources are available to 
students majoring in law, business, 
health, engineering, com puter 
sciences and the humanities. Three 
national organizations are funding 
older women returning to school.

High school, college and future 
students should send now for their 
free planning calendar and infor­
mation on the scholarships by 
sending a stamped, self addressed 
envelope (business size) to The 
Scholarship Bank, 13944 E. Amar 
Rd., La Puente. Ca. 91748. For 
faster service, call toll free 
1 800-332-4432 outside Calif, and 
1 800-523-6831 in California.

At the | aycee's Bar-B-Que, during Hansford Bai^B-Que for the old Timer* Reunion and residents 
Round-up, 750 people turned out at Swimming Pool of Hansford Manor. Of the prooeeda, $1,000 will go 
Park for the Bar-B-Que. The I aycee's also catered toward scholarships to benefit Spearman youth.
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BROADLEAF HERBICIDE

EM ULSIVE ACID

W e e d o n e

‘'sa u u tft .ts a registered trademark of KhdneHmilcnr

Kids' Stuff
& Lady Fair j

S ALL spring & summer fashions 
reduced 30-50%  off.

Begins 9 a.m. 
Thursday, June 9

(Stores w ill be closed  W ed., Ju n e  8 to p rep are  for the sale)

CONTROL 
PROBLEM WEEDS

• Field Bindweed

• Thistles

• Blueweed

• Plus other tough 
annual and perennial 
broad leaf weeds

Use WEEDONE* 
brand 638 herbicide
The Affordable 
Alternative

Grain sorghum growers:
Use 1-1 xh  pints per acre to control 
annual and perennial 
broadleaf weeds.

Rangeland, fallowland and CRP
areas: Use 2Vz-5 pints per acre to 
control annual and perennial 
broadleaf weeds.

R h on e-P ou lenc AG Com pany
PO. Box 12014, 2 T. W. Alexander Drive 
Research Triangle Bark. NC 27709
1 Uftts RhAoe-Poulenc Ag Company
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Lions Club race

Amarillo man wins 1 OK race

Olo Crum, of Amarillo won the Lions Club’s 4th annual 10K race last 
weekend at the Hansford Round-up. Crum ran the 6.2 miles In 39 
minutes 39 seconds.

The fourth annual lions Club 10 
K race was held last weekend 
during Hansford Round up.

DOUGLAS GARRETT

Qlo Crum, from Amarillo was the 
overall winner in the men’ s divi­
sion. He ran the 6.2 miles in 39

Garrett chosen 
as Outstanding 
College Student

Douglas W. Garrett, a senior 
student at Texas Tech University in 
Lubbock, has been selected as a 
new member of the Outstanding 
College Students of America.

Garrett, son of Wayne and Lou 
Garrett, formerly of Spearman and 
now of Gruver. has been selected 
as a new member because of 
outstanding merit and accom­
plishment as an American college 
student.

Garrett is an Ag Economics 
major, and he will graduate from 
Tech next December. He plans to 
then attend graduate school. The 
Garrett’ s daughter, Jill, is a fresh­
man student at Tech.

minutes and 39 seconds. Kathy 
Sullivan, of Spearman, claimed the 
women's division title with a time 
of 57 minutes 27 seconds. The first 
Hansford County resident to cross 
the finish line was Richard North, 
of Spearman. North also took 
second place overall with a time of 
40 minutes and 33 seconds.

Howard Heaninger of Pampa 
placed third overall. He had a time 
of 42 minutes and 27 seconds.

Lewis Nava of Spearman ran a 43 
minute and 35 second 10 K to finish 
fourth.

Fifth place went to Stinnetts. 
Jason Richardson. Richardson 
turned in a time of 45 minutes and 
20 seconds.

Phillip Archer of Spearman ran 
the 10 K in 48 minutes and 47 
seconds to finish sixth overall.

Seventh overall was Brian 
Hughes, of Stinnett. He ran the 6.2 
mile distance in 49 minutes and 28 
seconds.

Isabel Martinez of Spearman 
took eighth place in the race. His 
time was 49 minutes and 49
seconds.

Joe Archer, o f Spearman, 
rounded out the 10 entries and 
placed ninth with a time of 53 
minutes and 48 seconds.

According to Randall Sauer, the 
light turnout for the annual race 
was because 2 other similar races 
were being held on that same day 
in Dumas and Amarillo.

V A C A T IO N , from  p. 2
The best defense against acci­

dents is to always be a defensive 
driver, obey the speed limits, and 
wear your safety belts. Major 
Cawthon stated, “ We, as members 
of the Texas Department of Public 
Safety want each and everyone of 
you to enjoy your vacations. There­
fore, we urge you to always stay 
alert, always being mindful of the 
other driver, take frequent rest 
stops on long trips, and obey all 
traffic rules and regulations.”

The Troopers of the Texas 
Department of Public Safety want 
the summer of '88 to be the safest 
yet for the Texas motorist. Please 
drive friendly and have a good 
vacation!!!

According to recent American Heart 
Association estimates, in U.S. adults 
aged 18-74,33 percent of white males, 
38 percent of black males, 25 percent 
of white females and 39 percent of 
black females have high blood 
pressure.

Vacation spots 
abundant 
in Texas

Vacation time means fun time. 
With the warm weather and the 
green foliage in abundance, the 
citizens of the State of Texas will be 
enjoying their vacations at the 
many different areas that this great 
state has to offer. With the 
additional people on our streets 
and highways, there are additional 
precautions that need to be taken 
also.

Before leaving on long trips, we 
need to take a little time to check 
over our vehicles. Vacations are no 
time fora breakdown. So, checking 
simple items such as tires, cooling 
system, battery, belts and hoses 
can prevent unwanted and un­
necessary breakdowns. But, noth­
ing can spoil a vacation anymore 
than having an accident. Major 
Vernon Cawthon, Regional Com­
mander of the Texas Department of 
Public Safety stated, “ The number 
of vehicles on Texas highways is 
increasing each year and unfortun­
ately, traffic accidents are increas­
ing also.”

se e  V A C A T IO N  p. 2
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CENTER, from p .l
Pool, and Randy Kirk.

Janice Mayfield is the current 
activity centers director. Past dir­
ectors include Jim Beeson and 
Wynn Crenshaw.

Past presidents of the center 
include Jim McLain, Ed Dear, 
Johnny Crawford. Don Hawkins, 
Ricky Thompson, and Kerry Hen- 
ton.

Anyone wishing to contribute to 
the Activity Center may call any 
board member or the Activity 
Center.

RED RIVER FISH FARM S

stocking catfish, bass, hybrid bluegill, and fathead minnows 
for your lakes and ponds. Wed nesday, June 15, we ill be in 
Gruver at Continental Grain 10:30 a.m. to 11:30 a.m.; and in 
Spearman at Spearman Equity 1:30 p.m. to 2:30 p.m. contain­
ers with oxygen provided for transporting fish. For more 
information, call (915)529-4277, Abilene, Texas.

RED RIVER FISH FARMS
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IV 'JYour Home Is Full ___
Of Hidden Dollars Call 659-3434

Turn idle items *
into cash fast, 

with a  Want Ad

MiiiiDiiimiiiiiiaiiiiiiiiimniiiiniiiiiiaiiiitmqi 
BOB HARDY REALTY 

803 Wilmeth Dr.
059-3440

____ NEW LISTINGS____ §
718 Cotter - 3 /M  th
fenced. Nice! P” 08 

lW e  also have some (FmHA 
I homes for sale.

f  Real Estate f
HELP W A N TED L For Sale VO

HELP WANTED: Collection clerk FOR SALE: 1976 Oldsmobile

- broker ■mnnunnmtSMI

Offered by .
EMMETT R. SANDERS

REALTOR * '  -
3 bedroom home, attached garage,
- , 
Call for details on almost new ]
FmHA repo's, 3 bedroom homes

EM M FIT R. SANDERS
REALTOR

659 2516. nights 659 2601
MMWMWMWMVtMMIMMMA

GOLDEN SPREAD REALTY
Janye Helton Pointer, B-oker 

Owner, 435-5444 
SALES ASSOCIATES 

T.O. Leslyf>59 3836 or 659-2028 
402 S. Haney • 3/2. Brick home 
with storm cellar and storage 
building!
1112 S. Bernice - 3-114. Loca­
tion! Location!
712 Collier - 3/V», foreclosure) 
Fireplace & extra lot!
607, 609, 611, 615, Haney -
Small house/2 apartments.
615 E. Kenneth - 3 /9 ^  ,^r 
lot with extrj|nder-* *  rteducedi 
619 Bernice - 4/2. Big home . . . 
small payments!
210 S. Bernice - 3/1. New roof 
and siding!
102 Wanda - 3/1. Immaculate! 
118 Townsend • 4/2. Apart­
ment included!
108 S. James - 3/1. No down 
payment to eligible buyers!
130 N. Hoskins - 3/2. Roomy 
inside and out!
711 Collier - 3/1. Why rent?
322 S. Barkley - 3/1. Good 
location at affordable price!
811 Townsend - 2/1. Afford 
able!
5 mi. east of Spe» rco»tt*e l iv.
tj  be sold asu#A*
321 N. Hoskins - Trailer & 3 lots!
120 N. Hazelwood - 9 n  ~ et
starter home! unde 
Industrial Road - 40 x 60 all steel 
building! FARM
640 acres of grass in Sherman 
Co., over 500 acres in the 
C.P.R. Program.
640 acres of wheat and milo 
land in Hansford Co.
3 Ranches in Brownwood area. 
Call today! .

i T  ' ", • f — M.  . %OM*«*oafeililwbisicorMu.

;3ody
& M 
Workd

1501 Hwy. 15 
-659-2775 A.

Tailpipes - $29.95 
Mufflers - $39.95 ■

Most Duals - $160.00
complete __________

FOR SALE: 3 br, 1 bath, house 
with fireplace, storage building, 
cellar and car-port. Prices in lower 
30's. 1007 S Haney, Call 659 3447. 
S30-4tp-Tonly

>164.05 per month for a 3 bedroom 
home, free delivery and set-up, call 
806-376-5364, ask for Marina, $596 
down at 96 months, 8.5 APR.
S32 7t

$99 total down payment for 4
bedroom, 2 bath, double wide, free 
delivery and tie down, ask for 
Rubin at 806-376-5630. 132 months 
at $335, 11.75 APR.
S32 7t

FOR SALE: 65x12 1971 Astra 
trailer house on double lot with 
double carport and storage 
building. Pay out like rent. Call 
435 6313.
S 30S 4tp

FOR SALE: Nice small 3 bedroom 
home. Fenced, carport, close to 
school. Great rental property or 
starter home. 1010 Dressen. Call 
1-669-9765, Pampa.

S18-rtn

ABANDONED HOMES Take over 
payments on 2 and 3 bedroom 
homes. Qualify by phone. (806) 
381-1352. Call collect.
S46-rtn

FOR SALE: 24 foot tandem axle 
travel trailer. Self contained. New 
tires and awning. $2,500. 16 N. 
Hoskins. Call 659-2842.
S31S-2 times

$188.36 per month for new 3
bedroom, 2 bath, 14x80 moblie 
home, free delivery, 806-376-5363, 
13% APR, 240 months 10% down, 
A-l homes.
S32 7t

$19.23 per month buys Cameo, 14. 
x 80, 3 bedroom, 2 bath, 10% 
down, 12% APR, 180 months, like 
new, call 806-376-5363 ask for Lee. 
S32 7t

$182.73 per month buys 1985 14x52 
2 bedroom mobile home, $1000 
total down payment, 11.75 APR for 
144 months ask for Art_806i376j 
4694. '
S32 7t

Mobile Homes moved and set up,
low rates, insured and bonded, B & 
G Mobile Homes Inc., (405)338- 
5315.
S32-4t-Tonly

Real '  i  
E state  | 

'S a m p ler
Iford-Rroker-659-3034 
Sue Crawford-Saies 
659-3060 or 659-2074 #  

Dennis Nelson-Sales-659-3608 
*: Larry Trosper-Sales-659-.i-<91 •:£
& 619 Evans - under contr»ct

bthjv;

SaMMVMMWWWMWMMWM

OSGOOD
MONUMENT CO.

AmanDo, Texas
Dealers of Rock of Ages 
Granite, as well as all 
colored granites, marble 
and bronze memorials.

represented by
BOXWELL BROS. 
FUNERAL HOME

519 S. Evans 
659-3802

#  32 N. Snider - 1850 sq. ft.
£: 729 Cotter - 1519 sq. ft.
#505 Haney - 1600 sq, tt.

. •>£-408 E. Kenneth • 1 j  . 2
App 1630 sq ft. *
721 Wilbanks 4 th 1838 X;

•i* sq ft.
Duplex - Kenneth A Hoskins

§ 1 1 1 1  Barkley -3 bdr.. 1 WJjathJ 
::-:*316 Roland - 2 bdr., l Vi bathjj 
Sgarage, nice cellar. Fenced yard.-
$!1013 Townsend - 1950 sq. ft. If!-: 
$•:full baths. Price Reduced.
:j:j: WE WANT TO BE
#: YOUR REALTOR $

NOTICE
Wallace Monument Co.
Monuments, Curbing, 

Grave Covers 
Local RepresenUtive 

LEONARD JAMESON 
Spearman, Texas

and hours flexible. Call 659-3311 
between 9 and 5 to set up 
interview.
S32-2tp

GET PAID for reading books! $100. 
per title. Write: PASE- B3134, 161 
S. Lincolnway, N. Aurora, IL 
60542.
S32-4tp

North Plains Electric Co-op is 
now accepting applications to fill 
the position of warehouseman. 
Applicants for the position, must 
be in good physical condition 
and able to perform strenuous 
work. Only those interested in 
full time employment should 
apply at the cooperative head­
quarters, Hwy. 83 N. Perry ton, 
TX. All applications must be 
received by 5 p.m. Wednesday, 
June 15. 1988. EOE.

SALES REP . I . HYDROTEX Inc

A multi million dollar 50 year old 
National Lubrication Company 
needs a Sales Representative to 
call on Commercial and In­
dustrial Accounts in the SPEAR­
MAN area. High Commissions. 
Product training provided. life / 
Health Insurance available. No 
inventory required. For person­
al interview call 1 800-443-1506 
or send resume to: HYDROTEX 
- DEPT. 2127 F. P.O. BOX 
560843, DALLAS, TX. 75356 
S31S-S32-p

SALES HELP 
NEEDED

Advertising salesperson  
needed to w o rk  

in surrounding a rea . 
Apply in person only, at

The Sp earm an  Reporter 
213 Main Spearm an, Tx

Office hours: 8-5, 
Mon. - Fri.

Garage Sales ran

t

Three Family Garage Sale: Kitchen 
things, clothes, lots of baby clothes 
and stroller and car seat, much 
more! Sat., June 11, Extension 
Homemakers Clubroom, 9 a.m. - 
lp.m.
S32-ltp

3 FAMILY RUMMAGE SALE:
Friday, June 10 and Sat., June 11, 
1018 Blodgett Dr. Mrs. LM . 
Womble.
S32' 11 "CLASSIFIED RATES 

Regular.. . .  Per Word $0.13 
Display. . .  Per col. lnch-$4.20 

Double rate for blind ads 
Minimum charges

Cash............ $4.00
Charge.............. $4,50

CASH IN ADVANCE ADS 
•Work wanted* •Trailers for Sale* 
•Business Opportunites* »No 
longf Responsible* ‘ Political 
Advertising* ‘ Child Care* 
•Baby sitting* ‘ Garage Sales* 
•Out-of county Ads unless ad 
vertiser has established credit 
'with *The Spearman Reporter*

DEADLINES
To place or cancel ads
Friday - 12:00 p.m_____Sunday
edition.
Tuesday . 12:00 p.m. . .
.Thursday edition 

The Spearman Reporter re­
serves the right to reject, edit, 
revise and properly classify all 
advertising submitted for publi 
cation. The Spearman Reporter 
also reserves the right to cancel 
any advertisement at any time. 
TOE SPEARM AN REPORTER 

213 Main, P.O. Box 458 .'
Spearman, Texas 79081

Regency 98, $650 or best offer, call 
659-2301.
S32 3tp

FOR SALE: 1977 Pontiac, 4 dr $700. 
659-2049 between 7 & 10 p.m. 
S32-3tp

FOR SALE: 1980 Chevy Station 
Wagon runs good 659-3181 or 705 
Wilbanks.
S32-ltp

FOR SALE: An extra length sofa in 
excellent condition and two chairs 
for living room. Call 659-2885. 
S31S-2tp

HALF PRICE1 Flashing ariuw 
signs $2991 Lighted, non-arrow 
$289! Unlighted $249! Free letters! 
See locally. Call today! Factory: 
1(800)423-0163, anytime.

FOR SALE: 1982 Buick Riveria. 
very clean, fully loaded, daytime 
call 659 2036 after 6 p.m. cajl 
659-2497.
S32 2tp

( For Rem rtflf

ROUND BALE 
HAULING

$3 ~

f
FOR RENT: 2 bedroom, furnished 
trailer. Call 659-3017 or 323 Town 
send.
S32-2tp

TRAILER SPACE FOR RENT: 
Fenced yards, underground utili­
ties, concrete walks and patio. 
Close to high school and swimming 
pool. Call 435-6640 or 435-5080. 
S19S-rtn

for one mile 
Mike Skinner 

659-2129

NOTICE TO BIDDERS

Sealed bids for the sale of a 
1976 CHEVROLET TYPE I AM 
BULANCE. built by SOUTHERN 
AMBULANCE, will be received by 
the City of Spearman until 2:00 
p.m., September 22, 1988, and 
then publicly opened and read.

The City reserves the right to 
reject any or all bids, to waive 
formalities, and to accept the bid 
deemed to be the most advanta­
geous to the City. All bids received 
after the closing hour will be 
returned unopened.

Information and bidding docu­
ments nlay be secured from the 
office oflthe City Manager, P.O. 
Box 37,»pearman, Texas 79081. 
S32&33||'sonly

NOTICE OF HEARING

Hansford County Commissioners 
Court will hear requests for the 
1989 Budget year at its regular 
meeting June 13, 1988, and discuss 
the budget it expects to adopt at its 
regular meeting in July, 1988.

The proposed budget includes a 
5% pay raise for all elected officers 
and regular employees.

Roy L. McClellan 
Hansford County Judge

ltc-T only

SERVICES

Need yards to mow for the sum­
mer. Satisfaction guaranteed. Call 
659-5162.
S31 4tp

REPAIR on vacuum cleaners and 
appliances. Call 659-3301. j
S19S-rtn

LOST

LOST: One large white female dog.
great pyranese. reward call 659­
3265.

L .F E  IS YOUR MOST 
VALUABLE POSSESSION.

PASS IT ON.O f all the riches you could leave to your family, the most precious is the gift of life. Your bequest to the American Heart Association assures that priceless legacy by supporting research into heart disease prevention
WERE FIGHTING FOR 
MOURLIFE

American Heart 
Association
Texas Affiliate

?Local Happening? 
Special Event? 
Club M eeting?
If it s important to you, 

it's important to us.

Let us know about your event 
and well do our best to get you 

the publicity it deserves both before and after.

Call 659-3434 Today!
The Spearman Reporter 
The Gruver Statesman

Y

The Hansford Plainsman
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By Helen Fisher

Jesse Davit spent two days this 
week presenting his fourth genera 
tion wisdom to 4 month old M ikala 
Murley, great granddaughter of 
Dorothy and Jesse Davis.

Their granddaughter and hus­
band, Tanya and Scott Murley 
brought Mikala to meet her great- 
grandparents.

The Murleys are from Naples, 
Flor. and visited other grand­
parents at Memphis, Panhandle

STATEMENT OF INTENT 
TO CHANGE RATES

GTE Southwest Incorporated, in 
accordance with the Rules of the 
Public Utility Commission of Texas, 
hereby gives notice of the Compa ny's 
intent to implement a new schedule 
of rates in Texas, effective July 6, 
1988 This proceeding has been 
previously docketed by the Com­
mission as Docket No 5610.
The proposed changes in rates will 
affect approximately 970,500 of 
the Company's Texas customers 
who represent all classes of 
customers subscribing to the 
Company's local exchange and 
foreign exchange services within 
the State of Texas, as well as all 
entities subscribing to the Com­
pany's billing and collection 
services within the state. The 
proposed changes ip rates are 
designed to i/lcrease the Company's 
intrastate revenues by $81,407,000, 
or approximately 11 8 percent 
annually.
Persons who wish to intervene or 
otherwise participate in these 
proceedings should notify the 
Commission as soon as possible. A 
request to intervene, participate, or 
for further information should be 
mailed to the Public Utility Com­
mission of Texas, 7800 Shoal Creek 
Boulevard, Suite 400N, Austin, 
Texas 78757. Further information 
may also be obtained by calling the 
Public Utility Commission Con­
sumer Aftairs Division at (512) 
458-0223, (512) 458-0227, or 
(512) 458-0221 teletypewriter for 
the deaf.
A complete set of revised rate 
schedules has been filed with the 
Public Utility Commission at Austin, 
Texas, and is available for public 
inspection in each of the Com­
pany's Business Offices in the State 
of Texas. A summary of the 
Company's rate filing has also been 
sent to the Mayor's office of each 
affected Municipality.

GTE Southwest 
Incorporated

and Moreland, Okla.

L a rry  and Ty Hodge, father and 
son team representing the Texas 
Highways Publication have been at 
the J.B. Buchanan place for a 
couple of days. They were taking 
pictures and interviewing J.B. for 
an article for the magazine.

Some classes from Stinnett 
school have been at the Buchanans 
for a field trip to learn about the 
windmills.

Another guest of the Buchanans, 
though not to photograph the 
windmills, is Mrs. Buchanan's 
sister, Faye Schweitzer. She is 
from Bedonda Beach, Cal. and is 
here for several days stay.

Greg Plazlewood and his son, 
Nicholas, of Hereford were here 
several days last week with his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Paul Hazle-
wood.

Ina Martin is back at home now 
after being seriously ill in High 
Plains Baptist Hospital with a heart 
condition. She is making slow 
recovery, but looking forward to 
better health.

Paul and Liz Loftin and son, 
Roudette, were in Spearman over 
the weekend. Paul was greeted by 
many old friends, being well 
remembered in spite of the many 
years since he lived here.

He visited his mother, Mrs. 
Hazel Loftin, of the Hansford 
Manor and the Fred Holts and 
other relatives.

Information from Sheila Watley 
is that she is recovering from 
serious back surgery and may be 
home this coming weekend. Andy 
Watley, her husband, has been in 
Houston also where she is in 
Methodist Hospital.

Her recovery is expected to be 
lengthy.

Cleo and Lowell Denman hosted 
the Gill family reunion at their 
home over the weekend.

All enjoyed attending the old 
settlers reunion at the Crawford 
Motor Company and the parade on 
Saturday.

Cleo, her brothers and sister, all 
finished high school here. The 
oldest, Aaron Gill, has had some 
heart problems and was unable to 
make the trip from Glendale. Ariz.

Those attending the reunion 
were: Cleo’ s sister, Chloe and 
husband, Carroll Cone, Black Can­
yon City, Ariz.; her brother, Paul 
Gill, his daughter, Twyla and 
husband, Dennis Wright, all of 
Batesville. Ark.; Cleo's daughter.

NEWSPAPERS No. 1
No Comparison 
In All-Around  
Use For Service

Newspapers are increasing their overwhelming 
leadership in media . . . because they have the 
best formula for service. Failure to recognize 
the effectiveness of newspaper advertising has 
destroyed many a business.

*r *r ★  ★

THE FACTS:
1) 8 out o f 10 adults read a newspaper on an average 

weekday
2) Newspaper readership increases with income
3) Newspapers are read page-by page
4) Newspaper ads are rated by the public as the “ most 

helpful and most trustworthy”
5) People “ look forward”  to newspaper ads more than 

they do all others combined
6) Newspapers outperform broadcast media 2-to-l in 

influencing sales
7) Most leading retailers carry their main messages in 

the newspaper
8) Newspapers are alone in delivering massive coverage 

and having something important to say to-and 
about all income groups, all education groups, all 
occupational groups and all age groups.

. . . and each o f these facts has been documented over- 
and-over by an endless variety o f surveys.

(SOURCE: Bureau of Advertising)
Prepared b y  Texas Newspaper A d v e rtis in g  B ureau  (T N A B ) 

An affiliate ot the Texas Press Association

Win With The Leader 
Newspaper Advertising

Dora Kate and husband. Lovell 
Lee, Amarillo; and a cousin, Fran­
ces and Roy Kindsfather, Sayre, 
Okla.

Verlin Beck is still on crutches and 
brace as a result of a leg injury 
more than a week ago. He and his 
son, Edward, were in the Canadian 
River Breaks, and some distance 
from his pick-up, when he, in an 
unusual circumstance, twisted his 
knee out of joint. Before they eould 
reach the pick-up, he fell and 
injured it more seriously.

His sons are wondering if it is 
just a coincidence that he timed hia 
incapacity just before all the har­
vest workl

Having good reason for un­
expected optimism is Tommy Rus­
sell. He has been in St. Anthony's 
Hospital expecting to have heart 
surgery, and was relieved to learn 
it was not required.

He has returned home and 
expects to return to work in the 
near future.

Leaving Monday after several 
days visiting his sister, Maxine 
Banister was Don Williams. He is 
from LaHabra, Cali.

Another guest of Mrs. Banister 
was Margaret Amerman, also of 
LaHabra.

The W.Y. Williams family re­
union was held here over the past 
weekend. On Saturday evening 
they held a cookout at the Home 
Demonstration Building.

Sunday morning there was a ten 
o'clock brunch, also at the Home 
Demonstration Building. At two 
o’ clock Sunday afternoon, a private 
luncheon was held at the Cattle­
mans.

Most of the out of town members 
are former Spearman residents. 
Those attending were: Mr. and 
Mrs. Earl Kenny, Thadine Cooper 
and Kristen Cooper, Tim Kenny, 
all of Amarillo.

Jason and Jessica Beck, Perry- 
ton; Mr. and Mrs. Dub Dowd, St 
Jo, Texas; Mr. and Mrs. Gil 
Lybrook, Wolforth; Helen Kenny, 
Albuquerque; Mr. and Mrs. Bryon 
Kenny, Texline.

Mr. and Mrs. Lonnie Ray Ken­
ny, Umbarger; Alan M inchew, 
Dallas; Mr. and Mrs. Edward Beck 
and sons, Mrs. Helen Minchew all 
of Lubbock; Don Williams, Mar­
garet Amerman, LaHabra, Ca.

Those attending from Spearman 
were Marie Beck, Mr. and Mrs. 
Verlin Beck and sons; Mr. and 
Mrs. Ronnie Beck; Mr. and Mrs. 
Gerald Beck; Maxine Banister and 
Ira Tindall.

Shown here are the hones and their riders who 
participated in the Round Up Parade laal Saturday. 
Winning prizes in that division were Jennifer

Schnell, winning first place, Brandon Sutton taking 
second place and J amie Sutton, placing third.

Specialist cautions of 
hot, humid weather

Lometa and James Sparks re­
turned Friday from a busy 10 days 
down state. On May 28 they 
attended the wedding of their 
grandson, Robert James Sparks to 
Kimberly Ann Scanlan at College 
Station.

Robert James recently received 
his Master's degree with a 4 point 
average. He and Ann will both be 
teaching at A & M.

Among those attending the wed­
ding were Thelma Vaughn, former 
resident of Spearman, and her 
family.

The Sparks then visited at Can­
yon Lake with Anne and Larry 
Sparks; at Satler with grand­
daughter, Lee Ann and Mark 
Norris; in San Antonio with Carol 
and Evan Sparks and Jerry Sparks; 
at Austin with Lometa's sister, 
Dixie and John Gill.

Hot, humid weather which 
typifies Texas summers can be 
dangerous to your health, partic­
ularly if you work outdoors.

Outdoor workers often suffer 
from such physical disorders as 
heatstroke, heat exhaustion, heat 
cramps and fainting, said Thomas 
D. Valeo, safety specialist with the 
Texas A&M University Agri­
cultural Extension Service.

Such disorders occur most often 
when workers do not take time to 
adjust to the heat, Valeo said. 
Summer hot spells, the first few 
days of work for new workers, and 
the first day back on the job after a

tClub New&\
GLADIOLA FLOWER CLUB 

By Dorothy Haner

The Gladiola Flower Club met 
Thursday in the country home of 
Wanda Brown. Wanda Brown 
introduced Mrs. Wanda Reed of 
the Blackburn Flower Basket who 
presented a very interesting pro­
gram on fixing potted greenery in 
baskets and adding fresh flowers 
and ribbon bows and adding 
interest to arrangements.

Winner in the arrangement of 
flowers category with pink peonie's 
was Dorothy Haner.

Wanda Brown won the specimen 
category with a white rose and the 
potted plant with a large jade 
plant.

Wanda Brown read a report from 
Gwen Smith about the work day at 
the Hansford Manor. The garden 
was cleaned and plants planted to 
replace those which had not sur­
vived .

Ann Flowers, president, called 
the meeting to order. Roll was 
called and answered with “ My 
Favorite Color.’ ’

Wanda Brown gave a very 
interesting report on Dolly Payne 
Todd Madison. Refreshments were 
enjoyed by the following members: 
Mrs. Charlsie Baker, Dorothy Buz­
zard, Mrs. Rose Cummings, Mrs. 
Betty Davis, Mrs. Margarette 
Evans, Mrs. Ann Flowers, Mrs. 
Dorothy Haner, Mrs. Virginia 
Head, Mrs. Lorene Kunselman, 
and hostess Mrs. Wanda Brown.

The June (6th meeting will be in 
the home of Mrs. Dorothy Haner at 
721 Cotter Drive.

ORDERA 
BANANA SPLIT. 

GETA 
BUNCH OFF.

9 9 'Fresh, delicious bananas. Your favorite fruit toppings: strawberry, pineapple, and chocolate. And plenty of whipped topping, too! No one makes ’em like DQ-and they’re on sale now!
THIS IS<®>C0UNTRY

• (tag T U M I. D .O .C « »  »  I W h  D Q OttCoun 'A lp U C Ip U in g D W V  O u M n IW M

vacation or illness are likely to be 
times when workers suffer the 
most from heat-related problems.

The combination of high temper­
atures and high relative humidity 
can be especially dangerous, said 
the safety specialist.

For example, a temperature of 
100 degrees F. and a relative 
humidity of 50 percent have the 
same effect on the body as if the 
temperature reached 120 degrees. 
The human body cools itself by the 
evaporation of perspiration but 
high relative humidity retards 
evaporation of perspiration from 
the skin, Valso said.

To avoid potential health pro­
blems during the hot summer 
weather, he offered these sug­
gestions for farmers and ranchers 
and others who work outdoors:

--Rest periodically in a cool 
place; rest is most beneficial when 
breaks are short but frequent.

- Drink fluids every 15 to 20 
minutes. Water intake must equal 
perspiration loss, so drink more 
than enough to satisfy thirst. Rely

O b itu a ry

on meals to replace salt.
- Wear loose garments of thin 

cotton fabric to enhance air cir­
culation near the skin and to allow 
body heat to escape.

--Slow down work speed or 
distribute the workload evenly over 
the course of the day.

•-If possible, postpone non­
essential work for cooler periods.

--Transfer workers to help from 
other jobs or obtain extra helpers. 
Younger and more physically fit 
workers might take over.

• Where possible, shield workers 
from equipment heat sources, use 
exhaust fans near heat sources, 
and provide open windows and 
cooling fans for maximum air flow 
around individuals.

- Provide maximum opportun­
ities for outside workers to work in
well ventilated, shaded ureas.. **

Fairbanks-Vera 
to be wed

Malissa Jan Fairbanks, daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Raymond Fair­
banks and William Vera, son of 

Mr. and Mrs. Pete Vera Sr. are to 
be united in marriage on June 19. 
united in marriage on June 11.

The ceremony will be at four 
p.m. at the First Christian Church 
of Gruver. The public is invited to 
attend. There will be a reception 
following the wedding.

Gilman Flowers
Gilman Flowers, 82, died June 2.
Services were June 4 in the First 

Baptist Church with the Rev. Jack 
Lee, pastor, and the Rev. Clayton 
Watkins, former pastor, o ffi­
ciating. Burial was in Canadian 
Cemetery by Stickley-Hill Funeral 
Home.

Mr. Flowers was a member of 
First Baptist Church and a long­
time Hemphill County fanner and 
rancher.

Survivors include his wife, Lois; 
three sons, Joe Flowers of Gage, 
Okla., Roy Flowers of Spearman, 
and Wayne Flowers of Canadian; 
five daughters, Frances Newell of 
Canadian, Zella Meeks of Richard­
son, Pat Schaef of Boswell, Okla., 
Vickie Bolin of Dallas, and Dixie 
Cook of Canadian; three brothers, 
Cep bus Flowers of Tulia, Travis 
Flowers of Perryton, and Clem 
Flowers of Amarillo; a sister, Lottie

Portwood of Perryton; 21 grand­
children; and seven great-grand­
children.

Catherine Elisabeth Davie
Catherine Elizabeth Davis, 78, 

died June 3 in Amarillo.
Services were held at the First 

Baptist Church in Borger, on 
Monday. Burial was at Weatlawn 
Memorial Park in Borger.

Mrs. Davis, born in Verona, 
Mo., was a Borger resident since 
1928. She was a housewife and a 
member of the First Baptist 
Church. Her husband, Glover D. 
“ Red”  Davia, died in 1981 and a 
son, Kenneth Dale Davis, died in 
1969.

Survivors include two sons, 
Devoe Davis of Borger and Travis 
Davis of Spearman; a daughter, 
Bobbye Eloyce Harper of Amarillo; 
11 grandchildren; and 13 great­
grandchildren.

Through heat waves 
and cold spells

insulation helps you save

insulation can  help you use less electricity 
throughout the year. In the winter, It helps keep the 
heated air In your house. During hot weather. It 
keeps the hot air out.

With insulation, your home Is more comfortable, 
and your heating and cooling systems don't have 
to work as hard during weather extremes.

To learn more about putting Insulation to work (or 
you, visit or call your local TNP office today.

.J^Texas-N ew M exico  
Power Company.
Neqhbor* MVaBOfUto Offer** Hiv Tfte Ben Ounce

*


