
Mrs. Mark (Linda Gale) White

Visits 20 Panhandle Cities

Left to right: Pete Fisher, Mrs. Fisher, Linda Gale White 

and Dfcbhie Hanna at Spearman, Tuesda>

As chairwoman of the Wo­
men's Organization for Mark 
White (WOW), Mrs. White has 
already traveled thousands of 
miles to campaign on behalf of 
her husband.

Hospital News
Patients at Hansford Hospital 

are Rav Pracher, Katina Statum 
and Mae Ballard.

Dismissed were Clara Jack- 
son. Margaritta Burch and son,

Nancy Durden. Shelly Cook. 
Hattie Mackie. Genne Womble. 
Eljuana Eaton. Maria Avila.

T. 6. «  T. 

Moonlight Nadn«ts 

talo --This srosk, 

and Saturday night...

MARKETS

AUSTIN, Texas-Mrs. Mark 
(Linda gale) White will visit 20
Panh»miU cities in a three-da,
tour which starts Tuesday Aug.

Mrs Mark White visited 
Tuesday, August IT with sup­
porters at the Hansford County 
Courthouse.

As chairwoman o f the 
W om en’ s Organization for 
Mark White (WOW), Mrs. 
White has already traveled 
thousands of miles to campaign 
on behalf of her husband.

Tuesday activities begin with 
a visit to Dalhart. She will also 
stop at Stratford, Spearman. 
Perryton, Canadian and Pampa 
on Tuesday.

Wednesday. Mrs. White will 
travel to Borger, Dumas. Chan- 
ning, Vega. Hereford and Dim­
mit.

Mrs. White will meet with 
friends and supporters in Tulia. 
Canyon. Panhandle, Claude, 
Clarendon. Wellington, Child­
ress and Memphis on Thurday 
before returning to Austin.

And, she said. " I  look 
forward to visiting with all our 
Panhandle friends on this trip."

Alvin Byers, Pete Herrera. Faye 
Hickerson, Glee Rae. Diane 
Brewer, Pam Edwards. Hermo- 
sillo, Irwin Williams and Ola 
Jackson.

Wheat $3.12
Com 2.95
Milo 4.25
Barley 2.03
Soy Beans 4.95

Dick Elbert u new dealer for Steiger Tractor

New  Steiger T ra c to r  D e a le r  N a m e d
Dick Elbert. North Plains 

International, Inc., Spearman. 
Texas, has been named a dealer 
for Steiger Tractor, Inc.

North Plains International 
will now be able to offer a full 
line-up of high-horsepower.

four-wheel-drive tractors to 
farmers in the North Plains 
area.

North Plains International 
was selected because of its 
proven commitment to service 
and sales excellence, according

to Steiger district manager 
John Dale Weaver.

"W e are very pleased to be 
able to offer Steiger tractors," 
Dick Elbert, owner, North 
Plains International, said, 
"Steiger has built an outstand­

ing reputation for quality a- 
mong farmers all over the 
U.S....ali over the world for that 
matter. We expect a lot of 
interest and inquiries from 
farmers in the area."

Steiger Tractor, Inc. is head­
quartered in Fargo. N.D.

Angela Lesly to 
crown Miss 
Wheatheart

Angela Lesly to crown Mto Wheatheart

United 
hosts free 
breakfast

^our United Super Market at 
Perryton is inviting you to 
breakfast "on the house" Sat­
urday.

It is United’s way of showing 
appreciation for the patronage 
of folks in the area and is an 
annual event staged with the 
help of Perryton Jaycees.

All you have to do is show up 
at the parking lot. 901 S. Ash 
between 6 and 8 a.m., Saturday 
for bacon, eggs, rolls, juice, 
coffee-all the good stuff that 
makes a tasty, aromatic High 
Plains breakfast.

The United invite is the same:
“ Y’all come, now!”

School

Registration
High School registration will 

be Friday, August 27. Principal 
Eddy Clemmons states that due 
to so many changes in courses, 
all students need to be present 
for orientation and final sche­
dules.

Seniors will register from 8 to 
10 a m., Friday 27, Juniors. 10 
to 1 p.m.; Sophomores. 1 to 2:30 
p m. and Freshmen 2:30 to 4
p.m.

New students may register at
.■high school August 16 thru 

20 or at the regular registration
August 27.

Kenneth Friemel. new junior 
high principal asks that new 
students to the district register
at junior high Friday, August 27
any time.

The rest o f the janior high
students will register Monday, 
August 30.

Elementary students, kinder­
garten through 4th grade will 
register Friday, August 27 from 
8:30 to 11:30 a.m.

All new elementary students 
to the district should register 
Aug. 23 and Aug. 24 from 9 
until 2:30 each day, according to 
elementary principal Allen Al­
ford.

The annual Miss Wheatheart 
pageant will be held Friday, 
August 20. in the auditorium of 
Perryton High School at 8 p.m.

Angela Lesly, of Spearman, 
last year's first runner-up, will 
open the show with a number 
from the musical "Oklahoma." 
She will be opening the pageant 
and crowning the 1982 Miss 
Wheatheart. as Miss Wheat- 
heart 1981 Lori White will be 
competing in San Antonio for 
the 1982 Miss Texas title.

Cost of tickets are $3 for 
adults. SI.50 for students and 
children under 6 will be admit­
ted free.

An elaborate stage setting 
has been designed for the 1982 
pageant by state coordinator 
and director, Lou Givens.

Entertainment for the even­
ing will be “ Up With People". 
Several members of the cast 
which will be performing the 
following night will be on hand 
to provide pageant entertain­
ment.

Emcee for the evening will be 
Miss America 1975, Shirley 
Cothran of Denton. Since she 
was crowned Miss America, she 
has traveled extensively meet­
ing people and making many 
personal appearances. She has 
been the featured subject of a 
national billboard campaign, 
served as spokesman for Wes- 
tinghouse, and has appeared on 
many variety and talk shows 
across the United States.

She has earned her master’ s 
degree in guidance and counsel­
ing, and a doctorate degree in 
early childhood education. Cur­
rently, Shirley serves as a 
trustee for the Denton Indepen­
dent School District. Her travels 
include many youth conferences 
and evangelistic crusades, local 
and state Miss America preli­
minary pageants, educational

conferences and other television 
appearances.

The winner will receive SI000 
scholarship, first runner-up 
$500 and second runner-up 
S250. The winner will be 
presented with a loving cup 
trophy. Third and fourth run­
ners-up will receive gifts.

Miss Hansford County,

Suzanne Hart of Gruver, will be 
among 13 beauties competing 
for the Miss Wheatheart title. 
The brown hair, brown eyed 
17-year old is the daughter of

Mr. and Mrs. Jon Hart of 
Gruver and is being sponsored 
by the Xi Zeta Upsilon Chapter 
of Beta Sigma Phi of Spearman.

City o f Spearman 
to support Extra 
Special, Special

L y n x  S crim m a g e  

G u y m o n  F rid a y

Spearman will again be one of 
the 34 cities taking part in the 
Panhandle segment of the Jerry 
Lewis Labor Day Telethon, with 
their own Pledge Center located 
at the Fire Department.

Vicky Bullard is serving as 
coordinator for the Spearman 
Pledge Center which will be 
open throughout the Telethon 
from 8:00 p.m. Sunday, Sep­
tember 5th until 6:30 p.m. 
Monday, September 6th A 
special phone number. 659- 
5577, has been assigned for use 
by the people of Spearman, to 
phone in their pledges. Local 
coverage of Spearman Activi­
ties will be on Cable Channel 6 
and KRDF FM Radio.

Originating from Las Vegas, 
the 22‘/j hour TV Marathon is 
held to benefit the medical 
services and research programs 
of the Muscular Dystrophy 
Association (MDA). Telephone 
pledges and donations made 
through the Spearman Pledge 
Center, to be manned around 
the clock by the Rotary Club and 
Fire Department, will be credit­
ed to the citizens throughout the 
telethon.

The Panhandle show will 
again be broadcast by KFDA- 
TV 10 in Amarillo and will 
feature Mark Robertson-Baker 
»nd Ken Baierl as emcees. They 
will interview patients from 
pledge center towns, and will 
recognize various fund-raisers 
throughout the Panhandle, in 
addition to first-hand-reports of 
pledge center activities.

Watch Cable Channel 6 for 
Day to Day Activity Updates 
prior to September 5.

home fire
A Gruver couple. Tim and 

Teresa Barkley, suffered a fire 
in their home in the Harris 
addition Sunday on the eve of 
the start of their vacation.

Quick and expert action on 
the part of the members of the 
Gruver Volunteer Fire Depart­
ment held damage to the 
dwelling to a minimum but the 
couple suffered the loss of their 
pet Cocker Spaniel from smoke 
inhalation.

Mrs. Barkley reportedly left 
work early to get a head start on 
last minute preparations for the 
annual summer vacation. Find­
ing her house filled with smoke, 
she phoned the Gruver Fire 
Department.

Cause of the conflagration 
had not been determined at 
press time.

The Barkleys moved into a 
vacant dwelling as a temporary 
home while investigation and 
repair is underway at their 
house.

City Manager A.J. Ratliff had 
profuse praise for the firefight­
ers who responded to the call 
Sunday. Ratliff cited the speed 
and skill of these men as the 
reason fire damage was closely 
contained at the Barkley home.

The Spearman Lynx are get­
ting ready for their first scrim­
mage of the year. They will be 
going up against the tough 
Guymon team at Guymon. The 
game is expected to begin at 6 
p.m.

Head Coach Larry 
Lanier has optimism for this 
season. His coaching staff and 
himself have been working hard 
with the Lynx Freshmen, Jr. 
Varsity and Varsity players-to- 
be. The “ official" roster for the 
Lynx has not yet been printed or 
released. During this first 
scrimmage, Coach Lanier will 
see which guys deserve to be on 
the varsity, on the Jr. Varsity 
and so on. Y'all go on over to 
Guymon and cheer on the boys^

They need all the 
support they can get from (heir 
local fans, let's not let them 
down. One way to show how 
proud we are of them is to show 
up at Guymon and cheer them 
on.

Then next Friday, August 27, 
the Lynx will be hosts to White 
Deer-at Lynx Stadium begin­
ning at 6 p.m. Once again, you 
as a fan will be able to cheer on 
the guys and prove to them that 
we are “ behind them all the 
way".

But this year, the Lynx will be 
taking the season-‘ ‘one game 
at a time". So first thing is first 
and the first scrimmage of the 
season will be this Friday, 
August 20, at Guymon begin­
ning at 6 p.m.

The Lynx-all three teams- 
have been working out in their 
pads and so forth. Each mem­

ber doing his duty is what 
Coach Lanier and his coaching 
staff are asking for. Make the 
trip and the Lynx will make the 
effort to look good at their first 
scrimmage. Guymon is suppose 
to have a pretty good team this 
year.

Formtr Rusidtirt 
Buriud Tuesday
Funeral services for a former 

Spearman resident, Sophia 
Birdwell Fuller, 59, were con­
ducted at 3 p.m., Tuesday, from 
the Oxnard Funeral Chapel, 
Oxnard, Calif.

Burial was in Ivy Lawn 
Cemetery, Ventura, Calif.

Bom Oct. 9, 1922 at Lamesa, 
she came to Spearman as an 
infant when her parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Ruben Birdwell 
moved here.

For most of her married life 
she had lived in the Oxnard 
Ventura area of California.

She is survived by her 
husband, Doug; a daughter, 
Sharon Karvosik; a son. Bill 
Mallory -  both of California; 
sisters Claudia Georgia, Doris 
McKay and Jackie Sickling, 
Crum, Texas and five grand­
children.

She is also survived by many 
nieces and nephews in Califor­
nia and cousins in this area. 
Here, survivors include Mrs. 
Earl (Hollie) Riley, Spearman 
and Mrs. Edith Ferguson, Stin­
nett.
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The Arts A Crafts Guild met 
Fhdav. August 13 in the home 
of Margaret Gibner.

Attending were Athalie Tray- 
ler. Freda Sheets. Sada Hos­
kins. Deta Blodgett. Annie

Arts & Craft Guild Meets
Allen. Georgia Holt. Aileen 
White. Jewel Turner. Lemmie 
Russell, and Blanche Fuller.

The meeting Friday. Aug. 20 
will be in the home of Sada 
Hoskins.

Mrs. Annie Allen Honored on 
80th Birthday

ATTENTION LIVESTOCK PRODUCERS:

CATTLEMAN*S LIVESTOCK COMMISSION CO.
Box SO, Dalhart, TX 79022 

Phone 1806) 249-5505
4 miles West of Dalhart on HWY 54.

* Hog Sale every Wednesday
* Starts at 10:00 a.m.
* Cattle Sale every Friday at NOON

MARKET REPORT 
HOG MARKET

WEDNESDAY, AUGUST 11
Sold 220 Hogs
Top Hogs $60.50 to $61.50
Sows $45 to $51
Boars $40 to $42.50

CATTLE MARKET 
FRIDAY, AUGUST 13 

Sold 2351 Cattle on a very active market.
Butcher Cows

On the occasion of her 
eightieth birthday, Annie A, 
(Mrs. Garrett) Allen, was ho­
nored with a reception on 
August eighth, in the Fellow­
ship Hall of the First United 
Methodist Church. Guests were 
registered from three until 
four-thirty. The table was dra­
ped with pink over a white 
tablecloth. Colors were taken 
from Mrs Allen’s favorite 
painting of pink roses. Table 
appointments were silver and 
crystal.

Refreshments of punch, cof­
fee and birthday cake were 
served to out-of-town guests 
Mrs. Naomi Rutz and Mrs. Vera 
Pitts. Booker; Mr. and Mrs. 
Earl Waide, Perryton; Mrs. 
Maude McClellan and Mrs.

Jennie Hart, Mr. and Mrs 
Donnie Thoreson, Gruver, Mr. 
and Mrs. James F. George. 
Ginny and Gail. Mr. and Mrs 
Dan O’ Brien, all o f Amarillo, 
Mr. and Mrs. Bob G. Phillips 
and Bob Allen. Pampa, and Mr. 
and Mrs. Vernon King, Gene 
and David. Seagrove, North 
Carolina; Mr. and Mrs. Bill 
Nash. Beaver. Oklahoma, Mrs 
Roger Nash and Anna Alexis. 
Hampton. Virginia, Mr. and 
Mrs Elden Allen, Amarillo and 
Dr. and Mrs. Glenn Keim. 
Kerry Anne and Kyle, Clovis. 
New Mexico.

During the calling hours, 
many friends and relatives 
gathered to visit and wish Mrs. 
Allen ’Happy Birthday". Gifts 
of floral arrangements and 
plants added to the occasion.

OurHcrikje <f
Butcher Bulls 
Heiferettes 
Cutting Bulls 
Feeder Steers

Feeder Heifers 
Steer Calves

Heifer Calves

600 to 700 lbs. 
700 to 800 lbs. 
800 to 900 lbs. 
500 to 700 lbs. 
300 to 400 lbs. 
400 to 500 lbs. 
300 to 400 lbs. 
400 to 500 lbs.

$34 to $46 
$44 to $54
$45 to $59 
$57 to $61 

$65 to $69.75 
$64 to $68.SO 
$63 to $66.50 

$57 to $63 
$70 to $85 
$65 to $75 
$57 to $65 
$57 to $63

Faith Lutheran members 
greet you in the Lord’s name. 
Most often we take hope for 
granted when it is well with us. 
This Sunday the sermon will 
dwell on hope when it seems 
hopeless. The sermon title is: 
HOPE WILL NOT DISSAPOINT 
US. I Kings 19:4-8.

Sunday School is at 9:45 a.m 
Worship is at 10:45 a.m. with 

Holy Communion.
Attend the church of your 

choice. Visitors are most wel­
come to study and worship with 
us. especially you without a 
church home.

Bruno Gaskamp. Pastor

Mike and Kathy Brown, 
former residents of Spearman, 
now living in Woodward, Okla . 
are proud to announce the 
arrival of their new son, 
Cameron Lee Brown He was 
born July 31 and weighed 9 lbs. 
5% oz. and was 22 inches long. 
He joins a brother. Dusty. 3'A. 
in the home.

Maternal grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. Walter Kingham 
and paternal grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. James H. Brown, 
all of Spearman.

Maternal great-grandmother 
is Mrs. Leona Bewley of Dun­
can. Okla.

Paternal great-grandmother 
is Mrs. Omah Brown, Sayre, 
Okla.

Hunter Safety 
Program 
Set Here

Hunter Safety Instructors 
Dwight Sumner, Wayne Cum­
mings and Jim Beeson will be 
offering a Texas Hunter Safety 
Program Saturday August 28th 
at the Boy Scout Hall, begin 
ning at 8:00 a.m. The program 
is an eight hour course with a 
break for lunch. There will be a 
$1.00 registration fee.

The Texas Hunter Safety 
Program was initiated in 1971 
and was designed primarily for 
the young hunter. However, all 
interested persons are invited to 
participate in the classes. There 
are many benefits enjoyed by a 
graduate of the Texas Hunter 
Safety program.

The student successfully 
completing the course is well 
versed in the basics of firearms 
handling and responsibility, 
hunter ethics, survival, conser­
vation. archery and muzzle 
loading.

Each successful student 12 
years of age or older is issued a 
hunter safety card from the 
Texas Parks and Wildlife De­
partment. Permanent course 
completion records are main­
tained in Austin.

Second Annual Arts 
& Crafts Show Set

WE WANT TO CONTRACT CATTLE FOR 
FALL DELIVERY CONTACT LARRY WING.

WE NEED YOUR COWS & BULLS IN THE 
DAY BEFORE THE AUCTION IN ORDER TO 
COMPLY WITH FEDERAL AND STATE REGU­
LATIONS AS TO BLOOD TESTING. THE STATE 
OF TEXAS PAYS FOR THIS TESTING.

WE ARE NOW OFFERING A SELL & BUY 
BACK PLAN FOR CATTLE.

WOULD LIKE TO LEASE RANCH, YEAR 
ROUND BASIS.

Once In A Lifetim e Opportunity

WE ARE THE DEALERS FOR THE NECK- 
OVER TRAILERS.

LARRY WING, MANAGER, RES. 806 249-2402
Kenneth Knight. Asst. Manager 806-384-2136
Craig Lawrence. Yd. Foreman 806-384-2153

FIELD REPRESENTATIVES:
George Wall. Clayton. N.M. 505-374-9550
Greg Wade. Canyon, TX 806-655-3409

The local committee for 
Hansford County History Vol­
ume 2 has received the first of 
the family stories for proofing, 
already the "Special Pages”  
have been proofed and returned 
to the publisher.

The publisher is allowing us 
to accept orders for books until 
the final proofs are returned for 
publication. When that time 
comes, book sales will be 
closed. All books must be 
pre-ordered and paid in ad­
vance, this will be the number 
of books to be printed. If you 
have not alreadv ordered the 
"collectors item” , or if family 
members or friends have been 
left out, do not wait and miss 
out on this once-in-a-lifetime 
opportunity! Already when a 
copy of Volume I Hansford 
County History is made avail-

. u u u r n m .

able for sale by someone who 
purchased more than one copy, 
this book sells for tSO.OO to 
$60.00. The original cost was 
$35.00 in 1980. Act now, order 
this second publication today 

Hansford County Volume 2 
contains 562 family stories; a 
memorial and tribute section, 
business histories; organiza­
tions; new county history not 
contained in Volume I; and a 
comprehensive index for both 
volumes. It promises to be a 
book with approximately the 
same number of pages as 
Volume I, IF ENOUGH OR­
DERS FOR BOOKS ARE RE-

or money to Stationmaster’ s 
House Museum, Spearman; 
Hansford County Library, 
Spearman; Sylvia Robertson, 
515 Archer, Spearman; Ada 
Joyce Stedje, Gruver (she has 
placed an envelope at Gruver 
Drug for this purpose). Gift 
certificates are available. These 
books would make fine Christ­
mas gifts or birthday gifts for 
family members.

Cost of Volume 2 Hansford 
County History is $46.20 includ­
ing tax; add $3.00 if you wish 
your book mailed. (Sylvia 
Robertson, and Ada Joyce 
Stedje, co-chairmen book com­
mittee.)

CEIVED. If too few books are 
sold, the number o f picture 
pages will be cut.

Order your book today by 
bringing or sending your check

Final Days o f Summer 

Clearance Sale at

KIDS STUFF
and

LADY FAIR
Save up to

on all Spring and Summer fashions 

for a limited time.

The basic outline of the 
course is:

1. Knowledge o f Guns and 
Ammunition.

2. Proper Gun Handling.
3. Safe Hunting Methods.
4. The Rifle.
5. The Shotgun.
6. The Hunter’ s Responsibili­

ties.

The Texas hunter safety card 
is also honored in other states

The Spearman Study Club is 
happy to announce that all plans 
for their second arts and craft 
show and sale are coming along 
great! There is a total of 30 
dealers from four states who 
have already made reservations 
for the show. The club plans to 
have dealers by September 1. 
the last day to send for 
reservations.

Texas, Oklahoma, Kansas, 
and Colorado dealers are bring­
ing everything from antiques, 
quilts, paintings, tole paintings, 
depression glass, sculptures, 
bronzing, stained glasses, jew-

requiring hunter safety training e 'rY- breads, and many other 
prior to the issuance of a >*ems ,0 l°ng to list-'
hunting license. More than half 
o f the states now require this 
training including Colorado. 
New Mexico, Montana, and 
Oregon.

Local talents Kindra Davis. 
Lometa Sparks, Evelyn and 
Albert Mackie, Joe Gose, Larry 
Porter. Orville and Martha

Latham, and Dora Faries have 
entered booths in our sale. 
There is still time for more of 
our locals to sign up for one of 
the biggest events in Spearman 
this year.

The club asks for your 
support by attending their sale 
September 11 and September 
12 at the Plains Shopping
Center. A successful show will 
mean an annual event in 
Spearman every year sponsored 
by Spearman Study Gub.

Watch in the paper for future 
progress of events. Nothing will 
be shown or sold before the first 
day of the sale.

For further information con­
tact Trudie Schneider 659-3691 
or Francis Biles 659-2126.

ORDER AND NOTICE SETTING HEARING
THE STATE OF TEXAS
C O U N T Y  O F H A N S F O R D

S e c S in the District CourtWHEREAS, in Cause No. 
of Hansford County, Texas, styled "EX PARTE HANSFORD COUNTY ^  
HOSPITAL DISTRICT", the Hansford County Hospital District has 
initiated and filed such action as a proceeding in rem in 
accordance with the provisions of Article 717m-l, V.A.T.C.S., 
as a class action against the taxpayers, property owners, and 
residents of the Hansford County Hospital District, and all 
nonresidents, if any, owning property therein, and/or all others 
having or claiming any right, title or interest in any property 
or funds to be affected by the proceedings and/or the issuance 
of refunding revenue bonds in the principal amount of $500,000 
by said District, or interested or affected in any way thereby, 
or by the proceedings, including all actions and expenditures 
of funds, taken or made and/or proposed to be taken or made in 
connection with or affecting said bonds, the indebtedness to be 
refunded by such bonds, and/or the provisions made for the pay­
ment of said bonds as more particularly described in the Petition 
of said District on file in the district Court of Hansford 
County, Texas, wherein the Hansford County Hospital District, 
among other things, prayed for a Declaratory Judgment as to its 
authority to issue and deliver said bonds and to the legality 
and validity of all proceedings, including all actions and 
expenditures of funds, taken or made and/or proposed to be 
taken or made in connection with or affecting any of said bonds, 
and as to the legality and validity of the provisions made for 
the payment of said bonds.

NOW, THEREFORE,
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN TO:

All taxpayers, property owners, and residents of the Hansford 
County Hospital District, and all nonresidents, if any, owning 
property therein, and all others having or claiming any right, 
title or interest in any property or funds to be affected by the 
proceedings and/or issuance of said bonds, or interested or" 
affected in any way thereby, or by the proceedings, including 
all actions and expenditures of funds, taken or made and/or pro­
posed to be taken or made in connection with or affecting said 
bonds and the Attorney General of Texas are directed to appear 
at 10 o'clock A.M. on the first Monday after the expiration of 
twenty (20) days from the date of issue of this order, and show 
cause why the prayers of the Petition should not be granted and 
the proceedings and the bonds aforementioned validated and con­
firmed as therein prayed.

The Clerk of this Court is hereby ordered to cause a sub­
stantial copy of this Order to be published in a newspaper of 
general circulation in Travis County, and in a newspaper of general 
circulation in Hansford County, such publications in each news­
paper to be made once in each of two consecutive calendar weeks, 
with the date of the first publication in each newspaper to be not 
less than fourteen (14) days prior to the date set for hearing 
and trial.

SIGNED AND ENTERED THIS the 1982,

District Court of Hansford County, 
T E X A S
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BUY, SELL,TRADE OR BENT THROUGH THE

m
OSGOOD

MONUMENT CO.
Amarillo, Texas 

Dealers of Rock of Ages 
Granite, a s . well as all 
colored granites, marble and 
bronze memorials.

represented by

BOXWELL BROS. 
FUNERAL HOME

519 S. EVANS 
659-3802

Hansford County 
Planned Parenthood 

26 S. Haney 
659-2483 
Spearman 
Mon.-Fri. , 
8:30-12:30 ,

N O T IC E  
Wallace Monument Co.
Monuments, Curbing.

Grave Covers 
Local Representative 

LEONARD JAMESON 
Spearman. Texas

35s-rtn

' »
STEAM RINSE Jk VAC 

Steam Rinse-and-Vac Sham 
pooers; S10.95 for up to/ 24 
hrs, available at Gordon’ s 
Drug; also at Freddie Lar- 
gent’ s 716 Cotter Dr. after 4 
p m  and Saturdays and 
Sundays.

SERVICE: Pits cleaned, wet or 
dry. Dragline or loader. Also, 
dozer, grader, carry-all service. 
Lee Roy Mitchell, 806-733-2384, 
Gruver, Texas 79040 
tt-rtn

SNOOPY’ S DAY SCHOOL .*
Open Mon through Fri. from 
7:00 a.m. to 6:(X) p.m. Call 
659-3328 or come by 620Vi 
Bernice for further information. 
23-rtn

MONUMENTS

Save Agents and 
Undertaken Profits

If it is inconvenient for 
you to visit our large 
display, please phone 
collect (405) 327-0626 or 
write and we will call on 
you.

ALVA MONUMENT
WORKS, INC.

Alva OK 73717

New to area?
Give us a try 

Call your local 
USED COW DEALER 
As soon as Possible. 

659-3544 
659-3545 

1-800-692-4043 
rtnI7S

S&H ROOFING: Residential 
only. Shade Cedar Top, Spanish 
Tile Repair, Skylight. 5 year 
warranty on Mobile Homes. We 
give S&H Green Stamps. Call 
806-383-9672 Amarillo.
39s-rtn
CAKE DECORATING: Call:
659-2312.
39s-7tp
General Contracting: Roofing, 
Painting, Yard Fencing. Patios, 
Cement Work, Porches, Siding 
and Sidewalks. Call Curly Davis 
after 5 p.m. 659-3455.
Repair Remodeling.
40- 3tc
For a lifetime of pleasure, join 
Shaffer's Dance Gass suiting 
Sept. 15 in Perryton. Call 
435-4121 for details.
41- 8tc

Garage Sales

FRONT PORCH SALE: Friday, 
Aug. 20. Dishes, bedspread, 
drapes from 8 a.m. to 1 p.m, 
1107 Townsend.
41-ltc

Miscellaneous

FOR SALE: 333 Graco airless 
with hose tips and handgun. 
659-3658.
40s-2tc

Lose weight with a safe diet pill 
amazing-high protein Spirulina. 
Spearman Drug.
40s-2tp

FOR SALE261 yards good used 
carpet with pad. Call 3584 or
3227.

40-rtn

Reduce safe & fast with GoBese 
Tablets & E-Vap "water pills" 
Spearman Drug.
40s-2tp

Real Estate
HOUSE FOR SALE: Owner 
relocated. 1111 Townsend; 
2,000 sq. ft. living area, 3 
bedroom, pool room, lots of 
storage. I1/, baths, kitchen with 
built in appliances, fireplace, 
utility room, garage, new roof. 
To obtain key, contact Donnie 
H e rg e rt --6 5 9 -3 7 2 1 , d a ily , 
659-3317, nights; or Dari Her- 
gert at 435-3686, daily, 
435-4132, nights.
37S-rtn

FOR SALE-Beautiful 3 bedroom 
brick home in Golden Circle 
addition. Large family room 
with cathedral ceiling and fire­
place. Moderate size kitchen 
with built in appliances and lots 
of cabinet space. Separate 
utility room with walk in pantry 
and lots of cabinets. 2 baths. 
Double car garage. Assumable 
loan. Call 659-3960 for appoint­
ment.

39-8tc

HOUSE FOR SALE: Nice 3 
bedroom, 1 bath, with Ben 
Franklin Fireplace, fenced in 
backyard. 1 1/2 lots. S34.500.00 
or Buy Equity and Assume 
Loan. Shown by Appointment 
only. 512 S. Haney. Phone 
9-2463.
28-rtn T only

HOUSE FOR SALE: 3 bedroom, 
two bathrooms, fully carpeted, 
basement, formal dining room, 
detached garage, sprinkler sys­
tem, corner lot in nice neighbor­
hood. Owner will finance. Rea­
sonable down payment and 
interest rate. Call Cynthia Floyd 
659-3308 or 659-3123 for ap­
pointment.
28s-rtn
FOR SALE: 2 story house on 2 
lots. Newly remodeled kitchen 
and dining room. 2 garages and 
storage house. Call 659-3482 for 
appointment.
41-4tc_________________ __

Help Wanted
NURSES NEEDED: to do home 
health care. Panhandle Home 
Health Agency is now taking 
applications. Salary, mileage 
and benefits. Call 935-6861 for 
an interview.
40s-2tc

First United Methodist Church 
needs nursery worker. If inter­
ested call 659-3220.
44-6tc

Wanted

FOR SALE: ‘81 Dodge D-50 
Sport Pick-Up AM FM -Cas- 
sette. Power Steering & Brakes. 
A/C. Bucket Seats. Sliding 
Rear Window. New Tires. Call 
James, 9-2649.
40-4tc

Mobile Homes 
For Sale

DEALER REPO-2 bedroom mo­
bile home. Good condition, 
garden tub, bay window, wet 
bar, etc. Assume payments of 
J244.04 with approved credit. 
FIRST QUALITY MOBILE- 
HOMES-665-0715, Pampa, Tx. 

37S-8tc

FOR SALE: To be moved 12x60, 
2 bedroom moble home. Owner 
will help move local. For more 
information, call 659-3833 any­
time.
41-4tp

Lost & Found
STRAYED-7 head of steers, 
weighing 700 lbs. near Northern 
Natural plant. Brand H. on left 
side. Call 806-659-2189. Terry 
Butt.
40S-4tp

Businoss
Opportunities

Own your own Jean-Sports­
wear, Infant-Preteen or Ladies 
Apparel Store. Offering all 
nationally known brands such 
as Jordache, Chic. Lee, Levi, 
Vanderbuilt, Calvin Klein. 
Wrangler over 200 other 
brands. $7,900 to 16,500 in­
cludes beginning inventory, air­
fare for one to Fashion Center, 
training, fixtures, grand open­
ing promotions. Call Mr. 
Loughlin (612) 835-1304.
41-ltp

Farm Equipment

Allsup’s Participating 
In MS Drive

$1000 AN ACRE
For your corn. Let us turn 
your irrigated corn crop into 
$1000 an acre. Dalhart Farm 
Store, 806-249-6757.
40-4tc

WANTED: used boat, motor 
trailer. Must be cheap! Just for 
local fishing-659-2338.
38-nc

Barege Sales
3 FAMILY YARD SALE

Boys' Bicycle-in very good 
condition. Lots of other kinds of 
items and miscellanious items. 
So don't miss this spectacular 
YARD SALE-Thurt., Aug. 19 
and Fri., Aug. 20, from 9 to 5. 

30 S. Dressen
44-2t NC

Everything Goes 
4-FAMILY GARAGE SALE: 

Wednesday, August 18th, from 
9:00 a.m. to 7:00 p.m. Home 
Demonstration Room. Family 
Gothing, Household items. Pic­
tures, Many Misc. Toys.

Automobiles
FOR SAI.E-1979 Ford Mustang, 
good condition. Call Angie 
Francis, 659-2454.
31-rtn

FOR SALE: '76 Buick Century 
and a chrome roll bar for 
pickup. Call 2764.
40s-4tc

KOEHN
Mobile Homes 

508 East Pancake 
Liberal, Kansas 67901 
Phone: 316-624-0338 

"Specializing in more 
QUALITY AND VALUE 

for your dollar! ”  
CHAMPION 

MHMC
OPEN SUNDAY AT 2 P.M. 

24-rtn

Allsup's Convenience Stores 
will again participate in the 
Annual Muscular Dystrophy 
Fund Raising Drive. Allsup's 
Stores will be displaying the 
Muscular Dystrophy Collection 
Canisters in all of the stores in 
New1 Mexico. Texas and Okla­
homa in order to help meet the 
goals of this worthwhile associ­
ation, whose programs are 
funded almost entirely by pri­
vate contributions, corporations 
and the Labor Day Telethon.

The Muscular Dystrophy As­
sociation is looking for cures 
and causes of a group of 
diseases, marked by progres­
sive weakness and wasting of 
the skeletal muscles which 
control body movement. Neuro­
muscular disease can strike 
anyone at any age, they afflict 
an estimated one million Ameri­
cans.

Legal Notice

FOR SALE: Hansford County 
4-H Council is taking bids on a 
gooseneck trailer made by 
Southwest Metal Works It is 
15' by 5', V) steel top, 1 

escape door and has a single 
axle. The trailer can be seen 
behind the County Ag Barn in 
Spearman. All bids are to be in 
the County Judge's Office by 
Monday. August 23rd. ^0 00 
a.m., at which time they trill be 
opened. 4-H reserves the right 
to accept or decline any or all 
bids.
40-4tc

Card Of Thanks

I want to say thank you to all 
my family and friends for all the 
many thoughtful deeds done 
in my behalf during my recent 
illness at Hansford Hospital, 
also following surgery at NWTH 
in Amarillo.

Your prayers, calls, flowers, 
cards and offers of assistance 
are greatly appreciated and will 
never be forgotten.

A special thanks to the 
Brack's, my next door neigh­
bors, for taking care of my yard.

Spearman is such a good 
place to call home.

Edith Womble

A man must learn to en­
d u re  that patiently 
which he cannot avoid 
conveniently.

-John Florio.

All men com m end pati­
ence. although few be 
willing to practice it.

-Thomas A. Kempis.

Specializing in Rooting of all Types 
Residential 6 Commercial

Tile Cedar Shingles
Slate Builtup Rooting Hand Split Shakes

Rigid Asbestos Tar 4 Gravel Composition
Pitch

NORTH PLAINS ROOFING & SIDING CO
8 0 6  3 5 2  7 7 5 4

Licensed Bonded Insured 

Call collect for free estimate 
806-352-7754 ---------------------------- Amarillo Tens

BEACH HOUSE FOR REHT-Sua k i t ,  fialvtston.
Ska|is 5, k iw is  court, boat launch, bait 

house, IQ ft. lifh k d  fishing piar, access to 
fiahreskn Country Club for goH, accost to 
Cahreston County Airport. Across the street 
from boaeh, 6 miks from tho San Luis Pass 

bridge tad  17 miks from downtown fiahraskn, 
Call BM-BM-5037.

3SS-20tc

in addition to the "in-store" 
canisters. Allsup's will also be 
conducting the "Allsup's Door­
bell Brigade". Area youngsters 
are encouraged to visit their 
local Allsup's Store on Sept. 5th 
and 6th and pick up a collection 
packet for the door to door 
campaign. After collecting do­
nations for “ Jerry's Kids" and 
returning them to the store. 
Allsup's will give the young­
sters a free fountain drink of 
their choice. It’ s our way of 
saying thanks to the kids for 
caring.

From Jack Crow, Director of 
Public Relations, "thanks to all 
of our customers for your 
generosity in this fight against 
neuromuscular diseases, and 
we at Allsup's are looking 
forward to working with area 
youngsters to help the Muscular 
Dystrophy Associations.”

EATINGS,

Political
Announcements

DEMOCRATIC PARTY

For U.S. Congressman 
13th District 

JACK HIGHTOWER

State Representative 
88th District

J.W . "B U C K " BUCHANAN 

REPUBLICAN PARTY

State Representative 
88th District 

R.C. PORTER

OUT

Offered Exclualvely Bv 
EMMETT R. SANDERS, 

REALTOR

D3.
realtor*

By Rose Hughes
ONE of the great Ameri­

can dining traditions is the 
free glass of ice w ater- 
served at the very beginning 
of one's visit. Unfortunately 
some clever operators are 
trying to end this unique 
courtesy and profit more by 
not automatically serving 
free water.

THAT'S the European 
and worldwide custom, of 
course. In few other coun­
tries does one gel a free glass 
of ice water upon sitting 
down. But it has no place in 
this country. Customers 
should ask for their tradi­
tional glass of water-or re­
fuse to patronize restaurants 
which end this service. 
(That's a subtle effort to sell 
more non-free drinks.)

ANOTHER of this coun­
try's great dining traditions 
is free bread and butter. In 
most other countries one 
must buy them. In Germany 
there's a basket of rolls on all 
tables. At the end of a meal, 
one tells the waitress or 
waiter how many rolls one 
ate. He or she charges ac­
cordingly.

STILL another great 
tradition in the U .S.A., 
where food is plentiful, is the 
eat-all-you-wish meal. 
That's almost never found 
in other countries; one can 
return to the buffet spread 
and get seconds in other 
countries.

THESE fine traditions 
make dining out in the 
United States the best buy in 
the world. And in some of 
our chains-such as Brew- 
master- one gets all the wine 
and beer one wants with 
dinner. That's unheard of 
abroad.

100’ by 140' commercial 
zoned with 26’ by 32' 
concrete block shop build­
ing, close to downtown on 
Dressen Street.

Nearly new builder's home, 
4 bedrooms, 2'/i baths, 
basement, double garage, 
fenced yard, large tool- 
house, numerous amenities: 
shown by appointment only.

Nice 2 bedroom home on 
100 ft. corner lot adjacent to 
junior high and elementary 
school. Carpets, drapes, 
refrigerated air. basement.

I shake roof, separate one 
room and bath bachelor's 
quarters. Estate settlement. 

•«••***•
2 bedroom home, immacu­
late interior, fenced yard, 
detached garage, lean as­
sumption with $4 000.00 
down payment. New furni­
ture optional. Shown by 
appointment.

Choice commercial location 
fronting 140 ft. on West 
Kenneth Street.

Attractive 3 bedroom brick 
home, near Elementary 
School on Dressen St. Call 
for appointment.

**•*••«•
EMMETT R. SANDERS 

REALTOR 
659-2516 

659-2601 InlghUj 
40 -rtn T ONLY
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David Stockman. Budget 
director:
"C ongress will have to 

cut billions o f dollars from 
socia l p rogra m s next 
y e a r . . .t o  hold  dow n 
budget de fic its ."

Patience is a necessary 
ingredient o f genius.

•Benjamin Disraeli.

He that can have pati­
ence can have what he 
will.

-Benjamin Franklin.

For Tha Ultimata In
ST0BM D00BS ft WINDOWS

Custom Built, Dutigntd, And In 
Colors To Fit Tour Homo^.

Contact Howard Moyer at

1

Aluminum Industries
405-338-6966 or 

405-338-6170 
AFTER 6 P.M.

THE fast food outlet is 
also perfected to a finer de­
gree here than abroad. From 
hamburgers to barbecue 
(local barbecue restaurants 
seem better bets than chains 
like Fat Boy, which give 
skimpy servings) and 
shakes. Americans have a 
greater variety and better 
quality to choose from than 
diners in any other country.

P atience  and delay 
a ch iev e  m ore than 
force and rage.
-Jean De La Fontaine.

This. 3 bedroom brick home has a NKW ROOF, 
largeV-orper lo i  ncal ih d o l, k id  RRlt'E HAS 
BEBfr Gh&ATCT REDUCED. Bt1 O in tm e n t
only.

***«»•
Jam«£sSt -NEW RQOF, 3 bedrooms, CejxHeat 
& air\G»nd.p!T XLMK d£tathe/f ga/age, pig)lot. 
PRICRREDUCEd I W  apjfomtmeTtn3Ttly.T~' 

••••»»
Roland St.--2 bedroom house, Cen/Heat. Double 
g a ig b  witeiparlnfentf Large Tot, sttSrage bldg., 
stif-nvxxllac- PRICE lJW ^T lV-UHHJCES. BY 
APPOINTMENT ONLY.

**•••*
RESIDENTIAL LOTS FOR SALE--southwest 
location.

••*•*•

659-3841 □

Need man to manage 

irrigated farm. Must 

have experience. New 

home furnished.

Phone
405 -338 -5506  

or 405 -338-7307

Need man 
experienced with

livestock to work 
at small feed yard.

P h o n e
4 0 5 -3 3 8 -5 5 0 6  

o r 4 0 5 -3 3 8 -7 3 0 7
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HuCAN aod who CAN'T, 
obierved.

The five non-conference
games begin with the pretl. 
ously mentioned aehedulc with 
Vega The second will be 
against Guymon and will also be 
a home game

The third tilt will also be the 
third game in a renewed rivalry 
with neighboring Spearman 
This year, the 'Hounds will 
cross the creek to meet the LyM 
on their home grounds.

Sept. 24, the Greyhounds 
will journey to the lair of the 
tough Panhandle team and 
then, on Oct. 1, Graver will host 
the Canadian squad for the 
annual Homecoming Game 

All five non-conference clash­
es will start at 8 p m.

The time schedule moves 
back to 7 30 with the first 
conference game Oct 8--a- 
gamst Stratford on the Grey­
hounds' home turf.

Then comes Stinnett, there, 
Oct. 15; Sanford-Fritch, here, 
Oct.22; White Deer, there, 
Oct.29--and the season’s dimai 
Nov.5 against Sunray there.

Coach Rick Nil observed that 
many of these schools had 
fielded tough teams in the past 
but noted that all of them would 
be working up from a large 
number of raw recruits this 
season

"It could be a flat-out race to 
refine that raw talent and the 
first few games it could be 
anybody's guess who will turn 
up with the real mean scene this 
year." Nil grinned.

Seventh and Eighth grades 
and the Junior Varsity.are often 
a treasure trove of talent that 
will eventually move on to the 
Varsity. Because of this, these 
squads have, in the past, drawn 
s large number of spectators for 
each game and a lot of support 
from home, school staff and 
student body.

Their opening game of the 
season, Sept. 2, is a home game 
against Stratford and features
only the Junior Varsities. That 
game starts at 7 p.m.

The remaining nine games, 
the last five of them district 
tilts, will begin at 5 p.m. 
because they involve Seventh, 
Eighth and the JV.

Sept. 9, they play Stinnett 
there; Sept. 16, Panhandle, 
here; Sept 23, White Deer,

(litre, and Sept.JO. sunray, 
there.

Then, with one escepnon. 
dntrici play is a re-run of the 
warmup cycle.

Oct. 7, Stratford there; Oct. 
14, Stinnett here; Oct. 21, 
Saaford-Fritch there. Oct. 21, 
White Deer here and the 
clrmaa Nov. 4, Sunray here.

Coach Nil said he was 
asking s special "push" to get 
Graver fans, faculty aod stu­
dent body to back each squad in

,  big *»7 »  *•“ • ,heT
play this season

With a large number of fans 
already plotting pre-game strat­
egy around the local coffee
tups, one of them just may have
hit on a description of the action 
this season

••When a dog w»|» hts tail, 
he usually wants to play. With 
the G reyhounds, it usually 
meant some swivel-hipped 
broken field running and THAT 
,ust may end putting the bite on 
the othet teams' championship 
homes this y e a r !"

Richard Smelling. G over­
nor (R-Vt), chairman 
o f National Governors' 
Assn.:
“ The governors can­

not support a plan that 
fails to provide for the 
m ed ica lly  n e e d y , d is ­
courages adequate state 
w elfare a ssista n ce  or 
ign ored  d if fe re n c e s  in 
state burdens.”

Gniver School 
dates set

Classes begin in Graver 
schools Aug. 26.

Final stages of preparation 
for the start of the 1982-83 term 
at Gruver begins Aug 19 with 
Teacher Orientation Day at the 
school.

The next day, Friday, Aug. 
20, students will register for 
their classes between the hours 
of nine and 12 noon.

Aug 23, 24, and 25, mem­
bers of the Gruver faculty will 
participate in an in-service 
cooperative program with other 
schools in the area to be 
conducted at Perryton over the 
three-day period.

Farnsworth fire is a minor blaze

Blood Drive Aug.
So far as activity among city 

departments is concerned, this 
past week in Spearman was 
quiet-which is the way the dog 
days of a waning summer are 
supposed to be lived.

The only stir-and that of little 
consequence-was a fire call 
that took Spearman firefighters 
and equipment to a point five 
miles north of Farnsworth just 
before press time, Tuesday. 
The fire, at an irrigation facility, 
was quickly tapped out and 
firefighters were on their way 
back to town.

Other than that alarm, rou­
tine traffic tickets were the only 
activity confronting the Spear­
man Police Department.

The Coffee Memorial Blood 
Center will be in Spearman 
August 30 at the Sacred Heart 
Parish Hall. 901 S. Roland from
1 to S p.m.

The goal for the drive is 75 
pints.

For appointment call Carol 
Hall. 659-3356 or Rose Cator, 
733-2317 in Gruver.

Walk in donors will also be 
taken.

Come out and help us make 
our goal and over.

STATEMENT Of FINANCIAL CONDITION OF HANSFORD COUNTY 
RECONCILIATION WITH DEPOSITORY BANNS AS OF AUGUST I .  1982

FUNDS boos;
balance

0UTSTAN01RG
CHECKS

BANK
BALANCE

JURT
GfNEAAl

8.5S 4 .1S  
71 .388 (IS

1 ,9 3 1 .1 9
11 ,607 .02

10 ,4 85 .34
8 2 ,7 95 .87

ROAD 6 BRIDGE, GENERAL 
f r e e ln e t  No. 1 
P rec in ct No. 2 
P rec in c t No. 3 
P rec in c t No. 4

12 ,5 3 4 .0 4  
22 .3 S 3 .64  

9 ,19 8 .3 1  
10 ,744 78

4.2C 2.57  
2 , 6 I 5 . i l  
2 ,0 2 9 .7 6  

479.98

16 .816.61
24 ,9 69 .42
11 ,2 28 .07
1 1 ,2 24 .76

ROAD 4 BRIDGE. PRECINIT 
No. 1 , Improvement 
No. 2 ,  Improvement 
No. 3 , Improvement 
No. 4 , Improvement

6 ,2 6 9  40 
4 ,4 9 1 .1 1  

841.12  
1 ,218 .71

6 ,2 6 9 .4 0
4 .49 1 .1 1

841.1?
1 .218.71

REVENUE SHARING 2 S .0 IS .9 5 991.47 2 6 ,0 77 .42

FUND

JURY
GENERAL

2 . SUMMARY 
BALANCE 
5 /1 /8 2  

4 ,54 6  32 
3 7 ,5 3 0 .8 8

Of RECEIPTS AND D1S8URSEICNTS
RECEIPTS DISBURSEKNtS BALANCE 

8 /1 /8 2
1 3 ,0 5 1 .4 8  9 ,0 4 3 6 5  8.S S 4.15  

194 ,503 .83  160 ,645 .66  71 .3JB .S5

ROAD t BRIDGE, GENERA! 
P re c in c t No. 1 
P re c in c t No. 2 
P rec in c t No. 3 
P re c in c t No. 4

21 ,7 08  33 
1 7 ,6 94 .78  
1 5 ,1 53 .14  
2 1 ,6 5 9 .1 0

5 0 .7 7 8 .7 8  
53 .2 38  34 
2 3 ,1 80 .52  
13 ,643 .92

5 9 ,9 5 3 .0 7
4 3 ,5 7 9 .4 8
2 9 ,1 3 5 .3 5
2 4 ,5 5 8 .2 4

1 2 ,5 3 4 .D4 
22 .3 5 3 .6 4  

9 .19 8 .3 1  
1 0 ,7 44 .78

ROAD E BRIDGE, PRECINCT 
No 1 , Improvement 
No. 2 ,  Improvement 
No. 3 , Improvement 
No. 4 ,  Improvement

5 ,1 3 5 .7 7
3 ,4 7 4 .8 0
5 ,4 2 5 .6 9

19 ,7 09 .37

1 ,1 1 3 .0 3
11 ,016.31

715.43
651.07

10 ,0 0 0 .0 0
5 ,3 0 0 .0 0

1 9 ,1 41 .73

6 ,2 6 9 .« t  
4 ,49 1 .1 1  

841.12  
1 ,218 .71

REVENUE SHARING 22 ,8 1 6 .7 0 21 ,795 .21 1 9 ,5 25 .96 25 ,0 8 5 .9 5

HANSFORD COUNTY INVESTMENTS:

2General •  - ............................. ................385,000 00
Precinct 1, Fund #8........................ ................ 55,000.00
Piednct 1. Fund » 1 ? .................... ................ 15,000.00
Precinct 2, Fu'd • 9 .................... ................76,00<i.00
Ptecinct 2 , Fund » 1 J ................... ................ 60.000.00
Precinct 3, Fund •  1 0 .................... ...................  50.000.00
Pnclnct 3, Fund •  1 4 .................... • -  -  •  8.000 00
Precinct 4. Fund •  1 1 ................... ...................  50.000.00
Precinct 4, Fund .15 .................... 10.0u0.00
Revenue Sharing e?5 - -  .  . . ...................  50.000.00
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To the Annual

UNITED
F R E E

BREAKFAST
Served on the Parking Lot — 

901 S. Ash
Perryton, Texas

SATURDAY, AUGUST 21,1982
6 :0 0  A .M . till 8 :0 0  A .M .

T h e  M e n u . . .
•Bacon »Eggs ‘ Rolls 'Butter *Jelly 
•Orange Juice »Milk •Chocolate Milk

In appreciation for the growing 
business from the people of 
Perryton and surrounding 
area.

. ’ ***>• .

"  * ■
, • ** * * < : *

MAKING PLANS FOR 'UP WITH PEOPLE'
First National Bank president John Cluck goes over the details with Up 
With People” representatives Mark Conzemius and Brett Strobe 
100-member cast of "Up With People" will provide entertainment or the 
Wheatheart Celebration at the PHS Auditorium at 7 p.n,. on Saturday, 
August 21. Tickets are on sale at the First National Bank and at the 
Ochiltree Chamber of Commerce officeGreyhounds

The Graver Greyhound! are 
on the growl!

Shoes were picked up Wed­
nesday. The first workout-in 
sborts-is set for Mondsy (Aug. 
9) with the second "bustle”  
Friday (Aug 13) in pads 

The following Fhday-Aug 
20-will be rhe first scrimmage 
It will be here against the 
Hooker. Okla. squad 

One week later, the Grey­
hounds will go to Dslhart for the 
last scrimmage before season 
play begins.

That first game of the season 
will be a home stand against 
Vegs beginning st 8 pm.. Sept. 
3

Greyhound Head Coach Rick 
Nil said the Vega team has 
been picked by a prominent 
magazine to be the winner in its 
district this season.

Coach Nil said he eapected 
some 30 prospective gndsters to 
turn out when school gets 
underway. As of now, 12 of 
these should be seniors

The coach said the quarter­
back spot particularly was "up

for grabs."
"Right now, we have two 

men with eiperience at the 
quarterback position.”  Coach 
Nil said "They are Dub 
Garrett, a junior and Chad 
Logsdon, a sophomore Both of 
them will probably get a 
'workout' as season play opens 
but this does not mean others 
will not get a shot at the position 
whether they have eiperience 
or not."

Nil pointed out that Diirrict 
1-AA re-alignment left the 
Graver Greyhoundl with only 
five conference clashes on their 
schedule this year. This gives 
them five non-conference 
games to "warm-up."

"Not counting the two scrim­
mages. this will give us five 
tough games to find out who
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Jr. Lusby C,ats & First State Bank Red Hots Arettt

1982 Co-Champs In Softball
Tht final games-in a matter readv forfeited their aame to ®game.

of speaking-were played on 
Friday, August 13, and on 
Monday, August 16. They were 
two days of excitement and 
glory for a couple of teams 

First of all the games played 
on Friday, August 13 included 
the biggest game of the sea- 
son-the game between A4tL 
Printing and First State Bank 
Red Hots, who were tied for 
second. Sports Tally had al­

ready forfeited their game to 
J&J Enterprise at the Jaycee 
Ballpark. So there were going to 
be lots of folks at this game Not 
particularly, not as many as 
predicted. Some were in the 
stands, some on the grass, but 
most of the fans in their cats. 
There were a few interested 
spectators at this game. First of 
all, the Red Hots had already 
beaten AirL once before, the 
question now was, could they do

it again? Well, Brenda Shield- 
knight. the Red Hots' Pitcher, 
did a fine job barely walking 
folks, and making her oppo­
nents hit bad pitches, where her 
infield could make outs and 
where her outfield could catch 
the flies The Red Hots played 
an excellent game, as a matter 
of fact, both teams played 
exceptionally well in the first 2 
or 3 innings, no one scoring a

single point. Then, all ol x Bank Red Hots back in the 
sudden, the Red Hots made drivers seat, if they defeated 
hits, RBI's—Runs Batted In, by the Sororities on Monday, then 
the batter- excellent base run- ,he Red Hots would be tied fot 
nmg A * L found itself losing in Flt„  p|ace wh|!e a|| thi,  was 
the biggest game of their gojng on. the Jr. Lusby Cats 
season. They tried desparately would now be getting ready to 
to make a comeback, and almost cheer on the Sororities to victory 
succeeded, but First State held over the First State Bank Red 
on to win the game. This gave Hots. A&L, last year's Champs, 
AirL their 3rd loss of the had to hang up their Title 
season, and put First State claims and wait fot next year.

scars
. . .  the kind of store you remember.

f T / o i For Back To School

WRANGLER

i

Wrangler No-Fault Boot Jeans
Boys

Stim & Ra). Size 6-18
tOOftfioHw

02. Din k

Students
Waist Sees 25-30

R«j. 11"
$0*8 Raj. 14”

$11

' ■ m i  X

§ 1
1

I

Students
Cowboy Cut Jeans

t00» Cotton #410 u H u .Dm m

tfaist Sizes 25 -12 
. Re*. 15" $I2«»

Extra Terrific 
Savings

Prices Geed Thru August 21

Kids Denims
Classic Western 

Or
No-Fault Western

Sim IT-7 Ska IRt).

Rs),’i ”1s'9" ^ 2 ^

Boy's
Tube Socks

TUBE SOCKS
5  PAJR

31 . i 1
V. r

Color Striped

78% Cotton/20% Orlon/2% Nylon. 

5 Pan Pkg.

Get a $2, $5 or $10 refund by mail.
Mail this certificate and proofs) of purchase to Wrangler Cash Refund

P.O. Box 704 
Westville, N J . 06093

I am enclosing proofts) of purchase from the following Wrangler clothes along with 
sales receipt ( with circled Wrangler price) from each item Please send my $2, $5 or $10 
refund to

GEM'S
Name.

Address.

City____

Checkf

L .

□$5 Refund D$5 Refund 0*10 Refund
1 pair of cords 1 pair of cords and 1 pair of cords, 1 

1 Wrangler shirt. shirt and 1 pair of 
denim jeans

''<•** -'*** iz-oany «» eKjra tout'd-, no XOM.«**on o- •*p»cOull<on t* hono>«4 0»f vo*d wh«t« p«o»**tcd t*to i»
i t  t  •„ IrfNR Iffcjndot" (f*Mwatf fitw t.*G-ffuodDr- N>,vrhow aoorss A*o*u ft , tty •«•«■©* rffuno OWcr cadres 
mi M, I W  Only (Mwcrwirs •*«* the u S w»o icneorws qmuW,

Proof ol purchase on waistband '
Proois) of purchase ol denim jeans 
and cords >s waistband size ta? Proof , 
of purchase for shut is paper hang tag

First State was ready fot the 
"thrill of victory”  not the 
"agony of defeat” .

The final games wete played 
on Monday, August 16. There 
wete lots of spectators xt the 
first game, AicL Priming going 
up agaisi Jit J Enterprise. A few 
folks thought this would be "an 
easy game" for AirL to win, 
well, JitJ proved them wrong 
JirJ played one terrific game. 
They never let up. They played 
as a team determined to win. 
They had only won 3 games in 
the season, this would be a 
fantastic victory. JitJ played 
the game against AitL as if this 
was the Title game They really 
worked hard. Each one scoring 
at one time or another. AitL had 
to work harder than they 
figured, they had to work as 
hard as they did when they 
defeated Jt. Lusby. The players 
for JitJ Enterprise—every 
single one-scored or brought in 
a tun at one time ot another. 
The lead would change at the 
end of each teams bat. In other 
words, at the top of the inning 
the lead would change, at the 
bottom of that same inning, the 
lead would change again The 
last at bat was AitL Printing, so 
they had an advantage to start 
with Let me tell y'all some­
thing, both teams proved to the 
fans and to each other that 
"  Wheaties" does make a differ­
ence in a game Well, JitJ lost 
by 3 points-I9-22. If you 
weren't at the game, then you 
don't know what you missed, 
and if you were there, then you 
know how JitJ played-with the 
self-confidence of any team 
wanting to win!! The members 
of JitJ include Criselda Vela— 
Pilcher, Ciria Vela-JrJ Base, 
Tammy Garcia-Rover. Sara 
Avila—Center, Marla Rosales — 
1st Base, Terri Dewberry— 
Shortstop, Melissa Davis-Le/l 
Field, Tiarra Smith—2nd Base, 
Ramona Garcia-Right Field 
and Olivia Renteria—Catcher. 
Congratulations to each and 
everyone of the JitJ Enterprise 
team for improving as the year 
went by. The team members for 
AitL Printing include Pam 
Barber—Shortstop, Brenda 
Vera—Right Field, Jeane 
Close-Center Field, Kim Vera- 
Left Field, Ginger Coffee-2nJ  
Base, Tina fVoolley-Jrd Base, 
Janet Reed-Rover, R oyce-tsl 
Base, Stacey Cook—2nd Base, 
Tina-Catcher, Linda H'ilker-

so n -P iich er—AtcL was last 
year's champs, this year they 
finish in 3rd Place. Congratula­
tions on having a fine season.

The final game played was 
between First State Bank Red 
Hots and Sororities. First State 
had to win and they proved to 
be worthy of the Co-Champion- 
ship. Sororities had an escellent 
season, surprising most folks of 
this year's League. Congratula­
tions to all the Sororities' 
players fot playing with the 
intensity to win and keep their 
heads high even when they lost.

So now there is a tie fot First 
Place. There has been no word 
from June Sexton, the Chair­
man of the Women’ s Softball 
League, but the question is 
"W ill there be a play-off?”  
"W ill the League have Co- 
Champions?" Well, each team 

defeated each other once, so they 
deserve to share the Cham­
pionship Title for a year!! The 
team members include: Donna 
Y arbrough-P itcher, Honda 
U 'it te n -S h o r ts to p , S helly  
Lackey (o f  Gruwer)--Roi<er, 
Kathy Beck--2nd Base, Janeen 
Baumgardner—Center Field, 
JoDell Tigrett-Lejt Field, Kart 
Lou Schumann —1st Base, 
Cheryl Gibson-Catcher, Kenda 
Burke—3rd Base. Judy Tindell— 
Right Field and Brenda Clark— 
2nd Base. Congratulations to 
the Jr. Lusby Cats for being 
Co-Champs of the 1982 Wo­

men’s Softball League The 
team member of the First State 
Bank Red Hots include Brenda 
Shieldknighl — Pitcher, Mary 
Schumann—Calcher, Barbara 
Stavlo—Catcher, Mollte Holton- 
Center Field, Janie Kunsel- 
m an-lst Base. Shelley Beedy— 
2nd Base, Cindy Crooks-Jrd 
Base, Candy Boxwell-Right 
Field, Beth Stauffer—Shortstop, 
Jennifer llmphress-Left Field, 
Linda Arnold-Center Field, 
Mary Ann Martin-Rover and 
Andrea M ires-Left Field. Con­
gratulations to all the First State 
Bank Red Hots and their 
coaches for being Co-Champs 
fot 1982.

This year was a very “ inter­
esting”  Season, maybe next 
year it will he even more 
exciting!!

Clark Mires 
Returns To 

Coaching
Clxrk Mires, former football 

coach here, has returned to 
coaching. Mires will be on the 
C'aprock varsity football staff in 
Amarillo this year.

Mires has been out of coach­
ing and in various business 
enterprises since he resigned 
from the Spearman School 
System in the spring of 1973.

Mires guided the Lynx to an 
8-1-1 record during the 1972 
season. That was the best 
record in school history to that 
point He also coached the first 
player ever picked from Spear­
man to play in the Texas High 
School Coaches All-Star Game, 
Mike Floyd, who played at 
Texas A&M.

Mires was an all-district 
center for three seasons at 
Lamesa High School. He was a 
good basketball player there. 
He attended West Texas State 
on an athletic scholarship until a 
neck injury cut short that 
career.

He got into weightlifting and 
was the state AAU champion in 
1963. He also was state runner- 
up in Golden Gloves boxing.

Mires was an assistant foot­
ball coach to Dalhart and 
Canyon before taking the head 
job at Stratford in 1970. His 
next move was here where he 
revitalized the Lynx.

Canadian 
Squares To 
Have Special 

Dance
The newly organixed square 

dance club in Canadian, Texas 
will sponsor its first special 
dance at 8 00 p.m. on Saturday, 
August 21, in the City Auditor­
ium The Canadian Squares will 
be square dancing to one of the 
finest callers in the Texas- 
Oklahoma area, John Gorski. 
Gotski is also a featured caller 
at a square dancing resort in 
Colorado, Fun Valley.

An Energy Checked 
Efficiency H o m e . . .
m  i a i i

Investment

An Energy Checked Efficiency Home is one of the best invest­
ments you can make for savings and comfort. Energy-saving 
features like insulation, caulking, weatherstripping, and effi­
cient heating and cooling systems mean savings on utility bills 
plus a more comfortable home for years to come. And with ris­
ing energy costs, those features could mean a higher resale y 
value for your home. So before you buy, build, or remodel, call 
or drop by our office for your free Energy Checked Efficiency 
Home booklet.

Texas-NewMexico 
Power Company

E33-82
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Perryton, Texas

m o,

SAVE ENERGY AND TIME 
IN MEAL PREPARATION

Has continuous "kitchen du­
ty "  drained your energy and 
time banks?

" Maximize"  your efficiency 
with steps designed for saving 
time and energy-especially 
human energy—in meal prepar­
ation.

Identify ways specific jobs 
can be performed using the 
least amount o f time and energy 
to increase efficiency

WORKABLE KITCHEN 
A MUST'

A good way to begin is by 
spending some time organizing 
your kitchen. Arrange storage 
and work areas so that equip­
ment and supplies are within 
easy reach.

This will save steps across the 
kitchen each time you need 
something.

TOOLS A KEY
If you’ve been struggling 

along with prehistoric tools, 
maybe now’s the time to replace 
them.

Proper equipment and uten­
sils that get the job done-and 
knowing how to use them-will

Shorthorn A ssociation  
R ecognizes P rod u cers

/uei energy.
Prepare a roast large enough 

for two or three meals, or make 
two pies and freeze one. 
Prepare enough of your favorite 
casserole for two meals and 
freeze half. This way you’ve 
saved not only time but also 
energy.

Be sure to estimate time 
needed to prepare each item in 
the meal. This will help you 
determine in advance the order 
of preparation.

CLEAN-UP CONSERVES 
One of the greatest enemies 

of efficiency is procrastination. 
Don’t put off cleaning up, but 
instead save time by cleaning as 
you work. This will provide you 
with more clutter-free space.

Soak used utensils and equip­
ment immediately or place in a 
dishwasher. Dried-on foods are 
difficult to remove from uten­
sils, so avoid waiting to clean 
them.

ASSEMBLY LINE ASSISTS' 
Another way to save time is 

with the assembly-line ap- 
proach-perform all tasks o f one 
kind at one time Do all 
trimming and peeling before

go a long way toward timt and- start,ng to chop, or measure all 
energy savings. dry ingredients before wet

For instance, using a blender 
to grate and crumble bread and 
cheese takes less time than 
hand grating or grinding them.

Granted, new equipment 
does cost more money initially, 
but most items, if chosen 
wisely, will be one-time invest­
ments.

TIME MATTERS 
Another factor to consider is 

time spent in the kitchen, both 
busy time and “ watching 
time "--the latter often wasted. 

Instead of standing idle, use

ones.
MENU PLAN SAVES

Menu-planning can also save 
the cook time and energy. 
Planning ahead helps deter­
mine the length of meal prepar­
ation, and it ensures efficient 
shopping.

NEW IDEAS HELP 
Finally, to control the use of 

lime and energy, be receptive to 
new ideas. Try new meals, 
recipes or even methods of  
cooking and baking that save 
time and energy. Also try out

" watching time" to prepare new products that are time 
other meals. For example, make savers, 
up juice for tomorrow's break­
fast, sandwich fillings for to- E D U C A T I O N A L  PRO-  
morrow's packed lunches or GRAMS CONDUCTED BY THE 
salads and desserts for tomor- TEXAS AGRICULTURAL EX- 
row's dinner. TENSION SERVICE SERVE

In order to prepare as much PEOPLE OF ALL AGES RE- 
food-with as little energy--as GARDLESS OF SOCIO-ECO- 
possible, maximize time and NOMIC LEVEL, RACE, COLOR 
energy-both human and fossil- SEX. RELIGION OR NATION­

AL ORIGIN.

School tajain
The fsfjPTm of summer for millions of youngsters is 

coming to 'an end. and the "necessary tragedy”  of 
school approaches.

This, of course, is not the proper view. Many look 
forward to school, a healthy reaction. But the Huck 
Finns among us love freedom under summer skies. The 
end of vacation coincides nostalgically with the end of 
summer.

Fall, nevertheless, has its attractions--cooler 
weather, clear skies and landscapes, football, hunting, 
etc. That doesn t make the approaching end of summer 
less sad for children w ho enjoy it as their annual time of 
freedom.

It should be remembered, in this sorrow, that school 
makes vacation summers what they are. The time will 
come for most when a few weeks' vacation a year, if 
that, will be the annual hope.

S fra k e
Talk

FREE EDUCATION AM ) THE 
UNDOCUMENTED WORKER

On June 15. 1982. The 
Supreme Court ruled. 5-4. 
that Texas and other states 
must provide free public edu- 
cation for the children of un 
documented workers— 
people in this country 
illegally.

Our current Lt Governor. 
Mr Hobby, was happy w ith 
the decision, praising it as 
the ' only rational decision" 
the court could have made

On the contrary. I think it 
was a wrong decision that 
defied both law and logic

One of the principal un­
derpinnings of an orderly so­
ciety is that one should not 
benefit from breaking the 
law All around the world, 
thousands of people stand 
patiently in line at our em­
bassies. waiting for legal en 
try into this country By its 
recent ruling, the Supreme 
Court told these people lhal. 
if they are smart, they will 
igndre our immigration laws, 
find some other way to enter, 
and then there's a good 
likelihood all manner of 
taxpayer-supported benefits

will be open to them and 
their families

We can all feel sympathy 
for people driven to emigrate 
by desperate economic con­
ditions And I believe we 
should be compassionate to­
ward the children of undocu­
mented workers who are here 
through no fault of their 
own We have been told we 
must educate these children 
and we will it is our duty

But I am deeply concerned 
about the effect this will have 
on our school systems and 
the quality of education We 
have only a certain amount 
of desks and dollars with 
which to address the prob­
lems of educating Texas' 
children

The court was essentially 
establishing social policy un­
der the guise o f ruling on a 
constitutional question The 
result was bad law and bad 
social policy. It should now 
he up to the Federal Govern­
ment to help pay for the 
mess they have created by 
not properly policing our 
borders

Strake, Jr.

Paid PohiKal Advertisement Texans for Siraltr 121 \ W t4ih 
Slreel Austin. Texas 78705 Bivard Friedman Treasurer

James W Shirley, executive 
secretary of the American 
Shorthorn Association, has an­
nounced that seven "Builders 
of the Breed" award recipients 
have been named for 1982 

The annual awards were first 
presented in 1945 and are 
presented to breeders who have 
made outstanding contributions 
lo the development of the 
Shorthorn-'Polled Shorthorn 
cattle breed. They are all 
involved in Shonhorn cattle 
operations and exhibit their 
leadership in breed associa- 
tons. agricultural, civic and 
service organizations.

The recipients for 1982 are 
Robert Dahl, Gruver, Tx ; Stan­
ley Melroe, Gwinner, N.D.i 
Roger Steiger, Delavan. II. 
Orille and Kendrick Berg. 0- 
sage, la,; Paul Schrag. Marion, 
S.D.; Mike Dugdale, Omaha. 
Ne.; and Darrel. Dave, and

Dean Steck, Wataga, II 
Robert Dahl. Gruver, Tx., has

developed the cow herd at Palo 
Acre Farms with quality and 
performance in mind Strict 
culling has been practiced for 
these traits since the hqrd 
began in 1968 with the purchase 
of one bull and four females 
The cow herd, that now num­
bers over 100 registered fe­
males, shows selection for size 
and correctness Dahl contri­
butes much of the improvement 
to their herd sire of recent 
years, Spiro X. and the intro­
duction of selected Irish blood­
lines through AF Deerpark 
Dividend 932 and Ballyart Ad­
vancer, with Dividend and 
Guinness used artificially. Palo 
Acre Farms have participated 
in numerous shows, have pro­
duced a number of All-Ameri­
cans and market a large number 
of the calves to junior exhibitors

for show purposes. Dahl is 
active in numerous church 
activities, has been a 4-H and 
Boy Scout leader, is a former 
basketball referee and is listed 
in the Blue Book of Texas. He 
has been president and vice 
president of the Five State 
Shorthorn Association and cur­
rently is a director for that 
organization. He has been a 
director for several years of the 
Texas Shorthorn Association 
and is presently serving as vice 
president. He has served on the 
Texas delegation to the annual 
meetings of the American 
Shorthorn Associaiton for many 

years. He has served on the 
steer sifting committee of the 
Southwestern Exposition Ac Fat 
Stock Show and Houston Stock 
Show. Dahl is also a member of 
the American Cattle Breeders 
Hall of Fame, Texas edition.

The Robert Dahl family also 
includes his wife, Suellen; their 
three children, Wade. Brenda, 
and Scott; Angie, wife of Wade, 
and their daughter, Jennifer.

Pringle-Morse 
School Begins 

Aug. 25
The Pringle-Morse School, 

located in Morse, will begin 
classes Aug. 25 at 8:30 a.m. 
Registration is set for the week 
beginning Aug. 16.

There are approximately 75 to 
80 students who will attend 
school there. The school has 
kindergarten through 8th 
grade.

Two new teachers at the 
school this year are Collette 
Trammell and Helen Lee.

As of Tuesday morning, the 
board was still looking for a 
coach and science teacher.

Teachers are kindergarten. 
Peggy Wilkinson; first grade. 
Rhema Harris, second grade, 
Collete Trammell; third grade,

Betty Clemmons; fourth grade, 
Shari Wilkinson. Junior high 
teachers are Ruth Powers, 
Peggy Lewis, George Snider 
and Helen Lee.

Many a person eats
away his insides being 
en v iou s  o f  o th ers  and 
thereby destroys his own 
personality.

First Guide To Historic Sites
The meaning, spirit and feel 

of Texas’ heritage will come 
alive in a first-time guide to 
historic shrines and sites that 
every Texan should visit.

The booklet on where to go to 
experience the Lone Star story 
is a Texas Heritage Project of 
the Texas Historical Founda­
tion. This handy heritage refer­
ence will be distributed free to 
schools, tourist bureaus, librar­
ies and chambers of commerce.

Mrs. W.R. Knowles, chair­
man of the activity, requests 
that every Texan submit sites 
which have personally in­
creased their understanding 
and appreciation of the unique 
and colorful heritage of their 
home state.

"W e would like for every 
proud Texan to submit those

locations which they recant- 
mend their children, grandchil­
dren. out-of-state guests and 
newcomers should visit," Mrs 
Knowles emphasized.

"This much needed guide 
will be of great assistance to 
new and native citizens in 
discovering the roots of Texas' 
traditional values of courage, 
independence, work ethic and 
freedom of opportunity. Visiting 
these significant shrines, m o" 
uments and sites will heighten 
the awareness of and streng­
then ties to our incomparable 
legacy." Mrs. Knowles con­
tinued.

Suggestions for those sites 
every Texan should visit can be 
sent to: Texas Heritage Project, 
Box 12243, Austin, Tx. 78711.
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Congressman Hightower's Washington Report
Because of my long-standing 

advocacy of a balanced federal 
budget, and in view of the 
Congress' and Administration's 
continuing difficulty in achiev­
ing that goal, it is clear to me 
that stricter procedural rules 
and stronger fiscal medicine are 
needed to correct the cheif 
cause of inflation, high interest 
rates and recession: chronic 
budget deficits. Although in the 
past. 1 have favored amending 
out constitution as a last resort. 
I am increasingly convinced that 
we need to take this step, and 
we need to do so now.

The amendment 1 am co­
sponsoring. H.J.R. 350. would 
require a three-fifths vote of 
both houses of Congress before 
any spending over the budget 
could be allowed. That three- 
fifths is extremely difficult to 
get on any vote, regardless of 
which political party controls 
the House or Senate. The only 
exception to the amendment 
would be if the President 
declared a national emergency 
such as war or disaster which

might require special spending.
I have been on record as 

favoring a balanced federal 
budget since 1961, and my 
voting in Congress has been 
with that as a top priority. 
Although many of us have 
fought through the years to cut 
spending, demands on the 
federal dollar have intensified. 
Last January. President Rea­
gan. despite his advocacy of a 
balanced budget, submitted a 
1983 fiscal year budget proposal 
to Congress containing a whop­
ping $184 billion deficit esti­
mate. I think that points out the 
difficulty of doing what must be 
done.

In just twenty-one years, 
from I9bl to 1982. federal 
spending increased from $98 
billion to $725 billion, a 740% 
rise. Many factors are respon­
sible: the Vietnam War. stag­
gering OPEC oil price increas­
es. but most of all. ever-expand­
ing domestic spending designed 
to meet the needs of a modern 
nation<

1 have argued for some time

that the way the disease of 
inflation, and bring down inter­
est rates, is for Congress and 
the Administration to make 
hard choices and bring spend­
ing into line with revenue 
gradually, but firmly, over a 
fixed period of time. A constitu­
tional amendment will not ma­
gically balance the budget 
itself, but it will give us a 
mechanism making it much 
harder to deficit-spend. It will 
refocus the congressional 
spending bias away from chron­
ic dificits and toward sensible 
fiscal policy.

WINNING CROP DISASTER 
AID FOR FARMERS

On July 15th, the Department 
of Agriculture announced that 
farmers whose crops were des­
troyed by intense rain. wind, 
hailstorms and cold weather in 
May and June in a 40-county 
area of West Texas would be 
receiving emergency disaster 
assistance. This announcement 
was a major victory for many of 
us who have been working to

get the Administration to res­
pond to our farm communities 
worsening depression.

The request for help was first 
made in a letter to Agriculture 
Secretary Block from me. Rep. 
Charles Stenholm and Rep, 
Kent Hance on June 25th, 
followed up by our invitation to 
Deparment officials to inspect 
the damaged areas. They 
agreed to come down, and their 
subsequent estimates were that 
some 2.3 million acres of 4 
million were affected. Between 
$50 and $60 million in cotton 
alone was devastated

In the meantime. Senators 
Bentsen. Tower and Governor 
Clements expressed concern 
and actively worked with us to 
convince the Administration of 
the need of act. Numerous farm 
groups and local officials work­
ed with U.S.D.A. personnel, 
and a strong and successful 
bipartisan effort got the aid 
approved. Producers of cotton, 
wheat and feed grains will be 
receiving financial aid disaster 
payments based on the percen­

tage of crop they lost. Hopefully 
this will help many survive 
these natural disasters coming 
on top of the worst farm 
depression since the I930's. 
Thirty-two of our district's 33 
counties were successfully in­
cluded in the aid package, as 
were Baylor, Knox, Kent and 
Floyd counties which become 
part of the 13th District at the 
end of the year through redis­
tricting.

THE SCHOOL PRAYER 
AMENDMENT

I have always been one who 
believe that our country’s past, 
present and future welfare was 
and is greatly dependent on our 
dedication to religious freedom 
and private worship. The offi­
cial atheism of the Soviet Union 
and the religious fanaticism of 
Khomeni's Iran are extreme 
examples of government denial 
or government dominance of 
religion. Just as it is constitu­
tionally and politically proper 
that we Americans continue to 
observe the principle of "separ­
ation of Church and State," I 
also believe that government 
should not interfere with or 
deny the free practice of 
religion.

There have been a number of
proposals for a constitutional 
amendment to “ restore school 
prayer." Most of these propo­
sals. unfortunately, have been 
worded in such a way that they 
would probably create more 
legal and religious problems 
than they would resolve. Many 
religious leaders, as well as 
respected legal scholars, agree 
that we must not put anything 
in the Constitution that could be 
twisted into government man­
dated worship. I do not believe 
that prayer should ever become 
perverted into a "compelled 
public ritual." At that point, it 
is no longer prayer in the true 
sense.

However, ever since the 
Supreme Court's landmark de­
cision prohibiting state or local 
authorities from requiring an 
official state prayer in com­
munity schools, 1 have been 
increasingly concerned about 
the widespread misbelief that 
the Supreme Court banned all 
prayer from our public schools. 
Subsequently lower federal 
court decisions have further 
muddied the legal waters and 
contributed to public misunder-
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standing. Therefore, I am sup­
porting a resolution for a 
con stitu tion a l am endm ent 
which reads as follows:

NOTHING IN THIS CON­
STITUTION SHALL BE 
CONSTRUED TO PROHI 
BIT INDIVIDUAL OR 
GROUP PRAYER IN PUB 
LIC SCHOOLS OR OTHER 
PUBLIC INSTITUTIONS. 
NO PERSON SHALL BE 
REQUIRED BY THE UNIT 
ED STATES OR BY ANY 
STATE TO PARTICIPATE 
IN PRAYER.

This would, in my judgement, 
remove the uncertainty that has 
existed since the Supreme 
Court's decision and would not 
violate the important principle 
of Church-State separation. If 
such a resolution comes to the 
House, I will vote to submit it to 
the states for ratification. This 
is an affirmation of what I have 
always believed the law to be 
and what most people believed 
prior to the Court’ s decision and 
the later actions of other courts. 

DEFENSE, CIVIC LEADER­
SHIP AWARDS RECEIVED 
On July 3rd in Wichita Falls, I 

was honored by the military 
personnel at Sheppard Air 
Force Base as the first recipient 
of the new Sheppard Air Force 
Base Contributor Award. Major 
General Harry A. Morris, Base 
Commander, made the presen­

tation citing my "support of the 
various missions at SAFB, the 
Air Force and the United 
States." Sheppard AFB has 
come a long way and has 
become one of the most import­
ant tmining bases in the United 
States.

Earlier this year, 1 was 
honored to receive a National 
Security Leadership Award for 
my work in Congress to rebuild 
and strengthen our defense 
posture over the years. The 
Award was presented by the 
Americans Security Council, the 
executive committee of the 
Coalition for Peace Through 
Strength The Coalition is an 
organization of pro-defense 
groups throughout the U.S. 
which includes the Veterans of 
Foreign Wars and the American 
Legion.

• • • • F O O D F O l* * * *
•• TODAY’ S THOUGHT ••

■ • The dogma* of the qatot 
paat are Inadeqaato to the 
stormy present. The occaaioa Is 
piled high with i 
we mast rise with the t 
. .  As oar case la aew, so mast 
we think anew, and act aaew. 
We mast disenthrall ourselves, 
and then we shall save oar 
country. .

Abraham Lincoln, 
16th President, to Congress 
during the Civil War, 1862

North Plains Field 
Day August 18

AMARILLO, TEXAS People 
interested in ways to cut farm 
production costs are invited to 
the North Plains Field Day, 
Wednesday, August 18, near 
Etter, Texas. Dr. G.B. Thomp­
son, Texas A&M Research 
Director, will host this annual 
tour. Featured will be research 
on limited tillage and irrigation 
The program will start at 1:30 
p.m. by the headquarters of the 
Texas A&M North Plains Re­
search Field located about 1.5 
miles east and 1 mile north of 
Etter

The program will begin with a 
Welcome by Joe Cox. Chairman 
of the North Plains Research 
Field Steering Committee. Dr. 
Bob Merrifield, Associate Dir­
ector will discuss the overall 
research program of the Texas 
Agricultural Experiment Sta­
tion. A tour of research in the 
field will follow the opening 
program.

Cotton, corn and sorghum 
variety trials will be the first 
stops on the tour. According to 
Cecil Regier, manager of the 
research field. Paymaster 14S 
cotton produced over a bale per 
acre and grossed 230 dollars per 
acre in 1981. This variety was 
markedly more resistant to drift 
from 2,4-D than the other 36 
varieties evaluated.

Over 90 hybrids each of corn 
and sorghum are being evaluat­
ed with a high level of irrigation 
and fertility. These trials will be 
discussed by Kenneth Hollo­
way, Moore County Extension 
Agent, and Dr. Frank Petr, 
Area Agronomist with the 
Texas Agricultural Experiment 
Service.

Tillage systems on dryland 
and under center pivot irriga­
tion will be explained by Dr. 
Paul Unger. USDA Soil Scien­
tist, and Dr. Dan Undersander. 
Texas Agricultural Experiment 
Station Agronomist. Unger will 
describe research conducted for 
15 years at the USDA Research 
Laboratory at Bushland and a 
new experiment at Etter in 
which limited irrigation, furrow 
diking and limited tillage will be 
integrated. Undersander has 
four tillage systems under high 
and low pressure center pivot 
systems. Corn and sorghum are 
planted under each pivot. Peo­

ple on the tour will be able to 
see how furrow diking and 
no-tillage greatly reduce runoff 
under a low pressure pivot.

Efficiency of high and low 
pressure sprinkler systems has 
been evaluated for three years 
by Tom Marek, Agricultural 
Engineer. His research shows 
that crop yield is not affected by 
pressure of the irrigation sys­
tem.

Finally, Dr. Wyatte Harman 
will discuss economic analyses 
of several minimum tillage and 
irrigation systems.

Reducing production cost 
while maintaining high yields 
will be the key to economic 
survival for farmers. "Observ­
ing our research at Etter will 
help farmers toward that goal". 
Dr. Tompson said.

1

AUGUST 21

Ultra Suede fabric is 
being shown in early fall 
suits and dresses. An attrac­
tive suit was shown in rich 
purple with a blended tie- 
neck blouse.

Was that new outfit 
really worth the money? 

* • * *
P ro g re s s  i s n ’ t 

achieved by following the 
crowd.

DEALERS SUPPLY 
AUCTION

Saturday, August 28*10:00 A.M.
1 m il* West of H o p * Rd. on th *  South sk i*

of 1-40 W ** t  In Amarillo, T * z m .
1979 Ford 3 / 4  Ton Pickup 
1976 Mazda Pick-up 
Tandem Axle Trailer 
Furniture for 3 Offices 
Parts bins and shelves
W ell equipped shop w ith 18 ” Lathe - Band S a w s - 
Drill Presses • Hydraulic P ress Lincoln Welder - 
Bench G rinders Dollies - Carts - V ises - Sand 
Blaster - Vacuum  Pumps - Heaters - Fans - Work 
Benches
Tremendous stock of parts, starters, alternators. York 
compressors, clutches, pressure and clutch plates, 
water pumps armatures solenoids and large stock of 
pans for building new alternators S20.000 bearing 
inventory (sell as 1 lot), hiten bars and pins, pulleys, 
pneumatic and electric tools, new end used hand toots
2 large rooms full of parts for tractors and trucks

AUCTIOKMM » ■WOKKWR « A P P W U W
L  H Nelson TXGS-071-00W

1816 S. Kentucky - Bidg. C *10 
Amarine, Taxaa 78102 
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Voter turnout verges on 
the pathetic these days, 
because politics smell too 
bad to too many people.

I have a couple of sug­
gestions

"F irst, election cam­
paigns are too long, with 
too much opportunity to 
b u y  an election. These 
should be shortened to no 
more than 90 days, with 
Texas primary elections 
about Sept 1, 60 days or 
so before the established 
general election in early 
November

Second, politicians build 
corrupt little empires when 
they hold an office a long 
time. Let’ s limit time in 
legislative offices to a 
maximum of eight years -  
then. UP or OUT

When a fe llow  stays 
around Austin too long, he 
forgets that the people he 
is supposed to represent 
live bade In bis district.

R.C. PORTER 
*  H fm M m w  Candid*?* hr 

State R#er»»e»feti»».
I l t b  D istrict.

Institute On Substance H ig h to w er Urges
Abuse Set

The ninth Annual Panhandle 
Institute on Substance Abuae. 
scheduled fot Sept V and 10 at 
West Teiaa University, will 
feature two nationally-known 
eapetts on substance abuse as 
keynote speakers

Dr Donald MacDonald, pres­
ident-elect of the Florida Pedn- 
atric Society, will keynote the 
first day's activities with a 
presentation on drugs and 
youth. Dr MacDonald has been 
affiliated with the American 
Council on Marijuana and the 
National Institute on Drug 
Abuse.

The second day's activities 
will begin with a speech by Dr. 
Douglas Talbott He began his 
medical career as a cardiologist 
and worked at a senior con­
sultant for NASA, helping se­
lect crews for the Mercury, 
Gemini and Apollo projects. He 
is currently director of the 
Alcohol and Drug Program at 
the Ridgevtew Institute in 
Smyrna, Georgia.

Both MacDonald and Talbott 
will be participating in concur­
rent workshops during the days 
they are associated with the 
institute. Joining them will be 
more than a dosen national, 
state and local experts in 
various facets of the drug and 
alcohol problem, DWI legisla­
tion and employee assistance 
programs.

In addition to the workshops 
dealing specifically with sub­
stance abuse, a roundtable 
discussion featuring state elect­
ed officials, judges and proba­
tion officers will look into 
proposed DWI legislation and 
how it will affect the role of the

Potter County Sheriff T.L. 
Baker will also be featured the 
second day, talking about 
county-based restitution centers 
where offenders reimburse 
their victims of their crimes as 
part of their rehabilitation.

Area lawmen, hospital emer­
gency room personnel and 
anyone else who comes in 
contact with violent, aggressive 
and intoxicated persons will 
benefit from a day-long work­
shop being presented by Lucy 
Dowling, an education special­
ist with the Texas Hospital 
Association.

One of the special features of 
this year's institute will be a 
performance of Through Our 
Eyes, an original drama with 
music written and presented by 
participants in Amarillo Theatre 
Centre's summer children's 
program It will be presented 
the night of Sept 9, The play 
focuses on the effects of alcohol­
ism, drug abuse and peer 
pressure on the family.

The other special event will 
be the second annual Distin­
guished Service Award, presen­
ted by the institute's organizing 
committee Last year, the honor 
went to former Potter County 
Judge Branch T. Archer for his 
pioneering work in establishing 
the Panhandle Alcoholic Re­
covery Center at the Old 
Amarillo Air Force Base

The institute is planned and 
conducted by a subcommittee of 
the Panhandle Regional Alco­
holism Advisory Committee, 
and advisory group to the 
PRPC's Board of Directors. It is 
co-sponsored by 16 area agen­
cies and companies. Last year, 
it drew a crowd of 165 About 
200 are expected this year

Cong. Hightower Will Be Speaker 

For USDA Event
Congressman Jack E. High­

tower of Vernon will be the 
principal speaker at a field day 
to be held at the USDA Soil 
Conservation Service Plant Ma­
terials Center at Knox City on 
August 25, 1982.

Congressman Hightower 
serves on the conservation, 
ctedit, and rural development 
subcommittee within the Com­
mittee on Appropriations. He 
will speak about 12:30 p.m

Monnie Edwards, district 
conservationist for SCS at 
Spearman, said the public is 
being invited to the event. The 
center serves both Texas and 
Oklahoma.

Guided tours will be conduct­
ed through the 90-acre center 
from 9.00 a m, to 2:30 p.m. The 
center is located on FM 1292, 2 
miles north and 2 VS miles west 
of Knox City.

POLITICAL AD

Regulatory Relief For 
Farmers, Ranchers, 

Landowners

A barbeque lunch will be 
available on a prepaid basis at 
*♦ 50 per plate. Payment should 
be sent to Ms. Doris Crown- 
over, Chamber of Commerce, 
Box 91, Knox City, Texas 79529 
by August 20.

Seed or rootstock from native 
plants that show potential for 
solving specific soil and water 
conservation problems are col­
lected, then grown and evaluat­
ed at the Knox City Center. The 
more promising ones are then 
tested under field conditions by 
farmers and ranchers cooperat­
ing with local soil and water 
conservation districts. Selec­

tions which prove superior to 
commercial varieties are then 
released to seed gtowets. These 
producers then grow seed and 
sell it to the public.

Several hundred strains of 
grasses, legumes, forbs, and 
woody plants are being tested at 
Knox City.

SCS also operates a plant 
materials center at Kingsville in 
cooperation with the Caesar 
Kleberg Wildlife Research In­
stitute, Texas AScI University, 
and the South Texas Associa­
tion of Soil and Water Conser­
vation Districts. The South 
Texas center was established in 
1981.

Congressman Jack High­
tower today urged a key House 
committee to act on his bill to 
reform U S. water laws as they 
affect playa lake areas like those 
in the 13th District. Hightower 
testified before the House Com­
mittee on Merchant Marine and 
Fisheries arguing for changes in 
federal law that would provide 
relief to farmers, ranchers and 
landowners whose land includes 
playa lake areas.

Under the present wording of 
the law, playa lakes which only 
contain water briefly after rain­
storms, are included in the 
definition of "navigable water­
ways." Hightower is seeking a 
clearer definition of navigable 
waterways which would exclude 
such playa lake areas. High­
tower claims federal jurisdiction 
over plava lake areas is unne­
cessary and federal bureaucra­
tic intrusion into the rights of 
landowners and others.

"W hen the Federal Water 
Pollution Control Act was writ­
ten in 1972. its language 
regarding restrictions on 
dredge and fill operations in 
Section 404 were much too 
v a g u e ."  Hightower said. 
"Therefore, we’ve come to the 
ridiculous situation where the 
federal government has ques­
tioned a man's right to fill in 
eight feet of swampy area in his 
backyard because it may techni­
cally come under the jurisdic­
tion of the Act. It's this kind of 
federal intrusion that I'm trying 
to eliminate with my bill." 
Hightower was referring to a 
case of a man in Appleton. 
Wisconsin, who was warned by 
federal officials that he was in 
technical violation of the Act 
and that he faced possible fines 
of up to 525,000.

The Highjower bill, H R

Experiment Station 
Plans Field Day

LUBBOCK--Research aimed 
at helping High Plains farmers
make better management deci­
sions about their crops will be 
demonstrated Sept. 14 at the 
73rd annual field day of the 
Texas Agricultural Experiment 
Station (TAES) at Lubbock and 
Halfway.

The Texas A&M University 
High Plains Research Facility at 
Halfway, 14 miles west of 
Pla nview on U.S. Hwy. 70 is 
the host this year, said Dr. Bill 
Ott, resident director of re­
search for the Lubbock-Halfw ay 
centers. The annual program 
alternates between the two 
facilities, in cooperation with 
the High Plains Research Foun­
dation.

Five major displays are plan­
ned on the tours of the research 
sites at Halfway, said James 
Bordovsky, research agricultu­
ral engineer and field day 
chairman. These stops will 
illustrate research being con­
ducted in weed research, cotton 
breeding and variety testing, 
and cotton bollworm control;

explain work on new manage­
ment strategies, including m - 
farm computer application; and 
display a new multi-function 
irrigation system which will 
apply both water and chemicals 
through a dual nozzle system.

Also featured on the tour will 
be research on sorghum im­
provement, mite control, soil 
fertility, grain sorghum perfor­
mance. and soybean evaluation. 
Farm machinery, irrigation 
equipment and other farm 
implements will be on display 
by area manufacturers and 
suppliers.

Tours will begin at 1 p.m and 
end at 5 p.m.

The field day is a cooperative 
presentation of TAES, the High 
Plains Research Foundation, 
the Texas Agricultural Exten­
sion Service and the Agricultu­
ral Research Service of the U.S. 
Department of Agriculture.

Professional staffs of these 
agencies will be on hand to 
answer questions and discuss 
problems with agricultural pro­
ducers, home owners and gar­
deners, Bordovskv said.

Ranch when the rodeo is held on 
September 5 and 6. More than 
200 boys will be tiding bareback 
broncs, Brahma bulls, steers, 
calves and stick-hotses. de­
pending upon their ages A 
specialty act that proved very 
popular last year, a wild-steer 
race, will be included in the

B oys R a n c h  R o d e o

3962. would make clear that for 
purposes of dredge and fill 
operations, the federal govern 
ment would have jurisdiction 
only over navigable waterways 
which could be used for inter 
state transportation, the ongi 
nal intent of the 1972 Act. The 
bill also re-establishes clear 
state jurisdiction over those 
waters not included under the 
navigable waters definition 

“ There's a situation on the 
Trinity River in Texas where a 
federal district court judge 
reviews all Section 404 permits 
for a 200-mile segment of the 
river," Hightower explained 
"and we had a highway near 
Amarillo stopped in the middle 
of construction because a part of 
it was being built through a low 
area that was technically under 
the jurisdiction of the Act. 
Farmers and ranchers who own 
land with these areas think it’s 
silly for the government to call 
them wetlands' and I certainly 
agree I don't think it’ s the 
federal government's business 
if a farmer or rancher in my 
district digs a trench to water 
cattle or crops.”  Hightower told 
the Committee.

The American National Farm 
Bureau has endorsed the High­
tower bill and the Assistant 
Secretary of the Army for Civil 
Works, William Gianelli, testi­
fied that he, too, agreed with 
the intent of the bill. The Army 
Corps of Engineers, which is 
involved in water and construe 
tion issues, comes under Gian- 
elli's jurisdiction. Although 
other similar pieces of legisla 
tion have been introduced in the 
House, the Committee prefer­
red to consider the Hightower 
bill during its review of the 
Section 404, Dredge and Fill, 
part of the Act.

Ptnt-sixe cowboys on profes­
sional rodeo animals will high­
light the 38th Annual Bovs 
Ranch Rodeo that gets under 
way over the Labor Day week­
end.

Area riding clubs from a 
trt-state area will join the nearly 
400 boys of Cal Farley's Boys

action this year. Approximately 
10,000 people, including many 
of the Ranch's former boys, are 
expected to attend the two 
performances at 2:30 p.m., 
Sunday and Monday.

Reserve box seat tickets for 
*3.50 are on sale at the Ranch

administrative office at 600 
West 11th Street in Amarillo, 
and can be obtained by calling 
806/372-2341 General admix 

sion tickets are 12.50 andean be 
purchased at the rodeo arena or 
in Amarillo. Barbecue beef 
plates will be sold by the boys 
for only *3 00. The Boys Ranch 
Rodeo is the only rodeo of its 
kind in the nation, according to 
Ranch officials.

Pass it
NOW

Fly Free to Alaska —
7 or 11 Day Complete Alaska/Yukon Vacation Featuring 

Inside Passage Cruise in September.
From $1190 to $1605 per person

r ^ O i W H E A T H E A R T  T R A V e l , i n c .;
7 S.W. 3rd. Perryton Office Plaza Perryton, TX

o n ! !

HOURS: »:M A M. to 5 : «  P.M. 
MONDAY THRU FRIDAY

Whether you travel by air, land or sea 
Remember our services are FREE.

Please Call ... 435-9646
Eve Childers,

Manager Travel Consultant 
Jerry & Harriett Conner 

Travel Agents
L. Owners >

This Monday, August 16 
thru Sunday, August 22. i

W e t r e a t  yo u  lik e  a T exan . ̂

Dairii 
Queen
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Vp With People” In Perry tont**^»t?^**+**
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"The opportunities ire vist 
that come with being a part of 
Up With People. But it's up to 
the individual to take advantage 
of such opportunities . . .  to 
learn and grow. The combined 
experiences of travel, perform­
ing. living with host families, 
and an exposure to broad 
cultures is something you can't 
put a price on ."

The words come from Mark 
Conzemius. 23 and a native of 
Minnesota who. aiong with 
18-year-old Brett Strobel from 
Boise. Idaho, is in town to 
promote the upcoming Perryton 
stop of Up With People. Conze­
mius toured with Up With 
People in 1979-80 and now 
works as a staffer for the 
international touring group. 
The two will be in Perryton for a 
couple of weeks before the 
110-member troupe arrives, 
working out details of the show 
and gaining an insight to the 
Perryton community.

"W e want to get a feel for the 
Perryton community." said 
Conzemius. "W e don't want to 
be just another organization to 
come into town, hit the motel, 
perform, and catch the first bus 
out." Indeed, the entire Up 
With People program is careful­
ly planned and executed in an 
overall attempt to "build 
bridges of understanding and 
communication among peoples, 
cultures and countries."

The cast of Up With People 
will be arriving in Perryton two 
weeks from tonight. A barbeque 
dinner will be hosted by United 
Supermarket and the Wheat- 
heart Shrine Club, where the 
cast will meet their hosting 
families. The troupe coming to 
Perryton includes young people 
(ages 18 to 26) from 32 different 
states and more than a dozen 
foreign countries. Up With 
People has a total of seven 
casts, five of which tour in 
various parts of the U.S. and 
then go abroad.

The entire Up With People 
movement, more than 500 cast 
members strong, has only re­
cently organized for the 1982-83 
year. Dress rehearsals were 
held in Tucson. Ariz., on July 
14. The Perryton show will be 
the second stop of the season.

"Up With People is an 
educational experience" ex­
plained Conzemius, "and new 
casts are chosen each year. In 
other words, we don't have any 
repeaters." The annual budget 
of Up With People is nearly $8 
million. Just over half of the 
funding comes from performan­
ces and ticket sales. Just under 
a third comes from student fees 
(the cast members pay a tuition 
fee of $5,300 each) and about 
one-fifth of the revenue comes 
from gifts and grants.

First National Bank of Perry­
ton is sponsoring the group in 
Perryton.

The cast will be in Perryton 
for three nights Saturday, 
August 21, is the big day. of 
course, as Up With People will 
appear in the Wheatheart of the 
Nation Celebration parade as 
well as presenting their concert 
at 7 p.m. in the high school 
auditorium. (Tickets are on sale 
at the First National Bank and 
the Chamber of Commerce.)

In between, the group will be 
making various tours in and 
around Perryton. Plans call for 
the touring of a wheat farm 
operation as well as a local oil 
and gas-related business. Cast 
members are hoping to be able 
to make a stop out at Senior 
Village. Other activities will 
include a mixer, put on by the 
Chamber of Commerce, and the 
10K and fun runs, in which 
some of the cast is expected to 
take part.

The two ambassadors of the 
Up With People show doing 
promotion work in Perryton 
from different backgrounds. 
Conzemius hails from the small 
town of Madena in Minnesota 
and was graduated earlier this 
year from North Dakota State 
University. He earned a bache­
lor's of university studies de­
gree, with an emphasis on 
communications. As a staffer 
this year with Up With People, 
he received a salary that doesn't 
do a whole lot more than cover 
expenses. But that doesn't tint 
his enthusiasm whatsoever.

Strobel, meanwhile, is just 
fresh out of high school and is 
sewing his oats, so to speak, 
right here in Perryton. In high 
school, he was a member of the 
choir, debate team. Key Club, 
and was a columnist for the 
school newspaper. The Borah 
High School Newspaper, by the 
way, was judged one of the top 
five in the U.S.

Joining Conzemius in promo­
tion and public relations is just 
one of Strobel's assignments for 
the year. He will be singing and 
dancing with Up With People, 
but had expressed a desire to 
learn about and be exposed to 
public relations. Such is the

educational experience and the 
opportunities that Conzemius 
referred to earlier.

Here in Perryton. the two will 
be speaking at various civic and 
service clubs as well as meeting 
with the area media and finaliz­
ing plans for the upcoming 
show. Both also are on the 
lookout for young people of the 
Perryton community who might 
be interested in joining the tour 
group next year. In every town, 
interviews are conducted with 
interested young people. “ Pure 
talent isn't the measure of who 
can be in Up With People," said 
Conzemius. " I ’m not a great 
singer but I had the want to be a

part. The interviews will be 
conducted following the Satur­
day night concert.

As of mid-week, some 30 
families had signed up to be 
host families for the Up With 
People cast. That's about half of 
the total number needed.

Teresa Brillhart is in charge of 
assigning host families and 
anyone interested in hosting a 
student or two should contact 
her. Conzemius and Strobel can 
be contacted through the bank.

OPPONENTS
Stratford 
FRITCH 

GRUVER 
STINNETT 
Sunray 

♦Bovs Ranch 
•Canadian 
♦DALHART 
•RIVER ROAD 
•Perryton

p  ‘ Denotes District 1-AAA Games a
★ ★ ★  ★  irk  ★  ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ £

Positive Proof 
The most im pressive 

testimony for tolerance is 
a golden wedding anni­
versary.
-Tim es. Marshalltown, la

Definition
'  Radical: A person who 
can out talk you on any 
subject.

-Pilot. Brunswick. Ga.

•— •— •— -< -4 -^ e —

;  1982 J.V. *  9th LYNX SCHEDULE
j DATE OPPONENTS PLACE TIME
e Sept. 9 Canandian There 5:00-7:00

Sept. 16 Perrvton There 5:00-7:00
1 Sept. 23 GUYMON HERE 5:00-7:00

Sept. 30 DALHART HERE 5:00-7:00
' Oct. 7 WHEELER (9th) HERE 5:00

Oct. 7 BOYS RANCH (JV) HERE 7:00
Oct. 14 CANADIAN HERE 5:00-7:00

i Oct. 21 Dalhart There 5:00-7:00
Oct. 28 River Road There 5:00-7:00

1 Nov. 4 PERRYTON HERE 5:00-7:00

1982 7th & 8th GRADE LYNX SCHEDULE
DATE OPPONENTS PLACE TIME
Sept. 9 CANADIAN HERE 5:00-6:30

t Sept. 16 PERRYTON HERE 5:00-6:30
Sept. 23 Guymon There 5:00-6:30

1 Sept. 30 Dalhart There 5:00-6:30
Oct. 7 Boys Ranch There 5:00-6:30
Oct. 14 Canadian There 5:00-6:30

, Oct. 21 DALHART HERE 5:00-6:30
Oct. 28 RIVER R )AD HERE 5:00-6:30

i Nov. 4 Perryton There 5:00-6:30
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Sugar Coating 
Culture is what makes 

us think we'll like some­
thing we won't.

•Leader, Tripoli, la.

Strange
Conceit is a funny 

disease. It makes every­
one sick except the fellow 
who has it.

-Grit.

Sandra Shaker, senior 
economist, Chase 
Econometrics Assn.: 
"I see a further edging 

down of ihterest rates, but 
not a plunge."

festival 
in

IUSIC

It’s singing. Its  dancing. It's en­
tertainment like you've never seen.

The Up With People Show is an 
internationally acclaim ed cast of 
over 100 young people who sing 
and dance their way right into 
your heart. With music from home 
and abroad.

Don t miss this chance to see  
this beautifully choreographed, 
colorful festival of music.

Saturday, August 2 1 — 7 p.m. 
Perryton High School Auditorium

Tickets On Sale At First National Bank And Chamber of Commerce Office

Reserved Seats — $5.50 Adults 
General Admission — $5.00 Adults

$4.50 Students & Senior Citizens 
$4.00 Students & Senior Citizens

m
First National Bank

'Perryton, Texas
____„  8 0 6 4 3 5 -5  —
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News

Entertainment
Tonight

Green Acres
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Sports
Tonight
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This Old 
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Born to the 
Wind

Ape Man1 Movie: 
Root tar'
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Geographic
Special

Movie; The 
Boys from 
BraziF

Magnum, P I. Movie: The 
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Pnmo Naws
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All Craaturas 
Great and 
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Diff rant 
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Gimme a Break Movif: 
Birth of

- Unfolding
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Sixth Annual 
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the Stars

•
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! 30

Arthur
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Hill Street 
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the Beaties 20 20

Sing out 
America

News
•
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News
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rar Report 
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Report
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Another Lila Saturday
Night

News

Quincy

All In the 
Family

Movie: Young 
Wemors'

Sports
Tonight

Crossfire
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30

Sun Off

Lata Might 
with David

- Nightlme

Burns A Allan

Jack Benny 
Show

Movie: Roms 
Adventure’

Movie: 
McMillan A

-
Naws

Moneylma
Update
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Lettarman

NBC haws
Overnight

Movie J O. 
and the Salt 
Flat Kid'

Vega* Married 
Joan 

My Little 
Margie

*
Wile: Til 
Death Do Ua 
Part' Movie: Fort 

Apache
r  * l  *

Mika Douglas 
People Now

On August 24. 1572. 
the mass murders of 
Protestants began in 
France, on an order from 
King Charles IX. incited 
by Catherine de Medici.

Over 2.000 were killed 
in Paris alone, and many 
more all over France. The 
Reformation had begun in 
Germany earlier in the 
century and many of 
France's leading thinkers 
and intellectuals had 
joined the reform move­
ment.

French Protestants,

known as Huguenots, 
were persecuted and 
murdered on and off in 
France for centuries, 
many fleeing for their 
lives to America, often to 
Massachusetts. New 
York. Pennsylvania. Vir­
ginia and South Carolina.

The 24th. known for 
the festival of St. Bartho­
lomew. thus reminds the 
world annually of the folly 
of religious intolerance 
and fanaticism--probably 
responsbile for more kill­
ing in the world's history 
than any other thing.

THUI
Optimists

Apparently a great 
many of our present-day 
juries are composed of 
persons who can see no 
evil in anything.

-Banner. Nashville.

Too Absorbed 
Some people are like 

blotters. They soak every­
thing in. but get it all 
backward.

-Tribune, Chicago.

ANSWERS ACROSS ANSWERS DOWN

FRIDAY

1-Each 22-Deuce 1-Easy 20-Ade
5-Lever 24 Hose 2-Aliev 21-Men

10-Aleut 27-Danes 3-Cease 23-Camel
12-Agave 30-Ale 4 Hut 24-Hates
13-Slate 31-Gem 5-Last 25-Olive
14-Solos 32-Lip 6-Ego 26-Sedan
15- Yes 34-Tidal 7-Value 28- Elite
16-Net 36 Elide 8-Evoke 29-Sides
18-Uke 38-Evade 9-Reset 31 Glee
19 Yeast 39-Later 11-Tense 33-Pert
21 Meet 40-Sense 17-Etude 35-Ads

41-Pest 37-Lap

CROSSWORD
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PORTS OF CALL £
F0! TIAVH AND AIVINTIRI

BY EDWARD H. SUMS

ACROSS: 1-Apiece; 5-Simple machine: 10-Northern native: 
12-Desert plant; 13-Roofing material. 14-Musical numbers. 15-Af- 
ftrmatue; Ib-Tenms ...: 18-Musical instrument: 19-Baking need;
21-Encounter: 22-Playing card: 24-Apparel item: 2"-Great ......
30-Tavern item; 31-Precious stone; 32-Edge; 34-.....  waves;
36-Slur: 38-Escape; 39-Mo e recent: 40-Be aware of; 41-Annovtng 
person. DOWNt l-No' hard to do; 2 Back street: 3-Siop: 
4-Humble abode; 5-F\nal: 6-Conceit;  ̂Worth; 8-Call forth: 
9-Adjusi again; 11-Past or present; I "-Musical work; 20-Picnic 
drink: 21-Chess pieces; 23-Beast of burden: 24-Detests: 25-Shade 
of greet: 26-Automobile; 28-High society; 29-Surfaces; 31-Merri­
ment; 33-lmpudent: 35-Displays: 37-Splash against;

WASHINGTON. D C. -  
The next two months are 
glorious for enjoying the 
countryside. In the east, the 
most famous scenic drive is 
from west of Washington to 
northern Georgia--beginning 
as the Skyline Drive and 
turning into the Blue Ridge 
Parkway.

This is a 400-mile trip, 
along the top ridges of 
mountains. There are no 
trucks and no billboards, and 
one can drive betw een 55 and 
45. stopping at the hundreds 
o f  overlooks and parking 
areas.

October is the peak 
month for color, of course, 
but September land August 
in the higher altitudes) is 
also beautiful. A gap which 
has existed in the parkway 
for years has just been com­
pleted and its entire length is 
kept in top condition by 
federal maintenance crews. 
Free literature is available at 
various places along the 
parkway.

Motorists should double 
the driving time which would 
be needed on regular high­
ways. There are also few inns 
and lodges. They're often 
full in peak month October 
and thus one can plan _ 
turnoff at any of the many 
towns and cities along the 
way.

Utah. Colorado. Mon­
tana. California. Arizona and 
other western states 
(Oregon. Washington and 
Idaho in the northwest) offer 
many beautiful drives at 
higher altitudes. Utah is 
breath-taking and so are so 
many drives and parks in

California and Wyoming.
Nevada is spectacular in 

the Hoover Dam area, but 
most of it is flat dessert. New 
M exico, west Texas and 
Arizona offer dry. rocky and 
spectacular mountain coun­
try. Those who like that cli­
mate land the wind) would 
live nowhere else.

Colorado is close to Cali­
fornia when it comes to high 
mountain scenery But Cali­
fornia has the ocean--similar 
to areas in southern France 
and Italy on the Mediterra­
nean. where mountains for 
skiing are close to the ocean 
and provide a panoramic 
view and contrast.

The writer has found 
Honda delightful in Septem­
ber and October, after the 
summer rush and before the 
major winter season. Un­
crowded beaches, settled 
weather, fewer thunder­
storms and less haze are 
features of early fall weather 
in Florida.

h 's also the hurricane 
season. But today these 
gigantic. slow-moving
storms can be tracked rather 
accurately, and tourists al­
ways have time to move in­
land or away from these 
monstrous storms.

Inland, during September 
and October, the tornado 
season is past its peak: the 
mountains in any event lend 
to break up funnel cloud 
activity year-round. So fall at 
the beach or in the 
mountains is a nostalgic, 
colorful drink o f nature's 
beauty in a year coming to an 
end.

Malcolm Baldnge, Com­
merce Secretary, on 
tax cut:
‘ ‘ In the way 

budget deficits came out 
this year...certainly im­
plies that if wre had to do 
this all over again we 
would have asked for less 
of a tax decrease last 
year.”

Robert Ortner, chief 
economist. Depart­
ment of Commerce: 
"The July report is not 

as bad as it' appears, be­
cause it contains signs 
that the employment sit­
uation may be stabiliz­
ing...”

BIBLE VERSE
"B ear y e  one an­

other's burdens, and so 
fulfil the lavs o f Christ. "

1. Who was the author of 
this advice?
2. To whom was he 
writing at the time?
3. How can one obey the 
command?
4. Where may these 
words be found?
Answer* to Bible Vers*
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WHO KNOWS?
1. Locate Valley Forge.
2. What is the scientific 
term for basic living mat­
ter?
3. What class of animals 
are equally at home on 
land and in water?
4. What is a bentho-
scope?
5. Where was the first 
U S.hydroelectric plant 
built?
6. Define the phrase "auf 
wiedersehen."
7. When was the Big 
Apple a popular teen age 
dance?
8. For w hat was Dorothea 
Lynde Dix best known?
9. What holds the gases 
to the earth?
1 0 . W h ich  p r e s id e n t  
served the shortest term?
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The 19th
In August. 1812. this 

country was at war with 
Britain. Captain Isaac 
Hull in the frigate Consti­
tution sailed from Boston 
to demonstrate to the 
British that U.S. naval 
power was for real.

Largely contemptuous 
of the Americans, the 
British bet their regular 
warships could easily 
defeat American counter­
parts. On the 19th, some 
days out of Boston. Hull 
sighted the Guerriere. 
which opened fire at long 
range.

Holding his fire until 
very close. Hull quickly 
devastated his English 
opponent in a battle which 
cost the Royal Navy 300 
killed and wounded.

That strikingly demon­
strated to the world that 
America was a major sea 
power--with potent ships 
and well-trained crews-- 
not to be taken lightly.

For some people fish­
ing isn't the rest or 
relaxation it should be. If 
fishing requires the same 
mad pace our daily 
routine requires, it pro­
vides little recreational 
value.

Successful fishing is 
the small boy who sits 
happily dangling a hook 
from a bank-taking it
easy.

Or. it's the individual 
who finds relaxation, un­
hurried. in dangling bait 
with quiet hope and 
pleasure, not frenzied 
frustration and push
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HARDWARE STORE

Paint Summer
Bright! at great savings on the paint l|

Your loc»/ wdependen tly ow ned True Value Hardware Store has nationxi , 1, v.
G r U V G f T ©  e ° aS na! ° na c " a,n*buymg power.

fc*“ *w*' (tsy to Clean' Supt'D*'#
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Factory
To-You
Savings

PAINT NOW

Wall Finish
PAY LATER

98
GALLON

*. Good Housekeeping .
\ i ■

Get true wash-tnd we&r convenience in our finest 
flat latei. .. ideal for high-traffic areas-kitchens. 
hallways, children's rooms -because it stands up 
to repeated washings. P

X-O RUST 
SPRAY
ENAMEL

78

All Paint 
Brushes

20%
OFF!

All Caulking 
Compound

10% OFF!

16 FL. OZ.

With X-0 Rust Spray Enamel, the protection is in 
the JOB instead of the number o f coats. Rust 
protection is right in there with the finish. X -0

3M

jflfeathejM 98
GALLON

f  Custom Colors Higher
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x House
Custom Colors Higher

WEATHERALL HOUSE PAINT
Our finest acrylic latex house paint is now available in 
three attractive finishes1 The original flat finish and our 
new safin finish are both ideal for exterior wood and 
aluminum siding, shingles, brick, stucco, etc Weather All 
is stain and fade resistant, plus it’s high hiding too Dries 
fast, simple water cleanup Choose from 26 colors, black 
81 white HPX/SHP
Gloss Finish. Black & White 
Custom Colors Higher GHP 13.98 Gal.

SOLID COLOR
l a t e x  s t a in
s,«co Wood

I V17 Ru-lx B r » « _«3F
■

88<
6 -PACK 
SANDPAPER
Choose from line-grain , 
medium, or coarse-produc- 
tion sandpaper 9015/6/7

SOLID-COLOR 
LATEX STAIN

Covers the wood but doesn't hide the beeutiful rough 
wood texture Produces blister-resistent breather type 
finish Fade-resistant colors stay fresh lor years Easy 
soap-and-weter cleanup 32 colors end white. LS
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Conference Offers Ways 
To Use

Tractors Economically
LUBBOCK--Agricultural 

engineers, economists and trac­
tor specialists from industry and 
the Texas Agricultural Exten­
sion Service will share with 
farmers and implement dealers 
ideas to improve tractor effici­
ency at a daylong conference 
here Sept. 1.

Hie "Big Tractor Confer­
ence" is designed to help area 
farmers make the most econo­
mical use of their tractors and 
assist equipment dealers in 
matching the most desirable 
equipment to their customer's 
needs, said Elston Grubaugh. 
Extension agricultural engineer 
at Lubbock.

The conference at the South 
Park Inn, South Loop 289 at the 
Indiana Avenue exit, begins at 
10 a.m. Registration opens at 9 
a.m. A S7.50 registration fee 
includes lunch and conference 
proceedings.

Opening the conference will 
be Warren Lenius. test depart­
ment manager for Versatile 
Manufacturing Co.. Winnipeg. 
Manitoba, Canada. He will 
examine the place of increasing 
horsepower on the farm.

High speed farming with 
two-wheel-drive and four- 
wheel-drive equipment will be 
discussed by J. Charles Stein- 
man, factory marketing mana­
ger for John Deere Tractor 
Works, Waterloo, Iowa.

The use of computerized 
management tools to analyze 
tractor costs will be explained

by Extension agricultural eco­
nomist. Gary D. Condra of 
Lubbock.

Bob Beaman, merchandising 
manager for Stieger Tractor 
Co.. Fargo. N.D.. will report on 
electronics, the "wave of the 
future" in agricultural tractors. 
William P. Simpson, product 
information specialist with J.I. 
Case Co.. Racine, Wis.. will 
discuss tractor weighting and 
its effect on performance.

Tractor size and implement 
matching will be covered by 
Wally Post. Arlington district 
manager for Allis Chalmers 
Corp. A comparative analysis of 
radial and bias-play drive wheel 
tractor tires will be made by 
Lyle Bohnert, senior field de­
velopment engineer for B.F. 
Goodrich Co.. Franklin Park. III.

The role of four-wheel-drive 
tractors in row crop farming will 
be examined by Dave Hess, 
advanced design manager for 
crop production systems. Inter­
national Harvester. Hinsdale. 
III.

Soil compaction and its ma­
nagement will be discussed by- 
Edwin Colburn, Extension agro­
nomist and soil management 
specialist, College Station.

The program will conclude 
with a panel discussion by area 
farmers and equipment dealers. 
Henry O'Neal, Extension agri­
cultural engineer from College 
Station, will moderate the dis-

Radio/hack
DEALER Duma*. Texas

C om m ent On Sports
OLYMPICS * * ••

WASHINGTON. D. C. -  
The Olympic Games are only- 
two years away--in Los 
Angeles--and because the 
U.S. squad is training in 
Colorado at a special camp, 
financed by private industry, 
hints are already being aired 
about a U.S. triumph.

This is heady optimism. 
The Colorado Springs train­
ing camp is a good idea but it 
can’t match the nation-wide, 
government-financed sports 
program in Russia and East 
Germany. The Russians are 
heavily favored to win 1984 s 
Olympics, as they have been 
doing for years now. because 
of this massive government 
sports program.

U.S. men have done well 
even in recent years when 
the Russian medals total was 
much higher than the U.S. 
total. It's U.S. females who 
have done so miserably-

By Pete Frltchle

comparatively speaking. If 
U.S. women did as well as 
U.S. men in Olympic compe­
tition. the American team 
would have a good chance to 
lead in points at L.A.

A major effort is now- 
being made to correct that 
deficiency but it’s hoping for 
a lot to think it can be cor­
rected by 1984, that our girls 
can compete evenly with 
those from Russia and East 
Germany, who have been 
training hard (and are hard) 
for years.

The U.S. performance in 
the summer games at Los 
Angeles will be a success if 
total medals won are greater 
than in 1976 (The U.S. boy­
cotted the 1980 games in 
Moscow.) The Russian team, 
meanwhile, remains the 
favorite until it’ s clear the 
trend in the games is re­
versed.

Your Checklist For Savings

□ Calculators ■ From $6 95 to $49 95
□ Compact Stereo Systems •

Ideal For The Dorm

□ Watches and Clocks -
To Keep Your Running On Time

□ Alarm Clocks and Clock Radios
To Get You Up And At ’em In The Morning

□ Portable Tape Recorders •
Great For Recording Lectures And Seminars

□ Small Televisions-
Ideal For Car Or Dorm

□  Wide Selection Of Books -
Many Different Subjects. . .  Computers, AC/DC, 
Electronics, Electronic Math And Many Others

Batteries - To Keep Everything Running

MAKE US YOUR ELECTRONIC 
BACK-TO-SCHOOL HEADQUARTERS

AMERICAN TECH 203 BLISS 
9352288
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PAGE 12

T.G.4Y. will honor any 
locally advertised lower 
price on any Item avail­
able In our tlore. Jual 
bring us the Ad!!

THE SPEARMAN REPORTER SPEARMAN, TEXAS 79081 THURSDAY. AUGUST 19. 1982

These prices good from 
6 p.m. to 11:00 p.m.

Saturday only
CLAIROL Instant Hair- 
setter Model C205. Reg. 
22.88 .

AREA RUGS assorted. 
27 x 54. Reg. 5.97

BEACH THONGS as­
sorted sizes

00

LADIES 3 pak pom pom 
socks. Reg. 2.47

DOWNY Frabic Softener. 
33 oz.

1.00

GILLETTE Swivel Dis­
posable Razor. 2 per pk. 
Reg. .76

SWEETHEART Dish­
washing liquid. 22 oz. 
size

HAM ILTON BEACH 
Butter-up popcorn pop­
per.

S A L E

1 1 . 0 0

R a i n ^ B i r d ,

Rain Bird Oscillating Sprinkler Adjustable water­
ing pattern has 4 positions and covers 2200 sq ft 
#0-13

S A L E 5.00

KODAK Film C126 12 ex­
posure.

HOT WHEEL H E.L.P. 
assortment 6 vehicles per 
pkg. Reg. 6.59

S A L E

4.00
SAYELLE Knitting Yarn.
3'/i skein.

skein

FINAL Net Hair Spray. 8
oz. size.

LADIES 26" coaster bike 
Reg. 103.88

sale82.00

fam ily
centers
PRICES M O D ONLY IT  T M Y  

FAMILY CENTER 
021 HWT 201 S00TN 

SPEARMAN, TEXAS M S-3742

Hourly Drawing  
for prizes 6 p.m. 
thru 10 p.m. Sat

Grand prize 
drawing 

10:30 p.m.
Must be present 
to w in -

No purchase 
necessary

In store specials 
every half hour.

SELF-PROPELLED Lawn 
Mower 22" cut 3 '/j Hp 
Briggs & Stratton engine. 
Reg. 199.00

S A L E

146.00
Free coffee  

and cokes

These prices good thru Sat. Aug. 19
ALL WESTERN Straw 
Hats.

MARKED
PRICE

summer 
savings are 
a breeze!

S A L E

15.00
20”  Breeze Box Fan 2 sp.

a |  =  s S p n a | : i =

PRESTONE II Anti- 
Freeze Summer coolant. 
Limit 6 gal.

I  G * r  t  policy is to always have advertised merchandise in id»quat(1 , UDoly in our stoies In theevent the advertised merchandise nnot available due to unforseen reasons. TGAY will provide a Rain Check. upon request, in order that 
lh» merchandise may be purchased at tha sale prica when it becomes j, , ,« b le  of you may purchase similar quality merchandise at a similar prica raductron It ia the policy of TQ4Y to see that you are happy with your purchases *  It Is 
T 0 4Y  s policy to be priced competitively in the market Regular Sale Prices may vary market by market, but the sale price will always be as advertised • We will be happy to refund your money il you ere not satisfied with your 
purchase VISA* and MasterCard* accepted

■ k " s *  •,-x^k , if i* -r-,
Sp "ii'tfttfffl
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GENERAL INFORMATION
A concerted and organized effort to provide college level courses for adults of the area was 
begun during the spring semester of 1979 From that first offering, six subjects, the Adult 
Education Program has grown to this semester’s offering of 25 courses The tremendous 
response by the people of the area has made possible this expanded program Six of the 
courses offered during this term will meet requirements for a degree A survey of persons 
who had taken previous adult ed courses indicated that the interest did exist for a way to 
obtain a degree by taking evening courses The persons responding indicated that areas of 
business would be most popular The fall of 1962 finds four classes from this department 
that will meet requirements in most areas of business. Other courses can be used to fulfill 
general education requirements, total hour requirements or upper level requirements It is 
the belief of Panhandle State University that many people of the area have enjoyed the 
stimulation of learning and doing and meeting new people A challenge has been re­
experienced and the results have been rewarding For information concerning enrollment 
or classes, contact Bob Wise, Director of Adult Education, Panhandle State University, 
Goodwell, Oklahoma 73939 Call 405-349-2611 EXT 269

ENROLLMENT CLASS LIMIT
Persons wishing to take courses in the Panhandle State University Adult 
Education Program may enroll by any of three ways The back cover of this 
brochure may be filled out and mailed with a check to the Director of Adult 
Education, Panhandle State University, Goodwell, Oklahoma 73939. You 
may enroll by coming to room 101 of Sewell-Ijoofbourrow, the administration 
building) between the hours of 9:00 a m. to 12:00 noon and 1:00 to 4 :00 p.m., 
Monday through Friday, August 16, 1982 through August 26, 1962 Par­
ticipants may also enroll theevening of August 26,1982 at 7:00 p.m in room 
101 Sewell-Loofbourrow. No enrollments will be accepted after August 27, 
1982. Current Panhandle State students will be allowed to enroll, on August 
27,1962 in any class not closed by limit They will adhere to all policy listed 
for the adult education classes including book purchase, refunds, and tuition 
costs They may enroll in room 101 Sewell-Loofbourrow on August 28 only 
Current Panhandle State students may enroll in any class not having a 
maximum limit at any time listed above

TUITION, FEES & COSTS
Each person enrolling in the Adult Education Program will be charged 
tuition and fees at the time of enrollment Tuition is $15.65 per credit hour for 
courses numbered 1000 or 2000 Tuition for courses numbered 3000 or 4000 is 
$16 75 per credit hour Each person is assessed a $3 00 general fee for each 
course in which they enroll They are also assessed a $1.00 per credit hour 
student union fee. AH of these charges are established by state legislature 
Some courses require an additional fee to be paid sometime during the class 
This is to help defray costs of materials or foods used during the class. In all 
cases, this fee will be mentioned in the descriptive information contained in 
this brochure Some classes also require textbook, workbook or both This 
information will also be contained in the course descriptions on pages 4, 5, 6, 
and 7 of this brochure These textbooks are to be purchased at the university 
bookstore They are not part of the book rental plan available to the tradition 
student attending regular university classes

INCLEMENT WEATHER
In the case of inclement weather, cancellation of class notices will be 
broadcast by KGYN Radio, 1210 kh on the AM dial They will air the an­
nouncements as soon as they receive them and will air them on the 5:00 p.m. 
central time local newscast. Please do not call the radio station, call 
Panhandle State if you think you might have missed the announcement

Many of the classes offered through the Adult Education Program have 
limits governing the maximum number who may enroll. These limits are 
established due to lab facilities, classroom size, or instructor abilities to 
provide necessary individual attention. These limits are stated in the 
descriptive information and in the appropriately titled column of the 
schedule on page 3. Additionally, the university has instituted a minimum 
enrollment of 10 participants per class This minimum number allows the 
university to adequately fund the instruction for the course Any person who 
enrolls in a class that does not meet minimum enrollment will be given a full 
refund All who are cancelled out of a class will be informed by telephone on 
Friday, August 27, 1982 and be given the opportunity to enroll in another 
course that has not attained a maximum limit Any person not wishing to 
enroll in another course will then be given a full refund.

REFUNDS
It is the policy of Panhandle State University to make no refunds to persons 
enrolled in the Adult Education Program The lone exception will be when 
PSU cancels a class because of minimum enrollment standardsare not met. 
If and when that occurs, a full refund will be made.

GRADES & CREDIT
Grades for the 25 courses offered through the Adult Education Program will 
be awarded on a “ P "  or passing. Those who do not complete the work or who 
have unsatisfactory attendance will be "Withdrawn”  from the course and 
will receive a "W ” . Six courses may be challenged for a letter grade by those 
enrolled if they so desire. The courses that may be challenged are: Real 
Estate Principles. Introduction To Comjxiter Information Systems, Fun­
damentals Of Photography I, American Government And Politics, Inter­
mediate Typewriting, and Business Correspondence Any person enrolled in 
these courses may submit, in writing, a request to the instructor expressing 
a desire to take the course for the traditional “ A ”, “ B ", “ C” , “ D” , or “ F”  
grades Those who do not will receive the normal adult ed grades of “ P ”  or 
"W" All courses carry either one, two, or three hours of university under­

graduate credit. All credit will be recorded on a Panhandle State University 
transcript.

ADULT EDUCATION ENROLLMENT
-B y  mail using the back cover of this brochure (fill out completely and attach check for tuition and fees.) 

- In  person, Room 101 Sewell-Loofbourrow from 9 a.m. to 12 noon and 1 p.m. to 4 p.m., Monday 

through Friday, August 16, 1982 through August 27, 1982.
-August 26, 1982 at 7 p.m. in Room 101 Sewell-Loofbourrow

No enrollments w ill be accepted after August 27, 1982
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3701  ART 4 0 0 0  BEGINNING PORTRAITS IN HARD PASTELS.
1 Hr. C redit. Thursday, Rm. 2 0 7  Sewell-Loofbourrow, 

Class Limit 12 , PSU Tuition & Fees ‘ 2 0 J
Beginning Portraits in Brown and White Pastels will 
include Basic sketching and studies in using live models in 
beginning portraiture Hie course will be taught by Louie 
Remmel of Guymon. Each student must purchase a 
prepackaged group of supplies and tools of the trade at a total 
coat of *16.50. The supplies may be purchased from 
Mrs Remmel the first night of class Each participant must 
provide their own easel that can be used from a standing

position The class is limited to 12 to permit a better 
arrangement for model studies The class will not begin until 
October 7. It is however necessary that all participants enroll 
prior to the August 27 final enrollment day. Mrs Remmel is a 
professional artist of some experience in portrait painting. 
She has studied with Ben Konis and other well known artists 
both privately and in workshops. A $10 fee will be 
collected at the first meeting to pay models

3 7 0 2  ART 4 0 0 0  PASTEL PAINTING.
2 Hrs. Credit, Thursday, Rm. 2 0 6  Sewell-Loofbourrow, 
Class Limit 2 0 , PSU Tuition & Fees 53 8 50
A comprehensive guide to Pastel Painting will be presented 
by Jo Dunham during this 10 week course Ms Dunham has 
studied pastel painting with Ben Konis of Amarillo. Texas, 
the past four years. She prefers to work on portraits, land­
scapes. and still life subjects on location or from models in 
her studio and work from her own photographs only when 
necessary Ms.Dunham will teach the class in pastel painting 
through step-by-step demonstrations The basics of pastel: 
composition, advantages and disadvantages, and the

3 7 0 3  ART 4 0 0 0  WATERCOLOR PAINTING,
2 Hrs. Credit. Tuesday, Rm. 2 0 6  Sewell-Loofbourrow, 
Class Limit 2 0 , PSU Tuition & Fees ‘ 3 8 5#

characteristics of soft and hard pastel, as well as technique, 
problems in lighting, linear perspective and color will be 
covered Some charcoal sketching from life, two still lifes, 
and two or three landscapes will be completed in this class A 
supply list will be furnished by calling Ms Dunham in 
Guymon at 338-3232 The supplies may be ordered from Ms 
Dunham by calling her one week in advance of the first 
meeting

This Watercolor Painting class will last 10 weeks and is of­
fered for 2 hours of credit. It has been designed for both 
beginning and intermediate painters Transparant water- 
color techniques will be emphasized through the use of basic 
washes: graded, flat, wet-in-wet, and dry brush. Variation in 
color, technique, and design will be stressed through step-by- 
step demonstrations. Paintings to be completed in the ten 
week Watercolor Painting class include: Field of Daisies,

Plowed Field, County Road, Morning Light, and Casual 
Water. Ms. Dunham holds bachelor and masters degrees 
from Northeastern Oklahoma State University and has 
studied with Carl Schmaltz, Robert l-oughhead, Ben Konis, 
and Stefan Kramer. She is founder and past president of 
Artists’ Studio Northwest. A supply list will be furnished by 
calling Ms Dunham in Guymon at 338-3232 The supplies will 
be available from her by calling one week prior to the first 
class

3 7 0 4  BUS. AD. 3 4 0 3  REAL ESTATE PRINCIPLES,
3 Hrs. Credit, Thurs., Rm. 1 1 0  Hamilton Hall,
Class Limit 4 0 , PSU Tuition & Fees ’ 5 6 15
The Real Estate Principles class is offered for three hours of 
university credit It meets the requirement necessary for an 
individual to be able to sit for the Sales Associate 
examination in the state of Oklahoma Primary emphasis for 
the course will be placed upon contracts, home ownership, 
brokerage, deeds, and selling The participants in the course 
will be required to purchase two textbooks Both will be 
available in the PSU Bookstore This course is one which

may be challenged for a letter grade It then may be used 
toward a bachelors degree in Business Administration. Real 
Estate Principles will be taught by Keith Matthews, prin­
cipal broker and manager of Keith Matthews and Associates, 
Incorporated of Guymon. He will provide a study of the 
Oklahoma Real Estate License Code and the Oklahoma Real 
Estate Commission Rules.

3 7 0 5  BUS. AD. 4 0 0 0  COMMODITY FUTURES II,
1 Hr. Credit, W ed., Rm, 139  Hamilton Hall,
No Class Limit, PSU Tuition & Fees ‘ 2 0 M

This course will be more advanced than previous commodity 
courses Some knowledge of commodity, cash, and futures 
markets is preferred although it is not required This course 
will deal primarily with what makes the futures markets 
move. There will be a brief explanation of what fun­
damentals are and how they affect the markets Commodity 
Futures II will deal mostly with technical and analysis of 
both cash and futures. An in depth study of the great

technicians such as W.D Gann and R.N. EUiott will be 
provided Participants in the course will do an in depth 
analysis of live cattle, feeder cattle, wheat and com  as ap­
plied to today’s markets, not last year’s. This should be 
valuable to area farmers and ranchers. The course will be 
taught by Robert Fitzgerald of Master Commodities in 
Guymon. He can provide an interesting and informative 
explanation of commodities

3 7 0 6  BUS. AD. 4 0 0 0  TAX PLANNING FOR THE FAMILY, 
2 Hrs. Credit, Monday, Rm. 1 10  Hamilton Hall,
No Class Limit, PSU Tuition & Fees s3 8 50

Tax Planning for the Family will consist of lectures and in 
depth personal financial evaluations through charts and 
questionnaires The course will cover the topics of record­
keeping. applicable tax deductions, new tax regulations, 
estate planning as well as investment considerations and 
numerous financial planning aids Nelda Smith will be in 
instructor for this course She is the sole proprietor of an

accounting and consulting firm in Guymon She is a PSU 
graduate with majors in Accounting and Business 
Administration She has fifteen years of office experience and 
has worked for the past three years as a tax preparer. Mrs. 
Smith is currently a CPA candidate as well as a candidate 
for certification as a Financial Planner
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3707  CO. SCI. 2 1 1 3  INTRO. TO COMPUTER INFORMATION SYSTEMS, 
3 Hrs. C redit Monday, Rm. 2 0 8  Sewell-Loofbourrow,
Class Limit 2 5 , PSU Tuition & Fees * 5 2 ”

3708  CO. SCI. 2 1 1 3  INTRO. TO COMPUTER INFORMATION SYSTEMS 
3 Hrs. Credit, Wed., Rm. 2 0 8  Sewell-Loofbourrow,
Class Limit 2 5 , PSU Tuition & Fees * 5 2 ’ 5

Kathaleerx
Thrasher

Diane Murphey

Pamela Nelson

Dr.David Driskill

i

Mary Ruth 
Ryther

Ed Bryan

Donna  Stelzer 
Jim Hughes

These two introductory courses into computer information 
systems will offer the same material. The popularity of this 
subject area prompted Panhandle State to offer two sections 
so that more participants can be accomodated The course 
with the 3707 key number will meet on Monday evenings and 
the course with the 3708 key number will meet on Wednesday 
evenings. Both will provide an overview of computer in­
formation systems There will be an introduction to computer 
information systems. There will be an introduction to 
computer hardware, software, procedures, and systems 
along with an overview of human resources and computer 
applications in various segments of society. Fundamentals of 
computer problem-solving and programming will be 
discussed and applied. A textbook ‘ ‘First Course in Data 
Processing with BASIC”  will be required and will be

available in the PSU Bookstore. The Monday evening course 
will be taught by Kathaleen Thrasher and the Wednesday 
evening course will be taught by Diane Murphey. Mrs 
Thrasher has a bachelors degree in Business Administration 
with minor in Computer Information Systems Education 
from West Texas State She taught and worked in the 
Texhoma Public School system from 1962 to 1962. During that 
time she changed the school accounting system from manual 
to data processing Mrs Thrasher is now employed at the 
First National Bank of Texhoma Mrs. Murphey is employed 
by Panhandle State as Instructor of Computer Science She 
teaches a majority of the computer courses at PSU. She has a 
bachelor and masters degrees in mathematics and is 
presently pursuing the course work toward a doctors degree 

jn ^ ed u ca tion ^ w ith jm jm ^

3 7 0 9  EDUC. 4 0 0 0  OVERCOMING MATH ANXIETY,
1 Hr. Credit, Thurs., Room 1 2 8  Hamilton Hall, No Class Limit, PSU Tuition & Fees *2 0 ”

Overcoming Math Anxiety could also be titled Everything 
You Always Wanted to Know About Math but Were Afraid to 
Ask.The course has been designed for women who have 
bad feelings about mathematics Pamela Nelson will help the 
participants with day-to-day uses of math. Help with check­
books and bank statements, how to get the most for your 
money at the supermarket, understanding the metric 
system, how to help the kids with their math homework, and 
calculator use will all be included in lecture material. There

will be no required textbook, however a $5.00 fee will be 
collected at the first meeting to cover the cost of copy 
materials This course is patterned after one of the most 
successful adult education courses ever offered in Denver, 
Colorado Pamela Nelson has a degree in mathematics from 
Panhandle State and is working toward a masters degree in 
computer science at WTSU. Participants should provide a 
pocket calculator.

3711  EDUC. 4 0 0 0  READING RATE IMPROVEMENT FOR ADULTS,
2 Hrs. Credit, Tues., Rm. 1 2 7  Hamilton Hall, Class Limit 2 0 , PSU Tuition & Fees *3 8 ”

This course is designed to develop reading rate and 
flexibility. This should improve not only the reading speed 
but also the comprehension. The course is to be taught by Dr. 
David Driskill, Associate Professor of Education and Di­
rector of the Reading Clinic at Panhandle State University 
Participants in this course will use teacher-made materials 
and some self contained materials. The methods and

materials necessary for increasing both rate and com­
prehension will be discussed. Many speed reading courses do 
not emphasize the increased comprehension, only the in­
creased speed. This course will help the participants achieve 
both. Dr. Driskill has had a number of years experience as a 
reading specialist prior to joining the Panhandle State 
University faculty in the fall of 1976.

3 7 1 2  ENG. 4 0 0 0  MYTHOLOGY,
3 Hrs. Credit, Wed., Rm. 1 23  Hamilton Hall, Class Limit 3 0 , PSU Tuition & Fees *5fcM
A study of the myths, legends, and folktales which have had 
influence on literature and our ways of thinking. Artists, 
poets, painters, sculptors, novelists have all used these 
myths and legends to enrich their own works so much so that 
the modern reader needs to make a study of them in order to 
interpret modern works of art These legends have been used 
in other areas of life: our space program uses them far 
names of missiles: astronomy names the stars with names of

3 7 1 3  HPER 4 0 0 0  FUNDAMENTALS OF BOWHUNTING, 
2 Hrs. Credit, Tues., Room 1 0 8  McKee Library, Class
Fundamentals of Bowhunting will include subjects of 
bowhunting, safety and ethics, equipment selection and 
tuning, shooting techniques, bowhunting methods, game 
habits and habitat, and field care of game Those who 
complete the course successfully will be officially registered 
as Certified Bowhunters with the National Field Archery 
Association’s National Bowhunter Education Program. 
Participants in the course will learn through lecture, visual 
aids, and practical experience The course will be taught by

mythological heros; psychology uses the myths to explain 
certain ways of thinking. Three text books costing ap­
proximately $12.00 will be required by the 
instructor Mary Ruth Ryther This course could be valuable 
to anyone wishing to clarify references in reading materials 
to stories that are used for examples or illustrations. It will 
also be helpful to anyone who wishes to expand their 
vocabulary

Limit 1 2 , PSU Tuition & Fees * 3 8 ”
Ed Bryan of Goodwell. He is a Certified Instructor in the 
National Field Archery Association's National Bowhunter 
Education Program and a lifetime NRA Hunter Safety 
Instructor. Bryan was formerly named Oklahoma's 
Bowhunter of the Year and has won the Oklahoma State 
Archery Association's Big Buck Trophy for the past three 
years Participants must provide their own equipment and 
pay a $10.00 fee for targets and supplies

3714  HPER 4 0 0 0  WESTERN DANCING,
1 Hr. Credit, Monday, Student Union Ballroom,
No Class Limit, PSU Tuition & Fees * 2 0 ,s
Beginning Country-Western Dancing will provide basic 
fundamentals of western dance Instruction will be provided 
and steps demonstrated and enforced, by practice, in the 
Cotton-eyed Joe, Western Waltz, Western Swing, Two Step, 
Salty Dog Rag, Schottischc, and other popular western 
dances The course will be taught by Donna Stelzer and Jim 
Hughes Donna was a student of Ada B. Coons for seven 
years She sang and danced in musicals at Guymon High 
School and Southwestern State where she obtained bachelors

and masters degrees in HPER. She was a member of the 
SWOSU Student Entertainers. Donna taught and coached at 
Liberal High School and was advisor for the Girls’ Marching 
Drill Team. Jim Hughes is a graduate of Guymon High 
School. He attended Central State University and Oklahoma 
City University where he was head of the Student Enter­
tainers Hughes has taught dance for Fred Astair, Xavier 
Cugot, and Arthur Murray Studios.
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Emma Schultz

Cleo Rainey

3 7 1 5  HOME EC. 4 0 0 0  CAKE DECORATING,
1 H i. Credit, Monday, Student Union Ballroom,

Class Limit 3 0 , PSU Tuition & Fees l 2 0 's
Beginning Cake Decorating will not only provide the in­
struction for decorating but will offer tips concerning baking, 
handling, and frosting.Decorating skills to be taught include: 
basic borders, drop flowers, flat surface flowers, and sugar 
molding Participants in this course will be asked to pay a fee 
of $5.00 at the first session to cover the co6t of frosting and 
other materials to be used at the first meeting. After the first 
meeting the participants will] be expected to furnish their 
own decoratine materials A kit consisting of a Wilton

3 7 1 6  HOME EC. 4 0 0 0  CHINESE COOKING,
1 Hr. Credit, lu es ., Rm. 3 0 5  Hesper Hall,
Class Limit 15 , PSU Tuition & Fees ( 2 0 M

Chinese Cooking will be taught by Cleo Rainey She is a PSU 
graduate with a degree in Home Economics Cleo is the wife 
of LTC Charles “ Bud”  Rainey, retired, who spent con­
siderable time in Taiwan. During the time she took lessons in 
Chinese cooking and also learned from their Chinese cook 
Cleo will give a background on China and Chinese cooking 
during the course. There will be a variety of dishes prepared 
during each of the five sessions The first session will be held

Yearbook, 14 tubes, couplers, bags, flower nail, bell mold 
sets and 8 color jars will be sold at the first meeting for $27.00. 
All participants must have this kit. Beginning Cake 
Decorating will be taught by Emma Schultz Mrs Schultz is a 
member of the Education faculty at Panhandle State. She 
has decorated cakes professionally and has instructed 
similar courses This class starts October 11. Enrollment is 
required by August 27.

on October 5. It will be necessary to enroll prior to the August 
27 final enrollment date Chinese cooking will feature a 
variety of dishes that can be prepared with food products 
available in this area Mrs Rainey will be using a wok, a 
Chinese cooking vessel, to prepare the food Dishes to be 
made include: Bao-Tse, sweet and sour pork, spring rolls and 
more. A $10.00 food fee will be charged

3 7 1 7  HOME EC. 4 0 0 0  PARTY FOODS,
1 Hr. Credit, Thurs., Student Union Ballroom, Class Limit 4 0 , PSU Tuition & Fees ‘ 2 0 M

Party Foods will begin October 7 and conclude November 11. 
It will be necessary to enroll prior to the final day of adult 
education enrollment on August 27. Party Foods will be 
taught by five well known area cooks. Each will take dif­
ferent types of party foods In addition to preparation, time 
will be spent with display and presentation of the food. Each 
session will deal with a different style or area of food 
preparation. To be included are: party sandwiches including

checkerboards and pinwheels, vegetables as hors 
d'oeuveres, meats as finger foods for parties, dips, chips, 
canapes, candies, cookies, mints and other sweets The 
course will be conducted as both lecture and hands on par­
ticipation There will be a charge of $20 00 made at the first 
session to cover the cost food and copies of the recipies used 
during the course. All persons enrolled are asked to bring a 
cutting board, bowl, and small knife to the first class.

Dr. Harold 
Kachel

Leo  M c M a k in

Bob Wise

Sam Nelson

3 7 1 8  IND. ARTS 4 1 0 0  WOODWORKING FUNDAMENTALS, 
2 Hrs. Credit, Tues., Rm. 131 Carter Hall,
Class Limit 2 4 , PSU Tuition & Fees l 3 8 5#
Woodworking Fundamentals is an industrial arts course 
designed to meet the desires of area residents wishing to 
learn about woodworking. The course will be taught by Dr. 
Harold Kachel, Professor of Industrial Arts and Head, 
Department of Applied Arts. Because it would be difficult to 
instruct and assist students with a wide background of ex­
perience in woods and tools, this course is a prerequisite for 
future woodworking courses that are planned for the adult

3 7 1 9  IND. ARTS 4 1 0 0  UPHOLSTERY FURNITURE, 
3Hrs. Credit, Monday, Rm. 2 09  Carter Hall, Class Li

education program Woodworking Fundamentals will cover 
the basic skills and include the use of hand tools, wood 
classification and machine tools. A textbook “ Units in 
Woodworking" will be required and will be available in the 
PSU Bookstore. Recognized as an outstanding instructor in 
the area of industrial arts. Dr. Kachel will develop this 
course with the adult learner in mind. Participants will learn 
through lecture, visual aids, and practical experience.

1 0 , PSU Tuition & Fees l 5 6 !s
This is an introduction to upholstery. Participants will re­
upholster a piece of their own furniture, preferably a chair. 
Each person enrolling in this course will learn the use of the 
most common hand tools of the trade and learn to operate a 
sewing machine. There will be a textbook, “ Furniture 
Upholstery and Repair" required for the course In addition 
to the text, each person will be required to provide the 
materials needed cloth tape, french chalk, and upholstery

material. Upholstery furniture will be taught by Leo 
McMakin of the Panhandle State University Industrial Arts 
Department. He has had many years experience teaching 
upholstering to adult learners as well as high school and 
college students He has had several years of commercial 
experience while operating his own upholstery shop Mr. 
McMakin has been with Panhandle State for the pest six­
teen years

3721  JOURN. 1 1 2 3  FUNDAMENTALS OF PHOTOGRAPHY I,
3 Hrs. Credit, W ed., Rm. 201 Sewell-Loofbourrow, Class Limit 2 0 , PSU Tuition & Fees J5 2 ’ 5
Concerned with the basics in the operation of a modem 35mm 
single lens reflex camera, the developing of black and white 
film, and the enlargement process The course will cover the 
operation of the camera, proper exposure, guidelines for 
good composition, using and controlling artifical lighting, 
correcting common photographic errors. These areas will be 
covered by lecture, filmstrips, visual aids and actual 
practice. All of the participants will take and develop their

own rolls of film. A textbook "Photography" is required and 
will be available in the PSU Bookstore. The photo 
materials: film, paper, chemical, etc. may be purchased 
through the PSU studio for $24 80 This class will be the first 
to use the new photo lab facilities that have been added this 
summer It will be possible for eight participants to try the 
enlarging and printing process during a session. The course 
will be taught by Bob Wise

3 7 2 2  POL. SCI. 1 0 1 3  AMERICAN GOVERNMENT & POLITICS,
3 Hrs. Credit, Tues., Rm. 2 2 3  Hamilton Hall, No Class Limit, PSU Tuition & Fees s5 2 ”
American Government and Politics is a survey of the origin 
and framework of the federal government. It will present a 
view of government as it is and as it is supposed to be. 
Government structure and processes will be compared with 
contemporary power groups, lobbys, and foreign and 
domestic policy. This course will meet the general education 
and legislative requirements for a program leading toward 
graduation This course is offered in response to the adults

who requested course work leading toward a degree 
American Government and Politics is required of all who 
graduate from an Oklahoma college or university. This 
course will fill three of the seventeen hours in the Prescribed 
Area of general education The course will be taught by Sam 
Nelson, head of the Department of Social and Behavioral 
Sciences Nelson received undergraduate and graduate 
degrees from the University of Texas.



D r. Roger Todd

3 7 2 3  REL. 4 0 0 0  RELIGION & SCIENCE.
2 Hrs. Credit, lues., Church ol Christ Bible Chair, No Class Limit, PSU Tuition & Fees 53 8 J*

The recent court case in Arkansas has revived interest in 
the age-old questions. "Are Science and Religion Com­
patible "D o They Contradict One Another?" “ Is there 
Any Scientific Evidence for Creationism?' and "Is Evolution 
Fact or Theory?". These and other questions will be honestly 
considered in light of the evidence available Special at­
tention willl be given to the scientific facts which are found in 
the Bible Religion and Science will be taught by Dr Roger

Todd Bible and science has long been a personal interest of 
Dr Todd's He has taught seminars on the subject. Dr. Todd 
has served as president of the editorial board for Campus 
Journal, a national publication relating to campus 
ministries He has been a minister for thirty years and has 
taught religion courses for Panhandle State University for 
the past 22 years A course syllabus will be provided by 
Dr.Todd

3 7 2 4  REL. 4 0 0 0  PHILOSOPHY OF RELIGION,
3 Hrs. Credit, Monday, Rm. 2 0 7  Hamilton Hall, Class Limit 2 0 , PSU Tuition & Fees * 5 6 2*

This course is designed to provide a forum for a serious and 
candid examination of the philosophical and religious 
foundations of the world society of the 20th century. Its 
special intent is to provide a time and place for serious 
conversations about the world's religious and political 
systems as they relate to the great issues of life Participants 
will examine the four dimensions of the universe to provide a 
cosmic orientation for quest. Time will also be devoted to an

examination of the Gods of the prehistoric world of central 
Asia, the Gods of Classical Greece and the “ Gods" of the 
current time as they relate to such things as the State, 
morals, war, etc. The course will be taught by James L. 
Mahan He has a BS from OSU and a MS from Texas A&M, 
and a MDiv from the Seminary of the Southwest He also has 
done graduate work at Iowa State and the University of 
Texas.

Dr. W ayne Cole

Ava Ruth 
Humphrey

Kim Smith

3 7 2 5  SEC. SCI. 2 3 1 3  INTERMEDIATE TYPEWRITING,
3 Hrs. Credit, Tues., Rm. 3 0 8  Hamilton Hall, Class Limit 3 0 , PSU Tuition & Fees s5 2 ’ 5
The objectives of Intermediate Typewriting are to: Provide 
students with an opportunity to improve skills learned in 
Beginning Typewriting, provide an opportunity for par­
ticipants to refine typewriting skills for a career, for personal 
use or for advanced studies. The course will emphasize the 
importance of neatness, correctness, and mailability of 
typewritten work Another goal of Intermediate Typewriting 
is to encourage performance without repeated instructions;

that is, develop concentration and listening skills. Course 
content will include letter styles, vertical and horizontal 
centering, business report component elements typing. 
Intermediate Typewriting will be taught by Dr. Wayne Cole, 
Instructor of Business at Panhandle State. Cole has M.S. and 
Ed.D degrees from Oklahoma State Dr Cole is a member of 
National Business Education Association. He has previously 
taught adult learners.

3 7 2 6  SEC. SCI. 3 1 1 3  BUSINESS CORRESPONDENCE.
3 Hrs. Credit, Monday, Rm. 3 0 8  Hamilton Hall, Class Limit 3 0 , PSU Tuition &  Fees * 5 6 M

Business Correspondence stresses the important role that the 
reader of business communications plays in written letters, 
memos, and reports. The purpose of the course is to help the 
participants compose business messages which the receiver 
can easily understand and to which he will react favorably. 
Some attention will be given to various types of business 
letters There will be review of fundamentals of composition 
and their application to business correspondence A text­

book, “ Effective Communication for Colleges" will be 
required This course may be challenged for a letter grade by 
persons wishing to pursue a degree program in the area of 
business or taken on a "P "  for passing basis by those wishing 
to gain knowledge or improve skills Business Correspon 
dence will be taught by Ava Ruth Humphrey, Associate 
Professor of Business at Panhandle State University.

3 7 2 7  SPAN. 4 0 0 0  SPANISH FOR THE CLASSROOM TEACHER,
3 Hrs. Credit, Monday, Rm. 1 28  Hamilton Hall, Class Limit 2 5 , PSU Tuition & Fees ‘ 5 6 15

Spanish for the Classroom Teacher is another in the series of 
conversational Spanish being offered in the adult education 
program at Panhandle State University. This course will 
stress classroom vocabulary enabling the teacher to con­
verse with Spanish speaking children Emphasis on con­
versation will be reinforced by some reading and writing. 
The terms used in this class will be terms specific to the 
classroom The previous Spanish courses have emphasized

terms specific to business and agriculture A textbook will be 
selectedby the instructor, Kim Smith, and will ordered at the 
first session It will be required for the course. Mrs Smith is 
an Assistant Professor of English and Foreign Language at 
Panhandle State University She has been with the university 
since 1974 and has completed the course work leading toward 
a doctors degree in Spanish.

The Adult Education Program at Panhandle State University would like to better meet 
the needs of the residents of this area. As you return the application for admission and 
enrollment on page eight, please take the time to answer the questions below and 
return with tte application. If you are not enrolling this semester, clip out this box and mail 
it to the Director of Adult Education, Panhandle State Oniversity, P.O. Box 430,
Goodwell, Oklahoma 73939.

W H A T  C O U R S E  O R  C O U R S E S  W O U L D  Y O U  L IK E  T O  SEE O F F E R E D  
T H R O U G H  T H E  A D U L T  E D U C A T I O N  P R O G R A M ?

W H A T  S U G G E S T IO N S  W O U L D  Y O U  M A K E  T O  H E LP  IM P R O V E  
T H E  P R O G R A M ?

v m a H i a n
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A p p lica tion  For A d m ission  
A n d  E nrollm ent

Panhandle State University 
Adult Education Program

FULL LEGAL NAME ( L a s t ,  F i r s t ,  M i d d l e ) ____________________________________________________________ ____________ __________________

SEX ( M - F ) ________ DATE OF B I R T H ________________ ____ _ PLACE OF B IR TH  ( C i t y ,  S t a t e ) ______________________________ __

ETHNIC C O D E ____ _ O *  N o n - R e s i d e n t  A l i e n  2 .  B l a c k  3 .  A m e r ic a n  I n d i a n  o r  A la s k a n  N a t i v e

4 .  A s i a n  o r  P a c i f i c  I s l a n d e r  5 .  H i s p a n i c  6 .  W h i t e )  SO C IA L  SECU RITY NO. ____________________________

F IR S T  TIME STUDENT ( Y - y e s ,  N - n o ) ___ ______  M A J O R _____ _________________ ______ _______________________________ __________________

M IN O R _______________________________________________________ ______ _ TELEPHONE N U M BE R______________________ ___________________________

STREET OR B O X _________ ____________ _____ _______ C IT Y  __  _____ ___  S T A T E __________ _ _

Z I P  CODE ________________________  M ARITAL STATUS _______  ( S - s i n g l e ,  M - m a r r i e d ,  W -w id o w e d ,  D - d i v o r c e d )

SPOUSE ( F i r s t  N am e) ___________  MAIDEN NAME _  HAVE YOU PREVIOUSLY ATTENDED

PSU ( Y - y e s ,  N - n o ) _______ FROM (M o n t h  a n d  Y e a r ) ____________________  TO (M o n th  a n d  Y e a r ) _______________

BACHELOR OR ABOVE DECREE EARNED ( Y - y e s ,  N - n o )  ________ DECREE (B S -M S -P H D ) ______________________________________

NAME OF HIGH SCHOOL ATTENDED _______________ ______________LOCATION ( C i t y , S t a t e ) _________________ __

DATE OF GRADUATION ___________ ____LAST COLLEGE OR U N IV E R SIT Y  A T T E N D E D _________ __ ___________________________

FROM (M o n th  a n d  Y e a r )  ___  ______ ___  TO (M o n t h  a n d  Y e a r )  _______ ________ E L IG IB L E  TO RETURN ( Y - y e s ,  N - n o )

______________  LOCATION OF COLLEGE ( C i t y ,  S t a t e )  _________________________________________________________________________________

Please fill out schedule from  page 3 listing Fall 1 9 8 2  A d u lt  E ducation  courses.

KEY COURSE CREDIT ROOM

Fill out this application completely and mail with check for the proper amount to:

Director o f Adult Education 
Panhandle State University 

Box 430
Goodwell, O K  73939


