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□  LINDA HOLT JARVIS

□

□

□  Brad Beedy

□  Edw in (Eddie) Limbocker

□  Bill P ittm an

□  --------

New co-m anager for TG&Y is  David Huntsman, on the left. On the 
right is  m anager Jerry Brock. Both of these fine young men have 
been with the local TG&Y store  for quite som e tim e, and are w ell 
known, and liked In the area . The new co-m anaaer Huntsman, is  
also  one of the finest com m ercia l a rtists  in the areal

Elections To Be 
Held Saturday

Jim Davis Announces

The City election and the 
Spearman Independent School 
District Board of Trustees elect­
ion will be held April 1 at 
Spearman High School on April 
1. Polls will open at 7 a.m. and 
close at 7 p.m.

Candidates in the City elect­
ion are Mayor Ralph Blodgett, 
filing for re-election, running 
unopposed, and candidates for 
the two aldermen positions are 
incumbent Bill Pittman, incum­
bent Brad Beedy and Edwin 
Limbocher.

Candidates for the two posi­
tions open on the Spearman 
School Board are incumbent 
Jim Davis, Dr. Bob Philips, 
Mrs. Linda Holt Jarvis, Larry 
Porter and Tommie White. The 
other incumbent, George Jack- 
son, did not file for re-election.

Absentee voting will end 
March 28 for both elections.

Troy Sloan has been appoint­
ed judge for the city election 
and J. L. Brock has been named 
judge in the school election

Jim Davis has authorized this 
newspaper to announce his 
candidacy for the Board of 
Education for the Spearman 
Independent School District.

Davis ran unopposed for a 
one-year term in 1977 and has 
filed for a three-year term.

Before moving to Spearman 
in 1959 he served in the Marine 
Corp and attended the Univer­
sity of Arizona and North Texas 
State University.

During the past nineteen 
years he has been active in

numerous civic, service, church 
and farm organizations.

He resides on Cotter Drive 
with his wife, Linda, and their 
three children, Jean, Jan and 
James, and farms east of the 
city.

Davis believes in the neces­
sity of quality education for our 
children and asks for your 
continued support of his efforts 
to serve in the betterment of our 
local educational system in the 
coming election.

pd. pol. ady

Tommy White Seeks 
School Board Position

Tomn:e White
Dear Voter

As a candidate for a position 
on the Board of Trustees of the 
Spearman Independent School 
District, I would like to express 
by desire to serve as your repre­
sentative to that board.

I have lived in Spearman all 
my life. I graduated from 
Spearman schools in 19S8. I am 
married and have one child in 
school and one who graduated 
in 1974. I am engaged in the 
farming and ranching business 
in the Spearman school district; 
therefore, I am aware of our 
increasing tax burden and will 
of course be concerned with our 
tax dollars. Being a conserva­
tive person by nature, I am also 
very interested in seeing that all 
the pupils of Spearman Inde­
pendent School District get a 
sound education in the bastes in 
order to equip them for entry 
into the business and labor com­
munity, or for higher education.

whichever they should choose.
I believe that we in Spearman 

are very fortunate in that we 
have a school program and 
faculty that is second to none; 
however, there is always room 
for improvement.

I have no "bone to pick", just 
a desire for our children to 
receive a well rounded, quality 
education and for all depart­
ment» of our school to be given 
full consideration. If elected I 
will consider each item of 
business of the board with an 
open and objective mind, trying 
always to use logical reasoning 
to determine how I will vote on 
any issue as it arises.

Let me close by urging you to 
exercise your privilege and duty 
to vote on Saturday, April 1st. 
Your vote and support would be 
greatly appreciated.

Sincerely, pd. pol. ady.
Tommie White

Larry Porter 
Is Candidate

Larry Porter announces his 
candidacy for the Board of 
Education for the Spearman 
Independent School District.

“ I am a graduate of Canyon 
High School and West Texas 
State with a major in Business. I 
was employed for an insurance 
firm in Amarillo, Texas before 
moving to Spearman in 1973.

"While in Amarillo for sever­
al years, I was President of 
Parents, at the Amarillo Speech 
and Hearing Center. I also 
served in the National Guard for 
eight years.

“ 1 am presently engaged in 
farming in the Holt Commun­
ity.”  He and his wife Gayle 
have two children, Pam and 
Curtis.

"I believe in the continued 
excellent School System we 
have in Spearman and I ask for 
your support in the coming 
election.”

pd. poilcai adv.

Hospital News
Patients in Hansford Hospital 

are Mart McKinney, Jace Daw­
son, Jessie Bratton, Pear! Cl­
uck, Mattie Layton, Gary Davis, 
Thelma Blevins and Irene Jan-

Recovered
Spearman Police Chief Steve 

Wisniewski reported Monday, 
March 27, that his department 
recovered two vehicles and an 
upright freezer after they had 
been reported stolen.

The freezer, after the con­
tents had been dumped out, 
was taken from the garage at 
the residence at 903 S. Haney,

souctbne between 7:3S and 
1 US p.m. Friday, March 24. 
Tkiteported burglary was giv- 
can the police department at 
12)0 a.m. on Saturday, March

j/ l2 :1 7  a.m. on Saturday, a 
IffS model vehicle, in which 
die keys had been left and 
which was running while the 
iccupant was in a convenience 
itore. was reported taken from 
Ihe private parking area of the 
itore. The vehicle, belonging to 
Curtis Hays of 122 W. Second, 
was recovered a short time later 
in good shape at North Brandt 
and C Avenue.

At 12:30 a.m. Saturday, the 
police were informed that a 
pickup truck belonging to Terr­
ell Evans of P. O. Box 612 in 
Spearman was taken from the 
County Bam in Spearman. The 
1975 model truck was recovered 
approximately five hours later 
near one of the hangars at the 
airport. Keys had been left in 
the ttuck.

BE SURE AND VOTE 
THIS SATURDAY.. .

John R. Collard, J r .,  on the left is  shown presenting Jim
McLain with a $500 check for the local YMCA fund. Mclain 
stated that the Rotary pledged $3500 towards the fund, in 
increm ents of $500, and Collard matched one of the Rotary's $500!

Send that letter or especially that
telegram today! Markets

Lindsey
Sheets, Sandra Gumfory and 
son, Duane Fulfer. J. B. 

transferred.

City Sirens 
in Shape

Spearman Police Chief and 
Civil Defense Coordinator Steve 
Wisniewaki has reported that all 
warning sirens in the city are in 
good working order at this time 
and can be utilized during the 
approaching tornado season to 
sound warnings and all clear 
signals a t might be necessary.

The battle for a farm bill that 
offers immediate help for those 
farmers who are in severe 
financial distress (25 percent 
cannot survive another year like 
’77), moves into the Senate- 
House Conference Committee 
Monday of next week. Letters 
and calls, but especially tele­
grams, have proven extremely 
effective so far, in swinging 
legislators into the "yea” col­
umn. Anyone who wants to 
help is urged to send telegrams 
to the following people, who 
comprise the Conference Com­
mittee. If you are a non-farmer, 
mention that—it may be worth 
two telegrams from fanners.

Sen. Cari Curtis. 2213 Dirk- 
sen Bldg., Wash., D.C. 20510; 
Sen. Robert Dole, 4213 Dirk sen 
Bldg., Wash., D.C. 20510; Sen. 
James Eastland, 2241 Dirksen 
Bldg., Wash., D.C. 20510; Sen. 
James Allen, 6205 Dirksen 
Bldg.. Waah., D.C. 20510; Sen. 
Walter Huddleston. 3327 Dirk­
sen Bldg., Wash., D.C. 20510; 
Sen. Herman Talmadge, 109 
Russell Bldg., Wash., D.C. 
20510; Sen. Milton Young. 5205 
Dirksen Bldg., Wash., D.C. 
20510; Sen. George McGovern, 
4239 Dirksen Bldg., Waah. D.C. 
20510.

Cong. Henson Moore HI, 407 
Cannon Bldg., Wash., D.C.

20515; Cong. James Johnson, 
129 Cannon Bldg., Wash., D.C. 
20515; Cong. Thomas Foley, 
1201 Longworth Bldg., Wash., 
D.C. 20515; Cong. W. R. Po- 
age. 2107 Rayburn Bldg., 
Wash., D.C. 20515; Cong. W. 

R. Poage, 2107 Rayburn Bldg., 
Wash., D.C. 20515; Cong. E. de 
la Garza, 1434 Longworth 

Bldg., Wash., D.C. 20515; 
Cong. Walter Jones, 201 Cann­
on Bldg.. Wash., D.C. 20515; 
Cong. Ed Jones, 104 Cannon 
Bldg.. Wash. D.C. 20515; 
Cong. Dawson Mathis, 2331 
Rayburn Bldg., Waah., D.C. 
20515; Cong. David Bowen, 116 
Cannon Bldg,, Waah. D.C. 
20515;Cong. Charles Rose, 218 
Cannon Bldg., Wash., D.C. 
20515; Cong. Frederick Rich­
mond, 1728 Longworth Bldg., 
Wash.. D.C. 20515; Cong. 
Keith Sebelius, 1211 Longworth 
Bldg., Wash., D.C. 20515; 
Cong. William C. Wampler, 
2422 Rayburn Bldg., Wash., 
D.C. 20515.

It would be moat helpful if y. 
our telegrams were to the effect 
that you strongly urge the 
Senator or Congressman to 
''turn out a bill reflecting the 
"flexible parity” concept, and 
do it qafcUy-time is of the
essence."

The Senators on the confer­

ence committee all voted for 
both the Dole (flexible parity) 
Amendment to the Talmadge 
BUI, and for the final BUI as 
amended. The Congressmen 
are more of an unknown quan- 
tity-none of them are yet on 
record on this kind of bUI, 
because the House has not 
passed one. So bear down 
hardest on the Congressmen.

PDRA, 
Engineers 

To Meet

CORN
SOYBEANS

- ,  - ,  BE SURE AND VOTE 
» j o  THIS SATURDAY.. .  
92.42 

»10.73

A special meeting of the Palo 
Duro River Authority of Hans­
ford County with representa­
tives of the U.S. Army Corps of 
Engineers involving discussion 
of the proposed Palo Duro River 
Project was in progress as this 
edition of The Spearman Re­
porter was going to press.

The meeting began at 10 a.m. 
in the PDRA offices in the 
Hansford County Courthouse in 
Spearman, it was announced bv 
Johnnie C. Lee, acting general 
manager of the PDRA.

Edwin Limbocker 
announces as candidate 

for City Alderman 
for the

upcoming election 
April 1.

Your vote will 
be appreciated.
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Disaster Area 
Paperwork 
Forwarded

County Judge Johnnie C. Lee 
announced Monday, March 27. 
that the necessary paperwork 
connected with having Hans­
ford County declared a disaster 
area has been completed and 
forwarded to Austin for further 
action. He noted that Governor 
Dolph Briscoe and other state 
officials contacted last week 
about the matter have express­
ed a favorable attitude concern­
ing the situation.

Judge Lee accompanied by 
Bud Lowe traveled to Austin 
after Hansford County Comm­
issioners Court voted unani­
mously Monday. March 20, to 
declare the county a disaster 
area.

In addition to accepting the 
status report on the disaster 
area declaration during the 
regular meeting of the Court on 
March 27, the Commissioners 
authorized the purchase of 
storm windows for the Court­
house and a replacement ve­
hicle for the sheriffs depart­
ment during the session held in 
the Courthouse in Spearman. 
The county will advertise for 
bids for the storm windows and 
the replacement vehicle.

Commissioners also author­
ized the purchase of radios for 
Gruver fire trucks with one

radio to be purchased from 
Precinct 4 funds and another 
from the County general fund. 
In addition, the city is expected 
to purchase some radios. The 
radios currently in use and 
being replaced will be utilized 
in weatherwatch service in the 
county.

The investment of $15,000 in 
90-day certificates of deposit for 
Investment Fund No. 13 for 
Precinct 2 was approved.

An annual service agreement 
on a cash register in the county 
tax office was approved and is 
to be handled by Stanfield 
Printing Co. of Guymon, Okla.

The tax office also was au­
thorized an additional telephone 
number.

Payment of claims as pre­
sented was authorized.

The meeting was recessed 
until Tuesday, March 28, at 2 
p.m.

Details connected with clear­
ing right-of-way of FM520 prior 
to the letting of the contract 
next month for work on the 
highway were cleared up during 
the Tuesday afternoon session.

It was announced that the 
contract for the highway project 
will be let in Austin on April 19.

Small Engine 
School

Summer is in view with lawn 
mowers rolling out of winter 
hideaways.

A small engine school taught 
by Fred Groves planned foi 

Saturday, April 1st at the 
Spearman County Barn, is de­
signed not to make yhou a 
mechanic, but to teach you how 
to diagnose and take care of the 
most common small engine 
problems.

From 9 a.m. to 12 noon and 1 
- 4 p.m. anyone using lawn 
mowers, pumps or generators 
will learn how to avoid ruining 
an engine.

The school will include sharp­
ening and balancing lawn mow­
er blades, servicing engines, 
adjusting engine speeds, car­
buretor adjustments, safety, 
and proper air cleaner service 
which is the most common 
cause of ruined engines.

Fred will use torn down 
engines to exemplify the results 
of improper use and service.

The school is designed for 
4-H youth and adults. Anyone 
interested may attend free of 
charge, upon contacting the 
County Extension office to en­
roll (659-2030 or 733-2901).

Little League 

Registration
If you plan to play this year in 

Little League, you need to 
register now before the April 1 
deadline.

Boys ages 13,14, and 15 need 
to register now.

Western Ag Sales Co.

Our underground pipe...your best choice.

Turn Key Installation 
Superior Quality Pipe 

/U nrivaled Experience in PVC Pipe Installation'»:

W estern  A g ...
Y o u ’v e  k n o w n  u s fo r  a lo n g  tim e .

• Center Pivot Systems • Metal Farm Buildings 

•Underground Plastic Pipe «Grain Storage Bins

★  can  u s  6 5 9 - 2 5 9 6
Wilton Green

P.O. Box 67 •  Spearman, Texas 79018

Tax Office 
Closed April /

Tax offices in other counties 
may open on April I for the sale 
of license plate stickers but the 
office in Hansford County in the 
Courthouse in Spearman as well 
as the auxiliary office in Gruver 
which has been maintained for 
the past few weeks will be 
closed. Hansford County Tax 
Assessor Collector Helen Dry 
has announced.

The tax office in Spearman 
will be open at the usual time on 
Monday. April 3, for the trans­
action of business.

SPD Officer Hired

Spearman Police Chief Steve 
Wisniewsky has reported the 
hiring of an officer for the 
department. He is Stephen 
Wayne Gains, 20. of Wheeler 
who has recently worked in 
Amarillo. Gains and Jimmy 
Jackson this week started a 
240-hour course at the Police 
Academy in Amarillo to receive 
their basic certification in law 
enforcement.

Farmers Union 
To Receive 

Charter
There will be a Farmers 

Union Meeting March 30. at
7:30 p.m. in the Morse School 
Cafeteria.

State President Jay Naman 
will be present to present a 
charter to Hansford and Hutch­
inson Counties combined 

A dutch treat barbecue will 
be catered by Sutphens. Wives 
are invited to attend.

Bowling
News

Wed. Night Mixed Donbles 
3-1S-78

W L
Panhandle Eastern 61 '/i 38'/i 
Wardrobe Cleaners 57‘/i 42'/i 
Cates Men & Boys 52 Vi 47 V, 
Ideal SO'/, 49‘/j
Doug Outs I  50 50
Bowl Mor 1  49 51

Hansford Implement 40'/i 59VS 
Electronics Center 39VS 60 Vi 

HIGH TEAM SERIES 
Wardrobe Cleaners 2191
Cates 2189
Hansford Implement 2173

HIGH MEN SERIES 
Oscar Donnell 530
Don White 516
Wayne Cummings 504

HIGH WOMEN SERIES 
Sandy Heinrich 454
Pat Donnell 432
Jane Meek 419

HIGH TEAM GAME 
Wardrobe G eaners 816
Ideal 782
Electronics Center 781

HIGH MEN GAME 
Oscar Donnell 214
Jim Nicholson 191
Bob Farr 190

HIGH WOMEN GAME 
Reba Benge 168
Sandy Heinrich 164
Jeannie White 159

A-l Automotive
W L
47 09

B& B Farm Ind. 37 19
Northern Natural 31 25
Cates Men & Boys 29 27
Berry Grain 27 29
Spearman Auto 19 37
North Plains 19 37
Lyric Theatre 15 41

HIGH MEN’S SERIES
Charles Elliott 582
Charlie Greenwood 533
Dan Faries (Sub) 489

HIGH WOMEN'S SERIES
Diane Elliott 576
Shirley Greenwood 542
Rita Reed 494

HIGH MEN’S GAME
Charlie Greenwood 218
Charles Elliott 215
Ladd Gafford 199

HIGH WOMEN’S GAME
Diane Elliott 206
Shirley Greenwood 203
Diane Elliott 200

Panhandle Eastern 2207
Hansford Implement 2207

HIGH MEN SERIES 
Jim Nicholson 535
Don White 533
Millard Tucker 507

HIGH WOMEN SERIES 
Georgeann Washington 492 
Sandy Heinrich 491
Pat Donnell 470

HIGH TEAM GAME 
Bowl Mor 833
Electronics Center 805
Panhandle Eastern 780

HIGH MEN GAME 
Millard Tucker 226
Billy Giles 201
Jim Nicholson 199

HIGH WOMEN GAME 
Jane Meek 191
Georgeann Washington 190 
Pat Donnell 189

Stinson Gibner 
Photo 

Competition
Stinson Gibner, junior at 

Spearman High School AND 
PHOTOGRAPHER FOR THE 
HIGH SCHOOL YEARBOOK* 
LYNX placed second in Class _ 
2AA sports photo competition in * 
the jState of Texas. The 
Contest was held as part of the 
Interscholastic Press Confer­
ence March 17-18 at the Univer­
sity of Texas, Austin.

Stinson’s award winning pho­
to was an action shot of football 
play last fall. The picture 
showed Billy Sellers as he broke 
through the offensive line and 
also showed the action in the 
line.

Earlier, Stinson won first and 
third in photography contests 
sponsored by the Panhandle 
Press Association.

Delivery of the 1978 edition of 
the LYNX containing these a- 
ward winning pictures is ex­
pected the first week in May.

Planning
Session

Plans for Emergency Aware­
ness month to be observed 
during April in Spearman and 
involving the Spearman Volun­
teer Fire Department were dis­
cussed at the departmental 
session held Thursday. March 
23, it has been announced.

According to advance infor­
mation. the observance is being 
timed to coincide with spring 
cleaning operations in the city 
during which inspections of 
buildings and residences will be 
conducted. All owners interest­
ed in having their property 
inspected are requested to con­
tact the city fire marshal to 
authorize such an inspection.

April 22. according to plann­
ing at this time, has been 
tentatively set as the date for 
the open house annually held by 
the fire department.

Activities scheduled for the 
month, with time and place to 
be announced, include some 
demonstrations by fire depart­
ment personnel and depart­
mental equipment and a de­
monstration of Emergency 
Medical Service (EMS) oper­
ations.

THURSDAY, MARCH 30, 1978

Station Master 

Museum News

Happy
Anniversary

Those observing their anni­
versaries during the month of 
April are Bob and Debra Den­
nis. Mr. and Mrs. Ralph New­
ton, Mr. and Mrs. Roy Collins, 
Calvin and Linda Bodey. Donita 
and Ronnie Lusby, Wally & 
Myra Berner, Harold and Joyce 
Frost, Henry and Stella Garcia, 
Darline & I. V. Pierce, Oliver 
and Mary Barnes, and James 
and Linda Owens.

The Hansford County Histor­
ical Commission held a special 
meeting Monday evening at 
7:30 P.M. at Martin’s Steak 
Gardens. There wxs a pleasant 
discussion on the old town site 
of Hansford. The business of a 
spring tour was the main topic 
of discussion, the members 
want to stimulate community 
interest and involvement by 
taking people that are interest­
ed on local tours of the historical 
markers and other sites of 
interest in the county. A 
County History Book is still in 
the discussion stages and also 
the Oral Histories that are 
imperative to our local history. 
Present were: Fred Groves,
President; Gementine Renner, 
Treasurer; Jaunita Pierce, Sec­
retary; Grace Lyons. Judge 
Johnnie Lee, Hellen Boyd, and 
Ruby Saltnes, Director.

You, your club, your group, 
or any interested party are 
welcome to inquire about the 

„tour. It is for educational 
‘ purposes so come along and 

bring your kids. We can learn a 
lot about our county. Make 
inquiries by calling the museum 
at 3008 or any committee 
member.

’42 Party 
Planed

The Holt Home Demonstra­
tion Gub is sponsoring a '42 
party for March 31, 1978 at 
7:30. It will be held at the Holt
School House.

Everyone in the Holt Com­
munity is cordially invited to 
attend this event.

Panhandle Eastern 
Wardrobe Geaners 
Cates Men & Boys 
Ideal 
Bowl Mor 
Doug Outs 
Hansford Implement 45‘/j 60‘/i 
Electronics Center 40'/i 63‘/a 

HIGH TEAM SERIES 
Bowl Mor 2300
Wardrobe Cleaners 2223

ALLSUPS
OPEN 21 OPEN 246311 40' j

' . -M HOURS
< . ■ .

CONVENIENCE STORES

SUPER SHOPPIN G

Edwin Limbocker 

announces as candidate 

for City Alderman 

for the
upcoming election 

April 1.

Your vote will 

be appreciated.

CHECK OUT AT ALLSUP'S

Î I A R - I - I

1  C l

- BORDEN S HIGH PROTEIN

i t  m ilk» 89c,
SHURFINE SLICED OR WHOLE \

PEACHES
16 OZ. CAN 2 5 €

Him

•0 FRESH COOKED

CHICKEN
$ | 9 9

1976 MALIBU CLASSIC - PS -  PB - AC -  AT...........$2395.00

Air conditioner‘Power steering-Automatic transmission-4 dr.
1977 NOVA.............................................................................. $3975.00

1976 LOADED SILVERADO 3 /4  ton........................ $4450.00

1973 PONTIAC, low m ile s , loaded.......................... $2000.00

2-door-Automatic trsnsmission-air conditioner-Elec. windows-doors-Tape

1975 BUICK RIVERIA........................................................$4550.00

1978 1 /2 ton CHEVROLET, s a v e . . .  sa v e ..........$ 6 ,3 2 0 .0 0

1974 MERCURY MX lo a d e d ..4 d r.................................$1995.00

One only - 1 /2  ton Chevy - 4W D -Stepside.. . .  $3100.00

One only -  3 /4  ton 4-w heel drive ch evy...............$3500.00

1977 98 Regency, 21 ,0 0 $ j i i i { p lq j d e d .  .......... $6800.00

1976 FORD, Gran T orino, clean PS, PB, AT, AC. . .  $2600.00

Gerald Heinrich's 
EXCEL CHEVROLET-OLDS, INC.

"WE'RE IN BUSINESS BECAUSE WE MAKE GOOD DEALS"
SOUTH HIGHWAY 207 -  Spearman, Texas -  Phone (»0«) 069-2541

SHURFINE

TOMATO SAUCE

7~ .$1
SHURFINE SLICED

.PINEAPPLE
X  15 OZ. CAN M i

pol, adv

SHURFINE WHOLE KERNEL

CORN
2 0Z. CAN

20e
FORALLTHOSE 

GOOD TIMES 
IN LIFE

...START SAVING 
WITH US TODAY.

Think of all the  good times ahead.
The day your child goes off to college. 

The day your daughter gets married. T he day 
you and your spouse fly off on that long-awaited 
trip. All good and wonderful times.

B ut-they  all cost money.
To make those d ream s com e true, open 

a savings account with us today. W hen you have a 
savings account with us, your m oney earns a high 
rate of interest, you know it's safe because it's 
insured by a U S. Government Agency, and it's 
always available. A n d -y o u r  money grows 
because the interest is compounded.

Make your dreams come true. Open a 
savings account with us now.

Interstate Savings & 
Loan Assn.

322 MAES 659-2344 SPEARMAN

SHURFINE BARTLETT

PEAR HALVES

so«
S H U R F IN E  

¿«L-CHUNK L IG H T t

M TUNA i
oz. c a n I  0 5  

HOT COOKED FOODS

f PEACHES
9 O Z .  C A N  ' 3 7 «

SHURFINE

VE0ETABLE OIL
I » oz. ggc
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Boxwell
Bros.

Funeral Home 
and

Flower Shop
FUNERAL HOME - 659- 3802 
FLOWER SHOP-659-2212

Hansford County 
Planned Parenthood 

26 S. Haney 
659-2483 
Spearman
M o n -Fri.

8 a.m. to l ì  noon 
30S-rtn

HANSFORD LODGE 
No. 1040 

A.F. ft A.M.

Called Meeting 
April 7, 7:30 p.m. 

G nad Master of Maiaa i  
In Texas Vlalt 

Certi Battoo, W.M. 
Jerry E. (be , Sec’j .

(  Older 3 bedroom home, car- ]  
{ pets, fenced yard, carport, £

Mobile home park, 6 spaces,, 
good location.

2 bedroom stucco home, plus 
large storage room, living 
room, dining room, kitchen 
with extra space, detached 
double garage, quiet location 1 
on 110 ft. lot, owner i 
carry loan.

Lovely 3 bedroom brick 
home, fenced yard, double 
garage, choice lot 104 ft. 
wide, cozy fireplace, carpets 
throughout, insulated ' 
dows and doors, central heat 
and air, built-in kitchen with 
dishwasher, disposal, cook- 1 
top and oven. Shown by ] 
appointment only.

EMMETT R. SANDERS 
REALTOR 
659-2516 

659-2601 (sights!
12S-rtn

KIRBY SALES ft SERVICE of 
Spearman, 912 S. Bernice.
659-2797.

30-rtn

after 7 p.m. ft Sundays
caU FREDDIE LARGENTI 

659-3437 
17-rtu

YOUR LOCAL USED 
COW DEALER: SPEAR­
MAN BI-PRODUCTS.

FOR SALEi Large office build­
ing in good location near down­
town. Use as Store. Offices. 
Storage of etc. Central heat, air 
conditioned, carpeted. 14 S. 
Haney. Harold Groves. 659- 
2647.

12S-rtn
FOR SALE: Two bedroom
house with large workshop on 
three lots. House is newly 
carpeted and painted. Fenced, 
with large shade trees. 90S S. 
Main. Graver, 806-733-2464.

FOR SALE- 1977 Wilderness 5 
wheel travel trailer. Small 
equitv and take up payments. 
1975 250 Yamaha dirt bike. Call 
659-3636 after 5 p.m.

________  19-4tc

HELP WANTED: Apply in
person, Rogers, Sales ft Ser­
vice. Waka, Texas. Inside 
shop, manufacturing work.

Steady employment. Irrigation 
and fanning. Summer tractor 
driving for school boy. Salary 
open. Three bedroom h ouse 
and other benefits furnished. 
Contact in evening: Fred
Meyer. Pho. 806-733-2818 or 
Robert Meyer, Pho. 806-733- 
2904 at Graver. Texas.

20-4tc
Help wanted Lady full time. 5 
days a week, 9 to 5:30. Apply at 
Spearman Jewelry.

*The City of Spearman is accept­
ing applications for manager 
and lifeguards of Municipal 
Swimming Pool. Applications 
will be accepted up until noon 
April 5th. 1978 in the office of 
the Citv Manager at Citv Hall.

20-2tc

I will not be responsible for 
any debts not made by me. 

Jerry Etheredge.
18S-4tp

SERVICE: Pits cleaned, wet or 
dry. Dragline or loader. Also, 
dozer, grader, cany-all service. 
LeeRoy Mitchell. 806-733-2384, 
Graver, Texas, 79040.

Mayfield Raal Estate 
John Mayfield - Broker

435-6528
Ruby Lair • Salesperson

659-2188

1109 Townsend. 3 bedroom, 
IV« baths, new appliances, 
single car garage, fenced 
yard.

Land For Sale: 160 acres, 11 
northeast of Follett, 

windmill water, some ma­
chinery. immediate posses­
sion, no minerals.

FOR RENT: One ft Two
bedroom apartments. 303 Davis

Sam Nitschke 
LEGAL NOTICE

General Telephone Com­
pany of the Southwest 
has filed tariHs with the 
Public Utility Commis­
sion of Texas to imple­
ment the Federal 
Communications Com­
mission's telephone 
equipment registration 
program (FCC Docket 
19528). The tariffs have 
an effective date of 
April 15, 1978. The 
proposed changes will 
reduce rates for exten­
sion telephones and 25

charges for service con­
nection, moves and 
changes, increasing 
some and reducing 
others; and will offer 
reduced monthly rates 
for one-party business 
and residence customers 
who provide their own 
primary telephone in­
strument. The proposed 
changes in rates, with 
some increasing and 
others decreasing, will 
reduce General's gross 
revenues from its Texas 
operations by $2,565.00.

Alcoholic Anonymous Meet­
ing 8 p.m. Friday. Home 
Demonstration Club build­
ing. 305 N. Bernice. Phone 
659-3181 for information.

Al-Anon meetings 8 p.m. 
Friday Home Demonstration 
Cub building. 305 N. Ber­
nice in back room. Phone 
659-3181 for information. 
Ask for Al-Anon.

Ed Wheeler Real Estate 
Ed Wheeler-Broker 
Wilma Etheredge 

Salesperson 
659-3669

2 bedroom stucco plus eff­
iciency apartment. Roping 
arena with light. 1.6 acres on 
Industrial road.

BUSINESS
OPPORTUNITIES

Good Volume Service Station 
For Lease. Buy Equipment and 
small inventory. Call Days 
659-2323; nights 659-2969 • ask 
for BUI.

19S-4tc

ED WHEELER REAL ESTATE
HOMES - FARM 

-COMMERCIAL-
Brick 3 bedroom, 1V< baths, built-ins, new 
carpet, nice drapes, attached single garage, 
fenced, storage house.

3064 under roof, 3 bedroom. 1V« baths, central 
heat and air. ash paneling and woodwork, extra 
large double garage, automatic underground 
lawn sprinkler, large storage building, concrete 
pad for boat, etc. Cinder block fence, nice patio. 
Appointment only.

3 bedroom brick, 2 full baths, recently redecor­
ated, fenced, central heat and refrigerated air, 
large double garage detached with finished room 
ft bath, can be used for bedroom or office. Must 
see to appreciate.

•  • •
416 S. Haney. 2 bedroom, 1 bath, buUt-in 
appliances, washer ft dryer, completely remodel­
ed, new carpet, drapes, custom made, new roof, 
freshly painted, storm windows, detached garage 
made into bedroom. Must see to appreciate.

Trespass to Try Title-per- 
tatting to the following describ- 
cdtpropcrtv to-wit: All of Lots 
Nos 4. >. h. 7. h and 9. in Block 
No.4. Original Town of Morse 
Hxnsford County. Texas.

If this citation is not served 
within ninety days after the dale 
of its issuance, it shail be 
returned unserved.

The officer executing this writ 
shil promptly serve the same 
according to requirements of 
In. and the mandates hereof, 
aid make due return as the law 
directs

Witness. Marie H. Gould. 
Qert of the District Court! s) of 
Hmsford County. Texas.
Issued and given under my 

hand and the seal of said court 
it Spearman. Texas, this the 

‘ lay of March. A.D. 1978 
1 H. Gould. Clerk. District 

Í Court Hansford County. Texas. 
l9-4Tonly

GARAGE SALE: Saturday,
.April 1st. 9:00 A.M. Color TV. 
Household items and clothing. 
Nothing sold before Saturday. 

... 703 Gibner Dr.

Plans and specifications in­
cluding minimum wage rates as 
provided by Law are available at 
the office of Jay L. Hawley, 
Resident Engineer. Borger. 
Texas, and State Department of 
Highways and Public Tran­
sportation, Austin.

Usual rights reserved.
20-2t

GARAGE SALE: Saturday.
April 1st. 9:00 to 5:00. 1112 S. 
Bernice.

20-ltp
Have openings for grocery 
clerks. 3:00 P.M. to 11:00 P.M. 
or 7:00 A.M. to 3:00 P.M. See 
Manager at Allsup’s Conven­
ience Store, 30 S. Kenneth.

20-rtn

JIMMY GREENE 
659-3196

BOX 5
SPEARMAN

I We offer one of the largest and finest homes in 
f Southeast Spearman across from the high school, 
i Five bedrooms, formal living room, den in 
1 basement with built-in fireplace. Approximate- 
I ly 4000 square feet with many extras. Includes 

I2 ’x20’ storage building, fence, sprinkler system,
! TV and CB towers and antennas, many more 
I features. Call for appointment. 659-2647, Mr.

Monuments, Curbing, 
Grave Covers 

Local Representative 
LEONARD JAMESON 

659-3486 
20-rtn

REAL ESTATE 
FOR SALE

Fans Far Sole: Crawford Addi­
tion, 659-3510.

16S-rtn

FOR SALE BY OWNER: Two. 
3 bedroom homes, 2 baths, 
good location, reasonably pric­
ed. CaU 659-2283.

19S-rtn

FOR SALE: >013 S. Bernice. J

windows and doors, fenced-in 
back yard. After 5:00 for 
appointment. 659-2872.

ISS-rtn

ik

821 S. Barkley, 2 bedroom, 1 Vi bath, new tile in 
kitchen, dining area, new carpet in den, storm 
windows, large lot, fenced storage building, 
single garage, large trees, sprinkling system. 
Extra nice home -  can be made into a three

FOR SALE: 1974 T-Bird *2400. 
1975 F150 Ford V« ton super 
cab. new motor S2900. 1976 
Scottsdale Vt Ton Chevrolet, 
low mileage, J3000. 1964 GMC 
1 Ton $400. Graver, 733-5091. 

20-2tc

FOR SALE: 1967 Chevrolet
Van. 68 Buick Wildcat, 63 
Cadillac. 303 Davis St.

17S-rtn

FOR SALE: Firewood. Burton 
Schubert. CaU 659-2667.

5-rtn

FOR SALE: Antique Kitchen 
Cupboard with sliding louvered 
front. 6S9-2716.

18-rtn
FOR SALE: 1974 Vega GT 

Air-conditioned 
733-2853, Graver a 
P.M.

20-ltc
FOR SALE: AKC Registered 
Airedale Puppies. Call 659- 
3460 after six.

20-2tp

CARDINAL CHEMICAL, INC.
NEEDS EQUIPMENT OPERATORS 

Must have commercial license and telephone. 

$875 monthly guaranteed pay. Group Insurance, 
paid vacation, retirement plan, advancement. 

Experience hfilpfuLHuLooLrequIred.
PEBRYTON, TEXAS

APPLY IN PERSON -  435-8688.
________  MUST BE AGES 21 ANDOVER

CARDINAL CHEMICAL, INC.
NEEDS ONE OR TWO GOOD MECHANICS

Must have own tools and diesel experience. 
Group insursnee, paid vacation, retirement plan, 
advancement. Age 21 years or over.

APPLY IN PERSON -  435-858«

WHAT A HOUSE!
Nestled on a cul-de-sac, this beautiful home 
offers 3 large bedrooms, 2 baths, sunken living 
room with fireplace, utility room, lota of storage, 
double garage, ft large patio. Step-saving 
kitchen arrangement has continuous cleaning 
double ovens, cook-top, dishwasher, ft disposal. 
Warm, rich ashwood cabinets complete this 
'cook’s' dream of a kitchen. From the beautiful 
double doors that grace the entrance, the 

&É f lH ^ H I  woodwork and doors throughout are the same 
' rich ashwood. Large master bedroom features

two huge walk-in closet) and unusually large luxurious ceramic tiled bath. THIS IS THE OPPORTUNITY OF A LFE- 
T IME TO HAVE THE HOME YOU DIDN'T THINK YOU COULD FIND. Quality throughout. By appointment only.

IT'S ALL HERE 
712 Collier Dr.

3 bedrooms. Vh baths, 1323 Sq. Ft. on 130’ lot. 
Utility room, Central heat and Air-conditioning. 
The sunken living room with fireplace gives this 
home special warmth and charm. See this one 
today! Call for appointment.

We Need Listings I Want to Seil your Home? We have BUYERS, W ÈËÊÊÈÈÊËÈÈŒ fi
.



EXCLUSIVELY AT

HANDPAINTED
Stoneware Mugs at 
magnificent savings! 

ONLY AT

MICROWAVE & 
DISHWASHER SAFE 

•OVEN TO TABLE

Coffee, tea, milk, 
soft drinks. . .  serve 

up any beverage 
of your choice 

in style! Now you can collect a complete set of beautiful 
mugs at great savings just for shopping with us!

Choose from a wide
selection of shapes 

amt decorations!

Now you can pick up an extra special bargain each time 
you shop! A beautiful regular size mug of your choice for only 
99*. Or, a super jumbo mug for just $1.49. And you can 
choose from a myriad of patterns and styles! Lovely florals, 
contemporary stripes... and colors to match every decor! 
They’re dishwasher-safe, break-resistant and chip-resistant 
— perfect for everyday and entertaining, too!

So  start your mug collection today 
when you shop— and remember to 
get at least one of each size every- 
time you come in. And before you 
know it, you’ll have collected two 
Mugnificent** sets of handpainted 
stoneware mugs!
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Rebekah Lodge 
Meet8

Spearman Rebekah Lodge 
0290 met Thursday, March 23 in 
the l.O.O.F. Lodge Hall. Noble 
Grand Inez Holland presided 
over the meeting with Vice 
Grand Pro Tern Dorothy Long- 
ley assisting.

Secretary Mona Slater gave a 
report on attending the Rebe­
kah Assembly; and also gave a 
report from the correspondence 
sent by Panhandle Association 
to be held April 22 in Pampa.

Wanda Slater, Thelma Ble­
vins. and Jessie Bratton were 
reported as being ill.

Mrs. Wanda Slater. Cecil 
Slater’s mother, is recovering 
from recenf surgery.

A ballot was held on Marilyn 
Groves' membership; it was 
decided that she would be 
installed April 13 into the 
Lodge.

Inez Holland served refresh­
ments to the nine members 
present.

Members sang Happy 
Birthday" to Thelma Kenney 
Sandra Bowar. Inez Holland, 
and Dorothy Long ley who cele­
brated their birthdays during 
the month of March

The next meeting will be 
April 13 at 7:30 p.m.

Rho Rho 
Sorority Meets
The Rho th e  Chapter of Beta 

Sigma Phi elected officers for 
the coming year at the March 
23rd meeting at the home of 
Mrs. Donita Lusby Mrs. Jackie

Day Banquet
April 27.

Installation of the new offi 
cers will be held the first 
meeting in May. May 11

Mrs. Kari Schumann. Social 
Chairman, announced that 
there will be a picnic for the 
members' families in April. In­
vitations will be sent.

The program, which was on 
medicine, was given by Mrs 
Joan Hill, lab technician. She 
explained about blood tests

Refreshments were served by 
Mrs. Donita Lusby to members. 
Mesdames: Hazel Shield
knight. Karen Blodgett. Candi 
Boswell. Debbie Clements. 
Marilvn Cline. Linda Blackman. 
Kari Schumann. Jolinda Hut­
chison. Jackie Pearson, Marsha 
Pipkin. Janie Henton. Susan 
Pearson. Lisa Pipkin. Jodie 
Rex. Cindy Schneider. Mills 
Leslv. Delinda McLaughlin. 
Ginger Pittman. Pennve Ral­
ston. Pam Taylor and Joan 
Hill

The next meeting will be 
April 13 at the home of Mrs. 
James Hargis. 1106 Wilmeth

Mrs Teresa Hargis will be

Religious Art 
Show Successful

Spearman Ministenal All­
iance were well pleased with the 
success of their first religious 
arts show at Hansford County 
Li bran all Holy Week Twenty 
three artists exhibited oil paint­
ings. pastels, chalk, decoupage.

first religious arts show were 
Martha Ballon. Ruth Bryan 
Debbie Connelly. Alice Dukes 
Bucks Dunnihoo. D. W. Dunni

Happy
Birthday

Those celebrating their birth-

sculpture. ceramics, needle-
point, crewel, and embroidery . 
People were pleased with the 
depth of expression of religious 
faith on the part of exhibitors. 
In addition, there were also 
banners from the Presbyterian, 
Lutheran, and Methodist chur­
ches on display making the 
library a very colorful, cheerful 
place

Exhibitors at Spearman's

tended to Betty Green, Dorthy Conference on April 7 & 8 
Lusby, Dennis P. Rojas, Mari- Pampa at the Coronado Inn - 
lyn Groves, Barbara McClellan, Motel.
Leann Biles, Nita Baker. Oscar Officers were elected for the 
Dennis Rojas, Amos Burke, Ray next two years. They are: Pre-
Moyer, Joe Wattier, Ramon sident, Mrs. Reneau Wlsniew-

| ____  _ Lazano, Cliff Hornsby, Debbie ski; First Vice President, Mrs.
days during the month of April Hornsby, Charles Zschieshe, ------- “  ..................
»re Wayne Ware, Lorie Junell, Julie Countiss, Fern Newton.

, . , _ .  . - . p»m Dry. Karey Bodey, Kristy Brent Biles. Connie Etheredge, Third Vice President. Mrs.
w c  m ®ct,v Franklin, Phillip Turner, Fran* Robert Hagerman, Tammy da Winegamer; Secretary, Mrs.

Freeman. Blanche Fuller. Mar dsc0 RUiz, Betty Davis. Dick Donahue. Jerry Orr, James Susan Pearson; Corresponding 
ina Gaunder. M. Gibner Fred Hudsol), Mac Owens, Dee Ann Pierce, Agustin Mejia. Bette Secretary. Mrs. Cindy Schnei-
Groves. Mrs. Woodville Jarvis. Green. Carla Greene, Sara Jen- Morris, April Tennison, Eleanor der; Treasurer, Mrs. Michelle

kins. Dickie Allen, Ralph New- Reed, Lonnie Luaby, Kerry Me- Davis; and Parliamentarian,
ton. Ted Godfrey, Douglas Mullan, Elvin Martin, Tammy Mrs. Marsha Murphy. _____________
Barnes, Wally Berner, Thelma Savage, Scott Vernon, Robby Refreshments were enjoyed f o r  COUNTY & 
Blevins. Beth Sheppard, Kelly Shields, Connie Steyer, Ed Gar- by members, Mesdames: Re- DISTRICT CLERK
Groves, Julie Farr, Damon ner, Lee Jarvis, and Debra neau Wisniewski, Gaye Wool-
Goodheart, Nancy Lair, April Owens.
Abston. and Patti Short.

Servitors Club

Dorene Kirk. Ruth Lackey. Im- 
ogene Pogue. K Rcimer, Lo- 
meta Sparks. Helen Whitaker 
Phil While. Don Wirsdorfer, M 
Yanke. and Arlene Zicmer.

Viewers had fun looking at 
the works of art and placing 
blue ribbons on that which 
appealed to them most. Almost 
every work of art had at least 
one ribbon and some had as 
tmanv as three.

The Hansford Plainsman is 
authorized to announce the 
candidacy of the following can- 

Debbie Benton; Second Vice didates for public office, subject 
president, Mrs. Wanda Lyon; t0 ,he action 0f the voters in the 
............. ~ "  * 1 9 7 8  primary elections.

FOR COUNTY JUDGE 
R. L. McClellan 
Francis Biles
FOR COUNTY TREASURER
Verna Gail Keim

Xi Zêta Upsilon 

Meets
Xi Zêta Upsilon Chapter of 

Beta Sigma Phi met Thursday,

Twentieth 
Century Club

The Twentieth Century Club n^McCov Tnd
met Thursday, March 23 in the J ' °  MeC°y' »"d

Birthday wishes also go to 
Donita Lusby, Mac Sheppard, 
Lawton Guthrie, Cindy Berner 
Smith, Tammi Maize. Jeanette 
Giias. Chance Jackson, Darlita 
Pierce. Robbie Randall. Ross 
Bulls. Michele Schuman, Ste­
phanie Friemel, Kay Cook, 
Perra Lozano, G. W. Robinson,

Servitors Club met Thursday, 
March 16 at the B A B Friend­
ship Room at 7:30 p.m. Hos-

ley, Susan Pearson. Betsy Neff, 
Marsha Murphy, Rita Holmes, 
Cathy Harris, Candi Boxwell, 
Debbie Benton, Terry Thomp­
son, Becky Booth. Cindy 
Schneider, Jackie Pearson, 
Wanda Lyon, Mollie Holton, 
Michelle Davis, Candy Delo

tesses were Mrs. Candy Delo- zier, Janie Assiter and guests 
zier and Mrs. Gaye Woolley. Mrs. Hollie Simpson and Mrs.

The program was given by Donna Thomas, 
senior high drama students The next meeting will be

Lori Diffie.

far the coming <
Mrs Hazel Shieldknight. Mrs 
Pennyt Ralston mas named 
First Vice President: Mrs Kar­
en Blodgett. Second Vice Presi­
dent. Mrs Marilyn dine. Re­
cording Secretary; Mrs. Susan 
Pearson. Corresponding Secre­
tary: Mrs. Ginger Pittman. 
Treasurer: and Mrs. Patty Tay­
lor. Extension Officer.

The secret ballot will deter­
mine the chapter’s ‘girl of the 
Year', ‘Chairman of the Year’, 
and Program of the Year’. This 
ballot was voted on at this 
meeting and will be revealed at

Club To Host 
Dist. Jamboree

The Spearman Spinners Squ­
are Dance Club will host the 
District 5 Jamboree Saturday . 
April 1 m the Community 
Building here The business 
meeting »ill be at 2 p.m. and 
the dance «-ill begin at 8 p.m.

There »ill be several area 
callers present for the dance 
and even-one is invited to come 
and dance or just come and 
match.

Arts and Crafts 
Guild Mews

Arts and Crafts Guild met 
Friday. March 24 in the home of 
Mrs. Garrett Allen.

Refreshments were enjoyed 
by members. Mesdames: Sada 
Hoskins, d a y  Gibner. Bill Rus­
sell, P. A. Lyon, Sr., Pope 
Gibner, Ned Turner, and Deta 
Blodgett.

The next meeting will be 
March 31 in the home of Mrs. 
Deta Blodgett.

^  _____ _______ ww Thursday, ____
March *23, 1978 at 11:30 ¡ t  home of Mrs. F. B. Schubert for Con„ atulations are also 
Martin's Steak Garden for a * Texas Day Meeting under the ^
dutch treat luncheon. President title "Freedom To Enjoy Life".
Mrs Linda Latta presided over Roll Call was answered by 
the business meeting. "How I Help My Grandchild’s

They had the opening ritual Education” , 
and roll call. Followed that was the salute

Minutes of the previous to the Texas Flag, 
meeting were read and approv- Mrs. Coy Palmer talked from 
ed. the title “ Tall Tales From

Mrs. Sharion Cook. Service Texas” .
Mrs. Ed Freeman gave a very

which was a one-act play.
The club is going to be involv­

ed in a Top 'o Texas Spring

Chairman, reported that the 
club will deliver meals next interesting book review which
month for the 'meals on wheels' 
project.

Officers were elected for 
1978-79. They are: President. 
Mrs. Sharion Cook; Vice Presi­
dent, Mrs. Mary Lou Mathews; 
Recording Secretary, Mrs. La-

: entitled "And God Created 
Grandparents” by Charlie 
Shedd.

Members present were Mes­
dames: J. R. Stump, Harold 
Shaver, F. B. Schubert - hos- 

Russell Pogue - co-hos
quita Evans; Corresponding Se- tess, John Brown, Tommy Rus- 
cretary. Mrs. Linda Umphress; sell, O. C. Holt, Ed Freeman, C.
and Treasurer, Mrs. Linda Ven- 
neman. They will be installed 

i Founder’s Day, April 27.

A. Kleeberger. Wayne Hutchi­
son. L. L. Anthony. Deta Blod­
gett, Coy Palmer, Cecil Big-

Members voted on 'Girl of gers, John Bishop, Woodville 
the Year', Chairman of the Jarvis, P. A. Lyon, Gary Evans. 
Year’ and Program of the C. U. Pope, Tom Sutton, Don

JGs HAS STARTED  
A NEW

^HOSIERY CLUB *

Edwin Limbocker 

announces as 
candidate 

for City Alderman 

for the upcoming 

election April 1. 

Your vote will 

be appreciated.

Year'; these awards 
given at the Founder's Day 
Banquet.

Following the business meet­
ing, Mrs. Sharion Cook gave the 
program on Will Rogers.

The closing ritual was held. 
Members present were Mes­

dames: Linda Latta. Verna ideas.
Strawn, Sharion Cook. Linda 
Venneman, Phyllis Collins, Lyn- 
na Renner, Mary Dixon, Mary 
Lou Mathews. Cheryl Meek,
Cathy Patterson. Laquita 
Evans, Eulalia Mires and guest 
Mrs. Suzie Driscoll.

The next meeting will be 
April 13 at the home of Mrs.
Cynthia DeArmond. Mrs. Ver­
na Strawn will have the pro­
gram.

HD Club 
News

The Holt Home Demonstra­
tion Gub met Tuesday, March 
21, 1978 in the home of Mrs.
Larry Porter. The President,
Mrs. Michael Holt, called the 
meeting to order.

Minutes of the previous 
meeting were read and approv­
ed.

Council representative. Mrs.
Loyd Pool, gave the Council 
report. She reported on the 
scholarship fund.

May 2 was announced as the 
date for the County Show n Tell 
A Luncheon to be held at the 
Phillips Community Building.

It was announced that a '42 
Party will be held March 31,
1978 at 7:30 p.m. at the Holt 
School.

Mrs. Rex McGoy gave a 
program on "gardening and

Kunselman, and John Trindle.
The next meeting will be 

April 13 in the home of Mrs. L. 
L. Anthony. There will be a 
change of program. It will be 
entitled "Eggery" by Mrs. 
Fred Meyers which will give 
members interesting craft

Public Notice

April 20.

United 
Presbyterian 
Church News

Coordinating Council of Palo

Southwestern Bell, in accordance 
with the rules of the Public Utility 
Comm ission of Texas, hereby gives 
notice of the com pany’s intent to im­
plement a new schedule of telephone 
rates in Texas effective April 14,1978.

It is expected that the requested 
rate schedule will furnish an increase 
of 11.4 percent in the com pany 's intra­
state revenues.

A complete copy of the new rate 
schedule is on file with the Public 
Utility Com m ission at Austin, Texas, 
and with each affected municipality, 
and is available for inspection in each 
of the Com pany 's public business 
offices.

Alvin (Bill) Cator, Jr.
George C. (Bud) Lowe 
Val Winger
FOR STATE REPRESENTA­
TIVE 64th LEGISLATIVE DIS­
TRICT
Bob Close

“ Doubting Thomas" will be 
the subject of Pastor Edward D. 
Freeman's sermon at the serv­
ice for the public worship of God 
on Sunday. April 2 at 11:00 a.m.

If you are new in Spearman or 
do not yeat have a church home. 

Duro Union Presbytery will you are invited and encouraged 
meet at Covenant Presbyterian to try the warm. Christian 
Church in Lubbock Friday and fellowship at the First Presby- 
Saturday. March 31 and April 1 terian Church. You will be glad 

Saturday. April 1 is both you didl 
School and City Elections.
Good Christians pray about 
candidates and issues and then 
go and vote their convictions.

There is a Sunday Church 
School class for you. regardless 
of age, every Sunday at 9:45 
a.m. with a friendly teacher 
with a well prepared, fascinat­
ing Bible study to help you 
understand your faith and its 
practical application to every 
day life.

Guests of the Sam Nitschke’s 
Wednesday and Thursday, will 
be their son, Mr. and Mrs. Bud 
Nitschke from Cambridge, 
Kansas.

Movable type was first en 
ployed around 1000 A.D. i 
China.

Southwestern Bek

HANSFORD COUNTY'S ENTERTAINMENT CENTER

LYRIC IHEAIRE

Roll Call was answered by 
"An Unusual Flower Contain­
er” by the following members, 
Mesdames: Verlin Beck, W. D. 
Berner. Fred Holt, Michael 
Holt, Nolan Holt, O. C. Holt, 
Doyle Jackson, W. C. Jackson, 
Randy Kirk, Richard Kirk, Rex 
McGoy, Ray Moore, Loyd Pool 
and Larry Porter.

The next meeting will be 
April 4 at the home of Mrs. Ray 
Moore.

Receipts at the 'fcxhoma Livestock Comm. C o .. Inc. this week were 5176 cattle  & calves. 
The market very active and higher on a ll classes with the exception of Packer cows. Steer 
calves $1.00 to $2.00 higher. Heifer mates $2.00 higher. Feeder steers steady to $1.00 
higher. Feeder heifers »1.00 to $2.00 higher. Packer cows steady selling mostly from 
$32.00 to $36.00. Bologna bulls $1.00 higher, $40.00 to $43.70.

Steer calves -  300# to 550# -  $57.00 to $67.70 
Heifer calves - 300# to 500# -  $50.00 to $55.20 
Feeder steers - 600# to 850# - $54.00 to $57.00 
Feeder heifers -  600# to 700# -  $48.00 to $49.90

For next Thurs,, March 30, we are expecting 4500 cattle of a ll classes. Plan to be with 
us every Thursday.

Remember, Saturday, April 1, the 34th Annual Sale of the Great Plains Hereford Asso­
ciation. 100 bulls, 40 females, and 20 club calves.

YOUR DEPENDABLE LIVESTOCK AUCTION
TEXHOMA LIVESTOCK COMMISSION C O ., INC.

P. O . BOX 70 TEXHOMA, O K U . 73949 
PHONE 406-423-7511 It 423-7612 

CATTLE DEPARTMENT - UOTD GOODNER & RAYMOND CHOATE 
GOODNER RESIDENT PHONE -  406-423-7427-------------------------------------------------------------

If He could do 
His number 
on the Red Sea... 
and bring the 
championship to  
the ’69 M ets... 
why should it 
be so hard to  
believe He's 
back again!

PHONE 659-2812

|  SPEARMAN INSULATION j
. . SERVICE I
I »8 now in operation "
f  IF YOl WANT THE BEST IN A 
A INSULATION CALL f
f Fred Mayfield 659-3342 or A
|  S.B. Sheets 659-3022 "

★  ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★
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A JERRY WEINTRAUB PRODUCTION 
GfMtGt BURNS- JOHN DINVER• OH. 000'

TERICARR • DONALD PlEASINCf
Based on ih. i, .„,i bv »vf RY C0RMAN • Screenplay by LARRV GELBART 

hlta!#lERRTWeiNTRAUB • 0,reeled b,
—  - --------------■—

marcn 29 mne a m u  4

ONE SHOW 
SUN.-M0N.-TUES. 
-WED.-THURS.- 

7:30 P JL

TWO SHOWS 
FRI.-SAT. 
7:00 P.M. 

A W  9:00 PJL

NEXT
ATTRACTION

m i r a t a »  m i x k a n a s

LA DUDA
SiNiAY matinee, 2 p.m., aprii 2, w»

O n e  o f  d ie

warriors
whoever
lived .

A M U  5 THRU APRIL I I

* * * * * * * * *  * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * *  *
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FCA Is Largest Organization At SHS
The Fellowship of Christian »"<1 'he sponsoring of a volley- some young people Christians." 

Athletes, more commonly called hall tournament. The light bulb The officers for this year are 
FCA, is the largest organization «1* •* now in progress. Jim Jones, president and Chris-
in Spearman High School. It The money raised will be ty Collier, secretary-treasurer, 
consists of 186 members. It is a used for FCA conference in the The committee members ate 
national organization composed summer. Scot Martin, Zane Newton,
both of Protestants and Roman Some comments about FCA Debbie Greene. Mark Franklin, 

from the coaches were: and Scott Sherwood.
"I think FCA helps us to Jim is the son of Mr. and 

become closer to the student Mrs. Hershel Jones. He was 
and the view point of young the class favorite his Freshman, 
people. It also helps us to share Sophomore, and Junior years, 
our feelings to the students," He is also in the National Honor 
said Coach Ralph Newton, head Society and is a Student Council

Marriage Enrichment 

Seminar Set

Catholics. FCA’ 
pose is to serve our Lord Jesus 
Christ and to witness to cfchers 
about our Lord. It also is a 
fellowship through which ordi­
nary people help each other 
become better people and bett-

THE SPEARMAN REPORTER, REEARMAN, TEXAS 79081

Church”of Christ.
Mark is the son of Mr. and 

Mrs. George Franklin. He is a 
member of the Lynx varsity 
football team. He also partici­
pates in basketball and track.
This year Mark is a Student The public is invited to a beginning at 7:30 p.m.
Council representative for the ««nage enrichment seminar at It is a well known fact that the 
Junior class. He is a member of Hut Christian Church in Spear- home and family are in trouble 
the First Baptist Church. * “  beginning on Monday, all over the world. Maybe we

Scott is the son of Mr. and April 3, and continuing through Christians should strengthen 
Mrs. Greg Sherwood. He w ; ‘™rsda\ April 6, with Herb our homes by understanding 
quarterback on the Lynx varsity J« e t, Hi-Plains Area minister each other better, really listen- 
football team. Scott is also on Wthe Christian Church (Disci- ing to one another and opening 
the varsity basketball and var- pies of Christ), conducting the doors to happier homes and

Mark your calendars now for 
this upcoming seminar.

The format will involve lec-

to raise the general insights of 
people (without sharing person

partners can do privately to gain 
greater satisfaction from their

er examples of what the Lord 8>rls' basketball coach.
in do in our lives.
The organization meets every

When asked how he l___
FCA, Coach George Franklin.

member. Jim is a member of 
the varsity football, varsity bas­
ketball. and varsity track teams. 

Wednesday morning before Assistant girls' basketball He was selected All District in 
school. coach, said. "FCA is a fine basketball and football this

Some of the money raising organization that helps young year. He is also a member of 
activities for this year are: the people spiritually. It also makes the First Baptist Church, 
concession stands at the basket- better Christians out of the Christy is the daughter of Mr. 
ball games, a light bulb sale, young people and it makes and Mrs. Robert Collier. Last

year she was the Class AA State 
typing champion. Christy is 
also a cheerleader and a mem­
ber of the varsity Lynxette 
squad. Her hobbies are cook­
ing. basketball, tennis, and 
reading. She is also a member 
of the First United Methodist 
Church.

Scot is the son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Ray Martin. He is a 
member of the National Honor 
Society and Student Council. 
Scot is also a member of the 
varsity basketball and varsity 
track teams. He is a split-end 
and a defensive half-back on the 
Lynx varsity football team. Scot 
is a member of the First United 
Methodist Church.

Zane is the son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Ralph Newton. He was an 
All-District back in football and 
Honorable Mention in basket­
ball his Sophomore and Junior 
year. This year he is a Student 
Council representative for the 
Junior class. Zane is a member 
of the First Baptist Church.

Debbie is the daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. James Greene.

Edwin Limbocker 

announces as 

candidate for 

city alderman for 

the upcoming election 

1 .

Your vote will 

be appreciated.

sity track teams. He's a 3 year 
member of FCA. He also 
participated in number sense 
last year. Scott is a member of 
the Church of Christ.

The members of FCA want to 
thank you for your support in 
our light-bulb sale.--If you have 
not bought from us, please 
contact one of our members-or 
call the high school. The funds 
will be used to send members to 
FCA camp this summer.

Hel p f u l  T i ps
You can save energy cool­

ing your house by using the 
same things that help you 
save when heating your 
house: storm windows. Kept 
on windows not needed for 
ventilation, they help keep

The Department of Energy 9
_______ ______  She has estimated that proper at-
received the track award and ‘¡c insulation can save up to 9  
was an All-District guard in 30 .P«™*."1 °.f h«»tin* an,d 1  
basketball her Freshman and ™ I  
Junior year She was also an inlufficiently 1
Honorable Mention forward in The same insulation reduces M  
basketball her sophomore year, the need for cooling by keep- m  
Debbie is a member of the ing out the sun’s heat.

Lotion 

SAIEI 4ox.

NAIL
POLISH REMOVER

4oz.
RIG. 69C

^  BABY OIL 
r\_  or LOTION

HERBAL
CONDITIONING I 

SHAMPOO
- r . 16ox.

MG. 1.85

ClAIKOl HERBAL ESSENCE

GUARANTEED
TtSMJ

WHITE HOT 
PAIN RELIEF 

RUB

MG. 2.75

HI-DRI _
PAPER  î â JTOWELS S S
Single-roll. $ 3 * 5

Comfort Top

KNEE-HI
NYLONS

3-pair pack 
REG. 2.00

¡ F  SUPER 
PLENAMINS

* * *  BALSAM 
CONDITIONER

Compere with WfUA

* * & ' GLYCERIN 
SUPPOSITORIES

v e x a / /  ASPIRIN 
TABLETS «4g

with daily sessions family life.

n otes fro m  F aith  Lu th e ran  C h u rch

profound moment in the life of a 
human being is the death of that person. That 
one moment changes the person totally. In that 
one moment all of our contact, interrelations, 
influence and touch with this world and with 
those who live in it ceases to exist.

We may try to ignore it or push it off, but we 
cannot escape it. Whether we realize it or not, 
death constantly threatens us. It threatens our 
security, our relationships, and our life, and it 
will eventually win out. Whatever we do not 

destroy on our own, death w

But the most profound moment in the history of 
man is the resurrection of Jesus. That one 
moment changed our fate totally. In that one 
event all the shallow peace, joy, love, and hope 
that we strive for in this world was exchanged for 
that which far exceeds our imagination and is 
truly out of this world.

We may try to ignore or deny what God has 
done in Jesus Christ. Indeed, we can refuse 
God’s love and blessings of h ope, joy, and peace, 
and we can continue to hold on to the peace, joy. 
love, and hope that we think can be found in this 
world. But whether we realize it or'not, God 
constantly stands beside us offering to us the 
blessings which Christ has won for us through 
His death and resurrection. For God has shown 
in Christ our Lord that He loves us and rules over 
everything, including sin and death. We cannot 
help ourselves. But God can and has.

Death need not be our end. It will continue to 
threaten all that we have in this world. But in 
Christ we have something which far exceeds our 
imagination. For he is the ruler of all. God 
Himself. Yet He loves us, gives us forgiveness, 
and makes us His children and the inheritors of 
His Kingdom.

If you are new in Spearman or have no church 
home we invite you to worship with us as we 
continue to celebrate the Easter victory. Sunday 
Morning Worship is at 9:30 followed by Sunday 
School at 10';30. At Faith we have a Sunday 
School class for everyone, from a nursery to an 
exciting adult class.

X&M FAST HOME s 
PERMANENTS d
Choose the 
formule that' 
right tor you!
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District THDA Spring Meet Set
The District I Tei*s Home 

Demonstration Association Spr­
ing Meeting will be held in 
Dalhart on Thursday, March 30. 
1978. at the Rita Blanca Coli­
seum. Co-hosting the annual 
events will be home demonstra­
tion club women from Dallam 
and Sherman counties.

Registration will start at 8:30 
a.m. and continue until 9:15 
a m The General Assembly 
will start at 9:30 a.m.

Presiding at the meeting will 
be Mrs. Jerry Barnett, District 
Director of THDA from Perry- 
ton. Mrs. Harold Preston, State 
President from Llano, Texas, 
will represent the State THDA 
Board. Dr. Jennie Kitching, 
Assistant Director for Home 
Economics, will bring greetings 
from the Texas Agricultural 
Extension Service. Mrs. Sue 
Farris, District Agent (home 
economics), will introduce the 
Extension agents for home ec­
onomics from the 19 counties in 
district 1.

Four educational workshops 
will be presented in the follow­
ing areas; Health, 4-H, Re­
creation and Family Life. 
Creative art and recycled items 
will be displayed in exhibits 
from each of the 19 counties.

This is Election Year. Dele­
gates will be electing a new 
director for District 1, and 
voting on endorsements of Mrs. 
Charles Warminski. who is 
running for state president and 
Mrs. Jerry Barnett, who is 
running for state treasurer.

Joanna Warminski, a 4-H'er 
from Carson County will be 
recognized as winner of the 
$500.00 Maggie W. Barry sch­
olarship. which is the number 
one THDA scholarship in 
Texas.

Special appointments for the 
THDA meeting are as follows 
Secretary. Mrs. Glen Lemons; 
Parliamentarian (immediate 
past director). Mrs. Ennis Clay­
ton; Welcome. Mrs. Roberta

"Oh. God!" A 
Fanciful Adventure 

In Humor and 
Humanit>

"Oh. Cod:." a celebration ol 
the marvelous ttunas that can 
happen to Everyman, is a fanciful 
adventure in Humor and humaims 
with a mischievous look at God. the 
Man in work clothes with a hi; 
cigar and a reasonably patient atti­
tude toward an errant mankind. He 
returns to Earth to prove He is alive 
and well, thanks, and to promote 
His original values through the 
reluctant auspices of a young super­
market employee.

It opened Wednesday, March 
29, at the Lyric Theater in 
Spearman.

"Oh. Cod!" is George Burns' 
first film since he won an Academy 
Award for his performance in his 
80th year in "The Sunshine Boys" 
in 1975. and it is John Denver's 
first film ever. It was produced by 
Jerry Weintraub. is a Warner Bros, 
release, and was directed by Carl 
Reiner, the soft-spoken wit of the 
'70s.

Having composed many popular

Rocky Mountains and people in 
general, and sung them to the world 
with a full heart. John Denver has 
become the golden boy of the sober 
seventies, a voice and talent and 
personality that a large part of 
America and much of the rest of 
the world finds irresistible.

A star of television specials, 
nightclubs and sold-out concerts, as 
well as a champion record-seller, 
John now shifts his focus to the 
wide wide screen. In "Oh. Cod!" he i 
plays the assistant manager of a 
Southern California supermarket, 
with a wifo, one kid with glasses, 
another with braces, and a nice 
house in a nice neighborhood 
When Cod appears to him in the 
gruff but amiable guise of George 
Burns, the serenity of Denver's 
suburban life govs havwirc.

Carl Reiner, the director of 
"Oh. God!" goes back to "Enter 
Laughing," the film and the book, 
to Sid Caesar's Show of Shows on 
TV, to many screen and television 
appearances and to Mel Brooks' 
recordings of 'The 2000-VearC)ld 
Man.” With a soft hand, a head 
bursting with imagination, and a 
compassionate, and frequently 
trenchant, sense of humor, Reiner 
is the perfect man to weld together 
the gifts and personalities of his

As for Jerry Weintraub, the

lucer of films and television shows.

The Lading lady in "Oh, Cod! " 
a Teri Carr, a Hollywood boro 
llonde who became a dancer before 
m actress, and has recently been 
irommcnllv on vi

Stanley; Response, Mrs. Char­
les Sheldon; Resolutions. Mrs. 
L. W. Barkley; Credential Re­
port. Mrs. Cecil Walker; Grace, 
Mrs. Porter Rogers; District 1 
4-H Fund, Mrs. Bill Hill; Invi­
tations. Mrs. Virginia Harvey; 
Courtesy Resolution, Mrs. Ber-

nard Byers; Benediction. Mrs. 
Ralph Rice; Committees App­
rove Minutes, Mrs Porter Rog­
e rs*  Mrs. Ralph Rice; Messen 
ger Subscriptions A Medall­
ions, Mrs. Spencer Matlock; 
Handbooks. Mrs. Ralph Rice; 
Insurance. Mrs. Jo Ann BecM-

E. Brisendive; Tellers, Mrs 
Delores Dean A Mrs. Chariev 
Sheldon; Registration. Dele 
gates • Vernon Gustin; Regis 
tration. Visitors - Belinda 
Goode; Registration. Agents 
Pearl Hermesmeyer.

The noon luncheon will be 
catered by K-Bob’s restauram 
in Dalhart. Reservations must 
be made by March 24 to Mis-

Susie Montgomery. County Ex­
tension Agent (home econo­
mics), Box 471, Dalhart. Texas
79022.

All home demonstration club 
women in District 1 are urged to
attend.

Pullman cars get the ir 
name from their designer, 
George Pullman.

4-H Parent-
in a continuing effort to 

strengthen and improve the 4-H 
and youth program in Hansford 
County, the Parent-Leader's 
Association has called a meet­
ing for Tuesday. April 4,1978 at 
7:30 p.m. in the Hospitality 
Room of the First State Bank. 
Spearman.

Parents and leaders will have

opportunity to discuss and es­
tablish guidelines for: election 
of 4-H Community Club Off­
icers. financial help for youth 
participation in special award 
trips, organization of teen lead­
ers, 4-H budget and expendi­
tures. 4-H Rally Days, and 4-H

vvrution,” and w 
evident in "Clow 
Third Kind.
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T T G & Y

r  A.
APRIL FOOLIN'

PRICES COOP THURSDAY. FRIDAY. SATURDAY

FACIAL QUALITY

BATHROOM
T ISSU E

IP0N
T.G.ftY.

BATHROOM 
TISSUE 

8 ROLL PKG.
2 PLY TISSUE

T  1 . 1 7
WITH COUPON

GOOD APRIL

COUPON
T.G.A Y .

BATHROOM
TISSUE 

4 ROLL PKG. 
2 PLY TISSUE

umit3. 6 5
WITH COUPON

GOOD APRIL 1ST ONLY.

T O  a. Y

BATHRO O M
T IS SU E

,  -  _ -  . . T G l Y  J iT_°_w!iY_-L._____ T G & Y . _
r^ iO U PO N  COUPON
H a »

T C i  Y

SO F T
ABSORBENT

TOWELS

V
I U lA fik  Ivasi

wash
16 OZ. AEROSOL

LIMIT 2
WITH 0 " 7  

COUPON it
GOOD APRIL 1ST ONLY.

P T O a V ____________,

COUPON
POSTER 
BOARD
22"x28" 

White-Double 
Faced

BOUNCES FABRIC SOFTNER 
20 SHEETS.

WITH
LIMIT 2 COUPON l 9  #

GOOD APRIL  1ST ONLY.

__________ T G i c i g _ _

s z ^ P 0 N

SHOE STORAGE BOX 
CLEAR W/GOLD B A  

WITH COUPON ( 9 0
GOOD APRIL  1ST ONLY.

■ T O l fc lY l____

JOBE’S® 
HOUSE PLANT 
SPIKES 
20 PER CARD

WITH COUPON
APRIL  1ST ONLY.

T G a Y _______ ________  __
COUPON COUPC

ULTRA BAN®
ROLL ON
ANTI-PERSPIRANT
1.5 OZ.
LIMIT 3 •78 “ ¡1

___ WITH COUPON
GOOD APRIL  1ST ONLY.

--------- T O k V _______

COUPON COUPON
T.Q.AY.

«T SUPER
[STAINLESS STEEL

RAZOR 
BLADES

10 TO A PKG.

T.G.&Y.
NON-DETERGENT

20 Wt. and 30 Wt. 
LIMIT 1 2  

WITH COUPON

"•n-detarf®1̂
MOTOR

° I L  I S i Y  GOOD APRIL 1ST ONLY. j

T.O.AY.
SOFT, ABSORBENT

PAPER 
TOWELS
120 SHEETS 

2 PLY TISSUE

2 n .  ! T.G.&Y. FACIAL TISSUE 
F O R .O f  ! 200 SHEETS, 2 PLY

WITH COUPON I WITH COUPON i V l  |

l im it

............  “  PON ”
POLY-FIL®
#1 BAG, 100%; 
POLYESTER 
LIMIT 3

WITH 
COUPON

J 1.00
GOOD APRIL  1ST ONLY.

.. T G a Y _____
COUPON

T.G.A Y.

AUTOMATIC
t r a n s m is s io n ;

FLUID

2 f o r 1 . 0 0 |
WITH COUPON

Limit GOOD APRIL  1 ST ONLY.

4  —  n n o i a j y i -

T.G.& Y. 
SAFETY 

[MATCHES

2 for1 bOO i23*
WITH COUPON I 5 0  BOOKS p e r  b o x

GOOD APRIL 1ST ONLY.GOOD APRIL 1ST ONLY.

---------- ____________________________ T t ì k t __________________________- j - .

COUPON

T.G.& Y. 
TWIN BLADE 
CARTRIDGES ;

9 TO A PKG. it
WITH COUPON a

OOOO APRIL  1ST ONLY. ____

l ^ g B - T i a g g ) ___________

J WITH COUPON . 9 3
I LIMIT GOOD APRIL 1ST ONLY.

PON

HOUSEHOLD
BROOM
LIMIT 2

1 . 7 7
WITH COUPON

— fvw-1 GOOD APRIL
T G & Y is t  o n l y , j

COUPON
LILT®

SPECIAL
PERMANENT

1 . 3 7
WITH COUPON

■jncCTgggg
PRICES 600D ONLY AT T.S.AY. FAMILYCENTER 

SPEARMAN tW.3741 521 W T . 207 SOUTH

DUPONT- CRAZY COMBj
9" COMB A SS ’T. COLORS

2  FOR . 7 8
WITH COUPON

GOOD APRIL  1ST ONLY.

J T X S i Z E _______

• In adaquat* supply In our at
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