
LUCKY KIDS -- The children finding the prize eggs for the live bunnies, 
donated by Dude Bailey at the Motley County Easter Egg Hunt Friday, were 
(front L to R) Lisa Jones, daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Jones, Dana Vinson, 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Roger Vinson and Charity Copeland, daughter of Rev. 
and Mrs. Danny Copeland. In back hold Dana's bunny is his mother, Doris 
and holding Charity's bunny is Jennifer Davis, daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Bob 
Davis. 

Photo by Leon Watson 

HUNTING EGGS -- Jessica Perkins, daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Jesse Perkins 
seems to be filling her Easter basket at the Motley County Easter Egg Hunt 
Friday in Matador City Park. 
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Lions Nominate Officers 
For Next Years Tenure 

I think everyone had 
a good time at the 
Easter egg hunt last 
Friday. The kids 
enjoyed playing with 
each other in the park, 
hunting eggs and 
getting all the goodies. 

The adults enjoyed 
visiting, taking pictures, 
and watching the kids 
race across the park to 
pick up eggs. 

But it is important 
that we teach our 
children the proper 
meaning of Easter. We 
should not tell them the 
Easter Bunny hid the 
eggs nor that the 
goodies came from a 
rabbit. 

Easter is a religious 
holiday and we should 
never overshadow the 
death, burial and 
resurrection of our 
Savior with eggs and 
bunnies. This is not the 
purpose of having the 
egg hunt each year. 

The true meaning of 
Easter should be taught 
to our children from the 
time they are old 
enough to understand, 
and that egg hunts 

Motley County High 
School girls placed 
second in the district 
track meet at Post on 
Tuesday, April 6. 
Meadow won district at 
the meet. 

The 400 meter relay 
team placed second 
with a time of 55:2. On 
the relay for MC were 
Kim Moore, Holly 
Hobbs, Derinda Cruse 
and Vivian Sims. 

Other results were 
100 Meter Hurdles, 3rd 
Renee Renfro, 19:5; 100 
Meter Dash, 3rd Vivian 
Sims, 13:7; 800 Meter 
Relay, 4th with a time of 
2:04. On this relay team 
is Holly Hobbs, Kim 

The Airport Golf 
Association will have a 
meeting at the Summit 
Savings and Loan, 
Friday, April 16 at 7:00 
o'clock p.m. to elect 
new officers and collect 
dues for the coming 
years. Dues are $15.00 
a year per person. 

Everyone, men and 
women, who are 
interested in becoming 
members, please 
attend this meeting. 

All former members 

* * * 

have no meaning at all, 
other than a time to get 
together. 

This is a Holy time of 
year, but our children 
should be taught the 
meaning of the 
resurrection year-
round. Let us be careful 
not to leave the 
impression on those 
young minds that we 
worship the Easter day 
or that it means only a 
time to look for eggs. 

The Motley County 
Junior High School Girls 
won First Place in the 
District Track Meet 
Tuesday, April 6 at Post. 

They scored 129 points 
to Meadow's 103 for 
second place. 

Results of the meet 
were 400 Meter Relay, 
1st, 56:2.9. On the relay 
team are Amy Miller, 
Selma Aguilar, Danielle 
Wittier and Tammy 

Moore, Renee Renfro 
and Darla Smith. 

In the 1600 Meter 
Run Derinda Cruse was 
4th with 6:40.79; 400 
Meter Dash, Deanna 
Durham, 4th with 71:07; 
1600 Meter Relay, 3rd, 
4:45. On this relay team 
are Deanna Durham, 
Darla Smith; Derinda 
Cruse and Renee 
London. 

In the Triple Jump, 
Vivian Sims was 1st with 
31'.6"; Holly Hobbs was 
2nd with 31' 11/2" and 
Renee Renfro was 4th 
with 30' 21/2". In the 
High Jump Vivian Sims 
was 2nd with 4' 10". 

Deanna Durham won 
first in the Shot Put,  with 

are welcome to join, or 
attend the meeting to 

A meeting will be 
held Thursday, April 15 
(tonight), at 8:00 p.m. in 
the school cafeteria to 
organize the summer 
baseball program. 

The program is open 
to all Motley County 
boys and girls in grades 
one through eight of the  

By Lila Meador' 
New officers to serve 

Matador Lions Club 
next year, were 
nominated at first 
Tuesday meeting of the 
club, April 6, at the 
United Methodist 
Church. 

Lion Alan Bingham, 

Brown. Amy Miller 
placed 4th in the 100 
Meter Hurdles with a 
time of 20:64. 

Tammy Brown was 
2nd in the 100 Meter 
Dash with a time of 
14.1. The 800 Meter 
Relay Team placed 1st 
with a time of 2:03.25. 
On this team are Amy 
Miller, Selma Aguilar, 
Danielle Wittier and 
Shawna Campbell. 

In the 200 Meter 

a throw of 28' 5" and 
Janice Brown was 2nd 
with a throw of 27' 71/2". 

In the Discus Janice 
Brown placed 3rd with 
a toss of 80' 51/4" and 
Renee London was 4th 
with 73' 4". 

In the Long Jump 
Vivian Sims was 6th with 
a jump of 14' 3/4". 

All first and second 
place winners in the 
District Meet will 
compete at the Reg-
ional Track Meet to be 
held in Levelland on 
April 23 and 24. 

Melee Taylor will go 
to Levelland as an 
alternate in the 400 
Meter Relay. 

help discuss the plans 
for the coming year. 

current school year. 
In an effort to 

continually improve the 
Motley County Youth 
Organization program, 
it is important that ALL 
PARENTS and VOLUN-
TEERS attend this 
organizational meet-
ing.  

president, welcomed 
the guests and reported 
on action by the 
directors at their 
Monday breakfast. He 
led the club in applause 
for Walter Jones, for 
the enjoyable meal. 

A program of music 
was given by Mrs. 

Dash, Tammy Brown 
placed 2nd with 29:42 
and Selma Aguilar was 
4th with 31:2. In the 
1600 Meter Relay, 
Shawna Campbell, 
Koree Campbell, Kim 
Phillips and Danielle 
Wittier placed 3rd with 
a time of 5:12.2$" 

In the High Jump Amy 
Miller was 6th with a 
jump of 4' 2". In the 
Triple Jump Danielle 
Wittier was 2nd with 28' 
33/4" and Tammy Brown 
was 3rd with 27' 41/4 ". 

Kim Phillips won first 
in the Shot Put with a 
throw of 27' 63/4" and 
Koree Campbell placed 
second with 26' 5". 

In the Discus Kim 
Hand was 2nd with 73' 
7" and Koree Campbell 
placed 4th with 58' 
81/2". Tammy Brown 
won 3rd in the Long 
Jump with 14' ,/2" and 
Danielle Wittier was 5th 
with 13' 5"  

Dannie Copeland, who 
sang several songs with 
recording accompani-
ment. Selections 
included "One Day at a 
Time," "Tell Them 
Again," "He was There 
All the Time," and 
several others. Mrs. 
Copeland was intro-
duced by Lion Billy 
Wason, program 
chairman. 

Other guests were 
Janet Jelen and 
Barbara Cook from the 
Social Security Office in 
Plainview, Doyce 
Middlebrook of Shelia-
water, Dr. Victor 
Chavez and Roy Hobbs. 

Lion John M. Russell, 
chairman of the 
nominating committee, 
presented the following 
slate of officers for 
election: President, 
Gerald Pipkin; 1st V-P, 
Lonnie Jackson; 2nd V-
P, Kirby Campbell; 3rd 
V-P, Travis Jameson; 
Secretary, Alan Bing-
ham; Tailtwister, Larry 
Hoyle; Recorder, Bill 
McCaghren; Sweet-
heart, Miss Rachel 
Patton; Lion Tamer, Bob 
Stanley. 

Miss Deanna Durham 
is Lions Queen, and 
directors are John M. 
Russell, Walter Jones, 
Vann Francis, John 
Stevens and Bill 
Durham. J. R. Whit-
worth will continue as 
permanent director of 
the club. He now resides 
in a nursing home in 
San Antonio. 

(Photo by Leon Watson) 

"The degree to which 
we value children is 
indicated when you 
look at the play areas 
we create for them," 
according to Joe Frost 
of the University of 
Texas at Arlington. 

The Motley County 
PTO believes in Dr. 
Frost's theory and has 
set as it's project for 
1982 - 1983 the 
updating of the existing 
school playground. 

Plans have been 
received from Texas 
Tech, and the play-
ground committee has 
met and formed one 
plan to be presented to 
the public at the 
meeting to be held next 
Monday night, April 19 
at 7:30 p.m. in the 
school cafeteria. 

The plan will be 
discussed and adopted 
at this time so that 
construction on new 
equipment can begin. 

********** 

Varsity Girls Track 
Places Second At Post 

Airport Golf Association 
To Meet Friday, Elect Officers 

Baseball Meeting 
Set For Tonight 

Junior High Girls Win 
District In Track Meet 

New Play Area Planned At School 



Colleen Rose and Don Baxter 

Couple Plans 
June Wedding 
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Many Visitors Here For Easter 

Mr. and Mrs. Doyle 
Rose announce the 
engagement and 
approaching marriage 
of their daughter, 
Colleen Denice, to Don 
Baxter, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Don Baxter of 
Afton. The wedding is 
planned for June 26 in 

GREEN THUMB 
workers in Crosby, 
Dickens, Floyd, Garza, 
Lubbock, and Motley 
counties met Monday, 
April 5 in Rails at the 
Rolls Senior Citizen's 
Center for their bi-
annual training meet-
ing. 

They learned of the 
changes affecting them 
in the social security 
system from Terry 
Richardson, Assistant 
Manager of the 
Lubbock social security 
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On Saturday, April 
10, twelve children and 
five adults attended the 
Children's Film Festival 
held in the Library film 
room. Featured were 
two films for preschool 
and elementary child-
ren, DUCKS and THE 
LEGEND OF JOHNNY 
APPLESEED. 

The library has 
recently received book 
donations from the 
following donors for 
which we are very 
grateful, Diane Barker 
of Lubbock and Renee 
and Sheryl Davis of 
Roaring Springs. 
Thanks! 

You can help you 
library: Save your 
empty detergent boxes 
to make magazine files 
(they can be covered 
with contact paper). 

Many homes enter-
tained visitors during 
the week-end Easter 
holiday. Among the 
visitors were Minister 
and Mrs. Norman 
Morrow and sons, John, 
Doug, David and Derek 
of St. Frances, Kansa , 
in the home of her 
parents, Mr. and Mr . 

Volunteer to help with 
the Summer Reading 
Program (theme: Space 
Capers). Do you have a 
little time to give? The 
library needs volunteers 
to paste pockets and 
lable checkout cards as 
well as typists to type 
catalog cards for 3000 
donated books. 

Remember the li-
brary is now open 
Tuesday 1-5 and 6-9, 
Wednesday 9-12 and 1-
5, Thursday 9-5, Friday 
9-5, and Saturday 9-1. 

Its services include 
interlibrary loan, films, 
filmstrips, books for all 
ages, reference ser-
vices, and will soon 
include microfilms. The 
microfilm reader is 
here! USE YOUR 
LIBRARY! 

John Irwin. 
In the home of Mr. 

and Mrs. J. D. Craven 
were their daughter 
and son, Mrs. Bill 
Harrison and Kyle of 
Brownfield, and their 
grandson, Scott Nichols 
of Floydada. 

Children of Mr. and 
Mrs. Roy Lipham, here 
for the week end were 
Mrs. Ervin (Wanda) 
Willard and son Zane, 
of Uvalde; Mr. and Mrs. 
Leroy Lipham and 
daughter Rhonda, and 
Mr. and Mrs. Wayne 
Lipham all of Asper-
mont; and Mrs. Bill 
(Nelda) Wagoner of 
Ozone. The family 
group attended ser-
vices Sunday morning 
at the First Baptist 
Church, and Miss 
Rhonda Lipham pro-
vided special music with 
a solo, "One Day at a 
Time." 

Mr. and Mrs. Gar-
land Rattan and sons, 
David and Chris of 
Boy's Ranch and Miss 
LeeAnn Gee of Canyon 
were week end guests 
of Mr. Rattan's parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Ward 
Rattan. 

Mr. and Mrs. Richard 
Lancaster and daugh-
ters, Leann and Christy 
of Breckenridge were 
visitors in the home of 
her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Cecil Shelton, and 
visited also with her 
sister and family, Mr. 
and Mrs. C. D. 
Garrison, who were 
hosts for a family dinner 
Sunday. 

Mrs. Buddy Allen of  

Pampa, accompanied 
by foster children, 
Debbie, Roger and 
Susan Browning were 
visitors during the week 
end with her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. R. C. 
Giesecke, and also in 

JESUS CHRIST, 
LIBERATOR, was the 
theme of the Easter 
program presented by 
Mrs. Glen Woodruff at 
the meeting of the 
United Methodist 
Women, Wednesday 
afternoon, April 7 in the 
church parlor. 

Mrs. John Hamilton, 
president, presided at a 
short business session 
and opened the 
program with prayer. A 
prelude to the program 
was a piano solo by 
Mrs. H. R. Jameson, "My 
Jesus I Love Thee." 

Mrs. Woodruff 
introduced the program 
by bringing out the fact 
that Jesus did not give 
up because of the cross. 
On the contrary, He 
thought nothing of the 
disgrace of dying on the 
cross, but the victory of 
being seated at the 
right side of God's 
throne. 	The group 
joined Mrs. Woodruff 
singing, "Victory In 
Jesus." 

When lighting a 
candle, Mrs. Woodruff  

Roaring Springs with 
Mr. Allen's mother, Mrs. 
C. W. Palmer. 

Visiting Mrs. L. L Lynn 
for Easter were her 
children, Mr. and Mrs. 
Lonnie Lynn, Connie 
and Michelle of 

said, "Jesus is the light 
of the world. He rose 
from death and lives. 
Jesus offers salvation to 
all." Standing behind a 
table of colorful 
wrapped packages, 
she placed each gift 
forward in turn so the 
words of the fruits of 
Spirit; Love, Joy, Peace, 
Patience, Kindness, 
Goodness, Faithfulness, 
Humility and Self 
Control, could be read 
by all. 

The poem, "The 
Hope of The World" 
was recited by Mrs. 
Jameson followed by 
everyone singing, 
"Because He Lives." 

Disciples, Matthew, 
Mark, Luke and John 
did not record in their 
passage of the Easter 
Story the same people 
or number of angels 
appearing at the tomb 
and on the road to 
Emmaus. These details 
are and will remain 
uncertain. 	However, 
there are some things 
about the Easter Story 
that are certain and 
Mesdames Bill Piakin, 

Mr. and Mrs. Glen-
dell Smith of Crowell, 
are the parents of a 
new baby daughter, 
Melody D'Nan, born 
April 3, at 9:25 p.m. in 
Wichita General 
Hospital. She weighed 
eight pounds, eight  

Childress; Mr. and Mrs. 
Larry Noland, Aaron 
and Jennifer of 
Floydada, and Mrs. B. 
L. Colwell and son, 
Lacy, of Paducah. 

....**** 

W. F. Jacobs, John M. 
Russell and Mike Hoyle 
told of "The Certainties 
Of Easter." The song, 
"Sweet, Sweet Spirit" 
was sung. 

In.  group discussion, 
events, quotations and 
scripture were related 
and recited as to how 
the fruits of the Spirit 
relates to your life with 
the family, church, 
community, nation and 
throughout the world. 
"Heaven Came Down" 
was sung in joyous 
unison. Mrs. Woodruff 
closed the program with 
the benediction, "An 
Easter Blessing." 

Following the pro-
gram, Mrs. Hamilton 
served refreshments of 
cookies and spiced tea 
to those mentioned and 
Mrs. Bill Mantooth of 
Girardear, Missouri, 
Mesdames L. L. Lynn, 
W. R. Tilson, Katherine 
Henderson, Everett 
Calk, Ethel Payne, 
Clarence Jenkins, 
Nelson McMahon, 
Frank Pohl, Olive 
Russell, Charles Keith 
and Nettie Brotherton. 

ounces and joins two 
brothers, Landon (13) 
and Derron 

Grandparents are 
Mrs. Paul Smith of 
Matador, Rod Clark of 
El Paso and Otha Smith 
of Paducah (great-
grandfather).  

Matador. Colleen will 
graduate from Motley 
County High School in 
May. Don is a graduate 
of East Afton High 
School. The couple will 
live in Matador where 
Don is employed by his 
grandfather, C. R. 
Davis. 

office. Visiting from 
Waco to discuss 
proposed changes in 
the program and other 
policy was Green 
Thumb Assistant State 
Director, John Willing-
ham. 

Wendy Brown, Area 
Supervisor for the 
Green Thumb program 
in thirteen south plains 
counties, was coordina-
tor for the session. She 
felt the workers were 
able to take some useful 

information home from 
the training meeting. 
"The future of the social 
security system and of 
employment programs 
for older persons has 
been of real interest to 
the Green Thumbers, 
since they will be the 
direct and immediate 
recepients of any 
changes in both of these 
areas," says Brown. 

Texas Farmer's Union 
Green Thumb, and 
equal opportunity 
employer, is an 
employment and 
placement program for 
rural residents age 55 
and older, who meet a 
low income guideline. 
Besides the counties 
already listed, the 
program operates in 
101 other counties in the 
state of Texas, in 44 
other states, and two 
territories of the United 
States. 

Local workers attend-
ing the Rails training 
session were Joan 
Patton and Lee Harris, 
both of Matador, Jim 
McCleskey, Author 
Sanders, Lester Hall, 
Ora M. Stonecipher, 
Ruff Melton and Rose 
Witcher, all of Roaring 
Springs. 

Do You Have Local News? 
Call 347-2400 

Matador Tribune 

United Methodist Women 
Have Easter Program 

New Arrival 

Write Checks, 

Eam Intere 

Green Thumbers 
Attend Confab 



Joe Meador 

Happy 
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Happy 26 

Donny 

Letters along with Polaroid pictures of their 
property are being sent to non-resident property 
owners of Matador. This letter is also being 
published in the Tribune so that everyone in the 
community will be aware of the work being done. 

Matador, Texa s 
April 13, 1982 

Dear Property Owner, 

• We are writing you this letter,  to inform you that a city wide 
clean-up campaign is under way in Matador. We are asking all property 
owners to clean up their property. If you receive the Matador Tribune 
you will have noticed that much work has been done thus far in our 
planning end workday schedule. Saturday, May 15th, is the first date 
set for a major clean up day. Everyone in our community is working 
together to make our city a more beautiful place to live. 

We are writing you this letter to inform you of the work to be 
done. As a property owner you will need to either clean your property 
or grant permission to this committee to have it done. Some owners 
will need to have only mowing done, while others with sub-standard 
housing, structures, equipment, junk cars, etc. will need to furnish a 
written statement of permission to this committee to clear lots of said 
items. At this point in time we will have equipment and man power avail-
able to clean your property with your written permission at no cost to 
you. This will also include the removal of any sub-standard housing and. 
would be to your benefit to take advantage of this free service. 

Plans are being made that all lots will be cleaned and we would 
appreciate your help and urge you to take advantage of this community 
clean-up now. If lots ere not cleared, action may be taken that property 
owners will have to clear lots at their own expense. 

Thanking you in advance for your cooperation in this matter and 
for allowing this committee to help you as a non-resident as well as 
our local citizens. We are looking forward to your response to this 
letter. Please mail your response to Matador Tribune, Matador, Texas 
79244. 

Thank you again, 

COMMUNITY PLANNING COMNITIEE 

Matador Tribune, Thursday, April 15 1982, Page 3 

Services Held 

For Joe Meador Attend Services 
Of Nephew 

Mrs. James Monk 
accompanied by Mr. 
and Mrs. Mickie Maupin 
of Turkey attended the 
funeral services of their 
nephew, Jackie Glen 
Maupin, 31, in Cana-
dian at 2:00 p.m., 
Tuesday, April 13. Mr. 
Maupin was killed in a 
one car accident nine 
miles north of Vega at 
2:00 a.m., Sunday. 

Family Reunion 
Easter Weekend 
The Starkey Family 

Reunion was held 
Easter weekend at the 
rural homes of Mr. and 
Mrs. C. W. Starkey and 
Mr. and Mrs. Jack 
Starkey. 	A cook-out 
luncheon was held 
Sunday followed by an 
Easter egg hunt in the 
foothills of the Caprock. 
They also enjoyed 
outdoor games and 
hunting rocks. 

Those attending the 
celebration were Mr. 
and Mrs. Royce Hanna 
and family of Wichita, 
Kansas; Bill Starkey of 
Farmington, N.M.; Mr. 
and Mrs. Homer Cypert 
and grandchildren, 
Monty George and Lisa 
of Lubbock; Mr. and 
Mrs. L. T. Starkey, Mr. 
and Mrs. Floyd Starkey 
and daughters and 
James Cypert and 
children of Rails; Mrs. 
Clifton Reid and 
children and Michael 
Starkey of Amarillo; Mr. 
and Mrs. Neal Moon, 
Mr. and Mrs. Gene 
Davis and sons, Mrs. 
Vickie Weber and 
children, Cindy Moon 
and Sarah of Fritch. 

Others attending 
were Mr. and Mrs. 
Floyd T. Starkey and 
sons of Floydada; Mr. 
and Mrs. Homer 
Starkey of Earth; Mr. 
and Mrs. Jess Starkey of 
Happy; Mr. and Mrs. 
Bill Weaver of Olton; 
Mr. and Mrs. Let 

McClain of Hart; Mr. 
and Mrs. James Moon 
and son of Dennison 
and Mr. and Mrs. 
Marvin Starkey, Mrs. 
Jackie Kendall and Mr. 
and Mrs. Travis Kendall 
and sons, local resi- 
dents. 

..****** 
Mr. and Mrs. Pete 

Clark visited in Jal, 
N.M. last weekend with 
Mr. and Mrs. Burl Clark 
and Burl, Jr., and Mr. 

New 
Arrival 

Mr. and Mrs. Jim 
Hudson of Palestine are 
proud to announce the 
arrival of a daughter, 
Cinda Lee, who was 
born Wednesday, April 
7 in Palestine Hospital. 

She weighed 8 lbs. 
and 1 oz. and was 221/4  
inches long. 

Grandparents are 
Dr. and Mrs. D. R. Scott 
of Shreveport, La., and 
Mr. and Mrs. E. L. 
Hudson of Palestine. 

Great-grandparents 
are Mrs. 0. B. Scott of 
Durant, Okla., and Mr. 
and Mrs. Bill McCagh-
ren of Matador.  

and Mrs.. Johnny Salzar 
and sons. 

Visiting during the 
weekend with Mr. and 
Mrs. L. E. Shorter were 
Mr. and Mrs. Richard 
Rhodes, Ricky and 
Russell of Amarillo, 
Louis Shorter of 
Lubbock, Salina Shorter 
of Matador and local 
residents who joined 
them for Easter 
luncheon, Mr. and Mrs. 
Clois Shorter, Kera, 
Cindy and Christi. 

Local 
News 

Mrs. Osie Smallwood 
visited in Odessa with 
her granddaughter 
and family, Mr. and 
Mrs. Jerry Smith and 
Penny. She returned 
home Thursday, April 8, 
following a weeks visit. 

Truitt Read returned 
home Thursday after 
spending a week in 
Lubbock General 
Hospital. He had 
developed blood 
poisoning after receiv-
ing a scratch on a 
barbed wire fence. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jeff 
Smart of Hereford 
visited Saturday in the 
home of his sister, Mrs. 
Tommy Edwards. 

Fun 
Night 
Planned 

The Patton Springs 
Young Homemakers will 
present FAMILY FUN 
NIGHT, Monday,. April 
19 at 7:30 p.m. 

The admission will be 
50 cents each or any 
donation. 

There will be games 
for the pre-school as 
well as the adults. 

It will be quarter 
night in the concession 
stand. 

The spectacular 
event will be the leg 
judging contest. Prize 
ribbons will be given for 
the winners of each 
event. 

All proceeds will go 
to the American Cancer 
Society. Please come 
and join in on the fun. 

In The 
Rough 

By Hazel 

CANCER BENEFIT 
TOURNAMENT SET 

Sunday, April 18, the 
annual Babe Zaharias 
tournament will be 
played. Tee-off at 1:15 
p.m. for scramble play. 
This tournament has 
been played since April 
23, 1967, sponsored by 
the ladies golf associa-
tion, and all money is 
donated to the Ameri-
can Cancer Society ... 
so, everybody come for 
an afternoon of fun and 
to benefit a most worthy 
cause. 

Fire At Dorsey Home 

The Matador Volun-
teer Fire Department 
responded to a fire at 
the rural home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Robin Dorsey, 
located northeast of 
Whiteflat early Monday 
morning. Mr. Darsey 
was burning trash in a 
barrel with a screen 
over the top when 
gusting winds caused 
the grass around the 
barrel to ignite in 
flames. 

Before the fire was 
brought under control, 
it burned a hog shed, 
fence, wooden gate 
and rattlesnake. It was 
fortunate the wind was 
from the west as the 
flames traveled in an 
easterly direction away 
from the barn and 
house and was extin-
guished at the edge of 
a field of rye. 

New Residents 
We welcome Mr. and 

Mrs. James Gwinn who 
bought the former 
home and land of Mr. 
and Mrs. Ronnie Cox, 
located northwest of 
Whiteflat. Mr. and 
Mrs. (Darla Cruse of 
Flomot) Gwinn, former-
ly lived in Matador and 
moved into their 
remodeled home last 
week. Mr. Gwinn is 
engaged in farming in 
the Whiteflat and 
Flomot area. 

******** 

Visiting in the home 
of Mr. and Mrs. Mark 
Hall last week were Mr. 
and Mrs. Wes Hall of 
Albuquerque, N.M., 
Mr. and Mrs. Glenn 
Dennison of Cortez, 
Colo., Julia Hall, Ida 
Moseley, Cheyleine 
Moseley, Edward Hall 
and Eyvonn Finney, all 
of Denver, Colo., Lena 
Jackson, Jimmy and 
Flora of Pampa, Theda 
McKee, Lois Wilson, 
and Lara Stewart, all of 
Seattle, Wash., Neil 
Hall of Tucson, Ariz., 
Mr. and Mrs. R. G. 
Morris of Petersburg, 
Bob Morris of Plainview, 
Mr. and Mrs. Jack 
Ingram of Dimmitt, and 
local residents, Mr. and 
Mrs. E. E. Markham and 
Larry, Mr. and Mrs. 
Rickey Green, and Mrs. 
Betty June Bearden. It 

Mr. and Mrs. Harvey 
Whitefield of Spear-
man visited Mr. and 
Mrs. Spencer Dixon, 
Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Dickie 
Garrison, Dowell and 
Dane joined family 
members in Matador, 
Sunday for an Easter 
luncheon in the home of 
his parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. C. D. Garrison. 
Other guests were Mr. 
and Mrs. Richard 
Lancaster, Lee Ann and 
Christy of Breckenridge, 
Mr. and Mrs. Cecil 
Shelton and Mr. and 
Mrs. Johnny Scott, Jody 
and Scotty of Matador. 

Weekend visitors of 
Mr. and Mrs. John 
Barton were Mr. and 
Mrs. Jerrell Patrick of 
Amarillo and visiting 
Sunday was Mrs. 
Maxine Shipley of 
Turkey. 

Agent 
To 
Speak 

Sylvia Quintero, 
Extension Agent-Home 
Economics will be in 
Matador on Tuesday, 
April 20 at the Catholic 
Church Hall at 1:00 
p.m. 

She will be speaking 
on pattern alterations 
and other topics. 

The public is invited 
to attend. 

had been 40 years since 
some of the families 
had seen each other. 

Return Home 
Mr. and Mrs. Lloyd 

Fulkerson returned to 
their home in Odessa 
Friday, after spending 
several days at their 
home here. Mr. 
Fulkerson entered 
Medical Center Hospit-
al in Odessa, Monday 
for surgery Tuesday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Mickey 
Brooks spent the 
weekend in Tahoka 
with her parents and 
sister, Mr. and Mrs. Pat 
Green and Traci. 

Rochelle Ellithorp, a 
student at Baylor 
University in Waco 
visited during the 
weekend with her 
grandparents, Mr. and.  
Mrs. Herman Ellithorp. 

Funeral services for 
Joe R. Meador, 79, of 
Paducah were conduct-
ed at 2 p.m. Tuesday in 
the First Baptist Church 
there. Rev. Martin 
Foster, pastor of the 
First Christian Church 
and Rev. Jerry Griffith, 
pastor of the First 
Baptist Church, offic-
iated. 

Burial was in Garden 
of Memories Cemetery 
under the direction of 
Seigler Funeral Home. 

Mr. Meador died 
Sunday, April 11, at 
8:30 a.m. in Richards 
Memorial Hospital, 
where he had been a 
patient the past month. 
He had been in failing 
health for several 
years. 	He was the 
brother of the late Ben 
Douglas Meador, 
longtime publisher of 
the Matador Tribune. 

He was born April 10, 
1903 in Texhoma, 
Okla., where his 
parents, Jennie Belle 
Quarton Meador and 
James E. Meador, 
pioneers of Motley 
County, had moved 
after leaving Matador 
and living for a short 
time in Moore County. 
The family later moved 
to Quanah, and in 
1910, to Cottle County. 

As a young man, 
Meador worked as a 
cowboy on the Matador 
Ranch, and on a dude 
ranch in New Mexico, 
later returning to 
Paducah. 	He was 
married to the former 
Lola Ray Grayum. 

For several years he 
was engaged in 
constructing tanks and 
dams on ranches and 
farms in this area, and 
also as a dirt and gravel 
contractor before going 
into ranching. He was a 
retired rancher and  

cattleman, and was a 
member of the Texas 
and Southwestern 
Cattle Raisers Associa-
tion. He had been in 
charge of the chuck-
wagon for the Cottle-
King Rodeo Association 
for the past 29 years. 
The association last 
year presented him with 
a plaque in apprecia-
tion for his longtime 
services. 

He was widely known 
for the entertaining 
stories which he told of 
ranchers and cowboys 
with whom he had 
worked. 

Survivors include his 
wife, Lola; a daughter, 
Freida Maxey of 
Paducah; a stepson, 
Jack Grayum of 
Dennison; three grand-
daughters and five 
great-grandsons. 

Serving as pallbear-
ers were Adrian Defoor, 
Scotty Grear, Bobby 

Motley County boys' 
track team edged New 
Deal by one p6int to win 
the Division I title at the 
Abernathy Invitational, 
Saturday, April 10 with 
80 team total points. 

Team members who 
returned home with one 
of the three top medals 
were MCHS seniors, 
Glen Calvert, Harvey 
Lee and Wesley 
Stafford and junior, Tim 
Shannon. 

Calvert won first 
place honors in the Shot 
Put, 55'-2 1/2 " and 
Discus, 152'-4". 
Shannon was awarded 
first in the Pole Vault 
event, 11'-0; second in  

Thompson, Rodney 
Rochelle, Larry Thomp-
son, Derr Johnston, 
Doug Yarbrough and 
Bruce Slover. 

Named Honorary 
Pallbearers were Elmer 
Petty, John Gaither, 
Buster Tippen, Jamie 
Cates, J. J. Gibson, 
Claud Flippin, Earl 

Long Jump, 19'-0 and 
third, High Jump, 5'-8". 
In the 200 meters event, 
Lee placed second, 
23.55 and third in the  

Bates, W. E. Smith, J. R. 
Gibbs, Marshall Hol-
comb, Taylor Martin, 
David Garcia, J. T. 
Westbrook, Irless 
Brooks, Roy Lehew, 
Afton Willingham, John 
Gilbreath, Charles 
Meskorik, Johnny Harris 
and Carl Darr. 

100 meters, 11.53. 
Stafford won a th;,J 
place bronze medal in 
the 110 meter hurdles 
with 15.72. 

Flomot News Whiteflat News 
By Earlyne Jameson 	 By Earlyne Jameson 

Local News 

Palace Theatre 

Phone 806/492-3000-- Paducah, Texas 

Friday, Saturday and Sunday 
7:30 p.m. 

9 Aeeleely Award Winning Pet e 

"REDS" 

Saturday Late Show -- 11:30 p.m. 
Also Monday Night, 7:30 p.m.  

"The Border" 

* * * * * * * 

Special Spanish Movies 
Every Sunday Afternoon 

3:00 p.m. and Thursday Night 
Beginning At 8:00 p.m. 

MCHS Tracksters Win 
Abernathy Invitational 



Senior Citizens News 
The Senior Citizens 

met April 1 for a 
covered dish luncheon 
which was followed by 
a business meeting. The 

meeting was called to 
order by president, 

Beth Henson. Mrs. Dye 
was absent because of 
sickness, as was several 
others. 

Osie Lee Brown, chair 
person for the nominat-
ing committee present-
ed the candidates for 
election for the new 

officers. Those being 

accepted were Mary 
Webb, president; Beth 
Henson, vice president; 
Odessa Mullins, 2nd 

vice president; Eva 
Mitchell, secretary-

treasurer; and Amy 

Mcllroy, program 
chairman. Osie Lee 
Brown was selected to 
represent the center for 
the Senior Citizen of the 
Year at the Senior 
Olympics at Lubbock in 

May. 
The ladies are 

quilting each Thursday 

afternoon and they 
invite anyone to come 
and quilt or visit. 

The ceramics classes 

are held each Monday 

afternoon. The Senior 
Citizens invited every-

one to come and join in 
on the fun. 

The blood pressure 
clinics are held each 
first and third Mondays 
at 9:15 a.m. Exercises 

are held every after-
noon. 

For information and 
referral call 348-3081. 

Public Interest Growing 

In Community Clean-up 

Mr. Farmer: 
Come To 

Caprock Gin 
Flomot 

THE MEI TWINS WILL APPEAR AT 

ROLLING PLAINS 
PRODUCTION CREDIT ASS'N. 

48th ANNUAL 
STOCKHOLDERS MEETING 

Mark These Dates 

r  	For Your 
Fertilizer 
Treflan 

Sveps - Chisels 
Bolts 

Anhydrous Ammonia 

Caprock Gin 
Donnie and Linda Turner 

Friday, April 23 
10 A.M. 

City Auditorium 
Childress, Texas 

Saturday, April 24 
10 A.M. 

High School Auditorium 
Stamford, Texas 

Entertainment will be provided by the Otwell Twins, who are 
regular performers on the Lawrence Welk Show. Roger and David 
are natives of Tulia, Texas and are former residents of Childress. 
Come on out and enjoy some good music and singing by these 
young talented artists. 

WEST TEXAS UTILTTIES COMPANY 

,411./V11 

This dependable energy 
saving Frigidaire Laundry Pair 

can handle big family-size loads — 
up to a full 18 pounds. 

See a Demonstration 
TODAY! 

Washer offers dependable 

cleaning power — even lets you 

conserve hot water and detergent 

• No need to waste hot water. This 
FrigJdaire Washer features a Water Level 
selector that lets you match the amount 
of water to the size of your washload. 

• Depend on Frigidaire to keep lint from 
settling bank on your clothes with 
the Lint Filter which snaps in and 
out for easy cleaning 

• New horizontal cleaning action 
passes clothes under the recirculating 
filter 8 to 14 times each cycle. 
The new system is equally effective 
for small. average or large loads. 

Dryer puts big drying 

capacity within easy reach 

• For easy loading and unloading the 
big oversize door opening — one of 
the largest In the Industry — is 
positioned a comfortable I 8 Inches 
off the floor. 

• For efficient drying without hot 
spots that can damage fabrics. 
Frigidaire gently pulls air through 
your clothes. 

• For big-family wash loads this 
Frigidaire dryer provides gentle 
fabric care for up to 18 pounds of 
laundry. 

Th_....  Qualified Factory-pained Servicemen Offer You The Finest In April nce Service 

Dr. David Hughes of 
Chicago, Ill., and his 

sister, Mrs. Gayla 
Lawson of Tyler, visited 
Mr. and Mrs. J. D. 
Mitchell last Tuesday 
after attending their 
grandmothers (Mrs. 

Hughes') funeral. They 
are the son and 
daughter of the late 
Mary (Thacker) McIver 
and grandchildren of 
the late Guy Thacker. 

J. D. Mitchell 
received news Saturday 
that his daughter-in-
law, Beverly Mitchell, 
wife of the late Frank 

Mitchell, had passed 

away in Newnan, Ga. 

Mr. and Mrs. J. D. 

Mitchell 	and 	Karen 

Davis attended funeral 
services in Crosbyton for 
Jason Tue, Monday  

afternoon. 

Recent visitors for 
several days in the 

home of Mrs. Lois Green 
were her daughter, 
Mrs. Jewell Lawrence of 
Lewisville and her son, 

Bert Green with his five-
year-old son, Jason of 
Seattle, Wash. 

Mrs. Print Rice and 
daughter-in-law, Mrs. 

Wayne Rice and four 
children of Plainview 
visited their sister-in-law 
and aunt, Mrs. Ora 

Stonecipher over the 
weekend. Mrs. Wayne 

Rice and children will 
soon join Mr. Rice in 
Louisiana where he is 
employed by a Seismo-
graph Company in-
volved in off-shore 

drilling for oil. 	The 
children enjoyed an  

Easter egg hunt around 
the Stonecipher home. 

In the "Easter 

Parade" at Floydada 
Nursing Home, Mrs. 
Jessie Freeman won first 
prize on her hat which 

was fashioned by Mrs. 
Dorothy Neff, former 

social director of the 
home. 

Mrs. Minnie Dye had 
Easter lunch with her 

daughter, Mrs. Rollie 
McNutt, Mr. McNutt, 
and children at their 
home in Patton Springs. 

Miss Lula Swim visited 
her brother and wife, 
Mr. and Mrs. S. A. Swim 

in Fort Worth joining 
their daughter, Miss 

Cindy Swim of Denver 
there for the weekend. 
The group joined 
relatives in Plano for the  

Easter Day festivities. 
Easter weekend 

guests of Mr. and Mrs. 
L. A. Mullins and Allie 
Lawrence were Bessie 
Saulcy, Mr. and Mrs. 
Lester Mullins and 

Eddy, and David 
Morrison, all of 
Hereford, Mr. and Mrs. 
Bobby Mullins and 
Dean of Plainview, Billie 
and Kelly Odell of 
Lubbock, Mr. and Mrs. 
John C. Ballerd and 
Tootsie of Snyder, Mr. 
and Mrs. Johnnie Lee 

Ballerd, Tommy and J. 
L. of Abilene and local 

resident, Bess Ferger-

son. 
Visiting Mr. and Mrs. 

Jim McCleskey during 
the Easter holidays 
were their sons and 

families, Mr. and Mrs. 
Nathan McCleskey, 

Clint and Brent of 
Petersburg. 	Nathan 
who is working in Dallas 

met them here. Also 

visiting were Mr. and 
Mrs. Elgie McCleskey, 
Wyman, Elwyn, Willie 
and James of Dumont. 

Visiting the Jim 
McCleskey's Saturday 

afternoon were Mr. and 
Mrs. James Smith of 
Matador, Mr. and Mrs. 
James Ray Smith of 
Johnson, Kansas, and 
Mr. and Mrs. George 
Miller, Amy, Charla and 
Toni of Garland. 

The children and 

grandchildren of Mrs. 
Rosetta Underwood 
gathered at the Senior 
Citizens Center in 
Roaring Springs, 
Sunday for lunch and 

an Easter egg hunt. 
Those attending from 
Matador were Mr. and 
Mrs. Tony Rose, Mr. and 
Mrs. Thomas Hurt, Mr. 

and Mrs. Tommy Hurt, 
Lee Hurt, Connie and 
Salina Shorter, J. D. 
Hurt, Mickey Hurt, Mr. 
and Mrs. Danny 

Perryman and Devin, 
Mr. and Mrs. John 

Christopher and Crys- 

tal, Charlie Marvel and 
Mrs. Sarah HoGland. 

Others attending 
were Mr. and Mrs. 

Buddy Grant, Randy 
and Cindy, Mr. and 
Mrs. Buddy Lee, Grant, 
Kandy and Eddy of 
Paducah, Mr .and Mrs. 
Bucky Marvel, Cris, 
Brady and Randy of 
Fort Sill, Okla., Mr. and 

Mrs. Kenneth Grant, 
Mark and Alan of 
Wichita Falls, Mr. and 
Mrs. Randy Grant and 
Johnny Grant of 
Vernon, Mr. and Mrs. 
Gary Cogwell, Teri, 
Brian and Deann of 

White Sands, N.M., 

Charles Grant of San 
Antonio, Mrs. Rosey 
Martin and Ricky of 

Hamlin, Paula, Julie 
and Doug of Snyder, 
Randy Meredith of 

Houston, and Karen 
Carson of Lubbock. 

Local residents 
present were Audrey 
Jones, Mr. and Mrs. Ken 
Marvel, Mr. and Mrs. Jo 
Glen Meredith, Cody 
and Yancy, Carla and 
Jeremy Jones and Mrs. 
Underwood. 

Services for E. M. 
"Pete" Timmons, 82, of 
Northfield were held at 

2 p.m. Tuesday, April 
13 in the Childress 
Church of Christ in 

Childress with Pat 
Abbananto, officiating. 

Burial was in North-
field Cemetery under 
the direction of 
Blackburn-Shaw Mem-
orial Chapel. 

Timmons died at 
11:30 p.m. Saturday, 
April 	1 1 	in 	the 
Northwest Texas 
Hospital in Amarillo. 

He was born in Wise 
County and lived in 
Northfield most of his 

Have you noticed any 

changes in the appear-

ance of our city? If not, 
then you should look 
around you. It seems a 
sense of community 
pride is growing. Our 
citizens are "Springing 
Anew!" 

life where he was a 
rancher. 	He was a 
member of the North-

field Church of Christ. 
Survivors include his 

wife, Fay of Northfield; 
four sons, Reece of 
Matador, Eddie of 
Amarillo, Don of 

Northfield and Wayne 
of Boise, Idaho; two 
daughters, Margie 
Cook of Northfield and 
Marie Cruse of Justine; 
two brothers, Walter of 
Northfield and Weldon 
of Cee Vee; two sisters, 
Lema Ware of Clovis, 
N.M. and Ethel Pople of 

Dodson; 16 grandchild-

ren, and six great-
grandchildren. 

From the downtown 

business area to the 
residential areas, 

people are involved 
with the community 
clean up. A lot has 

been done the first two 
weeks in April and the 

next two weeks should 
prove to show even 

more progress and 
improvement. 

Everyone is getting 
involved from our 
Future Citizens to our 
Senior Citizens. Plans 
include the Senior 

Citizens opening their 
center to the community 
on Saturday, May 15 
from 8:00 a.m. to 6:00 
p.m. as headquarters 
for the first major clean-

up date. Refreshments 
will be available to all 

who come out and work 
that day. Maps and 
work schedules will be 
on display at the center 
so everyone can be 
involved and a part of 
this campaign. 

As future citizens, the 
sophomore Home 
Ec. girls, under the 
direction of their 
teacher, Mrs. Syd 
Pipkin, have chosen to 
help improve the city 

park as part of their 

home experience 
project. 	The girls will 
trim trees, clean out 
flower beds, and paint 

all playground equip-
ment this Saturday, 
April 17. The paint is 
being donated by the 

Garden Club and El 
Progresso Study Club. 

Those girls working 
include, Beverly Witch-
er, Melba Mangram, 

Services for Mrs. John 
(Mona) Smith, 56, of 

Houston, sister-in-law of 
H. C. Smith of Roaring 

Springs, were conduct-
ed April 6, at Resthaven 

Chapel, Lubbock, 
followed by burial in 
Resthav en Cemetery. 

Mrs. Smith died April 
2 in M. D. Anderson 
Hospital following a 
lengthy illness. 

The former Mona 
Casey was born 
February 7, 1926 in 
Abilene and grew up in 
Lubbock. 	She was 
married April 9, 1949 to 
John William Smith of 

Roaring Springs, whom 
she met while both were 
attending Texas Tech. 
They lived in Germany, 
Japan and other  

Renee Renfro, Carla 

Christian, Deann 
Phillips, Vivian Sims, 

Holly Hobbs and Melea 
Taylor. 

Tenative plans are 
for Friday afternoon, 

May 14th that high 
school students, with 

parents approval, who 
wish to help with the 

clean-up campaign 
work together to free 
vacant lots of debris so 
that tractors and 
shredders may be used 
Saturday, May 15. 

Details and work 
schedules are now in 
progress. 

Anyone who has 

tractors, trailers, pick-
ups, trucks, and 
shredders that will be 
available this date 
should contact Jerry 
Cummins, County 
Agents office, 347-2733 

as soon as possible so 
that work schedules can 
be completed. 

Letters, along with 
polaroid snap shots of 
their property have 

been sent to non-

resident citizens. This 

letter is also being 
published in the Tribune 
so that everyone in the 
community will be 
aware of what work is 
being done. 

This is an opportunity 
for everyone to be 
involved in one way or 

another. Through the 
combined efforts of all 
citizens of Matador and 
non-resident citizens 
this campaign "will 
work." Will you be a 
part? 

foreign countries where 
Mr. Smith's work as an 

executive for General 
Electric took them. They 
moved to Houston 

about three years ago 
from Cincinnati, Ohio. 

She is survived by her 
husband; a daughter, 
Candace and a son, 

Eric, all of Houston. 

Mr. and Mrs. Don 
Smith and children, 
Julie and Chad of 
Houston accompanied 
her uncle and cousins to 

Lubbock where they 
were joined by her 

parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
H. C. Smith, for the 
funeral. The group 
then spent last week in 
Roaring Springs with 
the latter. 

E.M. (Pete) Timmons 

Services Are Held 

Recent Rites Held 

For Sister-In-Law 
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By Ace Reid 

"Shore I stole them cattle sheriff, but with Interest beln' the 
way It Is, how In the heck could I afford to buy 'em?" 

Card Of Thanks.  
1 	

This Feature Sponsored By 

First State Bank 

DOYCE 
MIDDLEBROOK 

DEMOCRAT 

State 

Representative 

District 84 
* * * 

thww,  Miehildwunk is n 39..nr-old fifth aencration former end 

lifeinne resident of LnIshork Cts and Di.. 84. He has bomb. 
and 	interests in le. Co. und Heel"... Co. os .11 

na Ivoldmck Co. 

He graduated from Texas Tech with a BA in Government. 

Doyce and wife Paula are natives of Shollowater as are thew 
children Randy. 20. and Patti, 14. After attending West Texas 
State University at Canyon. Randy is now engaged in farming 
and fattening feeder calves. Patti is a freshman at Shallowater 
High School and active in the National HortorS ociety, track and 

fine arts. 

Alifamily members are active in theShallowater United Metho-
dist Church where Doyce and Paula have been Sunday School 
teachers for youth and adult darter. Dosce also has served as 
Layleader. Youth Leader, Finance Chairman, and is presently 
Crusade Chairman for the Retired Ministers Pension Fund. 

Doyce also: Has served as Board President of Shadowater Co-
Op Gin for thepast 14 years ond as BoardMember for 17years: is 
a director of the First Stale Bank of Shallowaten Board Vice 
President and Executive Committee Member of Plains Callon 
Co-Op Assn.; Board Member of American Cotton Growers since 
its formation for five gin districts; Member of Plains Cotton 
Growers, Inc; Member of the Grain Sorghum Producers Assn.; 
Member of the American Quarter Horse Assn.; .d serves at 

A kernel. Director of Cotton Incorporated. 

He is interested in conservation and development of water, sod 
and other natural resources in the states has represented PCCA 
and ACG in Washington, DC affairs dealing with regulations 
affecting cotton marketing: and raises and trains registered.. 
ter horses for competition and pleasure. 

* * * 
Middlebrook For District 84 

For constipation 
you'll call it 

"The Overnight Wonder" 
Ever feel uncomfortable with your laxative? 

Then it's time you tried the gentle medicine they 
call "The Overnight Wonder." 

It's today's Ex-Lax" and it relieves the discom-
forts of constipation by helping restore the body's 
own natural rhythm. Try it tonight. You'll like the 
way you feel in the morning! 

Chocolated or pills, Ex-Lax is "The Overnight 
Wonder." 
Take only as directed 

CONSOLIDATED REPORT OF CONDITION 
(Including Domestic Subsidiaries) 

LEGAL TITLE OF BANK 

The First State Bank of Matador 

rOUNTY 

Motley 

 

STATE 

Texas 
ZIP CODE 

79244 

   

CITY 

Matador 

STATE BANK NO. jFEDERAL RESERVE 01ST. NO. 	CLOSE OF BUSINESS DATE 

219 11 March 31,1982 

ASSETS 	 WEN Thou. _ 
1. Cash and due from banks 	 MINN  
2. Due from other depositories and all C859 hers in the process of collection 	  1111111111111011 
3. U.S. Treasury securities 	 =MIMI 

4. Obligations of other U.S. Government agencies and corporations 	
EMI 5. Obligations of States and political subdivisions in the United States 	 = 

 

6. All other securities 	  11111111111111NO 
7. Federal funds sold and securities purchased under agreements to resell 	 00 

8. Total loans (including overdrafts totaling SA All 	) (From Schedule A, Item 8) 	  
9. Lease financing receivables 	  

10. Bank premises, furniture and fixtures, and other assets representing bank premises 	  
11. Real estate owned other than bank premises 	  
12. Letters of credit and customers' liability on acceptances outstanding 
13. All other assets 	  
14. TOTAL ASSETS (sum of items 1 thru 131 	  

LIABILITIES 

15. Demand deposits of individuals, partnerships, and corporations 	  
16. Time and savings deposits of individuals, partnerships, and corporations 	 
17. Deposits of United States Government 	  
18. Deposits of States and political subdivisions in the United States 	  
19. Due to banks 	  
20. All other deposits 	  
21. Certified and officers' checks 	  
22. Total Deposits (sum of items 15 thru 21) 	  

a, Total demand deposits 	  
b. Total time and savings deposits 	  

23. Federal funds purchased and securities sold under agreements to repurchase 
24 Interest-bearing demand notes issued to the U.S. Treasury and 

other liabilities for borrowed money 	  
25. Mortgage indebtedness for which the bank is directly liable 	  
26. Unearned discount on loans 	  
27. Letters of credit and acceptances.  outstanding 	  
28. All other liabilities 	  
29. TOTAL LIABILITIES (excluding subordinated notes and debentures) (sum of items 22 thru 28) 	  
30. Subordinated notes and debentures 	  
31. Allowance for possible loan and investment losses 	  

EQUITY CAPITAL _ 	. 
32. Common stock (No. of shares outstanding .2.000  
33. Certified surplus 	  
34. Undivided profits 	  
35. Uncertified surplus, reserve for contingencies, and other capital reserves 	  
36. TOTAL EQUITY CAPITAL (sum of items 32 thru 35) 	  
37. TOTAL LIABILITIES AND EQUITY CAPITAL (sum of items 29. 30, 31 and 36) 	  

  

7 445 

 

7 266  
179 	 

-d- 

  

  

    

   

0- 

  

-0- 

   

117 
-0- 

   

    

    

 

7 564 

   

-0- 

   

11 

    

   

200 
200 
941 
-0- 

   

   

   

   

   

341 

   

916 

916 

NOTE: This report must be signed by an authorized officer and attested by not less than three directors other than the officer signing the report 

I. the undersigned officer, do hereby declare that this Report of Condition (including the supporting schedules) has been prepared In conformance with Me in. 
structions and is true to the best of my knowledge and belief. 

DATE SIGNED 

NAME ANO ITLE OF OFFICER AUTHORIZED TO SIGN REPORT 	We the undersigned directors, attest the correctness of this Report of Con- 
dition (including the supporting schedules) and declare that it has been ex- 

Roy G. Hobbs 	 arnined by us and to the best of our knowledge and belief has been pre. 
Cashier 	 pared In conformance with the instructions and is true and correct. 

SIGNA RE OF DIRECTOR 

 

SIGNATURE OF DIRECTOR SIGNATURE OF DIRECTOR 

     

     

       

(MAKE MARK FOR 
NOTARY'S SEAL) 

State of 	 Texas 	 County of 	Motle 

	

Sworn to and subscribed before rn 	day of 
My commission expires 	 ' 	 19 

   

 

9- 
--  Notary Public. 

 

  

SIGNATURE Of-Of FICER AUTHORIZED 	SIGN REPORT 

2  

AREA CODE/TELEPHONE NO. 

806-347-2661 

' 'pit 'W / 
MOWERS SCISSORS TOOLS PINES CUTTERS CHISELS Hot 

O. P. Pete) C ark 
Rt. 1, Box 45 

Flomot, TX 79234 
Phone 806-469-5268 

COMPLETE SHARPENING SERVICE 

D & D Auto Repair 
We Repair All Makes Cars and Pickups 

Located in Tony Rose Shop 
Telephone 347-2330 

Dave London and Doug Block 

A Special Thanks 
On behalf of all the children who 

enjoyed the 4th Annual Motley 
County Easter Egg Hunt Friday, 

thanks is extended to everyone 

who helped in any way. 

Thank you to the businesses 

and individuals who donated, 

money to purchase eggs and 

prizes, and to the persons who 

donated eggs. Also Thanks to 

Dude Bailey for donating the 

three live bunnies for the grand 

prize in each division. Also thank 

you to the ones who helped hide 

the eggs. 
Without your support and help 

this Easter Egg Hunt would not be 

possible. 

Paschal Plumbing 

For All Your Plumbing Needs 

Call Day or Night 
Home Phone 347-2261 

Matador, Texas 

YOUR NEAREST 

H&R Block 
Office Is At 106 W. Missouri 

Floydada, Texas 	Call 983--5233 

THE INCOME TAX PEOPLE 

IAll 	Risk Federal 
Crop Insurance 

Lee's Insurance 
Orville and Ruth Lee 

Flomot, Texas 79234 	806/469-5370 

r ".0.6^,e,..~..0.0..efh,th,ei,e7,e,'..1,0,e7,9,0,  

1 	
Available For 

§ Income Tax Reports 
iOpal Pipkin 

Tax Practitioner 

Telephone 347-2747 	Home 347-2316 

O'KerwawisSwielnwifiganaelnelaiaCtawsereetraer..egwerwaswein 

Beefmaster Bulls 
Certified -- $600 Up 

Stuart Dixon 
Drawer E -- Matador, TX 79244 

Phone 806/469-5347 
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CARD OF THANKS 
Thank you for your many 

kindnesses during my recent 
stay in the hospital. To all those 
who brought food, sent flowers 
and cards, called with words of 
concern and offers of help, and 
for the many prayers on my 
behalf. Also a special thanks to 
Roy Tiepin for his help. 

Thank You. Friends are 
invaluable at a time like this. 

Sincerely, 
Truitt Read and Family 

CARD OF THANKS 
I would like to thank each of 

you who showed such love and 
concern during my surgery and 
since returning home. 

The prayers. cards, visits, 
calls, food and flowers were 
each appreciated so much and 
will always be remembered. 

Joanie Stephens 

CARD OF THANKS 
We wish to thank the Senior 

Citizens for having representa-
tives from the Community 
Planning and Improvement 
Committee as guests at the 
April meeting. 

Your support and coopera-
tion are certainly appreciated 
and we are all looking forward 
to working with you in the 
future to make Matador a 
prettier and better place to 
live. 

MEETING ANNOUNCED 
Germania Farm Mutual Aid 

Association Local Chapter 
285 will meet April 18, 1982. 
2:30 p.m. at Lee's Insurance, 
Romot, Texas. 

PubMbed in Matador Tribune 
April 15. 1982. p1t 

Political 
Calendar 
County Judge 

Billy Joe Whitaker 
(re-election) 

John M. Russell 

1 
County Treasurer 

Wilna. Hobbs 

(re-election) 

District & County 
Clerk 

Lucretia Campbell 
(re-election) 

Commissioner 
Precinct Two 

Bill D. Washington 

Commissioner 
Precinct Four 

Billy Hand 

Fraiser Watson 

Justice Df The 
Peace 

Precinct One 
Roy Smith 

Texas Senate 
30th District 

Ray Farabee 

Small Engine 

REPAIR WORK 

and 

Lawn Mowers 

Also 3 Engines 
Available For Sale 

Elmer Hipp 
348-3581 

GERMANIA FARM Mutual 
Aid Association. Reasonable 
sound Property Insurance. If 
you want to sve, Contact Mrs. 
Orville Lee. Flomot 806-469-
5370. 

25-ptfn 

CANCER INSURANCE:Call 
Mrs. Orville Lee, Flomot. 
806/469-5370.. 

25-ptfn 

FOR SALE: Good used color 
TV Sets. Some with new 
picture tubes and new 
guarantees. Thacker Supply 
Company, Roaring Springs. 

3-ctfn 

NEW LOCKNEY MEAT CO. 
USDA Inspected. Kill Days, 
Monday through Friday. 
Custom Processing. Whole-
sale and Retail Meat. One half 
and quarters, cut, wrapped, 
frozen and fully guaranteed. 
Located on corner of U.S. 70 
and FM 378 South, 652-3305. 
Sam and Kelly Fortenberry. 

28-ctfn 

NEW Carpet Cleaning 
Machine now available for rent 
at Bob Stanley Pharmacy. 
56 	 37-tfn  

FOR SALE: Pat Green 
Home. Three bedroom, two 
baths, whirlpool in one Built in 
appliances. Central heating and 
cooling. Fireplace. Call 347-
2636. 
72 	 2-ctfn 

N OW AVAILABLE At 
Matador Motor Ai Imp). 
Professional windshield 
installers are at Matador 
Motor & Implement every two 
weeks. Guaranteed not to leak. 
Call 347-2422. 

11-ctfn 

NEW Ceramics Class 
Starting Monday, March 29 
from 2--6 p.m. at Senior 
Citizens Center in Roaring 
Springs. 

SOS 
Representativi 

for 

MONUMENTS 

AND 

CURBING 

Seigler 

Funeral Home 

Phone 347-2626'  

FRESH HOME MADE 
Baked Goods Saturday, April 
17, American Legion Building. 9 
am. -- 12 noon. 

15-p1 t-15 

TAMALES FOR SALE 
Sunday, April 18 from 11:00 to 
4:00 on Roaring Springs Hwy. 
70 nest to Foy Moore home. 
Phone 347-2818. 

• 15-p1t-15 

FOR SALE: Four old oak 
chairs. Call after 4 p.m. week 
days. 347-2252. 
11 	 15-c1t-15 
ALL KINDS of bedding 
plants now available. Toma-
toes, peppers, all other kinds of 
bedding plants. Also basket and 
pot plants. Matador Nursery, 
North side of Matador. Your 
business is appreciated. 
12 	 15-c3t-17 

FOR SALE: Beautiful old 
two story home across the 
street from First Baptist 
Church. Call Frank Fisher, 
915 755 9245 collect or 
contact Luther Green, 
Matador. 
13 	 15-00 n 

NICE HOUSE FOR SALE --
Three bedroom, two bath.  
Rock. On Main Street near 
school. Call 347-2790. 
14 	 15-ctfn 

FOR SALE 1973 Buick 
Station Wagon. Air, Power 
Seats, Windows, etc. Call 806-
689-2226. 

15-pt-16 

PORCH SALE: Thursday 
and Friday. Mrs. W. L Holt 
15 	 15-c1t-15 

-Truth is rarely pure and 
never simple." Oscar Wilde 

To Report Local News 
Call The Tribune 

347-2400 

Future Figure 
Studio 

Special offer on Body Wrap in the Studio 

The Total 
Future Figure System 

Choose any "one" or all "four" programs. 
It is up to you what you need to get into shape. 

ik Bee Trim Cellulite weight and inch loss kit 
* Bee Trim weight loss Protein Cocktail 
* Creme de Contour with Herbs and Aloe Vera 

Body Wrap to break down cellulite 
*Future Figure Impulse Machine to retain tone 

and tighten muscles and aid blood circulation 
as you lose weight 

For more information and a FREE figure 
analysis visit Future Figure Studio at 

1101 Burleson 	Box 112 	Matador, Texas 

 

Call For Appointment 806/347-2294 
..ese4te•Snkfa.e.ankahke2,0,9,,,nnf.ancee.,,teeoneen.ereeseeo.). 

Open For Business 

Tommy's Garage 
North Main Street 

Matador, Texas 
Your Business Is Appreciated 

Tommy Hurt 



WHITE OR GOLD 

Safe- 2 $100 

Guard
BATH 
SIZE 

35. OFF LABEL FABRIC 

Bounce $299 
Softener IN 

CALIFORNIA SUNKIST 
NAVEL 

Oranges 

LB. 310 
WASHINGTON GOLDEN 

ApplesDELICIOUS2 
 

LBS. 

CALIFORNIA CRISP 

Carrots CELLO  3 

LARGE TIE GREEN 

Onions 	2 FOR 29c  
U.S. NO.1 RUSSET 

Potatoes 	5 LB. 79c 
BAG 

1 00 

1LB,S100  
PKGS. 
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GROCERY SPECIALS 
DEL MONTE Mt KERNEL 

Gold Corn 
DEL MONTE 

Spinach 
BATHROOM TISSUE 

White Cibud 

DEL MONTE NAT. JUICE SYRUP 
CRUSH CHUNK SLICED DEL MONTE SLICED/HALVES 

ling 16 OZ. 
CAN 

YELLOW 
SLICE 

Peaches 
D REACH f — 

CEREAL 

Rice Chex 
MAXWELL HOUSE ALL GRINDS Del Monte 

1 LB. 
CAN 

MASTER BLEND ALL GRINDS Sweet 
HORMEL HAM/ 

CHICKEN OR TURKEY 3 
DEL MONTE EARLY GARDEN 

17 OZ. 
CAN Peas 

6%OZ. CAN 

Tender Chunk 
DEL MONTE PINEAPPLE 

DEL MONTE CUT/FRENCH 
De fl on e 

CUT GREEN BEA  Green  
Beans 70 

STYLE 

16 OZ. 
CAN 

Pickles 

SELECT SLICED YOUNG 

Beef Liver 

CLAUSSEN'S CHILLED DILL 

Franks 
SHURFRESH 

MEAT SPECIALS 

QT. 
JAR 

12 OZ. PACKAGE 

950 

WRIGHT'S WRIGHT'S HICKORY 
SMOKED SLICED SLAB 

n 
29 

Baco
$  

U.S.D.A. GRADE 'A' CERTIFIED 
FINEST QUALITY COUNTRY PRIDE 

U.S.D.A. GRADE 'A° CERTIFIED FINEST 
QUALITY COUNTRY PRIDE FRYERS 

CUT-UP PAN READY 

Fryers 
SPLIT FRYER 

Breasts 
FRESH FRYER 

Thighs  
FRESH FRYER 

Drumsticks 

Fryers 

LB. 

2 Liter Bottle -- $1.09 

DAIRY & FROZEN FOODS 

SHURFRESH, SOLID 

Margarine 

ONE POUND 

3 FOR $1 .00 

Kraft 	$ 149 
Cheese P 

00Z. 
KG. 

PILLSBURY CRESCENT 

Dinner Rolls 
BRIGHT 'N EARLY ORANGE 3 

BREAKFAST 	6 OZ. Beverage CANS 

LIQUID 

Clorox 	
C Bleach JiGAL. 

 

$169 

	

40132. 	49 
BOX 

	

QT. 	29  
BTL. 

22 OZ. 99c 
BTL.  

GIANT 59c 

Coca Cola 6-32 OZ. BTL CRTN $2.1 
PLUS DEPOSIT 

CHEDDAR/COLBY HALFMOON 

89c  
CANA 

$100 

LIQUID TILE 

Tilex 
Cleaner 1ff- 

ALL FABRIC BLEACH 

Clorox II 
THE DRAIN OPENER 

Liquid Plumr 
LIQUID CLEANER 

Formula 409 
AJAX POWDERED 6' OFF LABEL 

Cleanser 

PRICE FIGHTER SAVINGS 

WHITE/ASSTD. FACIAL 

Kleenex 
nssue B 

020 
OX. 
CT 

 

HEALTH ft BEAUTY AIDS 

20 CT. $ 
119 

BOX 	 NEW 
the price fighter 

JERGEN'S REG./EX. STRENGTH 

Lotion 

6 OZ. $119 

BTL. 

 	 BAND-AID 
BAP AD Brand TRICOT MESH 

BAND-AID 
	Brand FLEXIBLE FABRIC BANDAID 

$119 
20 CT. 

	 BOX 	 NEW! 

Billy's 
Grocery 

reaps WE ACCEPT FOOD STAMPS 
WE ACCEPT MANUFACTURER'S COUPONS 

MEMBER STORE ilrrsfiRrINE8 

PRICES EFFECTIVE THURS., FRI., SAT. 
WE RESERVE THE RIGHT TO LIMIT QUANTITIES 
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