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The Jenny slippers will 
have a regular quarterly 
meeting on Tuesday at 7:30 
p.m. in the warehouse 
building at Five Area Tel­
ephone. All members are 
urged to attend this 
meeting.

*****
The Bailey County Farm 

Bureau will be holding 
their Board of Directors’ 
meeting on Thursday even­
ing at 8:30 p.m., April 7, 
1983 in the Bailey County 
Farm Bureau office. Any 
members are welcome to 
attend this meeting.

*****
Airman Leslie E. Lynk, 

daughter of Joan P. Mc­
Clure of 8909 E. Harbor­
age, Tucson, Ariz., and 
Clive R. Lynk of 406 Chi­
cago, Muleshoe, Texas, has 
completed Air Force basic 
training at Lackland Air 
Force Base, Texas. During 
the six weeks at Lackland, 
the airman studied the Air 
Force mission, organization 
and customs and received 
credits towards an associate 
degree in applied science 
through the Community 
College of the Air Force. 

,The airman will now re­
ceive specialized instruction 
in the intelligence field at 
Fort George G. Meade, 
Md. She is a 1980 graduate 
of Sahuaro High School, 
Tucson.

*****
A lot of effort has been 

made to see that this 
year’s Spring Program for 
Cont. Page 8, Col. 1

Hempe Services 
Held Saturday

Services for Don Rempe, 
54 were held at 2 p.m. on 
Saturday, April 2 in the 
Immaculate Conception 
Catholic Church under the 
direction of Father Pat 
.Maher, Pastor and Father 
Tim Schwertner of Level- 
land. Interment was in the 
Bailey County Memorial 
Park under the direction of 
Ellis Funeral Home.

Rempe was a partner in 
the Dent-Rempe business 
until his retirement in Feb­
ruary, 1983 and was active 
in civic and community af­
fairs. He was a member of 
the Immaculate Conception 
Catholic Church, the Mule­
shoe Rotary Club and the 
Muleshoe Chamber of 
Commerce. He died on 
Friday, April 1.

The Plainvilte, Kansas 
native was born June 29, 
Cont. Page 8, Col. 5
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Eel the Heavens be glad. and lot 
the earth rejoice; and let men 
m \  among the nations.
The Lord reigneth:
/  Chronicles 16:31 £

Easier joy is everywhere. Lei us share with friends
and family the unique blessings of lhis season of rebirth 
and renewal.

May the message of this holy Easier fill your hearts 

and uplift your spirits with gladness and hope. Rejoice.

Buy Excess Grains
★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★

Varsity Mules Win 
Bovina Track Meet

Program To Bolster 
P1K Needs

Muleshoe's varsity boys 
track team traveled to 
Bovina on March 31 for the 
sole purpose of bringing 
back the first place trophy • 
which they did. Thurman 
Coleman ran the 100 meter 
in 10:82 and the 200 meter 
in 22.88, moving him into 
the all-time top ten list for 
Muleshoe and earning him 
a name jersey for this 
award. Coleman was great­
ly aided by the wind. Also 
in the pole vault event, 
Ricky Rasco vaulted a per­
sonal best of 11’6” , im­
proving over the 10*6’ ’ he 
had previously. This jump 
also put Rasco in the top 
ten list. According to Coach 
Kevin Wiseman this was 
one of the best track 
meets, bringing together a 
combination of the varsity 
and junior varsity athletes. 
Muleshoe won with 151 
total points.

In other events on Sat­
urday, the 400 meter relay 
team placed first with team 
members Kirvin, Shaw, 
Flowers and Coleman run­
ning a time of .46.0. Ip the 
3200 meter run, Tony Luna 
placed first with a time of 
10:597 and Tony Rojas 
placed second with 
11:18.43. Luna also placed 
sixth in the 800 meter run 
with 2:18.97.

In the 100 meter dash, 
Thurman Coleman placed 
second with 11:02 and 
Chris Kirvin placed fifth

with 11:36. Coleman placed 
first in the 200 meter dash 
with a time of 22.88.

Eddie Alvarado, Michael 
Del Toro and Smiley Oro­
zco placed third, fourth and 
fifth respectively in the 400 
meter dash with times of 
54.77, 55.82 and 56.45.

In the 300 Intermediate 
hurdles, Mark Moton 
placed first with a time of 
42:87. Aldo Almanza placed 
first in the 1600 meter run 
with 4:47.63, Martin Men­
doza placed second with 
4:51.3. In the 1600 meter 
relay, the team placed se­
cond with a total time of 
3:36.52. Team members in­
clude Orozco, Perez, Del 
Toro and Neman. In the 
pole vault. Raul Garcia 
placed fourth with 11’6” 
and Ricky Rasco placed 
fifth with H ’6’\

Chris Kirvin placed third 
in the high jump with 6 
foot even and Mark Moton 
placed fifth with 5’8” . In 
the Long Jump, Moton 
placed second with 20’5”

Cont. Page 8, Col. 6

Bailey County Executive 
Director of the ASCS office 
released information late 
Friday regarding the need 
of the USDA’s acquiring of 
additional loan collateral for 
the P1K program.

Williams stated that his 
information included the 
fact that a "heavy signup 
in the PIK Program had 
made it necessary for

Commodity Credit Corpora­
tion to either acquire add­
itional grain from producers 
or to exercise the prev­
iously announced option to 
require producers to obtain 
loans on 1983 commodities 
to satisfy PIK contracts.

Reports indicate that the 
CCC will offer to purchase 
corn, wheat and sorghum 
from producers who have 
outstanding regular or re­
serve loans with the CCC 
in excess of their PIK 
needs. Eligible producers 
are only those producers 
with outstanding regular or 
reserve loans in excess of 
PIK needs. The purchasing 
of these commodities will 
be handled through a bid­
ding process with the 
County Offices. Corn,

District Court Set 
To Begin Monday

Jury trials have been set 
for 287th District Court of 
Bailey Coanty with jurors 
scheduled to report on 
Monday, April 11 at 1:30

Commissioners To Meet 
In Special Session

Underground WaterShows 
Change Of Depths

DON REMPE

The High Plains Under­
ground Water Conservation 
District has completed its 
annual program of measur­
ing depth-to-water levels in 
the 71 wells in Bailey 
County. These wells are 
part of a larger network of 
more than 950 observation 
wells scattered throughout 
the District’s 15-county 
service area.

Don McReynolds was 
able to complete all 
measurements of "static” 
water levels in observation 
wells and tag them with 
the District’s identification 
sticker for owner in­
formation.

"Several irrigators stop­
ped me in the field to ask 
about declines and what 
their water was doing,” 
said Don. "W e have initial 
results for each of the 15 
counties, but tabulated data 
on the entire observation

network readings is not ex­
pected to be complete until 
mid-year.”

Bailey County’s 1982- 
1983 depth-to-water table 
below surface minimum 
reading was at 25.91 feet, 
and the maximum level 
read was at 176.03 feet. 
This year’s average change 
in depths-to-water in the 
county was -0.79 of a foot, 
which compares with a 
1981-1982 county reading of 
-1.18 feet. Comparing the 
rate of change calculated

this year for these wells 
shows a minimum decline 
change of +5.58 feet and a 
maximum decline change of 
-4.04 feet.

The Water District keeps 
a record of annual decline 
and rate of change going 
back to 1962. The data is 
used for making projections 
of decline rates, for det­
ermining the amount of 
water left in storage, and 
as a basis for the income 
tax depletion allowance 
claims on landowner’s tax 
returns.

Farmers Reminded 
Of Final Sign-Ups

Wildlife Refuge To Hire 
Ten Youth Corpsmen

Muleshoe National Wild­
life Refuge will be spon- 
sering a Youth Conserva­
tion Corps. Camp from 
June 6 through July 29, 
1983. Young people 15 
through 18 years of age are 
eligible to apply for the ten 
positions which will be 
available in this program. 
Applications are available 
from area high schools, 
Texas Employment Comm­
ission and Muleshoe Nat­
ional Wildlife Refuge. A 
random drawing for the ten 
positions will be made at 
4:00 p.m. on Friday April 
15 from all applications re­

ceived by 4:30 p.m. Thur­
sday April 4. The drawing 
will be open to the public 
and all applicants are en­
couraged to attend. Enrol- 
lees will receive $3.35 per 
hour for eight hours per 
day, five days a week, for 
eight weeks.

The program is open to 
males and females of all 
social, economic, racial, 
and ethnic backgrounds, 
regardless of work exper­
ience or skills. However, 
any applicant must meet 
the following requirements: 
Be 15 through 18 years old;
Cont. Page 8, Col. 4

Bailey County's ASCS 
office will be a beehive of 
activity in the next few 
days and weeks with the 
beginning of sign-ups for 
aerial measurements and 
for the new or additional 
cost sharing program funds 
being offered to Bailey 
County producers, Both 
sign-ups begin on April 4.

April 8 is the final sign­
up date for the additionally 
allocated $44,000 which is 
tagged for the underground 
pipe cost sharing program. 
As before, ASCS Executive 
Director, Rusty Williamson 
encourages any farmer in­
terested in getting his 
underground pipe in shape 
to get signed into this pro­
gram. Williamson stated, 
"If we don’t use these 
funds now, the word is that 
this type program will not 
be offered to Bailey County 
again."

Measurement service 
sign ups will also begin on 
April 4 and according to

Williamson, ground rates 
will be charged on all be­
ginning applications and 
refunds will be given foll­
owing the performance of 
services.

Those producers who 
wished to enter in the 1982 
reserve or regular commo­
dity loan for wheat should 
have signed in by March 
31, 1983; however May 31, 
1983 is the final sign-up 
date for com, grain sor­
ghum or cotton.

Producers in Bailey 
County need to remember 
that final certification dates 
are just around the comer. 
For fall-seeded small grains 
the final certification date 
is May 16; for spring seed­
ed crops, the final date of 
certification is July IS, 
1983. Wheat which is des­
ignated as conservation use 
acreage (CUA) must be 
designated as such by May 
16.

Cont. Page 8, Col. 4

The Bailey County Com­
missioner’s Court will meet 
in a special session in the 
Courthouse on Monday 
April 4, beginning at 10 
a.m. and continuing until 
all business is concluded. 
Several items are scheduled 
on the agenda.

The Court will meet with 
Virgie Perry and with Ray 
Lynk; they will also take 
into consideration repairs 
on a typewriter for the'’ 
County Extension office.

The Commissioners will 
consider a resolution for

Annual Spring
Program
Planned

Parents of students in­
volved in the Chapter 1 
Programs at the Muleshoe 
Elementary and Junior 
High Schools are in for a 
very special treat at the 
Annual Spring Program for 
Parents on Thursday even­
ing, April 7, 1983 at 7:00 
p.m. in the Muleshoe High 
School Cafeteria according 
to those planning the 
program.

Roy Anzaldua will be the 
Master of Ceremonies for 
an evening of games and 
parents and students will 
have a chance to win some 
very nice prizes which in­
clude, games, books, puz­
zles and educational toys. 
There is no charge to any­
one for playing the games 
and everyone will have a 
chance of going home a 
winner.

Six members will be 
elected to serve on the 
Chapter 1 Parent Advisory 
Council and the following 
nominations have been re­
ceived Manuel Fabela, 

.Juana Fabela, Johnny Cis­
neros, Maria Cisneros and 
Ramon Sanchez.

Refreshments will he
Cont. Page 8, Col. 6

the taxation of motor veh­
icles for 1983; hear the 
county treasurer’s report 
and consider acquiring a 
painting machine.

A request by the Bailey 
County Child Welfare 
Board, asking for the use 
of the Coliseum will be on 
the Monday agenda also.

Commissioners will con­
sider a water line easement 
along a county road and 
will consider bids for 
painting the county fire 
truck. Also up for consid­
eration is the division of 
the Wildlife Refuge contri­
bution and the seal coating 
•of county roads.

The court will consider a 
request from the Northwest 
Texas Hospital for payment 
of indigent medical care 
and payment of routine 
county bills will be taken 
care of along with other 
miscellaneous items.
• ■

p.m.
Jury settings for this 

date include the following 
cases: B. Gene Hamilton 
Vs. Gloria T. Perez; Shirley 
Servis vs. Muleshoe An­
tenna Company, Inc.; Eq- 
uico Lessors, Inc. vs. D.B. 
Ivy and Judy Van Dyck 
Morin vs. Joseph Paul Van 
Dyck, Individually, and as 
Independent Executor of 
the Estate of B.H. Dyck, 
and Barbara Van Dyck 
Mills. These cases will be 
called and tried in the or­
der listed beginning at 10 
a.m. on April 11.

A list of 100 jurors have 
been called for these trials 
and they include: Gladys 
Ballard Myers, Elias Noe 
Anzaldua, Treena Bryant 
Matthews, Tina Lea Mc­
Daniel, Nora Reyes, Roby 
Darren Kelton, Carroll Ray 
Precure, Terry Lynn Mc- 
Camish, Maldean Masten 
Mrs., Mollie Cox Degge, 
Eufemio Y. Rodriquez.

Delfina Lopez Martinez, 
Dorthy McMahan Mick, 
Terry R. Pollard, Albert 
Garcia, Robert Lee Odle, 
Isaac Newton Wilcox, C.J. 
Feagley, J.D. Smith, Will­
iam Eugene Meyers, Don-
Cont. Page 8, Col. 3

wheat or sorghum that is 
needed to satisfy a prod­
ucer’s PIK needs or quan­
tities that have been des­
ignated to satisfy other 
producer’s PIK needs are 
considered ineligible for 
this new program.

Letters to producers in 
the Bailey County area are 
being mailed now, inform­
ing them of the new pro­
gram in which the sign-up 
begins on April 4. The 
sign-up period will run un­
til close of business on 
April 15, with a public 
opening if needed on April 
16 at 9 a.m.

Williamson explained 
♦hat a signup in the new 
program could result in a 
producer getting his note 
paid off, getting a percent­
age of his commodity back 
free and clear while help­
ing fulfill the outstanding 
PIK contracts. One contract 
per loan is allowed.

The delivery of the pur­
chased commodity will be 
handled the same as loan 
forfeitures or deliveries of 
loan grain, except that a 
producer may retain a por­
tion of the offered quantity 
for feed or marketing. The 
quantity that may be re­
tained will be determined 
by the percent bid.

All offers bidding a “ 0 ” 
percent will be accepted. In 
a case like this, the full 
offered quantity must be 
delivered to the CCC.

Offers made by a pro­
ducer in the bid method 
may not be withdrawn or 
amended after they have 
been filed. Offers must also 
be submitted to the County 
ASCS office where the loan 
was obtained. Liquidated
Cont. Page 8, Col. 1

Mule Day 
Festival 
Meet Set

Using the positive theme, 
"W e Can - If We Try” Jeff 
Smith and Larry Winkler, 
co-founders of the Mule 
Day Festival scheduled this 
year for August 13, have 
scheduled a general meet­
ing Tuesday night.

Scheduled for 7:30 p.m. 
at the Muleshoe State Bank 
community room, a large 
number of clubs, officials 
and organizations have 
been invited.’All interested 
individuals are encouraged 
to attend the meeting.

Smith and Winkler will 
bring the group up to date 
on the annual event, and 
will be soliciting volunteers 
Cont. Pane 8. Col. 5

U1L REGIONAL SCIENCE FAIR WINNERS-Several Muleshoe Junior High students 
traveled recently to the Regional Science Fair competition, bringing back a number of 
ribbons with them for their efforts. From left (bottom) Ester Acosta. Becky Vela. Dcaun 
Crozier, Shane Burris, Michael Duncan, Dusty Rhodes and Chris Young. Second row: Mist: 
Brewer, Angela Kidd, Van Gregory. Dalyin Bratcher, Donnie Nowlin. Ed Chance and 
Shawn Nciman. Third: Torey Cox, Scottie Spies, Jennifer Green, Sue Haire and Julie 
Crittenden. Fourth: David Sanders, Debbie Brown, Lisa Noble. Sergio Gonzales and Diane 
Eros.
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Girlstown, USA, A Unique Living Experience

THEY’RE RIGHT THERE TO GREET YOU, AT GIRLSTOWN, U.S.A.-Several of the 60 plus girls who reside at
Girlstown, U.S.A. near Whiteface were caught by the camera at the entrace to Girlstown. The girls were found to be 
friendly and helpful to visitors on-campus during a visit there last week by Jeff Smith, Lonnie Adrian and Cleta 
Williams. The group was in Girlstown to help set up the annual Mule Day Festival, with the proceeds scheduled to go 
to Girlstown. (Bailey County Journal Photo)

Outstanding Citizens Honored At Chamber Banquet
Dr. Dan Kamp, Pars and 

Recreational Director of the 
City of Lubbock and a 
former Sudan resident was

Sudanites bestowed tri­
butes Saturday night on 
Outstanding Citizens during 
the Second Annual Cham­
ber of Commerce Banquet. 
They also recognized mem­
bers of the Hornette State 
Champions and their coach, 
Jim Kirkland.

"Community Participa­
tion In Action" was the 
theme for the banquet and 
many local businesses 
made displays depicting 
their work or business with 
miniature replicas of their 
shops, or places of busi­
ness. Rainbows, floral ar­
rangements and displays 
decorated the hall.

Tom Rigsby was Master 
of Ceremony and Pudd 
Wiseman made the presen­
tation of Awards to the 
Outstanding Citizens and 

»Hoyt Robertson made the 
presentation to the person 
having lived the longest 
continuously in Sudan: 
Lendle McCarty who has 
lived here since 1919 ex­
cept for the time served in 
the armed forces. The 
newest residents as of 
March 1983 were Mr. and
Mrs. Jim Fields who re­
cently moved back to 
Sudan from Crosbyton.

Special tributes were 
paid to Sara Woods, “ Out­
standing Woman of the 
Year,” who was commend­
ed for her outstanding ser­
vice to the community. 
She’s a member of the 4th 
of July Celebration Commi­
ttee, Pioneer Independence 
Day Committee: has served 
and is serving on many 
Chamber of Commerce 
Committees: (including
decorating committee for 
the banquet); active in Ex- 
Student-Teacher Home­
coming activities; active in 
Booster Club, Senior Citi­
zens and a member of the 
First Baptist Church. It was 
said of her "She does 
many things, small insigni­
ficant, but yet useful to her 
friends and neighbors and 
community, always serves 
on any committee when 
asked and is on the Hotel 
Restoration Committee.

The James Withrow 
family was named "Farm 
Family of the Year". This 
family, James and his wife.

bette, came 25 years ago 
and took a sandy old John­
son grass farm and made it 
into a very productive farm 
today ALMOST free of 
Johnson grass.

Betty drives a tractor 
from time to time and the 
three girls, Martha, Ruth 
and Marie have run module 
builders as well as move 
pipelines and hoe. They 
also have caused some 
"near accidents” by chop­
ping cotton near their home 
on Hiway 84 in the hot 
summertime. Marie, who is 
a senior this year is a 
member of the State 
Champion Hornette team. 
James has served as the 
school board for the past 
15 years and served as 
President for the past 8 
years. He has also served 
the Co-op Gin Board; FHA 
County Board; County Tax 
Appraisal Board; A.S.C.S. 
Committee and is an elder 
in the local Church of 
Christ.

‘‘Man of the Year” 
award went to Orville Hill 
who has devoted many 
hours of his time and ef­
forts to helping our comm­
unity live a little safer; 
through the fire department 
of which he has served for 
years and is presently ser­
ving as Fire Chief; he 
serves as an EMS; ECA; 
and is a 4-H Adult leader 
and member of the Fiist 
Baptist Church and has 
done many good Samaritan 
aids.

rtCitizen Through the 
Years” Award went to 
Marvin Tollett who. has 
been a member of Sudan 
community for over 30 
years. He has served as 
president of Rotary Club, 
Sudan City Council, Pres­
ident of Chamber of 
Commerce and Agriculture; 
active in Fall Festival work 
and was instrumental in 
purchasing the last Christ­
mas lights for the city. He 
was active in Boy Scout 
work in keeping it alive. 
He is presently active in 
Lions Club; president of 
Senior Citizens group; 
member of the Chamber of 
Commerce, Heritage Com­
mittee, 4th of July Cele­
bration Committee; Booster 
Club and is active in his
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church, the First United 
Methodist Church where he 
sings in the choir. He has
contributed much to our 
community for many years 
and hasn’t let up yet.

Jay Livingston Lamb 
bounty Deputy, was recog­
nized and given tribute for 
his willing and uncompl­
aining service to Sudan day 
or night.

speaker of the evening. He 
said, along with a little 
humor, there are three 
things needed for purpose 
of life. Challenge, Recogni­
tion and Contribution. His 
speech was "Freedom & 
5ndividuality.”

A GIRLSTOWN CLASSROOM-Amy, seated, looked
through a book with Jeff Smith as an onlooker during a 
trip to Girlstown, U.S.A. last Friday. Several girls attend 
the alternate school on campus at Girlstown.

(Bailey County Journal Photo)

Take a large measure of 
love, liberally sprinkle in 
care, stir well with disci­
pline, mix in quality edu­
cation, fill with caring, 
concerned adults, and when 
all is completed -  you find 
Girlstown, U.S.A.

Located south of White- 
face, in Cochran County, 
Girlstown, U.S.A. is a un­
ique living experience for 
more than 60 girls. They 
live, love and leave Girls­
town knowing they have 
had the best care, the most 
loving care possible to 
have.

Mr. and Mrs. Marshall 
Cooper moved to Girlstown 
just over 19 years ago 
where he became manager 
of the financially troubled 
organization which was try­
ing to exist without gov­
ernment funding.

Girlstown still exists to­
day without government 
funding. With 76 percent of 
the funding for Girlstown 
coming from contributions 
and public support, the 
remainder is provided by 
fees, farm income and in­
come from securities. 
Girlstown has grown, and 
Copper and his wife say 
new funding must be 
found.

The Coopers said they 
are most grateful for all the 
support Girlstown has re­
ceived from clubs, organ­
izations and individuals 
since it first started in 
1949. A $10 contribution 
looks large to them, as the 
Coopers said Girlstown op­
erates “ in the black” only 
three months out of the 
year. For the other nine 
months, it is a hit and miss 
proposition, with any and 
all money, food and cloth­
ing, as well as furniture, 
books, “just anything,” 
said the Coopers, “ We 
manage to find a use for 
almost anything that is 
given to us.”

A major contributor to 
Girlstown is the District* 
2T2, Lions Club, which in­
cludes Muleshoe.

Mrs. Cooper said it costs 
approximately $800 per 
month to house one girl at 
Girlstown -  but, it costs
approximately $2000 to 
house one girl in a gov­
ernment-funded institution.

If you have not visited 
Girlstown •• and watched
the entire thing in action -  
you have missed a most
unique experience. Driving 
in, it looks like a small
college campus, with a 
gymnasium, a classroom 
for an alternate school on 
campus. There is an office 
housing the case worker for 
Girlstown, and an admini­
stration office. There is a 
combination dining/kitchen 
/chapel, which also can be 
converted to a theatre for 
movies and a host of other 
activities. There’s a swim-
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ming pool, a fire station 
with a new fire truck (since 
the devastating fire that 
destroyed one cottage last 
year) and the cottages 
where the 60 plus girls 
make their homes.

The cottages are cons­
tructed of brick, and in 
each cottage are house 
parents (man and wife) and 
one single female house- 
parent. The girls are 
housed three to a room, a 
large, airy room, and are 
responsible for keeping 
their own room.

Most of the kitchen dut­
ies ate by the girls, al­
though the girls from the 
“ honor cottage” are ex­
empt from kitchen duty. 
The honor cottage is for 
girls who excel! in deport­
ment, have adapted the 
best to Girlstown living, 
are academically high, and 
better adjusted.

The alternate classroom 
on the Girlstown campus is 
for newly-arrived girls, so 
they can adjust before go­
ing to public schools at 
Whiteface, for girls who 
have failed to adjust to the 
school at Whiteface, and 
for girls with other disci­
plinary problems. The 
teacher in the school, 
Renee Houchins, is a 
Texas-certified teacher, and 
is paid by the state to 
teach at Girlstown.

The cottages have a kit­
chen and dining room, as 
well as a living room with 
television and each has a 
basement-playroom, which 
also doubles as a storm 
shelter.

At this time, ages of the 
girls at Girlstown range 
from 11-17, although one 
graduate of Girlstown is 
currently still residing there 
while attending college. 
The youngest girl has en­
tered Girlstown at the age 
of six-months, having been 
placed there by the court.

Girlstown operates under 
very stringent government 
rules even though it is not 
government funded. Ins­
pectors are very strict and 
the entire structure must 
conform in order to con­
tinue to be licensed.

In March, 1949, Girls­
town, U.S.A. was founded 
by Amelia Anthony at

Buffalo Gap, Texas. In July 
of that same year, Tom 
Duggan, a Lubbock attorn­
ey donated 1425 acres of 
land near Whiteface to 
Mrs. Anthony and her 
girls. Since that time, 
Girlstown has expanded to 
four campuses, Whiteface, 
Borger, Lubbock and 
Austin.

Cooper said the ongoing 
philosophy of Girlstown, 
U.S.A. is that love, security 
and Christian values should 
be offered in a home en­
vironment to girls in need. 
Also, added Cooper, in re­
cent years, Girlstown has 
begun providing special 
help for pre-delinquent, 
delinquent, troubled, and 
disturbed children.

Records indicate that 
most of the referrals to 
Girlstown, U.S.A. are made 
by juvenile courts, child 
guidance clinics, other 
child care institutions and 
local private professionals. 
Cooper said, "Girlstown 
accepts girls from infancy 
to age 17 who are dem­
onstrating emotional pro­
blems for which residential 
care would be beneficial.

"Each girl’s needs are 
assessed and an individual 
treatment plan is drawn 
up,” he continued. “ This 
plan is periodically reass­
essed for modification. The’ 
staff meets reeularlv to

identify any group or in- ^  
dividual problems, and 
develop plans necessary to

resolve these problems. 
Unit living stresses self-
government and peer 
interaction.”

If you would make a trip 
to Girlstown, U.S.A., you 
cannot help but be im­
pressed with the people 4  
who work at this most 
unusual home for girls, and 
with the progress of the 
girls, themselves. It’s well 
worth the drive and visitors 

'are always welcome.

"He said unto them. 
Go ye into all the world, 
and preach the gospel to 
every creature.

1. Who is speaking in this 
command?
2. To whom was he 
speaking at the time?
3. Does this command 
apply today?
4. W here may it be 
found?

Answers to Bible Verse

1. Mark is recording the 
command of Jesus.
2. He was speaking to his 
disciples.
3. Certainly.
4. Mark 16:1$.
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Christ--
The Resurrection And The Life

By JAMES WILLIAMS

“ I am the resurrection 
and the life...” John 11:25,
26.
Introduction:

The death and resurrec­
tion of Christ are the two 
grand fundamental facts on 
which the whole of Christ­
ianity rests. Hence, says 
the apostle, ‘i f  Christ be 
not risen, then is our faith 
vain...”

What evidences have we 
that these events really 
took place?

A. They were public 
events.

B. They were seen by a 
great number of persons.

C. They were written 
down in a book at the time.

D. Monuments, to com­
memorate those events, 
were erected -- The Lord's 
Day and The Lord's 
Supper.

in addition to the great 
miracle of Christ’s resurr­
ection, similar miracles 
were wrought both by the 
Apostles and the Saviour 
Himself. One of the most 
interesting of these, and 
one that excited the great­
est attention was the re­
surrection of Lazarus.

Come with me to the 
home of Lazarus, and let 
us observe:

/. The Facts Stated
“ 1 am the resurrection 

and the life.”
“ 1 am the author and 

cause of the resurrection -- 
It so depends on me that it 
may be said that I am the 
resurrection itself.”  This is 
a strong mode of express­
ion and is often used. He 
is said to be made unto us 
Wisdom, Righteousness,
Sanctification and
Redemption.

II. The Promise
There is scarcely, in the 

whole compass of Revela­
tion, a more beautiful and 
comprehensive promise 
than this. Notice-:

A. The persons to whom 
it applies. “Whosoever 
believeth. ”

B. The nature of the 
promise.

1. The dead shall live. It 
would seem that this has 
reference to those in a 
state of physical death. He 
who believed and is now in 
the grave, though his body 
moulders there, shall be 
restored. Jesus illustrated

this in the case of Lazarus.
2. The living shall never 

die. To the believer, the 
curse is removed, and the 
last hour is an hour of 
victory -- of glorious 
triumph!
III. The Appeal

“ Believest thou this?”
Let me apply this on a 

little wider scale than, per­
haps, was intended in the 
text.

A. To the penitent. --You 
are anxious to obtain par­
don; you feel you must be 
pardoned or die. Listen to 
what is addressed to you in 
Isa. 1:18; Jer. 31:34; II 
Cor. 5:19.' ‘‘Believest thou 
this?”

B. To the doubting soul. 
-You are not quite sure 
that your sins are forgiven. 
You want to hear the voice- 
of God -  to know that your 
name is in the Book of 
Life. You want the witness 
of the Spirit. This is a pri­
vilege given upon believing 
-  (Acts 15:8; I John 5:19) 
as our evidence of adoption 
(Rom. 8:16) and as an evi­
dence of Christ in you (I 
John 3:24), an evidence of 
God in you (1 John 4:13). 
‘‘Believest thou this?”

C. To believers.
1. It is your duty to

strive to be free from sin, 
to be like Christ and to 
love God with all your 
heart. This is promised 
(Ezek. 36:25; Jer. 33:8; I 
Thess. 5:23; Col. 2:10). 
‘‘Believest thou this?”
What is your answer? 
‘‘Believest thou this?”
this?”

2. God has engaged to
provide you with every 
necessary temporal bless­
ing: Psa. 37:28; Matt.
10:30, etc. ‘‘Believest thou 
this?”

3. There is a glorious 
heaven provided for vou 
and promised to you.

JOYOUS EASTER-Mr. and Mrs. Willis Wood are on their 
way to Easter services at the Premitive Baptist Church. 
The Wood’s moved to Muleshoe in 1946. They have five 
children, Carolyn Wilhoite, Dale Wood, Virginia Gage, 
Lonnie Wood and Larry Wood, 15 grandchildren and eight 
great grandchildren. Wood is semi-employed and lists 
hunting as his hobby. Mrs. Wood enjoys sewing.

ATTENDING EASTER SERVICES-Mr. and Mrs. Wayne 
Copley and daughters. Tena and Gail, are all ready for 
Easter services at the Community Church. Tena is eight 
years of age and a third grade student at Mary DeShazo 
Elementary. Six year old Gail, is in the first grade at 
Dillman Elementary. Copley is self employed with Wayne 
Copley Trucking.

A TIME TO REJOYCE-Mr. and Mrs. David Williams and 
daughters, Michelle, four; and Melissa, two, arc on their 
way to Easter services at the Progress Baptist Church. 
Williams is engaged in farming and Mrs. Williams is 
attending South Plains College.
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S t e w i n g  C e t e m o n y  U n i t e s  t _ A l i s s  R o b i s o n ,  Q a s s  *
Miss Cindra Dee Robison 

became the bride of Benny 
Charles Gass Saturday 
evening, March 12 at the 
First Baptist Church in 
O’Donnell. The Rev. Floyd 
E. Haddock of Seagraves 
read the double ring vows.

Parents of the couple are 
Mr. and Mrs. Stanley Rob­
ison and Mr. and Mrs.
Charles Gass. Grandparents 
of the couple are Mr. and 
Mrs. Chester Wilson of 
Breckenridge, Mr. and 
Mrs. Sylvan Robison of 
Muleshoe. Mr. and Mrs. 
Jack Brewer of O'Donnell, 
and Mr. and Mrs. W.G.

Hobby
Club

The Muleshoe Hobby 
Club met in the community 
room of Muleshoe State 
Bank for an all day meet­
ing and luncheon with 17 
members and one visitor 
present.

Crochet articles were 
took to work with and pat­
terns which were copied for 
future use.

Those present were: 
Vickie Hendricks, Blanche 
Awbrey, Nan Gatlin, 
Myrtle Creamer, Jane Wil­
liams, Myrtle Wells, Ethel 
Julian, Myrtle Chambless, 
Mabel Caldwell, Mae Pro­
vence, Elsie Allen, Fidel 
Shafer, Edith Fox, Verna 
Dement, Sammie Ethridge 
and Angie Bowden.

Glass of Tahoka.
Vows were exchanged 

before a 15 point arched 
fan of white cathederal 
tapers decorated with 
greenery, lavender and 
violet mums with touches 
of white daisies. Matching 
15 point spiraling candela­
brum decorated in similar 
design stood to each side 
of the fan.

Mrs. C.A. Doss, pianist 
and Mrs. Kenneth Pearson, 
organist, played a prelude 
of traditional and popular 
wedding selections and ac­
companied Kay Mires of 
Plains as she presented 
"Truly” and "Bind Us 
Together.”

Given in marriage by her 
father and mother and es­
corted to the altar by her 
father, the bride chose a 
formal length gown of 
sheer, white organza over a 
flowing A-line skirt, cas­
cading softly from the 
waist. The molded bodice 
was edged with tiny seed 
pearls and reembroidered 
Venice lace and beaded in 
a scroll of flower design. 
The empire waistline acc­
ented the watteau train.

To complete her ensem­
ble the bride wore a fin­
gertip veil of silk illusion 
with scalloped edges of 
embroidered Venice lace.

The bride carried a cas­
cading bridal bouquet of 
white silk roses with high­
lights of violet and laven­
der satin streamers tied in 
love knots.

Shonda Hancock of San 
Angelo attended her sister

as matron of honor. Bride­
smaid was Kevia Black, 
cousin of the bride of
Plainview. Amber Hancock 
and Chera Forbes, niece of 
,the couple, served as
flower girls.

Attending the groom as 
best man was Travis Mires 
of Plains. The groomsipan 
was Randy Brewer,4jincle 
of the groom of O’Donnell. 
Ushe rs included Todd Gass 
of San Angelo and Brady 
Gass of Lubbock, cousins of 
the groom, Lanny Jackson 
of San Angelo and Monty 
Hancock of O’Donnell. Jus­
tin Robison, brother of the 
bride and Corey Gass, 
brother of the groom, ser­
ved as junior groomsmen.

Following the ceremony a 
reception was held in the 
fellowship hall of the 
church. The bridal table 
was centered with a silk 
arrangement consisting of 
lavender daisies and lilies, 
white lilies, carnations and 
baby’s breath and violet 
azaleas.

The three tiered confec­
tion was decorated with

WOTS 
Weekly
Meeting

iassxKxxxxsssxxx

lavender, orchid and purple 
flowers and atop the cake 
was placed three satin 
wedding bells inside a 
heart of silk flowers. Cry-

Sudan CofC
Honors
Seniors

The ladies of the Sudan 
Church of Christ honored 
members of the senior 
class of 1983 and their 
sponsors with a hamburger 
supper and ice cream 
Thursday, March 17 in the 
fellowship hall.

The tables were covered 
with red and white cloths 
and laminated placemats 
with pictures of the stu­
dents since their first 
grade, were used.

George Schuster, mini­
ster, gave the welcome and 
following the meal, a sing­
ing group from Lubbock 
Christian College in Lub­
bock provided the 
entertainment.

Junior class members of 
the church served the 
guests.

stal and silver appoint­
ments were used in serving 
guests.

Rhonda Forbes, Lynda 
Read, Kathy Bessire and 
Milete Clard assisted.

The groom’s table feat­
ured a chocolate cake with 
marzipan fruit. A hurricane 
lamp accented with green­
ery decorated the table. A 
gold coffee service was 
used in serving those at­
tending. Mrs. Don Forbes 
and Mrs. Randy Brewer 
assisted.
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Creative Woman
By Sheryl Borden

Topics to be presented 
on “ The Creative Woman” 
show on April 5 and 9 in­
clude information on putt­
ing in shoulder pads and 
sleeve heads in blazers, 
protein complementarity 
ideas and how to make a 
homemade jewelry cleaner.

Ann Meyer. Education 
Representative for Pellon 
Corp. in New York will 
discuss and illustrate how 
essential shoulder pads and 
sleeve heads are in a well- 
made blazer or jacket. Mrs. 
Meyer explains “ you see, 
most of us have a hollow* 
just below the shoulder and 
shoulder pads fill this out 
giving a smooth, contoured 
look to the whole shoulder 
area. Sleeve heads support 
and fill out the sleeve cap 
-  they are a must for a 
professional look.”

Another guest, Beverly 
Harder, a former home 
economist with Arrowhead 
Mills in Hereford, Texas, 
will talk about protein 
complementarity ideas. 
Since amino acids are nec­
essary for muscle and 
blood formation, protein is 
especially important in all 
our diets. But, Mrs. Harder 
will point out ways to in­
corporate protein in our 
meals through meat-less 
dishes, which are still high

in protein and much less 
expensive.

And to conclude the 
show, Joy Best, Extension 
Home Economist in Por- 
tales will share an old re­
cipe for a jewelry cleaner 
that works well. This part 
of the program is called 
"Housecleaning on a 
Shoestring.”

On April 7, the show will 
feature information on in­
terfacing basics and tips on 
food drying.

Ann Meyer with Pellon 
Corp. will talk about 
choosing interfacings, why 
an interfacing is so im­
portant in sewing any gar­
ment, and how to apply 
sewn-in and fusible inter­
facings. As Mrs. Meyer 
says “ The most important 
point to remember is when

you choose an interfacing, 
make sure it is compatible 
with the weight of your 
fabric and the styling of 
your garment.”

Connie Moyers, Market­
ing Representative with 
Southwestern Public Ser­
vice Co. in Clovis will con­
clude the show with tips on 
food drying. She will dis­
cuss types of food that can 
be successfully dried, ex­
plain how to prepare foods 
for drying and will dem­
onstrate drying some foods 
in the microwave oven -- 
which is only one way to 
dry foods. Other methods 
will be demonstrated on 
later shows.

“ The Creative Woman” 
show is produced and 
hosted by Sheryl Borden. 
The show is aired at 12:30 
p.m. on Tuesdays and 
Thursdays and at 2:00 p.m. 
on Saturdays on KENW- 
TV.

«»*
Rich gifts wax poor when 

givers prove unkind

Deanne Rasco was the 
hostess for the Thursday, 
March 31 WOTS luncheon 
held at Summit Savings. A 
rabbit and large Easter egg 
centered the dessert table 
in keeping the Easter 
theme.

Members present includ­
ed Kay Madry, Thereasa 
Todd and Jeffery of Texico, 
N.M., Deanna Rasco and 
Jason, Marv Smith, Betty 
Moore, Earth, Alice Phill­
ips, Karen Mason, Linda 
Cogtiandra, Rose Cross­
white, Kiley and Deboraji, 
Mildred Williams, Betty 
Barker, Edna Haynes, Pat 
Mudford, Kathy Railsback 
and Nora Flannary.

Guest present included: 
’Brenda Mudford, Kathy 
Mudford, Ricky Railsback, 
Killy Railsback and Bryan 
Rasco.

Hostesses for the April 7 
luncheon wiH be Kay Mon- 
crief and Alice Phillips.

For more information on 
WOTS you may contact 
Alice Phillips at 272-5172 
or Lois Martinec at 
272-3019.

ENGAGEMENT ANNOUNCED-Mr. and Mrs. Jack Dun­
ham and Mr. and Mrs. Clayton Myers announce the 
engagement and approaching marriage of their children, 
Rhonda and Thurman. A June 24 wedding has been 
scheduled at the First Assembly of God Church.

TOPS Club
Chapter 34

TOPS chapter Tx. No. 34 
met Thursday, March 24*at 
6:30 p.m. in the meeting 
room of Bailey County 
Electric.

Clara Lou Jones, presi­
dent, called the meeting to 
order. The TOPS pledge 
was recited and the fellow­
ship song sung. Clara 
Crain called the roll with
19 members weighing in.

Ann Vinson reported on
the boat contest. An auc­
tion was held with Jewel 
Peeler and Lou Knowles as 
auctioneers. Leavern James 
celebrated her birthday.

It was reported that the
20 year anniversary cele­
bration will be held April 
14 and all past leaders and 
charter members are wel­
come to attend this 
meeting.

Best loser for the week 
w as Lou Knowles. Skeet 
B r a d s h a w  w a s  first runner 
up and Zcffa Shafer was 
second runner up.

The meeting was dis­
missed with the singing of 
the goodnight song.
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Ladies Fashion Rings

Reduced 30%

Large Selection Of 
Costume Earrings
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Terra Dawn Chandler
Mr. and Mrs. Charlie R. 

Chandler of Bryan, Texas 
are the proud parents of a 
daughter born at 4:10 a.m. 
March 15.

The young lady weighed 
six pounds and five and a 
half ounces and has been 
named Terra Dawn. She is 
the first child for the 
couple.

Grandparents are Mr. 
and Mrs. Homer Redwine 
of Port Arthur and Mr. and 
Mrs. Orbie R. Chandler of 
Lubbock.

Great Grandparents are 
Mrs. Opal Pugh of Port 
Arthur and Mrs. Minnie 
Redwine and Mr. and Mrs. 
Charlie Watson all of 
Muleshoe.

Miria Madalena Vargas
Mr. and Mrs. Jesse Var­

gas are the proud parents 
of a daughter, Maria Mad­
alena, born at 12:45 p.m. 
March 21.

Maria Madalena weighed 
seven pounds and four 
ounces. The couple have 
six other children, Jesse, 
12; Orlande, 10; Leo, nine; 
Gloria, six, Janet, five; and 
Francis, two years of age.

Grandparents are Mr. 
and Mrs. Joe Casillas of 
Austin and Manuela Vargas 
of Odessa.

Shanda Kristen Bentley
Mr. and Mrs. Bentley of 

Texico, N.M. are the proud 
parents of a daughter born 
at 11:41 p.m. March 28 in 
West Plains Medical 
Center.

The young lady weighed 
nine pounds and ten 
ounces and has been 
named Shanda Kristin. She 
is the first child for the 
couple.

Grandparents are Mr. 
and Mrs. Everett Prather 
of Farwell, Dale Bentley 
and Shirely Jackson.

Great grandparents are

Mrs. J.T. Prather of Bowie 
and Mrs. Delanie Vincent 
of Bovina.

Rebekah Lodge 
Meeting Held 
Tuesday

Grand Lodge Rebekah 
Assembly met in Abilene 
March 18 thru 21. Twenty 
attended from Muleshoe. 
Mrs. Dimple Sims, repre­
sentative, gave a report at 
the Lodge meeting Tuesday 
evening, March 29.

District five of Rebekahs, 
composed of Lodges from 
Dimmitt, Hereford, Friona 
and Muleshoe is planning 
to send a delegate to 
United Nations. The boy or 
girl selected must be either 
a sophomore or junior. The 
one selected this year will 
be either from Muleshoe or 
Springlake-Earth.

The Lodge will send Joy- 
lene Costen, Noble Grand, 
to Canyon to the Panhandle 
West Texas ‘‘Distinguished 
Women” award banquet, 
to be recognized as an out­
standing woman.

Thirty-three were present 
for Tuesday’s meeting.

Rug Doctor.
M akes  house calls.

‘‘Everyone enjoyed the ar­
rangements of solo’s, 
duets, quartets and con­
gregational singing” says 
Ms. Coffman.

Everyone who likes sing­
ing or plays an instrument 
is welcome to attend.

Just
Conscience doesn’t 

keep you from doing any- 
thing--it just takes all the 
enjoyment out of it.

-Golden Gate.

MULESHOE MEET-Muleshoe Twisters boys and girls competed in a Tumbling Meet 
hosted by Hawkins and Purdy School of Dance and Gymnastics. Front row (L-R) Cassie 
Cuevas, Kelli Calowell, Jenna Glover, Chris Thrasher, Shane Schuster and Jarah Redwine. 
Back row (L-R) Leslee Treadwell, Keetha Glover, Emily Harris, Jeanne Cox, Sean 
Flannary, Josh Slayden, Fara Black, Allison Field and Emily Bomer.

Right
When buying a lawn- 

mower you should select a 
substantial one that will 
last your wife several 
years.

-Sandury Review.

Only A Part 
Education is largely a 

matter of choosing one’s 
company wisely, and 
listening in silence.

-News. Detroit.

So They Say 
Middle age is when 

work is no longer play, 
and play is getting to be 
work.

-Tribune, Chicago.

The fast, 
dependable 
carpet and 
upholstery 
cleaner.

StMming
Rent the Rug Doctor at:

At D im

Pay & Save
401 S. First

Fry & Cox, Inc.
515 W. American

The Muleshoe Singing 
Group met Saturday, 
March 26 at the Trinity 
Baptist Church with 23 
present. Invocation was 
given by Clara Coffman.

Cecil Rundell was in 
charge of the singing.
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SPECIAL PURCHASE!
60"  B0TT0MWEIGHT FAB 

X  $ 197
•Gabardine •Linens •Textured
•Stretch Gab •Poplins $°Ms
'Over 1000 yds Just Received
GREAT GAUZE $ 0 9 7  
PRINTS & SOLIDS

WESTERN SHIRTS 
$988

Short Sleeve

DRESS SHIRTS 
$588 AND $788

Great Selection

LADIES SPRING 
TOPS & BLOUSES

RUFFLED EYELET T R IM S ...2 y d s  *1
PULLOVER SHIRTS.Polyester

THREAD
Knit*Plaids*Solids* 

-Woven* Casual*Dress ELASTIC
Donnkenny

LADIES GABARDINE SLACKS
Beautiful

THICK BATH TOWELS ANTHONY DRESS 
SLACKS

KNIT PULL*0N SLACKS
Anthony's Own

SIGNATURE BED PILLOWSGreat
Selection

Your Choice Of Sizes: 
Standard, Queen, Or King

t o p s  & as
BLOUSES 1 |

0 8 8  1 0 8 8  m
/ A N D  I  L .  j /

CHIC, LEVI, AND  
LEE JR. JEANS.....

Printed

Kitchen Towels

BATH TOWEL SETS

LARGE GROUP OF LADIES SHOESSpecial

Purchase

MEN'S LEVI JEANS

MEN'S WRANGLERS $ 
BOY'S WRANGLER JEANS
Boys 1-7....................................8988
Boys 8-14................................8 .1 1 88

Students.................................* 1 3 88

MEN'S WESTERN BOOTS
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Letter To 
The Editor

Dear Editor,
I would like to take a 

moment to express my 
thanks and appreciation to 
several groups of people 
and individuals that help in 
making a successful track 
program.

First of all 1 would like 
to thank the school board 
for their support in the ap­
proval of a sufficient bud­
get in order to run a qual­
ity program. We have been 
allowed the opportunity to 
take an overnight trip to 
the San Angelo Relays each 
of the past two years. This 
item alone runs into some 
expense for a single meet, 
but this is an enjoyable as 
well as an educational ex­
perience for our boys. 1 
would also like to add that 
I as a coach have been on 
many overnight trips with 
teams before, but the 
Muleshoe boys are the 
most polite and respectful 
group I have ever been as­
sociated with. You as par­
ents and a community can 
be proud of the way your 
boys represented you dur­
ing their stay in San 
Angelo. In my book they 
are what you call class.

We have also upgraded 
our uniforms and equip­
ment over the last two 
years thanks to the support 
of the board, booster club 
and our athletic director. I 
would also like to thank all

Jf^est Plains 
Medical Center

ADMITTED
March 28-Jessica Vidna, 

Danny Collins, Romelo 
Toscano, Rickie Claybrook, 
Linda Nowell, Juanita Bus­
by, Socorro Favor, Rena 
Huff, Ruby Goor and Mar­
gie Stringer.

March 29-Amy Jesko, 
Mary Ann Hall. Antonio 
DeLeon and Debra Bentley

March 30-Susie Medley 
and Bertha Arce

March 31-Lou Ann Pike 
and Winnie Berry 

DISMISSED
March 28-Christina Pena, 

Sam Blackwell, Ernest 
Martin, Nancy Kidd and 
Grace Kemp

March 29-Martin Chand­
ler, Charles Brommit, 
Raymond Roubinek, Jewel 
McCormick, Maneula Re- 
jino and Anita Guest

March 30-Diane Gonz­
ales, Renay Huff and 
Rickie Claybrook.

of the merchants of Mule­
shoe who have supported 
us through our track poster 
each year. This project has 
enabled us to let the 
community get involved
and they have been so 
willing to help.

Some individuals that 
have helped us include:
Carlton Newell of Art-Craft 
Printing, Lonnie Adrian of 
Adrian Photography,
Johnny St. Clair of St.
Clair’s, Paul Wilbanks of 
Western Drug, Shirly
Farmer and all the staff at 
the Muleshoe Journal, 
KVOP Radio, Gil Lamb and 
Channel 6 and Steve 
Thasher at Anthony’s.

I would like to thank 
Wayland Ethridge and Bob 
Graves for all of their help 
and support along with the 
other faculty members and 
coaching staff. A special 
thanks goes to Betty Cowan 
and Sue Mader, also, Tom 
Jinks and Billy Murphy 
along with rest of the 
school maintenance dept.

As a result of all the 
support and cooperation 
Muleshoe has been quite 
successful in all phases of 
the Track and Field 
program including both 
boys and girls over the last 
three years. This year 
alone we have the class 
AAA State Champion cross 
country team, our 7-8 boys 
and girls won the Muleshoe 
Invitational, our girls Var­
sity team has won two 
meets already this year, 
and the boys have won 
three meets. Coach Bran­
don and his girls have an 
opportunity to capture the 
district championship this 
year, and the boys will try 
to repeat as district 
champions.

In closing I want to share 
a dream with you that the 
kids and our coaches have, 
that I hope will be the 
good of this community. 
We have talked about hav­
ing an all-weather track, 
and I hope that though the 
continued support, this can 
become a reality in the 
near future. This is some­
thing that would affect both 
boys and girls in the top 
six grades as well as pro­
viding local joggers an ex­
cellent facility. Once again 
a big thanks to everyone 
for making Track in Mule­
shoe a success.

Sincerely,
Kevin Wiseman

VOLCKER & RATES
Siding with President 

Reagan, Federal Reserve 
Chairman Paul Volcker said 
recently that some interest 
rates charged by banks seem 
‘‘quite high" in light of de­
clines in inflation.

? *

TH ESE VARIETIES 
HAVE PROVEN 
THEM SELVES IN

P R 8 0  Outstanding micronaire and yield record. 
'  n O U  storm resistance to survive tough condi­

tions Excellent disease protection

p D 7 C  Tough in drouth conditions; high yield 
potential Early  maturing, good storm 
resistance Very good early season growth 
and seedling disease escape

Lockett ° uts,andjn9 y'eld and exce,,en* 9'nl u v a u i i  turnout very good early season growth 
7 7  and seedling disease escape Very good 

fiber length and good fiber strength

PIONEER.

Gene Paul Jarman
Route 1, Box 84A 
Muleshoe, Texas 

Phone 806/965-2340

1 5 ' O FF LA B EL  FA BR IC  S O FT EN ER

DOWNY
$ 4 0 9

3 3  OZ. 
BTL.

15* O f f  L A B EL  PU R EX  LIQUID

BLEACH

LIBBY'S

VIENNA
SAUSAGES

STARKIST

TUNA

ASSORTED/DEC

VIVA
TOWELS

JUMBO
ROLL

DOUBLE STANPS ON Wl

GROCERY SPECIALS

ASSORTED BATHROOM

CHARMIIM
TISSUE

G O LD  M ED A L

2 5  LB . 
B A G

REG./DIET 32 OZ. PLUS DEP.

MH DR,
PEPPER

1
PpeA

HR

Hl-HO

CRACKERS
■ 9 9 *

L Y S O L

1 6  O Z. i 
B O X

SCHILLING

GARLIC SALT
8 9 *3 %  O Z. 

B TL.

6 BTL. 
CTN.

B E T T Y  C R O C K E R  S T IR  & FRO ST ASSTD I

CAKE MIX 
$ 4 1 9

I1 3  O Z . 
B O X

„ Y T ^ H IN G T O N  r e d  d elic io u s i
RESH FROM THE FARM PRODUCE/

APPLES

LB.

CALIFORN IA P IN T  B A S K ETSTRAW­BERRIES

W A FER S  v a n w T E 1BOXZ 7 9 * . 
JU ICE  sssssss? %?z $1 49

HEALTH & BEAUTY AIDS

O R E  ID,
r f R E N C I

T a

CALIFORN IACELERY 
HEARTS mi
CALIFORNIA

JALEPENO 0 0 4
PEPPERS IB .

GREEN o ”Z B £  ONIONS

VOS
BUY ONE GET ONE FREE!!!

VO-5 ASSORTED

HAIR SPRAY 
SQ19

PAK
BTLS. ■ $-'> -

2 PAK 
7 OZ.

FLOSS 
Shampoo 
Conditioner

WAXEO/UNWAXED Q  Q  ̂
DENTAL PKG O v

VO-5 NOR / ^
EX. BOY./HENNA 15 OZ ■ BTL

VO-5 NOR / $ ^ 0 9  *  
EX. BOY / • *  I
HENNA 15 0Z .1  BTL

STORE HOURS: 
515 W. AMER. BLVD 

272-4406

PWCES EFFECTIVE APRMM^PRIL S 
WE RESEFIVE THE RIGHT TO -

.....................

A LL G RIN D S FO LG ER ’S

CA N

QUALITY ANM 'ICE
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QUALITY MEAT SPECIALS
HEAVY GRAIN FED BEEF BONELESS

CHUCK
MACARONI & CHEESE HEREFORD

CORN TORTILLASKRAFT
DINNERS

OSCAR MAYER 
SLICED CHOPPED

EXTRA LEAN FRESH CHK. QUL. 
GUARANTEED 80% LEAN LB.

, OSCAR MAYER 1 LB.
I REL'ULAR MEAT PKG.
HILLoHIRE FARM 
REGULAR
OR POLISH SMOKED LB. 
8 02. PKG
OSCAR MAYER SLICED 
MEAT-BEEF-THICK

OSCAR MAYER 
SLICED HAM &

. . . .  OSCAR MAYER 8 OZ *
‘MWlI sucEDCorro pkg.
Ever wonder what Oscar Mayer 
has in store fur you...

AUSAGE

HEAVY GRAIN FED

BONELESS 
CHUCK STEAK

BATH  S 'Z E

ZEST SOAP
B A R S

PICTURE
L Y S O L  R E G ./ S C E N T  II

SPRAY
L Y S O L  w -

CLEANER

LY S O L

DISINFECTANT

LO VE M Y C A R P ET  A S S T D . RU G  & RO OM

LOVE-MY-CARPET
FAMILY SIZE

CASCADEO RE IDA C R IN K LE C U T  
^ R E N C H  FR IES O R

Ta t er  to ts
Ice cream
| i / | | |  | f  BORDEN 
I W l l L l Y  CHOCOLATE

Bars PUDOWG

‘W affles FR
D i c e  PEI RITZ 
r ' I C d  CHERRY/APPLE

. l l  l i r ^ C  MINUTE MAI 
A i  U  I  t # C  ACID FROZEI

f l r t i m  i t c  m or  IL J U IM U T S  choc
23* OHTCHEESEvmn

BORDEN Vi GAL 
ASSORTED SQ CTN

IL.4 T®'APWL 9, 1983

UNCLE BEN’S

FROZEN FOODS & DAIRY

Courthouse

Neum

MARRIAGE LICENSE 
Joe Clinton Gear and 

Gayla Maurine Wagnon, 
Muleshoe

Lincoln Wade Snell and 
Ona Michelle Berry, 
Muleshoe.

WARRANTY DEEDS 
Harold L. Thornton and 

wife, Joy Thornton to Roy 
D. Whitt and wife, Joy 
Ann Whitt-TRACT I: All 
of Lots (6), (7), (8), (9). 
and (10), in Block (13), 
Original Town of Muleshoe, 
Bailey County, Texas. 
TRACT II: All of Lots (1), 
(2), and (3), in Block (2) 
Wagnon’s Addition to the 
City of Muleshoe, Bailey 
County, Texas.

David W. Hamblin and 
wife, Wanda L. Hamblin to 
J.B. Fowler and wife, Pat­
ricia A, Fowler -- A 160 
acre tract of Land out of 
the Northwest part of Sec­
tion (41), Block Z, 
WD&FW Johnson Subdivi­
sion, Bailey County, Texas.

S.D. Clements and wife, 
Ruth Clements to Leroy 
Sandefer-All of Lot (7),

Block (3), Wagnon Addition 
to Muleshoe, Bailey

County, Texas.
Lupe DeLeon to Joe L. 

Smallwood -  The North­
easterly 66 feet of Lots 
(13), (14), and (15), Block 
(40), Original Town of 
Muleshoe, Bailey County, 
Tcxss
COUNTY COURT 

ORDER OF DISMISSAL 
Kevin J. Robinson, Es- 

tella Ramos, Charles Flow­
ers, Keith Oris Calhoun, 
Bernardo Servin Gonzalez 
and Brandon Dee Hall.

Keith Oris Calhoun DWI 
10 days jail and S500 fine 

Bernardo Servin Gonzalez 
Failure to Appear $20 fine 

Rudolfo Toscano DWI 3 
days jail $150 fine 

Ruben Silva DWI 3 days 
jail $250 fine

Richard Mora DWI 3 ‘ 
days jail $250 fine 

DISTRICT COURT 
Norma Linda Jaramillo 

and Joseph Raymond 
Jaramillo DV 

Muleshoe State Bank VS 
Don Harmon Judgment 
NEW VEHICLES BOUGHT 

IN MARCH, 1983 
Teddy Harrison, 1983 

Chev PU, Robert D. Green, 
Inc. L.W. Chapman, 1983 
Ford 4 dr, Muleshoe Mtr. 
Co., Inc.

Water Conservation
Program Outlined

Agriculture Commiss­
ioner Jim Hightower and 
state Sen. John Montford 
(D-Lubbock) Thursday pre­
sented details of a water 
conservation proposal that 
potentially “ Could save al­
most 200 times as much 
water as Texans presently 
drink.”

The proposed constitu­
tional amendement, co­
sponsored by Senators 
Montford and Bill Sarpalius 
(D-Hereford), would create 
a state Agricultural Water 
Conservation Loan Fund to 
make low-interest money 
available to Texas farmers 
to convert to more water- 
efficient crop irrigation 
systems. The proposal is a 
component of a compre­
hensive “ state water 
plan,”  a package of leg­
islation unveiled Monday 
by Lt. Gov. Bill Hobby, 
Hightower and the senate 
sponsors of the bills.

“ More than 70 percent 
of all the fresh water used 
in Texas is used for agri­
cultural purposes,” High­
tower explained at a Thur­
sday news conference in 
the Senate Chamber, “ so it 
goes without saying that 
agricultural water use must 
be a major component of

any statewide plan addres­
sing Texas’ future water 
needs. We’re all in this 
together, so it’s critical that 
wc come up with a plan 
that urban Texans and 
rural Texans, West Texans 
and East Texans can agree 
on.

“ I’m supporting the 
whole package,” Hightower 
said, “ but I’m especially 
pleased with the approach 
of this proposal sponsored 
oy Senators Montford and 
Sarpalius. It will be finan­
ced by the sale of bonds, 
and the loans made to 
farmers from the fund 
would be repaid to the 
state, so the cost to the 
taxpayers will be precisely 
zero. Our farmers will save 
money on their production 
costs. And the water they 
save through more efficient 
irrigation techniques will 
then be available to cover 
the needs of industrial 
development and popula­
tion growth. Everybody 
wins.

“ The focus of the entire 
water plan is essentially on 
conservation,” Hightower 
noted, “ but in no other 
area of water use is the 
potential for conservation 
savings as great as in the 
agricultural sector.

TH ESE VARIETIES 
HAVE PROVEN 
THEM SELVES IN

Cotton

otorm resistance to survive tough 
tions. Excellent disease protection

lam b  COUNTY

Soybeans

Variety
4880

A late group IV maturing variety that has 
excellent standability and seed quality. 
4880 has excellent field resistance to 
Phytophthora root rot.

PIONEER.

Don Bryant Seed
Route 1, Box 140 
Muleshoe, Texas 
(806) 965-2227
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CCC Loans
Cont. from

damages will be assessed if 
the delivery of the comm­
odity is not completed by 
the final delivery date 
specified.

A notification of bid ac­
ceptance will be provided 
after the CCC has had an 
opportunity to review and 
evaluate all of the bids 
submitted.

While not too much ac­
tual bid information was 
available on Friday, ASCS 
offices in Bailey County » 
and in surrounding counties 
hoped to be ready to ans­
wer producer’s questions 
on this new program 
Monday.

The following few para­
graphs contain some rules 
and regulations regarding 
the invitation to sell 
program:

Offers will not be acc­
epted for a quantity for 
which the first part of the

Muleshoe...
Cont. from Page 1
Parents of Chapter 1 stu­
dents is the best ever. 
Preparations are nearing 
completion for the big 
game night which will be 
held on Thursday, April 7 
at 7:00 p.m. at the Mule- 
shoe High School Cafeteria 
Prizes will consist of all 
kinds of exciting instruct­
ional materials and toys 
and everyone will have the, 
chance to be a winner. 
Please come and bring your 
family -- this will be a fun 
time for all of you. Re­
freshments will be served 
and there is no charge 
made for anything. Parent 
Advisory Council members 
will be elected for the 
coming two years. See you 
there.

*****
State Comptroller Bob 

Bullock has announced that 
Phillip Land from his Lub­
bock Field Office will be at 
the Bailey County Court­
house in the County 
Commissioner Courtroom 
on Tuesday, April 12, 1983 
from 2:00 p.m. to 4:00 
p.m. A comptroller’s rep­
resentative is available to 
assist local residents at the 
courthouse the second 
Tuesday of each month.

Page 1
purchase price; as des­
cribed in Section 1 of An­
nouncement CCC-Loan 
Commodity-200, equals or 
exceeds $1,000,000.00.

In the case of ware- 
house-stored loan collateral, 
sorghum grading No. 4 or 
worse may not be offered.

If “ in elevation” charges 
on warehouse-stored sor­
ghum have been prepaid 
by the farmer, CCC will 
refund the prepaid amount

WIFE

The Muleshoe and Area 
W.I.F.E. (Women Involved 
In Farm Economics) have 
developed an on-going pro­
ject for WIFE which is de­
signed to help raise funds 
for travel expenses for 
state officers.

The WIFE project is now 
offering an associate mem­
bership to interested area 
women and to business­
men. Plans include keeping 
the majority of the asso­
ciate membership fees in 
the State of Texas for the 
travel and various other 
projects, as called for.

Associate Memberships 
for WIFE are priced on a 
yearly basis and will be $50 
for a small business; $100 
for a large business; $300 
for a corporate business; 
$850 for Life Membership 
and $500 for Farmer’s Life 
Membership. Those desir­
ing to sign up will receive 
“ WIFE-Line” (a WIFE 
publication) and the state 
newsletter. New members 
will also receive a placard 
showing the type of mem­
bership that they have 
purchased.

For further information 
contact any member of the 
Muleshoe Area WIFE 
organization.

N O T E S ... 
COMMENTS

One can have 
many credit cards.

to the farmer.
Successful offerors of 

farm-stored sorghum will 
be issued a delivery notice 
that specifies a point of 
delivery and the final date 
for delivery of the sorghum 
which has been purchased 
by CCC. The final date for 
delivery will be 15 days 
from the date the notice is 
issued. If CCC requires de­
livery at a receiving point 
beyond the farmer's normal 
delivery point as deter­
mined by the county ASC 
committee, CCC will reim­
burse the farmer for the 
excess haul at a rate det­
ermined by CCC. CCC will 
assume the “ in elevation” 
charges at the point of 
delivery.

CCC, in its discretion, 
reserves the right to accept 
or reject any offer.

All offerors will be not­
ified by CCC in writing of 
the acceptance or rejection 
of their offer.

A list of successful off­
erors in a county will be 
available at the county 
ASCS office.

City Council 
Will Canvass 
Votes Tuesday

Members of the Mule­
shoe City Council will meet 
in a special meeting on 
Tuesday, April 5 beginning 
at 8:30 a.m. in order to 
canvass election results and 
consider a resolution de­
claring the results of the 
City Council election held 
on April 2.

Also to be canvassed will 
be the election results and 
the consideration of a res­
olution declaring the results 
of the bingo election to 
legalize bingo games as 
authorized under the Bingo

Sign-ups • ••
Cont. from Page 1

“ I can’t remind produc­
ers too much to keep these 
dates in mind and to be 
sure that they meet them,” 
Williamson said.

enabling act.
In other council business, 

consideration of bids on the 
general purpose tractor be­
ing considered for purchase 
by the City.

A resolution authorizing 
the addition of new street 
lights to the City lighting 
system will also be consid­
ered at the Tuesday 
meeting.

festival.

Court Trials

too

IG.LK •THANK GOODNESS 
IT S A SALE

ARTCARVED SILADIUM®
H.S. CLASS RINGS
MOW ONLY

$8 9 “wW F H  with this 
AO

Bring this ad to get super savings on your 
ArtCarved Siladium ‘ class ring Every ring is 
backed by the ArtCarved Full lifetime Warranty 
This offer expires May 31,1983 and is to be used 
only for the purchase of ArtCarved Siladium1

/ŴRVED' 
'le .w e lzu .

1202 MAIN " U  272-33551 
■ ■ ■ I  BRING THIS AD ■  H  H  H

X.LnA

nie Dee Stewart,
Suzanne Pierce, Tommie 
Bovell Bratcher.

Dale Newsom, Nelda 
Branden Mullins, John Lee 
Dunbar, Louise King, Luis 
Pacheco, Pina Hurtado 
Lopez, Jim Kenneth 
Haynes, Adele Sterling 
Tompkins, Alfred N. 
Flores, Dianne Brown Nie- 
man, Norman Bays, David 
Paul Poynor, Sharon Mid- 

, dlebrooks Grant, Carroll 
Lynn Rhodes, R.A. Gross, 
Haney Caldwell Poynor, 
Rocky Joe Gore, Ruby Pea­
cock, Kimberly Kay Will­
iams, Nick Manzanares, 
Ronald Byron Green, Mar­
vin George Davenport, 
Royce Earl Harris, Alta 
Locker Bruns, Janice Rae 
Self, Sheri Brockmeier 
Hawkins.

Ada Spurgeon Skaggs, 
Terry Holt Perry, Willie 
Graves Walker, Nancy
Garner Williams, Tanya 
Burton Crawford, Juanita 
Estrada Martinez, Don
Seales, Jessie Costilla,
John Curtis Slaughter, Jr., 
Delbert Russell Watson, 
Jerrell R. Otwell, Mylinda 
Sue Graves, Mary Ellis 
Webb, Jimmie Pitcock, 
Laury Hafford Medlin, Jr., 
Belinda Jo Dolle, Vicki Bo- 
llen Black, Jack Bates, At- 
tie Lahaise Hettinga, Albert 
Teofilo Garza, Jo May 
Head, Thelma Jacquelyn 
Blaylock, D.O. Burlesmith, 
Robbie N. Gore, Dennis 
Lee Watson, Gabriel Alv­
arez Perez, Anne Edwards 
Oyler.

Mary Johnson Mardis, 
Mildred Arnold Lambert, 
Linda McCormick Wilhite, 
Johnny Lee Barnes, Nona 
Clem Griffin Mrs., Mack 
Anthony Norman, William 
Orozco, Lonnie Dewey Ad­
rian, Billy Jo Barker, Linda 
Dell Davis, Glen Dalton 
Harris, Darlene Black 
Henry, Ellen Daricek Kin­
dle, Willie Martin James.

Mildred Mallett James, 
Edna Bryant Haynes, Doris 
Crouch Scott, Gloria Hilda 
Garcia, David Alton Parker,

Cont. from Page 1
Sherri Kristi Diane Henry, Ramon 

R. Cisneros, Alton Ray 
Carpenter, Dorothy Duncan 
Wenner, Nancy Coleman 
Kidd.

Don’t
Clown Around!

Lome 0n In to r  (rood Values

1-Rack Long Sleeve

SHIRTS $1395 »"j2400
All Other Long Sleeve Shirts

*5°° OFF Regular Price

fm • • • • • • • • • •

MEN'S

WRANGLERS
LEVIS...................$1529

All Other Boys, Students Reduced

# ees WESTERN W EAR, INC
1910 American 272-4663

Jobs.
Cont. from Page 1 
be permanent residents of 
the United States, its terr­
itories or posessions; have 
no history of serious crim­
inal or other antisocial be­
havior that might endanger 
their safety or that of 
others; have or are able to 
obtain work permits (if re­
quired), and Social Security 
numbers; must be willing 
and able to work hard and 
participate in work projects. 
(Handicapped are eligible 
for the program provided 
they can participate in most 
YCC activities.) and must 
have not participated in the 
YCC program before for 
more than 3 weeks.

Cont. from Page 1
to help stage the large all­
day show on Saturday, 
August 13.

All proceeds from the 
Mule Day Festival will be 
presented to Girlstown, 
U.S.A. at Whiteface. See 
the related story about 
Girlstown in this issue of 
The Journal.

Hempe
Cont. from Page 1

1928 and married Joan 
Margaret Westcott in July, 
1953. They moved to 
Muleshoe in April of 1967. 
He was a veteran of World 
War II, serving in the U.S. 
Army.

Survivors include his wife 
Joan, two sons Kent of 
Lubbock and Keith of 
Wichita Falls and one 
daughter Mrs. Joiene Cle­
ment of Perryton, four sis­
ters: Mrs. Wayne Slimmer 
of Plainville, Kansas, Mrs. 
Ellen McCarty of Dallas, 
Mrs. Lester Hawkins of 
Garland and Mrs. Fred 
Thompson of Seward, 
Nebraska. Also three bro­
thers, Gary of Richland, 
New York, Bernard of 
Hays, Kansas and Dale of 
Plainville, Kansas, and two 
grandchildren.

The family has requested 
that memorials be made to 
the Don Rempe Cancer 
Fund Memorial at either 
Muleshoe bank. A rosary 
was held at 6:30 p.m. on 
Friday.

The best years can al­
ways be ahead.

Golfers Play 
Three Tourneys 
This Week

The Muleshoe High 
School girls golf team com­
peted this past week in 
three golf tournaments, 
with one being held in 
'Muleshoe, dubbed the 
Muleshoe Invitational on 
Monday. The girls finished 
second in a nine team

Track...
Cont. from Page 1 
and Kirvin placed third 
with 19’9". Hector Garcia 
placed third in the shci put 
with 43'2Vi” and Hector 
Flores placed fifth with 
40’8% ” .

field, with Denise Wilson 
winning the Low Medalist 
with a score of 80. Tulia 
placed first overall in the 
tournament.

On Tuesday, the team 
traveled to Sundown and 
finished up the session 
there with second place in 
that six team tournament. 
Denise was again the low 
medalist in the Sundown 
tournament with a score of 
87. Sundown finished first 
in the tournament.

The second of three 
rounds of district play was 
played at Abernathy on 
Wednesday, March 23. The

Spring...
Cont. from Page 1
served and it promises to 
be an evening of fun for 
the entire family. Make 
plans to be there!

Muleshoc team moved from 
a third place position into 
second place in the Aber­
nathy tournament with a 
team score of 388. Denise 
Wilson was the low med­
alist with a two-round total 
of 162. Polly Harrison 
played well in the second 
round and shot an 88, ac­
cording to her coaches.

The Muleshoe Girls Golf 
team is made up of Denise 
Wilson, Polly Harrison, 
Melissa Wilbanks, Debbie 
Hicks and Kristi Speis.

*  * *  *
Life would be simple if 

everyone was unselfish.
* • * *

Too much hard work
kills the desire to play.

* * • •

Life is hard to those 
who make it hard.

• * * *
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PIK COTTON
If you have PIK cotton for sale, we can help you obtain 
the best price when you decide to sell.

We can provide you up-to-the-minute quotations on 
PIK cotton prices.

We offer a sound contract with several special features 
that may be of benefit to you.
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Farmers Will Idle Less Productive Acres In PIK

o

Surveys show that farm­
ers who participate in the 
government’s Payment in 
Kind (PIK) program this 
season will be inclined to 
idle their less productive - 
acres.

When making that deci­
sion, Dr. Allen Wiese, Ex­
tension weed control spec­
ialist at Texas A&M Univ­
ersity, says farmers can 
“ improve their longterm 
profitability by diverting

severely
problem

those acres most 
infested with 
perennial weeds.

“ There are a number of 
weeds that offer growers 
the opportunity for signifi­
cant population reduction 
while the land is idle,’’ 
says Dr. Wiese. “ These 
include johnsongrass, 
shattercane, field bind­
weed, barnyard grass and 
several more.’’

Under PIK rules, grow-

Local Man Will Join 
Fertilizer Institute

Larry D. Meyers will join 
the staff of The Fertilizer 
Institute as vice president, 
legislative affairs, effective 
April 1, according to Insti­
tute president, Gary D. 
Myers.

“ Larry’s proven effect­
iveness in agricultural pub­
lic affairs will further 
strengthen our Institute’s 
role in working with the 
Congress, its staffs and the 
governmental agencies,” 
Myers said.

Meyers most recently 
served as a founding par­
tner in the Washington- 
based consulting firm of 
Hackler, Meyers, Dutko 
and Associates, and from 
1978 to 1981 was director 
of the U.S. Department of 
Agriculture’s office of con­
gressional affairs. In this 
position, he was respon­
sible for all contact be­
tween the Congress and 
USDA, as well as legisla­
tive liaison with the White 
House.

A native of Muleshoe.

Hale Weed 
Conference Set

A Weed Conference on 
Hard to Kill Weeds will be 
held April 4, 1983 an­
nounced Flip Calhoun, 
Chairman of the Hale 
County Soil and Water 
Conservation District. This 
meeting will be held at the 
Hale County Agricultural 
Center on Business 87, 
South of Plainview at 9:30 
a.m.

The main objective of 
this conference is to inform 
local producers on what is 
available to them in their 
efforts to control problem 
weeds. “ Our program will 
consist of two parts,” Cal­
houn said, “ the first part 
will consist of presentation 
by Dr. John Abernathy, Dr. 
James Supak and Dr. Paul 

jUnger, and the other part 
,will be a series of presen­
tations by a number of 
chemical and equipment 
dealers.” The Hale County 
Soil and Water District 
sees this conference as an 
excellent opportunity for all 
producers to see and learn 
about new chemicals and 
spray equipment, such as 
the new Micro-Max and 
Electro-Dyne.

For more information 
contact the Hale County 
Soil and Water Conserva­
tion District at (806) 
296-2149.

Texas, Meyers received his 
bachelor’s degree in busi- 
ness/marketing in 1971 
from Texas Tech University 
in Lubbock. He began his 
career in U.S. government 
affairs in 1972, serving as 
legislative aide to Sen. 
Lloyd Bentsen (D-Texas).

In 1977, he joined USDA 
as its legislative liaison 
with the U.S. Senate prior 
to heading the depart­
ment’s congressional affairs 
office in 1978.

During the past two 
years, Meyers and his con­
sulting firm have been in­
volved in a variety of client 
services, including lobby­
ing, issues research, pro­
ject casework, congress­
ional and agency monitor­
ing, and legislative 
planning.

He and his wife, Kris, 
reside in Arlington, Va., a 
Washington suburb.

The Fertilizer Institute 
represents, by voluntary 
membership, more than 90 
percent of the nation’s fer­
tilizer industry. Producers, 
manufacturers, retailers, 
trading firms, and equip­
ment manufacturers who 
comprise its membership 
are served by a full-time 
Washington, D.C. staff in 
various legislative, educa­
tional and technical areas, 
as well a> with information 
and public relations pro­
grams. The association and 
its predecessor organiza­
tions this year mark 100 
years of service to this 
agricultural industry.
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ers must control weeds on 
idled acres. The rules 
state: A farm operator 
shall, in a timely manner, 
use needed control mea­
sures for erosion, insects, 
weeds and rodents on the 
conservation use acreage.” 
Failure to do so can result 
in a reduction or complete 
loss of program benefits. 
What are the control op­
tions? There are really only 
two: mechanical or
chemical.

Mechanical weed control 
could include clipping or 
tillage. Clipping does not 
kill weeds but can prevent 
them from setting seed and 
increasing future weed 
control problems. In the 
case of perennial weeds.

Circus Here 
Monday

The Boy Scout’s Grounds 
on the South end of Main 
Street in Muleshoe will 
provide the setting on 
Monday morning for the 
raising of the big top of the 
Fort Brothers Circus. Un­
leading will take place be­
tween 7 and 8 a.m. and 
the kids who are early- 
risers will get an opportun­
ity to see the big tent 
pulled into place between 9 
and 10 a.m.

The event is being spon­
sored by the Muleshoe 
Chamber of Commerce and 
Agriculture and will have 
two performances on that 
day. One performance is at 
6 p.m. and the other be­
gins at 8 p.m. Since, with 
the Easter Holidays at 
hand, so many businesses 
will have changed hours, 
tickets may be purchased 
in advance from Chamber 
directors, from the Cham­
ber office and at the Mule­
shoe State Bank, The Sonic 
Drive In will also have 
tickets for sale. Everyone is 
urged to buy their tickets 
ahead of time, since the 
Chamber only benefits from 
tickets sold prior to circus 
day.

Ford Brothers have been 
active since 1971 and plays 
more than 225 cities and 
towns in twenty states.

Two different short 
forms this year. 
H&R Block can 
uncomplicate 
them for you.

Two different short forms and new deductions 
make short form filing more complicated this 
year. Our preparers know the new tax laws and 
forms. We've studied them for months.

224 W. 2nd 

272-3332

The new tax l a w s . ___________ _____ _
This year’s number one reason to go to HM Block.

Weekdays 9-6 Sat. 9-5

H&R BLOCK

VALLEY GRAIN PRODUCTS
P.O. BOX 484 

Muleshoe, Texas

Valley Grain Products, Inc. is LOOKING FOR NEW 
GROWERS for the 1983 growing season.

We are OFFERING NEW MARKETS for corn.

We are in the process of completing our 60 million 
pound per year masa (corn flour) facility.

We are PAYING PREMIUM PRICES for human
consumption white and yellow food corn varieties.

We will be here ... after PIK is gone.

CALL: 272-5545 or 272-4636
ASK FOR: Jeff Smith or Max Crittenden 

Division Manager or Field Representative
Rr-MMrclicr. & Prorev.ois of Pn.innim Oh ilit/ Loin Piorhu I'.

clipping will not control 
growth of underground 
rootstock.

Tillage poses a number 
of problems. First, it’s ex­
pensive in terms of equip­
ment, fuel and labor. Se­
cond, it often compounds 
the problem by spreading 
the perennial’s reproductive 
root systems and by turn­
ing up annual weed seeds 
so they can germinate. 
Third, it enhances the opp­
ortunity for wind and water 
erosion, which must be 
controlled to comply with 
PIK regulations. A cover 
crop, which is required to 
protect the soil from ero­
sion unless a farmer re­
quests and receives ASCS 
permission to leave the 
ground as stubble from the 
previous crop, will not 
usually provide adequate 
supression of weed growth. 
Tillage as a means of weed 
control would only serve to 
destroy the soil conserva­
tion benefits of the cover 
crop or stubble.

It should be a farmer’s 
goal to keep expenses to a 
minimum on PIK idled 
acres, according to the un­
iversity weed control spec­
ialist. Complying with the

erosion and weed control 
requirements of the pro­
gram will incur some costs, 
so examine each expense 
carefully. While there’s no 
return on tillage costs, an 
investment in chemical 
weed control can pay div­
idends for several years to 
come.

By diverting acres with 
severe weed problems and 
making a small investment 
in a sound herbicide pro­
gram, growers can bring 
the weeds under control so 
the land can be returned to 
maximum production in fu­

ture years. And since the 
land is idle, farmers have 
maximum flexibility in both 
herbicide choice and app­
lication timing.

While the treatment sea­
son is still months away, a 
grower needs to plan now 
to set aside those fields, or 
portions of fields, with se­
vere weed problems, ad­
vises Dr. Wiese.

“ Then a good herbicide, 
program can accomplish 
significant reduction of the 
problem. For johnsongrass 
you’ll probably want to use 
Roundup.

“ Field bindweed, red- 
vine, trumpet creeper, 
pepperweed, milkvine and
silverleaf nightshade can 
best be controlled with 
either Banvel or Banvel
plus 2,4-D,” advises Dr. 
Wiese.

Dr. Wiese says that 
treating while the land is 
idle offers growers an ex­
cellent opportunity to re­
duce the population of 
many problem weeds, with 
the payoff coming in future 
crop yields.

*  *  *  *
It’s easier to sit back 

and criticize the do- 
gooders than to do some 
good.

Late Minute Taxpayers 
Wait To File Forms

“ About one-third of all 
taxpayers wait until April 
to file their federal tax re­
turn,” observed Diana 
Marmolejo, Volunteer In­
come Tax Assistance 
(VITA) Coordinator for 
Lubbock. “ That’s why our 
VITA sites are gearing up 
to assist those who need 
free return preparation. 
With the average refund at 
S650, we know there are 
lots of taxpayers anxious to 
file an accurate return tak­

ing advantage of all the tax 
breaks which may apply 
including the child care
credit, marriage deduction 
and Earned Income
Credit.”

Diana noted that last- 
minute filers, in their haste 
to make the April 15th 
deadline, sometimes make 
errors which will delay any 
refunds due.

* * * *
Kind, sincere words 

will take the average man 
or woman a long way
along the journey of life. 

* * * *
The unsatisifed, or 

envious member of a com­
munity, is always ready to 
tear down those who have 
something he or she 
wants--and doesn’t have.

N

For The Best Garden Or Flower Bed, 

Get Your Bedding Plants Now!

New Stock Weekly! Hanging Baskets, Too! 

Pick Up At

PIVOT PRODUCTS
Call 272-5134

West Of Muleshoe On Hwy. 84.
Home Delivery Available In Muleshoe 

On Full Flat Sales.
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White Declares 
Texas Job Safety, 
Health Week

M asa
M ix la

In a recent capital cere­
mony Texas Governor Mark 
White declared the week of 
April 24-30, 1983, as Texas 
Jot> Safety and Health 
Week. The special week of 
emphasis on job safety and 
health cooincides with the 
annual meeting of the 
1400-member Texas Safety 
Association.

The Texas Job Safety 
and Health Week gives 
special emphasis to the 
problems and opportunities 
of on-the-job safety. Each 
year hundreds of ^Texas 
workers are killed on the 
job ond* hundreds of thou­
sands of .worker* apply for 
Workers’ Compensation in­
surance benefits for the in­
juries they suffered on the 
job.

Members of the Texas 
Safety Association work to 
provide safer, healthier 
workplaces for all Texans 
through comprehensive 
safety training and educa­
tion. These efforts result in 
fewer deaths and disabling 
injuries on the job, in­
creased job productivity 
and lower operating and 
production costs.

Moisture 
Good In 
County Now

A recent check with the 
new Bailey County assis­
tant agent Kirby Rankin 
revealed to us, just what is 
going on now that PIK is 
over with. Good snows and 
underground moisture have 
put Bailey County farmers 
in pretty good shape acc­
ording to Rankin. However, 
the drying winds don’t help 
much.

Rankin stated that the 
wheat crop in the county is 
growing extremely well, 
with producers grazing lots 
of acreage. Cattle are 
growing well as a result of 
the good feed Rankin 
noted, and no bugs or in­
sects to speak of have been 
noted.

The extension agent said 
that some farmers have 
just recently began to pre­
water, but did not start 
until after the PIK program 
finally was settled up. He 
felt this in part was due to 
the fact that some, espec­
ially those who had made 
whole base bids, did not 
know just how much land 
they would be farming. 
Rankin stated that it ap­
peared that Bailey County 
producers had cut back 
some on their pre-watering 
programs.

Vegetables, other than 
hardy ones, have not yet 
been planted, although the 
agent has spotted some 
potato ground being read­
ied for planting.

All in ali, Rankin says 
that Bailey County is in 
excellent shape for mois­
ture, but unless the wind 
lays, the moisture will dry 
out rapidly. “ A good two 
or three inch rain would 
put us in really good shape 
for planting.”

The Texas Safety Asso­
ciation’s annual meeting, 
the Texas/Southwestern 
Safety Conference and Ex­
position, will be held at the 
' Houston Shamrock Hilton 
Hotel April 24-27. For more 
information about Texas 
Job Safety and Health 
Week or the Texas Safety 
Association annual meeting 
write: The Texas Safety 
Association, P.O. Box 9345, 
Austin, Texas 78766.

MULESHOE

M0N-FRI
8:30-6:00

GLASS & MIRROR
422 N. First 

272-3671
EMERGENCY (NIGHT)

1-505-763-5286

SAT
9:00-1:00

★  Glass Replacement-Home, Commercial 
★  M irrors & Windows, Cut To Size 

★P a t io  Doors & Repairs
StO ft F ro n t! VCom e By And Meet Layton & Roxanna Preist

T
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Prices
Effective

• Constructed with 2 super strong 
belts of steel cord under th e , 
tread and 2 tough Radial body 
plies of polyester cord give a 
smooth ride with flexibility and 
strength in the sidewalls.

• Aggressive Hi-Traction rubber 
compound flexibility at temper­
atures below freezing to maintain 
good traction on both wet and dry 
pavement

• Deep grooves produce good trac­
tion on curves and hills.

• Gives excellent driving perfor­
mance, and eliminates winter tire 
charge -ver

45C64 P235/75R15 
Reg. 80.19

Stock No. 4SC06 P155 80R13 Reg. 41.84. . .  
Stock No. 45C11 PI65/80R13 Reg. 49.77. . .  
Stock No. 45C13 P175/80R13 Reg 54.82. . 
Stock No 45C15 P185/80R13 Reg. 53.49 . 
Stock No S5C38 P1S5/75R14 Reg 61.36. . 
Stock No. 45C39 P195 75R14 Reg. 62.46. . . 
Stoc* Nu. 45C47 P205/75R14 Reg. 66.47.. .

• FREE BALANCING
• FREE MOUNTING  
•N O TRADE REQUIRED 
•FULL ROAD HAZARD
GUARANTEE

39.07 FET 1.51 
39.82 FET 1.67 
43.86 FET 1 77 
42.79 FET 1.88 
49.09 FET 1.99 
49.97 FET 2.14 
53.18 FET 2.29

Stock No. 45C60 P215/7SR14 Reg. 70.17. . 
Stock No. 45C66 P225/75R14 Reg. 72.15. 
Stock No. 45C34 P205 75R15 Reg. 68.21. . 
Stock No. 45C45 P215/75R15 Reg 72.64. . 
Stock No. 45C49 P225/75R15 Reg. 74.91. . 
Stock No. 45C64 P235/7SR15 Reg. 80.19

56.14 FET 2.42 
57.72 FET 2.59 
54.57 FET 2.39
58 I I  FET 2.51
59 93 FET 2.71 
64.1*3 FET 2.90

•OPTIONAL COMPUTER 
BALANCE ONLY$3.00 EA. 
•ADDITIONAL MOUNTING  
CHARGE ON ALL SPLIT 
RIMS

Classic Balled 2 + 2  Poly Blass .85 mmilewall
The combination at fiberglass 
oelis pnd body plies or 
pcyesteicord

( c m m s a i j )

2.7?

N5 64 P235/75B15
Reg. 57.54

Stock No. K5 06 PI55,80813 Reg 34.93 
Stock No. N5 11 P l(a '80613 Reg. 36.43 
Stock No. NS 13 P175/8QB13 Reg. 38.56. 
Stock No. N5-14 P1S5/80B13 Reg. 34.47.. 
Stock No. N5 38 P1SS/75814 Reg. 40 79 
Stock No. N5-39 P195/75814 keg. 42 54. 
Stock No. N5 47 P205/75B14 Reg. 47.36. 
Stock No N5 60 P215/75814 Reg. 48 65 
Stock No. N5-46 P225/75B14 Reg. 52.51. 
Stock No N5 34 P205/75B15 Reg. 50.92 
Stock No. Nb 45 P215/75B15 Reg. 53.56 
Stoc* No N5 49 P225/75B1S Reg. 56.09 
Stock No. N5 64 P235/75B15 Reg 57 54.

. 2/ 94 FET 1.52 
29.14 FET 1.5% 
’ 0 85 FET 1.7u 

.31.58 FET 1.79 

. 12.63 FET 1.86 

. 34 03 FET 2.00 

. 37.89 FET 2.11 
38.92 FET 2.24 

. 4? 01 FET 2.45 

. 40.74 FET 2.l3 

. 42.85 FET 2.37 
44.87 FET 2.52 

. 46.03 FET 2 72
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Lisa Wood, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Dan Wood 
and a member of the 
Sudan Hornette basketball 
team has received another 
honor, that of TABC All- 
State first team. She will 
be playing in the North- 
South Texas Coaches All 
Star Game in July in 
Lubbock. Lisa has been 
named All South Plains, All 
District, All South Plains 
Player of the Year, District 
Most Valuable Player, All- 
State Tournament and 
TABC All-State first team.

Tanya Bell, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Ray, 
was recently installed into 
the Kappa Delta Pi Nat­
ional Education Honor So­
ciety in the Theta Epsilon 
Chapter at Abilene Christ­
ian University on March 10 
in the University Library 
Auditorium. Tanya has
maintained a 3.0 average 
during her studies as
Junior Education major.

Mr. and Mrs. Glen
Cardwell were in New 
Home recently to take their 
two granddaughters, Krista 
and Danielle back to their 
home following a visit here 
with them and their aunt, 
Glenda.

**e

John Burnett has been 
transferred to the Veteran's 
Hospital in Amarillo where 
he ha* been seriously ill for 
several days.

•**
Mr. and Mrs. Dexter 

Baker were in Hereford 
Sunday to attend a family 
gathering honoring an 
uncle who was 92 years 
old.

***
Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy 

Kno,. of Abernathy visited 
Sunday with his parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. R.B. Knox 
and other family members.

***
Among those visiting in 

the home of Mrs. Dell 
Aycock during the weekend 
were her daughter, Tommy 
and Roy Keeters of Rui- 
doso, N.M. and her nieces 
and nephews, Dolly Porter 
and Tonnette of Clovis, 
N.M., Pete and Tommy 
Fulcher of Lariat, Reba 
Matthews and Fonda As- 
trander of Lubbock. They 
were also here to attend 
funeral services for their 
aunt, Pauline Fulcher.

* •*
Mr. and Mrs. Dan Wood 

and Lisa were in Amarillo 
during the weekend to 
watch some of the All Star
basketball games.

***
Jack Fisher has been a 

medical patient in the 
Amherst Hospital this 
week.

**•
Yvonne Pierce underwent 

surgery at St. Mary’s 
Hospital in Lubbock on 
Wednesday.

***
Bob Terry of Red River, 

N.M. visited recently with 
his mother, Mrs. Gladys 
Terry who has returned 
from the Amherst Hospital. 
She was in Arkansas where 
she was hospitalized for 
several days and then re­
turned home and was re­
admitted to the Amherst 
Hospital. She is recuperat­
ing at home now.

* •*
Louzelle Serratt has re­

turned home from Hico 
where she visited her son, 
Mr. and Mrs. Melvin Ser­
ratt and family. While 
there, Mr. and Mrs. Gay- 
Ion Beavers and Angie of 
Waco, formerly of Sudan, 
visited with her. They send 
their congratulations to the 
Sudan Homettes for winn­
ing State and a hello to all 
their friends. Also joining 
them for a visit was
Louzell's brother, Mr. and 
Mrs. Jim Brown of
Brownwood.

• • •
Mr. and Mrs. F.M. 

Smith have returned home 
from vacationing in Florida.

•**
Hazel Gaston has re­

turned from Ballinger 
where she visited relatives.

Elsie Cate has returned 
home from visiting family
members in Corsicana.

Mrs. Polly Hargrove has 
recently purchased the 
Clara Kent home at 400
Furneaux.

•**
Mrs. M.S. Lane, mother 

of Frank Lane has been a 
patient in the Methodist 
Hospital.

*«*

Mr. and Mrs. Hal Card- 
well returned Monday to 
their home in Greenville 
following a visit here last 
week with their son, Mr. 
and Mrs. Glen Cardwell 
and family.

The First Baptist Church 
will be holding a Sunrise 
Service at the church on 
Easter Sunday, April 3. 
That evening at 7:00 p.m. 
the film "Greater Than 
Gold" will be shown.

*•*
The Baptist revival 

meeting has been set for 
April 17-22 and a Stadium 
Crusade has been set for
July 24-28 this summer.

***
Mrs. J.K. Milam and 

Mrs. Jay Harper visited 
recently in Canyon with
their sister-in-law, Mrs.
Margaret Harper.

***
Mr. and Mrs. Claud 

Kropp visited in Hereford 
during the weekend with 
their children, Mr. and 
Mrs. John Kropp and fam­
ily and Mr. and Mrs.
Charles Minchew arid
family.

***
Faye Dorsey has been a 

patient in the Amherst 
Hospital this week.

***
Mr. and Mrs. Charlie 

Lyle of Houston has been 
visiting her parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Calvin Vernon 
and Shanda and grand­
parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Russell Ingle.

***
Becky Byerley student at 

Tech has been home during 
spring break with her par­
ents, Mr. and Mrs. Elray 
Rasco.

t u
Mr. and Mrs. Morris 

Phillips of Muleshoe visited 
Sunday with their daught­
er, Mr. and Mrs. Jerry 
Cox, Jamie who is home 
for spring break from 
WTSU and Danene. They 
all had dinner at Chick-n- 
Sea Sunday.

***
Mr. and Mrs. Billy 

Hanna visited recently in 
Petersburg with their son, 
Mr. and Mrs. Larry Hanna 
and children.

***
Mr. and Mrs. Halbert 

Harvey visited recently 
with their daughter, Cheryll 
in Fort Worth and in San 
Angelo with their son, 
Ryan Dale.

•*#
Ruby Fulcher has re­

turned home from the
Muleshoe hospital where 
she had been a patient for 
several days.

•**
Mr. and Mrs. Larry 

Durham and family of
Lubbock and Mr. and Mrs. 
Ronnie Hill and boys of 

-Hobbs, N.M. visited during 
the weekend with their
parents, Mr. and Mrs.
Connie Hill and Sandra.

**•
Mr. and Mrs. James 

Withrow and Mr. and Mrs. 
Wayne Seart visited in 
Amarillo recently with the 
Don Ham family. Ruth 
Ham underwent by-pass 
surgery at the St. An­
thony's Hospital where she 
remains a patient and is 
reportedly doing well at 
this time.

***
Mrs. Muriel Crouch, El­

sie Seymore and Mr. and 
Mrs. Van Seymore and 
children were in Post Sun­

day to pick up Elsie's 
grandson, Jeffry Mc- 
Andrews of Abilene. While 
there they also visited Mrs. 
Inez Grantham, a former 
Sudan resident.

•**
Mr. and Mrs. Wayne 

Doty were in Lubbock Sat­
urday to visit her sister, 
Mr. and Mrs. Claude Pat­
ton. Patton recently under­
went heart surgery and it 
was reported that he is 
doing well.

Mrs. Dorothy Drake has 
been in Florida the past 
several days to be with her 
sister who was ill. Follow­
ing the death of her sister, 
she remained there for ser­
vices and a longer visit.

***
Mrs. Byron Lynn has re­

turned home from visiting 
in Fort Worth with her 
daughter, Mr. and Mrs. 
Bobby Alfred and Paula 
Jones and son.

Herb Potter remains a 
patient in the Amherst 
Hospital.

Raegan May, Tech stu­
dent was home during the 
spring break with his par­
ents, Mr. and Mrs. Ray 
May. ***

Wendy Knox, daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy 
Knox of Abernathy spent 
some of the weekend with 
her aunt, Mr. and Mrs. Bill 
Kuykendall and attended 
the birthday party for her
cousin, Missy, on Saturday. 

***
Missy Kuykendall was 

honored Saturday on her 
seventh birthday with a 
skating party held at the 
Skate Ranch in Lubbock.

Refreshments of cup­
cakes, ice cream and cokes 
were served to each guest. 
Others attending were her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Bill 
Kuykendall and her bro­
ther, Len, a cousin, Wendy 
Knox of Abernathy, and 
Jan Smith, Charlie and 
Joe, Brooke Baker. Heather 
Harrison, Heather Hough­
ton, Chad King, Bennie 
Baker, David Damron, Ja­
cob Fisher and Kelli Baker. 

***
Hoyt Robertson resigned 

as Mayor of Sudan for per­
sonal reasons on February 
28. 1983 to be effective
April 1, 1983.

***
Charles Scott Church­

man, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Scott Churchman of Mule­
shoe was honored Sunday 
with a party on his third 
birthday. Following a din­
ner served at his home for 
his grandmother. Patty 
Bausman and his uncle 
David Bausman of Ama­
rillo, his other grand­
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Gil­
bert Churchman joined 
them for a birthday party. 
Birthday cake and goodies
were served.

***
Mrs. E.C. Minyard spent 

the weekend in Dallas with 
Mr. and Mrs. Ron Milliken 
and Mr. and Mrs. R.D. 
Ormand.

Basketball Camp Will 
Feature Tech Coach

THREE AND FOUR YEAR OLDS-At the recent Tumbling Meet held here three and four 
year olds competing included (from left) Vikas Mittal, Jason Rasco, Mark McGuire, Taylor 
Robinson, Jason Barron, Aaron Purdy and James Cox. Not pictured, Cory Williams.

President Urged ToReconsider 
Costly Cotton Decision

The Gerald Myers Sum­
mer Basketball Camp will 
be instructed this year by 
Tech basketball coach 
Meyers and his staff, as 
well as several outstanding 
high school and college 
coaches.

The camp will be held on 
the campus of Lubbock 
Christian College and three 
separate weeks are plann­
ed. The camps will begin 
in June and run until July 
1; then in July 17 to July 
22 and July 31 to August 
5. Fees for residence camp 
are $175, for day camp 
$150 and a deposit of $25 
is required for registration.

Workouts will be held in 
the LCC *Fieldhouse with 
meals provided at the coll­
ege cafeteria. Resident 
campers are housed in air 
conditioned dorms. Boys 
who attend will be taught 
the fundamentals of shoot­
ing, dribbling, passing and 
individual moves plus the 
strategy of the game. More

advanced drills and techni­
ques will be taught older 
players. Individual attention 
will be stressed for all 
boys.

The camp is open to 
boys in elementary (9 years 
or older) junior high, and 
high school junior varsity. 
According to the rules of 
the Texas University Inter- 
scholastice League, a cam­
per may not be a member 
of a high school varsity 
team.

For further information, 
phone 806/742-3367 or 
write to the Gerald Meyers 
Basketball Camp, c/o 
Texas Tech University, P. 
O. Box 4199, Lubbock, Tx 
79409.

Buried Treasure 
There must be a lot of 

good in some people, 
when you consider how 
little has ever come out of 
them.

-National News.

U S. Rep. Kent Hance, 
D-Texas, today urged the 
Reagan Administration to 
reconsider a decision that 
could rob cotton farmers to 
the tune of 600,000 bales of 
a needed foreign market.

In a letter to President 
Reagan, the Texas Demo­
crat asked the President to 
reconsider a decision 
reached by a sub-cabinet 
level group to deny South 
Korea $20 million of 
"blended credit.” The De­
partment of Agriculture has 
a $1.5 billion fund to use to

encourage foreign countries 
to buy U.S. agriculture 
commodities. The interest- 
free direct government 
credit is "blended" with 
commercial bank credit of­
fered under the Commodity 
Credit Corporation export 
credit guarantee program 
to achieve overall lower in­
terest rates.

Hance said he did not 
understand how the U.S. 
could deny such credit to 
South Korea, a country that 
has an excellent creuit 
history with the U.S., and

Comptroller Warns Of 
Deficit Finance Dangers

State Comptroller Bob 
Bullock Tuesday said the 
State of Illinois’ loss last 
week of its coveted Triple- 
A bond rating "should be a 
clear warning to Texans of 
the dangers of deficit 
financing.”

Last Thursday Standard 
and Poor’s Corporation 
lowered its rating of Illinois 
bonds in what Governor 
James Thompson called "a  
warning for us to get our, 
fiscal house in order."

" I ’ve called deficit state 
financing the fast lane to 
nowhere,” Bullock said. 
" I ’m reporting the Illinois 
situation because it’s the 
kind of danger that is right 
around the corner for Texas 
unless we stay on the pay- 
as-you-go plan.

"The State of Illinois has 
a $300 million deficit and 
might have to take out 
short term loans to cover 
it,” Bullock pointed out. 
“ In Texas, our Governor is 
saying the only way he can 
balance his budget is with 
$700 million worth of bonds 
and $800 million worth of

tax increases. What is hap­
pening in Illinois right now 
ought to change his mind 
about bonds to cover a 
deficit."

Early this week Bullock 
issued a report from his 
office showing that Gover­
nor Mark White’s proposal 
to finance $700 million in 
highway construction with
bonds would cost the state 
$100 million a year in debt 
service and could jeopar­
dize Texas’ Triple-A rating, 
which insures the lowest 
interest rates available on 
Texas veteran and water 
bonds.

"Trying to balance our 
state budget on these 
bonds is a fiscal shell 
game,” Bullock said.

especially since such
blended credit entails no 
additional government 
expenditures.

"The decision to exclude 
South Korea from using 
‘blended credit’ will perpe­
tuate the loss of foreign 
markets accessible to U.S. 
agricultural commodities,” 
Hance wrote. " I ’m sure 
you would agree that 
maintaining trade relations 
with dependable partners is 
just as important as dev­
eloping new trade partners. 
It is much easier and less 
costly to maintain an es­
tablished market than to 
regain a lost market.”

Hance also noted that 
the U.S. share of the South 
Korean cotton market has 
fallen from 95% in July
1982 to 79.8% in February
1983 "And if the trend 
continues, Mr. President, 
the annual loss for cotton 
farmers in Texas and 
across the nation could to­
tal 600.000 bales by the 
end of the 1985 marketing 
year.”

The Texas Democrat also 
expressed concern that the 
Administration’s decision 
would "cause an even 
greater decline in our share 
of South Korea’s cotton 
market and have an 
adverse impact on the 
United States cotton in­
dustry. I would appreciate 
your consideration of my 
concern in this matter and 
I look forward to hearing 
from you

ferti-lomeferti-lome

FEED

BEFORE

LEAVES

APPEAR

Specifically
designed

for
Special

Gardeners

ferti-lome. [ ferti-lome.
GET THE GREEN BACK

ferti-lome
Chelated Liquid Iron or Soil Acidifier

BAKER
Farm Supply

1532 W. American 272-4613

24-HOUR PLUMBING 
SERVICE

LEAL S PLUMBING

272-3588

Jmtlmue. ThmVaSut.
M AROW ARf S TO R E S M A R O W A R fS TO R E S

BARGAIN
O F THE M O N TH

TOOL VALUE
or THE MONTH

c ■> SSrVSS
pis .
S i t /

While
Supplies

LastSupplies
Last

2%-Gal. Gasoline Can
No top, side seams Galva­
nized steel 7-in spout SP-2V? 

Quantities Limited

32-Gal. Trash Container
Tough molded construction 
With snap on lid 7332 TV 

Quantities Limited

Long Handle 
Round Point Shovel
Ideal lot gardening landscap 
mg 48 in handle SLRCSU 

Quantities Limited

F ry  &  Cox, . %

401 S . 1st 272-4511

TIRE & SERVICE

U

P15S-13
KZXT

W H ITE W A L L

Brake Service
Front Disc
•P a c k  front 

bearings  
•Turn  rotors  
•R e p la c e  

front
disc pads

s59.95
Mott American Care

A lignm ent
•S e t toe-in 
•In sp ect tires  
•A d ju st caster  

and cam ber

FET: M.80 *11.9
SIZE SUGGESTED SALE
P 1 55/80 13 X Z X T S77.20 S49.00
P185/75-13 X Z X W W T 82 53 5 6  0 0
P195/75-14 XW W T 121.23 7 9 .0 0
P20S/75-14 " 129.38 84.00
P215/75-14 13473 88.00
P205/75-15 X A W W T 131.63 8600
P215/75-15 XW W T 13715 89.00
P225/7515 141.73 94.00
P235/75 15 148,63 99.00
FET : S1.SO-2.86 WHITEWALL

M o tt  A m e ric a n  C a r t

Shocks
Heavy Duty

•  Famous 
Brand

•  Lifetim e  
Warranty

•  Installation  
Available

M IC H E L IN
LIGHT TRUCK TIRE

*16.99____  Each

Battery
24 M onth
•Group 24

700-15 
X C A  8 p ly

F E T :  ‘3 .5 6

PEACE OF M IND Ask about it
Com plete Road H azard P ro te ctio n  at Shook.

*29.95
Plus exchange battery

C u s t o m  w h e e l s

*25AS
tow

Prices good thru April 2, 1983
FREE  MOUNTING! [ 301 North First • 27: 

Manager: John Rob

Sudan News 

B y Evelyn Ritchie
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At Muleshoe Junior High

IIEDIAG INFOIMATION’

Nursing Home
News

By:
Joy StMncell

visited her Wed.
• ••

Eighth Grade Girls 
Host Muleshoe Meet

Muleshoe eighth grade 
girls hosted an internat­
ional track meet on March 
18 at which they placed 
first overall.

440 Relay, Shannon Pel- 
ton 2nd place, Casey,King 
2nd place, Debbie Isaac 
2nd place, Lisa Black 2nd 
place.

880 Relay, Iris Lopez 2nd 
place, Jana Brown 2nd 

,* place, Debbie Isaac 2nd . 
place, Tisha Cox 2nd place.

Mile Relay, Shannon 
Pelton 1st place, Iris Lopez 
1st place, Tisha Cox 1st 
place, Debbie Isaac 1st 
place.

1600 m. run, Norma 
Castorena 1st place, Mary 
Jane Recto 2nd place, 
Linda Recio 3rd place.

880 Run, Susan Mendoza 
2nd place, Tina Reid 3rd 
place, Maggie Navejar 6th 
place.

100 yard dash, Lisa Black 
3rd place, Jearldean Lewis 
5th place.

400 yard dash, Kathy 
Horn 2nd place.

200 yard dash, Shannon 
Pelton 1st place, Lisa Black 
3rd place, Jearldean Lewis 
6th place.

Hurdles, Jana Brown 4th 
place, Debbie Isaac 5th 
place.

V High Jump, Debbie Isaac 
v4th place, Casey King 5th 
place.

Long jump, Shannon 
Pelton 5th place.

Shot, Jill Hamilton 3rd 
place, Maggie Navejar 6th
place.

Discus, Tisha Cox 4th 
place.

Seventh grade athletes 
recently participated in 

-track -meets on March 18 
and 2ff. and placed first 
overall in both meets. 
Muleshoe hosted the meet 
on March 18 and placed 
first with 163 points, foll­
owed by Friona in second 
place with 154 points. 
Muleshoe 7th graders com­
piled a total of 169 points 
at the Abernathy meet, 
followed by 2nd place 
Canyon with 98 points.

Individual winners in­
cluded: 1600 m. run. Quay 
Gregory 1st, Caroline Liles 
3rd, Elizabeth Posados 4th. 
400 m. relay, Muleshoe 
team 5th (Sawnya Bran- 
scum, Amy Bean, Elena 
Perez, Michelle Stevenson). 
800 m. dash, Quay Gregory 
1st, Elizabeth Posados 4th, 
Caroline Liles 3rd. 100 m. 
hurdles, Melissa Burnett 
4th, Lisa Laredo 2nd. 800 
m. relay, Muleshoe Team 
1st (Jennifer Green, Kim 
Glover, Carey Gonzales, 
Michelle Stevenson). 400 
m. dash, Lisa Laredo 2nd. 
200 m. dash, Karen Kenn- 
emer 2nd. 1600 m. relay, 
Muleshoe Team 1st (Amy 
Bean, Carey Gonzales, 
Stacy Haley, Jennifer 
Green). Long jump, Sawnya 
Branscum 2nd, Karen 
Kennemer 3rd. Shot put, 
Michelle Stevenson 2nd, 
Kim Glover 4th. Triple 
jump, Karen Kennemer 
4th, Caroline Liles 5th. 
Discus, Kim Glover 3rd, 
Emilie Martinez 5th, Torey 
Cox 6th. High Jump, 

4.................................•............. I
: :
j Lisa ’s Lines ;
: by Lls&* f

Hamilton \

This week has really 
been fun. Everyone is get­
ting pretty excited because 
there is only 8 or 9 more 
weeks of school.

The Annual Staff is 
sponsoring another movie. 
The movie will be Davy 
Crocket and there will be 
three cartoons also. The 
ftiovie will be shown on 
April 13 and admission will 
be 75 cents.

The annuals will be com­
ing in pretty soon and we 
can't wait to sec how good 
they will be.

Everyone took their Cal­
ifornia Achievement Tests 
and most of us are hoping 
they will be good.

Knowledge without wis­
dom can destroy the earth.

Michelle Stevenson 5th.
ABERNATHY MEET 

200 m. dash, Karen 
Kennemer 1st, Michelle 
Stevenson 3rd, Tanya No­
well 6th. 1600 m. dash, 
Quay Gregory 1st, Caroline 
Liles 2nd, Elizabeth Posa­
das 3rd. 100 m. dash, Kar­
en Kennemer 1st, Elena 
Perez 6th. 100 m. low 
hurdles, Misti Treadway 
3rd, Lisa Laredo 6th. 800 
m. dash. Quay Gregory 
2nd. 1600 m. relay, Mule­
shoe Team 1st (Amy Bean, 
Carey Gonzales, Stacey 
Haley, Karen Kennemer). 
800 m. relay, Muleshoe 
team 1st, (Tanya Nowell, 
Kim Glover, Carey Gon­
zales, Michelle Stevenson). 
400 m. relay, Muleshoe 
team 4th (Sawnya Bran- 
scum, Amy Bean, Elena 
Perez, Michelle Stevenson). 
Discus, Emilie Martinez 
5th, Kim Glover 3rd. Shot 
put, Michelle Stevenson 
2nd, Kim Glover 6th. Tri­
ple jump, Karen Kennemer

5th. Long jump, Sawnya 
Branscum 3rd. High jfimp, 
Amy Bean 1st.

The MJHS track girls 
entered a meet in Abern­
athy March 26 and placed 
second, competing against
six other teams. Abernathy 
placed first with 182 points, 
and Muleshoe had 110.

Individual winners in­
cluded: 800 m. relay,
Muleshoe team 3rd (Tisha 
Cox, Debbie Isaac, Casey 
King, Lisa Black). 400 m. 
relay, Muleshoe team 3rd 
(Shannon Pelton, Casey
King, Debbie Isaac, Lisa 
Black). 400 dash, Kathy
Horn 2nd, Shannon Crozier 
5th. 100 m. dash, Lisa 
Black 3rd. 800 m. run, Iris 
Lopez 3rd, Norma Castor­
ena 4th, Susan Mendoza 
6th. Mile relay, Muleshoe 
team 1st (Shannon Pelton, 
Kathy Horn, Tisha Cox, 
Debbie Isaac). 1600 m. run, 
Norma Castorena 2nd, 
Mary Jane Recio 6th. 200 
dash, Shannon Pelton 2nd, 
Jearldean Lewis 6th. Triple 
jump, Jana Brown 2nd, 
Debbie Isaac 4th. High 
Jump, Debbie Isaac 4th. 
Long Jump, Tisha Cox 4th, 
Hurdles, Tisha Cox 5th.

Seventh Grade Boys 
Win At Earth Meet

MJHS seventh grade 
boys competed in the 
Springlake-Earth track meet 
March 26 and captured 
first place in overall points. 
Fifteen teams participated 
in the meet.

Individual placings for 
Muleshoe were: 440 yd re­
lay, Muleshoe team 3rd 
(Salinas, Mendoza, Sanc­
hez, Del Toro). Mile relay, 
Muleshoe team 1st (Simn- 
acher, Mendoza, Del Toro, 
Leyva). 220 yd. dash, Joel 
Leyva 3rd. 330 yd. dash, 
Joel Leyva 1st, Shannon 
Simnacher 6th. 120 yd. im. 
hurdles, Joe Mendoza 1st. 
660 yd. run, Jesus Agundis 
2nd. 1320 yd. run. Greg 
Garcia 1st, Jesus Agundis 
3rd, Andy Olivarez 4th. 
Long jump, Joel Leyva 5th. 
Discus, Jedon Ruthardt 1st, 
Jesus Agundis 4th.

Coach Hargis comment­
ed, “ This was the most 
exciting win we've had this 
year. We had to come from 
behind to beat Slaton for 
the team trophy, but the 
boys rose to the occasion 
and we won the track 
meet. It was a tremendous 
effort and 1 was very proud 
of the team.”

Eighth grade boys com­
peted in the Springlake- 

. Earth track meet, March 
26. and placed 2nd in

overall points. Individual 
ranking included: 440 Re­
lay, Williams, Black, Lewis, 
Garcia 3rd. Mile Relay, 
Williams, Black, Perez, 
Garcia 6th. 220 Dash, Jesse 
Garcia 2nd, Mike Cavasos 
6th. 330 Dash, Chris Harris 
3rd. Long Jump, Jesse 
Garcia 4th. Shot Put, Fran­
cisco Ybarra 6th. Discus, 
Sidney Lewis 2nd. 660 
Dash, Demtrio Guillen 3rd, 
David Medlin 6th. 1320 
Run, David Medlin 3rd, 
Demtrio Guillen 4th.

CANCER DEATHS
An unusually large num­

ber of deaths from brain can­
cer and other tumors of the 
head among workers at the 
Rocky Flats nuclear weapons 
plant sparked new calls re­
cently for independent moni­
toring of the nation's atomic 
program.

Mrs. Kemp has returned 
to the nursing home after 
being hospitalized. Wel­
come back Mrs. Kemp 
members of her family vis­
ited her Wed.

***
Ruby Gare is in the 

hospital at this time. Hurry 
and get well.

**•«
<*• Effie Smith spent the 
weekend in Clovis in the
home of her neice.

♦**
C.W. Wilhite, Floyd 

Ruthardt, Ruth Shipp, Lena 
Hawkins, Maud Kersey 
visited the nursing home 
last week.

•**
Mr. Laney has returned 

to the nursing home after 
being hospitalized. His wife 
and Eva Atwood visited 
him Wed.

•••
The Muleshoe Church of 

Christ came to Sing to the 
Residents Sun. afternoon.

Cleo Bellar spent the 
weekend with her family in 
Sudan.

«««
Jackie Johnson and her 

two little daughters visited 
the nursing home Wed. 
Jackie read to the residents 
in our group meeting.

• ••
Bunnie Hurd was visited 

by Mr. and Mrs. William 
Edmiston and family of 
Georgetown, Tex. Wed. 
afternoon.

*•*
Cordelia Cochran was by 

her brother and sister-in- 
law Mr. and Mrs. D.J. 
Coffman of Rotan, N.H. 
Wed. Mrs. Jewel Strong

Joins Staff
The executive director of 

Lena Pope Home, Alice 
DeMent has announced 
that Roy and Debbie 
Puente have joined the 
staff as Family Teachers of 
one of the boys group 
homes on the Lena Pope 
campus in Fort Worth.

Puente is the son of Rev. 
and Mrs. Rockey Puente of 
202 East Birch in Muleshoe 
and is a graduate of Mule­
shoe High School.

Lena Pope Home is a 
residential treatment fac­
ility for approximately 40 
adolescents who come from 
backgrounds of extreme 
abuse and neglect.

The Puentes worked at 
the Texas Boys’ Ranch 
while Roy attended Texas 
Tech University. They have 
three children, Josh, Hanna 
and Leslie.

±
B U I C K
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ROBERT D. GREEN, INC.
2400 W w t A— rlc—  B M . 

M U lE S H O t. T E X A S  70147

OLDSMOBILf —  BUICK —  PONTIAC —  GMC

TERRY YELL
Sales Representative 

Business Phone
806 272-4588 
505 762-2772

Home Phone 
806 272-4948

Quality Products at A 
Low Price For 

Farm Bureau 
Members!

mep com
PLAT CENTERB E  S U R E  T O  H A V E  

Y O U R  M E M B E R S H I P  C A R D  W I T H
For Additional Information. Contact:

CHISEL
SPIKES
Y O U

Baker Farm Supply
272-4613

Mrs. Beard went out 
with her brother W.O. 
Glover Tues. morning.

e*«
Mrs. Bertie Hendrix 

spent Sun. with her family, 
Judy Logsdon picked her 
up at the nursing home.

•••
Annie Dunn went out 

with her daughter Benny 
Sun.

Abraham Garcia was vis­
ited by several of his fam­
ily members Wednesday 
afternoon.

Mr. and Mrs. D.B. Head 
Lana and Bryce Embry vis­
ited Dot Wilterding Wed. 

***
Marie Engram was vis­

ited by Sonia Florace, Lav- 
erne Stephenson, Hazel 
Randolph, Wilma Waddle, 
Jessie Robinson, Rev. Bill 
Kent, Maud Kersey, Nan 
Gatlin, Nelda Merriott, 
Susie Vela, Joann Head, 
Lynn Campbell.
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Federal Land Bank Shows 
*2.4 Billion Loan Increase

Mr. and Mrs. James B. 
Glaze of Muleshoe have 
just returned from Houston 
where he represented the 
Federal Land Bank Assoc­
iation of Muleshoe at the 
38th Annual Stockholders’ 
Meeting.

The meeting, held at the 
Westin Oaks Hotel, was 
attended by members of 
the 55 Federal Land Bank 
Associations in Texas, with 
approximately 450 persons 
in attendance at the March 
25 meeting.

The Federal Land Bank 
of Texas, the state’s lar­
gest, long-term farm mort­
gage lender, released its 
1982 annual report during 
the meeting, showing $2.4 
billion in outstanding loans, 
an 11.3 percent increase 
over 1981.

According to Land Bank

President Thomas H. Ben­
son, while low commodity 
prices, high interest rates 
and rising production costs 
combined to create a year 
of adversity for farmers 
served by the Texas Land 
Bank, the rate of delinque-

NEWS

S  ™ * s
Ronald Reagan, P resi­

dent:
“ It would be wrong to 

ignore the facts of history 
and the aggressive im­
pulses of an evil empire to 
simply call the arms race a 
giant misunderstanding."

ncies and foreclosures re­
mained low due to the 
Bank's policy of working 
with member borrowers.

The Federal Land Bank 
of Texas is part of the 
nationwide Farm Credit 
System, the nation’s largest 
private cooperative lending 
institution. The Federal 
Land Bank Association of 
Muleshoe makes and ser­
vices loans in this area.

Members of the board of 
directors in Muleshoe are: 
Gorden Duncan, Muleshoe, 
Jim Claunch, Bula, James 
Glaze, Muleshoe, Arlin 
Hartzog, Bovina, William 
Gromowsky. Others from 
this area who attended the 
meeting are: Mr. and Mrs. 
William Gromowsky, Bill 
Liles, President.

BRING YOUR 
GARDENING PROBLEMS 

TO US.
|We have the answer-THE ORTHO 
PROBLEM SOLVER. The most comprehen­
sive reference book ever compiled, with:
■ Solutions to nearly 2.000 gardening 

problems
■ Expert advice on weeds, pests, diseases, 

even soil and climate problems
■ Full-color photography, thorough written 

analysis, and advice on future prevention
THE ORTHO PROBLEM SOLVER. It’s easy 
to use, easy to understand and available 
now for our customers.

Fry & Co, .
401 s. 1st 272-4511

Real Estate Foreclosure Sale
Property formerly known as Charlie’s Originals 
located at 109 S. First Street, Muleshoe, Texas.

Legal Description:

PLACE Bailey County Courthouse, Muleshoe. 
Texas
DATE April 5, 1983 
TIME 10:00 A.M.

TERMS: The real estate will be sold for cash to 
highest bidder. Sold subject to all taxes due 
thereon. Title will be conveyed by substitute 
trustee’s deed.
For information contact Nell Luck, Small Busi­
ness Administration, 1611 10th St., Lubbock. 
Texas 79401. Phone 806-743-7471

LEGAL DESCRIPTION:
A part of the South One-Half (S/2) of Section 
Number Forty (40), Block "Y ” , W.D. & F.W., 
Johnson’s Subdivision No. 2, and being more 
particularly described by metes and bounds as 
follows:
BEGINNING at a point 80 feet North 54° 53’ 
West from the Southwest Corner of Block Num­
ber Eight (8), WARREN ADDITION No. 2 to the 
Town of Muleshoe, Bailey County, Texas; 
THENCE N. 35° 07’ East 100 feet to the South­
erly right of way line of the Pecos and Northern 
Texas Railway;
THENCE N. 54° 53’ W. with said right of way 
line 186 feet to a point;
THENCE S. 35° 07’ W. 90 feet to the Northerly 
right of way line of U.S. Highway No. 70-84; 
THENCE S. 54° 53’ E. 151 feet with said 
highway right of line;
THENCE S. 35° 07’ W. 10 feet to concrete 
marker;
THENCE S. 54° 53’ E. 35 feet to the Place of 
Beginning, including one-half (*/a) of the oil, gas 
and other minerals.

“Well, I’ll tell you what I’m doing. I’m cutting 
back on my corn acres. How ’bout you?”

"Planting less com , 
but m ore XL-73 and 
XL-72aa"
“Do you really 
have that much 
confidence in 
them?”

“Sure do.
Can’t beat them 
for the way 
they yield and 
stand up in the 
weather. And 
that XL-73 pro­
duces top-quality 
grain every time.”

“Sounds good to me. But do you have any kind of 
performance data?”

“Right here. And take a look at T1230 while 
you’re at it. It’s another consistent hybrid you’ll want 
to try.”

“I see what you mean. This is mighty convincing.” 
“You’ll be even more 

convinced when you plant 
them on your own farm, and 
prove it to yourself.”

DEKALB-PFIZER 
GENETICS

3100 Sycamore Road • DeKalb, IL 60115

"D E K A L B "  Is a registered brand nam e N um be rs  designate hybrids As a co nd itio n  of sale, please 
note statement of lim ited warranty and  rem edy on D E K A L B -P F IZ E R  G E N E T I C S  orders and tags

local corn grower talks with bis DEKALB-PFIZER 
GENETICS dealer about top-yielding hybrids
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High Plains Aquifer Water OK For Irrigation, Drinking
High Plains aquifer water 

from about 80 percent of 
the eight-state area under­
lain by the aquifer has sal­
inity low enough to permit 
general use of the water, 
barring other problems, to 
irrigate most crops, accord­
ing to a report published 
by the U.S. Geological 
Survey.

Water from this 80 per­
cent of the aquifer area 
also meets U.S. Environ­
mental Protection Agency 
drinking-water standards 
for dissolved-solids concen­
trations. Amounts of diss­
olved solids in water are 
also used to measure sal­
inity levels.

Water from most of the 
remainder of the aquifer, 
although higher in salinity 
as measured by dissolved 
solids, can be used for irr­
igation of most crops if 
soils are permeable enough 
and if farmers take special 
precautions to prevent salt 
buildup in soils, says the 
report, which is accompan­
ied by a map.

There are isolated areas 
in the High Plains aquifer, 
however, where salinity is 
too high, because of either 
natural or man-caused con­
ditions, to permit success­
ful use of the water for 
irrigation.

Generally, salinity levels 
increase from north to 
south in the 174,000 square 
miles underlain by the 
aquifer in parts of South 
Dakota, Nebraska, Wyom­
ing, Kansas, Colorado, Ok­
lahoma, Texas and New 
Mexico. The High Plains 
aquifer, which consists of 
the Ogallala Formation and 
associated rocks, is the 
principal source of water 
over most of its area for 
municipal and domestic use 
as well as for irrigation.

Ground-water levels in 
most parts of the aquifer 
have been falling since' 
World War II, mainly be­
cause of extensive irriga­
tion. Local and area econ­
omies in many parts of the 
region are heavily depen­
dent on irrigated agricul­
ture, which includes about 
170,000 wells irrigating 
about 25,000 square miles 
(16 million acres).

The dissolved solids map 
and text and a companion 
map and text on sodium 
concentrations in the High 
Plains aquifer are part of a 
five-year U.S. Geological 
Survey study of (he aquifer 
begun in 1977. The study 
should provide a better 
understanding of the aqui­
fer so that its water re­
sources can be more wisely 
used and conserved. Com­
puter models will be dev­

eloped to predict aquifer 
response to possible future 
changes in ground-water 
development and use.

Noel C. Krothe, a USGS 
hydrologist in Denver, 
Colo., and principal author 
of the report, said most 
crops can tolerate water 
containing as much as 500 
milligrams per liter (mg/L) 
of dissolved solids without 
adverse effect. Solids in­
clude calcium, sodium, sul­
fate, chloride and other 
minerals that, in the main, 
are dissolved from surr­
ounding rocks.

Dissolved solids concen­
trations of 500 to 1,500 
mg/L in irrigation water 
are not likely to be harmful 
if leaching or drainage is 
adequate, Krothe added.

He explained that if soil 
is permeable enough or 
drainage is adequate, salts 
left behind in soil from 
earlier irrigation water will 
be leached or dissolved 
from the soil and flushed 
out to drainageways or 
down to lower soil levels by 
new applications of irriga­
tion water. He added, 
however, that farmers may 
have to take steps to en­
sure proper drainage and 
may have to apply more 
irrigation water than need­
ed by crops in order to 
provide enough water for 
this flushing effect and to 
prevent salt buildup in 
soils.

Areas with water con­
taining more than 1,000 
mg/L dissolved solids in­
clude parts of Howard, 
Glasscock, Midland, Mar­
tin, Andrews, Gaines, 
Dawson, Lynn, Terry, 
Yoakum, Lubbock, Hockley 
and Lamb counties in 
Texas; Beaver County in 
Oklahoma; Kearny, Finney 
and Gray counties in Kan­
sas, Kiowa County in Colo­
rado; Wayne, Stanton, Lin­
coln and Keith counties in 
Nebraska; and Goshen 
County in Wyoming.

The maximum concentra­
tion of dissolved solids 
found during the study was 
20,200 mg/L in Gaines 
County, Texas, caused by 
contamination from disposal 
of oil-field brines in surface 
pits. Most concentrations of 
dissolved solids are caused 
by natural conditions, how­
ever, such as when water 
dissolves materials from 
surrounding rocks or when 
saline water from lower 
depths leaks into the 
aquifer.

The dissolved solids text 
includes a table showing 
chemical analyses of water 
samples from 15 sites in 
the High Plains aquifer.

The table shows that

TH ESE VARIETIES 
HAVE PROVEN 
THEM SELVES IN

$A\ \ &
c O °

0 4  OA  Superior standability Consistent, excellent 
^  yields under a wide range of conditions

Excellent stress tolerance

0 4  Q C  Consistent performer with high yield potential 
&  1 0 0  T a ll, showy hybrid that produces hard- 

textured, heavy grain Excellent standability 
and disease resistance

0 04 4 High yield potential under widely varying 
^  1 1 conditions Excellent stress tolerance Excel­

lent hybrid for silage, too

Gene Paul Jarman 
Route 1, Box 84A 

•ioneer. Muleshoe, Texas
Phone 806/965-2340• A A N O ’ M t O *

EPA drinking-water stand­
ards for dissolved-solids 
concentrations were ex­
ceeded for water samples 
from Niobrara County, 
Wyo. (678 mg/L); Kiowa 
County, Colo. (2,140 
mg/L); Barton County, 
Kan. (694 mg/L); Meade 
County, Kan. (900 mg/L); 
Gaines County, Texas (507 
mg/L); and a second place 
in Gaines County, Texas 
(3,970 mg/L).

The table also shows that 
EPA drinking-water stand­
ards were exceeded for 
sulfate, chloride and fluo­
ride concentrations in water 
samples from Gaines 
County, Texas; and for sul­
fate and fluoride concen­
trations in water samples 
from Kiowa County, Colo.

EPA drinking-water 
standards for nitrate also 
Were exceeded in water 
samples from Barton and 
Stanton counties in Kansas 
and from Union County, 
N.M. Also, EPA drinking- 
water standards for chlo­
ride were exceeded in wat­
er samples taken from 
Meade County, Kan.

The sodium concentration 
map and text shows areas 
of the High Plains aquifer 
that have water with var­
ious concentrations of sod­

ium, in milligrams per 
liter. This, however, is not 
a direct indication of suit­
ability of water for irriga­
tion purposes or for 
drinking.

An accompanying table 
shows, among other things, 
specific-conductance values 
for water samples from 28 
sites in the High Plains 
aquifer region. Specific 
conductance reflects the 
electrical conductivity of 
water, which increases with 
higher concentrations of 
dissolved solids and there­
fore is an indirect measure

of dissolved solids and 
salinity.

The table also shows that 
water samples from eight 
counties, based on specific- 
conductance tests, can be 
used for irrigation, but 
good crop growth can be 
obtained only with “ good 
land management and fav­
orable drainage condi­
tions.” These eight count­
ies are Niobrara in Wyom­
ing; Kearny, Finney, Clark 
and Reno in Kansas; Beav­
er in Oklahoma; Ochiltree 
in Texas; and Lea in New 
Mexico.

Other authors of the re­
port are John B. Weeks, a 
USGS hydrologist in Den­
ver and director of the
overall High Plains aquifer 
study; and Joseph W.
Oliver, a former USGS hy­
drologist in Denver.

The latest report was 
published as USGS Hydro- 
logic Investigations Atlas 
HA-658, titled “ Dissolved 
Solids and Sodium in
Water from the High Plains 
Aquifer in parts of Colo­

rado, Kansas, Nebraska, 
New Mexico, Oklahoma, 
South Dakota, Texas and 
Wyoming.”

Copies of the atlas can 
be purchased for $6 each 
from the Western Distribu­
tion Branch, U.S. Geologi­
cal Survey, Box 25286, 
Federal Center, Denver, 
Colo. 80225. Orders must

include the identification 
number HA-658 and checks 
or money orders payable to 
the U.S. Geological Survey.

Copies can be purchased 
over the counter at USGS 
Public Inquiries Offices in 
Denver. Colo. (169 Federal 
Bldg., 1961 Stout St.) and 
Dallas, Texas (1C45 Fede­
ral Bldg., 100 Commerce 
St.)

Ellis Funeral Home
Pre-Need Funeral Needs

Price Is Frozen At Time Of Purchase 8. Guaranteed 
272-4574 Muleshoe \

See Us For Your Field Seeds.
★  Asgrow ★  Browning
★  Growers ★  Paymaster
★  Oro ★  PAG ★  Pioneer

Ray Griffiths & Sons 
Grain Elevator
Main & American Blvd.

We Also Have A Complete Line 
Of Garden Seed &
Lawn Grass Seed.
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ATTEND THE CHURCH 
OF YOUR CHOICE

I
G|
«2

! EMMANUEL BAPTIST CHURCH 
Iglesia Bautista Emmaneul 
107 East Third 
Isaias Cardenas, Pastor 
RICHLAND HILLS BAPTIST CHURCH 
17th and West Ave. D 
Brock Sanders, Pastor 
SPANISH BAPTIST MISSION 
East Third and Ave. E 
Roy Martinez, Pastor 

.UNITY BAPTIST CHURCH 
314 Ave. B 
Don Knight, Pastor 
LONGVIEW BAPTIST CHURCH 
Phone 946-3413 
B.C. Stonecipher, Pastor 
SIXTEENTH AND AVED CHURCH OF CH 
James Johnson, Pastor 
Sunday - 10:30 a.m.
Evening - 6 p.m.
Wednesday - 8 p.m.
PROGRESS BAPTIST CHURCH 
Donald G. Proctor, Pastor 
Progress, Texas
NORTHSIDE CHURCH OF CHRIST 
117 E. Birch Street 
SPANISH ASSEMBLY OF GOD 
East 6th and Ave. F 
Luis campos, Pastor 
UNITED PENTECOSTAL GOSPEL 
LIGHTHOUSE CHURCH 

, 207 E. Ave G. 
i  George Green, Pastor 
I MULESHOE BAPTIST CHURCH 

8th and Ave. G 
Bob Dodd, Pastor 
FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
220 West Ave. E 
J.E. Meeks, Pastor

TEMPLO CALVARIO 
507 S. Main 
Sunday - 10:00 a.m.
Sunday evening - 7:00 p.m. 

t  Evangelistic Services 
1 J.L. Soto, Pastor

ALL NATURE Proclaims 
A RISEN SAVIOUR

AT EASTER . .  trees and flowers blossom into

new life. AT EASTER. . .  we celebrate our Saviour's 

rising to a new life, and the promise that we shall have 

this new life too. Attend Church Easter Day and 

join others in celebrating this great victory

FIRST ASSEMBLY OF GOD 
521 South First 
Lee R. Rich, Pastor

CHURCH OF THE NAZARENE 
9th and Ave. C 
Jimmie Williams, Pastor

FIRST CHRISTIAN CHURCH 
130 W. Ave. G 
Dick Tarr, Pastor 
Sunday School - 10:00 a.m.
Worship 11:00 a.m.
LATIN AMERICAN METHODIST MISSION. 
5th and Ave. D 
R.Q. Chavez, Pastor 
THE COMMUNITY CHURCH 
Morton Highway 
H.D. Hunter. Pastor 
CALVARY BAPTIST CHURCH 
1733 W. Ave. C 
James Williams, Pastor 
PROGRESS SECOND BAPTIST CHURCH 
1st and 3rd Sundays 
Clifford Slay, Pastor 
FIRST UNITED METHODIST CHURCH 
507 W. 2nd, Muleshoe 
Bill Kent, Pastor 
ST. JOHN LUTHERAN 
Lariat, Texas
Sunday School - 10:00 a.m.
Worship Service - 11:00 a.m.
Herman J. Schelter, Pastor 
PRIMITIVE BAPTIST CHURCH 
621 S. First 
Elder Bernard Gowens 
MULESHOE CHURCH OF CHRIST 
Clovis Highway 
JOHN A. BOOR, Minister 
Jehovah Witness 
Friona Highway 
Boyd Lowery, Pastor
IMMACULATE CONCEPTION CATHOLIC 
Father Patrick Maher 
Northeast of City in Morrison Edition 
ST. MATTHEW BAPTIST CHURCH 
Corner of West Boston and W. Birch 
M.S. Brown, Pastor

NEW COVENANT CHURCH 
Plainview Highway 
Sunday - 10:00 a.m.
Wednasday - 7:00 p.m.
Jimmy Low, Pastor
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Bratcher Motor 
Supply

107 E. Ave. B 272-4288

James Roy Meat 
Market Co.

506 W. Amer. Blvd. 272-4361

White’s Cashway 
Grocery

W here Friends Meet & Prices 
Talk

Dent-Rempe 
Inplement Co.
John Deere Dealer 272-4297

Western Drug
!

U14 Main 272-3106

First National 
Bank

“Home Owned
202 S. 1st 272-4515

Irrigation Pumps 
& Power

Muleshoe 
Co-op Gins

*

Five Area T elep h on e. 

Cooperative Inc.

272-5533

Baker Farm 
Supply Inc.

Lambert Cleaners
Steam Carpet Cleaning 

Drapery Cleaning 
123 Main 272-461:6

^ D a i r ?
L OueeiJ .

Margie Hawkim 
 ̂ Manager 

272-3412

Farmers Spraying 
Service

American Valley 
Inc.

272-4266

Farmers Ho -  Op 
Elevators

3 Locations to Serve You 
272 - 4335

... ........................... .
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BUYING?!
SELLING?. CHECK OUT THE...

DEADLINE FOR CLASSIFIED 
ADS IS TUESDAYS AND 

FRIDAYS 11:00AM _

WE RESERVE THE 
RIGHT TO CLASSIFY. 
REVISE OR RLJECT 

ANY AD.

NOT RESPONSIBLE 
FOR ANY ERROR 

A U E R  AD HAS RUN
ONCE.

SMALL 3 BR house to be 
moved. 925-6733.
8-11 t-8tp

PRICED TO SELL: 3-2-2. 
Lots of extras, best loca­
tion. 3 years old. Call 
272-5049 or 272-3386. 
8-10t-tfc

1. PERSONALS

Want to do babysitting in 
my home. Call 272-3222. 
l-30t-tfc

SPRUCE UP for spring. A
complimentary Mary Kay 
facial. Call Ginger Damron. 
946-3394. 
l-9s-tfc

TOWN and
COUNTRY

WILL 1)0 BABYSITTING in
my home. Day or night. 
Also will do sewing and 
alterations. Reasonable 
fees. 272-4356.

AN ENAMEL ON COPPER 
workshop April 7, 8 and 
4th. 9:30 to 3:30. Rita 
W'lute Studio, 213 E. Fir, 
west door. 272-3889 or 
272-4696.

Real Estate
Extra Nice 1 bedroom 
house with fireplace, car 
port and lots of goodies.

Elegent 3-2-2 brick in 
Country Club Addn. Ref. 
air, fireplace and all the 
things you’d want in 
your dream home.

PLACE YOUR LISTINGS 
WHERE THE ACTION 
IS' CALL US.

John W. Smith 
806/272-5335 

223 East Ave. B 
Muleshoe, Tx 79347 

8-12t-tfc

KRF.BBS REAL ESTATE 
Appraisals 

201 W. Ave. C 
Tel. 272-3191 

Perfect Vi Sec.-2-8 
wells

in.

80 A Alfalfa - close in

Quarter sec.-well located 
- good land

350A - good red land - 2 
circle sprinklers, except­
ionally good water

Have good lots and ac- 
erages - 1 M. E on Hwy 
84. Give good terms. 
Houses can be moved on 
this.

Neat 2 BR - 2 bath home 
- mile out of town, land­
scaped, small barn and 
lots. Some ones’ dream - 
See this.
8-14s-stfc

1 13t-3tc
MONOG RAMMING. Al- Jimmie Crawford
terations and Sewing in Real Estate & Ins.
Muleshoe and Sudan area. 1725 W Ave E
946-3438. Muleshoe. Texas
12s-1 6tc Phone 272-3666

SISTER SOPHIA 3 bedroom house in
Palm reader, spiritual Lenau addition.
healer, reader advisor. 40 acres East ofCan help advise in all town with 8" well.
problems luck, health,
happiness, marriage, 160 acres West of
success, financial. Will town with 2 wells.
help you overcome all
your problems. Come, 320 acres N.E. of
call, or write. 799-9124. town with 3 wells.
Send seif addressed. 8-7s-stfc
stamped envelope to:
2263 34th St., Lubbock, HOUSE FOR SALE: by
Tx 79411. owners. 3 Br. 1 Vi bath.
1-12t-24tp brick. Lots of storage.

Large room. Priced reason-

3. HELP WANTED

SPRING’S A GREAT TIME 
TO CLEAN UP OLD BILLS. 
Want to pay bills? You’ll 
earn good money selling 
Avon, and the hours are 
flexible. Call Phyllis Duff 
794-3498 or 272-3208. 
3-14s-8tc

ably. Large back yard, 
covered patio. 272-3839 
after 5, 272-3831 or
965-2240.
8-8s-tfcs

4, HOUSES FOR RENT

FOR RENT: Small 3 room 
furnished house. Call Wed. 
- Thur. or Friday. Couple 
or single 272-5366.
4-14s-ltc

14x60 2 bedroom & 1
bath furnished trailer
house for rent. Central
heat. Real Clean.
257-3776.
4-3s-stfc

5. APTS. FOR RENT

FOR RENT: 3 room furn­
ished apartment. Water 
paid. Call Betty Carpenter 
272-4561 or 272-3109. 
5-14s-tfc

8. REAL ESTATE 
FOR SALE

...... .......    4 . .rf

FOR SALE: South 80 acres 
of North West Quarter of 
Section 51, Block W, E.K. 
Warren Subdivision No. 1 
Lamb County, Texas. Con­
tact Bob Finney, Trustee, 
Muleshoe State Bank, 
Drawer K, Muleshoe, Tx 
79347 or telephone 
806-272-4561.
8-10t-tfc

IDEAL 90* lot for mobile 
home or double wide mo­
bile home and 50’ lot, 2 
and 3 BR houses. 272-4732 
days, 272-4827 nights and 
weekends.
8-IOt-tfc

EXTRA NICE 3-1'/i-l. New 
carpet, paneling through 
out. Screened in patio. Call 
4541 or 5671 after 5:00 
p.m. Ask for Dcbby. 
8-13t-tfc

A m e r ic a n

^ J f A U E Y

J N VESTMENTS
Formerly Reid 
Real Estate

REALTORS

-Homes-
NEW LISTING - Beautiful Home and Barn at the edge 
of town located on 32 Irrigated Acres. Just right for a 
small manufacturing business.

LASTING QUALITY - Beautiful 3 Bedroom, IV* Bath, 2 
Car Garage. Fireplace. Cedar Roof. Ash Paneling with 
Bookshelves. Lots of extras.

ROOMY FAMILY HOME - 4 Bedroom, IV* Bath Home 
with Double Car Garage. Lots of Storage. Large 
Workshop.

COUNTRY DREAM - Beautiful 3 Bedroom Home, 1% 
Bath, Double Car Garage. Located on 15 Acres close to 
town. Planted in Alfalfa. Barns, Corrals, Fruit Trees, 
Lots of Extras.

SUPER CLEAN - Extra nice 2 Bedroom, l l/j Bath, 
2-Car Garage on Vi Acre close to town.

THE FRESH SMELL of a new home can't be matched. 
3 Bedroom, 1V* Bath, Double Car Garage. Corner 
fireplace in Beamed Living Area.

LARGE BEDROOMS - in this 3 Bedroom. \V* Bath, 
Double Car Garage Home. Lots of Storage. Established 
Neighborhood.

-Farms-
80 Acres with all-weather runway. Lots of hanger space 
plus 5,000 sq. ft. office space. Lots of extras. Ideal for 
spraying service or flying club.

8 Acres at Progress. Good well, Planted to Jose Wheat 
Grass. Lots of pens, barns, and good house well.

114 Acres near Muleshoe. 6” well sith siderolls. 
Allotments. Lots of Depreciation.

1 Section. Excellent for stocker cattle operation. 2 
Electric Valley Pivots and 6 Sideroll sprinkler systems.

144 Acres. Valley Pivot Sprinkler System. Good 
Assumable loan. Owner Financing.

272-4266 272-3565

Thursie Reid- -272-3142
Karen Harris ..... 272-5183
Lucille Harp- --272-4693

Rex Harris - Broker John Craig - Builder

FOR SALE: 79 Merc. 
Cougar XR-7 A/C, Cruise, 
Tilt, Power Windows, 
AM/FM 8 track, 5 new 
radial tires and shocks. 
272-3542 or 272-4112. 
9-8s-tfc

10. FARM EQUIP.
FOR SALE

HOUSE FOR SALE: 2350 
sq. ft. 3 bedroom, 2 baths, 
formal living room, den 
with fireplace, dining room, 
kitchen, laundry room with 
sewing center, basement, 
double car garage, patio, 
storage shed, 2 lots. Lo­
cated 1'/« mile east from 
Earth, Texas on hwy 70. 
Call (806) 257-3785.
8-14s-tfc

FOR SALE BY OWNER: 2 
bedroom. 1 bath and gar­
age on 1 acre of land. 10 
miles west of Muleshoe. 
Bam and other improve­
ments. Call for appoint­
ment. 272-3600.
8-14s-3tc

9. AUTOMOBILES 
FOR SALE

79' HONDA PRELUDE, 
Michelins, AC, Rear win­
dow shade, hidden CB, 
contest winning 200 watt 
stereo system - Muleshoe 
272-3386'.
9-14s-tfc

FOR SALE: 1976 Oldsmo- 
bile Regency. Good running 
condition. Chapman Supply
Co. 272-3473.
12s-9-tfc

WANTED TO BUY sideroll 
sprinklers, 2” , 3” , 4” ,
sprinkler pipe. Call State­
line Irrigation. 272-3450 or 
385-4487.
15-49s-tfc

FOR SALE OR LEASE: 21 
foot Bush Hog Tandem 
disc. Call 272-5175 or 
965-2232.
10-13t-tfc

BINGHAM & NIEMAN 
REALTY

116 E. Avenue C 
272-5285 

Night 272-5286
Just Listed 3-2-1, brick, 
central heat, fenced 
yard, approximately 4 
years old. Immaculate 
condition and priced it*, 
the low 40’s.

RICHLAND HILLS - 
3 -l3/«-2 Brick, approx. 
1960 sq. ft. of living 
area, built-ins, fireplace, 
& much more!!!

PRICE REDUCED ON 
THIS 3-2-2 home on 1 
acre, storage space ga­
lore, & located on pave­
ment, close to town...

JUST L1STED-2 bdrm., 1 
bath, new roof & carpe­
ting. Priced for quick
sale...

LENAU ADD. - 3-1-1
home, freshly painted 
interior, new roof, nice 
covered patio, fenced
yard!!!

RICHLAND HILLS-3-1 V* 
Brick, fireplace, fenced 
yard, very nice, & an 
excellent location...

HIGH SCHOOL AREA 
3-1V4-1 Brick home in 
immaculate condition, 
Cent. A&H, built-ins, 
lots of extras, buy equity 
& assume loan!!!

CLAY'S CORNER - 3 
bdrm. home on approx. 
3.5 acres on Hwy. 214. 
A nice country home for 
the price...

4 -l3/«-2 Brick home, 
Cent. A&H, large work­
shop, Make an offer on 
this one...

RICHLAND HILLS-3-2-2 
Brick, Cent. A&H, built- 
ins, fenced yard, and 
priced in the mid-$40’s...

3-1 home, new siding & 
roof, would make a nice 
starter home!!!

This 4-1V*-2 home has 
been totally remodeled in 
earth tones & priced 
under $40,000!!!

2-1 home on corner lot, 1 
car detached garage, 
storage bldg., & cellar, 
All for $12,000!!!

11. FOR SALE 
OR TRADE

FOR SALE: 2 good dryland 
80 acre tracts-joining. Ex­
cellent for Texas Vet Pro­
gram. Call 806-352-7595. 
Realtor-owner. 
ll-13s-tfc

FOR SALE: Vacuum pump 
trailer - to pump cess 
pools, septic tanks and 
mud pits. $1600. firm. Call 
after 6:00. 356-4791.
1 l-12t-4tc

PIK-Foard CSL League 195 
Labor 22, 168.4 acres
$50,000. All cultivated. Ken 
Spain 806-762-0615,
806-797-7064.
1 l-12t-lt4stc

1981 WINDSOR 14x80, 3
BR, 2 bath, utility closet. 
Kitchen appliances furnish­
ed and many extras. Ideal 
home for family ranch or 
country living. $3,000. 
equity. Assume note. 
272-5256. TYL.
1 l-12t-4tc

12. HOUSEHOLD GOODS

BURROWS 
UPHOLSTERY AND 

FURNITURE REPAIR 
209 W. 2nd 

Phone 272-4255 
15-5t-tfc

WE BUY USED 
FURNITURE AND 

APPLIANCES 
CALL 272-3030 
HARVEY BASS 

APPLIANCE 
15-5t-tfc

PIANO IN STORAGE
Beautiful spinet-console 
stored locally. Reported like 
new. Responsible party can 
take at big saving on low 
payment balance. Write 
Joplin Piano, Inc., Joplin, 
Missouri, 64801. Include 
home phone number. 
15-13t-2tp

15. MISCELLANEOUS

ALEX'S TIRE SERVICE 
For service 24 hours a day 
telephone 272-5012 or Mo­
bile 965-2242. 224 East
Fourth Street, Muleshoe, 
Tx. 79347.
15-5s-stfc

ROOF DAMAGE? J. L. 
Soto, Construction. Shing­
les - new - repair acoustical 
ceilings, painting, carpen- 
' 272-4142. "

4 homes-(2 bdrm. - 1 
bath), excellent rent pro- 
pety. Priced to sell...

try 
mates. 
15-5s-stfc

Free esti-

CLOV1S HWY.-3-1 plus 2 
car carport (remodeled & 
very nice), & a 2-1 home 
for a rental unit, all on 
approx. 4.4 acres. This 
tract has a sprinkler sys­
tem & would make an 
ideal truck farm!!!

RICHLAND HILLS - 3- 
1 Vi-1 Brick, Cent. A&H, 
built-ins, buy equity & 
assume!!!

RICHLAND HILLS-3 nice 
lots, just right for that 
new home. Reasonably 
priced!!!

We also have a good 
selection of farms and 
commercial property list­
ed. Check with us for 
details on these listings.

“WE APPRECIATE 
YOUR BUSINESS” 

George and 
Dianne Nieman

| < 8-1 Is-stfc

TREFLAN 
TEM1K 15-G 
ATRAZENE

etc.
WATSON CHEMICAL 

Call 272-4737 
or pickup at 

Pivot Products
Campbell Irrigation 

15-1 Lt-4tc

18. LEGAL NOTICES

PUBLIC NOTICE
Bailey County Electric 

Cooperative Association, 
Drawer N, Muleshoe, Tex­
as 79347 (Phone A/C 806- 
272-4504) is in the process 
of constructing 7'/a (seven 
and one-half) miles of 69 
kv transmission line. This 
line is located between our 
existing Dodd Substation 
and our Lazbuddie Substa­
tion for 3 miles on the west 
side of a county road, then 
.west along the south side 
of State road 145, 4 Vi
miles to our Lazbuddie 
Substation. The purpose of 
this construction will be to 
upgrade the Cooperative’s 
system and provide a bet­
ter quality and reliability of 
member's service in the 
immediate area. It is part 
of a continuing system 
improvement plan of com­
pleting another portion of a 
"looped transmission feed” 
of substations north of 
Muleshoe. The new line 
will be single-pole structure 
with two (2) crossarms and

GARDENER'S: Use our 
Special Plant Food - de­
signed specifically for Spe­
cial Gardeners. Baker Farm 
Supply, 1532 West Amer­
ican, 272-4613.
15-12s-tfc

HOME REPAIR. F.M. Sal­
dana Construction. Special­
ize in cement, work- 
carpenter, remodel, paint­
ing, acoustical ceiling. Also 
plumbing. 272-4955.
15-6s-tfc

HONEY FOR SALE

Nick Landers 
334 W. Ave. J. 

272-3096
15-5t-tfc

FRANK'S 
REFRIGERATION 

APPLIANCE & SERVICE 
PARTS & REPAIR 

315 W. 3rd. Ph. 272-3822 
15-5t-tfc

STORAGE ROOMS 
FOR RENT

S25.00-S30.00 
TED BARNHILL

272-4903
15-14s-stfc

three (3) energized conduc­
tors, and one (1) grounded 
neutral wire. All construc­
tion will conform to stand­
ard R.E.A. specifications. It 
will be identical to the lines 
that the Cooperative has 
constructed, maintained 
and operated in the area 
for forty (40) years. No ad­
verse effect on the quality 
of the environment is anti­
cipated to result from this 
proposed construction. This 
construction is under the 
jurisdiction of the Public 
Utility Commission of Tex­
as. An Application for a 
Certificate of Convenience 
and Necessity for this 
transmission line has been 
submitted to the Public 
Utility Commission of Tex­
as. Anyone wishing to in­
tervene in this proceeding 
or protest or comment on 
the action sought should 
contact the Public Utility 
Commission of Texas at 
7800 Shoal Creek Boule­
vard, Suite 450N, Austin, 
Texas 78757 (Phone A/C 
512-458-0100), within fif­
teen (15) days from the 
date of this public notice. 
18- 14s-25tc

18. LEGAL NOTICES |

FEED YOUR TREES Use 
Pecan and Fruit Tree Food 
from Baker Farm Suppl>. 
1532 West American, 
272-4613.
15-12s-tfc

GARZA RECYCLING 
112 W. 6th 

Clovis, N.M. 88101 
762-2247 

"W E BUY”
Aluminum Cans 25 cents 

Lb./Copper/Brass 
Radiators/Batteries 
Mon.-Fri. 8-5 Sat.

• 8-12 Mountain Time 
15-2s-stfc

NOTICE FOR BIDS
The Bailey County 

Commissioner’s Court will 
receive bids until 10 a.m., 
Monday, April 11, 1983, for 
the purchase of a New 
Motor Grader.

The minimum specifica­
tions for said motor grader 
are as follows, to wit:

Operating weight: 28,500 
lbs.; engine: diesel, 6 cy­
linder, turbocharged, 150 
SAE net horsepower; power 
shift transmission; power 
steering; tires: 14.00 - 24, 
10PR, 10-inch rims and one 
extra wheel; locking differ­
ential; cab: fully enclosed

all-steel cab providing SAE 
Standard 3% roll-over pro­
tection, heater, windshield 
wipers front and rear, de­
froster fan, dome light, 
tinted safety glass, and 
floor mat; circle: five-foot 
diameter, 360° rotation, 
hydraulic circle side-shift 
control; blade: 14’ chrome 
moldboard with hydraulic 
sideshift and tilt; addi­
tional: 24-volt electrical
system and starter; hour- 
meter; dry-type air cleaner 
w/restrictor indicator; wat­
er temperature guage; en­
gine oil pressure gauge; 
fuel guage; transmission 
temperature gauge; trans­
mission pressure gauge; 
ether starting aid; horn; 
reverse warning horn 
alarm; precleaner; articula­
tion indicator; two lights 
w/stoplights and taillights; 
two front and two rear 
work lights; turn signals 
w/emergency 4-way flash­
ers, and vandalism pro­
tection for all compart­
ments and filler caps with 
locks; air conditioner with 
heavy duty alternator; war­
ranty: Manufacturer shall 
provide one year factory 
warranty.

The bids must be sub­
mitted to the County Judge 
prior to the above time. 
The county will offer in 
trade a 1970 Caterpillar 
Motor Grader, which may 
be examined at the Pre­
cinct One Barn. All bids 
shall reflect the gross sales 
price of the new machine, 
the allowance for the trade 
of the 1970 motor grader, 
and the new amount of the 
bid.

The Commissioner’s 
Court reserves the right to 
reject any or all bids and to 
waive formalities.

/s /  by Gordon H. Green 
Gordon H. Green 

Bailey County Judge 
15-13s-2tsc

MR FARMER!
We build Hydraulic Hoses. 
Muleshoe Auto Parts, 217 
N. First.
15- 14s-tfc

Come by and let Rockey 
Flores rebuild your alterna­
tors, starters and genera­
tors. Muleshoe Auto Parts, 
217 N. First.
15-14s-tfc

Special Dairy Auction 
Friday April 22nd 

11a.m. MST
Roswell Livestock Auction 

Roswell, N.M.
Now accepting consignment for spring dairy sale. Will 
be selling open, bred and heavy springer Hefers. If you 
have Hefers of any size or type we would sincerely like 
an opportunity to work with you and please contact us 
as soon as possible so that we may properly advertise 
your livestock. Watch Sunday, April 17th paper for list 
of consignments. For more information or to Consign 
Cattle, Contact: Dale Rogers 505-622-5580, Tommy 
Bouldin 505-622-8353, Dick Moore 505-359-0950.
16- 14s-2tc

ELEPHANTS 
NEVER FORGE

DAVIS
COMMERCIAL

PUMPING

"If it's part liquid & not 
over 20 ft. deep we'll try 
to drain it.”

Phone 806 272-3467 
P.O. Box 71 

1510 W. Ave. D 
Muleshoe. TX 

15-5t-stfc

A good sale ad in the Nam 
Newspaper. Newspaper 
advertising has a captive 
audience. If you want to 
move merchandise and 
show big profits then give 
this captive audience a 
reason to come to your place 
of business. Newspaper 
Advertising builds traffic for 
stores.

Muleshoe & Bailey County
Muleshoe Journals 272-4536


