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1981 Building Permits Total 
1,189,424-Housing Inadequate

Information received 
from the Muleshoe City 
Hall has revealed a total 
construction value, includ­
ing additions and altera­
tions, of $2,189,424 during 
1981 for the City of Mule­
shoe.

Total residential con­
struction for 1981 amount­

Around

Muleshoe
Bailey County farmers are 
reminded of the 1982 ACP 
cost share signup for Bai­
ley County will be held the 
week of January 18 and 
through January 22.

All persons interested 
need to come in and signup 
for cost-shares on approv­
ed practices, which include 
terraces and underground 
pipeline.

• • •
, „ Carl Wooten, brother of 

Mrs. Fred (Bertha) Beene 
of Needmore passed away 
Tuesday morning in an El 
Paso Hospital.

Services were held on 
Thursday.

• ••
Rudolph Moraw, who 

recently announced his 
candidacy for County 
Commissioner of Precinct 
4, has lived in Bailey 
County for 44 years, NOT 
the 12 that the news article 
indicated. He has been 
commissioner for 12 years, 
however. Our apologies.
Coat. Page 6, Col. 5

ed to $599,900 in Muleshoe 
with home improvements 
reaching to $40,900.

Construction of new 
businesses amounted to 
$425,824, while business 
improvements were totaled 
at $80,800. One building 
permit was issued at a 
value of $42,000, which 
was listed as tax exempt, 
rounding out to the total 
figure of $1,189,424.

Reports indicated that 
nine mobile homes were 
moved into the city during 
1981.

One building was de­
molished.

A recent survey aimed at 
the housing situation in 
Muleshoe revealed that 
while there is a slight 
increase in the availability 
of purchase property, rent­
al property is almost vir­
tually non-existent.

Thursie Reid of Reid 
Real Estate reported to the 
Journal that the shortage 
of rental propferty here in 
Mrleshoe was definitely a 
serious problem. “ We get 
calls every day and the

housing is not adequate 
here,” Mrs. Reid said.

George Neiman told the 
Journal that there was a 
rental shortage every week 
with as many as six in the 
same amount of time wish­
ing to rent homes. "Sales 
are still in relatively good 
shape,” Neiman reported. 
The homes for sale in 
Muleshoe range from 
$15,000 to $80,000 and 
Neiman reported having 
several listings in all sec­
tions of town.

Joe Smallwood, another 
local realtor, stressed the 
fact that while rental hous­
ing is short, most homes 
are so expensive that no 
one is able to buy now. 
“The homes themselves 
are not so high, but due to 
the rate of interest being 
out of reach for most work­
ing people, sales property 
is not moving very fast.” 
Smallwood also reported 
from four to eight persons 
in his office looking for 
something to rent. “ More 
of the TOLK employees

Cont. Page 6, Col. 4

Casey Insurance 
Awarded For Service

Glen Dalton Harris

Harris Files For 
Commissioner

Glen Dalton Harris has 
announced his filing as a 
candidate for commissioner 
of Precinct Two of Bailey 
County in the upcoming 
Democratic Primary.

He and his wife, Leona, 
have resided in Bailey 
County since 1950. They 
have lived in the West 
Camp community for 29 
years, belonged to the 
Baptist Church, were ac­
tive in community. They 
are the parents of two 
living ohildren, Sandra 
Wilson of Muleshoe and 
David Harris of Amarillo.

Harris farmed uritil 1978 
when he purchased the 
West Camp Grocery. They 
operated it until last year. 
He has been employed on 
road maintenance for Pre­
cinct Two for four years.

He is a veteran of World 
War II, having served in 
Cont/ Page 6, Col. 7

On January 13, the W.Q. 
Casey Insurance Agency, 
Muleshoe, was presented 
with a personalized 25th

Bailey County
Republicans
Meet

The Bailey County Re­
publican Party held a 
meeting at 7:00 p.m. on 
Tuesday, January 12, 1982 
in the office of Dee Tread­
well. County Chairman Ray 
Precure and County Sec­
retary Dee Treadwell led 
the discussion concerning 
the filing of Republican 
candidates for various 
county positions. These 
announcements will be 
made soon.

Forms and information 
are available from either 
Ray Precure or Dee Tread­
well. Everyone interested 
in helping with this work is 
urged to contact the Coun­
ty Chairman or Secretary.

The Bailey County Re- 
Cont. Page 7, Col. 1

anniversary plaque by St. 
Paul Fire and Marine In­
surance Company. The 
plaque commemorates the 
ag ncy’s quarter century 
as a representative of the 
St. Paul. Beverly Heath- 
ington, owner of the a- 
gency, accepted the award 
which was presented by 
Fred LaPointe, field su­
pervisor at the St. Paul’s 
Lubbock Service Center.

Ir a letter accompanying 
the plaque, Robert J. 
Haugh, president of St. 
Paul Fire and Marine, con­
gratulated the agency and 
said, “ The quality of the 
St. Paul’s agency force has 
been a major stgrength 
throughout the company’s 
history and is typified by 
the friendly and coopera­
tive relationship that our 
two firms have enjoyed 
over the past 25 years. I 
hope you will accept this 
momento with the same 
feeling of pride the St. 
Paul takes in presenting it 
to you.”
Cont. Page 7, Col. 1

Measurement Of Water 
Level Begins In County

The High Plains Water 
District has begun its an­
nual program of measuring 
the depth to water levels in 
more than 900 observation 
wells scattered throughout 
the fifteen county District 
area.

Bailey County irrigators 
may see a blue and white 
Water District vehicle in 
the vicinity of their proper­
ty in the coming weeks 
while Dan Seale of the 
District staff measures the 
74 wells in the District’s 
observation network in 
Bailey County

Since most of the wells 
to be measured are oper­
ational irrigation wells, the 
month of January was cho­
sen to begin observations

in order to allow for a dor­
mant period and well re­
covery from the cone of 
depression developed dur­
ing the pumping season. 
Wells will be measured to 
find the depth to “ static” 
water level. After measur­
ing, each well will receive 
a red District identification 
tag for the owner’s infor­
mation.

Data gained from this 
program is used for decline 
rate projections, determin­
ing the amount of water 
left in storage, and very 
importantly, as a basis for 
the income-tax depletion 
allowance claims on land­
owner’s tax returns.

The annual measure- 
Cont. Page 6, Col. 8

GRAND CHAMPION STEER—Alan Harrison, son of Mr. and Mrs. Ted Harrison of
Muleshoe, won the Grand Champion Steer title in the Bailey County Stock Show Thursday 
night. Alan showed a heavy weight cross steer.

GRAND CHAMPION SWINE-Sharla Morrison, daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Herman 
Morrison of Muleshoe took top honors with her heavy weight Hampshire Friday in the 
Bailey County Show.

GRAND CHAMPION LAMB—Jeanine Robertson, daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Darwin
Robertson of Maple was overall winner with her medium wool, heavy weight lamb Friday in 
the annual county stock show.

Second Annual Irrigation 
Conference Scheduled

The second annual irri­
gation conference for Bai­
ley County producers will 
be held on January 26 in 
the Bailey County Coli­
seum in Muleshoe. The 
theme for this year’s con­
ference is “ Meeting the 
Challenge of the 80’s .” 

Registration will begin at 
8:30 a.m. with the welcome

and program introduction 
being given by Lewis 
Wayne Shafter, vice-presi­
dent of the Bailey County 
Electric Company and sec­
retary of the Blackwater 
Valley Soil and Water 
Conservation District.

The conference will be­
gin with a talk by Bill Liles, 
manager of the Federal

Harrison, Morrison, 
Robertson Tops

Land Bank in Muleshoe on 
“ Changing Landlord and 
Tenant Rent Agreements.” 

Following Liles will be 
Dr. James Supak with the 
Texas Extension Service 

.who will speak on the cost 
of production pertaining to 
cotton and sunflowers. Dr. 
Kirby Huffman, also with 
Cont. Page 6, Col. 5

Bailey County Junior 
Livestock Show judging 
continued into the night on 
Thursday and started up 
bright and early again on 
Friday morning.

Thursday night was the 
showing of lambs and 
steers, with the swine 
rounding out the show Fri­
day.

Judges for the event of 
lambs and steers was Joe 
Ed Wise, County Agent 
from Dawson County. Jud­
ging the swine was Joe 
Robertson of Randall 
County, also a County 
Agent.

Taking top honors in the 
lamb division this year 
with Grand champion was 
Jeanine Robertson Three- 
way showing a med wood 
cross, heavy weight lamb, 
reserve Champion was 
Starla Black also with a 
medium wool cross heavy 
weight lamb, under the 
Muleshoe FFA banner.

Beth Harmon took top 
honors in the lamb show­
manship division.

Beth showed under the 
Muleshoe FFA Banner 

Alan Harrison showed 
the Grand Champion Steer 
of the show with a heavy 
weight cross Belinda 
Wheeler took Reserve 
Champ honors with her 
steer of the same breed 
Both showed under 4-H. 
Belinda also took show­
manship honors under the 
steer division.

Grand Champion swine 
was shown by Sharia Mor­
rison with a Heavy weight 
Hampshire Shawne Cooley 
of Threeway showed the 
Reserve Champ.

Beth Harmon took top 
honors in the swine show­
manship division.

The following exhibitors 
took grand champion and 
reserve champion of their 
breeds:
LAMBS

Med Wool Heavy Wt. 
Grand Sharia Morrison; 
Starla Black, reserve.

Fine Wool Cross heavy 
wt.: Grand: Mitzi Robert­
son, Reserve: Michael An- 
geley 
STEERS:

Heavy Wt. Cross: Gra­
nd: Alan Harrison; Reser-

Mules Take 
Anton 58-50

The Varsity Mules slip­
ped by Anton Tuesday 
night ir the game which 
was played on the Mules’ 
home grounds.

The Mules led the first 
quarter with a 21 to 13 
accounting, but Anton 
came back in the second 
quarter to top the Mules by 
2 points leaving the score 
at halftime at 30-32 Anton.

The Mules got a second 
wind going into the third 
quarter and ended it with a 
nine point lead, going on to 
win the game with an eight 
point spread at 58-50.

Ronny Angeley led the 
scoring drive for the Mules 
with 16 points through the 
hoop, with Alan Bracey 
close behind with 13 
points.

Michael Isaac, who had 
recently been out due to 
illness, was back in the 
eame and copped nine 
Cont. Page 7, Col. 1

ve: Belinda Wheeler 
Pure Breed Heavy wt. : 

Grand: Jerry Gleason, Res: 
Colin Tanksley 

American Cross: Grand: 
Jerry Gleason: Res. Greg 
Young.
SWINE:

Hampshire - Heavy Wt; 
Grand Sharia Morrison; 
Res: Russell Brown 

Chester - ” ” : Grand: 
Sharia Morrison; res: 
Rhonda Dunham

Heavy Wt. Berkshire: 
Grand: Russell Brown; 
Res: Kay Lynn Prather 

Duroc - Med. Heavy: 
Grand: Wade Wheeler, 
Res: Tracy Tunnell.

Poland - Lt. Wt : Grand: 
Brad Stegall; Res: Troy„ 
Watson.

Poland-Spotted: Grand: 
Beth Harmon; Res: Mich­
elle Stevenson

York: Grand: Robin 
Moore, Res: Wes Hanks 

Cross: Grand: Shawn 
Cooley; Res: Colin Tanks­
ley.

The Jimmy Dale Black 
Memorial Showmanship a- 
ward was competed for by 
two girls; Beth Harmon, 
who won both the sheep 
and swine showman ship 
and Belinda Wheeler who 
won the Steer showman­
ship. Belinda won the 
memorial award by one 
point. Beth took reserve 
honors.

Other placings in the 
show are listed below. 
Swine pictures will be in 
Thursday’s Muleshoe 
Journal.

HEIFERS 
1st Stacey Kirby 
2 Jerry Gleason
3. Jacinda Gleason
4. Alan Harrison

FEEDER STEERS
1. Heath Burleson
2. Jay Gleason
3. Casey Stewart

* Cont. Page 6, Col. 1

Judge Young 
Will Seek 
Re-Election

Jack D. Young has an­
nounced that he will seek 
election as District Judge 
for the 287th Judicial Dis­
trict of Texas, which is 
composed of Bailey and 
Parmer Co’inties.

Jack D. Young has held 
the office of District Judge 
since May 1, 1981, when 
he was appointed to such 
position by Governor W. P. 
Clements, upon the forma­
tion of the newly created 
287th Judicial District.

Judge Young said, “ I 
would like to take this 
means and opportunity to 
announce my candidacy for 
election as District Judge 
for the 287th Judicial Dis­
trict of Texas. The people 
of Bailey and Parmer 
Counties are entitled to a 
fulltime judge, qualified to 
fill the needs of the District 
Court. I believe that I 
possess such qualifica­
tions, and if I am continued 
in such office I pledge to 
each of you my sincerest 
efforts to dispense justice 
fairly and impartially in all 
matters."

Jack D. Young is a can­
didate in the Democratic 
Primary to be held May 1 . 
1982.

WEATHER
Jan. 13 31 19
J a n .14 40 16
J a n .15 47 16
Jan. 16 59 .09

JOURNAL
The Community of Opportunitv-Where Water Makes the Difference’
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Career Day Sched

Tuesday, January 19, 
from 8:30 a.m. until 3:15 
p.m. will be a very special 
day at Muleshoe High 
School, as the Marketing 
and Distributive Education 
and the Free Enterprise 
Departments of are holding 
a joint “ Free Enterprise 
Appreciation and Career 
Day’ under the sponsor­
ship of Mrs. Lola Pylant 
and Mrs. Jean Allison. You 
are given an invitation to 
ccme to Muleshoe High 
School on this day and be a 
part of a day of presenters 
and dynamic speaking.

The “ Free Enterprise 
Appreciation” section will 
be conducted in the Mule­
shoe High School auditor­
ium from 8:30 a.m. until 
12:30 p.m. with seniors 
and other interested guests 
participating. Seniors from 
area schools have been 
given a special invitation, 
and it is hoped that a 
number of these will also 
participate.

Special guest speakers 
coming to extol our free 
enterprise system are Mr. 
Dan Law, president and 
co-owner of Fields and 
Company of Lubbock and 
Dr. C. L. Kay, president of 
the Institute for Business 
and Economic Education, 
Lubbock Christian College, 
Lubbock. A group of Lub­
bock Christian College stu­
dents will also present a 
puppet show and then will 
speak briefly about free 
enterprise. These students 
are under the sponsorship 
of Dick Laird, Executive 
Director of Students in 
Free Enterprise, Lubbock 
Christian College.

Mr. Dan Law will dis­
cuss the characteristics of 
the free enterprise system, 
the importance of the profit 
motive, and competition, 
using his experiences as a 
former Texas Tech football 
player. He will also give 
the challenges and oppor­
tunities of the free enter­
prise system in the busi­
ness world, relating some 
of his own experiences in 
the business world.

Dr. C. L. Kay, president of 
the Institute for Business 
and Economic Education, 
Lubbock Christian College 
will describe some of the 
dangers which threaten the 
free enterprise system, and 
will discuss the interna­
tional situation. Dr. Kay is 
highly qualified in this area 
as he is a member of the 
Board of Defense Orien­
tation Conference Associa­
tion and is informed about 
national defense. “ On the 
spot,” briefings have been 
given on matters related to 
the Department of Defense 
and the various commands 
including the Alaskan, the 
European, the Pacific, and 
the Southern. Dr. Kay, in 
this capacity, has visited 
defense installations all 
over the world, and he will 
have slides which will viv­
idly illustrate his speech. 
He will also bring special 
literature to be given to 
those participating.

Dr. Kay graduated from 
East Technical High School 
Cleveland, Ohio, received 
a diploma from Freed- 
Hardeman Jr. College of 
Henderson, Tennessee, a 
B.A. and a M.A. Degree 
from Eastern New Mexico 
University, Portales, New 
Mexico and an LL.D. de­
gree, an honorary degree 
awarded by the Oklahoma 
Christian College, Okla­
homa City, in 1967. He is 
married and has four chil­
dren^

Students and guests at­
tending this special day 
will also be entertained by 
students from Lubbock 
Christian College who will 
bring a puppet show and 
then will each speak briefly 
about free enterprise. The 
students come from Cali­
fornia, Ohio, Lubbock and 
other places and should 
bring a broad view to the 
subject. They have as their 
sponsor Mr. Dick Laird, 
Executive Director of Stu­
dents in Free Enterprise 
and professor of political 
science.

DAN LAW

R EA SO N  #5: If th e  IRS  
aud its  your re turn , 

H&R Block goes w ith  you 
at no extra  cost.

An IRS audit can be an anxious 
time for any taxpayer But. it' 
you're audited, Block will go with 
you at no extra cost Not as a le­
gal representative, but to explain 
how your return was prepared 
We re always ready to stand be­
hind you, year-round

H&R B L O C K
THE INCOME TAX PEOPIE 

17 reasons. O ne smart decision.

224 W. 2nd 
272-3332

Wkdys 9-6 
Sat. 9-5

Concluding this part of 
the program will be a panel 
discussion with all of the 
speakers and Lubbock 
Christian College students 
sitting on the panel. Sen­
iors and other members of 
the audience will break 
into groups and will then 
ask questions of the panel.

The Muleshoe area is 
very fortunate to have men 
and students of this caliber 
coming to speak on a 
subject as important as our 
free enterprise system.

Senior students of free 
enterprise and their spon­
sor, Jean Allison, extend 
an invitation to anyone in 
the Muleshoe area to at­
tend this special “ Free 
Enterprise Appreciation 
Day” especially business­
men who should find the 
day very informative.

The Marketing and Dis­
tributive Education De­
partment, and their spon­
sor, Lola Pylant, also ex­
tend an invitation to any­
one interested to attend 
the special “ Career Day” 
which is being held all day 
at Muleshoe High School, 
January 19, in individual 
classrooms. Freshmen, • 
sophomore and junior stu­
dents will attend tb“se 
Career Day sessions in the 
morning, joined by senior 
students after lunch. This 
department has secured a 
highly successful repre­
sentatives of various career 
areas who will give pre­
sentations in the field of 
their expertise. Each pre­
sentation will last about 
fifty minutes and students 
will be able to attend a 
number of these through­
out the day.

Outstanding presenters 
for this special "Career 
Day” include: Mr. Dave 
Sudduth, from Williams, 
Adair, Sudduth aiftf Co.,

C.P.A.s of Muleshoe; Mr. 
Trevor Ford, Architect, of 
Lubbock; Mr. Andrew 
Wilkes, artist from Here­
ford; Mr. Bob Finney, pre­
sident of Muleshoe State 
Bank; Ms. Claynelie Ham- 
ill of Jessie Lee’s Insitute 
in Luobock; Mr. Kenneth 
Lampkin from the Bureau 
of Apprenticeship and 
Training in Lubbock; Ms. 
Marilyn Riley, Interior De­
signer for the Art Loft in 
Muleshoe: Ms. Peggy
Pohlmeier, Dental Hygien­
ist with Dr. Charles Lewis 
of Muleshoe; Mr. Tim 
Campbell and Mr. Dick 
Chitwood, Muleshoe area 
farmers; Ms. Carolyn Alli­
son, manager of Grigsby’s 
Rag Doll of Lubbock; Ms. 
Martha Brown, Attorney 
with Thompson, Thomas 
and Brown of Lubbock and 
Muleshoe; Mr. T. J. Tibbs,
U. S. Navy Recruiter of 
Clovis; Ms. Helen H. Pay­
ne, R. N., M.S.N., from 
the School of Nursing, of 
Methodist Hospital, Lub­
bock; Mr. Lonnie Adrian of 
Adrian’s Photography of 
Muleshoe; Mr. Dave 
Knapp of the Lubbock Av­
alanche Journal; Ms. Carol 
Horne, Director of Special 
Programs, Muleshoe Inde­
pendent Schools; Dr. Ro­
land Johnson, Administra- • 
tive Services Department 
at West Texas State Uni­
versity; Ms. Pat Jones with 
the Texas Department of 
Health in Lubbock; Dr. 
Jerry Gleason, veterinarian 
from Muleshoe and Ms. 
Ann Lamb from the Public 
Information Department of 
TSTI in Amarillo.

As you can see, the day 
will be most informative 
and should be tremen­
dously educational to all 
involved. Please join us at 
Muleshoe High School on? 
Tuesday, January 19.

Com Growers Scheduled Meeting
Texas Com Growers As­

sociation and Texas Com 
Producers Board announce 
that the 9th Annual Meet­
ing of TCGA will be held 
Thursday, January 21st, 
1982, in the Castro County 
Exposition Building, with 
registration beginning at 
9:30 a.m.

Mr. Charlie Stenholm, 
U. S. Congressman, will be 
our guest speaker. Also 
included in our program 
will be Congressman Kent 
Hance (maybe), Mr. Rich­
ard Krajack, U. S. Feed 
Grains Council, Commis­

sioner Reagan Brown, and 
Ambassador Bob Krueger. 
We will be discussing the 
Farm Crisis of the 80’s; 
Weathering the Storms in 
Agriculture. The County 
Extension Service will 
wrap out program up in the 
afternoon with Dr. Rolland 
Smith, Marketing Econo­
mist, and Mr. Allen Knut­
son, County Entomologist.

We will have the same 
type of lunch as last year, 
and if you have attended in 
the past, you know we 
always have an excellent 
lunch.

Prices effective 1-17-82 TO 1-20-82
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Renting Bulls Good 
Idea In Texas

COLLEGE STATION- In 
Texas, renting a bull to 
settle cows is an alterna­
tive to owning one, though 
cattlemen need to consider 
numerous factors before 

[ making a decision either
way.

Several factors exist fav­
oring bull leasing for the 
producer, according to Dr. 
Ashley C. Lovell of Ste- 
phenville, economist with 
the Texas Agricultural Ex­
tension Service, Texas 

l A&M University System.
These include the tax 

deductible rental charge, 
less investment capital 
needed, and less annual 
expense in feeding and 
caring for the bull.

“ An important factor for 
smaller producers is that 
renting gives them a chan­
ce to use a better quality 
bull than they often could 
afford to own,” says Lov­
ell. “ Also, by using a dif­
ferent bull each year, pro­
ducers can keep heifers 
from each calf crop, and 
there is a limited bull 

I death risk.”
The economist states 

that acquiring a herd bull 
has short- and long-term

consequences, and these 
must be weighed and indi­
vidually considered before 
deciding whether to rent or 
own.

Long-term satisfaction to 
cow-calf producers from 
choosing bulls is measured 
by the performance of the 
progeny through future 
generations, he says. Bull 
costs per calf and pounds 
of beef weaned per cow are 
the short-term consequen­
ces from the bull selection 
that may determine if the 
producer can stay in busi­
ness long enough to realize 
any long-term benefits.

“ To achieve the econo­
mic advantage of lower 
annual feeding and main­
tenance costs, producers 
might need to keep a bull 
only three to four months a 
year, which is where rent­
ing would be the ideal an­
swer,” Lovell says. “ For 
herds that calve all year, 
six-month to one-year lea­
ses are necessary.”

In comparing figures for 
three- to four-month bull 
leasing programs, the 
economist notes that leas­
ing a $2,125 bull is pro­
jected as less expensive

per calf than owning a $750 
bull.

, .  .  J  , » ,  •, , , . . V  , .
\  TO many cases, renting a 

high-performing bull for 
periods up to one year will 
be more economical than 
owning an average bull 
when rental costs, bull 
ownership costs and per­
formance of offspring of 
the two bulls are observed 
and compared, Lovell 
adds.

Four Muleshoe 
Students Make 
Dean’s List

Honor roll lists at West 
Texas State University for 
the 1981 fall semester in­
clude the names of 761 
students.

Students listed on either 
of the honor roll lists must 
have been enrolled in and 
completed 12 semester 
hours.

The Dean’s list includes 
from the Muleshoe area, 
Curtis L. Carpenter, a 
sophomore building con­
struction major; Martin L.

Lopez, a junior art major; 
Mary E. Mata, a freshman 
computer and information 
systems and Benetta A 
Roming, a senior agricul­
tural business and eco­
nomics major.

Texas Farmers Union 
Convention In Session

“ Family Farms For The 
Future” was the theme 
and the topic of concern 
when members of the Tex­
as Farmers Union gathered 
for their 1982 convention in 
Fort Worth on January 7-9. 
Delegates and members of 
the 10,000 member family 
farm organization gathered 
for the 78th annual con­
vention of the Texas Farm­
ers Union at the Kahler 
Green Oaks Inn for setting 
the annual policy and lis­
tening to important speak­
ers.

TFU President Mike 
Moeller said, “ At a time 

- when a real economic crisis 
is facing American Agri­
culture, it is essential that 
the problems and needs of 
family farmers be recog­
nized. Because of the pas­
sage of the 1981 Farm Bill 
in December, we feel this 
will be an excellent time 
for legitimate farmers and 
ranchers to air their com­
plaints and plan a course of 
action for 1982.”

In addition to confront­
ing problems on the na­
tional level, state issues 
will also be addressed by 
the TFU convention dele­

gates and members. Sch­
eduled to speak were Tex­
as Agriculture Commis­

sioner Reagan Brown and 
his challenger for the posi­
tion, Jim Hightower. Both 
men are well known state­
wide and their remarks to 
the convention kicked off 
the 1982 campaign year for 
the agriculture commis­
sioner’s seat.

National Farmers Union 
President George Stone 
delivered the banquet ad­
dress on Saturday to the 
convention. Stone has been 
outspoken in his opposition 
to the 1981 Farm Bill and 
other moves by the Reagan 
administration.

Delegates heard remarks 
on the growing impact of

foreign investment in the 
U. S. and the rights of 
landowners with mineral 
rights and leases.
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South Plains
Semester
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LEVELLAND - Registra­
tion for the spring semes­
ter at South Plains College 
here will be J 41). U -12 In 
the SPC Women’s Gym

Day registration will be.9 
a.m.-noon and 1:30-4 p.m. 
both days, while enroll­
ment for evening classes 
will be 7-8:30 p.m. Jan. 11.

Classes in advertising 
art, sculpture, intermed­
iate typing, geology, and 
others have been added to 
the nearly 500 day and 
evening classes being of­
fered this spring.

Classes begin Jan. 13, 
and late registration ex­
tends through Jan. 22. A 
late registration fee of $10 
will be charged all those 
registering after Tuesday, 
Jan. 12, 1982, according to 
Bobby James, SPC regis­
trar.

A variety , of courses are 
offered in agriculture, auto 
and diesel mechanics, ac­
counting, anthropology 
art, building trades, busi 
ness vocations, the Bible 
biology, commercial art 
chemistry, computer infor 
mation systems, drafting 
speech and drama, econo­
mics, math and engineer 
ing, English, fashion mer 
chandising and history and 
government.

Also home economics, 
journalism, law enforce­
ment, secretarial, mid­
management, machine 
shop, machinist trades, 
microbiology, nursing, 
music, vocational nursing, 
physical education, photo­
graphy, physics, psychol- 
ogy, petroleum technology, 
rodeo, real estate, refri­
geration, air conditioning

mechanics, reading, radio 
and television servicing, 
sound technology, sociolo- 
gy, Spanish, television 
production, welding and 
zoology.

Bulletins listing courses 
offered are now available 
in the SPC registrar’s of­
fice.

For more information, 
contact SPC, Levelland 
campus, at (806) 894-9611.
ONE MINUTE SPORTS QUIZ

1. Who won the Sun City 
Million Dollar Golf 
Challenge?
2. What college football 
team is the NCAA champs?
3. Adrian Dantley plays pro 
basketball for what team?
4. Who won the women’s 
World Cup slalom three con­
secutive times?
5. Name the player who 
leads in scoring in the history 
of the NFL divisional play­
offs?
Answer* To Sport Quiz
1. Johnny Miller.
2. Clemson University.
3. Utah Jazz.
4. Swiss Erika Hess.
5. Franco Harris.

MEDICAL LOAN ABUSE 
Health and Human Serv­

ices Secretary Richard 
Schweiker has ordered a 
crackdown on doctors and 
other health professionals 
who have defaulted on their 
student loans. Nearly 
one-third of the health pro­
fessionals are behind in re­
paying the low-interest 
loans.

ON SOCIAL SI 
The Reigd

tion will not rat! 
tax or use general tax money 
to pull Social Security out of 
its financial hole, even if 
that’s the recommendation of 
a new presidential group 
created to study the system's 
problems, the commissioner 
of Social Security, John A. 
Svahn, says.

AUCTION
Sit NORTH FIRST -  MULESHOE, TEXAS
COME IIAIX. SNOW OB SHINE
AUCTION FIRST SUNDAY OF EVERY MONTH 200 P.M.

(frfr.M U l \ H \  1 . I M M — M  A IM  M 7 . H I M — A P R I L  I . I » M |

Furniture Appliances 
TV’s

Buy Sell or Trade
Lots & Lots More 

K n o w l e l  ( A u c t i o n  S e r v i c e
516 NORTH FIRST MULESHOE, TEXAS PHONE 272-4993

L A  X X V  K N I V L R N  M I N T Y  H O A D  J A C K  K N O V L I S
ID NORTH FUUTP, MULESHOE, TEXAS P. O. BOX IN. MULESHOE. TEXAS t i l  WEST FOURTH, MUIESHOE. TEXAS

m i mmx 1M 1 m-uw im i m-mt
LICENSE TiE-021-0449

OPEN LATER TO 
MAKE FURTHER 

REDUCTIONS OPEN 10 TO 6 P.M.

t
LADIES AND JUNIOR FALL & WINTER CLEARANCE

$5
SPECIAL SALE RACKS REDUCED!

88 « 8 8  A 8 8  t4B 8817 t v p t e 3
Blouses •  Skirts •  Pants •  Tops •  Sweaters •  Jackets •  Shirts

And Much , Much , More!

LADIES DRESSES 
JUNIOR DRESSES 
VELVET BLAZERS 
CORDUROY BLAZERS 
WOOL BLAZERS 
WINTER COATS

PRICE

GIRLS FALL SPORTSWEAR 
REDUCED FURTHER."..

$ 2 8 8  $488 $£88

TOPS •  PANTS •  DRESSES 
SKIRTS •  COORDINATES

MENS SHIRTS, SWEATERS, 
VELOURS and SUPER SUEDES

$488 2 for $9
$ 788 2  for $ 15

$ ^ 8 8  2 for $ 19

HANES H0ISERY 
STYLE SPUN HOSES 
PURSES
NYLON LINGERIE 
BRUSHED LINGERIE 
WINTER ROBES

BOYS SPORTSWEAR 
CLEARANCE

SHIRTS •  SWEATERS 
•  JEANS •

SHOE CLEARANCE
Closeout on Remaining Fall Shoes

$ 7 8 8  $ < ^ 8 8  $  1 2 8 8

Special Group 
of Fall Shoes.

2 8 8
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Mr. and Mrs. Stephen Clay brook 
[nee Trade Ann Webb
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Lena Zapata 
Sudan Senior 
Spotlight

The Sudan Senior spbt-* 
light shines this week on 
Lena Christina Zapata, 18 
year old daughter of Vickie 
Zapata. She was born May( 
22, 1963 in Amherst under 
the Gemini sign.

She is now five feet 
three inches tall, has black 
hair and brown eyes.

Sea food is at the top of 
the list of her favorite 
foods; red and pink her 
favorite colors and when 
asked her favorite person, 
she replies “ My Mom."

At school her favorite 
subject is Speech and Mrs. 
King her favorite teacher.

Among her hobbies, she 
lists volleyball, softball and 
riding around. Her goals in 
life are to be happy and 
successful in all she does.

Following graduation, 
she hopes to get a job and 
maybe settle down near 
Sudan.

BARGAIN
O F THE M O N T H

TOOL VALUE
o r THE MONTH

xcccccS
ccc-cv. M l

nowQ88
MR*

DELUXE E r  
BATH SCALE
Dial features easy-to-read  
n u m b ers . E x tra -la rg e  
p la tfo rm  in  a ttra c tiv e  
k eys to n e  shape . V in y l 
m at w ipes clean. Brown, 
white. 8810

QUANTTTKS LIMITED

n o w

BOOSTER 
CABLE
P re m iu m  q u a lity  10- 
gauge cable is a full 12 ft. 
T a n g le -p ro o f®  w /s o lid  
c o p p er c o n tac ts , s tee l 
sp rin g s , shock p ro o f  
handles. ST1012

y  QUANTITIES LIMITED y

Long-Nose Pliers

S irVes!

Diagonal Pliers

Your Choice! 

n o w

6V2-ln. PLIERS
Your choice of long-nose 
pliers for work in confin­
ing areas , o r d ia g o n a l 
p lie rs  fo r  c u ttin g  w ire  
very close 216/26S  

QUANTITIES LIMITED

401 S. 1st
Fry & Co, Inc.

m m
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ception in the fellowship 
hall of the church.

Katnleen Patterson of
registered 

at
the
the

Tracie Ann Webb and 
Stephen Brent Claybrook 
were united in marriage on 
Friday, December 18, at 
7:00 p.m. at the Richland 
Hills Baptist Church of 
Muieshoe. Brock Sanders 
officiated in the double 
ring candlelight ceremony.

Parents of the bride are 
Mr. and Mrs. Cleo Webb 
of Muieshoe. Parents of 
the groom are Ms. Helen 
Bickel of Muieshoe and Bill 
Claybrook of Vernon.

The couple stood before 
an altar flanked by palms 
and candles trimmed in 
pink and burgundy bows. 
Pink and burgundy bows 
adorned the reserved fam­
ily pews.

Musical selections were 
played by Tena Landers, 
piano; Brenda Robison, or­
gan; and Tana Webb, sis­
ter of the bride, played 
flute. Soloist was Jama 
Brown, who sang “ Ice 
Castles,” “ The Wedding 
Song and “ Colour My

Llano Estacado 
Will Help 1 
Senior Citizens

Llano Estacado Civic 
Club held their first 1982 
meeting last Tuesday night 
in the home of Hazel Cun­
ningham.

Preceding the business 
session, co-hostesses Mrs. 
Cunningham and Glenna 
Raney served a buffet din­
ner to the nine members 
attending the meeting.

A dinner of tuna casse­
role, salads and chocolate 
pie were served.

Discussed was the recent 
skating held for youth in 
the civic center. It was 
reported that more than 
230 youths attended the 
skating. At least one other 
skating party was planned 
for the near future.

Other discussions held 
concerned the furnishings 
for the senior citizens com­
munity room and the an­
nual presentation of money 
to Mrs. Elizabeth Watson 
to be used at her discretion 
to help needy school stud­
ents.

Members voted not to 
have the annual Easter 
Wardrobe project this year 
and will concentrate on 
projects which will make 
more money for the club to 
use for their various civic 
projects.

!n the absence of presi­
dent Loyce Davis, the vice 
president, Jessie Robinson 
conducted the meeting

Other members present 
included Hazel Cunning­
ham, Glenna Raney, Betty 
Carpenter, Dolores Har­
vey, Anita Lobaugh, Betty 
Hopper and Cleta Wil­
liams.

272-4511 ♦

Boy, These 
Maytags 

Are Really
Built!

*asj
Your Authorized 
Soles & Service 

Dealer

MNffoKS
122 S. 1st 
272-3030

World.” “ Endless Love 
and“ The Lord’., Prayer” 
were also sung by Brock 
and Peggy Sanders.

The bride, escorted and 
given in marriage by her 
father, wore a traditional 
white wedding gown of 
chiffon net overlayed with 
chiffon. The scoop neckline 
was edged in Chantilly lace 
with pearls and Chantilly 
lace covering the empire 
bodice of the gown. The 
full bishop sleeves were 
trimmed in lace ending 
with wide lace cuffs coup­
led with pearl bottoms. To 
complement her attire, the 

chapel length train, edged 
in Chantilly lace, fell in 
three tiers from the empire 
bodice. To complete her 
bridal ensemble, the bride 
wore a wide brimmed hat 
trimmed in Chantilly lace 
and pearls. Long chiffon 
streamers fell from the 
crown of the hat to the 
floor.

She carried a cascading 
bouquet of mixed fresh and 
silk flowers, featuring ros­
es, carnations, spider 
munis and baby’s breath, 
trimmed in the bride’s 
chosen colors of pink and 
burgundy.

She wore the traditional 
blue garter. Something 
new was her dress, some­
thing old was her maternal 
grandmother’s wedding 
band. As something bor­
rowed, the bride wore a 
pearl and gold necklace 
borrowed from a friend, 
Becky Love of El Paso.

Shelley Davis of Mule- 
shoe served as maid of 
honor. Bridesmaids were 
Melissa Allison and Terri 
Webb, sister of the bride,

both of Muieshoe. Serving 
as flowergirl was Jacie 
Bruns, and David Clay­
brook, nephew of the 
groom, served as ring- 
bearer. Candle lighters 
were Carlene Ellis, cousin 
of the bride, of Canyon, 
and Scott Bickel, brother of 
the groom, of Muieshoe.

The groom wore a white 
tux and pink rose bouton­

niere. Serving the groom 
as best man was Duane 
Franklin of Junction City, 
Kans. Groomsmen were 
Kent Reynalds, and Chey­
enne Bickel, brother of the 
groom, both of Muieshoe. 
Ushers were Dale Hughes 
of Muieshoe and Scott 
Bass of Amherst.

Following the ceremony, 
the guests attended a re-

Muleshoe 
guests. Serving

bride’s table were Tana 
Webb, sister of the bride, 
of Odessa and Becky Love 
of El Paso. Serving at the

groom’s table was Marsha 
Williams of Muieshoe.

i t
Out of town guests in­

cluded Letha Webb, the

grandmother of the bride 
and Mr. and Mrs. Bobby 
Webb, all of Paducah; Re- 
nonda Crump, Sue, Peggy 
and Sara Fiores, all of 
Berger; Walter, Beverly 
and Kim Ellis, all of Can­
yon.

W.O.T.S. (Women of 
Tolk Station) met for their 
weekly luncheon at Tri- 
County community room 
on January 14, with Betty 
Moore and Marv Smith as 
the hostesses.

Members present were 
Kay Madry, Lois Martinec, 
Mildred Williams, Marv 
Smith, Nora Flanary, Mil­
lie Mitchell, Rhonda Hugg, 
Gayle Jones, Faye Well­
born, Jeri Helton, April 
and Aimee Hugg, Rhonda 
Hugg, all of Muieshoe, 
Betty Moore of Earth, Pat 
Cummins and Dell Hardy, 
both of Sudan and Theresa 
Todd, Tcxico, N.M.

New member was Gayle 
Jones, whose husband, 
Barry, works for SPS.

Ruby Green was a guest.
The next luncheon will 

be January 21 at Tri-Coun- 
ty with Jeri Helton and 
Rhonda Hugg as the hos­
tesses.

For more information on 
W.O.T.S. please contact 
Mildred Williams at 272- 
5260 or Lois Martinec at

Society Deadlines Set
Weddings must be in the office by Monday noon for 

the Thursday paper and by Thursday noon for the 
Sunday paper. Any wedding more than two weeks old 
must be edited and only the basic information included.

No shower picture will be taken without a 24 hour 
notice and copy must be in the office by Monday at 5 
p.m. for the Thursday paper and by Thursday at 5 p.m. 
for the Sunday paper. An honoree’s picture will be 
taken at only one shower.

All club stories for following edition of paper must be 
in the office by 10 a.m. on Tuesday and Friday 
preceding the next issue of the paper.

SALE
Liquidating Entire Stock 
Art Supplies, Metal & Gold
Frames 30% OFF 

While Supplies Last

We Will Handle Rustic Wood

Frames Exclusively

Sherry’s Art Shack

«

272-4902 Tradetrinds Plaza
272-3019. ' '

GREAT C O LD W E A T H E R - -meal makers
Breakfast Sausage

2 lb. Sack

Half Beef Hamburger
t V 9

$1 19
l b .

lb.
Ham Hocks

ib. 99

Arm or Chuck Roast lb • . ■

.H

We Do Custom Butchering—o
\

Call Today For An Appointment.

ie

Call Us For Your 

Meat Orders!

Closed On Saturday

Winkler Meat Co.
401 Main 2 7 2 4 7 0 3

g ~ t
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^  ANNIVERSARY—Mr. and Mrs. Cleo Ward will 
celebrate their 25th anniversary Tuesday, January 19. The 
couple have three sons, Cecil of Lubbock, Danny of 
Abilene and Marvin of the home. Ward and the former 
Ruby McMahan were married Jan. 19, 1957 in Muleshoe. 
Ward is engaged in farming west of town and Mrs. Ward 
is employed at Fry and Cox.

Girl Scout Cookie 
Sale Scheduled

Kookaburras and Hoe- 
downs are the newest 
cookies to be added to the

Latest
Arrivals

Sheena Leigh Embry
Mr. and Mrs Lee Embry 

of Earth are the proud 
parents of a daughter born 

.January 6, at Central 
Plains Hospital in Plain- 
view.

The young lady weighed 
eight pounds and five and 
a fourth ounces and was 
20'/j inches long. She has 
been named Sheena Leigh.

Grandparents r t  Mr. 
and Mrs. Alvin Pittman of 
Earth and Mr. arid Mrs. 
Chester Embry of Mule- 
shoe.

Great-grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. D.A. Pitt­
man and Mr. and Mrs. T. 
E. Beason, all of Roches­
ter, Mr. and Mrs. J. E. 
Embry and Mae Lawhon, 
all of Muleshoe.

Great - great - grand­
mother is Ethyl Williams of 
Rochester.

Tonya Jane Burton
Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Bur­

ton of Texico, N.M. are the 
proud parents of a daugh­
ter born at 1:10 p.m. Jan. 
12, in West Plains Medical 
Center.

The young lady weighed 
five pounds and ten ounces 
and Las been named Tonya 
Jane. She has two brothers 
Rickey, nine and Rodney, 
seven years of age.

Grandparents are Mr. 
and Mrs. Ernest Biduy of 
Houston, Janie Burton of 
Gallup, N.M. and John 
Burton of Arizona.

Great-grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. Bob Owens 
,of Modesto, Calif, and Mr. 
and Mrs. Henley Parks of 
Smithville.

KICA
FM Stereo

The
Kountry
Kicker

1 0 8
On The Dial

24 Hours 
A Day

Girl Scout line of familiar 
favorites, annotnced Mrs. 
Nolen Swain, president of 
the Caprock Girl Scout 
Council. The Girl Scout 
cookie sale begins January 
29 and will run for two 
weeks, concluding on Feb­
ruary 14.

Kookabu.ras are thin 
cookie wafers with caramel 
in between and are covered 
in chocolate. Hoedowns 
combine peanut creme and 
chocolate with a cookie 
crunch. Also, Mints, Sa­
vannahs, Scot-teas, Dutch- 
n-Such, and Chocolate ard 
Vanilla Cremes will be sold 
again this year. Each box 
of cookies will sell for 
$2.90.

All money collected from 
the cookie sale remains in 
the Council. It will help 
support seminars, work­
shops, and other troop and 
council sponsored activi­
ties. It will help local girls 
participate in National Girl 
Scout events, such as the 
Wider Opportunities pro­
gram. The funds will also 
help maintain and develop 
Camp Rio Blanco, a resi­
dent camp for the 18-coun­
ty Caprock Girl Scout 
Council and located north­
east of Crosby*on.

The girls are presented 
awards according to the 
number of boxes they sell. 
Top prize is an $85 cam- 
pership toward resident 
camp or council event, a 
warded to those selling 180 
boxes or more. Certifica­
tes, posters patches, T- 
shirts, and a $55 camper- 
ship are also awarded.

True
The only international 

language that has en­
dured is double talk.

-News, Dallas.

Mrs Magness 
Presents Art 
Demonstration

The Muleshoe Art Asso­
ciation met Tuesday, Jan. 
12, at 2 p.m. in the com­
munity room of Muleshoe 
State Bank. Kathy Embry 
called the meeting to order 
in the absence of the pre­
sident.

Guest artist was Dickie 
Magness of Farwell. She 
has had a shop at Farwell 
for the last nine years. Two 
hundred students have 
taken her workshops.

She does workshops near 
Cloudcroft, N.M. and will 
be doing a workshop at 
Sherri’s Art Shack in 
Muleshoe Jan. 22.

Mrs. Magness began 
painting by taking lessons 
from Mary Lee Garrett in 
1963. Then in 1968, she 
started getting together 
with friends and began 
painting again.

Guests present included 
Gladys Armstrong and 
Dickie Magness. The 18 
members present were 
Betty Embry, Faye Hous­
ton, Ann Vinson, Suetta 
Rushing, Velma Davis and 
Theda Cobb.

Also, Linda Childers, 
Louise Roard, Dana Ar­
nold, Annette J. Bonds, 
Beth Watson, Gayle Little- 
town, Blanche Lenderson, 
Louva Kersey, Carrie Lee 
Bishop, Barbara Carpen­
ter, Kathey Embry and 
Betty Barker.

cTeMie ^ M artin  
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Miss Terrie Martin has 
been named the Girl of the 
Month of January by the 
Mnleshoe branch of the 
Amtriean Association of 
University Women. Terrie 
is a senior at Muleshoe 
High School. She is the 18 
year old daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Kenneth Don 
Martin, and was selected 
for this honor on the basis 
of school and church parti­
cipation and leadership 
qualities.

Terrie is the Senior Re­
presentative for the Mighty 
‘M’ B~nd and a member of 
Art Club. She is the Op­
timist Club Sweetheart and 
a member of the Primitive 
Baptist Church.

Her hobbies include 
swimming, painting and 
bike riding.

AAUW members con­
gratulate Terrie on her 
selection as Girl of the 
Month.

* mi k*.
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Young Homemakers 
Meeting Held

The Muleshoe Young 
Homemakers met on Tues­
day, January 12, in the 
high school homemaking 
lab. Nanette Soto, presi­
dent, called the meeting to 
order.

A discussion on various 
money making projects 
was held. These ideas are 
being explored by the pro­
ject chairman, Lesa John­
son

It was announced that a 
former member, Pam 
White, has a new baby 
boy. He was born January 
7. He weighed seven 
pounds and 11 ounces and 
has been named James 
Weldor The club is send­
ing Mrs. White and Wel­
don a baby gift.

Valarie Reynolds, A 
Young Homemaker mem­
ber and teacher at Mary 
DeShazo School, asked the 
members to help her find 
volunteer workers for her 
class room. She is needing 
adults to listen to her 
children read.

The next Young Home­
makers meeting will be 
held Feb. 9 at 7 p.m.

Members are to bring a 
Mexican Food dish and a 
secret pal gift to celebrate 
everyone’s birthday.

Members present were 
Julie Cathy, Valarie Rey­
nolds, Julie Broyles, Karen 
Treider, Liz Patterson, 
Jean Richardson, Pam 
Zwickey, Linda Turner, 
Terry Byers, Terry Mar- 
ricle, Pam Hancock, Non- 
ette Robinson, Elaine Stout 
and Nanette Soto.

Best Of Press

The Winner 
When it comes to cost 

per mile of operation, is 
there any vehicle more 
expensive than a super­
market shopping cart?

-News, Russell, Kan.

And Desire
Great minds have pur­

poses; others have 
wishes.

-Grit.

L 'S’in? ■' V «,-C
Muleshoe 

Singing Group

The Muleshoe Singing 
Group met Saturday, Jan­
uary 9, in the fellowship 
hall of the Trinity Baptist

Fred Wilbanks
Celebrates
Birthday

Four generations were 
present at a birthday cele­
bration, December 30, at 
the home of Mr. and Mrs. 
Fred Wilbanks. The event 
was in honor of Wilbank’s 
birthday. His wife, Vigil, 
cooked platters of catfish 
that were caught in the 
streams of Arkansas, their 
native land.

Those present included 
Paul, Judy and Shea Wil­
banks, Richard and Mari­
lyn Engelking; Doyle, 
Debbie, Dawn and Dustin 
Weir; and Heather and 
Holly Engelking.

Dave and Sheryl Engel­
king and Melissa Wilbanks 
were snow skiing in Colo­
rado.

Church with 34 present in­
cluding Mr. and Mrs. Arch 
Gibson of Lubbock, Bur- 
ford Hobbs, Opal Turn- 
bow, Lucile Teal, Ramon 
Rutlidge and J. D. Britton, 
all of Portales, N.M. and 
Mr. and Mrs. J. M. Craw­
ford of Ohon.

Also, Mrs. Trudie Barn­
ett, Stella May Haivey, 
Foster and Lenora Caryle, 
all of Clovis, N.M. and 
Ealand Upchurch of Earth. 
Gibson brought new song 
books.

J. C. Shanks, president, 
opened the meeting and 
led, the first two hymns. 
Invocation was given by J. 
M. Pruitt.

Unchurch s a i^  
while playing the 
quartet was arranged by
the visitors from Portales.

Benediction was given 
by Arch Gibson.

The group meets each 
Saturday at 6:30 p.m. in 
the fellowship hall of the 
Trinity Baptist Church.

J W & W
- j i - 1

Thou gh it  has an area o f  
m o re  th an  one m illio n  
square m iles, less th an  1 0 0  
square m iles o f  th e  A n ta rc ­
t ic  c o n tin e n t is free  fro m  a 
p erm anent b la n k e t o f  ice.

TERRIE MARTIN

FABRIC SALE
ELEGANT SUEDE
60 IN. Wide , ^  .  ot
80%  A m el 20% Nylon $  1  4 7

Reg. *3”  YD, X  Yard.

Short Lengths
VELOUR

60 IN. W ide * 2 * *

Dressmaker Lengths
COTTON & COTTON BLENDS

45 IN. W ide R e g .  *1” 77 Yard

V A N I T  Y V E L O U R
60 IN. Wide 
80% Am el
Reg. *2”

20% Nylon # 1  4 7
1  Yard

Short Lengths
S U E D E  „
*2“  Value $  ^

H P e r r y s  I
37

VARD
303 Main 

272-4642

IDifeon
Sales & Service For

MAYIAG
For 14 Years And Will Continue 

To Be!
/^T\C om e Today & Let “Smiling” 

Gordon Make You A Deal!

i fA N t/A* 3 I U M K [ ( f ) k

Still In Progress
Good Selection Of 

Merchandise 
To Choose From

Albertson ’s Shop Fqr Men
272-3000 228 Main

C0NGMTUUU10NS
"** BEST WISHES

GRAND CHAMPION STEER--Alan Harrison is shown with his Heavy Weight Cross Steer 
which was the Grand Champion of the Bailey County Junior Livestock Show Friday. 
Harrison also won 1st place with this steer and his Light Heavy Weight Cross Steer. Alan is 
the son of Mr. and Mrs. Ted Harrison.

Johns Custom Mills J
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GRAND CHAMPION LAMB-Jeanine Robertson is shown with her Grand 
Jeanine also won first place with her Heavy Weight Medium Wool |a 
County Junior Livestock Show. She is the daughter of Mr. and Mrs, Darv

Page 6, Bailey County Journal, Muleshoe, Texas, Sunday, January 17, 1982

Livestock...
Con’t from page 1 

4. Michael Barrett 
PURE BREED 

LT. WT. STEERS
1. Wade Wheeler
2. Chris Young
3. Jamie Wheeler
4. Todd Bessire
5. Sharia Morrison

PURE BREED 
HV. WT. STEERS

1. Jerry Gleason
2. Colen Tanksley
3. Chris Young
4. Jamie Wheeler

AMERICAN CROSS
1. Jerry Gleason
2. Greg Young
3. Jacinda Gleason

LIGHT WEIGHT 
CROSS STEER

1. Greg Young
2. Sherri Bessire
3. Jamie Robberson
4. Sherri Bessire
5. Stacey Kirby
6. Darin Shaw
7. Jeanine Robertson
8. Casey Stewart

MIDDLE WEIGHT 
CROSS STEER

1. Sharia Morrison
2. Mitzi Robertson
3. Chad Robberson
4. Delia Shaw
5. Jay Gleason
6. Jeanine Robertson
7. Heeth Burleson

LT. HV. WT. CROSS
1. Alan Harrison
2. Heeth Burleson
3. Todd Bessire
4. Jodie Wheeler
5. Jacinda Gleason
6. Mitzi Robertson
7. Wade Wheeler
8. Tracey Tunnell
HV. WT. CROSS STEERS
1. Alan Harrison
2. Belinda Wheeler
3. Jodie Wheeler
4. Stacey Kirby
5. Jay Gleason
6. Belinda Wheeler

SHEEP 
FINE WOOL

1. Starla Black
2. Jeanine Robertson
3. Michael Angeley
4. Donae Parker
5. Mandy Plank
6. Beth Harmon 

FINE WOOL CROSS
LIGHT WT.

1. Shawn Cooley
2. John Snitker
3. Kelly Overman
4. Chad Griswold
5. Shawn Cooley
6. Donae Parker 

FINE WOOL CROSS
HVY. WEIGHT

1. Mitzi Robertson
2. Michael Angely
3. Lesa Black
4. Pam Plank
5. Tamara Gilliland

MED. WOOL 
LT. WEIGHT

1. Jamie Wheeler
2. Michael Angely
3. Lance Free
4. Brett Alexander
5. Dondie Stewart
6. Casey Stewart

MED. WOOL 
LIGHT MEDIUM

1.
2.

‘ 3 .
4.
5.
6.

Chad Griswold 
Belinda Wheeler 
John Snitker 
Kelly Overman 
Beth Harmon 
Chad Griswold 

MED. WOOL 
MED. WT. 

Beth Harmon 
Jamie Wheeler 
Tamara Gilliland

Steve Griswold 
Casey Stewart 

MED WOOL 
LIGHT HEAVY 

Starla Black 
Lisa Black 
Pam Plank 
Steve Griswold 
Holly Huekaby 

MED WOOL 
HVY WT. 

Jeanine Robertson 
Starla Black 
Jodie Wheeler 
Zanna Huekaby 
Mandy Plank 
Steve Griswold 

SOUTHDOWN 
Zanna Huekaby 
Holly ”
Br .̂d Alexander 
SOUTHDOWN CROSS 
Lisa Black 
Shawn Cooley 
Paula Snell

SWINE 
LT. WT. 

BERKSHIRE
1. Chad Griswold
2. Bill Eubanks
3. Polly Harrison
4. Latrice Barrett
5. Brett Stegall

HVY. WT. 
BERKSHIRE

1. Russell Brown
2. Kay Lynn Prather
3. Beth Harmon
4. Shawn Cooley
5. Shawn Cooley

CHESTER 
LT. WT.

1 .Jerry Gleason
2. Rudy Cisneros
3. Stephanie Brown
4. Michael Angeley
5. Mike Holt
6. Polly Harrison
7. Jason Morris
8. Brad Stegall

CHESTER
HVY.WT.

1. Sharia Morrison
2. Rhonda Dunham
3. Todd Bessire
4. Bill Eubanks
5. Scott Bickel
6. Chris Young

LT. WT. 
DUROC

1. Louis Peacock
2. Gena Pearcey
3. Amy Harrison
4. Kevin Reeves
5. Joni Sudduth
6. Tod Holt
7. Tony Munez
8. Louis Peacock
9. Dusty Rhodes
10. Pat LeFebre

MED. LT. WT. 
DUROC

1. Sherri Bessire
2. Todd Bessire
3. Chris Young
4. Lynn Copley

5i Cheyenne Bickel
6. Michael Barrett
7. Heeth Burleson
8. Ray Vinson

MED. HVY. WT. 
DUROC

1. Wade Wheeler
2. Gena Pearcey
3. Gena Pearcey
4. Todd Jones
5. Delia Shaw
6. Scott Bickel
7. Nichole Overman
8. Belinda Wheeler

HVY. WT. 
DUROC

1. Tracey Tunnell
2. Lisa Black
3. Colin Tanksley
4. Steve Griswold
5. Kevin Reeves
6. Kelli Overman
7. Kevin Reeves
8. Cheyenne Bickel

LT. WT. 
HAMPSHIRE

1. Colin Tanksley
2. Tracey Tunnell
3. Craig Hunt
4. Latrice Barrett
5. Steve Roberts
6. Casey Stewart
7. Jeff Cline
8. Kevin Atwood
9. Amy Harrison
10. Latrice Barrett

LT. MED. 
HAMPSHIRE

1. Rhonda Dunham
2. Todd Bessire
3. Dusty Rhodes
4. Jodie Wheeler
5. Bill Eubanks
6. Dusty Rhodes
7. Michael Barrett
8. Kelli Overman
9. Brad Stegall

MED. HVY.WT. 
HAMPSHIRE

1. Greg Young
2. Delia Shaw
3. Jerry Gleason
4. Kay Lynn Prather
5. Bret Stegall
6. Heeth Burleson
7. Stephanie Brown
8. Chad Griswold

HVY. WT. 
HAMPSHIRE

1. Sharia Morrison
2. Russell Brown
3. Todd Jones
4. Kim F&dfer ^
S; Crriig Hum
6. T6d Holt *
7. Beth Harmon

LT. WT. 
POLAND

1. Brad Stegall
2. Lynn Copley
3. Andy Copley
4. Twayna Copley
5. Michelle Stevenson

HVY. WT. 
POLAND

1. Troy Watson
2. Andy Copley
3. Michael Dunham
4. Steve Griswold

LT. WT. 
SPT. POLAND

1. Beth Harmon
2. Tonya Copley
3. Robin Moore
4. Danny Seales
5. Lance Free
6. Cris Hopkins
7. Jeff Kline
8. Barry Bass

Complete & Balanced 
Nutrition Dog Foo,d 

P U P P Y  FO O D
2 7 %  PRO TEIN

20 LB. Bag ^ 5 ^

HI-PROTEIN  
D O G M E A L  so LB. Bag 
26%  PRO TEIN

Five Point

* Dog Food
50 LB. Bag

$036
25 LB. Bag

$515
Alert

t - A M I  c a t  Food

9. Barry Bass
HVY. WT.

SPT. POLAND
1. Michelle Stevenson
2. Heeth Burleson
3. Phil Oxford
4. Scott Branscum
5. Chad Griswold
6. Steve Griswold

LT. WT.
YORKSHIRE

1. Wes Hanks
2. Greg Young
3. Sherri Bessire
4. Lance Free
5. Danny Seales

HVY. WT. 
YORKSHIRE

1. Robin Moore
2. Rhonda Dunham
3. Jerry Bob Graves
4. Kay Lynn Prather
5. Joni Sudduth

LT. WT. 
CROSS

1. Wade Wheeler
2. Wes Hanks
3. Greg Atwood
4. Stephanie Brown
5. Jodie Wheeler
6. Phil Oxford
7. Steve Roberts
8. Jimmy Seales

LT. MED. 
CROSS

1. Colin Tanksley
2. Mike Holt
3. Russell Brown
4. Darin Shaw
5. Sharia Morrison
6. Michael Barrett
7. Jane Stevens

MED. HVY. 
CROSS

1. Michael Dunham
2. Darin Shaw
3. Greg Young
4. Michelle Stevenson
5. Kevin Atwood
6. Tracey Tunnell
7. Jason Morris
8. Jane Stevens

HVY. WT. 
CROSS

1. Shawn Cooley
2. Starla Black
3. Joni Sudduth
4. Jodie Wheeler
5. Chris Young
6. Nichole Overman
7. Craig Hunt

Housing...
Con’t from page 1 gg 
would move to Muleshoe if 
housing was sufficient,” 
said Smallwood.

In explaining the lack of 
sales, Smallwood used this 
formula: “ The average 
price of a new home for 
Muleshoe is $50,000. If a 
$5,000 is required to be 
paid down, that leaves 
$45,000 to put into the loan 
at 17‘/ j % interest. Interest 
and payments would then 
amount to $677.23; add $80* 
taxes and insurance for a 
$757.23 total monthly pay­
ment. This is just almost 
totally out of reach for the 
average working family.

* * * *
Study may provide in­

telligence but it takes 
thinking to develop 
wisdom.

a g r l -  [
f a d s

Bill Wooley

C o rn  f  rm e rs  m a y  be
changing this season. A new 
nitrification inhibitor has 
been announced by a major' 
ag ricu ltu ra l chemical 
producer for use on fall 
applied nitrogen on corn. 
Application will initially be 
on a limited experimental 
basis. However, researchers 
see significant gains in 
prevention of nitrogen loss. 
A nitrification inhibitor 
prevents nitrogen from 
being lost due to leaching 
and denitrification. It also 
limits the action of soil 
bacteria responsible for 
changing nitrogen from 
ammonium into nitrate. The 
inhibitor, according to the 
company, should aid corn 
farmers with better nitrogen 
efficiency and substantially 
higher yields. This also 
eliminates side dressing and 
top dressing. Additionally, 
the new inhibitor will permit 
nitrogen application in the 
fall, when lower prices can be 
taken advantage of, rather 
than in the spring.

Irrigation...
Con’t from page 1 
the TES will round out the 
first session with a discus­
sion of the cost of produc­
tion of feed grains.

Some other subjects 
scheduled for the confer­
ence include: Tillage and 
Residue Management by

Muleshoe...
Con’t from page 1

Cherylee Northcutt, the 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Jess Bryant, graduated 
cum laude from Texas 
Tech University. She re­
ceived her Bachelor of 
Science degree in elemen­
tary education. Cherylee 
was on the Dean’s honor 
list with an overall grade 
point average of 3.69. Her 
husband, Dean, is a Senior 
Petroleum Engineering 
major at Texas Tech.

*•*
Robert Prather of Coleman 
formerly of Lazbuddie, fell 
Dec. 15 while on the job 
and suffered a hip injury 
that required surgery. He 
also broke his left wrist.

According to his niece, 
Connie Barnes of Lazbud­
die, he is doing fine at this 
time.

«**
The Muleshoe Country 

Club Ladies’ Golf Associa­
tion membership luncheon 
will be held on Wednesday 
January 20 at 12 (noon) at 
the Country Club.

A member says, ‘‘We 
would like to encourage 
you to become a member 
and enjoy playing golf and 
cards each Wednesday at 1 
p.m.”

***
Jennyslippers (Women’s 

Division of the Chamber of 
Commerce) will meet at 7 
p.m., January 21, in the 
meeting room of Muleshoe 
State Bank. According to 
the president, Nelda Mer- 
riott. a film entitled, “ pack 
Your Own Chute” will be 
shown.

Wooley
International. Inc. 

W. Hwy 84 

272-5514

Dennis Neffendorf, Area 
Agronomist with SCS; El­
ectric Energy - loan man­
agement by Connie Gup- 
ton, Manager of the Bailey 
County Electric Coopera­
tive.

After lunch and viewing 
of exhibits, the conference 
will start off with ‘‘Water 
Use Management” by Dr. 
Bill Lyle, Ag Engineer, 
TES Research Center, fol­
lowed by Don McElioy of 
Irrigation Pump & Power, 
Inc. of Muleshoe and Leon 
New, Irrigation Specialist, 
Extension Service and Ken 
Carver, Agriculturist, High 
Plains Underground Water 
District Number 1.

4

The conference is being 
jointly sponsored by the 
Bailey County Electric Co­
operative, Blackwater Val­
ley Soil and Water Conser­
vation District and the 
Texas Agriculture Exten­
sion Service.

All local and area pro­
ducers are urged to attend 
this conference.

Harris."
Con’t from page 1
the Navy aboard an aircraft
carrier.

Harris said he would ap­
preciate your vote and in­
fluence in the upcoming 
Democratic Primary elec­
tion.

Water...
Con’t from page 1 
ment program is expected 
to be completed in Feb­
ruary, weather permitting. 
Data on individual wells 
will be available within a 
few days of completed 
readings, but tabulated 
data on the entire network 
is not expected until mid­
year.

Logical Reason
He: "Why do you weep 

and sniffle at a picture show 
over the imaginary woes of 
people you never met?”

She: “ Same reason why 
you scream and yell when a 
man you don’t know slides 
into second base.”
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BESTWISW

RESERVE CHAMPION STEER -Belinda Wheeler is
• shown here with her Heavy Weight Cross Steer which won 
Reserve Champion at the Bailey County Junior Livestock 
Show. She also won the showmanship award in steers and 
the Jimmy Dale Black award. Belinda is the daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Joe Wheeler.

\

Nickels & Nickels of Baileyboro 
Nickels & Nickels o f Goodland
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at the close of business on 
February 16, 1982. The 
preferred stock dividends 
are payable May 31, 1982 
to holders of record at the 
close of business on April 
20. 1982.

£  Con’t from page 1

St- Paul and Ma­
rine, a Minnesota-based
firm fu n d ed  in 1853, is 

2|j, the sixteenth largest writer 
„ °f property and casualty 

b j insurance in the U. S. Its 
insurance products are 
marketed through 8,900

#  independent agents. In 
1980 the company’s written 
premiums were more than 
$1.5 billion.

The Casey Agency has 
been in business for about 
50 years. Beverly Heath- 

(1 ington, daughter of the late 
 ̂ W. Q. Casey, took over the

•  management of the busi- 
v* * ness f°,,ow‘ng the death of
' Mr. Casey in Agusut of 

1977.
The Casey Agency now 

employs Charlena Lindt, 
who came to Mulcshoe

* from the Ordway-Saund^rs 
Agency in Amarillo and

f f-  Tracie Clay brook, besides
* Ms. Heathington.
f

{ Mules...
* Con’t from page 1

points for the Mules, with 
•K Ronny Cox and Macario

Reyes behind him with
* eight points each. Other 

scorers were Jeff Hamilton 
and Chubby Ramos.

The Mules next home 
game will be against Lit-

« tlefield on January 22.
*
t  Republicans...

Con’t from prge 1 
publican Party will have 
several candidates running 
for office in th t next elec­
tion and the Party urg s 

v anyone interested to join
J with them to promote a
+ true two-party system in
^ Bailey County.

community and business 
affairs have included: exe­
cutive board member of 
the Boy Scouts of America
and of the Amarillo United 
Way, member of Amarillo 
Community Council, and 
the administrative board of 
the Polk Street Methodist 
Church. He was elected to 
the First National Bank of 
Amarillo board of directors 
in November, 1981.

Also in its meeting, after 
the annual shareholders 
meeting today at the firm’s

later became a statician- 
engineer, rate engineer, 
and rate manager, before 
being elected vice presi­
dent of rates and budgets 
in 1969. He was named 
executive vice president in 
1972, and joined the board 
of directors in 1974.

Springer has been active 
in many civic and business 
affairs and has served as 
president of the Amarillo 
Chamber of Commerce, 
co-chairman of the United 
Way, member of the Pre­
sident’s Council at West 
Texas State University and 
at Texas Tech University, 
and a director of the Na­
tional Food and Energy 
Council.

Springer tvceived the 
“ Distinguished Engineer’’ 
award from Texas Tech in
1975.

An Amarillo native, 
Ballengee earned a busi­
ness administration degree 
at the University of Texas, 
and began work at South­
western as an accounting

Excise Tax 
Lowered 
On GTE

department clerk in 1949. 
In 1951, he was advanced 
to chief clerk, and was 
appointed personnel man­
ager in 1957. With the ac­
quisition of the company’s 
first data processing capa­
bility in 1961, Ballengee 
became Southwestern’s

first director of data pro­
cessing. He was named di­
rector of finance in 1972, 
and assumed the respon­
sibilities of financial vice 
president in 1973.

Ballengee’s activities in

member ot the company s 
board. Prior to his pro­
motion, Springer had serv­
ed as president since 1976 
and was named chief ex­
ecutive officer in early 
1981. Ballengee had served 
as executive vice president 
since 1979.

Southwestern Public 
Service primarily provides 
electric utility service to a 
population of more than 1 
million in a 45,000-square- 
mile area of the Panhandle 
and South Plains of Texas, 
eastern and southeastern 
New Mexico, the Okla­
homa Panhandle and 
southwestern Kansas.

Springer is a Memphis,
Texas, native and indus­
trial engineering graduate 
of Texas Tech University. 
He started his SPS career 
as a draftsman in 1948. He

Longhorn 
Award 
Banquet Set

Highlights of the Cotton 
Bowl Champion Texas 
Longhorns’ 1981 football 
season will be reviewed 
and the team’smost valua­
ble athlete named at the 
annual Longhorn Football 
Banquet on Friday, Jan­
uary 29 at 7 p.m. at the 
Frank Erwin Center in 
Austin.

The 1982 Longhorn 
Football Awards Banquet 
features the presentation 
of lettermen, several ath- 

• letic land scholastic awards 
and a visual presentation 
of the season’s high points. 
Also included in the pro­
gram are the Longhorn 
Band and cheerleaders.

The Master of Ceremon­
ies is the Houston attorney 
and iormer Longhorn foot­
ball player Charles L. 
(Sonny ( Sowell. Coach 
Fred Akers will present the 
lettermen and athletic a- 
wards.

The banquet is sponsor­
ed r.nnually by The Ex- 
Students Association of the 
University of Texas at 
Austin and is the finale of 
each football season. ‘Fan’ 
tickets are $15.00. For fur­
ther information call the 
ExStudents’ Association at 
(512) 476-6271 or write Box 
7278, Austin, Tx. 78712.

FIRST PLACE WINNER -Sharia Morrison, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Herman Morrison, is shown with her 
Middleweight Cross Steer, which was a first place winner 
at the Bailey County Junior Livestock Show.

SAN ANGELO.......Tele­
phone users throughout 
the country got at least one 
gift for Christmas that isn’t 
the wrong size or wrong 
color.

On Jan. 1, 1982, the 
federal exise tax on tele­
phone service dropped 
from two percent to one 
percent.

Nationwide, the one 
percent reduction should 
save telephone customers 
approximately $516 million

according to estimates by 
the U. S. Independent 
Telephone Association.

** 1- Th« rax was imposed by ***' 
Congress as a ’temporary' 1 
measure during World 
War II. Congress voted in 
1970 to gradually eliminate 
the tax, reducing it one 
percent per year beginning 
in 1973 and continuing 
until 1982 when the tax 
would be eliminated.

However, the Fiscal 
Year 1981 Budget Recon­
ciliation Bill, signed by 
former Ptwsident Jimmy 
Carter on Dec. 5, 1980, 
contained a provision 
maintaining the excise tax 
on telephone and type­
writer service at the two 
percent level during 1980.
And this year’s tax bill 
further postpones the 
phase out, keeping the tax 
at one percent until Jan. 1, 
1985.

ANNIVERSARY PLAQUC.-Fred LaPointe, on left, pre­
sented Beverly Heathington, owner of Casey Insurance 
Agency, with a personalized 25th anniversary plaque. 
LaPoinie represented St. Paul Fire and Marine Insurance 
Company, with which he is a field supervisor.

Thornton Chevrolet

Prices Effective January 18 
Thru January 31,1982

STOP IN AND PICK UP YOUR COPY OF OUR 
SUPER 8 VALUE DAYS CIRCULAR

M E C H A N ^

means va
Mulettes Slip 
Past Aiiton

HARDWARE STORESThe Mulettes met the 
Anion <girls in a olase game 
played here in Muleshoe 
on Tuesday night. The 
Mulettes squeaked by with 
a two point lead to end the 
game at 52-50 in a closely 
matched game.

Denise Wilson led the 
Mulettes in scoring with 13 
points to her credit, while 
Delia Shaw was close on 
her heels with eleven. Jill 
Turner scored ten points; 
and Cindy Turner and 
Marylyn Lewis scored five 
points each. Other scoring 
was made by Lavon Rho­
des, Rhonda Dunham, 
JCristi Henry, Tori Hunt 
and Sherry Ellis.

*  • *  *

We wish all products 
were as good as the ad­
vertisements suggest they

Y o u r  lo c a l in d e p e n d e n t ly  o w n e d  T ru e  V a lu e  H a r d w a r e  
S to re  h as  n a t io n a l c h a in -b u y in g  p o w e r .

Master
MECHANIC6-GAL

WET/DRY VACUUM
Heavy-duty vac handles debris ordinary  
vacuum s can't: w ood  chips, nails and  
even w a te rl W ith  hose, w an d s , dolly, 
nozzle and squeegee shoe. M M 600-6

Master
M ECH AN IC

R e tra c ta b le  K nife
w ith  nine position  
blade. 109819

Professional pow er tape w ith  
p o s itiv e  to g g le  lock, se lf- 
adjusting end hook.M M P325

M aster
MECHANIC

CROSSCUT
HANDSAW 14-In. Back S aw  for

fine  cutting.
M M 10014P ro fessional crosscut saw  

w ith  4 -w ay taper. Bevel filed. 
Nickel alloy steel, hardwood  
handle. M M 10010/80
26-In. 10-Pt. S a w ......... 11.38

21-PC. SOCKET SET M achine cast-m etal back w ith 18x4'/, inch w ood base. 
Precision guides fo r angle cut w hen fram ing, cutting  
m olding and m ore. Valuable workshop tool. M M 3618

3/8-inch drive set features nickel chrom e-plated sockets. 
Also includes the handy quick release ratchet, standard  
and deep sockets, 2 extensions and tool box. T821

Slay cool 
handle U n c iw

MECHANIC
Master
MECHANIC22 ga steel 

cabinet

Automatic
thermostat
control

ELECTRIC 
GLUE GUN

lighted heat 
swrtch— 1320 
or 1500 watts

Quickly m elts glues or sealers for fast, 
perm anent bond. Features built-in ther­
m ostat. Ideal for hom e repairs. 203M M

Powerful snips for workshop  
use. Polished blades, vinyl 
plastic coated grips P77S

Precision edges and sides. 4 
p lu m b  a n d  2 le v e l v ia ls , 
heavy glass w indow s. 10117

Safety
tip-over
switch

HI and 10 
tan speeds

F A N -F O R C E D  U T IL IT Y  H EA TE R

Master
MECHANICMaster

MECHANICMECHANIC

16x24-IN

1&-0Z. CLAW 
HAMMER V
R u g g ed  h icko ry  h a n d le , 
b a la n c e d  w ith  b e ll-fa c e d  
head. B 16M M /R M M
16-Oz. Rip H am m er . . .  .7.96

10-IN. ^
ADJUSTABLE
WRENCH
D urab le  aHoy-ateel w rench  
w ith  ru s t-fes is ttrit, chrom -

COPPER 
FINISH SQUARE
For accurate cuts and m ea­
surem ents. S teel w ith  rust­
proof copper fin ish .C 600M M

STRAIGHT CATS 
PAW CLAW BAR
9-in. fo rged  c law  bar pulls  
nails, e c u  as m ini-crow bar. 
Heat treated M M 1 3 0

FIRST PLACE-Chad Griswold is shown w*th his Light 
Medium Wool lamb which won a first place at the Bailey 
County Junior Livestock Show. Chad is the son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Dale Griswold.

R e p la c e a b le  ja w s , f u l l ­
f lo a tin g  hook fo r easy re  
lease. Forged. M M 1 (

Terry Field Ins
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tional Year of Disabled Hines, 111., 
Persons among federal >n 1974. Sin
agencies. be=p * bioni

The new chair will en- *1 the 
able quadriplegics to more e,lCe ‘n aver 
efficiently maneuver an el- Nearly 1‘ 
ectric wheelchair. The veterans w
“ Smart” model uses Pola- their GI life
roid ultrasonic sensor *c‘es >n f°rct
technology -- a sensor on record $664
the camera provides the dend during
proper subject-to-camera ^be Texas
distance required for fo- total more t 
cusing. Two sensors that bon> accordi 
triangulate the user’s head erans Admit 
position are mounted on Because
the wheelchair. The infor- terest rates 
mation from the sensors is surance fun<
then used to control the to be paid ti
chair's movement or direc- during 1982
tion. Other features of the above the H
chair include obstacle de- No applic 
tection, wall-following and ed- Dividem
cruise control. automatical!

Research is continuing at on the anni\
the VA Center on the the individu
“ Smart Wheelchair” , and policy,
a marketable demonstra- Policy hold
tion chair is expected to be ce*ve varyin
available this winter. The pending on
researchers hope to pro- policy, the
duce a chair that won’t add surance in 
more than $500 to the total sured’s age
cost of a conventional el- renewal and
ectric wheelchair. l*cy has beei

Jaffe joined the VA as a Nationally
biomedical engineering as- million will I
sistant section chief at the 000 World \

buy the money order on 
the installment plan at $2 a 
week trom now on.

Thus for a few dollars 
you can buy a new car and 
get the economy booming. 
If you don’t have a few 
dollars, embargo grain 
and caterpillar tractors to 
Russia and maybe they’ll 
do it.

Yours faithfully, 
J.A.

Office understands inter­
national finances.

Say you’d like to help 
get the car industry back 
on its feet by buying a new 
car but don't have the 
down payment. Go to the 
Post Office and buy a 
money order equal to the 
down payment and drive 
off in the model of your 
choice. But, and here’s the 
revolutionary new idea,

the place to do it in.
If banks won’t go for 

this, I have hit on another 
idea you might say is up on 
the international financial 
level.

As I understand it, the 
economy is sagging be­
cause people aren’t buying 
and the reason they aren’t 
buying is they’re short of 
cash. There’s a remedy for 
this, provided the Post

with current policies. The 
average dividend for term 
policyholders will be $307 
and for permanent plan
policyholders, $303.

Some 3.124.000 World 
War II veterans with acrive
policies will share $590 
million. Average dividend 
for term policyholders will 
be $121. Fot permanent 
plan policyholders the av­
erage dividend will be $246 
and modified life plan po­
licyholders will receive an 
average of $116.

Korean Conflict veterans 
who kept their Gl insur­
ance in force -  a total of 
4%,000 -  will receive an 
average payment of $71. 
Their policies earned $35 
million during the past 
year.

More than 161,000 dis­
abled veterans of World 
War II and the Korean 

.Conflict holding Veterans 
Special Life Insurance Pol­
icies will receive an aver­
age dividend of $97. This is 
only the third year divi­
dends will be paid in this 
program.

A greater share of the 
higher interest rates was 
earned by those veterans 
who converted their insur­
ance plans to permanent 
type policies rather than 
continuing to hold the ori­
ginal term policies.

Each of the four partici­
pating insurance program 
funds are a separate entity, 
accounting for the differ-

Ralston Purina 
Will Award 
Scholorships

During the next school 
year, 69 outstanding up­
perclassmen in colleges of 
agriculture located through 
out North America and in 
Puerto Rico will again be 
completing their under­
graduate work with the 

I assistance of the Ralston 
Purina Scholarship Pro­
gram.

The $750 Ralston Purina 
Scholarship is awarded to 

[ one deserving incoming 
junior or senior at 65 state 
universities and land grant 
colleges. It is also awarded 
in three Canadian agricul- 
Itural colleges and in one 
college in Puerto Rico.

The student selected to 
receive the Scholarship is 
recommended by a Schol­
arship committee consist­
ing of faculty members of 
the college. The faculty 
committee chooses the re­
cipient on the basis of his 
scholastic record, partici­
pation in campus affairs, 
and eligibility for financial 
assistance.

This will be the 28th 
year of the Ralston Purina 
Scholarships. During the 
first twenty-seven years, 
the program has helped 
1,607 students finish their 
college undergraduate 
work.

Information
For

Veterans

The
Sandhills

Philosopher
A Veterans Administra­

tive rehabilitative engi­
neering researcher, David 
L. Jaffe, has received na­
tional recognition for the 
development of the “ Smart 
Wheelchair” -  a cheir that 
avoids obstacles by ultra­
sonic radar.

Jaffe, an engineer at the 
VA’s Palo Alto, Calif., Re­
habilitative Engineering 
and Development Center, 
supervised the VA-funded 
project designed by five 
graduate mechanical engi­
neering students at Calif­
ornia’s Stanford Univer­
sity.

The “ Smart Wheel­
chair” was a regional win­
ner and a national finalist 
in the Johns Hopkins Uni­
versity First National
Search for Personal Com­
puters to Aid the Handi­
capped, sponsored by the 
National Science Founda­
tion and the Tandy Com­
pany. The award came as 
the VA concluded spear­
heading the 1981-lnterna-

Dear editor:
Sometimes it looks like 

U. S. foreign policy is de­
signed to teach a lesson to 
every country except ours.

For example, two years 
ago we shut off grain sales 
to Russia when she invad­
ed Afghanistan and it sure 
taught her a lesson. It 
taught her that if she 
couldn’t buy grain from 
American farmers she 
could buy it from Canada, 
Argentina, etc.

Now Washington is go­
ing to cut off caterpillar 
tractors, drill bits and a lot 
of technical stuff because 
of Russia’s hand in Poland. 
Other countries are grin­
ning and rubbing their 
hands.

One group that probably 
wishes something else had 
been cut off a lot earlier is 
some big city banks. They­
’ve loaned the Communist 
government of Poland mil­
lions of dollars and can’t 
get it back. Can’t even 
collect the interest.

In fact, the Polish gov­
ernment has asked for $350 
million more in loans to 
pay off the interest. I don’t 
know if the banks will be 
interested, but if they are 
I’d like to get in touch with 
them. If a person could 
borrow money, then bor­
row more to pay the inter­
est every time it comes 
due, he could live comfor­
tably the rest of his life, 
although from the looks of 
things Poland wouldn’t be

FIRST PLACE-Lisa Black is shown here with her
Southdown Cross lamb which was a first place winner at 
the Bailey County Junior Livestock Show. Lisa is the 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Ronnie Black.

Reynolds & Young Equip

Congratulations
go to

Mr. & Mrs. Manuel Gonzales
on having the

New Year’s Baby o f 1982

Maria Josephine Gonzales
was bom Jan. 13 ai 10:49 p .n .

Letters are now being 
sent bv Ralston Purina 
Company to all eligible 
colleges offering the 1982- 
83 scholarships, according 
to an announcement made 
by George H. Kyd, Divi­
sion Vice President and 
Director of Public Rela­
tions.

NEWS VIEWS
Ronald Reagan, P resi­

dent, on spending 
cuts:
“ It is a step away from 

the big spending that 
wreaked havoc in the past 
and toward our goal of 
once again living within 
our means.”

The following merchants say welcome to Maria Josephine Gonzales

Allsups
ileshoe Body Shop McCormick Seeds Inc 
ileshoe Publishing Shook Tire Co,
nch House Motel Tennie’s Beauty Sho] 

Decorator’s .Nursery and Floral 
William Brothers Office Supply

J. Bennett Johnston, Sen­
ator (D-La), on 
budget:
"If we’re going to save 

th is  e c o n o m y .. .w e ’re 
going to have to return to 
the old time religion of a 
balanced budget.”*

FIRST PLACE WINNER-Zanna Huckaby, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Lyndon Huckaby, is shown here with her 
Southdown Lamb which was a first place winner at the 
Bailey County Junior Livestock Show.

Alexander M. Haig Jr., 
Secretary of State, on 
Poland:
“ We see no signs the 

Soviet Union is about to 
intervene in Poland..,’’

( P ^ M i j  j |
1
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Sudan News
By Evelyn Ritchie

Holiday visitors in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. 
Freddie Legg and children 
were her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Olan Hays of Alva, 
Texas, and an aunt, Mr. 
and Mrs. Haly Richardson 
of Slaton.

I *****

Mr. and Mrs. Philip 
Gordon, Jeff and Kay Lynn 
visited in Olney during the 
holidays with her mother, 
Mrs. Vera Thomas 

* ••••
Mrs. Edna Bellamy is in 

Fort Worth with her son

and family, the Ralph Bell­
amy’s following a wreck 
that caused Ralph to un­
dergo surgery. It was re­
ported that he was in 1CU 
for several days, in Harris 
Hospital there.

* * * * *

Shelley Pickrell, daugh­
ter of Mr. and Mrs. Gary 
Pickrell and a student at 
ACU in Abilene was home 
for the Christmas holidays. 
She also visited her brother 
Mr. and Mrs. Kevin Pick­
rell and her grandparents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Quinton Mc- 
Chaghren.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Glen 

Cardwell and Glenda were 
in Blytheville, Ark. recent­
ly and visited in Greenville 
with his parents, Mr. and

COME

DURING
PIONEER
/iSDAYS

See which varieties did best in our 
area. Visit with your friends and neigh­
bors. Join us in a free cup of coffee. 
And take home a good-looking new 
cap just for stopping by!

Yours 
Free!

if

Wiedebush &
. C o , > » *
1620 W.1 Amer. Blvd. 

272-4281
i

January
22

Mrs. Hal Cardwell and 
other family members.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. John Ca­

pers and Rebecca returned 
Saturday to their home in 
Cadiz, Ohio, following the 
holidays here with her par­
ents, Mr. and Mrs. B. A. 
Beauchamp and Darwin. 
Mr. and Mrs. Gene Vick­
ers, Amy and Kristi left 
this past week for their 
home in Mansfield, Ohio 
following the holidays here 
also.

*****
Ray Dudgeon, a student 

at TSTI in Amarillo and 
Roy Don Dudgeon, student 
at McMurry College in 
Abilene visited during the 
holidays with their parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Noble Dud­
geon.

• • • * •

Mr. and Mrs. Blackie 
Seymore hosted a Christ­
mas dinner in their home 
during the holidays when 
present were her mother, 
Mrs. Muriel Crouch and 
also Mr. and Mrs. Van 
Seymore, Elizabeth, Shana 
and Daniel of Sudan; Mr. 
and Mrs. Don Goodyear of 
Arlington; Dr. and Mrs. 
Gary Goodyear of Grand 
Prairie; Bob Crouch and 
boys of Ivanhoe, Calif.; 
Mr. and Mrs. Terry Dun­
can, Jamie and Chris and 
Jean; and Mr. and Mrs. 
Buddy Crouch, Amy and 
Buddy Boy. all of Loving- 
ton, N.M.

Viola Gore has returned 
home from visiting her 
son, Ira Childress of Arca­
dia, Calif.; her sister, Mr. 
and Mrs. Arthur Galloway 
in Lynwood, Calif, and 
grandchildren, Christine, 
Timothy and Scotty Chil­
dress in Chino, Calif, and 
her nephew, Mr. and Mrs. 
G. K. Galloway and family, 
also in Chino.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Jayson 

Cox of Lubbock visited 
during the New Year's 
holiday with Chub Morrow.
'd i f  1 * * * * * *

Jamie Cox, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Jerry Cox, visited 
during the New Year’s 
holiday in Amarillo with
his uncle, Leon Phillips. 

*****
Muffin and Mandy Davis 

of College Station are vis­
iting their grandparents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Pete Lance, 
and other relatives.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Marvin 

Tollett have returned home 
from visiting their children 
and grandchildren in 
Beaumont.

• * • • *

Mrs. Walt Yarbrough of 
Midland visited last week-

' o o o g o D O Q D n n n n n n r * < ■
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FIRST P U C E .... Starla Black is shown here with her 
Light Heavy Medium Wool Lamb which won first p'ace at 
the Bailey County Junior Livestock Show. Starla is the 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Ronnie Black.

M uleshoe State Bank

end with her mother, Gen­
eva Thomasson and aunt, 
Jerry Herzog.

Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Cox, 
Jamie and Danene hosted 
a family dinner Christmas 
Day when her parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Morris Phillips of 
Muleshoe joined them. Al­
so visiting were her bro­
ther, Mr. and Mrs. De- 
wayne Phillips, Christie 
and Michael of Hugoton, 
Kan. and her sister, Mr. 
and Mrs. Darwin McBee 
and girls of Morton and 
Leon Phillips of Amarillo.

• • • • *

Lt. Comm. Radney Fish­
er left Sunday for his home 
in Washington, D.C. where 
he is stationed with the U.
S. Navy, following a visit 
here during the Christmas 
and New Year holidays 
with his mother, Josephine 
Fisher, Missy and also 
with his brother, Mr. and 
Mrs. Mike Fisher, Tanya 
and Shannon. Their sister, 
Kathey of Hart also visited 
with them during the holi­
days.

• * • * •

Noble Dudgeon was a 
surgical patient in the 
Methodist Hospital last 
week where he underwent 
exploratory surgery and 
has been in the ICU unit 
for several days.

*****
Christmas guests with 

Opal Pennington were her 
children and grandchildren 
including Mr. and Mrs. 
Mitch Johnson and boys of 
Fort Worth; Mr. and Mrs. 
Ray White of San Antonio; 
Edith Ruggerillo and Dam­
on of El Paso; Mr. and 
Mrs. Robin Taylor and 
girls of Lubbock; Mr. and 
Mrs. Billy Gerik of Morton 
and Mrf. and Mrs. Gary 
Gerik and girls, also of 
Morton.

Muleshoe
School Menu

i___________ -
V Jan. 18-22, 1982

MONDAY
BREAKFAST
Milk
Cereal
Fruit
LUNCH
Steaks and Gravy 
English Peas 
Creamed Potatoes 
Hot Rolls 
Fruit 
Milk

TUESDAY
BREAKFAST
Milk
Honey Buns
Juice
LUNCH
Hamburgers
Lettuce and Tomato
Pickles and Onions
Tater Tots
Fruit Cobbler
Milk

WEDNESDAY 
BREAKFAST 
Milk 
Toast 
Jelly 
Fruit 
LUNCH 
Meat Loaf 
Potatoes 
Corn
Cornbread
Cookies
Milk

THURSDAY
BREAKFAST
Milk
Honey Buns
Juice
LUNCH
Corn Dogs
Vegetable Beef Soup
Crackers
Cinnamon Rolls
Fruit
Milk

FRIDAY
BREAKFAST
Milk
Oatmeal
Toast
Fruit
LUNCH
Fried Chicken and Gravy
Creamed Potatoes
Green Beans
Hot Rolls
Fruit
Milk

On Saturday, the Mitch 
Johnsons, along with the 
Ray White family and Opal 
left for a skiing trip to 
Cloudcroft, N.M.

*****
Last edition of the Sudan 

Beacon News it was re­
ported that firemen from 
Littlefield and other sur­
rounding areas had been 
called to help the local 
firemen with a fire at the 
Farmer’s Co-op. It should 
have been Muleshoe fire­
men -  Littlefield firemen
did not help.

*****
Members of the Sudan 

Volunteer Fire Department 
had 38 calls during 1981 
with 6 of these structure 
fires such as homes, barns 
or buildings; 3 autos; 7 
grass fires; 19 cotton-relat­
ed fires and one miscel­
laneous fire along with 2 
false alarms.

The ambulance made 59 
runs carrying 60 patients, 
with one run having two 
persons in the ambulance.

This is about the same 
average as a year before 
with 1980 having 61 am­
bulance runs.

• • • * •

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Kuy­
kendall, Len and Missy, 
visited during the New 
Year’s holiday with his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. A. 
R. Kuykendall.

*****
Bert and Becky Byerley, 

Tech students, were a- 
mong the college students 
home for the holidays.

Janie and Gary Brownd, 
Glenda Cardwell, Mike 
Hill, Jamie Martinez, all 
students at SPC were home 
as well as Gloria Martinez, 
student at Way land Col­
lege, Plain view.

*****
Mrs. E. C. Minyard re­

turned home from spend­
ing the Christmas holidays 
in Denver with her daugh­
ter, Mr. and Mrs. Ron 
Milliken. Joining her dur­
ing the New Year’s holi­

days were her sister, Mi. 
and Mrs. J.R. Anslow of 
Houston, and also her son 
and family, Mr. and Mrs. 
Pat Minyard, Monica, Ste­
phanie and Ernie of Lub­
bock. The children remain­
ed here for a longer visit 
with her as well as their 
other grandparents, Mr. 
and Mrs. D. W. William­
son.

• • • * •

Jonelle Bandy returned 
home recently from spend­
ing the holidays in Ce­
ment, Oklahoma with her 
daughter, Nancy Robertson 
and family.

*****

Mr. and Mrs. John Nor­
wood, Shane and Fawn of 
Alice, spent some of the 
holidays with her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Matt Nix and 
other family members. 

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Randy 

Humphreys and boys spent 
some of the holidays skiing
in Ruidoso, N.M.

• * • • •

Natasha and Shanelle 
Bruton, daughters of Mr. 
and Mrs. Jackie Bruton of 
Levelland, recently visited 
with their grandparents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Bob Nelson 
and boys.

*****

Holiday visitors with 
Edna Dent were her niece, 
Mr. and Mrs. C. R. Kerr of 
Vacaville, Calif. Mrs. Kerr 
is a former Sudan resident 
and graduate of Sudan
High School.

*****
Krissy Williamson, dau­

ghter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Harry Williamson of Lub­
bock and Stephanie and 
Monica Minyard, children 
of Mr. and Mrs. Pat Min­
yard of Lubbock, visited 
during the holidays with 
their grandparents, Mr. 
and Mrs. D. W. William­
son.

C ong/iatuC atiois
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FIRST PLACE WINNER-Wade Wheeler is shown with his 
Pure Breed Light Weight Steer which won a first place at 
the Bailey County Junior Livestock show. Wade is the son 
of Mr. and Mrs. Joe Wheeler.

ee’s WESTERN WEAR

............■■
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RESERVE CHAMPION-Starla Black won Reserve Champion Lamb, First place with her 
Fine Wool and First Place with her Light Heavy Medium Wool in the Bailey County Junior 
Livestock Show. Starla is the daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Ronnie Black.

■ M fc v . .

Farmers Coop Elevator
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Former Area 
Resident Dies 
In California

Grace Day, 72, of Mo­
desto, Calif., formerly of

ADMITTED
Jan. 11 - Ruby Jennings, 

Rena Tirry, Maude Stout.
Jan. 12 - Sandra Burton, 

Henrietta Ruiz, Salina 
Lynn.

Jan. 13 - Concha Gon­
zales, W. M. Vinson, Con­
nie Beversdorf, Russell 
Redwine.

Jan. 14-Bunnie Hurd, 
Donna Phillips, Norma 
Cruse.
DISMISSED:

Jan. 11-Lupe Martinez.
Jan. 12-Joshua Rojas, 

Albert Wallace, Raiford 
Daniel, Ernest Bara, Mike 
Bonta, Ruby Jennings, Je­
sus Hernandez, Jack Sch­
uster.

Jan. 13-Henrietta Ruiz, 
Renea Tirry.

Jan. 14-Connie Bevers­
dorf, Ed Stringer.

NOTICE TO 
CONTRACTORS

Sealed bids addressed to 
the City of Muleshoe, Tex­
as will be received at the 
City Hall until 8:30 AM, 
February 2, 1982. and then 
publicly opened and read 
for furnishing all plant, 
labor, material and equip­
ment, and performing all 
work required for seal 
coating various streets.

Bids shall be submitted 
in sealed envelopes upon 
the blank form of the 
proposal attached hereto 
and marked in the upper 
left hand corner.

All proposals shall be 
accompanied by a cashier’s 
check or certified check 
upon a national or state 
bank in the amount of five 
(5%) percent of the total 
maximum bid price pay­
able without recourse to 
the City or a bid bond in 
the same amount from a 
reliable surety company, as 
a guarantee that bidder 
will enter into a contract 
and execute performance 
bond within ten days after 
notice of award of contract 
to him. The bid security 
must be enclosed in the 
same envelope with the 
bid. Bids without check or 
bid bond will not be con­
sidered.

The successful bidder

Muleshoe, Texas, Sunday,

the Pleasant Valley com­
munity, died December 22 
at Modesto after a lengthy 
illness.

Mrs. Day was born Sept. 
5, 1909 in Colorado and 
moved to Modesto in the 
early 1940’s from the Plea­
sant Valley community.

Her husband preceded 
her in death in July, 1981.

Survivors include five 
daughters, Rosalene Julian 
of Corsicana, Virginia 
Quesenberry of Odessa, 
Ruth Lilly of Carmel, Cal., 
Genevie Lane of Modesto, 
Cal.; four sons, George 
and Jim of Saratoga. Cal., 
Duggen of Poter Valley. 
Cal. and Bob of San Jose, 
Cal.; 28 grandchildren; and 
several great-grandchild­
ren.

Mrs. Day was the 
grandmother of Connie 
Barnes of Lazbuddie.

T h e  f irs t te lev is ion  panel 
game show was a s ix -a ­
side Spelling Bee, presented  
by the B BC  M ay  3 1 , 1 9 3 8 .

must furnish performance 
and payment bonds upon 
the forms which are at­
tached hereto in the a- 
mount of 100% rtf the con­
tract price from an ap­
proved surety company 
holding a permit from the 
State of Texas to act as 
surety or other surety or 
sureties acceptable to the 
Owner. (If contract is less 
than $25,000, no perfor­
mance or payment bond is 
required.)

The right is reserved to 
reject any and all bids and 
to waive any informality in 
bids received.

Plans, specifications and 
bidding documents may be 
secured from the office of 
Bill R. McMorries & As­
sociates, Inc., 6300 Canyon 
Dr., Amarillo, Texas 79109 
on deposit of Fifty ($50.00) 
Dollars per set which sum 
so deposited will be re­
funded, provided: (1) All 
documents are returned in 
good condition to Bill R. 
McMorries & Associates, 
Inc. not later than 48 hours 
priod to the time for re­
ceiving bids; or (2) The 
Contractor submits a bid 
and all documents are re­
turned in good condition to 
Bill R. McMorries & As­
sociates, Inc. at the time 
that bids are opened.
CITY OF MULESHOE, 
TEXAS
By: Charles Bratcher,
Mayor
3s-2tc

January 17, 1982

Blackman Rites
To Be Held•* } • * » * -. ’■% ■

Here Monday
Services for John Black­

man, 60, will be held at 
2:30 p.m. Monday, .Jan. 
18, in the St. Matthew's 
Baptist Church with Rev.
M. S. Brown, Rev. Arthur 
Hayes and Rev. E. M. 
McFrazier, officiating.

Interment will be in Bai 
ley County Memorial Park 
under the direction of Ellis 
Funeral Home. Blackman 
died at his home Monday.

He was born Feb. 2, 
1921 in Cameron and had 
lived here 20 years moving 
from Amherst. He was a 
custodian at American 
Cotton Growers at Little­
field and a member of St. 
Matthews Baptist Church 
for 20 years.

Survivors include seven 
sons, Renard Johnson of 
Las Angeles, Calif.; James 
Johnson of San Antonio; 
Perry Blackman of Hobbs,
N. M., Tyron Blackman of 
Albuquerque, N.M. James 
Pinkston, Terry Pinkston 
and Eddie Pinkston, all of

Fyrt Worth; (our daugh­
ters, Miss Connie Johnsqn 
and Mrs. Gwen Tubb of 
Minneapolis,, Minn.; Miss 
Brenda PmJuUni and Miss 

lla Mae .'ohfM.ni of Fort 
J- B.

ld < m Qn n.F U h u  —a----

granddiildr*

Telecommunicati 

unique program 

at Texas A&M

COLLEGE STATION —
Engineering technology stu­
dents at Texas A&M University 
learn about the S100 hillion-a- 
year telecommunication, in­
dustry in what is believed to be 
the only program in the nation 
for undergraduates.

In the program, developed 
by Professor Bill Kdwai ds, the 
students are taught subjects 
ranging from the telephone 
and PABX (Private Automatic 
Branch Exchange) switch tech­
nology to microwave transmis­
sion and satellite communica­
tions.

“Our program was estab­
lished primarily in response to 
a need from industry, Ed­
wards said. “People in industry 
had been hiring electrical engi­
neers and retraining them. We 
are offering a unique student 
with an engineering systems 
management viewpoint.” Texas.

WARRANTY DEEDS
L. E. Bratcher and Nat- 

:icc Bratcher to Evelyn B. 
Moore - all of Lot Number
(7) in Block Number (1) 
Crawford Addition to the 
Tow n of Muleshoe, Bailey 
County, Texas.

W. G. Harlan to James 
Crane -  All of Lot Number 
(22) in Block Number (6) 
Lenau Subdivision to the 
City of Muleshoe, Bailey 
County, Texas.

Quessrn M. Hill to Har­
old Martin and wife, Opal 
Martin -  All of Lot Num­
ber (5) in Block Number 
(1), Murrah Addition No.
1, to the Town of Mule­
shoe, Bailey County, Tex-
a c u b .

Marvin F. Nieman and 
wife, Mabel M. Neiman to 
Carlton I . Jobert and wife, 
Jana Jobert--All of Lots 
Number (16), in Block 
Number (18), Country Club 
Addition to the City of 
Muleshue, Bailey County,

, .

DISTRICT COURT 
Johnny Hodges and 

Mary Hodges vs. William 
Guirremo Flores -  default 
judgment.

COUNTY COURT 
James S. Amelung-Or- 

der of Dismissal.
Donnie Leon Powell-Or- 

der of Dismissal.
William Britt Birdwell- 

Speedi.ig, $15 fine.
Mark A. Fried Worth­

less Check, $3 fine.
Sidney Thomas Sliger- 

Order Revoking Shock 
Probation.

BIBLE VERSE
"A new command­

ment give I unto you. That 
ye love one another: as I  
have loved you, that ye  
also love one another. ”

1. Who gave this com­
mandment?
2. To whom was he 
speaking?
3. Upon what occasion?
4. Where may this com­
mandment be found?
Answer to Bible Verae

1. Jesus Christ.
2. To his disciples.
3. Upon the occasion of 
the Last Supper, after 
Judas had left -the Upper 
Room.
4. John 13:34.

Historian interviews 
40 Aggie generals

COLLEGE STATION — 
Wartime experiences of 40 re­
tired Aggie generals are being 
recorded at Texas A&M.

“ No one can doubt that 
these generals played a signifi­
cant role in the history of the 
military and the nation, says 
Dr. Terry Anderson, a Texas 
A&M historian interviewing 
the men. The project, entitled 
“Aggies to Generals, is fund­
ed by the university’s Associa­
tion of Former Students.

"The project will examine 
the former students’ roles and 
responsibilities in combat, 
duties at military installations 
or at the Pentagon, roles as 
consultants with national lead­
ers on defense problems, and 
also their experiences at the 
university,” said Anderson.

O n io n s  w ill stay f irm  lo n g ­
er an d  keep  fro m  sprouting  
i f  yo u  w rap  th e m  in d iv id ­
u a lly  in  a lu m in u m  fo il .

Ellis Funeral Home
24 Hour Anibulance^Sei'vice

/Vi. *72-4574 M u le sh o e
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ATTEND THE CHURCH 
OF YOUR CHOICE

m m S M M S

Heat and cool your home 
with EnerCon* Geothermal 
Heat Pumps and well water. 
Slash utility bills by 
20% to 40%

• Cost about the same as ordinary 
home heating/cooling systems

• Over twice as energy efficient as 
conventional heat pumps during 
temperature extremes

• Keeps homes comfortable all 
year long

• Performance proven in thousands 
of commercial installationspnetnon9

G round W ater Pum p S ystem s

by A m erican Air Filter
an AHis-Chalmers company

Wilson Drilling Co.
W. Hwy. 81 1

272-5521 §j
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MULESHOE ASSEMBL Y OF GOD
517 South First
Rev. James Golaz «
EMMANUEL BAPTIST CHURCH
lglesia Bautista Emmaneut
107 East Third
lsaias Cardenas, Pastor
r ic h  i D m  n
17th and West Ave. D f?
Brock Sanders, Pastor 
SPANISH BAPTIST MISSION 
East Third and Ave. E 
Rev. Aradio Gonzales 
TRINITY BAPTIST CHURCH 
314 Ave. B 
Don Knight, Pastor 
LONGVIEW BAPTIST CHURCH 
Phone 946-3413 
B.C. Stonecipher, Pastor 
SIXTEENTH AND A VE. D 
CHURCH OF CHRIST 
James Johnson, Pastor 
Sunday - 10:30 a.m.
Evening - 6 p.m.
Wednesday - 8 p.m.
PROGRESS BAPTIST CHURCH 
Danny Jackson 
Progress, Texas
NORTHSIDE CHURCH OF CHRIST
117 E. Birch Street
SPANISH ASSEMBLY OF GOD
East 6th and Ave. F
Rev. Hipolito Pecina
UNITED PENTECOSTAL GOSPEL
LIGHTHOUSE CHURCH
207 E. Ave. G
George Green, Pastor
MULESHOE BAPTIST CHURCH
8th Street and Ave. G
Bob Dodd. Pastor
FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH
220 West Ave. E
Rev. J.E. Meeks

r

.1

M an has been seeking the answer to m any questions 

since the beginning of time. Volumes of books, 

and encyclopedias have been filled w ith facts in 

answer to this quest for knowledge. Even w ith all 

of this wealth of information, there is much to 

be learned, and man will never know ail of the 

answers. However in spiritual matters. God has

provided us with a book, filler* unto  valuable .e x
.q<

information. This book is m an’s guide to his 

relationship with God. For a better understanding of 

God’s word and his will for your life attend church, 

so that others may help you in this search.

the Church it M  i oppemtsd ogsncy ffl llm world 
lor sprtoding An kntwioAgt of Hit Ion lor non and 
of Hit demand for man to rotpond to Awt love hy 
loving hit neighbor Without Ant grounding in Am 
lout of tod. no government or torioly or troy of Ufa 
will tong pecievete and Aw frtodomt which wo hold 
to door will inovitahly porith Therefore, Men from 
o ttlfiih point of view, one thould tupped Aw Church 
for Aw toho of Aw welfare of himtolf ond hit family 
Ityond Ant. howouoc, every potion thotrid uphold 
ond partKipate in Aw Ownh become It twill Aw truth 
obout man t life, death ond destiny; Aw truth which 
alone will i l l  him free to Hue at o child of tod.

Xt
. t i n .

******  C

CHURCH OF THE NAZARENE 
Nirth and Ave. C 
Rev. Jimmie William.., Pastor 
FIRST CHRISTIAN CHURCH 
130 W. Ave. G 
Rev. Walter Bartholf 
Sunday School 10:00 a.m.
Worship 11:00 a.m.
LATIN AMERICAN METHODIST MISSION
Ave. D and Fifth Street
R.Q. Cahvez, Pastor
THE COMMUNITY CHURCH
Morton Highway
H.D. Hunter, Pastor
CALVARY BAPTIST CHURCH
James Williams, Pastor
1733 W. Ave. C
PROGRESS SECOND BAPTIST CHURCH 
Clifford Slay, Pastor 
1st and 3rd Sundays
FIRST UNITED METHODIST CHURCH
Rev. Bill Kent
507 West 2nd, Muleshoe
ST. JOHN LUTHERAN
Lariat, Texas
Herman J. Schelter, Pastor 
Sunday School - 10 a.m.
’worship Service - 11a.m.
PRIMITIVE BAPTIST CHURCH I
621 South First
Elder Bernard Gowens
MULESHOE CHURCH OF CHRIST
David Cox, Minister
Clovis Highway
JEHOVAH WITNESS
Friona Highway
Boyd Lowery, Minister
IMMACUALTE CONCEPTION CATHOLIC
Father Patrick Mahar
Northeast of City in Morrison Edition
ST. MATTHEW BAPTIST CHURCH*
Corner of West Boston and West Birch
Rev. M.S. Brown, Pastor

NEW CONVENANT CHURCH 
Plainview Highway 
Jimmy Low, Pastor 
Sunday, 10 a.m.
Wednesday: 7:00 p.m.

West Plains 
Pharmacy

708 S. 1st. 272-4524

Robert Green Inc.
Your Oldsmobile, G M l, 

Pontiac, Buick Dealer 
W. Hwy. 84 2724588

Farmers Spraying 
Service

Muleshoe Go-op 
Gins

Dent-Rempe 
Implement Co.

John Deere Dealer

Kemp’s Discount 
Furniture

1210 W. Amer. Blvd.
272-5023

Main Street 
Beauty Salon

y

272-3448

101 S. 1st 
2724511

4 O a i r i ;  
Q u e e n

Margie Hawking 
Manager
272-3412

White’s Cashway 
Grocery

Where Friends Meet 
_____ and Prices T a lk ______

Western Drug
114 Main

Muleshoe 
Publishing Co.

Muleshoe 2 7 2 4 5 3 6

Bratcher Motor 
Supply

107 E. Ave. B 2 7 2 4 2 8 8

American Valiev 
Inc.

Muleshoe Body 
Shop

402 N. First 2 7 2 4 2 4 6

Lee’s Western 
Wear, Inc.
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Sudan News
By Evelyn Ritchie

Mrs. Mable Reed hosted 
a Christmas Day dinner for 
her daughter, Mr. and 
Mrs. Jerry Ray and Tanya 
and Mr. and Mrs. Roby 
Lynn and children.

*****
Mrs. Gwen Schweppe 

and boys of Serento.lll. 
arrived Sunday for the hol­
idays with their parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. G. C. Chur­
chman and Mr. and Mrs. 
Scott Churchman and little 
Scott. Others joining them 
were their other daughter, 
Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Eth- 
redge of Dimmitt.

* * * * *

Gina Nichols spent the 
holidays in Spring with fter 
son Mr. and Mrs. Charlie 
Nichols and family.

• • • * *

Mr. and Mrs. Marvin 
Tollett spent the holidays 
in Beaumont with their 
daughter, Mr. and Mrs. 
Ray Shafer and family and
met their great-grandson. 

*****
Joining Jimmy Lou Dav­

ison and her mother, Mrs. 
Ruth Martin on Christmas 
Day were her daughters, 
Mr. and Mrs. Gary Morris 
and children and Mrs. and 
Mr. Mike Morris and Kyla 
of Muleshoe and Jim ’s sis­
ter, Mr. and Mrs. W. L. 
Connor or Irving.

Mrs. Billy Hanna has 
returned home from Vega 
where she went last week 
to be with her daughter 
and family, Mr. and Mrs. 
Dwayne Grey and to be 
with them while he under­
went back surgery in Ama­
rillo.

manda of Hobbs, N.M. and 
Mr. and Mrs. David Doty 
and children of Littlefield. 

*****
Holiday visitors with 

Muriel Crouch were her 
son and daughter and fam­
ilies, Bob Crouch, Donna 
and Jackie of Ivanhoe, Cal. 
and Mr. and Mrs. Don 
Goodyear of Arlington and 
Dr. and Mrs. Gary Good­
year and family of Grand 
Prairie.

* * * * *

Mr. and Mrs. Wayne 
Doty and family were in 
Lubbock Christmas Day for 
their family get-together in 
the home of her sister, Mr. 
and Mrs. Claud Patton. 
Also joining them were 
Mr. and Mrs. J. C. Wells 
and the Glen Chester fam­
ily and the Curtis Chester 
family.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Hal Card- 

well of Greenville spent the 
Christmas holidays with 
their son, Mr. and Mrs. 
Glen Cardwell and Glenna 
and other family members 
also joined them. Visiting 
with the Cardwells Sunday 
were her brother, Mr. and 
Mrs. Derral Hobbs and 
Tana of Plains.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Art Lynch 

and family of Odessa were 
Sudan visitors last week. 
His mother, Bonnie Sutton 
returned home with them 
for the holidays.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Ed Gaw- 

koski of Denver arrived 
Sunday for the holidays 
with her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. J. C. Wells, and her 
sisters, Mr. and Mrs. 
Wayne Doty and Mr. and 
Mrs. Glen Chester.

Visiting during the holi­
days with Mr. and Mrs. 
Wayne Doty and Donald 
were their children and 
fanfiilies, Mr. and Mrs. 
Billy Wayne Gore and chil­
dren of Odessa, Mr. and 
Mrs. Doyle Mapp and A-

Mr. and Mrs. Wayne 
Terrell visited their daugh­
ter and grandchildren dur­
ing the holidays.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Jeff Lyn- 

skey and Bradley of Lub­
bock visited on Christmas 

* Day’with theifr family, Mr. 
and Mrs. Bud Provence 
and other family members. 

*****

f l

L

Ask
a neighbor 

about
Pioneer 0 0 1 1  
brand J J J .  J. 

then come see us!
•  P ro v e n  p e r fo rm a n c e  -  n e a r ly  8 0 0  lb s ./a c re  y ie ld  

a d v a n ta g e  in o v e r  1 7 0  o n - fa rm  tests
•  E x c e lle n t  h e a t to le ra n c e  a n d  h e a d  sm u t 

re s is ta n c e
•  Excellent MDMV and head smut resistance

We're convinced this variety can give you a perfor­
mance advantage in this area And we can show you
field data to back us up 

First chance you get. come on by and let s talk 
about your seed needs for the coming year Together 
we ll select the right combination of Pioneer , brand 
seeds to give you the advantage you need

Gene Paul Jarman
965-2340

M jnte Rogers of Hous­
ton and Gaylene of Texas 
Tech were home with their 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Wayne Rogers, for the 
holidays.

• • • • *

Mr. and Mrs. Cary An­
derson and Brannon of 
Llano are spending the 
holidays with her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Bob Ed­
wards and brother, Mr. 
and Mrs. Pete Edwards 
and sister, Mr. and Mrs. 
Eugene Lopez and Anth­
ony of Amherst.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Mike 

Fisher, Tanya and Shannon 
spent the Christmas holi­
days in San Angelo with 
her parents, the Jacksons 
and family.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Bo Lance 

and Danya were in Baird to 
spend Christmas with her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Gil- 
lett and brother, Dana.

*****
Mrs. Josephine Fisher 

and Kathy Fisher of Hart 
were in Lubbock Sunday 
evening to meet their son 
and brother, Lt. Comm. 
Radney Fisher of Wash­
ington, D. C. when he ar­
rived by plane to spend the 
holidays with them.

*****
Overnight guests re­

cently with Mr. and Mrs. 
Harold May were their 
son, Brian, and friends, 
Charles Fleming and Dr. 
Gil Engdhal, all of San 
Angelo. They were here for 
the opening of the phea­
sant hunting season and 
they all bagged their limit. 

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Harold 

May were in Lubbock Fri­
day night for Texas Tech 
graduation at the munici­
pal coliseum when Renay 
Jordan of Clovis, formerly 
of Sudan, was among the 
graduates. They also visit­
ed with Mr. and Mrs. Cal 
Jordan, former Sudan resi­
dents.

*****

Mr. and Mrs. Robin Da­
vis and girls of College 
Station visited during the 
holidays with their parents, 

NMr. and Mrs. Pete Lance 
and other relatives.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Doyle 

Terrell have returned home 
from Weatherford, Okla. 
where they visited during 
the holidays with their 
daughter, Mr. and Mrs. 
Bill Dobbs and other rela­
tives.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Johnny 

Bates and Jason of Carrol- 
ton and Mr. and Mrs. Len 
Williams and children of 
Lubbock visited during the

holidays with their parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. R. C. Wil­
liams.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Ronnie 

Hill and boys of Hobbs, 
N.M. visited during the 
holidays with their parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Connie Hill 
■and Mr. and Mrs. Melton 
Williams.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Larry 

Hanna and children of Pe­
tersburg visited during the 
holidays with his parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Billy Hanna 
and Mat.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Charles 

Rich were in Hampton, 
Iowa for the Christmas 
holidays with their son, the 
Nathan Rich family. They 
returned home Monday. 
They spent the New Year’s 
holidays in Carlsbad, N.M. 
with her sister, Mr. and
Mrs. Bud Wilson.

*****
Holiday visitors in the 

home of Mr. and Mrs. T.
C. McWilliams were Mr. 
and Mrs. Charles Gresham 
and children of Hereford, 
Mr. and Mrs. Michael Mc­
Williams and family of 
Odessa, Mr. and Mrs. Tom 
Schlaback and children of 
Lubbock, Pattie and Justin 
London of Amarillo, Mr. 
and Mrs. Weldon Eagle 
and children of Muleshoe, 
Mr. and Mrfs. John Cock- 
erham, Tony and Eric of 
Amarillo and Mr. and Mrs. 
Glen Davis of Dumas. This 
was the first time in six 
years that the entire family
had been together.

*****
and Mrs. Jack En- 
were in Amarillo 

during the weekend to 
spend Christmas with their 
children at the home of 
their son, Mr. and Mrs.
Kim Engram.

*****

Mrs. J. W. Olds, Miss 
Bertha Vereen and Mrs. 
Radney Nichols spent the 
Christmas holidays in 
Spring with Mr. and Mrs. 
Charlie Nichols and family. 

*****
Tom Sharp was taken by 

ambulance to the Amherst
Hospital Tuesday.

*****
Holiday visitors with Mr. 

and Mrs. Byron Lynn were 
their daughters, Mr. and 
Mrs. Bobby Alford and 
children and Mrs. Paula 
Jones and Jason of Fort 
Worth.

*****
Son Qualls visited during 

the holidays with his sister, 
Mr. and Mrs. Lawrence
Massengale in Littlefield. 

*****
Mrs. Phyllis Lynn and 

girls visited during the

Mr.
gram

holidays with her sister, 
Mr. and Mrs. Eddie New­
comer in Houston.

*****
Rev. Kerry Hurst is in 

Nashville, Tenn. to attend 
the United Methodist 
Church evangelistic con­
ference. While he is gone, 
Mrs. Hurst and children 
are visiting her parents in 
Tahoka.

*****
Odell Johnson, student 

at McMurry College has 
been home during the hol­
idays with his parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. James McLau­
ghlin.

* * * * *

Word was received that 
Mrs. Leroy Simpson died 
on Tuesday, but no further 
details were known at this 
time.

*****
Holiday visitors with Mr. 

and Mrs. J. A. Graves 
were some of their child­
ren, grandchildren and 2 
great-grandchildren inclu­
ding Sgt. and Mrs. Gordon 
R. Graves and family; Mr. 
and Mrs. Arlen Graves of 
Denver, Colo.; Mr. and 
Mrs. Don Graves, Shryl, 
Donnie and Lacie of Odes­
sa; Mr. and Mrs. Paul 
Costello of Wolfforth; Mr. 
and Mrs. Brent Whiteaker 
and Miriam of Lubbock 
and Mr. and Mrs. Wayne 
Whiteaker and Mrs. Vena 
Whiteaker all of Sudan and 
Sherry Whiteaker of Lub­
bock.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Lewis 

Fields and Gary and Lesa 
Templeton of Earth were in 
Lubbock Sunday to cele­
brate the 2nd birthday of 
their granddaughter and 
niece, Alyson Bingham, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Sam Bingham. A Mickey 
Mouse theme was carried 
out in the festivities and 
hamburgers and cake were 
served to those attending.

Others were Mr. and 
Mrs. Jim Fields and Kit of 
Crosbyton; Mr. and Mrs. 
Otis Johnson and Roy of 
Seminole; Mr. and Mrs. 
W. H. Witt of Spur; Mr. 
and Mrs. Pecos Morgan 
and Michel and Pecos, Jr., 
Sherry, Jerry and David, 
all of Lubbock.

Tobacco  got its nam e fro m  
th e  Y -shaped p ipe  called a 
tabaca, w h ich  C olum bus  
saw C aribbean In d ians using.

* * * *
Middle age is the time 

of life when you should 
watch your middle.

Congratulations

Basic Care Knowledge 
Required Of Pet Owners

Many households in 
Texas received a new pup­
py or kitten for Christmas, 
and have already discover­
ed what a great pleasure 
and joy can be found in 
owning these cuddly, play­
ful pets. Along with the 
pleasure of a new pet, 
comes the responsibility 
for its proper care.

“ New pet owners need 
to be aware of the basic 
care required to keep their 
puppy or kitten healthy,” 
said Dr. Ben Johnston, 
president of the Texas 
Veterinary Medical Asso­
ciation (TVMA).

lt is important that an 
animal have good living 
conditions: adequate shel­
ter; exercise and fresh air; 
lots of water and a balan­
ced diet.

Johnston advises feeding 
your dog or cat only a good 
commercial pet food, or a 
diet recommended by your 
veterinarian. People food is 
for people, and pets re­
quire a diet balanced for 
their needs, he said.

Your puppy or kitten 
should also be kept free of 
external parasites such as 
fleas.

A new pet owner should

select a veterinarian and 
take their puppy or kitten 
in for examination and im­
munizations.

Six weeks is the usual 
age for both puppies and 
kittens to b^gin the im­
munizations needed to 
protect them against the 
major infectious diseases.

Distemper, hepatitis, 
parainfluenza, leptospiros­
is and parvovirus are the 
innoculations required for 
the young puppy. Keep in 
mind that a series of inno­
culations, including annual 
boosters, is necessary to 
insure the good health of 
both dogs and cats.

Kittens should receive 
vaccinations for distemper, 
rhinotracheitis and calci 
(respiratory disease).

Heartworms are an in­
creasing problem in Texas, 
so you should ask your 
veterinarian about heart- 
worm prevention.

A rabies vaccination is 
needed when your pet is 
three to four months old. It 
is given at a later age 
because younger puppies 
and kittens are not old 
enought to build effective 
resistance or immunity to 
the disease, said Johnston,

a Houston veterinarian.
By the time the family 

pet is six months old, 
owners should consider 
neutering. Pet overpopu­
lation is a growing public 
health concern, and res­
ponsible animal lovers 
should think about spaying 
or neutering their pet.

Give your new pet its 
best chance for a healthty 
life by taking proper care 
from the start.

WHO KNOWS?
1. What well known 
southern general was 
born January 20, 1807?
2. William R. King was 
vice president to which 
president?
3. What event took place 
on January 31, 1943, 
during World War II?
4. Where may one- find 
the statement “ Blessed is 
the nation whose God is 
the Lord” ?
5. Name the North Star
State.
6. What does the word 
“ euthanasia” mean?
7. With what theory do 
you associate Sir Isaac 
Newton?
A n a w e n  To  W h o  K a o w i

1. Roberf E. Lee.
2. Millard Fillmore.
3. The Germans sur­
rendered at Stalingrad.
4. Psalm 33:12.
5. Minnesota.
6. Painless, easy death.
7. The theory of gravita­
tion.

10(13
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FIRST PLACE—Mitzi Robertson is snown here with her
Heavy Weight Fine Wool Cross lamb which won a first 
place at the Bailey County Junior Livestock Show. Mitzi is 
the daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Darwin Robertson.

Muleshoe Livestock Auction

FIRST PLACE-Shawn Cooley won first place with his 
Light Weight Fine Wool Cross Lamb at the Bailey County 
Junior Livestock Show. Shawn is the son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Burl Cooley.

FIRST PLACE-Jerry Gleason is shown here with his Pure 
Breed Heavy Weight Steer which won first place at the 
Bailey County Junior Livestock Show. His American Cross 
also won a First place. Jerry is the son of Dr. and Mrs. 
Jerry Gleason.

Congratulations

A&M Farm & Ranch
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AUSTIN — The Text* 
Senate redistricting plan has 
survived its first major chal­
lenge with State District 
Judge Herman Jones reject­
ing arguments by a group 
of leading Republicans that 
the reapportionment plan 
was drafted on the wrong 
basis.

Jones upheld the plan, 
drawn by the Legislative Re­
districting Board, stating he 
wasn't convinced it violated 
either the state or federal 
constitutions.

State GOP Chairman 
Chester R. Upham and six 
other Republicans chal­
lenged the Senate map on 
grounds the state constitu­
tion required that districts 
be drawn on the basis* of 
“qualified electors” rather 
than a strict population 
count, as used by the LRB.

Attorneys for the state, 
however, argued that the 
LRB couldn't ignore a 1965 
federal court ruling they 
felt invalidated the Texas 
constitutional provision.

But the Senate plan isn't 
in the clear yet. The Re­
publicans still can appeal 
Jones' decision, and the plan 
still faces a federal court 
challenge—along with the 
House plan—before a three- 
judge panel in Dallas.

Liability Insurance Law
The state’s new manda­

tory liability insurance law 
went into effect at the first 
of the year, and the automo­
bile insurance business re­
portedly is booming as un­
insured drivers scramble to 
get coverage before being 
slapped with a $200 fine.

Under the law, drivers 
can be ticketed if they don’t 
carry proof of liability cov­
erage in their cars.

More than a million Tex­
as motorists are uninsured, 
and the required coverage 
could cost each of them up 
to several hundred dollars 
annually, depending on 
where they live and past 
driving records.

Those who don’t have in­
surance yet, or haven’t re­
ceived a document showing 
proof of insurance from 
their insurance companies, 
shouldn't panic yet: The De­
partment of Public Safety 
says its officers won’t start 
ticketing drivers without that

proof for another couple of 
months.

Police in some cities, 
however, are enforcing the 
law strictly, with some 300 
drivers ticketed in Dallas 
during the first week of the 
year.

Drivers caught without 
insurance more than once 
may face fines up to $1,000 
and jail terms.

Political Campaigns
The 1982 political races 

continue to take shape, with 
more and more of the po­
tential, but previously unde­
cided, candidates either 
jumping in or dropping out 
of the contests.

West Texas State Univer­
sity President Max Sherman 
has added his name to the 
list of candidates for attor­
ney general. He will face 
former U.S. Attorney John 
Hannah for the Democratic 
nomination.

Sherman, a former state 
senator, entered the race as 
Secretary of State David 
Dean was bowing out of a 
GOP bid for that position. 
Dean says he doesn’t feel he 
can abandon his post as the 
state's top election official 
with the primary election 
only a few months away.

Meanwhile, a Richardson 
appliance salesman became 
the first candidate to pay his 
filing fee in the governor’s 
race.

David L. Young became 
the first official candidate in 
that contest by paying the 
$1,500 filing fee to enter 
the Democratic primary. He 
will challenge Tyler Sen. 
Peyton McKnight, Attorney 
General Mark White and 
Land Commissioner Bob 
Armstrong for the Demo­
cratic gubernatorial nomina­
tion.

Young quit his job selling 
appliances at Montgomery 
Ward to make the race, and 
he plans to run a low budget 
campaign—not more than 
$ 10,000.

The other candidates have 
indicated they will spend be­
tween $2 million and $5 mil­
lion for the chance to take 
on incumbent Republican 
Gov. Bill Clements in the 
general election in Novem­
ber.

Jim Hightower, Demo­
cratic candidate for Texas 
Agriculture Commissioner, 
said tuday that “ Our gov­
ernment officials are fid­
dling, while a major farm 
depression is sweeping 
Texas like a prairie fire.” 

Hightower, who was 
guest speaker at the Texas 
Farmers Union annual 
convention, said that "the 
family farmers of this state 
are in the worst financial 
shape that they have been 
in since 1933, and the sit­
uation is well out of con­
trol. That’s bad news not 
only for farmers and rural 
people, but for all of us, 
because the family farm is 
the backbone of our entre­
preneurial system and the 
only competitive force that 
stands between consumers 
and monopoly control of 
our food supply.

Ask
a neighbor 

about
Pioneer. 2 2 1 1  
brand

then come see us!
•  Proven perform ance - nearly 800 lbs /acre yield  

advantage in over 170 on-farm  tests
•  Excellent heat tolerance and head smut 

resistance
•  Excellent M D M V and head smut resistance

We’re convinced this variety can give you a perfor­
mance advantage in this area And we can show you 
field data to back us up 

First chance you get, come on by and let's talk 
about your seed needs for the coming year Together 
we ll select the right combination of Pioneer, brand 
seeds to give you the advantage you need

Wiedebush & Co.
1620 W. Amcr. Blvd.

272-4281

PIONEER.
B R A N D

SEEDS
*P»oqeer »s £ brand name Numbers »denftfy varieties Registered trademark of

“ The latest economic 
figures from the Depart­
ment of Agriculture, Texas 
A&M, the Federal Reserve 
Bank and other sources 
confirm what farmers al­
ready know -  the farm 
economy is going bank­
rupt,”  Hightower said. He 
pointed out that:

* The net income of 
farmers has plummeted for 
three years in a row, fall­
ing by 36 percent from 
1979 to 1981, and USDA 
forecast preduct farm in­
come may drop another IS 
percent to 30 percent dur­
ing 1982.

* The price of every crop 
was down in 1981, causing 
the parity index of farm 
prices to be at the lowest 
levels since the Great De­
pression.

* Farm production costs, 
however, continue to rise, 
jumping by more that 21 
percent sin© 1979.

* In 1981, according to 
Texas A&M, the average 
cost of producing every 
major crop exceeded the 
average price that farmers 
were paid for them. -  In 
fact, for the first time ever, 
farmers paid more in in­
terest than they received in 
net income.

* As a result, the debt 
owed by farmers rose from 
$140 billion in 1979 to $200 
billion at the end of 1981, 
and if nothing is done to 
correct these economic 
trends, the farm debt is 
forecast to hit $500 billion 
by 1985.

* The average farmer’s, 
return on investment fell 
from a low 8 percent in

Texas Will Still Have Two 
Brucellosis Program

Area

Commissioners of the 
Texas Animal Health 
Commission took action 
recently which will allow 
Texas to continue its two 
area brucellosis program.

They requested the U. S. 
Department of Agriculture 
to reclassify the present 
brucellosis control areas of 
this state. The present 
Class A control area (gen­
erally the western half of 
the state) would become 
Class B area, and the 
present Class B control 
area (generally the eastern 
half of the state) would 
become Class C. There 
would be 140 counties in 
the proposed Class B area 
and 114 counties in the 
proposed Class C area.

“ We are taking this ac­
tion today so that the 
Texas livestock producers 
will be aware of impending 
changes as soon as possi­
b le,"‘ John B. Armstrong, 
Kingsville chairmati,’T ex ­
as Animal Health Commis­
sion, said.

New federal regulations 
are expected to be in place 
not later than the end of 
this month. Even then, 
however, it will take addi­
tional time to fully imple­
ment them.

“ Until the new regula­
tions are in effect, Texas 
producers should continue 
to operate under the pres­
ent Texas brucellosis pro­
gram,” Dr. John W. Hol­
combe, executive director, 
Texas Animal Health 
Commission, said.

Dr. Holcombe said it 
may be early Spring before 
the new rules will apply in

Texas.
Class B area, as recom­

mended by Commissioners 
includes these counties:

Andrews, Archer, Arm­
strong,. Bailey, Bandera, 
Baylor, Bell, Blanco, Bor­
den, Bosque, Brewster, 
Briscoe, Brown, Burnet, 
Callahan, Carson, Castro, 
Childress, Clay, Cochran, 
Coke, Coleman, Collings­
worth, Comal, Comanche, 
Concho, Coryell, Cottle, 
Crane, Crockett, Crosby, 
Culberson, Dallam, Daw­
son, Deaf Smith, Dickens, 
Donley, Eastland, Ector, 
Edwards, El Paso, Erath, 
Fisher, Floyd, Foard, 
Gaines, Garza, Gillespie, 
Glasscock, Gray, Hale, 
Hall, Hamilton, Hansford. 
Hardeman, Hartley, Has­
kell, Hays, Hemphill, 
Hockley, Hood, Howard, 
Hudspeth, Hutchinson, Ir­
ion, Jack, Jeff Davis, 
Johnson, Jones, Kendall 
Kent, Kerr, Kimble, Kin­
ney, King, Knox, Lamb, 
Lampasas, Lipscomb, 
Llano, Loving, Lubbock, 
Lynn, McCulloch, Martin, 
Mason, Maverick, Menard, 
Midland, Mills, Mitchell, 
Montague, Moore, Motley, 
Nolan, Ochi! ree, Oldham, 
Palo Pinto, Parker, Par­
mer, Pecos, Potter, Presi­
dio, Randall, Reagan, 
Real, Reeves, Roberts, 
Runnels, San Saba, Schlei­
cher, Scurry, Shackelford, 
Sherman, Somervell, Ster­
ling, Stephens, Stonewall, 
Sutton, Swisher, Tarrant, 
Taylor. Terrell, Throck­
morton, Tom Green, Tra- 
vis, Upton, Uvalde, Val 
Verde, Ward, Wheeler,

Wichita, Wilbarger, Will­
iamson, Winkler, Wise, 
Yoakum, Young, Terry and 
Zavala.

Class C area, as recom­
mended by Commissioners 
includes these counties:

Anderson, Angelina, 
Aransas, Atascosa, Austin, 
Bastrop, Bee, Bexar, Bow­
ie, Brazoria, Brazos, Bro­
oks, Burleson, Caldwell, 
Calhoun, Cameron, Camp, 
Cass, Chambers, Cherokee 
Collin, Colorado, Cooke, 
Dallas, Delta, Denton, De- 
Witt, Dimmit, Duv al, El­
lis, Falls, Fannin, Fayette, 
Fort Bend, Franklin, Free­
stone, Frio, Galveston, 
Goliad, Gonzales, Grayson, 
Gregg, Grimes, Gaudalupe 
Hardin, Harris, Harrison, 
Henderson, Hidalgo, Hill, 
Hopkins, Houston, Junt, 
Jackson, Jasper, Jefferson,
Jim Hogg, Jim Wells, 
Karnes, Kaufman, Kenedy 
Kleberg, Lamar, LaSalle, f  
Lavaca, Lee, Leon, Liber­
ty, Limestone, Live Oak, 
McLennan, McMullen, 
Madison, Marion, Mata­
gorda, Medina, Milam, 
Montgomery, Morris, Na­
cogdoches, Navarro, New­
ton, Nueces, Orange, Pan­
ola, Polk, Rains, Red Riv­
er, Refugio, Robertson, 
Rockwall, Rusk, Sabine,
San Augustine, San Jacin­
to, San Patricio, Shelby, 
Smith, Starr, Titus, Tri­
nity, Tyler, Upshur, Van 
Zandt, Victoria, Walker, 
Waller, Washington, 
Webb, Wharton, Willacy,
Wilson, Wood and Zapata.

* • * •
Be as anxious U help 

others as you are to accept
favors.

FIRST PLACE WINNER-Beth Harmon is shown here with 
her Medium Weight Medium Wood Lamb which won first 
place at the Bailey County Junior Livestock Show. She also 
won the showmanship award in the sheep division. Beth is 
the daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Bill Harmon.

W ooley International

1979 to 9 percent in 1980, 
and is forecast to be even 
lower in 1981 (By way of 
contrast, the major bank 
holding companies in Tex­
as averaged more than 20 
percent return on invest­
ment, oil companies aver­
aged 20.3 percent and ma­
jor food processors averag­

ed 16.1 percent).
“ These farmers have 

just produced some of the 
largest crops ever to come 
out of Texas land, and 
their reward is to stare 
bankruptcy in the face. In 
1979 and 1980, more than 
4,000 good Texas farmers 
folded, and another 4,000

could go under as a result 
of 1981 ’s disastrous prices- 
-the Production Credit As­
sociation office in Lubbock 
expects that some 20 per­
cent of its farm borrowe-s 
will be ‘dropped’ this year 
because they can’t pay 
their d^bts,” Hightower 
said.

January 15 Is Arbor Day
COLLEGE STATION --- 

Jan. 15 is an important day 
for every Texas citizen -- 
it’s Arbor Day.

Arbor Day is a day set 
aside each year to remem 
ber one of our most val 
uable resources -  the tree 
says Ted Fisher of Austin 
Travis County horticultur 
ist with the Texas Agricul 
tural Extension Service 
Texas A&M University 
System.

Arbor Day began in Ne­
braska on April 10, 1972, 
and is now observed across 
the country during the 
month of April. However, 
Texas Arbor Day was set 
for the third Friday in 
January by the Texas Leg­
islature in 1949 because 
January is an ideal time for 
planting trees.

As to the importance of

trees, Fisher cites a num­
ber of contributions.

“ In addition to providing 
lumber and paper, trees 
also purify and beautify,” 
he says. “ They cleanse the 
air we breathe by absorb­
ing carbon dioxide and 
returning oxygen to the 
air. They cool and humidify 
the air, reduce soil erosion, 
beautify our neighborhoods 
and communities, provide 
cover for fowl and wildlife, 
and offer a natural chal­
lenge for youthful climb­
ers.

“ Bearing all these 
things in mind, trees act­
ually work overtime to 
make our world a nicer 
place,” says Fisher.

Planting a tree in the 
home landscape can be a 
family project while 
schools and other groups

can be involved in tree 
planting at community 
parks and playgrounds.

“ Nurseries usually have 
a good supply of different 
kinds of trees available this 
time of year,” notes the 
horticulturist. There are 
shade, fruit and nut trees 
adapted to different areas 
of Texas that can be ad­
mired for generations to 
come if they are planted 
now and cared for proper­
ly-

"Many of the trees we 
enjoy today exist because 
those that came before us 
cared enough to leave 
something lasting for fu­
ture generations,” con­
tends Fisher.

“ We can do the same by 
planting a tree on Arbor 
Day, Jan. 15.”

»I •

v « ■

o •

o •

FIRST PLACE WINNEK-Jamie Wheeler, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Joe Wheeler, is shown here with his Light Weight 
Medium Wood Lamb which was a First place ..inner at the 
Bailey County Junior Livestock Show.
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FIRST PLACE-Heath Burleson won a first place at the 
Bailey County Junior Livestock Show with his Feeder 
Steer. Heath is the son of Mr. and Mrs. Cotton Burleson

McCormick Seeds Inc.
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DEADLINE FOR CLASSIFIED 
ADS IS TUESDAYS AND  

FRIDAYS 11:00 A M
CLASSIFIED RATES 

1st Insertion,
Per Word-S. 15 

Minimum ChargeS2.00 
2nd Insertion,

Per W o rd s  13 
3rd Insertion,

Per W ordS. 10 
Minimum ChargeS 1^80 

Vi Cheaper to run 
Classifieds 3 times 

or more
CARD OF THANKS 

25 WordsS3.00 
Over 25 Words 

Charged at regular 
Classified Rates 

Classified Display- 
51.55 per column inch 

Double Rate for 
Blind Ads 

DEADLINE FOR 
INSERTION 

11 a.m. Tues. for Thurs. 
11 a. m. Fri. for Sun. 
WE RESERVE THE 

RIGHT TO CLASSIFY 
REVISE OR REJECT 

ANY AD.
NOT RESPONSIBLE 

FOR ANY ERROR 
AFTER AD HAS RUN 

ONCE.

PERSONALS

STANLEY HOME 
PRODUCTS 
Janice Snell 

965-2665 
l-43t-tfc

NEW DOG 
BREEDERS 

NEEDED
Be your own boss. Your 
own business at home. 
Possible to turn one-half 
acre into an excellent 
income. We assist all 
new breeders. If quali­
fied, start small or large. 
Raise quality puppies for 

PROFITS
Our computerized mar­
keting gets you highest 
nationwide prices. For 
more information call: 

1-800-346-0749 
Or Write:

. KENNELS 
P. 0. box 8

Two Harbors, Minn. 
55616. [Include Phone 
Number) PUPPIES 

MEAN PROFITS

HELP .WANTED#

WE BUY USED 
FURNITUREAND 

'} APPLIANCES 
CALL 272-3030 
HARVEY BASS 

APPLIANCE 
l-18s-tfc

Custom farming, 8 row 
equipment. Reasonable
rates. Call 272-5317 before 
8 a. m. or after 7 p. m. 
l-16s-tfc

A HIGHLY PROFITABLE 
and beautiful Jean and 
Sportswear shop of your 
own. $12,500 to $16,500 
includes inventory, fix­
tures; in-shop training; one 
paid airfare to Apparel 
Center and more. Over 100 
nationally known brands 
such as Levi, Lee, Chic, 
Calvin Klein, Jordache, 
Zena. Call Now! Pacesetter 
Fashions, Inc. 1-800-643- 
6305. 1-3s-ltp

CREDIT PROBLEM? 
Guaranteed, Receive a 
MasterCard or Visa with 
no credit check, even if you 
have bad credit or no 
credit, for free brochure, 
send self-addressed, stam­
ped envelope to House of 
Credit, P. 0. Box 280570, 
Dallas, Texas 75228. 
l-2S-4tsc

RN needed in Muleshoe 
area to work with pro­
gressive Home Health a- 
gency. Competive salary. 
Mileage expenses and 
fringe benefits. 894-9657 
call 8-5 Mon.-Fri. [Level- 
land)
3-47s-tfc

NURSERY WORKER 
NEEDED: Richland Hills 
Baptist Church. Day: 272- 
5229. Night: 272-3570. 
3-2S-tfc

Holidays over? Bills to 
pay? Make good $$$ sell­
ing Avon. For more infor­
mation Call Nettie ?72- 
3208 
3-53t-8tc

Accepting applications for 
office clerk, proficiency on 
10 key a must. Ability to 
type. Salary open depend­
ing on past experience and 
ability to advance. Holi­
days paid, vacation, insur­
ance. Apply in person at 
Parmer County Cable Com­
pany, Hwy. 60, Bovina, 
Texas. Contact Jeanette 
Walling at [806] 225-4400. 
3-15t-tfc

SARATOGA GARDENS 
1300 N. Walnut, Friona 

~ ~  Phone 247-3666 
1, 2, or 3 bedroom apart­
ments modern, wall to wall 
carpet, heating/cooling, 
kitchen equiped, laundry 
facitilies, parking. Low 
rent for needy families. 
Call collect.
5-46t-tfc

R EA L E S T A T E  | g g |
Irrigated, new undergr­
ound pipe. 2- 158 acre 
tracts near Muleshoe. 
51150 /  acre Norman Real­
tors 806-795-9514 
8-42s-tfc

FOR SALE: 3-BR house, 1 
full bath, 2-l/i baths, living 
room, den, kitchen-dining 
room combination, utility, 
double garage, 272-5476. 
8-2S-4tc

Smallwood Real Estate 
232 Main 
272-4838 

*****

3 bedroom, 2 bath, large 
kitchen, fenced backyard, 
storage building. Apprai­
sed for FHA loan.
8-53t-tfc

See or call Joe Small­
wood, Broker

Town & Country Equites 
Nice 3 bdrm, 2'/j bath, 
20 acres, barn and corral 
Vi mile from city limits 
965-2642 or 272-3496 
8-46t-tfc

For all your real estate 
needs call:

GLAZE S. GOFORTH 
112 Ave. C 
272-4208

8-11-tfc

Krebbs Real Estate 
201 W. Ave. C 

Appraisals
IV

Serving Muleshoe Area 35 
years. We Appreciate your 
business.
8-52t-tfc

HOUSE FOR SALE: 310 
Breson St., Sudan. 3 BR, 2 
bath, good seller, equity 
$10,000. Owner will carry 
at 11%. Call 995-3269. 
8-3s-3tc

FOR SALE: 3-BR brick 
house, 1 -V* baths, living 
room, den with fireplace, 
large storage in back. 1713 
W. Ave. H. Call 272-3400 
after 5 and on weekends. 
8-3s-stfc

Choice Building site.' Rich­
land Hills. Will finance. 
272-4096 
ll-49s-stfc

REID REAL ESTATE 
we want your business 

“Remember 
REID REAL ESTATE 

1614 W. American Blvd 
272-3142

4 BR 2V* brick rock fire 
place, paneled basement 
and sun room. Double 
car garage, fenced back 
yard. Nice location.

Equity buys 3 BR, 2 
bath, fireplace, heavy 
alumnium storm wind­
ows, 1 car garage. Nice 
location.

3 BR, IV* Bath, over 
1,500 sq. ft. Storage 
shed, fenced back yard.

3 BR, 2 bath, fireplace, 
sunroom, double car ga­
rage, fenced back yard.

2 houses together with 
breezeway, excellent re­
ntal property.

Farm- 621 acre, welP 
improved, good water, 
assumable loans.
8-51s-tfc

Thursie Reid-272-3142

Bingham & Nieman 
Realty

116 E. Ave. C 
272-5285°965-2488

Just 1 year old but still 
looks brand spanking 
new. 3-13/4-1...

This home was built 
with energy conserva­
tion in mind. Has many 
of extras, plus tranquil 
country living. 3-13/42.

Extra nice ..... 3 large
bedrooms, IV* baths on 
corner lot. Loads of 
storage space.....

With creative financing 
this home could be yours 
in less than 15 years. 3-1 
carport........

Near Tolk - Large 3-2-2 
home on 60 acres.

Beautiful rock fireplace, 
2-2 with guest cottage...

FARMS
2 Labors-Wildlife Re­
fuge Area. . .

Bailey Co.-395 ac., 4 
wells, 1 elec, center pi­
vot . .  .

Parmer County. 320 ac., 
2-8” elec, wells, 2 elec, 
center pivots, complete­
ly fenced, & lots of de­
preciable assets. . .

We have several other 
80-320 ac. farms in Bai­
ley & Parmer Co.

“We Appreciate 
your Business!”

George SiDianne Nieman

160 acre farm for sale. 4 
miles north on Hwy. 1760. 
Call 272-4280 
8-49s-tsc

HOUSE FOR SALE: 2 BR, 
310 W. 6th, Call 272-3331. 
8-3s-ltp

B Y OWNER-Attractive liv­
ing (w/fireplace), dining, 
kitchen combination, 3 
bedroom, 2 bath, dbl. gar­
age. Equity buy. Assume 
loan. Shown by appoint­
ment only after 6 p.m. and 
all day Sat. 8c Sun. 
272-4428.
8-35s-stfc

HOUSE FOR SALE: 3 BR, 
IV*, LR, kitchen-dining 
combination, den, ample 
storage, corner lot, jiear 3 
schools, 1928 sq. ft. living 
area, 621 West 6th. Phone 
272-4732 days or 272-4827 
evenings.
8-2s-tfc

FOR SALE: 3 bedroom, 2 
bath, brick, living room, 
den with fireplace, office, 
Richland Hill. 272-4701. 
8-21t-tfc

2 year old brick home for 
sale. 3 bedroom, 2 bath, 
built in appliances, living 
room with beam ceiling 
and fire place. Double car 
garage. Parkridge Addition 
Call 272-3512 
8-ls-tfc

VA appraised-No down pay 
ment to qualified Veteran. 
Lovely 3 bedroom, IV* ba­
ths, brick home is Crest 
Park Addition, Littlefield 
Texas. Call Ida L. Howell 
Real Estate at 894-8566. 

,8-40t-tfc

c J J e n x y  R e a l t y

2 bedroom completely 
remodeled, carpet, good 
location.

Country living 3 bedroom, 
2 bath, double garage, 
brick home on Hwy 2 miles 
from town. Immediate po- 
session.
8-46t-8-46t-tfc

Small acreage 3 miles 
east o f Muleshoe on 
highway.

FmHA Approved 
111 W. Avenue B, 
Muleshoe 
272-4581 
8-44s-tfc

FOR SALE
OR TRADE• ••••••••••••••••*••••••• •'••*•*

FOR SALE: Cutting torch 
with hoses and gauges. 
5hp roto tiller with power 
reverse, almost new. Call 
925-6722. ll-3s-2tp

FOR SALE: Brand new gas
cooker. In good condition. 
Call 272-4261. ll-2s-tfc

FOR SALE: 2 lots in the 
old Muleshoe Cemetery 
5100 a piece Contact Jim­
my Ogletree, Rt. 2, Moun­
tain Grove, Missouri 65711 
phone [417)926-5860 
ll-ls-4tsp

CARS-TRUGKS^P
JEEPS* CARS* TRUCKS 
Many sell for under
5200.00 at local govern­
ment sales. For purchasing 
information call our Sur­
plus Sales Center [602] 
998-0575 ext. 511 
9-53t-4tsp

FOR SALE: 1964 Chevy 
Chevelle. New 283 V-8 
engine. Engine has about 
500 miles. Needs body 
work. Call 272-3304 or 272- 
3267 
9-49t-tfc

FOR SALE: 1976 Tandem 
Chevrolet with green end 
gate and new silage side­
boards. Good rubber all 
the way around. Call 272- 
5225.
9-3s-2tp

1978 Ford van 49,000 miles 
1 owner. 57,500. Excellent 
condition, 1977 Chevy Ca­
price, 2 door, 38,000 miles
54.000 Call 272-5289 
9-lt-4tc

HOUSEHOLD
GOODS
BURROWS 

UPHOLSTERY AND 
FURNITURE REPAIR 

209 W. 2nd 
phone 272-4255 

12-44s-ltc

13. PROPERTY 
FOR LEASE

FOR LEASE: Tracts 18 & 
19, League 176, Bailey 
County, Texas. Contact R. 
W. Miller. 806/355-5262. 
13-2t-4tc

OFFICE SPACE for rent at 
302 W. 2nd. Call 272-3107. 
13-3s-tfc

FOR SALE OR LEASE: 1 
building, with 5 offices and 
shop, (all or part may be 
leased) Call Western 
Sprinklers Inc., West Hwy. 
84 272-4544 
13-49s-stfc

WANTED 
TO RENT

Want to rent V% section of 
good farmland in Bailey 
County Call 965-2665 
14-50t-tfc

WANTED TO RENT: Fa­
rmland for ’82 irrigated or 
dry land. 272-4034 or 
946-3415.
14-38t-tfc

MISCELLANEOUS

BRUCE ELECTRIC 
Residential, commercial, 
wiring, repairs, supplies, 

and fixtures.
24 hour service 

272-5114 
15-43s-tfc

MISCELLANEOUS 2 Nursing Home
a

GORDON PLUMBING 
Licensed and bonded. 

New, repair, commercial 
work. Free estimates. 20% 
discount for senior citizens. 
24 hour service. 272-4111 
221 East 4th 
15-50s-8tc

WANTED: Someone with 
experience to refinish 
hardwood floor. 965-2175. 
15-2t-2tc

SECOND ANNUAL biggest 
little garage sale in Texas. 
Today until 6. At the Hale 
County Ag Bam, Plain- 
view.
15-2t-rff

WANT TO DO alterations 
in my home. Zida Mae 
Black, 402 E. Chicago, 
272-4939.
15-3s-4tc

CARPENTRY WORK 
Roof repair - painting 

acoustic work - remodeling 
- paneling - cement work. 
819 South First, Muleshoe, 
Texas (806) 272-4142. 
15-3s-tfc

Want a propane system/ 
check with 

SMITH LP GAS 
MULESHOE 

15-30s-tfc

We pay cash for furs. 
Coyote, coon and fox. Will 
be at the Dinner Bell Cafe 
every Monday.
Richard Finney [806] 995- 
2100 or Belton Finney [806] 
995-3854 
15-1 t-6tp

WANTED TO BVY-ased 
aluminum pipe of all sizes. 
Also side roll sprinklers of 
all sizes. No quantities too 
large. Top prices paid. 
Stateline Irrigation 
272-3819 or 272-3450 
15-33t-tfc

FRANK’S 
REFRIGERATION 

APPLIANCE & SERVICE 
PARTS & REPAIR 

315 W. 3rd Ph. 272-3822 
15-7t-tfc

Roofing, interior remodel­
ing of all kinds. Davis 
Construction 272-3047 
15-53t-8tp

B U T L E R
AGRI-PRODUCTS

Everything you need—from one tpecieltaed 
source. Henning aseietonce. feet construc­
tion, single source responsibility, efficient
Mnrict. f j ardin Construction 

Portales, N.M. 88130 
[505)276-8610 

15-53t-8tp

STORAGE ROOMS 
FOR RENT 

515-525
TED BARNHILL

272-4903

Commercial building 
30’x60’ for rent 
272-4878 after 6 p. m. 
13-44s-tfc

Newst

By Joy Stancell 
« s »rrm r» o n m m iY i

Our sympathy to Celia 
Lopez at the death of her 
son. Celia is a nurse’s aide 
in the Nursing Home.

** * * *

Cleo Bellar was visited 
by Don and Darlene, and 
her husband.

***** ___

FOR SALE: 1 Yamaha gui­
tar with case, 1 exercise 
bike, 1 set of weights and 
weight bench. 965-2682 be­
fore 8 a.m. or after 6 p.m. 
ll-2s-3tc

FOR SALE: Warm winter 
nest, furnished 2 BR trailer 
on lake LBJ with stove, 
refrigerator, washer, con- 
refrigerator, washer, cen­
tral heat and air. Nice. 
272-5408. 
ll-2s-tfc
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BOXCARS FOR SALE
40 x 50 Refrigerated Metal 

Boxcars
The Most Outstanding Storage 

Available At Any Price 
For Info Bennett Trucking Co. 

Clovis 505-763-5501
House & Heavyr Hauling 

15-2S-4TC M  .vrs. Experience
tiXSSXSSX$iSXXXXSX%%*X3SS%3S3SSXXXXXXXXXXSSSXX9^

Alma Henley’s daughter 
Cleo fell last week. Mrs. 
Henley said she did not 
break any bones, she was
just real sore.

*****
Pertie Hendrix, Alma 

Henley and Ora Roberts 
played Skip Bo after sup­
per last week.

Ora Roberts was visited 
by Bruce and Rita Duncan 
and Jeff Sliger and two of
his friends.

*•*••

Rent -To-Own 
Color TV

Stereos Microwave Ovens, Dryers 
Refrigerators Freezers Washers 

Dishwashers 
No Service Expense No Interest To Pay

117 Mom

IDtfaon
Appliance

fciULESHOE 272-5531
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i
Do You Want To 

Buy A New Home?
} If you qualify we now have I 
} 100% financing with closing l

4
4
4
4
*
4
4
4-

* cost not included.
4-

Call Today!
Thursie Ried 

272-3142

♦
4
4

4
4
4
4
4
4
4
4
4

jm .  t h e
CANDIDATES 

OF TOUR CHOICE!
••• ■ •

< sew me

Rates for listing in the Journal’s Political Column is: 
$35 for all offices except those for City Council and 
School Board post which is $15. This fee includes a front 
page announcement article and a one column photo­
graph at the time the announcement is made, in 
addition to the listing in the Political column from the 
date of announcement until the final election.

Charges for announcements are cash in advance, and 
this same policy to applies to all political advertising 
carried in the columns of this newspaper.

Names for each office will be listed in the Political 
Column in the order they are received at the newspaper 
office.

The Journal has been authorized to announce the 
following candidates for public office:

^  County Clerk ^
Barbara McCamish
+ District Clerk ^

Nelda Merriott
+ County Treasurer ^  

Dorothy Turner
+ Tax Assessor ^  

Kathleen Hayes
★  Justice Of Peaces 

Tana Holmes
★  County Commissioner ★

Precint No. 4
Rudolph Moraw 
* Commissioner*

' Precint No. 2
Glen Dalton Harris

28th Judicial District Judge
Bailey & Parmer Counties

lack Young


